
!200700113GG! 
 

  2483 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 29 MAY 2007 No. 113 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Local Government Act 1995— 
City of Belmont—Dust and Liquid Waste Local Law 2007...............................................  2496  
Local Government (Change of District Boundaries) Order 2007......................................  2487 
Wanneroo District (Wards and Representation) Order 2007............................................  2490 

Proclamations— 
Osteopaths Act 2005—No. 33 of 2005 ................................................................................  2486 
Podiatrists Act 2005—No. 30 of 2005.................................................................................  2486 
Trade Measurement Act 2006—No. 13 of 2006 .................................................................  2485 
Trade Measurement Administration Act 2006—No. 12 of 2006.......................................  2485 

Road Traffic Act 1974—Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2007.............................................................................................................................  2499 

Water Services Licensing Act 1995—Water Services Licensing (Plumbers Licensing and 
Plumbing Standards) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007...............................................  2502 

Workers’ Compensation and Injury Management Act 1981—Approved Medical Specialists 
Order (No. 3) 2007 ..................................................................................................................  2507 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Cemeteries..................................................................................................................................  2508 
Consumer and Employment Protection ....................................................................................  2510 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  2516 
Fisheries .....................................................................................................................................  2510 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  2511 
Marine/Maritime........................................................................................................................  2511 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  2513 
Police ..........................................................................................................................................  2515 
WorkSafe ....................................................................................................................................  2516 
 
 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2006 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$23.70 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$55.20 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$55.20 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.05 

  Bulk Notices—$201.70 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2485 

 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 
AA101* 

TRADE MEASUREMENT ACT 2006 
No. 13 of 2006 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 
By His Excellency 

Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Governor, acting under the Trade Measurement Act 2006 section 2 and with 
the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix 1 June 2007 as the day on which 
the provisions of that Act, other than sections 1 and 2, come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 22 May 2007. 
By Command of the Governor, 

SHEILA McHALE, Minister for Consumer Protection. 

———— 
Note: Under section 22 of the Interpretation Act 1984, sections 1 and 2 came into 
operation on 11 May 2006. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

AA102* 
TRADE MEASUREMENT ADMINISTRATION ACT 2006 

No. 12 of 2006 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 
By His Excellency 

Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Governor, acting under the Trade Measurement Administration Act 2006 
section 2 and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix 1 June 2007 
as the day on which the provisions of that Act, other than sections 1 and 2 and 
Schedule 1 clause 7, come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 22 May 2007. 
By Command of the Governor, 

SHEILA McHALE, Minister for Consumer Protection. 

———— 
Note: Under section 22 of the Interpretation Act 1984, sections 1 and 2 came into 
operation on 11 May 2006. 



2486 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

AA103* 
PODIATRISTS ACT 2005 

No. 30 of 2005 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 
By His Excellency 

Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Governor, acting under the Podiatrists Act 2005 section 2 and with the advice 
and consent of the Executive Council, fix the day after the day on which this 
proclamation is published in the Government Gazette as the day on which the 
provisions of that Act, other than sections 1 and 2, come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 22 May 2007. 
By Command of the Governor, 

JIM McGINTY, Minister for Health. 

———— 
Note: Under section 22 of the Interpretation Act 1984, sections 1 and 2 came into 
operation on 12 December 2005. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

AA104* 
OSTEOPATHS ACT 2005 

No. 33 of 2005 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 
By His Excellency 

Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Governor, acting under the Osteopaths Act 2005 section 2 and with the advice 
and consent of the Executive Council, fix the day after the day on which this 
proclamation is published in the Government Gazette as the day on which the 
provisions of that Act, other than sections 1 and 2, come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 22 May 2007. 
By Command of the Governor, 

JIM McGINTY, Minister for Health. 

———— 
Note: Under section 22 of the Interpretation Act 1984, sections 1 and 2 came into 
operation on 12 December 2005. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2487 

 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG301* 

Local Government Act 1995 

Local Government (Change of District 
Boundaries) Order 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council, on the recommendation of 
the Minister, under sections 2.1 and 2.2 of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Local Government (Change of District 
Boundaries) Order 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  This order comes into operation on 1 July 2007. 

3. City of Stirling (Osborne Ward) — Boundary change 

 (1) The area of Glendalough described in Schedule 1 item 1 is 
excised from the Osborne Ward of the City of Stirling. 

 (2) The boundary to the City of Stirling Osborne Ward and the City 
of Stirling district is changed to reflect the excision of the area 
of Glendalough described in Schedule 1 item 1. 

4. City of Perth — Boundary change 

 (1) The area of West Perth described in Schedule 1 item 2 is 
excised from the City of Perth. 

 (2) The area of East Perth described in Schedule 1 item 3 is excised 
from the City of Perth. 

 (3) The boundary to the City of Perth district is changed to reflect 
the excision of —  

 (a) the area of West Perth described in Schedule 1 item 2; 
and 

 (b) the area of East Perth described in Schedule 1 item 3. 

5. Town of Vincent (North Ward) — Boundary change 

 (1) The area of Glendalough described in Schedule 1 item 1 is 
included in the North Ward of the Town of Vincent. 

 (2) The boundary to the Town of Vincent North Ward and the 
Town of Vincent district is changed to reflect the inclusion of 
the area of Glendalough described in Schedule 1 item 1. 



2488 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

6. Town of Vincent (South Ward) — Boundary change 

 (1) The area of West Perth described in Schedule 1 item 2 is 
included in the South Ward of the Town of Vincent. 

 (2) The area of East Perth described in Schedule 1 item 3 is 
included in the South Ward of the Town of Vincent. 

 (3) The boundary to the Town of Vincent South Ward and the 
Town of Vincent district is changed to reflect the inclusion 
of —  

 (a) the area of West Perth described in Schedule 1 item 2; 
and 

 (b) the area of East Perth described in Schedule 1 item 3. 

7. Information plan of the areas to be transferred 

  The boundaries of the areas to be transferred under this order, 
and the consequential changes to the boundaries of Wards 
resulting from those transfers are shown, for information 
purposes, in the plan in Schedule 2. 

Schedule 1 — Description of areas 
[cl. 3, 4, 5, 6] 

1. Transfer from the City of Stirling (Osborne Ward) to the Town of 
Vincent (North Ward) 

  An area of approximately 34 hectares comprising all that portion of 
land bounded by lines starting from the intersection of the centreline 
of Powis Street with the centreline of the Perth — Currambine 
Railway, a present north-western corner of the Town of Vincent, and 
extending generally north-westerly along the centreline of the 
Perth — Currambine Railway to a southern side of Scarborough 
Beach Road; thence generally easterly along sides of that road to the 
prolongation northerly of the western boundary of Lot 417, as shown 
in Plan 1939, a present north-western corner of the Town of Vincent, 
and thence southerly, generally south-westerly, easterly, again 
southerly, north-westerly, south-westerly, generally north-westerly 
and again south-westerly along boundaries of that town to the starting 
point. 

2. Transfer from the City of Perth to the Town of Vincent 
(South Ward) 

  An area of approximately 19.3 hectares comprising all that portion of 
land bounded by lines starting from the intersection of the centreline 
of Newcastle Street with the prolongation south-westerly of the 
centreline of Charles Street, a point on the present south-western 
boundary of the Town of Vincent, and extending south-westerly along 
that prolongation to the centreline of the Mitchell Freeway; thence 
generally north-westerly along that centreline to the centreline of 
Loftus Street, a present southern corner of the Town of Vincent, and 
thence generally north-easterly and south-easterly along boundaries of 
that town to the starting point. 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2489 

 

3. Transfer from the City of Perth to the Town of Vincent 
(South Ward) 

  An area of approximately 40.8 hectares comprising all that portion of 
land bounded by lines starting from the intersection of the 
prolongation easterly of the centreline of the eastern section of 
Summers Street with the high water mark of the right bank of the 
Swan River, a present south-eastern corner of the Town of Vincent, 
and extending generally southerly downwards along that high water 
mark to the centreline of the Graham Farmer Freeway; thence 
generally westerly and south-westerly along that centreline to the 
centreline of Lord Street; thence generally south-westerly along that 
centreline to the prolongation south-easterly of the centreline of 
Newcastle Street; thence north-westerly to and generally along that 
centreline to the prolongation south-westerly of the centreline of 
Lindsay Street, a present south-eastern corner of the Town of Vincent, 
and thence north-easterly, generally south-easterly, generally 
north-easterly and generally easterly along boundaries of that town to 
the starting point. 

Schedule 2 — Map 
[cl. 7] 

 

I recommend that the orders in clauses 3, 4, 5 and 6 be made as 
recommended by the Local Government Advisory Board. 

 

Minister for Local Government. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



2490 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

LG302* 

Local Government Act 1995 

Wanneroo District (Wards and Representation) 
Order 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Wanneroo District (Wards and Representation) 
Order 2007. 

2. Terms used in this order 

  In this order — 
 “councillor” means a councillor on the council of the City of 

Wanneroo; 
 “new ward” means a ward created by clause 4; 
 “old ward” means a ward abolished by clause 3; 
 “poll day 2007” means —  
 (a) 20 October 2007; or 
 (b) if another day for the holding of polls is fixed under 

section 4.7(2) of the Act —  
 (i) for all local governments; or 
 (ii) for the City of Wanneroo or for local 

governments, or a class of local governments, 
including that city, 

  that other day. 

3. Existing wards abolished 

  The wards into which the Wanneroo district is divided on poll 
day 2007 are abolished on the day after poll day 2007. 

4. Wanneroo district divided into new wards 

 (1) As from and including the day after poll day 2007 the 
Wanneroo district is divided into 4 wards. 

 (2) The names of the 4 wards are as follows — 
 (a) Central Ward; 
 (b) Coastal Ward; 
 (c) North Ward; 
 (d) South Ward. 

 (3) The boundaries of each of the 4 wards are set out in Schedule 1. 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2491 

 

5. Number of councillors for new wards 

  The number of offices of councillor for each new ward is as 
follows — 

 (a) for the Central Ward, 3; 
 (b) for the Coastal Ward, 4; 
 (c) for the North Ward, 2; 
 (d) for the South Ward, 5. 

6. Continuing councillors for old wards to be councillors for 
new wards 

 (1) In this clause —  
 “continuing councillor” means a person —  
 (a) who holds the office of councillor on poll day 2007; 

and 
 (b) whose term does not end on poll day 2007. 

 (2) After poll day 2007 any continuing councillor for an old ward 
named in column 1 of the Table to this subclause holds the 
office of councillor, subject to the Act, for the new ward named 
in column 2 of that Table opposite the old ward. 

Table 
Old ward New ward 
Central Ward Central Ward 
Wanneroo Ward Central Ward 
Coastal Ward Coastal Ward 
Hester Ward Coastal Ward 
North Ward North Ward 
South Ward South Ward 
Alexander Ward South Ward 

7. Elections of councillors for new wards 

 (1) In order to give effect to this order, councillors are to be elected 
under the Act to represent the new wards as follows —  

 (a) for the Central Ward, one; 
 (b) for the Coastal Ward, 2; 
 (c) for the North Ward, one; 
 (d) for the South Ward, 3. 

 (2) Any poll needed for an election referred to in subclause (1) is to 
be held under the Act on poll day 2007. 

 (3) If —  
 (a) on or before poll day 2007 a vacancy occurs in the office 

of a councillor who would otherwise have become a 
continuing councillor for an old ward named in column 
1 of the Table to clause 6(2); and 



2492 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

 (b) election day for the extraordinary election to fill the 
vacancy is on or after poll day 2007, 

  a person elected at the extraordinary election holds the office of 
councillor, subject to the Act — 

 (c) if elected under section 4.55 of the Act before poll day 
2007 — for the old ward until poll day 2007 and after 
that day for the new ward named in column 2 of that 
Table opposite the old ward; or 

 (d) if elected on poll day — for the new ward named in 
column 2 of that Table opposite the old ward. 

 (4) The elections referred to in subclause (1) and any extraordinary 
election referred to in subclause (3) are to be prepared for and 
conducted under the Act as if the new wards had been created 
and had the boundaries set out in Schedule 1. 

Schedule 1 — Ward boundaries 
[cl. 4(3)] 

1. Central Ward 

  The Central Ward is that portion of land bounded by lines — 
  starting from the intersection of the prolongation northerly of the 

eastern boundary of Lot 13, as shown on Diagram 76184, with the 
centreline of Neaves Road, a point on a present eastern boundary of 
the City of Wanneroo, and extending generally south-westerly along 
that centreline to the prolongation easterly of the northern boundary of 
Lot 39, as shown on Plan 16878;  

  then westerly to and along that boundary and westerly along the 
northern boundaries of Lots 38, 37 and 36 to the north-eastern corner 
of Lot 35;  

  then westerly and south-westerly along the northern and north-
western boundaries of that lot and south-westerly along the north-
western boundary of Lot 33 and onwards to the centreline of Neaves 
Road;  

  then generally westerly along that centreline and onwards to the 
prolongation north-easterly of the centreline of Greenvale Place;  

  then south-westerly to and generally south-westerly along that 
centreline and onwards to the centreline of Mornington Drive;  

  then generally south-westerly along that centreline and onwards to the 
centreline of Pinjar Road;  

  then northerly and generally north-westerly along that centreline and 
onwards to the centreline of Joondalup Drive;  

  then generally south-westerly along that centreline to the prolongation 
north-westerly of the south-western boundary of Lot 8, as shown on 
Plan 7782, a point on a present south-western boundary of the City of 
Wanneroo;  

  then generally south-easterly along boundaries of that city to the 
prolongation south-westerly of the centreline of Windsor Road;  

  then north-easterly to and generally north-easterly along that 
centreline to the prolongation north-westerly of the south-western 
boundary of Lot 16, as shown on Plan 6677; 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2493 

 

  then south-easterly to and along that boundary to the north-western 
boundary of Lot 3, as shown on Diagram 98587; 

  then south-westerly along that boundary to the north-western corner 
of Lot 4; 

  then south-easterly and southerly along the north-eastern and eastern 
boundaries of that lot and onwards to the centreline of Gnangara 
Road;  

  then easterly, generally north-easterly, generally easterly, again 
generally north-easterly and again generally easterly along that 
centreline to the prolongation southerly of the western boundary of 
Lot 3, as shown on Diagram 35098;  

  then northerly to and northerly, north-easterly, south-easterly and 
southerly along boundaries of that lot to the prolongation north-
westerly of the westernmost south-western boundary of Lot 800, as 
shown on Diagram 97325; 

  then south-easterly to and generally south-easterly along south-
western boundaries of that lot and onwards to the centreline of 
Gnangara Road;  

  then generally easterly along that centreline to the prolongation 
southerly of the eastern boundary of Swan Location 5199, as shown 
on Deposited Plan 161576, a point on a present eastern boundary of 
the City of Wanneroo; 

  then generally northerly along boundaries of that city to the starting 
point. 

2. Coastal Ward  

  The Coastal Ward is that portion of land bounded by lines — 
  starting from the south-western corner of Lot 14043, as shown on 

Deposited Plan 221400, a point on a present southern boundary of the 
City of Wanneroo, and extending generally north-westerly along the 
south-western boundaries of that lot to the south-eastern corner of 
Lot 854, as shown on Deposited Plan 32406; 

  then generally north-westerly, westerly, generally north-easterly and 
again generally north-westerly along boundaries of that lot to the 
southernmost south-western corner of the south-eastern severance of 
Lot 20, as shown on Plan 12486;  

  then generally north-westerly, westerly, north-westerly and north-
easterly along boundaries of that severance and onwards to the 
westernmost south-western corner of Lot 811, as shown on 
Plan 25657;  

  then generally north-easterly and generally north-westerly along 
north-western and south-western boundaries of that lot to the south-
eastern corner of Lot 812;  

  then generally north-westerly along south-western boundaries of that 
lot to a south-western corner of Lot 811;  

  then generally northerly along western boundaries of that lot to the 
southernmost south-western corner of the severance of Lot 14040, as 
shown on Deposited Plan 221398;  

  then northerly and generally north-westerly along western and south-
western boundaries of that severance to the southern corner of 
Lot 820, as shown on Deposited Plan 25660;  

  then north-westerly, south-westerly, again north-westerly, north-
easterly and generally north-westerly along boundaries of that lot to 



2494 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

the south-eastern corner of the north-western severance of Lot 10987 
(Reserve 27575), as shown on Deposited Plan 219820;  

  then westerly along the southern boundary of that severance to the 
south-eastern corner of Lot 3, as shown on Plan 9383;  

  then westerly along that boundary to the southernmost south-eastern 
corner of Lot 102, as shown on Plan 15760;  

  then westerly along the southern boundary of that lot and onwards to 
the low water mark of the Indian Ocean, a point on a present south-
western boundary of the City of Wanneroo; 

  then generally south-easterly and generally easterly along boundaries 
of that city to the starting point. 

3. North Ward  

  The North Ward is that portion of land bounded by lines — 
  starting from the intersection of the prolongation northerly of the 

eastern boundary of Lot 13, as shown on Diagram 76184, with the 
centreline of Neaves Road, a point on a present eastern boundary of 
the City of Wanneroo, and extending generally south-westerly along 
that centreline to the prolongation easterly of the northern boundary of 
Lot 39, as shown on Plan 16878; 

  then westerly to and along that boundary and westerly along the 
northern boundaries of Lots 38, 37 and 36 to the north-eastern corner 
of Lot 35; 

  then westerly and south-westerly along the northern and north-
western boundaries of that lot and south-westerly along the north-
western boundary of Lot 33 and onwards to the centreline of Neaves 
Road; 

  then generally westerly along that centreline and onwards to the 
prolongation north-easterly of the centreline of Greenvale Place; 

  then south-westerly to and generally south-westerly along that 
centreline and onwards to the centreline of Mornington Drive; 

  then generally south-westerly along that centreline and onwards to the 
centreline of Pinjar Road; 

  then northerly and generally north-westerly along that centreline and 
onwards to the centreline of Joondalup Drive; 

  then generally south-westerly along that centreline to the prolongation 
north-westerly of the south-western boundary of Lot 8, as shown on 
Plan 7782, a point on a present south-western boundary of the City of 
Wanneroo; 

  then north-westerly, generally south-westerly, northerly, generally 
north-westerly and westerly along boundaries of that city to the south-
western corner of Lot 14043, as shown on Deposited Plan 221400; 

  then generally north-westerly along the south-western boundaries of 
that lot to the south-eastern corner of Lot 854, as shown on Deposited 
Plan 32406; 

  then generally north-westerly, westerly, generally north-easterly and 
again generally north-westerly along boundaries of that lot to the 
southernmost south-western corner of the south-eastern severance of 
Lot 20, as shown on Plan 12486; 

  then generally north-westerly, westerly, north-westerly and north-
easterly along boundaries of that severance and onwards to the 
southernmost south-western corner of Lot 811, as shown on 
Plan 25657; 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2495 

 

  then generally north-easterly and generally north-westerly along 
north-western and south-western boundaries of that lot to the south-
eastern corner of Lot 812; 

  then generally north-westerly along south-western boundaries of that 
lot to a south-western corner of Lot 811;  

  then generally northerly along western boundaries of that lot to the 
southernmost south-western corner of the south-eastern severance of 
Lot 14040, as shown on Deposited Plan 221398;  

  then northerly and generally north-westerly along western and south-
western boundaries of that severance to the southern corner of 
Lot 820, as shown on Deposited Plan 25660;  

  then north-westerly, south-westerly, again north-westerly, north-
easterly and generally north-westerly along boundaries of that lot to 
the south-eastern corner of the north-western severance of Lot 10987 
(Reserve 27575), as shown on Deposited Plan 219820;  

  then westerly along the southern boundary of that severance to the 
south-eastern corner of Lot 3, as shown on Plan 9383;  

  then westerly along the southern boundary of that lot to the 
southernmost south-eastern corner of Lot 102, as shown on 
Plan 15760; 

  then westerly along the southern boundary of that lot and onwards to 
the low water mark of the Indian Ocean, a point on a present south-
western boundary of the City of Wanneroo; 

  then generally north-westerly, easterly, generally south-easterly, again 
easterly, southerly, again easterly, again southerly, again easterly and 
again southerly along boundaries of that city to the starting point. 

4. South Ward  

  The South Ward is that portion of land bounded by lines — 
  starting from the intersection of a western side of Wanneroo Road 

with the prolongation south-westerly of the centreline of Windsor 
Road, a point on a present south-western boundary of the City of 
Wanneroo and extending north-easterly to and generally north-
easterly along that centreline to the prolongation north-westerly of the 
south-western boundary of Lot 16, as shown on Plan 6677; 

  then south-easterly to and along that boundary to the north-western 
boundary of Lot 3, as shown on Diagram 98587; 

  then south-westerly along that boundary to the north-western corner 
of Lot 4;  

  then south-easterly and southerly along the north-eastern and eastern 
boundaries of that lot and onwards to the centreline of Gnangara 
Road; 

  then easterly, generally north-easterly, generally easterly, again 
generally north-easterly and again generally easterly along that 
centreline to the prolongation southerly of the western boundary of 
Lot 3, as shown on Diagram 35098;  

  then northerly to and northerly, north-easterly, south-easterly and 
southerly along boundaries of that lot to the prolongation north-
westerly of the westernmost south-western boundary of Lot 800, as 
shown on Diagram 97325;  

  then south-easterly to and generally south-easterly along south-
western boundaries of that lot and onwards to the centreline of 
Gnangara Road;  



2496 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

  then generally easterly along that centreline to the prolongation 
southerly of the eastern boundary of Swan Location 5199, as shown 
on Deposited Plan 161576, a point on a present eastern boundary of 
the City of Wanneroo; 

  then generally southerly, generally westerly, generally north-westerly, 
generally northerly and again generally north-westerly along 
boundaries of that city to the starting point. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

 

——————————— 
 
 

LG303* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

City of Belmont 
DUST AND LIQUID WASTE LOCAL LAW 2007 

Under the powers conferred upon it by the Local Government Act 1995, the Council 
of the City of Belmont resolved on 15 May 2007 to make the Dust and Liquid Waste 
Local Law 2007.  

PART 1—DEFINITION AND OPERATION  

1. Operation 
This Local Law will come into operation on the fourteenth day after the day on 
which it is published in the Government Gazette.  

2. Interpretation 
 (a) In this Local Law the following definitions apply— 

“Act” means the Local Government Act 1995;  
“authorised person” means a person authorised by the local government 

under section 9.10 of the Act to perform any of the functions of an 
authorised person under this Local Law;  

“district” means the district of the local government and includes any area 
placed under the jurisdiction of the local government pursuant to any 
Act or Regulation; 

“dust” means any visible granular or particulate material which has or has 
the potential to become airborne and includes organic matter and sand, 
but does not include smoke; 

“equipment” means equipment, machinery or vehicles used for or in 
connection with the development of land; 

“land” includes any building or other structure on the land; 
“liquid waste” means waste from any process or activity, whether useful or 

useless, that is in liquid form and includes paint, fuel, grease, fat, oil, 
degreaser, solvent, detergent, chemical, animal waste, food waste, 
effluent and all discharges of liquid to land or water that are not 
otherwise authorised by a written law but does not include 
uncontaminated stormwater; 

“local government” means the City of Belmont; 
“occupier” means any person who is in control of any land or part of any land 

or authorised by the owner, lessee, licensee or any other person 
empowered to exercise control in relation to land to perform any work in 
relation to any land and without limiting the generality of the foregoing 
and for the avoidance of doubt includes a builder or contractor; 

“owner” has the same meaning as given to it in the Local Government Act 
1995; 

“Regulations” mean the Local Government (Functions and General) 
Regulations 1996; 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2497 

 

“worker” means any registered builder, contractor or sub-contractor working 
on land in the district. 

 (b)  Where in this Local Law, a duty, obligation or liability is imposed on an 
owner or occupier the duty, obligation or liability, as the case may be, shall 
be deemed to be imposed jointly and severally on each of the owner and 
occupier. 

 (c)  Where, under this Local Law, an act is required to be done in relation to any 
land, the owner, occupier or worker shall cause to be done the act so 
required to be done. 

 (d)  Where, under this Local Law, an act is forbidden to be done in relation to 
any land, the owner, occupier or worker shall prevent from being done the 
act forbidden to be done. 

 (e)  Where this Local Law refers to the giving of notice no particular form of 
notice is required. 

PART 2—APPLICATION OF LOCAL LAW  
3. This Local Law applies to all land in the district.  

PART 3—PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES  
4. Any owner or / and occupier or worker of land must take effective measures to— 

 (a)  stabilise dust on the land;  
 (b)  contain all liquid waste on the land; 

 (c)  ensure no dust or liquid waste is released or escapes from the land whether 
by means of wind, water or any other cause; and  

 (d)  notify the owners or occupiers of adjoining land in writing 48 hours prior to 
the commencement of any activity that has the potential to cause the release 
or escape from the land of dust or liquid waste giving details of— 

 (i)  the nature of the activity; 

 (ii)  the proposed time and location of the activity; and  
 (iii)  the name of the person responsible for carrying out the activity and 

how and where that person may be contacted. 

5.  (a)  Where the local government or an authorised person forms the opinion 
that— 

 (i)  an owner, occupier or worker has not complied with sub-section 4(a) or 
sub-section 4(b); or  

 (ii)  dust or liquid waste has been released or escaped from the land,  

  the local government or an authorised person may serve on the owner, 
occupier or worker a notice requiring the owner, occupier or worker to 
do one or more of the following— 

 (iii)  comply with sub-section 4(a) or sub-section 4(b);  

 (iv) clean up and properly dispose of any released or escaped dust or liquid 
waste; 

 (v) clean up and make good any damage resulting from the released or 
escaped dust or liquid waste; or 

 (vi) take effective measures to stop any further release or escape of dust or 
liquid waste.  

 (b)  The requirements set out in a notice issued under sub-section 5(a) must be 
complied with— 

 (i) within 48 hours of service of the notice where no other time is 
specified;  

 (ii) within such other period as is specified in the notice; or  

 (iii) immediately, if the notice so specifies.  
6. Where the local government or an authorised person forms the opinion that dust 
or liquid waste has escaped or been released from an activity undertaken on land or 
as a consequence of the use of equipment on land, the local government or 
authorised person may serve a notice on the owner, occupier or worker, or the 
operator of the equipment, as the case may be, requiring that the activity or use of 
the equipment on the land be ceased immediately, for such period as is specified in 
such notice.  

7. Where the local government or an authorised person is of the opinion that dust or 
liquid waste may be released or escape as a result of an activity which is likely to be 
carried on from any land, the local government or an authorised person may give to 
the owner, occupier or worker a notice providing that the activity may only be 
carried on subject to conditions specified in the notice. 



2498 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

PART 4—MISCELLANEOUS  
8.  (a) Where a notice is given to the owner, occupier or worker and the owner, 

occupier or worker satisfies the local government or an authorised person 
within 48 hours, or by such other period as is specified in the notice from the 
date of giving of the notice that— 

 (i)  they were not responsible for the conduct in respect of which the 
notice was given pursuant to section 5, or the activity in respect of 
which a notice was given pursuant to section 6, as the case may be; 
and  

 (ii)  they took all reasonable precautions to prevent the conduct or activity, 
as the case may be; and  

 (iii)  where another person was responsible for the conduct or activity, it 
identifies the person responsible for the conduct or activity sufficiently 
to enable the notice to be issued to that person;  

  the local government or an authorised person may revoke the notice.  
 (b)  Clause 8(a) shall not apply where a notice is issued to which clause 5(b)(iii) 

applies.  

9. A person must not prevent or obstruct a duly authorised person or employee of the 
local government from carrying out his or her duties under this Local Law.  
10. The local government may delegate any of its powers, functions and duties under 
this Local Law in accordance with Part 5 Division 4 of the Local Government  
Act 1995. 

PART 5—OFFENCES AND PENALTIES 
11. Any person who— 

 (a)  fails to comply with a notice issued under clause 5, 6 or 7;  
 (b)  fails to do anything required or directed to be done under this Local Law;  

 (c)  does anything which under this Local Law the person is prohibited from 
doing; or  

 (d)  contravenes any provision of this Local Law,  

commits an offence. 
12. Any person who commits an offence under this Local Law shall be liable to— 

 (a)  a penalty not exceeding $5,000.00 and not less than— 
 (i)  in the case of a first such offence, $500.00;  

 (ii)  in the case of a second such offence, $1,500.00; and  
 (iii)  in the case of a third or subsequent offence, $3,000.00; and 

 (b)  if the offence is of a continuing nature, an additional penalty not exceeding 
$500.00 for each day or part of a day during which the offence has continued.  

13. An offence against any provision of this Local Law is a prescribed offence for the 
purposes of section 9.16(1) of the Act. 
14. The modified penalty for an offence against any provision of this Local Law is 
$100. 

———— 

The Common Seal of the City of Belmont was affixed here by authority of the 
Standing Orders Local Law 2006. 

SHAYNE SILCOX, Chief Executive Officer. 
Dated: 25 May 2007. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2499 

 

TRANSPORT 
TR301* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 31 May 2007. 

3. Specified day: section 28A 
  For the purposes of section 28A(3) of the Act, the specified day 

in relation to these regulations is 1 July 2007. 

4. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Charges and Fees) Regulations 2006*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 24 November 2006 p. 4843-85. 
  For amendments to 14 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

5. Regulation 20 amended 

  Regulation 20(1) is amended by deleting “$55” in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    $58    ”. 

6. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 clause 3 is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting “$14.75” and inserting instead —  
  “    $15.46    ”; 
 (b) by deleting “$343.00.” and inserting instead —  
  “    $355.00.    ”. 



2500 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

 (2) Schedule 1 clause 4 is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting “$14.75” and inserting instead —  
  “    $15.46    ”; 
 (b) by deleting “$1 485.00.” and inserting instead —  
  “    $1 537.00.    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 1 clause 5 is amended by deleting “$7.37” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $7.72    ”. 

 (4) Schedule 1 clause 6(1) is amended by deleting “$29.51.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $30.93.    ”. 

 (5) Schedule 1 clause 6(2) is amended by deleting “$44.29.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $46.42.    ”. 

 (6) Schedule 1 clause 7 is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting “$3.69” and inserting instead —  
  “    $3.87    ”; 
 (b) by deleting “$86.00.” and inserting instead —  
  “    $90.00.    ”. 

 (7) Schedule 1 clause 8 is amended by deleting the Table to the 
clause and inserting instead —  

“     
Table 

Licence Class Charge 
$ 

1B2 355 
2B2 592 
2B3 1 478 
AB3 592 

    ”. 
 (8) Schedule 1 clause 9 is amended by deleting the Table to the 

clause and inserting instead —  

“     
Table 

Licence Class Charge 
$ 

1R2 355 
2R2 592 
1R3 710 
2R3 946 
1R4 1 065 
2R4 2 365 
1R5 1 065 
2R5 2 365 
SR2 651 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2501 

 

Licence Class Charge 
$ 

SR3 2 365 
SR4 2 365 
SR5 2 365 
MR2 4 494 
MR3 4 494 
MR4 4 848 
MR5 4 848 
LR2 6 208 
LR3 6 208 
LR4 6 208 
LR5 6 208 

    ”. 
 (9) Schedule 1 clause 10 is amended by deleting the Table to the 

clause and inserting instead —  
“     

Table 
Licence Class Charge 

$ 
SP2 1 537 
SP3 4 019 
SP4 5 201 
SP5 5 201 
MP2 4 729 
MP3 5 911 
MP4 6 503 
MP5 6 503 
1LP2 5 911 
1LP3 5 911 
1LP4 6 503 
1LP5 6 503 
2LP2 5 911 
2LP3 5 911 
2LP4 6 503 
2LP5 6 503 

    ”. 

 (10) Schedule 1 clause 11 is amended by deleting “$343.00” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $355.00    ”. 

 (11) Schedule 1 clause 12 is amended by deleting the Table to the 
clause and inserting instead —  
“     

Table 
Licence Class Charge 

$ 
PSV 90 
TSV 90 

OSV2 296 
OSV3 592 
OSV4 888 
OSV5 1 184 



2502 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

Licence Class Charge 
$ 

OSV6 1 480 
OSV7 1 776 
OSV8 2 072 
OSV9 2 368 

    ”. 
 (12) Schedule 1 Division 2 is amended as follows: 
 (a) in item 10 by deleting “10.15” and inserting instead —  
  “    10.65    ”; 
 (b) in item 11 by deleting “16.75” and inserting instead —  
  “    17.55    ”. 

7. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 item 4 is amended as follows: 
 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “35.00” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    36.60    ”; 
 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “111.00” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    116.00.    ”. 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 
G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

WATER/SEWERAGE 
WA301* 

Water Services Licensing Act 1995 

Water Services Licensing (Plumbers Licensing 
and Plumbing Standards) Amendment 

Regulations (No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Water Services Licensing (Plumbers 
Licensing and Plumbing Standards) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2007. 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2503 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 June 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Water Services 
Licensing (Plumbers Licensing and Plumbing Standards) 
Regulations 2000*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 1 October 2004. 
  For amendments to 8 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 1 May 2007.] 

4. Regulation 14 amended 

  Regulation 14 is amended by deleting “issued to” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    held by    ”. 

5. Regulation 15 amended 

  Regulation 15(1) is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting “licence or permit” and inserting instead —  
  “    licence    ”; 
 (b) by deleting “or permit fee”. 
 Note: The heading to regulation 15 will be changed by deleting “or permit”. 

6. Regulation 17 amended 

 (1) Regulation 17(1) is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting “licence or permit” in each place where it 

occurs and inserting instead —  
  “    licence    ”; 
 (b) by deleting “or permit fee”. 

 (2) Regulation 17(2) is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting “licence or permit” and inserting instead —  
  “    licence    ”; 
 (b) by deleting “or permit holder” in both places where it 

occurs. 

 (3) Regulation 17(3) is amended by deleting “or permit”. 

 (4) After regulation 17(3) the following subregulation is inserted —  
“     
 (4) There are to be no permits other than those in force 

immediately before 30 June 2007. 
    ”. 



2504 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

7. Regulation 18 amended 

  Regulation 18 is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting “licence or permit” and inserting instead —  
  “    licence    ”; 
 (b) by deleting “or permit fee”. 
 Note: The heading to regulation 18 will be changed by deleting “or permit”. 

8. Regulation 19 amended 

 (1) Regulation 19(1) is amended by deleting “or permit” in both 
places where it occurs. 

 (2) After regulation 19(1) the following subregulation is inserted —  
“     
 (1a) A permit is subject to the conditions specified in 

the permit. 
    ”. 

9. Regulation 20 amended 

 (1) Regulation 20(1) is amended by deleting “15 June in each year” 
and inserting instead —  
“     

  on the 15th day before the day on which the licence or 
permit is due to expire 

    ”. 

 (2) After regulation 20(1) the following subregulation is inserted —  
“     
 (1a) If a licence or permit is due to expire on 30 June 2007, 

the notice of renewal must also specify the period for 
which the licence or permit may be renewed, being a 
period of not less than one year, or more than 3 years, 
after 30 June 2007 determined by the Board in respect 
of that licence or permit. 

    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 20(3) is amended by deleting “30 June” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    day    ”. 

 (4) Regulation 20(4) and (5) are repealed. 

 (5) Regulation 20(6) is repealed and the following subregulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (6) If the renewal fee for a licence or permit and any 

photographs required under subregulation (1) are not 
received by the Board within the period mentioned in 
subregulation (3), the licence or permit cannot be 
renewed. 

    ”. 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2505 

 

 (6) Regulation 20(8) is amended by deleting “subregulations (3) 
and (4)” and inserting instead —  

  “    subregulation (3)    ”. 

10. Regulation 21 amended 

  Regulation 21(1) is repealed and the following subregulations 
are inserted instead —  

“     
 (1) A licence or permit remains in force, subject to these 

regulations, for the period mentioned in whichever of 
subregulation (1a), (1b), (1c) or (1d) is applicable, and 
that period is to be stated in the licence or permit. 

 (1a) A licence that is issued on or after 1 June 2007 remains 
in force until the end of the period of 3 years beginning 
on the day on which it is issued. 

 (1b) Except as provided in subregulation (1d), a renewed 
licence or permit remains in force until the end of the 
period of 3 years after the day on which it would 
otherwise have expired. 

 (1c) A licence or permit that is in force immediately before 
1 June 2007 remains in force until 30 June 2007. 

 (1d) If a licence or permit that is due to expire on 
30 June 2007 is renewed, the renewed licence or permit 
remains in force until the end of the period specified, as 
required by regulation 20(1a), in the notice of renewal 
issued under regulation 20(1). 

 (1e) If a licence or permit is renewed under 
subregulation (1d) for a period of less than 3 years, the 
renewal fee is the relevant fee set out in Schedule 1 
reduced pro rata and rounded up or down to the nearest 
whole dollar. 

    ”. 

11. Regulations 26A and 26B inserted 

  After regulation 26 the following regulations are inserted in 
Part 3 —  

“     
26A. Licence or permit can be surrendered 

 (1) A licensee or permit holder may surrender the licence 
or permit by giving written notice to the Board 
specifying the day on which the licence or permit is 
surrendered. 

 (2) The day specified cannot be earlier than the day on 
which the notice is given to the Board. 

 (3) The licence or permit must be given back to the Board 
on or before the day on which it is surrendered. 



2506 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

26B. Refund of fees 

 (1) If a licence or permit is surrendered, the Board is to 
refund to the former licensee or permit holder so much 
of the fee last paid for the licence or permit as the 
Board, on application by the former licensee or permit 
holder, determines as appropriate to be refunded. 

 (2) If a plumbing contractor’s licence is issued to a person 
who holds a tradesperson’s licence or a tradesperson’s 
licence (drainage plumbing), the Board is to refund to 
the person so much of the fee last paid for the 
tradesperson’s licence or a tradesperson’s licence 
(drainage plumbing) as the Board determines as 
appropriate to be refunded. 

    ”. 

12. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 clause 1 is amended in the Table as follows: 
 (a) by deleting item 2A; 
 (b) in items 3 and 5 by deleting “200.00” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    500.00    ”; 
 (c) in items 4 and 6 by deleting “75.00” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    185.00    ”; 
 (d) by deleting item 4A; 
 (e) in item 6A by deleting “$25.00” and inserting instead —  
  “    250.00    ”; 
 (f) by deleting items 7, 8 and 8A. 

 (2) Schedule 1 clause 2 is repealed. 

13. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 clause 5 is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting paragraph (a); 
 (b) by deleting paragraph (c) but not “and” after it. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2507 

 

WORKCOVER 
WC301* 

WORKERS’ COMPENSATION AND INJURY MANAGEMENT 
ACT 1981 

APPROVED MEDICAL SPECIALISTS ORDER (NO. 3) 2007 
Made by WorkCover WA under section 146F(4) of the Act. 

1. Citation 
This order is the Approved Medical Specialists Order (No. 3) 2007. 

2. Approved medical specialists 
The following medical practitioner’s designation as an approved medical specialist 
under section 146F(4) of the Act is cancelled— 

Mr Harold Stock 

ADRIAN WARNER, Chief Executive Officer, 
WorkCover WA. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 



2508 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

— PART 2 — 

CEMETERIES 
CC401* 

CEMETERIES ACT 1986 
ALBANY CEMETERY BOARD 

Fees and Charges 
In pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by section 53 of the Cemeteries Act 1986, the Albany 
Cemetery Board hereby records having resolved on the 30th day of April 2007 to set the following fees 
and charges effective from 1st day of July 2007. The fees and charges shall be payable upon 
application for services detailed hereunder. 

Schedule of Fees and Charges 
All fees and charges are inclusive of 10% GST (except where shown exempt) 

$ 
1. Grant of Right of Burial (25 year tenure period) 
 Grave Site (2.4m x 1.2m).............................................................................................................. 995.50 
 Pre-need purchase—land selected by applicant or land reserved in advance........................ 1,188.00 

Approval to any refund on an unexpired Grant of Right of Burial shall be at the absolute 
discretion of the Board and in any case, the approved refund shall not exceed the 
amount originally paid, less an Administration fee of ................................................................ 121.00 

2. Burial Fees— 
 (a) Adult Burial .......................................................................................................................... 775.50 
 (b) Child Burial (under 13 years) .............................................................................................. 495.00 
 (c) Stillborn Burial in special ground set aside ........................................................................ 196.90 
 (d) Stillborn plaque on kerbing.................................................................................................. 231.00 
 (e) Re-opening of occupied gravesite, and burial...................................................................... 786.50 
3. Exhumation fee.......................................................................................................................... 1,353.00 
 Re-burial after exhumation.......................................................................................................... 775.50 
4. Annual Licence fees (GST exempt)— 
 Funeral Director........................................................................................................................... 495.00 
 (a) Single Funeral Permit (Funeral Directors only) ................................................................. 245.00 
 (b) Single Funeral Permit (other than Funeral Director) ........................................................ 325.00 
 Monumental Mason...................................................................................................................... 245.00 
 (a) Single Permit (Monumental Mason only) 245.00 
 (b) Single Permit (other than Monumental Mason) 325.00 
 (c) Single Permit/Licence Memorial Gardens (for each Memorial) 245.00 
5. Monumental Work (GST exempt) 
 Permit for each memorial— 
 Marker Memorial Park Cemetery.......................................................................................... 115.50 
 Lawn Area type monument to By-laws.................................................................................... 95.00 
 Charge for maintenance of ground surrounding headstone ................................................. 275.00 
 Renovations and additions to any monument ......................................................................... 75.00 
 Additional Inscription............................................................................................................... 65.00 
6. Miscellaneous fees— 
 (a) Copy of Grant of Right of Burial .......................................................................................... 121.00 
 (b) Extraordinary work required, per hour............................................................................... 121.00 
 (c) Use of chapel for burial/memorial service with sound system ........................................... 121.00 
 (d) Transfer of Grant of Right of Burial .................................................................................... 121.00 
7. Extra to Scheduled Fees & Charges— 
 (a) Interment or Cremation without due notice as per By-laws .............................................. 401.50 
 (b) Late arrival/departure.......................................................................................................... 121.00 
 (c) Interment of oblong or oversize casket ................................................................................ 220.00 
 (d) Interment or Cremation on a Saturday............................................................................... 401.50 
 (e) Search fee—involving Board Staff (minimum) ..................................................................... 16.50 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2509 

 

$ 
8. Cremation fees— 
 (a) Adult Cremation....................................................................................................................924.00 
 (b) Child Cremation (under 13 years) ........................................................................................485.10 
 (c) Stillborn Cremation (no service)...........................................................................................121.00 
 (d) Pre-need Cremation Certificate.........................................................................................1,061.50 

Approval to any refund on an unused Cremation Agreement shall be at the absolute 
discretion of the Board and in any case, the approved refund shall not exceed the 
amount originally paid, less an Administration fee of ................................................................121.00 

9. Disposal of Ashes—The tenure on all Cremation Memorials shall be 25 years from date 
of receipt of Scheduled fee— 

 (i) Gardens of Remembrance 
  Shrubbery 
 (a) 114x76mm 6 line bronze plaque and reservation for second interment...................324.50 
  Second interment and bronze plaque.........................................................................269.50 
 (b) 143x117mm 8 line bronze plaque and reservation for second interment.................631.40 
  Second interment with second inscription .................................................................576.40 
 (c) 229x229mm 10-line bronze plaque and reservation for second interment...............858.00 
  Second interment with second inscription .................................................................803.00 
 (d) 229X229 6 line bronze plaque with recessed vase and reservation for two 

further interments ......................................................................................................958.65 
  Second or third interment with new inscription........................................................903.65 

Rose Garden 
 (e) 143x117mm 8 line bronze plaque and reservation for second interment.................733.70 
  Second interment with second inscription .................................................................678.70 
 (f) 143x117mm sculpted 8 line bronze plaque and reservation for second 

interment.....................................................................................................................778.25 
  Second interment with second inscription .................................................................723.25 
 (g) 184x229mm 8 line bronze plaque and reservation for second interment..............1,069.20 
  Second interment with second inscription ..............................................................1,014.20 
 (h) 184x229mm sculpted 8 line bronze plaque and reservation for second 

interment..................................................................................................................1,117.60 
  Second interment with second inscription ..............................................................1,069.20 
 (i) 229x229mm 10 line bronze plaque and reservation for second interment...............976.80 
  Second interment with second inscription .................................................................921.80 
 (j) 229x229mm sculpted 10 line bronze plaque and reservation for second 

interment..................................................................................................................1,063.70 
  Second interment with second inscription ..............................................................1,008.70 
 (ii) Memorial Niche Walls 

No. 1 
Double niche with 5 line bronze plaque ...............................................................................605.00 
Second inscription .................................................................................................................207.90 
Single niche with 5 line bronze plaque.................................................................................392.70 
No. 2 and No. 3 
Double niche with 3 line bronze backing plate and 5 line first detachable plate...............903.10 
Second inscription .................................................................................................................286.00 
Single niche with 8 line bronze plaque.................................................................................447.70 

 (iii) Memorial Wall 
6 line bronze plaque with reservation for second interment...............................................669.90 
Second interment with inscription .......................................................................................614.90 

 (iv) Compartment CZ Memorial Gardens 
 (a) Sculpted Border 381x279mm 8 line bronze plaque single site only.......................1,287.00 
 (b) Sculpted Border & Sculpted Design 381x279mm 8 line bronze plaque single 

site only.....................................................................................................................1,346.40 
 (c) Sculpted Border double 381x279mm with 1st detachable plate ............................1,450.90 
  Second detachable plate..............................................................................................269.50 
 (d) Sculpted Border & Sculpted Design double 381x279mm with 1st detachable 

plate ..........................................................................................................................1,494.90 
  Second detachable plate..............................................................................................269.50 
 (e) Modular 381x279mm 8 line bronze plaque single site only ...................................1,329.90 



2510 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

$ 
 (v) Pre-need site reservation for all Gardens & Walls (plaque not included) (non 

refundable fee) 159.50 

 (vi) Non standard memorials (seats and rock placements) by quotation 
 (vii) Emblems, Photographs, Colour, Extra lines on any Memorials by quotation & extra 

to plaque fee 

 (viii) Grant Fees by quotation dependant on memorial site chosen 
10. Other Fees— 
 Marker for Memorial Park Cemetery unmarked grave (no tenure, plus permit fee).......... 929.50 
 Interment of Ashes in family Grave....................................................................................... 138.60 
 Attendance at Gravesite/Memorial Gardens for placement of Ashes (15 minutes)............... 82.50 
 Attendance at Gravesite/Memorial Gardens for placement of Ashes Saturday 

(15 minutes) ............................................................................................................................ 165.00 
 Collection of Ashes (service pre 01.07.2004) from Cemetery Office (24 hours notice 

required).................................................................................................................................... 88.00 
 Postage of Ashes within Australia ......................................................................................... 148.50 
 Postage of Ashes Overseas (by quotation) and including an administration fee of ............. 121.00 
 Scattering of Ashes to the winds............................................................................................ 121.00 
 Storage in safe custody (after six months) per month ............................................................ 16.50 
 Transfer of Ashes to new position (plaque extra if required) ............................................... 121.00 
 Granite Base Upgrade (143x117)........................................................................................... 168.30 
 Granite Base Upgrade (229x229)........................................................................................... 184.80 
 Acceptance and registration of Ashes from other Crematoria.............................................. 121.00 
 Ashes Container........................................................................................................................ 27.50 
 Presentation Urns and Keepsakes by quotation 

WILLEM ROTH, Chairman. 
NOELLA E. E. COOK, Administrator. 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 
CE401 

COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943 
COMPANY TO BE STRUCK OF REGISTER 

(Section 296(3)) 
Notice is hereby given that at the expiration of three months from the date hereof, the name of the 
undermentioned Co-operative Company will, unless cause is shown to the contrary, be struck off the 
register and the company will be dissolved— 

Bindoon Chittering Growers Cooperative Ltd 
Dated this 21st day of May 2007. 

WILL MORGAN, for the Registrar for Consumer Protection. 

FISHERIES 
FI401* 

FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 
PILBARA FISH TRAWL FISHERY (INTERIM) MANAGEMENT PLAN 

AMENDMENT 2007 
FD 219/19 [803] 
Made by the Minister under section 54. 

1. Citation  
This instrument is the Pilbara Fish Trawl Fishery (Interim) Management Plan Amendment 2007. 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2511 

 

2. Management Plan amended 
The amendments in this instrument are to the Pilbara Fish Trawl Interim Managed Fishery 
Management Plan 1997*. 

3. Clause 3 replaced 
Clause 3 is repealed and the following clause inserted instead— 
 “ 3. Cessation 
  This Plan will cease to have effect on 30 June 2009. ”  . 

[*Published in the Gazette of 23 December 1997. For amendments to 29 March 2007 see the Pilbara 
Fish Trawl Interim Managed Fishery Management Plan Amendment 1998 published in the Gazette of 
30 December 1998, the Pilbara Fish Trawl Fishery (Interim) Management Plan Amendment 1999 
published in the Gazette of 21 December 1999, the Pilbara Fish Trawl Fishery (Interim) Management 
Plan Amendment 2000 published in the Gazette of 12 December 2000, the Pilbara Fish Trawl Fishery 
(Interim) Management Plan Amendment 2001 published in the Gazette of 18 December 2001, the 
Pilbara Fish Trawl Fishery (Interim) Management Plan Amendment 2002 published in the Gazette of 
24 December 2002, and the Pilbara Fish Trawl Fishery (Interim) Management Plan Amendment 2005 
published in the Gazette of 24 May 2005. 
See regulation 183 of the Fish Resources Management Regulations 1995 concerning the citation of 
notices in force under the Fisheries Act 1905 immediately before the commencement of those 
regulations.] 

Dated this 8th day of May 2007. 

JON FORD, Minister for Fisheries. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG401 

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 
Shire of Northam 
APPOINTMENT 

It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Brett Smith has been appointed a Fire Control 
Officer for the Jennapullin Bush Fire Brigade (Shire of Northam). 

A. J. MIDDLETON, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

LG402* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT 1960 

City of Mandurah 
APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED OFFICER 

It is hereby notified for public information that Linda Jean Emery has been appointed as a Ranger 
and Pound Keeper pursuant to Part XX, Section 449 of the Local Government (Miscellaneous 
Provisions) Act 1960. The appointment is effective as of 30 May 2007. 

MARK NEWMAN, Chief Executive Officer. 

MARINE/MARITIME 
MX401* 

SHIPPING AND PILOTAGE (MOORING CONTROL AREA) REGULATIONS 1983  
DETERMINATION OF FEES  

Pursuant to the Shipping and Pilotage (Mooring Control Area) Regulations, the Department for 
Planning and Infrastructure hereby gives notice that, in respect of the mooring control areas in the 
waters of the State detailed in the Schedule to the Notice, it has been determined that as of 1 July 
2007 until further notice, the fee payable for hiring a swing mooring site shall be the amount 
calculated in accordance with the Schedule.  



2512 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

The Schedule  

Location Current Annual Fee 
$ 

New 
Annual Fee for 2007/08 

$ 
Albany—Princess Royal Boat Harbour 
and Emu Point Boat Harbour 

69.58 72.93 

Bremer Bay, Fishery Beach 128.36 134.53 
Bunbury, Casuarina Boat Harbour 59.64 62.49 
Carnarvon Fishing Boat Harbour 
(Inner Harbour) 

79.18  

Esperance (Bandy Creek) Boat Harbour  67.07 70.29 
Exmouth Boat Harbour— (Within 
Harbour Breakwater)1 

126.53 132.60 

1 Exmouth Boat Harbour (Outside 
Harbour Breakwater)  

63.25 66.29 

Jurien Boat Harbour (Inner Harbour) 65.60 68.74 
Kalbarri 70.40  
Onslow/Beadon Creek Boat Harbour 46.06 48.28 
Point Samson Johns Creek Boat 
Harbour 

27.02 28.31 

Port Denison Boat Harbour  
Commercial vessels (per vessel) 
Plus 
Recreational vessels 

 
676.50 
77.00 
48.40 

 

Note—Unless otherwise indicated, payment of a swing mooring fee entitles the hirer to free use of any 
service jetty in the mooring control area for loading and unloading the vessel subject to availability of 
berth space and direction of authorised officers.  
1 Applies to vessels mooring within the mooring control area. The two “Kailis Seabed Piles” at 
harbour entrance (marked by spar buoys) are deemed to be within the harbour breakwater. Vessels 
are subject to the following prescribed fees for berths and services.  

IN RESPECT OF THE MOORING CONTROL AREAS AT BREMER BAY, 
EXMOUTH AND CARNARVON 

 Current Fee New Fee 
Part year fee—three months or 
more and paid in advance 

Part 10% of the annual fee per 
month  

 

Monthly fee 20% of the annual fee per 
month  

 

Weekly fee—  
Bremer Bay  
Exmouth (Within Harbour 
Breakwater)  
Exmouth (Outside Harbour 
Breakwater)   
Carnarvon  

 
$6.40 per metre of vessel 
$6.30 per metre of vessel 
 
$3.20 per metre of vessel 
 
$7.25 per metre of vessel 

 
$6.69 per metre of vessel 
$6.63 per metre of vessel 
 
$3.35 per metre of vessel  

Daily fee—  
Bremer Bay  
Exmouth (Within Harbour 
Breakwater)  
Exmouth (Outside Harbour 
Breakwater)  
Carnarvon  

 
$1.28 per metre of vessel 
$1.26 per metre of vessel 
 
$0.64 per metre of vessel 
 
$1.45 per metre of vessel 

 
$1.34 per metre of vessel 
$1.33 per metre of vessel 
 
$0.67 per metre of vessel  

IN RESPECT OF THE MOORING CONTROL AREAS AT ONSLOW/BEADON CREEK AND 
POINT SAMSON 

 Current New 
Monthly fee— 20% of the annual fee per 

month  
 

Daily fee—  
Onslow 
Point Samson 

 
$1.83 per metre of vessel  
$0.28 per metre of vessel 

 
$1.93 per metre of vessel 
$0.30 per metre of vessel 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2513 

 

IN RESPECT OF THE MOORING CONTROL AREAS AT JURIEN, KALBARRI AND 
PORT DENISON 

 Current New 
Daily fee— 
Jurien 
Kalbarri 
Port Denison 

 
$1.19 per metre of vessel  
$0.68 per metre of vessel  
$11.00 per vessel (per day or 
part thereof) 

 
$1.24 per metre of vessel 

GREGORY STUART MARTIN, Director General, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure.  

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 
PI401* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENTS: 

1133/57—KIARA TAFE SITE LOTS 843 BOTTLE BRUSH DRIVE AND 14122 
MORLEY DRIVE, KIARA 

1134/57—CARINE TAFE SITE LOCATION 7398 MARMION AVENUE, CARINE 
Call for Public Submissions 

The Western Australian Planning Commission (WAPC) intends to amend the Metropolitan Region 
Scheme (MRS) for land in the cities of Swan and Stirling and public comment is invited. 

1133/57—Kiara TAFE Site  
The amendment proposes to transfer lots 843 Bottle Brush Drive and 14122 Morley Drive, the Kiara 
TAFE site land, from a public purposes (technical school) reservation to the urban zone in the MRS. 
The planning objective of the amendment is to enable the land to be redeveloped for a variety of 
urban purposes, in accordance with an Outline Development Plan, which will be undertaken under 
the local planning scheme. 

1134/57—Carine TAFE Site  
The amendment proposes to transfer location 7398, the Carine TAFE site land, from a public 
purposes (technical school) reservation to the urban zone in the MRS. 
The planning objective of this amendment is to allow for the land to be redeveloped for a variety of 
urban purposes in accordance with detailed structure planning to be prepared and approved under 
provisions for a development zone in the City of Stirling’s District Planning Scheme No. 3. 

Certificate 
The WAPC has certified that, in its opinion, the amendments do not constitute a substantial 
alteration to the MRS. 

Display Locations 
Full details of the proposals can be found in the WAPC explanatory amendment reports. A separate 
report exists for each amendment. These documents, along with the amending plans and other 
supporting documentation showing the proposed change to the zones and reservations of the MRS, 
will be available for public inspection from Tuesday 29 May 2007 to Friday 3 August 2007 at the 
following locations— 
1133/57—Municipal offices of the cities of Swan, Bayswater and the Town of Bassendean. 
1134/57—Municipal offices of the cities of Stirling and Joondalup. 
All documents are also available at the offices of— 
 • Western Australian Planning Commission, 469 Wellington Street, Perth 
 • J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 
Documents are also available from the WAPC website www.wapc.wa.gov.au. 

Submissions 
Any person who desires to make a submission to support, object or provide comment on any part of 
the proposed amendments should do so on a form 57. This submission form is available from the 
display locations, the relevant amendment report and the internet. 
Submissions must be lodged with the: Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission, 
469 Wellington Street, Perth WA 6000; on or before 5.00pm Friday, 3 August 2007. Late submissions 
will not be considered. 

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 



2514 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT 1132/57 
NORTH WEST DISTRICTS OMNIBUS 7 

Call for Public Submissions 

The Western Australian Planning Commission (WAPC) intends to amend the Metropolitan Region 
Scheme (MRS) for land in the local government of Wanneroo and is seeking public comment. 
The planning objective of the amendment is to rationalise the zones and reservations of the MRS in 
the Butler and Ridgewood localities, to correspond with the Butler-Jindalee District Structure Plan, 
and to facilitate the re-alignment of the passenger railway line north from the proposed Butler 
station. 
The Western Australian Planning Commission certifies that, in its opinion, the proposed amendment 
does not constitute a substantial alteration to the Metropolitan Region Scheme. 
Section 126(3) of the Planning and Development Act 2005 allows for the ‘parallel’ amendment of a 
local planning scheme when land is transferred to the urban zone in the region scheme. The City of 
Wanneroo has requested approval to include the land affected by the region scheme amendments in 
the development zone of the local planning scheme.  
If the region scheme amendment is approved, the WAPC may also transfer the land to the 
development zone in the local planning scheme. This will enable detailed structure planning to 
commence under the local planning scheme process, which includes the opportunity for further public 
consultation. 
The plans showing the proposed change and the WAPC amendment report, which explains the 
proposals, will be available for public inspection from Tuesday 29 May 2007 to Friday 3 August 2007 
at each of the following places— 
 • Western Australian Planning Commission, 469 Wellington Street, Perth 
 • J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 
 • Municipal offices of the cities of Wanneroo and Joondalup 
Documents are also available from the WAPC’s website www.wapc.wa.gov.au. 
Any person who desires to make a submission to support, object or provide comment on any part of 
the proposed amendment should do so on a form 57. This submission form is available from the 
display locations, the amendment report and the internet. 
Submissions must be lodged with the: Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission, 
469 Wellington Street, Perth WA 6000; on or before 5.00pm Friday, 3 August 2007. 
Late submissions will not be considered. 

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PI403* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Coorow 

Town Planning Scheme No 2—Amendment No 2 
Ref: 853/3/20/2 Pt 2 
It us hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister of Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of Coorow 
local planning scheme amendment on 20 March 2007 for the purpose of— 
 a. rezoning Crown Lots 716 and 717 east of Green Head Road, Green Head, from ‘Special Use’, 

‘Parks and Recreation’ ‘Residential’ and ‘Rural’ to ‘Major Road’, as more clearly set out in the 
Scheme Amendment Map A. 

 b. reclassifying Crown Reserve 41662 and portion of Crown Lot 710 from ‘Special Use’ and 
‘Parks and Recreation’ to ‘Public Purposes—Public Utilities’. as more clearly set out in the 
Scheme Amendment Map A. 

 c. reclassifying portion of Crown Lot 542 Green Head Road from, ‘Special Use’ and ‘No Zone’ to 
‘Parks and Recreation’. as more clearly set out in the Scheme Amendment Map A. 

 d. rezoning Crown Lot 524 Green Head Road, Green Head, from ‘Parks and Recreation’ to 
‘Residential’ as more clearly set out in Scheme Amendment Map B. 

 e. rezoning Crown Land 184 cnr Bryant Street and Greenhead Road, Green Head, from 
‘Commercial’ to ‘Tourist Accommodation’ as more clearly shown on Scheme Amendment Map 
C.  



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2515 

 

 f. rezoning Vacant Crown Land on the south side of Bryant Street, Green Head, from ‘Tourist 
Accommodation’ to ‘Residential—R12.5’ as more clearly shown on Scheme Amendment 
Map C. 

M. J. GIRANDO, Shire President. 
G. A. SHERRY, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 
PI404* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005  
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

Shire of Coorow  
Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 5  

Ref: 853/3/20/2 Pt 5 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Coorow local planning scheme amendment on 16 April 2007 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lot 41 Nairn Street, Leeman, from ‘Special Use—Hardware Store’ zone to 

‘Residential’ zone. 
 2. Adding an R Code of ‘R15’ to Lot 41 Nairn Street, Leeman, and 
 3. Adding a new Additional Use to Schedule 2 by inserting the following— 

 No. Description 
of Land 

Additional 
Use Conditions 

A4 4 Lot 41  
Nairn 
Street, 
Leeman 

Shop  
Showroom 

 • Hours of operation of the business are to be 
between the hours 8.00am to 6.00pm.  

 • The premises are not to be used for the sale 
of food, unless it is only incidental to the 
predominant use on the site. 

 • The premises are not to employ the use of 
noisy machinery, except to the extent that 
might be expected of a handyman in a 
residential area. 

 • Business is to be operated in a manner that 
remains cognisant of the fact that it is 
located in a residential zone, and not do 
anything that might downgrade the 
amenity of the area. 

 • The business is not to undertake any 
activity that might require a Dangerous 
Goods Licence unless the planning 
approval of Council has first been obtained. 

 • Any change of use of the premises is to 
require the planning approval of Council. 
The Council will refuse any change of use 
where such new use is likely to be more 
damaging to the amenity of the residential 
area than the previous use. 

M. J. GIRANDO, Shire President. 
G. A. SHERRY, Chief Executive Officer. 

POLICE 
PO501* 

POLICE ACT 1892 
POLICE AUCTION 

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892, unclaimed and forfeited property and bicycles will be sold 
by public auction Ross’s Sales & Auctions, 241 Railway Parade, Maylands on Wednesday 13 June 
2007 at 10.00am. 
The auction is to be conducted by Mr Brad Buckle, Mr. Craig Edwards, Mr. Kevin Grickage. 

K. O’CALLAGHAN, Commissioner of Police, 
Western Australia Police Service. 



2516 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

WORKSAFE 
WS401* 

OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH ACT 1984 
OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH REGULATIONS 1996 

EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE PURSUANT TO REGULATION 2.13 
(No. 10 of 2007) 

I, Nina Lyhne, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner, hereby grant an exemption to Western 
Australian Meat Marketing Co-operative Limited from the requirements of Regulation 4.43(1)(a) of 
the Occupational Safety and Health Regulations 1996 in relation to the need for two steam boilers at 
the Katanning Plant, Great Southern Highway, Katanning to operate using low water level safety 
devices in accordance with Clause 3.5.1.2 paragraph (a) of Australian Standard AS2593-2001 
Boilers—Unattended and limited attendance. 
This exemption is conditional upon operating an alternative water management system, using high 
integrity conductance probes, in accordance with paragraph (b) of Clause 3.5.2.1 of Australian 
Standard AS2593-2004 Boilers—Safety management and supervision systems. 
Dated this 23rd day of May 2007. 

NINA LYHNE, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner. 

DECEASED ESTATES 
ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Raymond Allen Faulkner, late of Annie Bryson McKeown Lodge, Angove Road, Albany, Western 
Australia, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 10 February 2007, are required by the trustee of the 
late Raymond Allen Faulkner of c/- Haynes Robinson Solicitors of 70-74 Frederick Street, Albany, 
Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to them within one (1) month from the date of 
publication of this notice, after which date the trustee may convey or distribute the assets, having 
regard only to the claims of which it then has notice. 
Dated this 24th day of May 2007. 

HAYNES ROBINSON. 
 

——————————— 
 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
In the matter of the estate of James Halbert Stuart Macdonald, late of 5/8 Johnston Street, 
Peppermint Grove, Western Australia, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the abovenamed deceased who died on 2 June 2003, are required by the 
executrix Jo Ann Hope Ledger care of Macdonald Rudder Lawyers, Suite 3/109 James Street, 
Northbridge, Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to her within one (1) month from 
the date of publication of this notice, after which time she may convey or distribute the assets having 
regard only to the claims of which she has then had notice. 

(Sgd.) for MACDONALD RUDDER LAWYERS. 
 
 

——————————— 
 



29 May 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2517 

 

 

Order your Bound Volumes of 
Government Gazette 2006 

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette 

 

For Government Departments and 
private firms who presently arrange 
binding for their copies of Government 
Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is 
now offering a subscription covering 4 
Quarterly Volumes at a cost of 
$1,098.90. 

The Gazettes will be bound in black 
cloth with gold foil lettering on the 
spine and personalised by  the addition 
of the client's name in gold lettering on 
the front cover. 

 

PLEASE NOTE 
On the rare occasion where extra 
gazettes are published in one quarter, a 
fifth volume may be required. In this 
instance the extra cost involved will be 
borne by the State Law Publisher and 
not passed on to clients. 

 
 

For further information please contact: 

State Law Publisher 

Telephone: 9321 7688 



2518 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 May 2007 

 

 

W A N T E D ! ! ! 

Old copies of the Government Gazette 

State Law Publisher is in the process of scanning all Government 
Gazettes (back to the first one ever published in the 1840’s) with 
the intention of adding the archived copies to our existing on-line 
service. 

We are looking for donations of any copies (pre 1994) that are no 
longer required by clients and would be appreciative of any 
assistance you can offer in this undertaking. 

The scanning process requires single pages, therefore we need to 
trim the spine off each gazette, which unfortunately ruins the 
gazettes for future use. 

Our preference is for unwanted copies, however, if a client requires 
their gazettes returned, State Law Publisher will reprint and replace 
individual editions. If a bound copy is supplied and is to be returned 
we will reprint all gazettes and arrange to have them rebound for 
the client. 

The benefits of having all the gazettes and indices on-line and 
searchable will be enormous. This service should remove the need 
for clients to retain hard copies and will free up valuable storage 
space. 

Barring any unforeseen delays, it should take around a month to 
scan each year and then release on our website. 

 

——————————— 
 
Please contact John Thompson on 9426 0010 if you can assist by 
supplying editions of the Government Gazette. For large quantities 
we will arrange for them to be collected. 
 



<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Warning
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /SyntheticBoldness 1.00
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /Unknown

  /Description <<
    /JPN <FEFF3053306e8a2d5b9a306f30019ad889e350cf5ea6753b50cf3092542b308030d730ea30d730ec30b9537052377528306e00200050004400460020658766f830924f5c62103059308b3068304d306b4f7f75283057307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a30674f5c62103057305f00200050004400460020658766f8306f0020004100630072006f0062006100740020304a30883073002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee5964d30678868793a3067304d307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a306b306f30d530a930f330c8306e57cb30818fbc307f304c5fc59808306730593002>
    /FRA <>
    /DEU <>
    /PTB <>
    /DAN <>
    /NLD <>
    /ESP <>
    /SUO <>
    /ITA <>
    /NOR <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU <>
  >>
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


