
!200700133GG! 
 

  3011 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 26 JUNE 2007 No. 133 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Children’s Court of Western Australia Act 1988—Children’s Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007 ....................................................................................................................................  3040 

Civil Judgments Enforcement Act 2004—Civil Judgments Enforcement Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2007.............................................................................................................................................  3037 

District Court of Western Australia Act 1969—District Court (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2007 ....  3035 
Energy Operators (Powers) Act 1979—Energy Operators (Electricity Retail Corporation) (Charges) 

Amendment By-laws 2007......................................................................................................................  3013 
Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems (Access) Act 1994— 

Electricity Distribution Amendment Regulations 2007.....................................................................  3024 
Electricity Referee and Dispute Resolution Repeal Regulations 2007 ..............................................  3028 
Electricity Transmission Amendment Regulations 2007...................................................................  3022 
Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems (Access) Declaration 2007................................  3018 
Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems (Repeal and Related Provisions) 

Regulations 2007.............................................................................................................................  3018 
Evidence Act 1906—Evidence (Video and Audio Links Fees and Expenses) Amendment 

Regulations 2007 ....................................................................................................................................  3030 
Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994—Fines, Penalties and Infringement 

Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007.................................................................  3031 
Government Railways Act 1904—Government Railways (Parking Stations) Amendment By-law 2007.  3059 
Health Act 1911—Health (Meat Hygiene) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007 ...................................  3029 
Local Government Act 1995—City of Belmont—General Amendment Local Law 2007 ..........................  3044 
Lotteries Commission Act 1990— 

Lotteries Commission (Monday and Wednesday Lotto) Rules 2007..................................................  3056 
Lotteries Commission (Oz Lotto) Amendment Rules 2007 ................................................................  3054 
Lotteries Commission (Powerball) Amendment Rules 2007..............................................................  3049 
Lotteries Commission (Saturday Lotto) Amendment Rules 2007......................................................  3053 
Lotteries Commission (Soccer Pools) Amendment Rules 2007 ..........................................................  3057 

Magistrates Court Act 2004—Magistrates Court (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2007 .........................  3033 
Proclamations—Medical Radiation Technologists Act 2006—No. 21 of 2006...........................................  3013 
Public Transport Authority Act 2003—Public Transport Authority Amendment Regulations 

(No. 3) 2007.............................................................................................................................................  3058 
Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992—Rates and Charges (Rebates and 

Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2007 ..........................................................................................  3061 
Supreme Court Act 1935—Supreme Court (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2007 ...................................  3042 
Water Services Licensing Act 1995—Water Services Licensing (Plumbers Licensing and Plumbing 

Standards) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2007.................................................................................  3062 
 

——— 
 

PART 2 
Coal Industry Superannuation Board........................................................................................................  3071 
Consumer and Employment Protection .....................................................................................................  3071 
Deceased Estates ........................................................................................................................................  3083 
Fisheries .....................................................................................................................................................  3073 
Minerals and Petroleum.............................................................................................................................  3074 
Parliament..................................................................................................................................................  3074 
Planning and Infrastructure ......................................................................................................................  3075 
Premier and Cabinet ..................................................................................................................................  3082 
Water/Sewerage..........................................................................................................................................  3082 

 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

WARNING—PRICE INCREASE 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2007 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$24.75 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$57.75 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$57.75 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.55 

  Bulk Notices—$211.00 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3013 

 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 

AA101* 
MEDICAL RADIATION TECHNOLOGISTS ACT 2006 

No. 21 of 2006 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 

By the Honourable 
David Kingsley Malcolm, 

Companion of the Order of Australia, 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
DAVID KINGSLEY MALCOLM 

Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, acting under the Medical 
Radiation Technologists Act 2006 section 2 and with the advice and consent of the 
Executive Council, fix 1 July 2007 as the day on which the provisions of that Act, 
other than sections 1 and 2, come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 19 June 2007. 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, 

JIM McGINTY, Minister for Health. 

———— 

Note: Under section 22 of the Interpretation Act 1984, sections 1 and 2 came into 
operation on 9 June 2006. 

ENERGY 

EN301* 

Energy Operators (Powers) Act 1979 

Energy Operators (Electricity Retail 
Corporation) (Charges) Amendment 

By-laws 2007 

Made by the Electricity Retail Corporation with the approval of the 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These by-laws are the Energy Operators (Electricity Retail 
Corporation) (Charges) Amendment By-laws 2007. 



3014 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

2. Commencement 

  These by-laws come into operation as follows: 

 (a) by-laws 1 and 2 — on the day on which these by-laws 
are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the by-laws — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in these by-laws are to the Energy Operators 
(Electricity Retail Corporation) (Charges) By-laws 2006*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 31 March 2006, p. 1225-46. 
  For amendments to 7 June 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 clause 3(1) is repealed. 

 (2) After Schedule 1 clause 3(2) the following subclause is 
inserted —  

“     
 (3) Tariff R1 is subject to the following conditions —  

 (a) the consumer agrees to take the tariff for a 
minimum period of 12 months; 

 (b) the consumer pays the fee set out in Schedule 4 
item 11; 

 (c) the consumer satisfies the corporation that the 
amount of electricity supplied to the consumer’s 
premises will be less than 50 megawatt hours per 
annum. 

    ”. 

 (3) After Schedule 1 clause 3 the following clause is inserted —  

“     
3A. Tariff R3 (time of use tariff) 

 (1) Tariff R3 comprises for each supply period specified in the 
first column of the Table to this subclause —  

 (a) a fixed charge at the rate per day set out opposite 
the supply period in the second column of that 
Table; and 

 (b) an energy charge consisting of —  

 (i) an on peak energy charge at the rate per unit 
set out opposite the supply period in the 
third column of that Table; and 

 (ii) an off peak energy charge at the rate per 
unit set out opposite the supply period in the 
fourth column of that Table. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3015 

 

 Table 

Energy charge Supply period Fixed 
charge On peak Off peak 

1 July 2007 to 
30 June 2008 

$1.19 20.85 cents 6.43 cents 

1 July 2008 to 
30 June 2009 

$1.25 21.89 cents 6.75 cents 

1 July 2009 to 
30 June 2010 

$1.31 22.99 cents 7.09 cents 

1 July 2010 to 
30 June 2011 

$1.38 24.14 cents 7.44 cents 

1 July 2011 to 
30 June 2012 

$1.44 25.35 cents 7.82 cents 

 (2) Tariff R3 is subject to the following conditions —  

 (a) the consumer agrees to take the tariff for a 
minimum period of 12 months; 

 (b) the consumer pays the fee set out in Schedule 4 
item 11; 

 (c) the consumer satisfies the corporation that the 
amount of electricity supplied to the consumer’s 
premises will be 50 megawatt hours or more per 
annum. 

    ”. 

 (4) Schedule 1 clause 4(2) is repealed and the following subclause 
is inserted instead —  

“     
 (2) Tariff S1 comprises for each supply period specified in the 

first column of the Table to this subclause —  

 (a) a minimum charge at the rate per day set out 
opposite the supply period in the second column of 
that Table; and 

 (b) a demand charge at the rate per day set out opposite 
the supply period in the third column of that Table 
multiplied by —  

 (i) the on peak half-hourly maximum demand; 
or 

 (ii) 30% of the off peak half-hourly maximum 
demand, 

  whichever is the greater; and 

 (c) an energy charge consisting of —  

 (i) an on peak energy charge at the rate per unit 
set out opposite the supply period in the 
fourth column of that Table; and 

 (ii) an off peak energy charge at the rate per 
unit set out opposite the supply period in the 
fifth column of that Table. 



3016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

 Table 

Energy charge Supply period Minimum 
charge 

Demand 
charge On 

peak 
Off 

peak 

1 July 2007 to 
30 June 2008 

$263.96 67.06 
cents 

9.61 
cents 

6.08 
cents 

1 July 2008 to 
30 June 2009 

$277.16 70.41 
cents 

10.09 
cents 

6.39 
cents 

1 July 2009 to 
30 June 2010 

$291.02 73.93 
cents 

10.60 
cents 

6.71 
cents 

1 July 2010 to 
30 June 2011 

$305.57 77.63 
cents 

11.13 
cents 

7.04 
cents 

1 July 2011 to 
30 June 2012 

$320.84 81.51 
cents 

11.69 
cents 

7.39 
cents 

    ”. 

 (5) Schedule 1 clause 5(2) is repealed and the following subclause 
is inserted instead —  

“     
 (2) Tariff T1 comprises for each supply period specified in the 

first column of the Table to this subclause —  

 (a) a minimum charge at the rate per day set out 
opposite the supply period in the second column of 
that Table; and 

 (b) a demand charge at the rate per day set out opposite 
the supply period in the third column of that Table 
multiplied by —  

 (i) the on peak half-hourly maximum demand; 
or 

 (ii) 30% of the off peak half-hourly maximum 
demand, 

  whichever is the greater; and 

 (c) an energy charge consisting of —  

 (i) an on peak energy charge at the rate per unit 
set out opposite the supply period in the 
fourth column of that Table; and 

 (ii) an off peak energy charge at the rate per 
unit set out opposite the supply period in the 
fifth column of that Table. 

 Table 

Energy charge Supply period Minimum 
charge 

Demand 
charge On 

peak 
Off 

peak 

1 July 2007 to 
30 June 2008 

$348.23 61.36 
cents 

8.98 
cents 

5.98 
cents 

1 July 2008 to 
30 June 2009 

$365.64 64.43 
cents 

9.43 
cents 

6.28 
cents 

1 July 2009 to 
30 June 2010 

$383.92 67.65 
cents 

9.90 
cents 

6.60 
cents 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3017 

 

Energy charge Supply period Minimum 
charge 

Demand 
charge On 

peak 
Off 

peak 

1 July 2010 to 
30 June 2011 

$403.12 71.03 
cents 

10.40 
cents 

6.93 
cents 

1 July 2011 to 
30 June 2012 

$423.28 74.58 
cents 

10.92 
cents 

7.27 
cents 

    ”. 

 (6) Schedule 1 clause 6(1) is amended by inserting after “R1,” —  

  “    R3,    ”. 

 (7) Schedule 1 clause 6(2) is amended by deleting “or R1,” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    , R1 or R3,    ”. 

5. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 by deleting “$27.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $29.80    ”; 

 (b) in item 10 by deleting “$3.80” and inserting instead —  

  “    $4.10    ”; 

 (c) in item 11 by inserting after “R1” —  

  “    or R3    ”. 
 
 
 
The Common Seal of the ) 
Electricity Retail Corporation was )  [LS] 
affixed to these by-laws ) 
in the presence of —   ) 
 
 
JAMES K. MITCHELL, Director. 
 
 
WILLIAM J. BARGMANN, Executive Officer. 
 
 
 
Approved by the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 
 
 
 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 



3018 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

EN302* 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Access) Act 1994 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution 
Systems (Access) Declaration 2007 

Made by the Minister under section 95A(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This instrument is the Electricity Transmission and Distribution 
Systems (Access) Declaration 2007. 

2. Certain provisions of Electricity Transmission and 
Distribution Systems (Access) Act 1994 to cease to have effect 

  It is declared that the Electricity Transmission and Distribution 
Systems (Access) Act 1994 sections 90 and 91 and Schedules 5 
and 6 do not have effect on and after 1 July 2007. 

 

FRANCIS LOGAN, Minister for Energy. 
 

——————————— 
 

EN303* 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Access) Act 1994 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution 
Systems (Repeal and Related Provisions) 

Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

Part 1 — Preliminary 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Electricity Transmission and 
Distribution Systems (Repeal and Related Provisions) 
Regulations 2007. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3019 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. Purpose 

  These regulations are made for purposes related to the 
Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems (Access) 
Declaration 2007. 

4. The Act amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Electricity 
Transmission and Distribution Systems (Access) Act 1994*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 4 August 2006.] 

Part 2 — Repeals 

5. Sections 90 and 91 repealed 

  Sections 90 and 91 are repealed. 

6. Schedules 5 and 6 repealed 

  Schedules 5 and 6 are repealed. 

Part 3 — Other amendments 

7. Section 89 amended 

 (1) Section 89(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting the definition of “prescribed pricing policy”; 

 (b) by deleting the definition of “referee”. 

 (2) Section 89(3) is repealed and the following subsection is 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (3) In this Part a reference to Schedule 5 or 6 is a reference 

to that Schedule as in force before its repeal by the 
Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Repeal and Related Provisions) Regulations 2007. 

    ”. 

8. Section 94 amended 

  Section 94(1) is amended by deleting all of the subsection after 
“enforceable” and inserting instead —  

“     
  by civil proceedings in a court, but no breach of those 

obligations gives rise to an action for damages. 
    ”. 



3020 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

9. Section 95 replaced 

  Section 95 is repealed and the following section is inserted 
instead —  

“     
95. Regulations for access and pricing — existing access 

agreements 

 (1) Regulations may be made under section 96 providing 
for matters relating to —  

 (a) access to, and pricing for, electricity 
transmission capacity; and 

 (b) access to, and pricing for, electricity 
distribution capacity, 

  to the extent that provision in respect of those matters 
is necessary or expedient for the operation and 
enforcement of existing access agreements. 

 (2) For the purposes of subsection (1) an “existing access 
agreement” is —  

 (a) an access agreement as defined in the 
Electricity Transmission Regulations 1996 
regulation 3(1); or 

 (b) a distribution access agreement as defined in 
the Electricity Distribution Regulations 1997 
regulation 3(1), 

  that is in operation on 1 July 2007. 

 (3) Without limiting subsection (1) the regulations may, to 
the extent mentioned in that subsection, make 
provision for any matter in respect of which regulations 
could have been made under Schedule 5 clause 2(2), 
(3) or (4) or Schedule 6 clause 2(2), (3) or (4). 

    ”. 

Part 4 — Transitional provisions 

10. Continued operation of Electricity Transmission and 
Distribution Systems (Access) Act 1994 Schedule 5 clause 2(4) 

 (1) Despite the Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Access) Declaration 2007 clause 2 and the repeal effected by 
regulation 6, the Electricity Transmission and Distribution 
Systems (Access) Act 1994 Schedule 5 clause 2(4) continues to 
have effect, subject to subregulation (2), in relation to the 
operation and enforcement of any access agreement (as defined 
in the Electricity Transmission Regulations 1996 
regulation 3(1)) that is in operation on 1 July 2007. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3021 

 

 (2) The Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems (Access) 
Act 1994 Schedule 5 clause 2(4) continues to have effect under 
subregulation (1) as if it were amended by deleting “effect.” and 
inserting instead —  

“     
  effect, unless the contract expressly provides that the 

provision applies despite any inconsistency with the 
essential terms and conditions. 

    ”. 

11. Continued operation of Electricity Transmission and 
Distribution Systems (Access) Act 1994 Schedule 6 clause 2(4) 

 (1) Despite the Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Access) Declaration 2007 clause 2 and the repeal effected by 
regulation 6, the Electricity Transmission and Distribution 
Systems (Access) Act 1994 Schedule 6 clause 2(4) continues to 
have effect, subject to subregulation (2), in relation to the 
operation and enforcement of any distribution access agreement 
(as defined in the Electricity Distribution Regulations 1997 
regulation 3(1)) that is in operation on 1 July 2007. 

 (2) The Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems (Access) 
Act 1994 Schedule 6 clause 2(4) continues to have effect under 
subregulation (1) as if it were amended by deleting “effect.” and 
inserting instead —  

“     
  effect, unless the contract expressly provides that the 

provision applies despite any inconsistency with the 
essential terms and conditions. 

    ”. 

 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 



3022 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

EN304* 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Access) Act 1994 

Electricity Transmission Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Electricity Transmission Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Electricity 
Transmission Regulations 1996*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 2 June 2006. 
  For amendments to 12 June 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Regulation 5 amended 

  Regulation 5(3), (4) and (5) are repealed. 

5. Regulation 6 replaced 

  Regulation 6 is repealed and the following regulation is inserted 
instead —  

“     
6. Restricted application of regulations 

  The application of these regulations is limited to —  

 (a) access agreements in operation on 1 July 2007; 
and 

 (b) the parties to those agreements; and 

 (c) matters relating to the provision of access 
services under those agreements, 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3023 

 

  and references in these regulations to an access 
agreement, a corporation or a user are to be construed 
accordingly. 

    ”. 

6. Regulation 12 amended 

  Regulation 12(1)(a)(i) and (b)(i) are each amended by inserting 
after “the Act” —  

“     
  (as in force before the repeal of that 

Schedule by the Electricity 
Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Repeal and Related Provisions) 
Regulations 2007) 

    ”. 

7. Regulation 15 amended 

  Regulation 15(1) is amended by inserting after “the Act” —  

“     
  (as in force before the repeal of that Schedule by the 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Repeal and Related Provisions) Regulations 2007) 

    ”. 

8. Regulation 17 replaced 

  Regulation 17 is repealed and the following regulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
17. Pricing methods and prices 

 (1) Pricing methods adopted by a corporation in relation to 
access services must be consistent with the price 
control provisions and pricing methods set out in the 
access arrangement for the South West Interconnected 
Network approved under the Electricity Networks 
Access Code 2004. 

 (2) A corporation must —  

 (a) prepare and make publicly available a schedule 
of indicative prices for access services that 
provides sufficient detail to allow users to 
calculate the electricity transmission prices 
likely to apply in any reasonable circumstance; 
and 

 (b) make publicly available such details of its 
pricing methods as are sufficient to indicate to 
users how prices for access services are 
established. 

    ”. 



3024 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

9. Regulation 32 amended 

  Regulation 32(1) is amended by deleting “to enable the 
corporation to comply with its obligations under clause 4(1) of 
Schedule 5 to the Act”. 

10. Regulation 45 amended 

  Regulation 45(1)(a), (b) and (c) are each amended by inserting 
after “the Act” —  

“     
  (as in force before the repeal of that Schedule 

by the Electricity Transmission and 
Distribution Systems (Repeal and Related 
Provisions) Regulations 2007) 

    ”. 

11. Regulation 46 amended 

  Regulation 46 is amended by deleting “the Act:” and inserting 
instead —  

“     
  the Act (as continued in effect by the Electricity 

Transmission and Distribution Systems (Repeal and 
Related Provisions) Regulations 2007) —  

    ”. 
 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

EN305* 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Access) Act 1994 

Electricity Distribution Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Electricity Distribution Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3025 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Electricity 
Distribution Regulations 1997*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 4 August 2006. 
  For amendments to 12 June 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

  Regulation 3(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in the definition of “distribution price schedule” by 
deleting “clause 6(3)(b) of Schedule 6 to the Act” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    regulation 19(2)(a)    ”; 

 (b) in the definition of “Prices and Charges Paper” by 
deleting “clause 6(3)(c) of Schedule 6 to the Act;” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    regulation 19(2)(b);    ”. 

5. Regulation 5 amended 

  Regulation 5(2), (3), (3a) and (4) are repealed. 

6. Regulation 6 replaced 

  Regulation 6 is repealed and the following regulation is inserted 
instead —  

“     
6. Restricted application of regulations 

  The application of these regulations is limited to —  

 (a) distribution access agreements in operation on 
1 July 2007; and 

 (b) the parties to those agreements; and 

 (c) matters relating to the provision of distribution 
access services under those agreements, 

  and references in these regulations to a distribution 
access agreement, a corporation or a user are to be 
construed accordingly. 

    ”. 



3026 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

7. Regulation 12 amended 

  Regulation 12(1)(a)(i) and (b)(i) are each amended by inserting 
after “the Act” —  

“     
  (as in force before the repeal of that 

Schedule by the Electricity 
Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Repeal and Related Provisions) 
Regulations 2007) 

    ”. 

8. Regulation 15 amended 

  Regulation 15(1) is amended by inserting after “the Act” —  

“     
  (as in force before the repeal of that Schedule by the 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Repeal and Related Provisions) Regulations 2007) 

    ”. 

9. Regulation 19 amended 

  Regulation 19(1) is repealed and the following subregulations 
are inserted instead —  

“     

 (1) Pricing methods adopted by a corporation in relation to 
the provision of distribution access services must be 
consistent with the price control provisions and pricing 
methods set out in the access arrangement for the South 
West Interconnected Network approved under the 
Electricity Networks Access Code 2004. 

 (2) A corporation must —  

 (a) prepare and make publicly available a schedule 
of indicative prices for distribution access 
services that provides sufficient detail to allow 
users to calculate the electricity distribution 
prices likely to apply in any reasonable 
circumstance; and 

 (b) make publicly available such details of its 
pricing methods as are sufficient to indicate to 
users how prices for distribution access services 
are established. 

    ”. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3027 

 

10. Regulation 46 amended 

  Regulation 46(1)(a), (b) and (c) are each amended by inserting 
after “the Act” —  

“     
  (as in force before the repeal of that Schedule 

by the Electricity Transmission and 
Distribution Systems (Repeal and Related 
Provisions) Regulations 2007) 

    ”. 

11. Regulation 47 amended 

  Regulation 47 is amended by deleting “the Act:” and inserting 
instead —  

“     
  the Act (as continued in effect by the Electricity 

Transmission and Distribution Systems (Repeal and 
Related Provisions) Regulations 2007) —  

    ”. 

12. Regulation 51 amended 

  Regulation 51(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “is” and inserting instead —  

  “    was    ”; 

 (b) by inserting after “the Act” —  

“     
  (as in force before the repeal of that Schedule by the 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Repeal and Related Provisions) Regulations 2007) 

    ”. 

 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 



3028 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

EN306* 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Access) Act 1994 

Electricity Referee and Dispute Resolution 
Repeal Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Electricity Referee and Dispute 
Resolution Repeal Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. Repeal 

  The Electricity Referee and Dispute Resolution 
Regulations 1997 are repealed. 

 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3029 

 

HEALTH 

HE301* 

Health Act 1911 

Health (Meat Hygiene) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Health (Meat Hygiene) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Health (Meat 
Hygiene) Regulations 2001*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 1 April 2005. 
  For amendments to 22 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 30 January 2007.] 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 Part 1 item 10 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “0.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    0.83    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “4.84” and inserting instead —  

  “    5.28    ”. 

 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



3030 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

JUSTICE 

JU301* 

Evidence Act 1906 

Evidence (Video and Audio Links Fees and 
Expenses) Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Evidence (Video and Audio Links Fees 
and Expenses) Amendment Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Evidence (Video 
and Audio Links Fees and Expenses) Regulations 1999*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 6 August 2004. 
  For amendments to 17 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 1 — Fees 

[r. 2 and 3] 

 1. Booking fee 

(1) Intrastate link ............................................... $64.00 

(2) Interstate or overseas link ............................ $95.50 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3031 

 

2. Hourly fee 

 Per hour or part of an hour .......................... $51.00 
    ”. 

 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

JU302* 

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994 

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices 
Enforcement Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Fines, Penalties and Infringement 
Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Fines, Penalties 
and Infringement Notices Enforcement Regulations 1994*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 8 September 2006.] 



3032 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
amount set out in column 2, and inserting instead the amount set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert 

1. $13.00 $13.50 

2. $11.00 $11.50 

3. $41.00 $43.00 

4. $27.50 $28.50 

 (2) Schedule 2 Division 2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
amount set out in column 2, and inserting instead the amount set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert 

1. $27.50 $28.50 

2. $128.00 $134.00 

 (3) Schedule 2 Division 3 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
amount set out in column 2, and inserting instead the amount set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert 

1. $57.00 $59.50 

3. $38.50 $40.00 

4. $41.00 $43.00 

5. $27.50 $28.50 

8. $135.00 $141.00 

10. $61.00 $63.50 

11. $135.00 $141.00 

12. $19.25 $20.00 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3033 

 

JU303* 

Magistrates Court Act 2004 

Magistrates Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Magistrates Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Magistrates 
Court (Fees) Regulations 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 28 April 2005, p. 1573-603. 
  For amendments to 18 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

2 39.50 41.00 

3(a) 1.00 1.05 

3(b) 1.10 1.15 

4(a) and (b) 23.00 24.00 

4 57.00 59.50 

5(a) 1.00 1.05 

5(b)      33 075.00      34 662.00 

6(a) 34.00 35.50 

6(b) 57.00 59.50 



3034 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

7(b)(i) 8.00 8.35 

7(b)(ii) 1.00 1.05 

7(c) 11.00 11.50 

8(a) 4.50 4.70 

8(b) 11.00 11.50 

 (2) Schedule 1 Division 1 item 8 note 1 is amended by deleting 
“$16.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $16.70    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 1 Division 2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 66.00 69.00 

1 100.00 104.50 

1 169.00 177.00 

1 254.00 266.00 

1 270.00 282.00 

1 405.00 424.00 

2 43.00 45.00 

2 64.50 67.50 

2 78.50 82.00 

2 102.00 106.00 

2 125.00 131.00 

2 161.50 169.00 

3 22.00 23.00 

3 44.00 46.00 

3 33.50 35.00 

3 67.00 70.00 

3 45.00 47.00 

3 90.00 94.00 

4 105.00 110.00 

4 157.50 165.00 

4 190.00 199.00 

4 285.00 298.00 

4 212.00 222.00 

4 318.00 333.00 

5 and 6 61.00 63.50 

5 and 6 122.00 127.50 

5 and 6 106.00 111.00 

5 and 6 212.00 222.00 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3035 

 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

5 and 6 152.00 159.00 

5 and 6 304.00 318.00 

7 and 8(a) 55.50 58.00 

7 and 8(a) 83.00 86.50 

7 and 8(a) 67.00 70.00 

7 and 8(a) 100.50 105.00 

7 and 8(a) 90.50 94.50 

7 and 8(a) 136.00 142.50 

9(a) and (b) 72.50 75.50 

9(c) 19.25 20.00 

10 169.00 177.00 

11 66.00 69.00 

 (4) Schedule 1 Division 3 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 55.50 58.00 

2 10.50 11.00 

3(a) 55.50 58.00 

3(b) 72.50 75.50 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 
 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

JU304* 

District Court of Western Australia Act 1969 

District Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the District Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 



3036 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the District Court 
(Fees) Regulations 2002*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 8 December 2006.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the corresponding fee in 
column 2 in each place where it occurs and inserting instead the 
corresponding fee in column 3. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Fee deleted 

Column 3 
Fee inserted 

1 454 475.00 

1 681 713.00 

2(a) and (b) 454 475.00 

2(a) and (b) 681 713.00 

2(c) and (d) 171 179.00 

2(c) and (d) 227 237.00 

3 57 59.50 

3 114 119.00 

5 454 475.00 

5 681 713.00 

6 and 7 399 418.00 

6 and 7 798 836.00 

8 and 10(a) 114 119.00 

8 and 10(a) 171 179.00 

11 (in 2 places) 23 24.00 

11A(a) (in 2 places) 1 1.05 

11A(b) (in 2 places) 1 042 1 092.00 

12(a) (in 2 places) 34 35.50 

12(b) (in 2 places) 57 59.50 

13(b)(i) (in 2 places) 8 8.35 

13(b)(ii) (in 2 places) 1 1.05 

13(c) (in 2 places) 11 11.50 

13(d) (in 2 places) 46 48.00 

14(a) (in 2 places) 4.50 4.70 

14(b) (in 2 places) 11 11.50 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3037 

 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the corresponding fee in 
column 2 and inserting instead the corresponding fee in 
column 3. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Fee deleted 

Column 3 
Fee inserted 

1(a) and (b) 72.50 75.50 

1(c) 19.25 20.00 

2 39.50 41.00 

3(a) 1.00 1.05 

3(b) 1.10 1.15 

4 38.50 40.00 

5(a) 123.00 128.50 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

JU305* 

Civil Judgments Enforcement Act 2004 

Civil Judgments Enforcement Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Civil Judgments Enforcement 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007. 



3038 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Civil Judgments 
Enforcement Regulations 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 28 April 2005, p. 1483-559. 
  For amendments to 15 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2 and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1  55.50  58.00 

1  83.00  86.50 

1  90.50  94.50 

1  135.50  142.00 

2 (both places)  68.50  71.50 

2 (both places)  91.50  95.50 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2 and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1(a)  28.50  29.50 

1(b)  39.50  41.00 

1(c)  20.00  20.50 

2  72.50  75.50 

3  72.50  75.50 

4  38.50  40.00 

5  4.15  4.30 

6(a)  1.00  1.05 

6(b)  1.10  1.15 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3039 

 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

7  135.00  141.00 

8  61.00  63.50 

10 (Note 1)  $198.50  $208.00 

11(a)  72.50  75.50 

11(b)  72.50  75.50 

11(c)  19.25  20.00 

12  19.25  20.00 

19  11.00  11.50 

6. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2 and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1  64.00  67.00 

2  26.00  27.00 

3  61.00  63.50 

4  150.50  157.50 

5  183.00  191.50 

6  61.00  63.50 

7  38.50  40.00 

8  38.50  40.00 

9  129.50  135.50 

10  61.00  63.50 

12(b)  38.50  40.00 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 
 



3040 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

JU306* 

Children’s Court of Western Australia Act 1988 

Children’s Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Children’s Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Children’s 
Court (Fees) Regulations 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 28 April 2005, p. 1415-33. 
  For amendments to 17 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2 opposite the item and inserting 
instead the figure set out in column 3 opposite the item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

2 39.50 41.00 
3(a) 1.00 1.05 
3(b) 1.10 1.15 
4(a) 23.00 24.00 
4(b) 23.00 24.00 

4 57.00 59.50 
5(a) 34.00 35.50 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3041 

 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

5(b) 57.00 59.50 
6(b)(i) 8.00 8.35 
6(b)(ii) 1.00 1.05 

6(c) 11.00 11.50 
7(a) 4.50 4.70 
7(b) 11.00 11.50 

7 (note 1) 16.00 16.70 

 (2) Schedule 1 Division 2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2 opposite the item and inserting 
instead the figure set out in column 3 opposite the item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 66.00 69.00 
2(a) 72.50 75.50 
2(b) 72.50 75.50 
2(c) 19.25 20.00 

3 169.00 177.00 

 (3) Schedule 1 Division 3 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2 opposite the item and inserting 
instead the figure set out in column 3 opposite the item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 55.50 58.00 
2 10.50 11.00 

3(a) 55.50 58.00 
3(b) 72.50 75.50 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 



3042 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

JU307* 

Supreme Court Act 1935 

Supreme Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Supreme Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations —  

 (i) on 1 July 2007; or 

 (ii) if these regulations are published in the Gazette 
on a later day, on that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Supreme Court 
(Fees) Regulations 2002*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 18 August 2006.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, in accordance with 
the Table. 

Table 
Item Delete Insert instead 

1, 2(a) and (b), 5 681.00 713.00 

1, 2(a) and (b), 5 1 022.00 1 071.00 

2(c) and (d) 228.00 238.00 

2(c) and (d) 342.00 358.00 

3 456.00 477.00 

3 684.00 716.00 

6 and 7 456.00 477.00 

6 and 7 912.00 955.00 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3043 

 

Item Delete Insert instead 

8 and 10(a) 160.00 167.50 

8 and 10(a) 239.00 250.00 

11 (both places) 23.00 24.00 

12(a) (both places) 34.00 35.50 

12(b) (both places) 57.00 59.50 

13(b) (both places) 8.00 8.35 

13(b) (both places) 1.00 1.05 

13(c) (both places) 11.00 11.50 

13(d) (both places) 
and (e) (both places)

 
46.00 

 
48.00 

13A(a) (both 
places) 

 
4.50 

 
4.70 

13A(b) (both 
places) 

 
11.00 

 
11.50 

14 228.00 238.00 

 (2) Schedule 1 Division 2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, in accordance with 
the Table. 

Table 
Item Delete Insert instead 

1 114.00 119.00 

1 228.00 238.00 

2 1 710.00 1 792.00 

2 3 420.00 3 584.00 

3 228.00 238.00 

3 342.00 358.00 

4 160.00 167.50 

4 239.00 250.00 

5 570.00 597.00 

5 855.00 896.00 

6 and 7 456.00 477.00 

6 and 7 912.00 955.00 

8 (both places) 23.00 24.00 

9(b) (both places) 8.00 8.35 

9(b) (both places) 1.00 1.05 

9(c) (both places) 11.00 11.50 

9(d) (both places) 46.00 48.00 

10(a) (both places) 4.50 4.70 

10(b) (both places) 11.00 11.50 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation, in accordance with the Table. 



3044 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

Table 
Item Delete Insert instead 

1(a) and (b) 72.50 75.50 

1(c) 19.25 20.00 

2 39.50 41.00 

3(a) 1.00 1.05 

3(b) 1.10 1.15 

4 38.50 40.00 

5 123.00 128.50 

6. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation, in accordance with the Table. 

Table 
Item Delete Insert instead 

1(a) 142.00 148.50 

1(b) 284.00 297.00 

1(c) 568.00 595.00 

2 46.00 48.00 

3(b) 11.00 11.50 

4 57.00 59.50 

5 23.00 24.00 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

City of Belmont 

GENERAL AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2007 
Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995, the Health Act 1911, 
and all other powers enabling it, the Council of the City of Belmont resolved on the  
15 May 2007 to make the City of Belmont General Amendment Local Law 2007. 

1 Citation 

The local law may be cited as the City of Belmont General Amendment Local  
Law 2007. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3045 

 

2 City of Belmont Local Government Property Local Law 2001 amended 
The City of Belmont Local Government Property Local Law 2001 as published in the 
Government Gazette of 13 September 2001 is amended as follows— 
 2.1 Delete the text of clause 3.1 of Schedule 2 in its entirety and in its place 

insert following text— 
 “1.3 A person is prohibited from the playing or practice of golf on local 

government property except— 
 (a) on a reserve set aside for the purpose; or 
 (b) with the written permission of the local government.”. 

3 City of Belmont Parking and Parking Facilities Local Law 2002 amended 
The City of Belmont Parking & Parking Facilities Local Law 2002 as published in 
the Government Gazette of 22 August 2002 is amended as follows— 
 3.1 In Clause 1.8 Powers of the local government delete the phrase “,by 

resolution,”. 
 3.2 In Clause 2.1 Determination of parking stalls and parking stations delete 

the phrase “by resolution”. 

 3.3 In Clause 2.2 Vehicles to be within parking stall on thoroughfare insert the 
following sub-clause (5)— 

 “(5) A person shall not park a vehicle in a parking stall otherwise than 
wholly within the stall.”. 

 3.4 In Schedule 2, delete Schedule 2 in its entirety and replace with the 
following— 

“Schedule 2 

PRESCRIBED OFFENCES 

PARKING AND PARKING FACILITIES LOCAL LAW 

Item 
No. 

Clause 
No. Nature of Offence 

Modified 
Penalty 

$ 

1 2.2 Failure to park wholly within parking stall 40 
2 2.2(4) Failure to park wholly within parking area 40 
3 2.3(1)(a) Causing obstruction in parking station 60 
4 2.3(1)(b) Parking contrary to sign in parking station 40 
5 2.3(1)(c) Parking contrary to directions of Authorized 

Person 
60 

6 2.3(1)(d) Parking or attempting to park a vehicle in a 
parking stall occupied by another vehicle 

40 

7 3.1(1)(a) Parking wrong class of vehicle 40 
8 3.1(1)(b) Parking by persons of a different class 40 
9 3.1(1)(c) Parking during prohibited period 60 
10 3.1(3)(a) Parking in no parking area 60 
11 3.1(3)(b) Parking contrary to signs or limitations 40 
12 3.1(3)(c) Parking vehicle in motor cycle only area 40 
13 3.1(4) Parking motor cycle in stall not marked ‘M/C’ 40 
14 3.1(5) Parking without permission in an area 

designated for ‘Authorised Vehicles Only’ 
40 

15 3.2(1)(a) Failure to park on the left of two-way 
carriageway 

40 

16 3.2(1)(b) Failure to park on boundary of one-way 
carriageway 

40 

17 3.2(1)(a) 
or 
3.2(1)(b) 

Parking against the flow of traffic 40 

18 3.2(1)(c) Parking when distance from farther 
boundary less than 3 metres 

40 

19 3.2(1)(d) Parking closer than 1 metre from another 
vehicle 

40 

20 3.2(1)(e) Causing obstruction 60 
21 3.3(b) Failure to park at approximate right angle 40 
22 3.4(2) Failure to park at an appropriate angle 40 
23 3.5(2)(a) 

and 6.2 
Double parking 60 

24 3.5(2)(b) Parking on or adjacent to a median strip 40 
25 3.5(2)(c) Denying access to private drive or right of 

way 
60 



3046 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

Item 
No. 

Clause 
No. Nature of Offence 

Modified 
Penalty 

$ 
26 3.5(2)(d) Parking beside excavation or obstruction so 

as to obstruct traffic 
60 

27 3.5(2)(e) Parking within 10 metres of traffic island 40 
28 3.5(2)(f) Parking on footpath/pedestrian crossing 60 
29 3.5(2)(g) Parking contrary to continuous line markings 40 
30 3.5(2)(h) Parking on intersection 60 
31 3.5(2)(i) Parking within 1 metre of fire hydrant or fire 

plug 
60 

32 3.5(2)(j) Parking within 3 metres of public letter box 40 
33 3.5(2)(k) Parking within 10 metres of intersection 60 
34 3.5(3)(a) 

or (b) 
Parking vehicle within 10 metres of 
departure side of bus stop, children’s crossing 
or pedestrian crossing 

40 

35 3.5(4)(a) 
or (b) 

Parking vehicle within 20 metres of approach 
side of bus stop, children’s crossing or 
pedestrian crossing 

40 

36 3.5(5) Parking vehicle within 20 metres of approach 
side or departure side of railway level 
crossing 

40 

37 3.6 Parking contrary to direction of Authorized 
Person 

60 

38 3.7(2) Removing mark of Authorized Person 60 
39 3.8 Moving vehicle to avoid time limitation 40 
40 3.9(a) Parking in thoroughfare for purpose of sale 40 
41 3.9(b) Parking unlicensed vehicle in thoroughfare 40 
42 3.9(c) Parking a trailer/caravan on a thoroughfare 40 
43 3.9(d) Parking in thoroughfare for purpose of 

repairs 
40 

44 3.9(e) Parking in thoroughfare for purpose of 
maintenance 

40 

45 3.10(1) 
or (2) 

Parking on land that is not a parking facility 
without consent 

60 

46 3.10(3) Parking on land not in accordance with 
consent  

40 

47 3.11 Driving or parking on reserve 60 
48 3.13 Failure to display ticket in parking station or 

area set aside 
40 

49 4.1(1) Stopping contrary to a ‘no stopping’ sign 60 
50 4.1(2) Parking contrary to a ‘no parking’ sign 60 
51 4.1(3) Stopping within continuous yellow lines 60 
52 5.1 Stopping unlawfully in a loading zone 40 
53 5.2 Stopping unlawfully in a taxi zone or bus 

zone 
60 

54 5.3 Stopping unlawfully in a mail zone 40 
55 5.4 Stopping in a zone contrary to a sign 40 
56 6.1 Stopping in a shared zone 40 
57 6.3 Stopping near an obstruction 40 
58 6.4 Stopping on a bridge or tunnel 40 
59 6.5 Stopping on crests/curves etc 40 
60 6.6 Stopping near fire hydrant 60 
61 6.7 Stopping near bus stop 40 
62 6.8 Stopping on path, median strip or traffic 

island 
40 

63 6.9 Stopping on verge 40 
64 6.10 Obstructing path, a driveway etc 60 
65 6.11 Stopping near letter box 40 
66 6.12 Stopping heavy or long vehicles on 

carriageway 
40 

67 6.13 Stopping in bicycle parking area 40 
68 6.14 Stopping in motorcycle parking area 40 
69 6.15 Stopping in disabled parking area 60 
70 7.6 Leaving vehicle so as to obstruct a public 

place 
60 

71  All other offences not specified 40 
”. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3047 

 

4 City of Belmont Activities on Thoroughfares and Trading in 
Thoroughfares and Public Places Local Law 2001 amended 

The City of Belmont Activities on Thoroughfares and Trading in Thoroughfares  
and Public Places Local Law 2001 as published in the Government Gazette of  
13 September 2001 is amended as follows— 

 4.1 In clause 4.5 Person not to abandon shopping trolleys, delete this text of this 
clause in it entirety and in its place insert the following text— 

“A person shall not leave a shopping trolley— 

 (a) in a public place; 

 (b) on local government property; or  

 (c) on private property without the permission of the owner or occupier 
of that private property, 

other than in an area set aside for the storage of shopping trolleys.”. 

 4.2 In clause 4.6 Retailer to remove abandoned trolley, delete this text of this 
clause in it entirety and in its place insert the following text— 

 “(1) If a shopping trolley is found— 

 (a) in a public place; 

 (b) on local government property; or  

 (c) on private property without the permission of the owner or occupier 
of that private property, 

other than in an area set aside for the storage of shopping trolleys, the local 
government may advise (verbally or in writing) a retailer whose name is 
marked on the trolley of the location of the shopping trolley. 

 (2) A retailer shall remove a shopping trolley within 24 hours of being so 
advised under subclause (1), unless the retailer— 

 (a) requests the local government to collect and deliver the shopping 
trolley to the retailer; and 

 (b) pays any fee for that collection and delivery (imposed and 
determined under and in accordance with sections 6.16 to 6.19 of the 
Act) within the period specified by the local government.”. 

 4.3 In Schedule 1 delete the rows marked in the first column of each row as 4.5 
and 4.6(2) and in their place insert the following rows— 

“4.5 Person abandoning shopping trolley  100 

4.6(2) Failure to remove shopping trolley upon being  
 advised of location 100”. 

5 City of Belmont Health (Stables Premises) Local Laws 1999 amended 

The City of Belmont Health (Stables Premises) Local Law 1999 as published in the 
Government Gazette of 14 April 1999 and amended in Government Gazette of  
12 November 1999 and 12 April 2001, is amended as follows— 
 5.1 In clause 17 Offences and Penalties insert the following sub-clauses— 

 “(3) An offence against any provision of this Local Law is a prescribed 
offence for the purposes of section 9.16(1) of the Act. 

 (4) The modified penalty for an offence against any provision of this Local 
Law is $40.”. 

6 City of Belmont Health Local Law 2002 amended 

The City of Belmont Health Local Law 2002 as published in the Government Gazette 
of 18 April 2002 is amended as follows— 

 6.1 in Clause 63 Cats, delete the text of this clause in its entirety and replace 
with the following text— 

 “63.(1) Subject to sub-clause (5), a person shall not, without a special 
exemption in writing from the local government, keep more than 2 
cats over the ages of 3 months on premises on any land within the 
District. 

 (2) An owner or occupier of premises may apply in writing to the local 
government for a special exemption from the requirements of sub-
clause (1). 

 (3) The local government shall not grant a special exemption under this 
clause unless it is satisfied that— 

 (a)  the number of cats to be kept will not be a nuisance or injurious 
or dangerous to health; and 



3048 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

 (b)  there are genuine compassionate reasons for the granting of the 
exemption. 

 (4) A special exemption granted under this clause shall specify— 
 (a)  the owner or occupier to whom the special exemption applies; 

 (b)  the premises to which the special exemption applies;  
 (c)  the maximum number of cats which may be kept on the 

premises; and 

 (d)  identifying characteristics of the cats to which the special 
exemption applies. 

 (5) Notwithstanding subclause (1) a person may keep more than 2 cats on 
premises used for veterinary purposes or as a pet shop.”. 

 6.2 Immediately following Clause 105 and before Clause 106, insert the 
following new clause 105A— 

“Prohibition on Installing new Hives 
105A. A person shall not install a hive on a lot.”; and 

 6.3  In clause 106 Bees that cause a nuisance not to be kept, delete the heading 
and text of this clause in its entirety and in its place insert the following 
heading and text— 

“Local Government may issue a notice requiring removal of bees 
106. (1) A person shall not keep, or permit the keeping of, bees that 
cause a nuisance. 

(2) The local government may issue a written notice directing any 
person, within the time specified in the notice, to remove any bees or 
beehives— 

 (a) that in the opinion of the local government are causing a 
nuisance;  

 (b) that are located on a lot in, or immediately adjacent to, any of 
the following zones— 

 (i)  residential zone;  
 (ii)  town centre zone,  

 (iii)  commercial zone,  
 (iv)  mixed use zone; or  

 (v)  residential and stables zone. 
(3) A person shall comply with a direction under subclause (2) within the 
time specified in the notice.”. 

———— 
The Common Seal of the City of Belmont was affixed here by authority of the 
Standing Orders Local Law 2006. 

SHAYNE SILCOX, Chief Executive Officer. 
Dated: 25 May 2007. 

———— 
Consented to— 

Dr A ROBERTSON, Executive Director, 
Public Health. 

Dated this 12th day of June 2007. 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 
 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3049 

 

LOTTERIES 

LO301* 

Lotteries Commission Act 1990 

Lotteries Commission (Powerball) Amendment 
Rules 2007 

Made by the Lotteries Commission under section 28(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Lotteries Commission (Powerball) 
Amendment Rules 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These rules come into operation as follows: 

 (a) rules 1 and 2 — on the day on which these rules are 
published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the rules — on the day after that day. 

3. The rules amended 

  The amendments in these rules are to the Lotteries Commission 
(Powerball) Rules 1996*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 18 May 2007.] 

4. Rule 8 amended 

  Rule 8(4)(b) is amended by deleting “, or subject to rule 9A,”. 

5. Rule 9 amended 

  Rule 9(1)(d) is amended by deleting “, or subject to rule 9A,”. 

6. Rule 10 amended 

  Rule 10(8)(a) is amended by deleting “, unless prevented from 
doing so by rule 9A”. 

7. Rule 18 amended 

  Rule 18(2)(b) is amended by deleting “go” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    goes    ”. 

8. Rule 22 amended 

  Rule 22(1) is repealed. 



3050 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

9. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 is amended by deleting from the heading 
commencing “Total cost of entry” to “as follows:” and inserting 
instead —  

“     
Total cost of entry 

(up to but not including draw 586) 

The cost of entering a powerball draw drawn before 9 August 2007 is made up 
of a subscription of 55 cents per game and an agent’s component (as set out in 
Schedule 2) making the total cost per number and type of game per week as 
follows —  

    ”. 

 (2) After the Table in Schedule 1 the following item and Table are 
inserted —  

“     
Total cost of entry 

(from draw 586 onwards) 

The cost of entering a powerball draw drawn on or after 9 August 2007 is 
made up of a subscription of 60 cents per game and an agent’s component (as 
set out in Schedule 2) making the total cost per number and type of game per 
week as follows —  

Entry or No. of 1 Week 2 Weeks 5 Weeks 10 Weeks 
System games               $            $                $            $ 

 2 1.30 2.60 6.50 13.00 

 3 1.95 3.90 9.75 19.50 

 4 2.60 5.20 13.00 26.00 

 5 3.25 6.50 16.25 32.50 

 6 3.90 7.80 19.50 39.00 

 12 7.85 15.70 39.25 78.50 

 14 9.15 18.30 45.75 91.50 

 18 11.75 23.50 58.75 117.50 

 25 16.35 32.70 81.75 163.50 

System 6 6 3.90 7.80 19.50 39.00 

System 7 21 13.75 27.50 68.75 137.50 

System 8 56 36.60 73.20 183.00 366.00 

System 9 126 82.40 164.80 412.00 824.00 

System 10 252 164.80 329.60 824.00 1 648.00 

System 11 462 302.15 604.30 1 510.75 3 021.50 

System 12 792 517.95 1 035.90 2 589.75 5 179.50 

System 13 1 287 841.70 1 683.40 4 208.50 8 417.00 

System 14 2 002 1 309.30 2 618.60 6 546.50 13 093.00 

System 15 3 003 1 963.95 3 927.90 9 819.75 19 639.50 

System 16 4 368 2 856.65 5 713.30 14 283.25 28 566.50 

System 17 6 188 4 046.95 8 093.90 20 234.75 40 469.50 

System 18 8 568 5 603.45 11 206.90 28 017.25 56 034.50 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3051 

 

Entry or No. of 1 Week 2 Weeks 5 Weeks 10 Weeks 
System games               $            $                $            $ 

System 19 11 628 7 604.70 15 209.40 38 023.50 76 047.00 

System 20 15 504 10 139.60 20 279.20 50 698.00 N/A 

System 3 861 563.10 1 126.20 2 815.50 5 631.00 

System 4 41 26.80 53.60 134.00 268.00 

 Powerpik  

Powerpik 3 38 745 25 339.50 50 679.00 N/A N/A 

Powerpik 4 1 845 1 206.00 2 412.00 6 030.00 12 060.00 

Powerpik 5 45 29.45 58.90 147.25 294.50 

Powerpik 6 270 175.50 351.00 877.50 1 755.00 

Powerpik 7 945 618.75 1 237.50 3 093.75 6 187.50 

Powerpik 8 2 520 1 647.00 3 294.00 8 235.00 16 470.00 

Powerpik 9 5 670 3 708.00 7 416.00 18 540.00 37 080.00 

Powerpik 10 11 340 7 416.00 14 832.00 37 080.00 74 160.00 

Powerpik 11 20 790 13 596.75 27 193.50 67 983.75 N/A 

Powerpik 12 35 640 23 307.75 46 615.50 N/A N/A 

Powerpik 13 57 915 37 876.50 75 753.00 N/A N/A 

Powerpik 14 90 090 58 918.50 N/A N/A N/A 

Powerpik 15 135 135 88 377.75 N/A N/A N/A 
    ”. 

10. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 is amended by deleting from the heading 
commencing “Agent’s fees” to “as follows:” and inserting 
instead —  

“     
Agent’s fees 

(up to but not including draw 586) 

The component of the total cost of entering a powerball draw drawn before 
9 August 2007 that is allocated as a fee for the agent through whom the entry 
was sold per number and type of game per week is as follows —  

    ”. 

 (2) After the Table in Schedule 2 the following item and Table are 
inserted —  

“     
Agent’s fees 

(from draw 586 onwards) 

The component of the total cost of entering a powerball draw on or after 
9 August 2007 that is allocated as a fee for the agent through whom the entry 
was sold per number and type of game per week is as follows —  

Entry or 
System 

No. of 
games 

1 Week
           $ 

2 Weeks
           $ 

5 Weeks 
              $ 

10 Weeks 
           $ 

 2 0.10 0.20 0.50 1.00 

 3 0.15 0.30 0.75 1.50 

 4 0.20 0.40 1.00 2.00 



3052 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

Entry or 
System 

No. of 
games 

1 Week
           $ 

2 Weeks
           $ 

5 Weeks
              $ 

10 Weeks 
           $ 

 5 0.25 0.50 1.25 2.50 

 6 0.30 0.60 1.50 3.00 

 12 0.65 1.30 3.25 6.50 

 14 0.75 1.50 3.75 7.50 

 18 0.95 1.90 4.75 9.50 

 25 1.35 2.70 6.75 13.50 

System 6 6 0.30 0.60 1.50 3.00 

System 7 21 1.15 2.30 5.75 11.50 

System 8 56 3.00 6.00 15.00 30.00 

System 9 126 6.80 13.60 34.00 68.00 

System 10 252 13.60 27.20 68.00 136.00 

System 11 462 24.95 49.90 124.75 249.50 

System 12 792 42.75 85.50 213.75 427.50 

System 13 1 287 69.50 139.00 347.50 695.00 

System 14 2 002 108.10 216.20 540.50 1 081.00 

System 15 3 003 162.15 324.30 810.75 1 621.50 

System 16 4 368 235.85 471.70 1 179.25 2 358.50 

System 17 6 188 334.15 668.30 1 670.75 3 341.50 

System 18 8 568 462.65 925.30 2 313.25 4 626.50 

System 19 11 628 627.90 1 255.80 3 139.50 6 279.00 

System 20 15 504 837.20 1 674.40 4 186.00 N/A 

System 3 861 46.50 93.00 232.50 465.00 

System 4 41 2.20 4.40 11.00 22.00 

 Powerpik  

Powerpik 3 38 745 2 092.50 4 185.00 N/A N/A 

Powerpik 4 1 845 99.00 198.00 495.00 990.00 

Powerpik 5 45 2.45 4.90 12.25 24.50 

Powerpik 6 270 13.50 27.00 67.50 135.00 

Powerpik 7 945 51.75 103.50 258.75 517.50 

Powerpik 8 2 520 135.00 270.00 675.00 1 350.00 

Powerpik 9 5 670 306.00 612.00 1 530.00 3 060.00 

Powerpik 10 11 340 612.00 1 224.00 3 060.00 6 120.00 

Powerpik 11 20 790 1 122.75 2 245.50 5 613.75 N/A 

Powerpik 12 35 640 1 923.75 3 847.50 N/A N/A 

Powerpik 13 57 915 3 127.50 6 255.00 N/A N/A 

Powerpik 14 90 090 4 864.50 N/A N/A N/A 

Powerpik 15 135 135 7 296.75 N/A N/A N/A 
    ”. 

11. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 is amended by deleting —  

“     
Prize pool – division 1 40.0%

Prize pool – division 2 12.9%

Prize pool – division 3 5.9%



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3053 

 

Prize pool – division 4 4.6%

Prize pool – division 5 2.6%

Prize pool – division 6 11.7%

Prize pool – division 7 22.3%

    ”. 
 
The Common Seal of the  ) 
Commission was affixed on the ) L.S. 
21st day of June 2007, ) 
by order and in the presence of — ) 

 
CLYDE BEVAN, Chairperson. 

FREDA CRUCITTI, Member. 

ROGER LEWIS, Member. 
 

——————————— 
 

LO302* 

Lotteries Commission Act 1990 

Lotteries Commission (Saturday Lotto) 
Amendment Rules 2007 

Made by the Lotteries Commission under section 28(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Lotteries Commission (Saturday Lotto) 
Amendment Rules 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These rules come into operation as follows: 

 (a) rules 1 and 2 — on the day on which these rules are 
published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the rules — on the day after that day. 

3. The rules amended 

  The amendments in these rules are to the Lotteries Commission 
(Saturday Lotto) Rules 1996*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 4 August 2006. 
  For amendments to 14 June 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 



3054 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

4. Rule 18 amended 

  Rule 18(2)(b) is amended by deleting “go” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    goes    ”. 

5. Rule 22 amended 

  Rule 22(1) is repealed. 

6. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 is amended by deleting —  

“     
Prize pool — division 1 27.2% 
Prize pool — division 2 6.45% 
Prize pool — division 3 12.15% 
Prize pool — division 4 20.85% 
Prize pool — division 5 33.35% 

    ”. 
 
The Common Seal of the  ) 
Commission was affixed on the ) L.S. 
21st day of June 2007, ) 
by order and in the presence of —  ) 

 
CLYDE BEVAN, Chairperson. 

FREDA CRUCITTI, Member. 

ROGER LEWIS, Member. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LO303* 

Lotteries Commission Act 1990 

Lotteries Commission (Oz Lotto) Amendment 
Rules 2007 

Made by the Lotteries Commission under section 28(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Lotteries Commission (Oz Lotto) Amendment 
Rules 2007. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3055 

 

2. Commencement 

  These rules come into operation as follows: 

 (a) rules 1 and 2 — on the day on which these rules are 
published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the rules — on the day after that day. 

3. The rules amended 

  The amendments in these rules are to the Lotteries Commission 
(Oz Lotto) Rules 1995*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 17 November 2006.] 

4. Rule 16 amended 

  Rule 16(2)(b) is amended by deleting “go” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    goes    ”. 

5. Rule 19 amended 

  Rule 19(1) is repealed. 

6. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 is amended by deleting —  

“     
Prize Pool – division 1 40.0% 
Prize Pool – division 2 1.7% 
Prize Pool – division 3 3.5% 
Prize Pool – division 4 1.8% 
Prize Pool – division 5 2.1% 
Prize Pool – division 6 24.0% 
Prize Pool – division 7 26.9% 

    ”. 
 
The Common Seal of the  ) 
Commission was affixed on the ) L.S. 
21st day of June 2007, ) 
by order and in the presence of —  ) 

 
CLYDE BEVAN, Chairperson. 

FREDA CRUCITTI, Member. 

ROGER LEWIS, Member. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 



3056 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

LO304* 

Lotteries Commission Act 1990 

Lotteries Commission (Monday and Wednesday 
Lotto) Rules 2007 

Made by the Lotteries Commission under section 28(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Lotteries Commission (Monday and 
Wednesday Lotto) Rules 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These rules come into operation as follows: 

 (a) rules 1 and 2 — on the day on which these rules are 
published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the rules — on the day after that day. 

3. The rules amended 

  The amendments in these rules are to the Lotteries Commission 
(Monday and Wednesday Lotto) Rules 2006*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 21 April 2006. 
  For amendments to 14 June 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Rule 18 amended 

  Rule 18(2)(b) is amended by deleting “go” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    goes    ”. 

5. Rule 22 amended 

  Rule 22(1) is repealed. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3057 

 

6. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 is amended by deleting —  

“       
Prize pool — division 1 50.0% 
Prize pool — division 2 3.7% 
Prize pool — division 3 6.8% 
Prize pool — division 4 17.0% 
Prize pool — division 5 22.5% 

    ”. 
 
The Common Seal of the  ) 
Commission was affixed on the ) L.S. 
21st day of June 2007, ) 
by order and in the presence of —  ) 
 

CLYDE BEVAN, Chairperson. 

FREDA CRUCITTI, Member. 

ROGER LEWIS, Member. 
 

——————————— 
 
LO305* 

Lotteries Commission Act 1990 

Lotteries Commission (Soccer Pools) 
Amendment Rules 2007 

Made by the Lotteries Commission under section 28(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Lotteries Commission (Soccer Pools) 
Amendment Rules 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These rules come into operation as follows: 

 (a) rules 1 and 2 — on the day on which these rules are 
published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the rules — on the day after that day. 

3. The rules amended 

  The amendments in these rules are to the Lotteries Commission 
(Soccer Pools) Rules 1996*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 17 May 2002. 
  For amendments to 14 June 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 



3058 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

4. Rule 23 amended 

  Rule 23(2)(b) is amended by deleting “go” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    goes    ”. 

5. Rule 26 amended 

  Rule 26(1) is repealed. 

6. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 is amended by deleting —  

“     
Prize pool — Division 1 65.0% 
Prize pool — Division 2 2.0% 
Prize pool — Division 3 6.0% 
Prize pool — Division 4 15.0% 
Prize pool — Division 5 12.0% 

    ”. 
 
The Common Seal of the  ) 
Commission was affixed on the ) L.S. 
21st day of June 2007, ) 
by order and in the presence of — ) 
 

CLYDE BEVAN, Chairperson. 

FREDA CRUCITTI, Member. 

ROGER LEWIS, Member. 

TRANSPORT 

TR301* 

Public Transport Authority Act 2003 

Public Transport Authority Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Public Transport Authority 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2007. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3059 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Public 
Transport Authority Regulations 2003*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 27 June 2003, p. 2465-97. 
  For amendments to 24 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 9 January 2007.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 item 1 is amended by deleting “$1.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $2.00    ”. 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 
 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

TR302* 

Government Railways Act 1904 

Government Railways (Parking Stations) 
Amendment By-law 2007 

Made by the Public Transport Authority of Western Australia under the 
Government Railways Act 1904 section 23 and approved by the 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council 
under section 24. 

1. Citation 

  These by-laws are the Government Railways (Parking Stations) 
Amendment By-law 2007. 



3060 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

2. Commencement 

  These by-laws come into operation as follows: 

 (a) by-laws 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the by-laws — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in these by-laws are to the Government 
Railways (Parking Stations) By-law 1997*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 9 July 2004.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 item 1(1) is amended by deleting “$1.00.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $2.00.    ”. 
 
 
The common seal of the Public 
Transport Authority of Western 
Australia was affixed, as authorised by 
the Authority, in the presence of — 

 

R. WALDOCK, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

 

Approved by the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 

 

 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3061 

 

TREASURY AND FINANCE 

TF301* 

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992 

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) 
Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Rates and Charges (Rebates and 
Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2007. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendment in these regulations is to the Rates and Charges 
(Rebates and Deferments) Regulations 1992*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 5 May 2006. 
  For amendments to 8 June 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

3. Regulation 3 amended 

  The Table to regulation 3 is amended by inserting the following 
row at the end of the Table —  

“     
1/7/07 — 30/6/08 $76.35 $148.75 $15.25 $227.20 

   ”. 

 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 



3062 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

WATER/SEWERAGE 

WA301* 

Water Services Licensing Act 1995 

Water Services Licensing (Plumbers Licensing 
and Plumbing Standards) Amendment 

Regulations (No. 3) 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Water Services Licensing (Plumbers 
Licensing and Plumbing Standards) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Water Services 
Licensing (Plumbers Licensing and Plumbing Standards) 
Regulations 2000*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 1 October 2004. 
  For amendments to 8 June 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 1 and 29 May 2007.] 

4. Regulation 3 amended  

  Regulation 3(1) is amended in the definition of “water services 
provider” by inserting after “3” —  

  “    of the Act    ”. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3063 

 

5. Regulation 12 amended  

  Regulation 12(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) before paragraph (a)(ii) by inserting —  

“     
 (ia) water supply plumbing work and 

sanitary plumbing work; or 
    ”; 

 (b) after each of paragraph (a)(i), (ii) and (iii) by 
inserting —  

  “    or    ”; 

 (c) after paragraph (a) by inserting —  

  “    and    ”. 

6. Regulation 47 amended 

  Regulation 47(2)(a) is amended by deleting “AS/NZS 
3500.1.2:1998, AS/NZS 3500.2.2:1996 and AS/NZ 
3500.4.2:1997” and inserting instead —  

“     
  AS/NZS 3500.1:2003, AS/NZS 3500.2:2003 

and AS/NZS 3500.4:2003 
    ”. 

7. Regulations 49 and 50 replaced 

  Regulations 49 and 50 are repealed and the following 
regulations are inserted instead —  

“     
49. Modifications of Australian/New Zealand Standard 

 (1) For the purposes of regulation 47, AS/NZS 
3500.1:2003 (Water services) is modified as set out in 
the Table to this subregulation. 

Table 

Provision Modification 

Clause 3.2.1 “The maximum flow rate from a shower, 
basin, and kitchen sink or laundry 
trough outlet shall not exceed 9 L/min.” 
is deleted 

Clause 3.5.2 is deleted 

 (2) For the purposes of regulation 47, AS/NZS 
3500.2:2003 (Sanitary plumbing and drainage) is 
modified as set out in the Table to this subregulation. 

Table 

Provision Modification 

Clause 3.2 “that building” is deleted and “buildings 
on that property” is inserted instead 



3064 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

Provision Modification 

Clause 3.9.2.2 is replaced by —  

“     
3.9.2.2 Downstream (boundary 

trap) vent 

Where, on any drain, a boundary trap vent 
is required by Clause 3.9.1(a), it shall be 
installed so that —  

 (a) the vent is connected not more than 
10 m from the boundary trap riser 
and no other fixture is connected 
between the vent and the boundary 
trap riser; 

 (b) if the vent is unsupported, it 
terminates between a minimum of 
150 mm and a maximum of 
250 mm above ground or adopted 
flood level using one of the 
following methods:  

(i) one 88° bend and a flat grate 
with invert level not less than 
150 mm above ground or 
adopted flood level;  

 (ii) two 88° bends and a flat grate 
or vent cowl so that there is 
not less than 150 mm between 
the flat grate or vent cowl and 
the ground or adopted flood 
level; 

(iii) an air admittance valve not 
less than 150 mm above 
ground or adopted flood level 
installed in accordance with 
Clause 6.9;  

 and 
 (c) the vent is sized in accordance with 

Clause 3.9.3.1 so that the fixture 
unit loading on the main drain 
determines the size of the vent with 
the minimum size being not less 
than DN 50. 

    ” 

Clause 3.9.2.4 “     
3.9.2.4 High level vent 

Where a boundary trap vent is not 
installed as a low level vent it shall 
terminate in accordance with Clause 6.8.4, 
and where an air admittance valve is used 
it shall be installed in accordance with 
Clause 6.9. 

    ” 

is inserted after Clause 3.9.2.3 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3065 

 

Provision Modification 

Clause 3.18 paragraphs (c) to (e) are replaced by —  

“     

(c) The inspection shaft shall be a 
sweep or 45° junction installed in 
the graded drain with the branch of 
the junction extended vertically 
upwards to surface level. 

 (d) The junction to the inspection shaft 
shall be against the grade of the 
drain so that any rodding of the line 
is in the direction away from the 
chamber. 

 (e) Where more than one drain is 
connected to a vacuum chamber, 
the spill level of both overflow 
gullies of the drains shall be 
installed level with each other 
wherever possible. 

 (f) A DN 100 vent pipe shall be 
provided on each drain connected 
to a vacuum chamber. 

 (g) A vacuum sewer system vent can 
be located on the main drain as 
close as possible to the inspection 
shaft riser but can also be 
connected further upstream as long 
as no other fixture is connected 
between the inspection shaft riser 
and the vent connection. 

 (h) A vacuum sewer system vent can 
terminate between a minimum of 
150 mm and a maximum of 
250 mm above ground or adopted 
flood level using one of the 
following methods:  

(i) one 88° bend and a flat grate 
with invert level not less than 
150 mm above ground or 
adopted flood level;  



3066 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

Provision Modification 

 (ii) two 88° bends and a flat grate 
or vent cowl so that there is 
not less than 150 mm between 
the flat grate or vent cowl and 
the ground or adopted flood 
level; 

(iii) an air admittance valve not 
less than 150 mm above 
ground or adopted flood level 
installed in accordance with 
Clause 6.9;  

 and 
 (i) Where a vacuum sewer system 

vent is installed as a low level vent 
it shall terminate in accordance 
with Clause 3.9.2.3. 

 (j) Where a vacuum sewer system 
vent is not installed as a low level 
vent it shall terminate in 
accordance with Clause 6.8.4, and 
where an air admittance valve is 
used it shall be installed in 
accordance with Clause 6.9. 

    ” 

Clause 4.4.1 “In this clause a “boundary trap area” is 
an area in which boundary traps are 
required by the water services provider.” 
is inserted at the end of the clause 

Clause 4.6.1 “     
All fixtures and appliances connected to 
overflow relief gullies or disconnector 
gullies shall be fitted with a trap or 
self-sealing device installed in accordance 
with Clause 6.4. 

    ” 

is inserted after paragraph (b) 

Clause 4.6.2(d) “surcharge.” is deleted and “surcharge 
being a grating that is of a loose, 
lightweight, domed pop-out type; and” is 
inserted instead 

Clause 4.6.2 “     
(e) have the height of the gully riser 

not more than 600 mm measured 
from the top of the water seal to the 
grate of the gully. 

    ” 

is inserted at the end 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3067 

 

Provision Modification 

Table 4.3 the first item is deleted 

in the second item “or shower” is deleted 

the third item is deleted 

in the last item “Top surface level of the 
fixture outlet” is deleted and “Overflow 
level of the fixture” is inserted instead 

Table 4.4  in the item “Bidet” “1.2” and “2.5” are 
deleted in the second and third columns 
and “Not permitted” is inserted instead 

Clause 4.7.1 paragraphs (a) to (h) are replaced by —  

“     
(a) at the downstream end of any 

branch drain that exits a building, 
adjacent to the junction into the 
main drain; 

(b) at the upstream and downstream 
ends of all branch drains and main 
drains that are external to a 
building; 

 (c) at every change of horizontal 
direction greater than 45°; 

(d) at intervals of not more than 30 m; 
(e) at the connection to the water 

services provider’s sewer if not 
provided by the water services 
provider; 

 (f) at the downstream end of any drain 
that passes under a building, except 
where waste fixtures only are 
concerned; 

(g) where any new section of drain is 
connected to an existing drain; and 

 (h) at the upper bend of a jump-up or 
rising shaft. 

    ” 

Clause 6.4.3 “Traps and self-sealing devices shall be 
connected as close as possible to the 
outlet of the fixture or appliance being 
served.” is deleted and “Fixture traps and 
self-sealing devices shall be connected as 
close as possible to the fixture outlet.” is 
inserted instead. 

“300 mm for urinals and” is inserted 
before “600 mm” 

 (3) For the purposes of regulation 47, AS/NZS 
3500.4:2003 (Heated water services) is modified as set 
out in the Table to this subregulation. 



3068 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

Table 

Provision Modification 

Table 5.1 in the item “Expansion control valve 
(Australia)” “ * ” is deleted in the second, 
third and fourth columns and “Yes” is 
inserted instead 

50. Definitions in AS/NZS 3500.0:2003 apply 

  Subject to regulation 51, a word or expression that — 

 (a) is used in a provision of AS/NZS 3500.1:2003, 
AS/NZS 3500.2:2003 or AS/NZS 3500.4:2003 
as applied for the purposes of regulation 47; 
and 

 (b) is given a meaning in AS/NZS 3500.0:2003, 

  has that meaning when so used. 
    ”. 

8. Regulation 51 amended  

  Regulation 51 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “AS/NZS 3500.1.2:1998, AS/NZS 
3500.2.2:1996 or AS/NZS 3500.4.2:1997 — ” and 
inserting instead —  

“     
  AS/NZS 3500.1:2003, AS/NZS 3500.2:2003 or 

AS/NZS 3500.4:2003 —  
    ”; 

 (b) after paragraph (a) by inserting —  

“     
 (aa) “boundary trap vent” means the vent at the 

downstream end of a drain that incorporates a 
boundary trap; 

    ”; 

 (c) after paragraph (f) by inserting —  

“     
 (fa) “network utility operator” means the relevant 

water services provider; 
    ”; 

 (d) after paragraph (i) by inserting —  

“     
 (ia) “vacuum sewer system vent” means a pipe 

provided on a sanitary drain to limit pressure 
variations within the sanitary drainage system 
caused by the operation of a vacuum pump; 

    ”. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3069 

 

9. Regulation 52 amended 

  Regulation 52(1) and (2) are amended by deleting “AS/NZS 
3500.1.2:1998, AS/NZS 3500.2.2:1996 or AS/NZS 
3500.4.2:1997” and inserting instead —  

“     
  AS/NZS 3500.1:2003, AS/NZS 3500.2:2003 or 

AS/NZS 3500.4:2003 
    ”. 

10. Regulation 62 amended 

  Regulation 62(1) is amended by deleting “AS/NZS 
3500.2.2:1996” and inserting instead —  

  “    AS/NZS 3500.2:2003    ”. 

11. Regulation 102 amended  

  After regulation 102(4) the following subregulation is 
inserted —  

“     
 (5) The Board may remove private address and telephone 

details from —  

 (a) the copy of the register that is available for 
inspection under subregulation (2); or 

 (b) a copy of the register that is provided under 
subregulation (3); or 

 (c) an extract from the register that is provided 
under subregulation (4). 

    ”. 

12. Regulation 103 amended  

  Regulation 103(b) is amended by deleting “address;” and 
inserting instead —  

“     
  address and his or her telephone number at that 

address or a mobile telephone number; 
    ”. 

13. Regulation 105 amended  

  Regulation 105 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by inserting after “Board” —  

  “    in writing    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “residential or business address” and 
inserting instead —  

“     
  address or telephone number as registered under 

regulation 103(b) 
    ”. 



3070 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

14. Regulation 109 inserted 

  After regulation 108 the following regulation is inserted in 
Part 8 —  

“     
109. Transmission of information 

  For the purposes of section 60B(2)(b) of the Act —  

 (a) information may be disclosed to a person or 
body who or which has functions relating to the 
regulation of plumbing work under the law of 
this or another State, a Territory or the 
Commonwealth; and 

 (b) details of property on which plumbing work has 
been carried out may be disclosed to a water 
services provider if the disclosure is in 
accordance with an arrangement between the 
Board and the water services provider. 

    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3071 

 

— PART 2 — 

COAL INDUSTRY SUPERANNUATION BOARD 

CZ401 
COAL INDUSTRY SUPERANNUATION ACT 1989 

APPOINTMENTS 
Perth, June 2007. 

Under the provisions of Section 8 of the Coal Industry Superannuation Act 1989, the following 
employee elected members are appointed as constituted under the said Act, from the 1st day of July 
2007— 

Gary Faries (2) two years 
Greg Della Alternate Member (1) one year 

B. E. WHITTLE, Chairperson. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
CZ402 

COAL INDUSTRY SUPERANNUATION ACT 1989 

APPOINTMENTS 
Perth, June 2007. 

Under the provisions of Section 8 of the Coal Industry Superannuation Act 1989, the following 
employer nominated members are appointed as constituted under the said Act, from the 1st day of 
July 2007— 

Ian Pigott (2) two years 
David Pullan Alternate Member (1) one year 

B. E. WHITTLE, Chairperson. 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401 

CHARITABLE COLLECTIONS ACT 1946 

REVOCATION OF LICENCES 
I, Patrick Walker, being the officer delegated by the Minister administering the Charitable 
Collections Act 1946, and acting in the exercise of the powers conferred by subsection (3) of section 12 
of that Act, hereby give notice that I have revoked the licence of the organisations listed below— 

 • Fund for F.A.I.T.H. Inc 
 • Multiple Sclerosis Australia 

 • NDHIWA Christian Orphanage Home Inc 
Dated this 18th day of June 2007. 

PATRICK WALKER, Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 



3072 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

CE402 
TRADE MEASUREMENT ADMINISTRATION ACT 2006 

MINISTER TO DESIGNATE COMMISSIONER AND DEPUTY COMMISSIONER 
It is hereby notified that pursuant to section 6 of the Trade Measurement Administration Act 2006 
the Minister for Consumer Protection has designated the persons who hold the positions within the 
Department of Consumer and Employment Protection of ‘Executive Director, Consumer Protection’ 
and ‘Director, Trading Standards and Fuel’ (either substantively or in an acting capacity) as 
‘Commissioner’ and ‘Deputy Commissioner’ respectively, for the purposes of the Trade Measurement 
Administration Act 2006 and Trade Measurement Act 2006. 
Dated this 21st day of June 2007. 

SHEILA McHALE, Minister for Consumer Protection. 

FISHERIES 

FI401* 
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 

PROHIBITION ON FISHING (ROTTNEST ISLAND) ORDER 2007 
Order No. 4 of 2007 

FD 931/01 [813] 
Made by the Minister under section 43. 

1. Citation 
This order is the Prohibition on Fishing (Rottnest Island) Order 2007.  

2.Interpretation 
In this order unless the contrary intention appears— 

“pointed instrument” means a speargun, harpoon, Hawaiian sling, gidgie, or any other similar 
instrument; 

“protected area” means any of the waters specified in Schedules 1, 2, 3, 4 or 5 

3. Prohibition on fishing in a protected area 
(1) A person must not fish by any means in a protected area. 
(2) Subclause (1) does not apply in regard to any area specified in Schedule 1, 2 or 3 as a permitted 
area, and by the means specified. 

4. Prohibition on fishing by net 
A person must not take fish by means of a net of any description in any waters described in 
Schedule 6. 

5. Prohibition on fishing for certain species 
A person must not fish by any means for any fish specified in Schedule 7 in any waters described in 
Schedule 6. 

6. Prohibition on fishing by pointed instrument 
A person must not fish by means of a pointed instrument in the waters specified in Schedule 8. 

7. Revocation 
(1) The following Notices, which were made under the Fisheries Act 1905 and were continued in force 
under regulation 186 of the Fish Resources Management Regulations 1995 as if they were orders 
made under Section 43 of the Act, are revoked— 

Notice No. 332 published in the Government Gazette of 30 May 1988 
Notice No. 333 published in the Government Gazette of 30 May 1988 
Notice No. 367 published in the Government Gazette of 2 December 1988 
Notice No. 641 published in the Government Gazette of 22 July 1994 

(2) Order No. 27 of 2003, published in the Government Gazette of 23 December 2003, is revoked. 

Schedule 1 
West End Demersal protected area 
All that portion of the Indian Ocean adjacent to Rottnest Island within and bounded by a line 
commencing at the point of latitude 32° 01.180’ south; longitude 115° 27.103’ east on the high water 
mark on Rottnest Island; then north along the geodesic to the point of latitude 32° 00.986’ south; then 
west along the geodesic to the point of longitude 115° 26.381’ east; then south along the geodesic to 
the point of latitude 32° 01.911’ south; then easterly along the geodesic to the point of latitude 32° 
02.005’ south; longitude 115° 27.408’ east; then northerly along the geodesic to the point of 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3073 

 

intersection on the high water mark of Rottnest Island and then generally westerly and northerly to 
the commencement point. 
Permitted Area and means 
1. Fishing for fish by means of a rod and line, or line held in the hand, from the shore, or from the reef 
top area adjacent to Rottnest Island, between a point of latitude 32° 01.479’ south; longitude 115° 
27.202’ east; and latitude 32° 01.563’ south; longitude 115° 27.408’ east. 
2. Trolling from a boat for pelagic species.  

Schedule 2 
Green Island protected area 
All that portion of the Indian Ocean adjacent to Rottnest Island within and bounded by a line 
commencing at the point on the high water mark on the southern side of Rottnest Island and 
intersection 115° 29.342’ east longitude; then south along the geodesic to the point of latitude 32° 
01.454’ south; then east along the geodesic to the point of longitude 115° 30.117’ east; then north 
along the geodesic to the point of intersection with the high water mark on Rottnest Island then 
generally westerly and southerly along the high water mark to the commencement point. 
Permitted Area and means 
Fishing by means of a rod and line, or line held in the hand, from the structure known locally and 
referred to as the “Green Island jetty”. 

Schedule 3 
Armstrong protected area 
All that portion of the Indian Ocean adjacent to Rottnest Island within and bounded by a line 
commencing at the point of latitude 31° 59.242’ south; longitude 115° 30.864’ east; then northerly 
along the geodesic to the point of latitude 31° 58.880’ south; longitude 115° 30.689 east; then 
generally westerly along the geodesic to the point of latitude 31° 59.171’ south; longitude 115° 29.960’ 
east; then south easterly along the geodesic to the point of latitude 31° 59.456’ south; longitude 115° 
30.193’ east; then easterly and northerly along the high water mark of Rottnest island to a point of 
latitude 31° 59.260’ south; longitude 115° 30.822’ east; then north easterly back to the commencement 
point. 
Permitted Area and means 
Fishing by means of a rod and line, or line held in the hand, from the shore, or from the reef top area 
adjacent to Rottnest Island, between— 
 (a) a point of latitude 31° 59.456’ south; longitude 115° 30.193’east; and latitude 31° 59.490’ 

south; longitude 115° 30.229’ east; or 
 (b) a point of latitude 31° 59.417’ south; longitude 115° 30.400’ east; and latitude  31° 59.409’ 

south; longitude 115° 30.455’ east. 

Schedule 4 
Parker Point protected area 
All that portion of the Indian Ocean adjacent to Rottnest Island within and bounded by a line 
commencing at the point on the high water mark latitude 32° 01.493’ south; longitude 115° 31.719’ 
east; then east along the geodesic to the point of longitude 115° 31.947’ east; then south along the 
geodesic to the point of latitude 32° 01.670’ south; then south westerly along the geodesic to the point 
of latitude 32° 01.949’ south; longitude 115° 31.497’ east; then north westerly along the geodesic to 
the point of latitude 32° 01.516 south; longitude 115° 31.021’ east; then north along the geodesic to 
the point of latitude 32° 01.261’ south; then east along the geodesic to the point of intersection with 
the high water mark of Rottnest Island; then generally southerly, easterly and northerly along the 
high water mark back to the commencement point. 

Schedule 5 
Kingston Reef protected area 
All that portion of the Indian Ocean adjacent to the area of waters at Rottnest Island known as 
Thomson Bay, within and bounded by a line commencing at the point of latitude 31° 59.756’ south; 
longitude 115° 33.050’ east; then east north-easterly along the geodesic to the point of latitude 31° 
59.640’ south; longitude 115° 33.496’ east; then north easterly along the geodesic to the point of 
latitude 31° 58.850’ south; longitude 115° 33.978’ east; then west south westerly along the geodesic to 
the point of latitude 31° 59.248’ south; longitude 115° 32.655’ east; then in a generally southerly 
direction back to the commencement point. 

Schedule 6 
All that portion of the Indian Ocean within 800 metres of the high water mark of Rottnest Island; and 
All that portion of the Indian Ocean within 200 metres of the high water mark of Dyer Island. 

Schedule 7 
Phylum Mollusca (live), which includes all bivalve and gastropod shells and sea slugs other than 
abalone, squid, cuttlefish and octopus; 
Phylum Echinodermata, which includes sea urchins, starfish, brittle stars, feather stars and sea 
cucumbers; 
Phylum Cnidaria, which includes all corals, sea anemone and jelly fish; 
Fishes of the families Syngnathidae and Solenostomidae, which includes sea dragons, sea horses and 
pipe fish. 



3074 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

Schedule 8 
(a) All that portion of the Indian Ocean bounded by a line commencing at the high water mark at 
Point Clune, then extending north 800 metres, then commencing in an easterly direction following, 
and parallel to, the coastline, at a distance of 800 metres from the high water mark, to a point 800 
metres south of the high water mark at Salmon Point, then north to the high water mark at Salmon 
Point, then along the high water mark to the commencement point. 
(b) All that portion of the Indian Ocean bounded by a line commencing at the high water mark at 
Salmon Point, then extending south 200 metres, then commencing in a westerly direction following, 
and parallel to, the coastline, at a distance of 200 metres from the high water mark, to a point 200 
metres north of the high water mark at Point Clune, then south to the high water mark at Point 
Clune, then along the high water mark to the commencement point. 
(c) All that portion of the Indian Ocean within 200 metres of the high water mark of Dyer Island. 

Dated this 19th day of June 2007. 

JON FORD, Minister for Fisheries. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
PETROLEUM ACT 1967 

EXPIRATION OF EXPLORATION PERMIT 
Exploration Permit No. EP 23 held by Ausam Resources Pty Ltd expired on 9 June 2007. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MP402* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
RENEWAL OF EXPLORATION PERMIT WA-306-P 

Renewal of Exploration Permit WA-306-P has been granted to Antrim Energy Australia Pty Ltd to 
have effect from and including 11th June 2007 for a period of five years. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 

PARLIAMENT 

PA401* 
PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

Royal Assent to Bill 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor has Assented in the name and on behalf 
of Her Majesty the Queen, on the date shown, to the undermentioned Bill passed by the Legislative 
Council and the Legislative Assembly during the First Session of the Thirty-Seventh Parliament. 

Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No. 
Racing, Wagering and Betting Legislation Amendment and 

Repeal Bill 2007 
13 June 2007 8 of 2007 

Ms MIA BETJEMAN, Clerk of the Parliaments. 
20 June 2007. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3075 

 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Broome 

Town Planning Scheme No.4—Amendment No.33 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Broome local planning scheme amendment on 22 May 2007 for the purpose of amending Clause 
5.5.3 (a) of the Scheme by changing it from— 
 (a) not be less than the estimated cost of providing and constructing the parking spaces required 

by Council Policy plus the value of the area of land which might have been occupied by the 
parking spaces; and 

and replacing it with— 
 (a) be in accordance with an approved detailed car parking plan that is adopted by Council. In 

the absence of an approved detailed car parking plan, payment shall not be less than the 
estimated cost of providing and constructing the parking spaces required by Council Policy, 
plus the value of the area of land which might have been occupied by the parking spaces; and 

G. T. CAMPBELL, Shire President. 
I. M. BODILL, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 

 

PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Gosnells 

Town Planning Scheme No. 6—Amendment No. 56 
Ref: 853/2/25/8 Pt 56  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of 
Gosnells local planning scheme amendment on 6 June 2007 for the purpose of— 

Rezoning a portion of 2452 (Lot 100) Albany Highway Gosnells from “Mixed Business” to 
“General Rural”. 

Applying a “General Rural” zoning to the unzoned drainage reserve (Lot 0) that runs along the south-
eastern and north-eastern sides of Lot 303 Albany Highway and along the north-eastern side of Lot 
28 Manning Avenue, Gosnells. 

P. M. MORRIS, Mayor. 
S. JARDINE, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 

 

PI403* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Gosnells 

Town Planning Scheme No. 6—Amendment No. 52 
Ref: 853/2/25/8 Pt 52 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of 
Gosnells local planning scheme amendment on 29 May 2007 for the purpose of— 
 1.  Rezoning a portion of Lot 1297 Southern River Road, Gosnells, from “General Rural” to 

“Residential Development”. 
 2.  Amending the Scheme Map accordingly. 

P. M. MORRIS, Mayor. 
S. JARDINE, Chief Executive Officer. 



3076 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

PI404* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Nannup 

Town Planning Scheme No. 1—Amendment No. 34 
Ref: 853/6/17/1 Pt 34 

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Nannup local planning scheme amendment on 5 June 2007 for the purpose of— 
 1. Modifying the Scheme Map to reflect the rezoning of portion of Lot 23 Brockman Highway, 

Nannup from ‘Special Rural’ to ‘Urban’. 
 2. Modifying the Scheme Map to reflect the rezoning from ‘Parks and Recreation’ to ‘Urban’. 

 3. Modifying the approved Subdivision Guide Plan. 
 4. Deleting Special Provision No. 1 of Schedule V relating to Lot 23 Brockman Highway, 

Nannup and replacing it with the following— 

Subdivision 

Subdivision shall be generally in accordance with Subdivision Guide Plan numbered  
‘P0486-01(SGP) Rev. 5’ attached to the Scheme Amendment Report (Amendment No. 34). 

B. DUNNET, Shire President. 
S. A. COLLIE, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

 

——————————— 
 

 

PI405* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

City of Albany 

Town Planning Scheme Amendment No. 3—Amendment No. 260 

Ref: 853/5/4/5 Pt 260 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of Albany 
local planning scheme amendment on 6 June 2007 for the purpose of rezoning Lot 47 and Part of Lot 
52 Lower King Road, Bayonet Head, Albany, from ‘Rural’ to ‘Residential Development’ as shown in 
the plan and modifying the Scheme Map accordingly. 

A. E. GOODE, Mayor. 
A. C. HAMMOND, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

 

——————————— 
 

 

PI406* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Augusta-Margaret River 

Town Planning Scheme No. 11—Amendment No. 133 
Ref: 853/6/3/8 Pt 133 

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Augusta-Margaret River local planning scheme amendment on 6 June 2007 for the purpose of 
amending the Scheme Boundary such that Lots 1 to 13 of Sussex Location 860 Ashton Street, 
Margaret River are removed from the Scheme Area as depicted on the Scheme Amendment Map. 

S. HARRISON, Shire President. 
J. TRAIL, Chief Executive Officer. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3077 

 

PI407* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Augusta-Margaret River 

Town Planning Scheme No. 17—Amendment No. 16 
Ref: 853/6/3/17 Pt 16 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of Augusta-
Margaret River local planning scheme amendment on 6 June 2007 for the purpose of— 
 1. Extending the Scheme boundary to include lots 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, and 8 of Sussex location 860 

Ashton Street Margaret River within Town Planning Scheme No. 17. 
 2. Amending the Scheme Maps to— 
 (i) Include Lots 1 and 2 and portions of lots 3, 4, 5, 6 and 7 of Sussex Location 860 Ashton 

Street Margaret River within the “Special Rural Zone”; 
 (ii) Include Lot 8, 9, 10, 11 and portions of Lots 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 12 and 13 of Sussex Location 

860 Ashton Street within the “Special Residential Zone; 
 (iii) Include portions of lots 12 and 13 of Sussex Location 860 Ashton Street Margaret River 

within the “Parks and Recreation Reserve; and 
 (v) Bordering all of lots 1 to 13 of Sussex Location 860 Ashton Street Margaret River to 

show their inclusion within a new “Overall Planning Area” and adding the notation “7”. 
 3. Amend Clause 3.4 Overall Planning Areas, to read; 
  “The Scheme Map indicates seven (7) overall planning areas wherein…” etc. 
 4. Introduce a new clause to be numbered 3.4.7 to read as follows; 
  “3.4.7—Area No. 7 
 (a) The area shall be redeveloped into a high standard for special rural and low density 

special residential development through resubdivision of existing 3.0ha lots that 
complements the surrounding land use, natural character and existing townscapes; 

 (b) Subdivision and/or development of the area shall be generally in accordance with the 
Outline Development Plan (Figure 5, Plan No. 00044P) dated March 2007 and endorsed 
by the Local Government’s Chief Executive Officer as part of Amendment No. 16 to the 
Scheme. 

 (c) Notwithstanding the requirements of the above mentioned clauses, any Outline 
Development Plan with Area No. 7 shall include a description of the following— 

 (i) The physical, topographical and environmental characteristics of the land 
including slope, soil type, vegetation and drainage characteristics and the need to 
protect such areas as the vegetation corridor along the Margaret River, high 
erosion areas or areas subject to flooding or inundation. 

 (ii) Existing built development and land uses. 
 (iii) Proposed lot sizes and the location, width and standard of proposed roads and 

their connection with the road and public recreation network in the locality. 
 (iv) The provision of public open space and drainage reserves and their management 

to protect the natural qualities of the area. 
 (vi) Where any lots back onto a public road or area of open space the Council will 

require individual lot access and the standard of fencing deemed compatible with 
the objectives of protecting visual and landscape amenity. 

 (vii) A comprehensive effluent disposal report of the soils within the area to support 
on site effluent disposal and recommendations on lot size. 

 (viii) A comprehensive drainage strategy necessary to service the resubdivision and 
development and management measures to protect the environmental integrity 
of the area, particularly in regard to stormwater discharge from additional 
subdivision. 

 5. Renumber existing Clause 3.4.7 to 3.4.8 and Clause 3.4.8 to 3.4.9. 
 6. Introducing into Schedule 2 the following— 

 Specified Area or 
Locality 

 Special Provisions 

3. All of lots 1 and 2 and 
portions of lots 3, 4, 5, 6 
and 7 of Sussex Location 
860 Ashton Street 
Margaret River 

1. Subdivision 
Subdivision to be generally in accordance with the 
Outline Development Plan (Plan No. 00044P 
attached to the Scheme Amendment Report 
(Amendment No. 16). 

  2. The Council may endorse or refuse any proposed 
modifications to the approved Outline 
Development Plan by way of resolution of Council 
where the modifications are consistent with the 
purpose and objectives of the zone. Where 



3078 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

 Specified Area or 
Locality 

 Special Provisions 

modifications to the Outline Development Plan are 
proposed, the Council shall require the 
modifications to be advertised for public comment 
for a period of 21 days prior to considering the 
proposed modification. 

  3. The Council shall forward a copy of any 
modifications referred to in 2. above, once these 
have been considered by Council, to the Western 
Australian Planning Commission for its 
consideration. The modified Outline Development 
Plan will not come into effect until endorsed by the 
Western Australian Planning Commission 
(WAPC). 

  4. Building Envelopes 

Council may request that the Western Australian 
Planning Commission impose a condition of 
subdivision requiring building envelopes to be 
nominated and all buildings, structures and on-site 
effluent disposal systems on each lot shall be 
contained within the envelope unless Council 
approves a variation to the envelope. 

  5. Protection of Water Course 
A 50m Landscape Protection Area along the 
Margaret River and related Public Open Space 
shall be observed where the following conditions 
will apply— 
 (i) Pumping or diversion of water from the 

Margaret River is not permitted unless 
with the prior approval of the Department 
for Environment and the Council. 

 (ii) No development (with the exception of tree 
planting) shall be permitted within the 
Landscape Protection Area except for 
development existing prior to gazettal of 
the Amendment, including effluent 
disposal systems, buildings and structures. 
Any additions to approved development 
shall be at the discretion of Council. 

  6. Infrastructure Implementation Plan 
Prior to subdivision, the subdivider is to prepare 
an Infrastructure Implementation Plan for the 
whole Outline Development Area, detailing the 
staging and funding for paths, drainage, roads, 
public open space, foreshore management and 
upgrading of Ashton Street. Council will request 
that the WAPC impose a condition of subdivision 
requiring the Infrastructure Implementation Plan 
be implemented to the satisfaction of Council. 

  7. Drainage Strategy 

For the whole Outline Development Plan area, 
Council will request that that the WAPC impose a 
condition of subdivision requiring the preparation 
and implementation of a drainage strategy. 

  8. Fire Management Plan 

Council will request that the WAPC impose a 
condition of subdivision requiring the preparation 
of a fire management plan to be implemented on a 
staged basis as subdivision occurs. 

  9. Foreshore Management Plan 

Council will request that the WAPC impose a 
condition of subdivision requiring the preparation 
and implementation of a foreshore management 
plan. The Foreshore Management Plan shall 
include the provision for low key vehicular access 
to the foreshore and associated car parking. 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3079 

 

 Specified Area or 
Locality 

 Special Provisions 

  10. Tree Planting 

Council will request that the WAPC impose a 
condition of subdivision requiring the preparation 
and implementation of a tree planting programme 
for the Proposed Tree Planting Areas as identified 
on the Outline Development Plan to the 
satisfaction of Council. 

  11. Effluent Disposal 
Disposal of onsite effluent is to be via aerobic 
treatment units (ATU’s) or alternative systems 
where specified to the specifications and 
satisfaction of Council and Department of Health 
WA. 

  12. Effluent disposal systems are to be located a 
minimum of 50m from any watercourse. A greater 
setback may be required depending on site 
conditions. 

  13. Council will request that the WAPC impose a 
condition of subdivision requiring that a covenant 
or an alternative mechanism be placed on the title 
of each lot to alert the first and subsequent 
purchasers of the following— 
 (i) That lots are not serviced by reticulated 

sewer. 
 (ii) The required standards for onsite waste 

water treatment and disposal. 
 (iii) That septic tanks as a form of waste water 

treatment are not permitted. 
  14. The subdivider is to submit with a subdivision 

application a site and soil evaluation for each lot 
by a suitably qualified consultant in accordance 
with Australian Standards and Government 
guidelines to determine an appropriate onsite 
domestic waste water treatment system and its 
location to meet health and environmental 
objectives to the satisfaction of the Council and 
Department of Health WA. 

  15. Water Supply 
Each lot shall be provided with a reticulated water 
supply service. 

  16. Development Controls 
All development shall comply with the following 
development controls— 
 (i) Buildings shall not be constructed of a 

height greater than 8 metres in accordance 
with council’s formula for determining 
height and Council reserves the right to 
determine a lessor height requirement 
upon assessment of topographical and 
visual constraints. 

 (ii) Buildings on land steeper than 1:10 shall 
be of split-level or pier construction to 
minimise the amount of required cut and 
fill. 

 (iii) Buildings should be of a sympathetic 
design, material and colour to compliment 
surrounding landscape elements, to the 
satisfaction of the local authority. 

 (iv) Non-reflective building materials will only 
be permitted and non-reflective roofing 
material shall be of a colour consistent 
with the vegetation and/or predominant 
colours of the individual building sites. 

 (v) Outbuildings shall form a unified group 
with the main building and should be of a 
similar form, colour and materials. 



3080 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

 Specified Area or 
Locality 

 Special Provisions 

 (vi) Clearing of existing native vegetation 
within building envelopes should be 
limited to 30m around buildings and 
should be an absolute minimum necessary 
for the installation of services. 

 (vii) A minimum of 150mm topsoil should be 
stripped from earthworks areas and 
replaced immediately after, on 
appropriately located areas, to minimise 
environmental disturbance. 

 (viii) Landscaping should be with materials that 
are sympathetic with the natural 
environment of the Margaret River. 

 (ix) Landowners are encouraged to use native 
vegetation as part of landscaping of lots. 

 (x) For building development landowners are 
encouraged to incorporate sustainable 
housing principles, including water re-use, 
energy efficiency and solar access design. 

  17. Stock 
Livestock shall only be permitted on those lots that 
are predominantly cleared and shall not reach 
levels as to cause land degradation. In such 
circumstances, Council may direct a landowner to 
remove such stock. 

  18. Fencing 
Fencing shall be to a rural post and wire standard 
to the satisfaction of Council. 

  19. Dams 
No dams shall be permitted on any lot unless 
otherwise approved by Council. 

  20. Vegetation Protection 
No trees or substantial vegetation shall be felled or 
removed from the site except where— 
 (i) Required for approved development works; 
 (ii) Required to fulfil the provisions of an 

approved Fire Management Plan; 
 (iii) Required by a council firebreak order; or 
 (iv) Trees are dead, diseased or dangerous. 

 7. Introducing into Schedule 3 the following— 

 Specified Area or 
Locality 

 Special Provisions 

 All of Lots 8, 9, 10, 11 and 
portions of Lots 3, 4, 5, 6, 
7, 12 and 13 of Sussex 
Location 860 Ashton 
Street Margaret River 

1. Subdivision 
Subdivision to be generally in accordance with the 
Outline Development Plan (Plan No. 00044P 
attached to the Scheme Amendment Report 
(Amendment No. 16). 

  2. The Council may endorse or refuse any proposed 
modifications to the approved Outline 
Development Plan by way of resolution of Council 
where the modifications are consistent with the 
purpose and objectives of the zone. Where 
modifications to the Outline Development Plan are 
proposed, the Council shall require the 
modifications to be advertised for public comment 
for a period of 21 days prior to considering the 
proposed modification. 

  3. The Council shall forward a copy of any 
modifications referred to in 2. above, once these 
have been considered by Council, to the Western 
Australian Planning Commission for its 
consideration. The modified Outline Development 
Plan will not come into effect until endorsed by the 
Western Australian Planning Commission 
(WAPC). 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3081 

 

 Specified Area or 
Locality 

 Special Provisions 

  4. Building Envelopes 
Council may request that the Western Australian 
Planning Commission impose a condition of 
subdivision requiring building envelopes to be 
nominated and all buildings, structures and on-site 
effluent disposal systems on each lot shall be 
contained within the envelope unless Council 
approves a variation to the envelope. Where a 
building envelope is approved the envelope shall 
supersede setback requirements of the Residential 
Design Codes of Western Australia. 

  5. Prior to subdivision, the subdivider is to prepare 
an Infrastructure Implementation Plan for the 
whole Outline Development Area, detailing the 
staging and funding for paths, drainage, roads, 
public open space, foreshore management and 
upgrading of Ashton Street. Council will request 
that the WAPC impose a condition of subdivision 
requiring the Infrastructure Implementation Plan 
be implemented to the satisfaction of Council. 

  6. Drainage Strategy 
For the whole Outline Development Plan area, 
Council will request that that the WAPC impose a 
condition of subdivision requiring the preparation 
and implementation of a drainage strategy. 

  7. Tree Planting 
Council will request that the WAPC impose a 
condition of subdivision requiring the preparation 
and implementation of a tree planting programme 
for the Proposed Tree Planting Areas as identified 
on the Outline Development Plan to the 
satisfaction of Council. 

  8. Council will request that the WAPC impose a 
condition of subdivision requiring planting of a 
suitable shrub screening buffer along the eastern 
most boundary of the Outline Development Plan. 

  9. Effluent Disposal 
Disposal of onsite effluent is to be via aerobic 
treatment units (ATU’s) or alternative systems 
where specified to the specifications and 
satisfaction of Council and Department of Health 
WA. 

  10. Council will request that the WAPC impose a 
condition of subdivision requiring that a covenant 
or an alternative mechanism be placed on the title 
of each lot to alert the first and subsequent 
purchasers of the following— 
 (i) That lots are not serviced by reticulated 

sewer. 
 (ii) The required standards for onsite waste 

water treatment and disposal. 
 (iii) That septic tanks as a form of waste water 

treatment are not permitted. 
  11. The subdivider is to submit with a subdivision 

application a site and soil evaluation for each lot by 
a suitably qualified consultant in accordance with 
Australian Standards and Government guidelines 
to determine an appropriate onsite domestic waste 
water treatment system and its location to meet 
health and environmental objectives to the 
satisfaction of the Council and Department of 
Health WA. 

  12. Water Supply 
Each lot shall be provided with a reticulated water 
supply service. 



3082 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

 Specified Area or 
Locality 

 Special Provisions 

  13. Landscaping 
Landowners are encouraged to use native 
vegetation as part of landscaping of lots. 

  14. Building Design 
For building development landowners are 
encouraged to incorporate sustainable housing 
principles, including water re-use, energy 
efficiency and solar access design. 

  15. Fencing 
Fencing shall be to a rural post and wire standard 
to the satisfaction of Council. 

S. HARRISON, Shire President. 
J. TRAIL, Chief Executive Officer. 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PC401 
BUILDERS REGISTRATION ACT 1939 

HOME BUILDING CONTRACTS ACT 1991 

PAINTERS REGISTRATION ACT 1961 

TRANSFER OF ACTS 
It is notified for public information that the Governor, in Executive Council, has approved the 
transfer of the administration of the Builders Registration Act 1939, Home Building Contracts  
Act 1991 and Painters Registration Act 1961 from the Minister for Consumer Protection to the 
Minister for Housing and Works with effect on and from 1 July 2007. 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

WATER/SEWERAGE 

WA401* 
WATER AGENCES (POWERS) ACT 1984 

Shire of Capel—Dalyellup 

PROPOSAL TO CONSTRUCT A 6ML STORAGE TANK 
To improve the water supply to the community of Dalyellup, the Water Corporation proposes to 
construct the following works— 
 – A new ground level storage tank of capacity 6ML and wall height 11m, adjacent to an existing 

6ML capacity tank. 
 – Associated tank pipework.  
The proposed works is in the locality of Dalyellup as shown on the plan. The proposed works are 
scheduled to commence in August 2007 and will continue for the duration of approximately four 
months.  
A copy of this Notice of Proposal (referred to as G050-0-3) is available for viewing, during office hours, 
at the Water Corporation’s South West Regional office, 61 Victoria Street, Bunbury WA 6230 and the 
Head Office, 629 Newcastle St, Leederville WA 6007. 
Further information can be obtained by contacting the Project Manager, Mr Paul Chan, on telephone 
(08) 9791 0452. Objections to the proposed works will be considered if lodged in writing, addressed to 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3083 

 

the Project Manager, Mr Paul Chan, Water Corporation’s South West Regional Office, 61 Victoria 
Street, Bunbury WA 6230 before the close of business on 20 July 2007.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Valia Brown, late of Gwen Hardie Lodge, Mermaid Avenue, Emu Point, in the State of Western 
Australia, Widow, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of Valia Brown deceased who died on 7 April 2007 at Albany, Western Australia 
are required by the personal representative David Malcolm Moss of 45 Duke Street, Albany, Western 
Australia to send particulars of their claims to David Moss & Co of PO Box 5744, Albany WA 6332  
by the 22nd day of July 2007 after which date the personal representative may convey or distribute 
the assets having regard only to the claims of which he has then had notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Annie Mary Theresa McMahon, late of 209 Grand Promenade, Bedford, Western Australia, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 21 March 2007 at Hollywood Private Hospital, 
Nedlands aforesaid are required by the Executor and Trustee of care of Messrs Dwyer Durack 
Lawyers of 6th Floor, St Martins Tower, 44 St Georges Terrace, Perth to send particulars of their 
claims to him by 26 July 2007 after which date the Trustees may convey or distribute the assets 
having regard only to the claims of which he then has notice. 



3084 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

 

 

WorkSafe Online 
 
 
 
 

 
 

Information and advice on workplace safety 

 and health is available direct to your workplace 

through the WorkSafe website. 

 
 

www.worksafe.wa.gov.au 
 
 
 

The WorkSafe website is user friendly and 

packed with valuable information to assist 

employers, employees, and all those involved 

in work to meet their obligations under the 

Occupational Safety Act 1984.  

 
 
 
 

For further information call WorkSafe on (08) 93278777 
 



26 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3085 

 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2008 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2008. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically on any day. 
All Gazettes $
  Within WA ....................................  918.50
  Interstate  .....................................  935.00

 
Bound Volumes of full year .......  1,138.50
 
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $
  Within WA  ...................................  441.00
  Interstate ......................................  525.00
 
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $
  Within WA  ...................................  871.20
  Interstate ...................................  1,064.80
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  ...................................  859.10
  Interstate ......................................  872.30
 

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $
  Within WA....................................... 310.20
  Interstate ....................................... 345.40
  Overseas ........................................ 402.00
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 856.90

 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $
  Within WA....................................... 334.40
  Interstate ........................................ 345.40

 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $
  Within WA ...................................... 459.80
  Interstate ....................................... 481.80

 

 

 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS 
 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at 
State Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of 
publication of the missing item. 
Claims lodged after this period will not be recognised and will attract 
payment in full. 
 
 



3086 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 June 2007 

 

 

W A N T E D ! ! ! 

Old copies of the Government Gazette 

State Law Publisher is in the process of scanning all Government 
Gazettes (back to the first one ever published in the 1840’s) with 
the intention of adding the archived copies to our existing on-line 
service. 

We are looking for donations of any copies (pre 1994) that are no 
longer required by clients and would be appreciative of any 
assistance you can offer in this undertaking. 

The scanning process requires single pages, therefore we need to 
trim the spine off each gazette, which unfortunately ruins the 
gazettes for future use. 

Our preference is for unwanted copies, however, if a client requires 
their gazettes returned, State Law Publisher will reprint and replace 
individual editions. If a bound copy is supplied and is to be returned 
we will reprint all gazettes and arrange to have them rebound for 
the client. 

The benefits of having all the gazettes and indices on-line and 
searchable will be enormous. This service should remove the need 
for clients to retain hard copies and will free up valuable storage 
space. 

Barring any unforeseen delays, it should take around a month to 
scan each year and then release on our website. 

 

——————————— 

 

Please contact John Thompson on 9426 0010 if you can assist by 
supplying editions of the Government Gazette. For large quantities 
we will arrange for them to be collected. 
 


