
!200700137GG! 
 

  3179 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 29 JUNE 2007 No. 137 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Builders’ Registration Act 1939—Builders’ Registration Amendment Regulations 2007......  3189 
Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947— 

Carnarvon Water Reserve Order 2007...............................................................................  3209 
Margaret River Catchment Area Order 2007 ....................................................................  3207 
Mount Magnet Town Dam Catchment Area Abolition Order 2007 ..................................  3204 
Mount Magnet Water Reserve Order 2007........................................................................  3205 

Electricity Corporations Act 2005—Electricity Corporations (Prescribed Customers) Order 
2007.........................................................................................................................................  3194 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems (Access) Act 1994—Electricity 
Distribution Access Repeal Order 2007.................................................................................  3193 

Energy Operators (Powers) Act 1979—Energy Operators (Regional Power Corporation) 
(Charges) Amendment By-laws 2007 ....................................................................................  3192 

Finance Brokers Control Act 1975—Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2007 ........................................................................................................  3181 

Firearms Act 1973—Firearms Amendment Regulations 2007................................................  3196 
Home Building Contracts Act 1991—Home Building Contracts Amendment 

Regulations 2007 ....................................................................................................................  3190 
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment 

Regulations 2007 ....................................................................................................................  3195 
Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978—Land Valuers Licensing (Remuneration) Notice 2007...  3182 
Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994—Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers 

Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007...................................................................................  3202 
Police Act 1892—Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2007................................................  3198 
Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996—Security and Related Activities 

(Control) Amendment Regulations 2007 ...............................................................................  3200 
Settlement Agents Act 1981—Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007.....  3187 

 
——— 

 
PART 2 

 
Consumer and Employment Protection ....................................................................................  3211 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  3226 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  3212 
Health.........................................................................................................................................  3220 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................  3220 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  3221 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  3222 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  3222 
Premier and Cabinet..................................................................................................................  3223 
Public Notices.............................................................................................................................  3227 
Racing, Gaming and Liquor.......................................................................................................  3225 
Water/Sewerage .........................................................................................................................  3225 
WorkSafe ....................................................................................................................................  3226 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

WARNING—PRICE INCREASE 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2007 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$24.75 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$57.75 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$57.75 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.55 

  Bulk Notices—$211.00 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3181 

 

— PART 1 — 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE301* 

 

Finance Brokers Control Act 1975 

Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Finance Brokers Control (General) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendment in these regulations is to the Finance Brokers 
Control (General) Regulations 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 14 October 2005, p. 4585-613. 
  For amendments to 15 January 2007 see Gazette 

10 February, 5 May and 27 June 2006 and 5 January 2007.] 

3. Regulation 13 repealed 

  Regulation 13 is repealed. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 



3182 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

CE302* 

 

Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978 

Land Valuers Licensing (Remuneration) 
Notice 2007 

Made by the Land Valuers Licensing Board under section 25 of the Act 
with the approval of the Minister. 

1. Citation 

  This notice is the Land Valuers Licensing (Remuneration) 
Notice 2007. 

2. Terms used in this notice 

  In this notice, unless the contrary intention appears —  

 “appropriate maximum amount of remuneration” means the 
appropriate maximum amount of remuneration —  

 (a) chargeable in respect of the valuation of, or the 
assessment of rental in relation to, a property; and 

 (b) specified in the Schedule item 1 or 2, as the case 
requires; 

 “assessment” includes a reassessment; 

 “valuation” includes a revaluation. 

3. GST and disbursements 

 (1) In this clause —  

 “GST” has the same meaning as in the A New Tax System 
(Goods and Services Tax) Act 1999 of the Commonwealth. 

 (2) The amounts of remuneration specified in this notice —  

 (a) are inclusive of any GST that is applicable; and 

 (b) do not include disbursements. 

4. Maximum amounts of remuneration 

 (1) Except as otherwise provided in this clause, the amount 
specified opposite a service specified in the Schedule is fixed as 
the maximum amount of remuneration for that service. 

 (2) If the valuation by a licensed valuer of a property is as at a date 
3 years or more before the date on which the licensed valuer 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3183 

 

received instructions to perform the valuation, the maximum 
amount of remuneration fixed for that service is 1.25 times the 
maximum amount of remuneration specified opposite that 
service in the Schedule item 1. 

 (3) If, other than in the circumstances referred to in 
subclause (4) —  

 (a) a licensed valuer reasonably does not consider that the 
circumstances of a valuation or assessment are 
adequately or appropriately dealt with in this notice; and 

 (b) the client to be charged has given prior written approval 
to the remuneration being determined under this 
subclause, 

  the licensed valuer may charge a maximum amount of 
remuneration of $295 per hour or part of an hour for time spent 
on the valuation or assessment, in lieu of the amount specified 
in this notice. 

 (4) If, when acting pursuant to an agreement or appointment under 
the Commercial Tenancy (Retail Shops) Agreements Act 1985 
section 11(3) or as a determinator —  

 (a) a licensed valuer reasonably does not consider that the 
circumstances of a valuation or assessment are 
adequately or appropriately dealt with in the Schedule 
item 3(f) or (g); and 

 (b) the client to be charged has given prior written approval 
to the remuneration being determined under this 
subclause, 

  the licensed valuer may charge a maximum amount of 
remuneration of $335 per hour or part of an hour for time spent 
on the valuation or assessment, in lieu of the amount specified 
in the Schedule. 

 (5) If —  

 (a) a licensed valuer —  

 (i) has at least 10 years demonstrable experience as 
a licensed land valuer; or 

 (ii) has been admitted as an Associate, Fellow or 
Life Fellow member of the Australian Property 
Institute as a Certified Practising Valuer (or its 
equivalent status) for at least 10 years; 

  and 

 (b) the client to be charged has given prior written approval 
to the increase, 

  the maximum hourly rates specified in the Schedule items 3, 4, 
5 and 7 and under subclauses (3) and (4) that the licensed valuer 
may charge are increased by a factor of 1.35. 



3184 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

5. Scope of maximum amounts of remuneration 

 (1) The maximum amount of remuneration specified in the 
Schedule item 1 is, subject to this notice, chargeable in respect 
of each separate property concerned. 

 (2) For the purposes of charging remuneration, 2 or more lots in an 
existing or proposed subdivision are to be taken to be one 
separate property if a plan of subdivision is furnished or 
available. 

 (3) In subclause (2) —  

 “lot” includes any residue remaining after subdivision of the 
land concerned. 

6. Joint valuations 

  If 2 or more licensed valuers are jointly instructed to value, or 
assess the rental of, a property and duly carry out that 
instruction, each of those licensed valuers may charge the 
appropriate maximum amount of remuneration is respect of that 
valuation or assessment. 

7. Maximum amount of remuneration for ascertainment of 
partial interests 

  A licensed valuer who is instructed —  

 (a) to value a partial interest in; or 

 (b) to assess a partial interest in the rental of, 

  a property, and duly carries out that instruction, may charge the 
appropriate maximum amount of remuneration in respect of the 
full valuation or of the full amount of the assessed rental of the 
property, as the case requires. 

8. Repeal 

  The Land Valuers Licensing (Remuneration) Notice 2003 
published in the Gazette of 12 December 2003 at pages 
5034-5036 is repealed. 

Schedule 1 — Maximum amounts of remuneration 
[cl. 2, 4] 

Item Service Maximum amount of 
remuneration 

(inclusive of GST) 

1. The valuation by a licensed valuer 
of a property where the amount of 
the valuation —  

 

 (a) does not exceed $110 000; $900 

 (b) exceeds $110 000 but does 
not exceed $250 000; 

$900 and $4.12 for every 
$1 000 and every fractional 
part of $1 000 by which the 
amount exceeds $110 000 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3185 

 

Item Service Maximum amount of 
remuneration 

(inclusive of GST) 

 (c) exceeds $250 000 but does 
not exceed $2 000 000; 

$1 476 and $2.88 for every 
$1 000 and every fractional 
part of $1 000 by which the 
amount exceeds $250 000 

 (d) exceeds $2 000 000. $6 516 and $2.47 for every 
$1 000 and every fractional 
part of $1 000 by which the 
amount exceeds $2 000 000 

2. The assessment of annual rental 
by a licensed valuer in relation to 
property where the amount of 
annual rental assessed —  

 

 (a) does not exceed $15 000; $1 235 

 (b) exceeds $15 000 but does 
not exceed $25 000; 

$1 235 and $4.12 for every 
$100 and every fractional 
part of $100 by which the 
amount exceeds $15 000 

 (c) exceeds $25 000 but does 
not exceed $50 000; 

$1 647 and $2.88 for every 
$100 and every fractional 
part of $100 by which the 
amount exceeds $25 000 

 (d) exceeds $50 000 but does 
not exceed $100 000; 

$2 367 and $2.47 for every 
$100 and every fractional 
part of $100 by which the 
amount exceeds $50 000 

 (e) exceeds $100 000. $3 602 and $1.24 for every 
$100 and every fractional 
part of $100 by which the 
amount exceeds $100 000 

3. A licensed valuer acting —   

 (a) as an adjudicator between 2 
or more parties to a dispute 
concerning a valuation or an 
assessment of rental; 

$335 per hour or part of an 
hour 

 (b) as an arbitrator or umpire 
under the Commercial 
Arbitration Act 1985; 

$335 per hour or part of an 
hour 

 (c) as a referee under a reference 
under the Supreme Court 
Act 1935 section 50, or 
under the District Court of 
Western Australia Act 1969, 
as read with that section; 

$335 per hour or part of an 
hour 

 (d) as an expert under the 
Magistrates Court (Civil 
Proceedings) Act 2004 
section 24; 

$335 per hour or part of an 
hour 



3186 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

Item Service Maximum amount of 
remuneration 

(inclusive of GST) 

 (e) as a special referee under the 
State Administrative 
Tribunal Act 2004 
section 65; 

$335 per hour or part of an 
hour 

 (f) pursuant to an agreement or 
appointment under the 
Commercial Tenancy (Retail 
Shops) Agreements Act 1985 
section 11(3); 

the appropriate maximum 
amount of remuneration 
specified in item 1 or 2 
multiplied by 1.25 

 (g) as a determinator. the appropriate maximum 
amount of remuneration 
specified in item 1 or 2 
multiplied by 1.25 

4. A licensed valuer —   

 (a) attending as an expert 
witness before any court, 
tribunal, Royal Commission, 
judge or other body or 
person acting judicially; 

$295 per hour or part of an 
hour 

 (b) attending as an expert 
witness on counsel in 
preparation of a case; 

$295 per hour or part of an 
hour 

 (c) assisting the State 
Administrative Tribunal 
pursuant to an appointment 
under the State 
Administrative Tribunal 
Act 2004 section 64. 

$295 per hour or part of an 
hour 

5. Time spent by a licensed valuer, 
at the specific request of counsel, 
on standby for attendance before 
any court, tribunal, Royal 
Commission, judge or other 
person or body acting judicially, 
where being on standby has the 
effect of preventing the licensed 
valuer from attending to any other 
work. 

$220 per hour or part of an 
hour 

6. Time spent by a licensed valuer 
travelling from and to his or her 
headquarters in the practice of his 
or her profession. 

$150 per hour or part of an 
hour and $1.30 per kilometre 
or part of a kilometre where 
the travelling involves the 
use of the licensed valuer’s 
motor vehicle 

7. Time —  

(a) spent by a licensed valuer 
away from his or her 
headquarters or in a 
conference or consultation or 
otherwise in the practice of 
his or her profession; and 

$295 per hour or part of an 
hour 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3187 

 

Item Service Maximum amount of 
remuneration 

(inclusive of GST) 

(b) for which no other maximum 
amount of remuneration is 
fixed under this notice. 

Signed on behalf of the  
Land Valuers Licensing Board 
 

BRYAN GARDINER, Chairman of the Land 
Valuers Licensing Board. 

Approved by the Minister 
SHEILA McHALE. 

 

——————————— 
 

CE303* 

Settlement Agents Act 1981 

Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Settlement Agents Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Settlement 
Agents Regulations 1982*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 18 March 2005. 
  For amendments to 25 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 6 February 2007.] 



3188 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

4. Regulation 6 amended 

 (1) Regulation 6(1) is repealed and the following subregulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (1) The prescribed examinations for the purposes of 

Schedule 1 clause 1(1)(a) are the examinations which 
are required by a public training provider or a 
registered training provider to be passed to complete —  

 (a) a Diploma of Financial Services 
(Conveyancing); and 

 (b) the following units —  

 (i) FNSCONV601A: Obtain and analyse 
information; 

 (ii) FNSCONV603A: Negotiate to achieve 
goals and manage disputes. 

    ”. 

 (2) After regulation 6(2) the following subregulation is inserted —  

“     
 (2a) Despite subregulations (1) and (2), until 

30 June 2009 —  

 (a) a person who has passed the examinations 
prescribed under subregulation (1) as in force 
immediately before the coming into operation 
of the Settlement Agents Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2007 is, subject to the Act, 
qualified for the grant of a real estate settlement 
agent’s licence; and 

 (b) a person who has passed the examinations 
prescribed under subregulation (1) as in force 
immediately before the coming into operation 
of the Settlement Agents Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2007 and the examinations 
referred to in subregulation (2)(b) is, subject to 
the Act, qualified for the grant of a business 
settlement agent’s licence. 

    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor  
and deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3189 

 

CE304* 

 

Builders’ Registration Act 1939 

Builders’ Registration Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Builders’ Registration Board of Western Australia and 
approved by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Builders’ Registration Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 – on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations —  

 (i) on 2 July 2007; or 

 (ii) if these regulations are published in the Gazette 
on a later day, on that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Builders’ 
Registration Regulations*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 7 June 2002. 
  For amendments to 11 April 2007 see Gazette 2 September 

2003.] 

4. Regulation 18 amended 

  Regulation 18 is amended by deleting “$12 000” in each place 
where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    $20 000    ”. 



3190 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

 
The common seal of the 
Builders’ Registration Board 
of Western Australia was 
affixed in the presence of —  

) 
) 
) 
) 

MARK CUOMO. 

NIGEL LILLEY. 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor  
and deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

CE305* 

 

Home Building Contracts Act 1991 

Home Building Contracts Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Home Building Contracts Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations —  

 (i) on 2 July 2007; or 

 (ii) if these regulations are published in the Gazette 
on a later day, on that day. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3191 

 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Home Building 
Contracts Regulations 1992*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 7 June 2002. 
  For amendments to 9 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Regulation 2A inserted 

  After regulation 2 the following regulation is inserted —  

“     
2A. Prescribed amounts for the purposes of “home 

building work contract” (section 3(1)) 

  For the purposes of the definition of “home building 
work contract” in section 3(1) of the Act —  

 (a) the prescribed amount for paragraph (b)(ii) of 
the definition is $7 500; and 

 (b) the prescribed amount for paragraph (b)(iii) of 
the definition is $500 000. 

    ”. 

5. Regulation 7 amended 

  Regulation 7 is amended by deleting “$12 000” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $20 000    ”. 

6. Regulation 7A inserted 

  After regulation 7 the following regulation is inserted —  

“     
7A. Prescribed limit (section 25D(1)(a)(i)) 

  For the purposes of section 25D(1)(a)(i) of the Act, the 
limit is prescribed to be $20 000. 

    ”. 

7. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in the paragraph beginning with “The Act deals with 
contracts” by deleting “$6 000” and inserting instead —  

  “    $7 500    ”; 

 (b) in the paragraph beginning with “The Act deals with 
contracts” by deleting “$200 000” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $500 000    ”; 

 (c) in the paragraph beginning with “It is compulsory” by 
deleting “$12 000” and inserting instead — 

  “    $20 000    ”; 



3192 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

 (d) in the paragraph beginning with “Home indemnity 
insurance is also compulsory” by deleting “$12 000” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    $20 000    ”; 

 (e) in the paragraph beginning with “Home indemnity 
insurance will protect you” by deleting “$13 000” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $20 000    ”. 

 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor  
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

ENERGY 

EN301* 

Energy Operators (Powers) Act 1979 

Energy Operators (Regional Power 
Corporation) (Charges) Amendment 

By-laws 2007 

Made by the Regional Power Corporation with the approval of the 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These by-laws are the Energy Operators (Regional Power 
Corporation) (Charges) Amendment By-laws 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These by-laws come into operation as follows: 

 (a) by-laws 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the by-laws — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in these by-laws are to the Energy Operators 
(Regional Power Corporation) (Charges) By-laws 2006*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 31 March 2006, p. 1279-97.] 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3193 

 

4. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 by deleting “$27.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $29.80    ”; 

 (b) in item 10 by deleting “$3.80” and inserting instead —  

  “    $4.10    ”; 

 (c) by inserting after item 10 the following item —  

“     
11. Rejected account payment....…………………... $20.00 

    ”. 
 
The Common Seal of the ) 
Regional Power Corporation was )  [LS] 
affixed to these by-laws ) 
in the presence of —   ) 
 
B. HAMMOND 
Director 

P. FELDHUSEN 
Executive officer 

 

Approved by the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

EN302* 

Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems (Access) Act 1994 

Electricity Distribution Access Repeal 
Order 2007 

Made by the Minister. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Electricity Distribution Access Repeal 
Order 2007. 



3194 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

2. Commencement 

  This order comes into operation on 1 July 2007. 

3. Repeal 

  The Electricity Distribution Access Order 2006 is repealed. 

FRANCIS LOGAN, Minister for Energy. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

EN303* 

Electricity Corporations Act 2005 

Electricity Corporations (Prescribed 
Customers) Order 2007 

Made by the Minister under section 54(4) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Electricity Corporations (Prescribed 
Customers) Order 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  This order comes into operation on 1 July 2007. 

3. Declaration of class of customers — s. 54(2) 

 (1) Customers of the class described in subclause (2) are declared to 
be prescribed customers for the purposes of section 54(2) of the 
Act. 

 (2) The class consists of each customer who consumes, or could 
reasonably be expected to consume, not more than 50 MWh of 
electricity per annum at each exit point through which 
electricity is supplied to that customer. 

 (3) In subclause (2) —  

 “exit point” has the meaning given in the Electricity Networks 
Access Code 2004 section 1.3. 

FRANCIS LOGAN, Minister for Energy. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3195 

 

HEALTH 

HE301* 

 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Hospitals (Services Charges) 
Amendment Regulations 2007. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Hospitals 
(Services Charges) Regulations 1984*. 

 [* Reprint 5 as at 11 August 2006. 
  For amendments to 13 April 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 23 January 2007.] 

3. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 Division 1 item 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$37.30” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    $38.20    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (d) by deleting “$128.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $129.80    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 



3196 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

POLICE 

PO301* 

Firearms Act 1973 

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Firearms Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Firearms 
Regulations 1974*. 

 [* Reprint 5 as at 15 April 2005. 
  For amendments to 23 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 12 January 2007.] 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

 (1) The Table to regulation 4(1a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “160” and inserting instead —  

  “    167    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “34” and inserting instead —  

  “    35    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “183” and inserting instead —  

  “    191    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “33” and inserting instead —  

  “    35    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “332” and inserting instead —  

  “    345    ”; 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3197 

 

 (f) by deleting “87” and inserting instead —  

  “    90    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 4(1aa)(a) and (b) are amended by deleting “$26” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $27    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 4(1b)(a) is amended by deleting “$26” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $27    ”. 

 (4) The Table to regulation 4(1c) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “332” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    345    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “80” and inserting instead —  

  “    83    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “61” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    64    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “214” and inserting instead —  

  “    220    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “65” and inserting instead —  

  “    67    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “203” and inserting instead —  

  “    208    ”; 

 (g) by deleting “60” and inserting instead —  

  “    62    ”. 

5. Regulation 5 amended 

  Regulation 5(1)(b) is amended by deleting “$45” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $47    ”. 

6. Regulation 7 amended 

  Regulation 7(5a) is amended by deleting “$16” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $17    ”. 

7. Regulation 8 amended 

 (1) Regulation 8(2) is amended by deleting “$26” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $27    ”. 



3198 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

 (2) Regulation 8(2a) is amended by deleting “$16” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $17    ”. 

8. Regulation 11 amended 

  Regulation 11(1) is amended by deleting “$119” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $122    ”. 

9. Regulation 27 amended 

  Regulation 27(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$376” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $390    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

PO302* 

Police Act 1892 

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Police (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3199 

 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Police (Fees) 
Regulations 1981*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 21 April 2006. 
  For amendments to 23 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Schedule amended 

  The Schedule is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting item 1 and inserting instead —  

“     
1. Copy of a person’s traffic records —  

(a) road traffic conviction record ......................…….. 

(b) traffic infringement notice record .......................... 

 

$17.60 

$17.60 
    ”; 

 (b) by deleting item 1a; 

 (c) in item 2(a)(i) by deleting “$77.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $80.90    ”; 

 (d) in item 2(a)(ii) by deleting “$92.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $94.60    ”; 

 (e) in item 2(a)(iii) by deleting “$70.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $72.05    ”; 

 (f) in item 2(c) by deleting “$119.25” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $125.00    ”; 

 (g) in item 3(a) by deleting “$10.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $11.00    ”; 

 (h) in item 3(b) by deleting “$16.75” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $17.60    ”; 

 (i) by deleting item 4 and inserting instead —  
“     

4. National criminal history record check —  

(a) issued to a volunteer organisation ........................ 

(b) issued to a public sector body ………………….. 

(c) issued to a business ......................................…… 

 

$10.00 

$34.00 

$39.50 

4a. National police certificate …........................................... $44.50 
    ”; 

 (j) in item 5 by deleting “$75.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    $81.90    ”; 



3200 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

 (k) in item 6 by deleting “$16.75” and inserting instead —  

  “    $17.60    ”; 

 (l) in item 7(a) and (b) by deleting “$30.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $32.00    ”; 

 (m) in item 8 by deleting “$30.75” and inserting instead —  

  “    $32.00    ”; 

 (n) in item 9(a) and (b) by deleting “$75.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $81.90    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PO303* 

 

Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996 

Security and Related Activities (Control) 
Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Security and Related Activities 
(Control) Amendment Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3201 

 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Security and 
Related Activities (Control) Regulations 1997*. 

 [* Reprint 4 as at 1 December 2006.] 

4. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 is amended in column 3 as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “383” and inserting instead —  

  “    401    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “404” and inserting instead —  

  “    423    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “155” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    162    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “213” and inserting instead —  

  “    223    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “133” and inserting instead —  

  “    139    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “98” and inserting instead —  

  “    102    ”; 

 (g) by deleting “123” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    128    ”; 

 (h) by deleting “31” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    32    ”; 

 (i) by deleting “91” and inserting instead —  

  “    93    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



3202 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

PO304* 

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994 

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Pawnbrokers and Second-hand 
Dealers Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Pawnbrokers 
and Second-hand Dealers Regulations 1996*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 13 January 2006. 
  For amendments to 23 May 2007 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4 and Gazette 
30 April 2007.] 

4. Regulation 28 amended 

  The Table to regulation 28 is amended as follows:  

 (a) in item 1 —  

 (i) by deleting “418” and inserting instead —  

  “    438    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “703” and inserting instead —  

  “    736    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “987” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 034    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 —  

 (i) by deleting “381” and inserting instead —  

  “    395    ”; 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3203 

 

 (ii) by deleting “640” and inserting instead —  

  “    663    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “899” and inserting instead —  

  “    931    ”; 

 (c) in item 3 —  

 (i) by deleting “490” and inserting instead —  

  “    508    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “907” and inserting instead —  

  “    940    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “1 320” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 367    ”; 

 (d) in item 4 —  

 (i) by deleting “473” and inserting instead —  

  “    496    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “760” and inserting instead —  

  “    796    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “1 045” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 095    ”. 

5. Regulation 29 amended 

  The Table to regulation 29 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 —  

 (i) by deleting “308” and inserting instead —  

  “    322    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “597” and inserting instead —  

  “    625    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “887” and inserting instead —  

  “    929    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 —  

 (i) by deleting “282” and inserting instead —  

  “    292    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “545” and inserting instead —  

  “    565    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “808” and inserting instead —  

  “    837    ”; 

 (c) in item 3 —  

 (i) by deleting “452” and inserting instead —  

  “    468    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “866” and inserting instead —  

  “    897    ”; 



3204 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

 (iii) by deleting “1 279” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 325    ”; 

 (d) in item 4 —  

 (i) by deleting “329” and inserting instead —  

  “    344    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “641” and inserting instead —  

  “    671    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “931” and inserting instead —  

  “    975    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

WATER 

WA301* 

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947 

Mount Magnet Town Dam Catchment Area 
Abolition Order 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council under section 9(1)(d) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Mount Magnet Town Dam Catchment Area 
Abolition Order 2007. 

2. Mount Magnet Town Dam Catchment Area abolished 

  The Mount Magnet Town Dam Catchment Area* is abolished. 

 [* Constituted by Order in the Gazette of 19 April 1985, 
p. 1382.] 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3205 

 

WA302* 

 

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947 

Mount Magnet Water Reserve Order 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council under section 9(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Mount Magnet Water Reserve Order 2007. 

2. Mount Magnet Water Reserve boundary altered 

  The boundary of the Mount Magnet Water Reserve is altered so 

that the boundary is as shown bordered ���� on the Department 
of Water plan WRC 3159-01. 

3. Information plan of the Mount Magnet Water Reserve 

  The former boundary of the Mount Magnet Water Reserve, 
described as the “Old boundary of Mt Magnet Water Reserve”, 
and the boundary of the Mount Magnet Water Reserve as 
altered by this order, described as the “Boundary of Mt Magnet 
Water Reserve”, are shown for information purposes in the plan 
in Schedule 1. 



3206 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

Schedule 1 — Mount Magnet Water Reserve 
[cl. 3] 

 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3207 

 

WA303* 

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947 

Margaret River Catchment Area Order 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council under section 9(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Margaret River Catchment Area Order 2007. 

2. Margaret River Catchment Area boundary altered 

  The boundary of the Margaret River Catchment Area (including 
Ten Mile Brook Catchment Area) is altered so that the boundary 

is as shown bordered ——— on the Department of Water 
plan WRC 3266. 

3. Information plan of the Margaret River Catchment Area 

  The former boundary of the Margaret River Catchment Area 
(including Ten Mile Brook Catchment Area), described as the 
“Old boundary of Margaret River Catchment Area”, and the 
boundary of the Margaret River Catchment Area (including Ten 
Mile Brook Catchment Area) as altered by this order, described 
as the “Boundary of Margaret River Catchment Area”, are 
shown for information purposes in the plan in Schedule 1. 



3208 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

Schedule 1 — Margaret River Catchment Area 
[cl. 3] 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3209 

 

WA304* 

 

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947 

Carnarvon Water Reserve Order 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council under section 9(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Carnarvon Water Reserve Order 2007. 

2. Carnarvon Water Reserve boundary altered 

  The boundary of the Carnarvon Water Reserve is altered so that 

the boundary is as shown bordered ���� on the Department of 
Water plan WRC 3185-01. 

3. Information plan of the Carnarvon Water Reserve 

  The former boundary of the Carnarvon Water Reserve, 
described as the “Old Water Reserve”, and the boundary of the 
Carnarvon Water Reserve as altered by this order, described as 
the “Carnarvon Water Reserve”, are shown for information 
purposes in the plan in Schedule 1. 



3210 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

Schedule 1 — Carnarvon Water Reserve 
[cl. 3] 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 
 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3211 

 

— PART 2 — 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401* 
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 

REINSTATEMENT OF ASSOCIATION 
The Retirement Village Association of Western Australia Incorporated—A0824576F 

Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named association has been re-instated 
pursuant to section 35(4) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987. 
Dated the 22nd day of June 2007. 

ANNE DRISCOLL, Director of Business Services, 
for Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 

 
 

——————————— 
 

 

CE402* 
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 

REINSTATEMENT OF ASSOCIATIONS 
The G.P. Fourteen Class Association of Australia (W.A. Branch)—A0790223F 

Eyre Highway Operators Association Inc.—A1000306A 
Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named associations has been re-instated 
pursuant to section 35(4) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987. 
Dated the 20th of June 2007. 

ANNE DRISCOLL, Director of Business Services, 
for Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 

 

 

——————————— 
 
 

CE403 
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 

TRANSFER OF ACTIVITIES 
Royal Flying Doctor Service of Australia (Western Australian Section) Incorporated 

Royal Flying Doctor Service of Australia (Eastern Goldfields W.A. Section) Incorporated 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 34(2) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987, I hereby order 
that the undertakings of the Royal Flying Doctor Service of Australia (Western Australian Section) 
Incorporated and the Royal Flying Doctor Service of Australia (Eastern Goldfields W.A. Section) 
Incorporated be transferred to RFDS Western Operations. 

In accordance with section 34(3) of the Act, the Royal Flying Doctor Service of Australia (Western 
Australian Section) Incorporated and the Royal Flying Doctor Service of Australia (Eastern Goldfields 
W.A. Section) Incorporated will be dissolved on the publication of the Order, and the property, rights 
and liabilities of the associations officially become those of RFDS Western Operations. 

This Order takes effect from the date of publication of this order. 

Dated the 26th day of June 2007. 

PATRICK WALKER, Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 



3212 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

CE404 
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 

TRANSFER OF ACTIVITIES 
The Sign Association of Australia (Western Australia Branch) (Inc.) 

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 34(2) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987, I hereby order 
that the undertaking of the Sign Association of Australia (Western Australia Branch) (Inc.) be 
transferred to Australian Sign & Graphics Association Incorporated. 
In accordance with section 34(3) of the Act, the Sign Association of Australia (Western Australia 
Branch) (Inc.) will be dissolved on the publication of the Order, and the property, rights and liabilities 
of the association officially become those of the Australian Sign & Graphics Association Incorporated. 
This Order takes effect from the date of publication of this order. 
Dated the 21st day of June 2007. 

PATRICK WALKER, Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 

ENERGY 
EN401* 

ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 
NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23 (1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS 

Notice is given that the following Distribution Licence has been granted— 
Licensee: Central Norseman Gold Corporation 
Issue Date: 19 June 2007 
Address of Licensee: Level 1 
 33 Ord Street 
 West Perth WA 6005 
Classification: Distribution (EDL 6) 
Term of Licence: Up to and including 31 December 2009 
Area Covered: Licence area is the area within the Norseman area of Western Australia 

as set out in Plan No. ERA-EL-111. 
Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
 6th Floor 
 197 St Georges Terrace 
 Perth WA 6000 
 http:// www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

 
——————————— 

 
EN402* 

ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 
NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23 (1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS. 

Notice is given that the following Generation Licence has been granted— 
Licensee: Griffin Power 2 Pty Ltd 
Issue Date: 20 June 2007 
Address of Licensee: 15th Floor 
 28 The Esplanade 
 Perth WA 6000 
Classification: Generating Works (EGL 17) 
Term of Licence: Up to and including 19 June 2037 
Area Covered: Bluewaters 2 Power Station, Coolangatta Industrial Estate, Collie WA. 

Lot 8 on Plan 20710 being part of the land comprised in Certificate of Title 
of Volume 2206 Folio 576. (Plan No. ERA-EL-090) 

Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
 6th Floor 
 197 St Georges Terrace 
 Perth WA 6000 
 http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3213 

 

EN403* 
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23 (1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS. 
Notice is given that the following Generation Licence has been amended— 

Licensee: Griffin Power Pty Ltd 
Issue Date: 20 June 2007 
Address of Licensee: 15th Floor 
 28 The Esplanade 
 Perth WA 6000 
Classification: Generating Works (EGL 4) 
Term of Licence: Up to and including 8 March 2036 
Amendment: Licence area map adjusted to accommodate the Bluewaters 2 Power 

Station 
Area Covered: Bluewaters Power Station, Coolangatta Industrial Estate, Collie WA. Lot 

8 on Plan 20710 being part of the land comprised in Certificate of Title of 
Volume 2206 Folio 576. (Plan No. ERA-EL-069) 

Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
 6th Floor 
 197 St Georges Terrace 
 Perth WA 6000 
 http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

 

——————————— 
 

EN404* 
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 

ELECTRICITY NETWORKS ACCESS CODE AMENDMENTS (NO 1) 2007 
I, Francis Logan, Minister for Energy for the State of Western Australia, hereby amend the Electricity 
Networks Access Code 2004 established under section 104(1) of the Electricity Industry Act 2004. 
Dated at Perth this 26th day of June 2007. 

FRANCIS LOGAN. 

———— 
Made by the Minister 

1. Citation 
These amendments may be cited as the Electricity Networks Access Code Amendments (No 1) 2007. 

2. Commencement  
These amendments come into operation on the date on which they are published in the Gazette. 

3. The Electricity Networks Access Code amended 
These amendments are to the Electricity Networks Access Code 2004*. 
[*Published in Gazette 30 November 2004, p. 5517-5700  
For amendments to 29 June 2007 see Gazettes— 

No 207 of 8 November 2005; 
No 59 of 31 March 2006; 
No 152 of 1 September 2006; and  
No 206 of 8 December 2006.] 

4. Section 1.3 amended 
Section 1.3 is amended— 
 (a) by deleting the definitions of “access application” and “applicant”; and  
 (b) by inserting the following definitions in the appropriate places— 

“ 
“access application” means— 

 (a) an application lodged with a service provider under an access arrangement to establish 
or modify an access contract; and  

 (b) a prior application and a transitioned application, 
and includes any additional information provided by the applicant in relation to the 
application. 



3214 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

“Appendix 8 augmentation” means an augmentation to the SWIN of a type specified in 
clause A8.2 of Appendix 8. 
“applicant” means— 

 (a) a person (who may be a user) who has lodged an access application under the access 
arrangement for a covered network to establish or modify an access contract, and 
includes a prospective applicant; and 

 (b) a prior applicant. 
“previous regime” means the previous regulations and sections 90 and 91 and Schedules 5 
and 6 of the Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems (Access) Act 1994 as in effect 
immediately before 1 July 2007. 
“previous regulations” means the Electricity Transmission Regulations 1996, the 
Electricity Distribution Regulations 1997 and the Electricity Referee and Dispute Resolution 
Regulations 1997, as in effect immediately before 1 July 2007. 
“prior applicant” has the meaning given to it in clause A9.1. 
“prior application” has the meaning given to it in clause A9.1. 
“referee” has the meaning given to it in the Electricity Referee and Dispute Resolution 
Regulations 1997, as in effect immediately before 1 July 2007. 
“SWIN” means the covered network that is covered under section 3.1. 
“SWIN access arrangement” means the access arrangement approved for the SWIN by the 
Authority’s Further Final Decision dated 26 April 2007.  
“transitioned application” has the meaning given to it in clause A9.1. 

”; 
and 

 (c) in the definition of “access dispute” by inserting after paragraph (c) the following— 
  “ 
 (ca) anything connected with or arising out of a capital contribution under section 

5.17A; and 
 (cb) a matter heard under section 15.7; and 
 (cc) anything connected with or arising out of Appendix 8; and 
 (cd) anything connected with or arising out of Appendix 9; and 

”. 
5. Section 2.9 amended 
Section 2.9 is deleted and the following is inserted— 
“ 
 2.9 If a service provider will need to undertake a required augmentation in order to provide a 

covered service sought in an access application then— 
 (a) if the service provider is Electricity Networks Corporation and requires a capital 

contribution under section 5.17A in respect of an Appendix 8 augmentation, then— 
 (i) if the applicant provides the capital contribution for the required augmentation, 

or the applicant and the service provider reach agreement on the terms on which 
the applicant will provide the capital contribution—the service provider must 
undertake and fund the required augmentation; and 

 (ii) otherwise—the service provider is not required to undertake or fund the required 
augmentation;  

and 
 (b) if section 2.9(a) does not apply, then— 
 (i) if all of the forecast new facilities investment for the required augmentation 

meets the new facilities investment test—the service provider must undertake 
and fund the required augmentation; and 

 (ii) if only part or none of the forecast new facilities investment for the required 
augmentation meets the new facilities investment test—then— 

 (A) if the applicant provides the capital contribution for the required 
augmentation determined under the capital contributions policy, or the 
applicant and the service provider reach agreement on the terms on which 
the applicant will provide the capital contribution—the service provider 
must undertake and fund the required augmentation; and 

 (B) otherwise—the service provider is not required to undertake or fund the 
required augmentation. 

”. 
6. Section 2.9A deleted 
Section 2.9A is deleted. 
7. Section 5.14 amended 
Section 5.14 is amended by deleting “5.14A” and inserting instead— 

““   5.17A   ”. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3215 

 

8. Section 5.14A deleted  
Section 5.14A is deleted. 
9. Sections 5.17A and 5.17B inserted  
After section 5.17, the following heading and sections are inserted— 
“ 

Capital contributions for certain SWIN augmentations 
 5.17A Despite section 5.14, Electricity Networks Corporation may require a capital 

contribution for an Appendix 8 augmentation of up to the maximum amount 
determined under Appendix 8 for the relevant type of Appendix 8 augmentation. 

 5.17B  From 1 July 2007 until the first revisions commencement date for the SWIN access 
arrangement, section 5.17A prevails over any inconsistent provision of the SWIN access 
arrangement. 

”. 
10. Section 14.28 inserted 
After section 14.27, the following heading and section are inserted— 
“  

Detailed provisions regarding capital contributions for certain SWIN augmentations 
14.28 Appendix 8 has effect. 

”. 
11. Sections 15.5 to 15.8 inserted 
After section 15.4, the following headings and sections are inserted— 
“ 

Preservation of SWIN actions  
 15.5 If an action could have been commenced before the referee under the previous regime 

immediately before 1 July 2007 seeking a remedy in respect of a thing done or not done 
before 1 July 2007 in connection with or arising out of a prior application, an action 
may be commenced before the arbitrator seeking the remedy in respect of the thing. 

 15.6 Section 15.5 does not extend any period of limitation or waive any other requirement 
under the previous regime for commencing an action. 

 15.7 If a person commences an action before the arbitrator seeking a remedy under section 
15.5, the arbitrator— 

 (a) may hear the matter under Chapter 10; and 
 (b) may make any determination in respect of the matter which is consistent with— 
 (i) the Code objective; and 
 (ii) the Act and this Code generally. 

Transitional arrangements for the SWIN queue 
 15.8 Appendix 9 has effect. 

”. 
12. Appendix 4 amended 
Appendix 4 is amended by deleting “5.14A” in both places where it appears in the introductory 
paragraphs of the Appendix, and inserting instead— 

““   5.17A   ”. 
13. Appendices 8 and 9 inserted 
After Appendix 7, the following Appendix 8 and Appendix 9 are inserted— 

“ 
Appendix 8—Detailed provisions regarding capital 

contributions for certain SWIN augmentations 
Definitions 

 A8.1 In this Appendix 8, unless the contrary intention is apparent— 
  “average cost” for a scheme means the total scheme cost divided by the total number 

of connection points covered by the scheme. 
  “commercial premises” means premises on which electricity is consumed 

predominantly for commercial use. 

  “member” in respect of a scheme means a person who has initiated or joined a scheme 
under the SES. 

  “pillar” means a ground mounted apparatus forming part of the SWIN located on or 
near a property boundary and to which the consumer mains of a premises are connected 
in order to obtain electricity. 

  “pole to pillar connection” means the provision to a residential premises of an 
underground 415 V or 240 V supply via a pillar connection.  

  “premises” has the meaning given to it in the Electricity Act 1945 (WA). 



3216 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

  “primary production premises” means premises owned or occupied by a consumer 
who is assessed as carrying on a primary production business under the Income Tax 
Assessment Act 1997. 

  “residential premises” means premises on which electricity is consumed 
predominantly for domestic use. 

  “scheme” means an arrangement with respect to a particular SES augmentation or a 
particular interconnected series of SES augmentations under the SES.  

  “SES” and “Supply Extension Scheme” means the approach to SWIN augmentation 
under clauses A8.8 to A8.15. 

  “SES augmentation” means a required augmentation which is an extension of the 
SWIN to connect— 

 (a) a primary production premises; or 

 (b)  one residential premises on a lot (excluding a residential premises in respect of 
which a pole to pillar connection is required under a written law or statutory 
instrument).  

  “standard dwelling” means a residential premises that is located on a lot that is 
zoned residential, or otherwise permitted to be used for residential purposes under any 
town planning scheme applying to that lot (excluding lots zoned special rural 
residential); and has 

 (a)  a load of no more than 63 amperes single-phase 240 volt or 32 amperes three-
phased 415 volt; and 

 (b)  sufficient SWIN capacity available to it, to supply the applicable load. 

  “subdivision” means a subdivision of land which requires or has received approval 
under section 135 of the Planning and Development Act 2005 (WA), the Strata Titles 
Act 1985 (WA) or an equivalent written law. 

  “substantial consumer” means an applicant who the service provider forecasts to 
consume in excess of 10% of the total annual electricity consumption in respect of a 
premises. 

  “temporary connection” means a non-permanent connection to the SWIN that is 
undertaken to provide supply to activities such as, but not limited to, outdoor functions 
(such as fairs and concerts), non-standard builder supplies (such as city or commercial 
developments) and connections to premises during renovations. 

  “total cost” for a scheme means the sum of the forecast new facilities investment for 
the SES augmentation for which the scheme was initiated plus the forecast new 
facilities investment for each SES augmentation for an applicant which subsequently 
joins the scheme. 

  “unmetered connection” means a type of connection point described in clause 3.9(2) 
of the Electricity Metering Code 2005 established under section 39(2)(a) of the Act. 

Scope of Appendix 8 augmentations to SWIN 
 A8.2 This Appendix 8 applies only in respect of the following augmentations to the SWIN 

(“Appendix 8 augmentations”)— 
 (a) a subdivision under clause A8.4; and 
 (b) a pole to pillar connection under clauses A8.5 to A8.6; and 
 (c) the development of buildings under clause A8.7; and 
 (d) a Supply Extension Scheme under clauses A8.8 to A8.15; and 
 (e) augmentations in excess of standard requirements under clause A8.16; and 
 (f) specified temporary connections under clause A8.17 and A8.18; and 
 (g) streetlights, unmetered connections, relocations, undergrounding and some 

temporary connections under clause A8.19. 
General principles 

 A8.3 A capital contribution for an Appendix 8 augmentation (other than a flat fee under 
clauses A8.5 and A8.17) must not exceed the forecast new facilities investment that 
would be forecast to be incurred for the augmentation by a service provider efficiently 
minimising costs. 

Subdivisions 
 A8.4 The maximum capital contribution for an applicant who— 
 (a) undertakes a subdivision; and  
 (b) seeks an augmentation (other by a pole to pillar connection) of the distribution 

system to service the subdivision, 
is the forecast new facilities investment for any required augmentation which is or will be 
located within the boundaries of, or adjacent to, the land being subdivided. 

Pole to pillar connections 
 A8.5 The maximum capital contribution for a pole to pillar connection is a flat fee 

determined under clause A8.6. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3217 

 

 A8.6 Electricity Networks Corporation may from time to time set a flat fee for pole to pillar 
connections, which fee must be calculated to the standard of a reasonable and prudent 
person and in such a way that, over a reasonable forecasting period, the forecast 
revenue from applying the flat fee to all pole to pillar connections installed during the 
period (“forecast connections”) is forecast not to exceed— 

 (a) the sum of forecast new facilities investment which would be incurred for the 
forecast connections by a service provider efficiently minimising costs;  

  minus 
 (b) the anticipated incremental revenue for the forecast connections. 

Development of buildings 
 A8.7 Where an applicant seeks a connection to the SWIN in respect of— 
 (a) multiple residential premises, including multi-storey buildings, excluding— 
 (i) residential premises in respect of which a pole to pillar connection is 

required under a written law or statutory instrument; and  
 (ii) connections which are SES augmentations;  
  or 
 (b) commercial premises in relation to which the applicant will not become a 

substantial consumer; or 
 (c) mixed residential premises and commercial premises in relation to which the 

applicant will not become a substantial consumer, 
  the maximum capital contribution by the applicant is the forecast new facilities 

investment for the required augmentation. 
The Supply Extension Scheme 

  Initiating or joining an SES 
 A8.8 An applicant, or group of applicants, for whom the required augmentation is an SES 

augmentation, may apply to Electricity Networks Corporation to either join an existing 
scheme or initiate a new scheme.  

 A8.9 If the SES augmentation sought by the applicants in clause A8.8 is to be connected to 
network assets which are covered by an existing scheme, then a new scheme must be 
initiated if— 

 (a) the forecast new facilities investment for the SES augmentation exceeds the 
average cost for the existing scheme; or 

 (b) the existing scheme commenced more than 10 years ago. 
  Contribution for applicant initiating a scheme 
 A8.10 If a single applicant initiates a scheme, the maximum capital contribution for the 

applicant is the forecast new facilities investment for the SES augmentation. 
 A8.11 If a group of applicants initiate a scheme, the maximum capital contribution for each 

applicant within the group is the average cost for the scheme. 
  Contribution for applicant joining an existing scheme 
 A8.12 If an applicant joins an existing scheme, the maximum capital contribution for the 

applicant is the new average cost for the scheme, calculated by adding the forecast new 
facilities investment for the required augmentation for the applicant to the previous 
total cost and calculating a new average cost taking into account the new applicant’s 
connection point. 

 A8.13 In this circumstance the capital contribution to be made by the new applicant will 
comprise a component in payment of the forecast new facilities investment for the new 
connection, and a rebate component in accordance with clause A8.14 and A8.15.  

  Rebate to continuing scheme members 
 A8.14 If an applicant joining a scheme causes a decrease in the average cost for the scheme, 

Electricity Networks Corporation must, after it receives the applicant’s capital 
contribution to join the scheme and the connection is completed, make a payment to the 
existing scheme members (excluding the applicant) of an amount equal to the difference 
between the average cost immediately before the applicant joined the scheme and the 
new average cost applying after the applicant joined. 

  Rebates will not be paid after 10 years 
 A8.15 To avoid doubt, the effect of clause A8.9(b) is that a rebate will only be paid under 

clause A8.14 within the first 10 years after a scheme commences.   
Augmentations in excess of standard requirements 

 A8.16 If  
 (a) an applicant seeks to have network assets constructed (“requested assets”) 

which Electricity Networks Corporation, in accordance with good electricity 
industry practice, considers are in addition to what is required to meet standard 
supply arrangements; and 

 (b) the forecast new facilities investment for the requested assets (“requested 
investment”) exceeds the forecast new facilities investment which would be 
required if the connection was constructed in accordance with standard supply 
arrangements (“standard investment”), 



3218 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

  then— 
 (c) the maximum capital contribution in respect of the standard investment is to be 

determined under the provisions of this Code and the access arrangement which 
apply to the type of connection in question; and 

 (d) in addition, the maximum capital contribution may include the difference 
between the requested investment and the standard investment.  

Temporary connections 
 A8.17 If a flat fee is determined under clause A8.18 for a class of temporary connection, then 

the maximum capital contribution for the class of temporary connection is the flat fee. 
 A8.18 Electricity Networks Corporation may from time to time set a flat fee for temporary 

connections, which fee must be calculated to the standard of a reasonable and prudent 
person and in such a way that, over a reasonable forecasting period, the forecast 
revenue from applying the flat fee to all temporary connections installed during the 
period (“forecast connections”) is forecast not to exceed the sum of forecast new 
facilities investments which would be incurred for the forecast connections by a service 
provider efficiently minimising costs. 

Streetlights, unmetered connections, relocations, undergrounding and some 
temporary connections 

 A8.19 The maximum capital contribution for an applicant who seeks— 
 (a) a modified or new streetlight, including provision of a new streetlight asset; 
 (b) an unmetered connection; 
 (c) to have an existing network asset relocated; 
 (d) to have an existing overhead network asset or connection undergrounded; 
 (e) a temporary connection if Electricity Networks Corporation has not set a fee for 

that class of temporary connection under clauseA8.18, 
  is the forecast new facilities investment for the required augmentation. 

Appendix 9—Transitional provisions for the SWIN queue 
Definitions 

 A9.1 In this Appendix 9— 
  “application and queuing policy” means the application and queuing policy in the 

SWIN access arrangement. 
  “connection application” means an access application classified as such under the 

application and queuing policy. 
  “electricity transfer application” means an access application classified as such 

under the application and queuing policy. 
  “material amendment” means, subject to clause A9.10, an amendment to an access 

application which is either or both of— 
 (a) a “material amendment” as that expression is used in the application and 

queuing policy; or  
 (b) an amendment which would result in the amended transitioned application being 

“materially different” from the prior application as that expression is used in 
clause 24.12(b) of the application and queuing policy. 

  “prior applicant” means the person who lodged a prior application and is deemed to 
have lodged the corresponding transitioned application. 

  “prior application” means an “access application” (as defined in the previous 
regulations) and includes any additional information provided under the previous 
regime before 1 July 2007 by the prior applicant in relation to that access application. 

  “transitioned application” means a prior application having effect as an access 
application under clause A9.3 and, if applicable, includes each of the deemed connection 
application and electricity transfer application under clause A9.5. 

Application of this Appendix  
 A9.2 This Appendix 9 applies only in respect of the SWIN, and applies despite the changes 

made to the previous regulations on 1 July 2007 and the repeal of sections 90 and 91 
and Schedules 5 and 6 of the Electricity Transmission and Distribution Systems 
(Access) Act 1994. 

Transitioning of prior applications 
 A9.3 A prior application has effect for the purposes of this Code and the SWIN access 

arrangement as though it was an access application lodged under this Code and the 
SWIN access arrangement.  

 A9.4 A transitioned application is deemed to have been lodged at the time the corresponding 
prior application was lodged. 

 A9.5 To the extent necessary to enable the transitioned application to comply with the 
application and queuing policy, it is to be regarded as two separate access applications, 
being a connection application and an electricity transfer application. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3219 

 

New queuing etc rules apply to transitioned applications 
 A9.6 From 1 July 2007, a transitioned application is to be dealt with in accordance with this 

Code and the SWIN access arrangement, despite having been lodged and previously 
dealt with in accordance with the previous regime. 

Updating a transitioned application 
 A9.7 By no later than 14 July 2007 Electricity Networks Corporation must give notice to 

each prior applicant— 
 (a) advising that the prior applicant’s prior application has been transitioned under 

clause A9.3; and 
 (b) if applicable, advising that the prior application will have effect as a deemed 

connection application and electricity transfer application under clause A9.5. and 
 (c) for each covered service sought by the prior application, Electricity Networks 

Corporation’s proposal as a reasonable and prudent person for— 
 (i) the reference service to be substituted for the covered service sought by the 

prior application; 
 (ii) the reference tariff to apply for the reference service; 
 (iii) the terms and conditions to apply to the reference service (including its 

proposal, if applicable, for completing any blanks in the standard access 
contract);  

  and 
 (d) advising that the prior applicant is not obliged to accept Electricity Networks 

Corporation’s proposals under clause A9.7(c); and 
 (e) specifying (to the extent reasonably practicable in accordance with good 

electricity industry practice) all additional information required from the 
applicant to cause the transitioned application to comply with this Code and the 
SWIN access arrangement and to enable Electricity Networks Corporation to 
process the transitioned application and, if applicable, make an access offer. 

 A9.8 Within 30 business days after receipt of a notice referred to in clause A9.7, the prior 
applicant must give Electricity Networks Corporation a notice setting out, for each 
service sought by the prior application, either— 

 (a) the prior applicant’s acceptance of Electricity Networks Corporation’s proposals 
under clause A9.7(c); or 

 (b) the prior applicant’s counter-proposal in respect of those matters. 
 A9.9 A notice from a prior applicant under clause A9.8— 
 (a) is an amendment to the relevant transitioned application under clause 3.13(a) of 

the application and queuing policy; and 
 (b) if given under clause A9.8(a) is not a material amendment; and 
 (c) if given under clause A9.8(b), can (subject to clause A9.10), but does not 

necessarily, amount to a proposal for a material amendment, 
 A9.10 A response under clause A9.8(b) is not a material amendment if the response would 

result in a transitioned application which is either (or both of)— 
 (a) not materially different from the prior application; or 
 (b) not materially different from what the transitioned application would have been 

if the prior applicant had accepted Electricity Networks Corporation’s proposals 
under clause A9.7(c); 

Assessing whether prior applicant’s election might amount to a material amendment 
 A9.11 Before giving a notice under clause A9.8(b), a prior applicant may submit a draft of the 

notice to Electricity Networks Corporation seeking Electricity Networks Corporation’s 
view as a reasonable and prudent person on whether the notice might amount to a 
material amendment if submitted in that form. 

 A9.12 Electricity Networks Corporation must respond to a request under clause A9.11 within 
5 business days with its view as a reasonable and prudent person as to whether the 
draft notice would, or would not, amount to a material amendment. 

Transitioned applications temporarily preserved 
 A9.13 Despite anything to the contrary in the SWIN access arrangement, a transitioned 

application must not be rejected, and cannot have its priority amended or be deemed to 
have been withdrawn, unless— 

 (a) Electricity Networks Corporation has given notice under clause A9.7; and 
 (b) the prior applicant has given a notice under clause A9.8 or the time for doing so 

has expired, 
  and thereafter a transitioned application may only be rejected, have its priority 

amended or be deemed to have been withdrawn in accordance with the application and 
queuing policy. 

Time periods restart after exchange of notices 
 A9.14 For the purposes only of determining a time period under the application and queuing 

policy, a transitioned application is deemed to have been lodged on the date the prior 
applicant gives a notice under clause A9.8 or the time for doing so expires. 

”. 



3220 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

HEALTH 

HE401* 
MENTAL HEALTH ACT 1996 

MENTAL HEALTH (AUTHORISED MENTAL HEALTH PRACTITIONERS) 
ORDER (NO. 3) 2007 

Made by the Chief Psychiatrist under section 20. 

Citation 
1. This order may be cited as the Mental Health (Authorised Mental Health Practitioners) Order  
(No. 3) 2007. 

Commencement 
2. This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Gazette. 

Authorised mental health practitioner 
3. The mental health practitioners specified in Schedule 1 to this order are designated as authorised 
mental health practitioners. 

Schedule 1 
NAME PROFESSION 

Adey, Nathan Mental Health Nurse 

Brabazon, Vernon Social Worker 

Darby, Margaret Mental Health Nurse 

Downie, Nicole Mental Health Nurse 

Fell, Lucia Mental Health Nurse 

Fernandez, Celine Psychologist 

Grady, Thomas Mental Health Nurse 

Harris, Lisa Mental Health Nurse 

Harvey, Adrian Mental Health Nurse 

Hill, Sarah Mental Health Nurse 

Hille, Lynette Mental Health Nurse 

Lawson, Clair Psychologist 

Rule, Trevor Psychologist 

Simpson, Wendy Mental Health Nurse 

Spinks, Jacqueline Mental Health Nurse 

Sweetman, Alan Wesley Mental Health Nurse 

Tait, Stuart Mental Health Nurse 

Dated: 25th June 2007. 

Dr ROWAN DAVIDSON, Chief Psychiatrist. 

JUSTICE 

JU401* 
JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

RESIGNATIONS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Minister has accepted the resignation of— 

Mr George Ernest White of 75 Peet Road, Roleystone 
from the Office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia. 

JOANNE STAMPALIA, A/Executive Director, 
Court and Tribunal Services. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3221 

 

JU402* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

SURNAME OTHER NAMES PERMIT No. REVOCATION 
DATE 

Goodall Dion AP 0372 23/06/2007 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager Acacia Prison Contract. 
26 June, 2007 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
SHIRE OF CUNDERDIN 

APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED OFFICERS 
It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Paul Reece has been appointed by the Council of 
the Shire of Cunderdin, as an Authorised Officer to enforce the provisions of the following— 

Local Government Act 1995  
Dog Act 1976 and Regulations  
Bush Fires Act 1954 and Regulations  
The Litter Act 1979  
Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978 and Regulations (as amended)  
Cemeteries Act 1986 

The following persons have been authorised as Registration Officers in accordance with the Dog 
Act 1976 and Regulations— 

Mrs Julie Oliver 
Ms Loren Hempel 
Ms Brooke Millea 
Ms Fiona Leeds 

G. M. (Gary) TUFFIN, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

LG402* 
CITY OF KALGOORLIE-BOULDER 

APPOINTMENTS 
The City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder wishes to advise for public information the appointment of Deonne 
Lewis as an authorised officer to operate within the City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder to enforce the 
following Acts, Regulations and Local Laws effective immediately— 
 • Local Government Act 1995 
 • Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 
 • Dog Act 1976—For the purpose of Dog Registration Officer, Issuing of Dog Infringement 

Notices, Dog Warning Notices and Notices to Register Dog (Admin) 
 • Litter Act 1979—For the Purpose of issuing Litter Infringements (Admin) 
 • City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder Parking and Parking Facilities Local Law (Admin) 
 • Bush Fires Act 1954 (Admin) 
 • Control of Vehicles (Off-road Areas) Act 1978 (Admin) 
 • Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act and Regulations 1995 (Admin) 
The City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder also wishes to advise the cancellation of the appointments of Fiona 
Megan Dent. 

D. S. BURNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 



3222 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
PETROLEUM ACT 1967 

GRANT OF EXPLORATION PERMIT 
Exploration Permit No. EP 455 has been granted to Westralian Gas and Power Limited to have effect 
for a period of six (6) years from 22/6/2007. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 
 

——————————— 
 
MP402* 

PETROLEUM ACT 1967 
GRANT OF DRILLING RESERVATION 

Drilling Reservation No. DR 9 has been granted to Backreef Oil Ltd of 29 Pindari Road, City Beach 
WA 6015 to have effect for a period of three (3) years from 20th June 2007. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 
 

——————————— 
 
MP403* 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Industry & Resources 
Mt Magnet. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Act 1978-1983, notice is hereby given that the 
licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) for breach of covenant, viz. 
non-payment of rent. 

S. RICHARDSON, Warden. 

———— 

To be heard in the Warden’s Court, Mt Magnet on the Thursday 26 July 2007. 

MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD 
P20/1604—Cougar Metals NL & Australian Eagle Oil Co NL 
P20/1487—St Barbara Ltd & Cougar Metals NL 
P20/1492—Australian Ragle Oil Co NL & Cougar Metals NL 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Capel 

Town Planning Scheme No. 7—Amendment No. 34  
Ref: 853/6/7/7 Pt 34 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of Capel 
local planning scheme amendment on 6 June 2007 for the purpose of adding a new clause after clause 
5.7.4 to read— 
 5.7.5 Where Council grants a Planning Consent to develop a caravan park in the Rural Zone 

pursuant to Clause 3.2.2 no person shall occupy any of the forms of accommodation 
identified in the definition of Caravan Park in Appendix 1 of the Scheme for other than 
holiday accommodation wherein the total stay will be limited to a maximum of 3 months 
in any 12 month period. 

M. T. SCOTT, President. 
P. F. SHEEDY, Chief Executive Officer. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3223 

 

PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Town of Cottesloe 

Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 43 
Ref: 853/2/3/5 Pt 43 

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Town of 
Cottesloe local planning scheme amendment on 6 June 2007 for the purpose of— 

 1. Amending Clause 3.4.3 to read as follows— 

 3.4.3 The intent of the Business Zone is to provide for the wide range of uses permissible in a 
manner compatible with surrounding development. 

 (i) The maximum plot ratio shall be 0.8 and in considering development 
applications, Council will be guided by the height of buildings in the adjoining 
areas and the amenity and parking provisions on Part V—General Provisions of 
the Scheme. 

 (ii) For the Eric Street local centre, the following development requirements shall be 
applicable, subject to Council approval— 

Maximum Plot Ratio Ground Floor 0.7:1 
First Floor Residential: As per Residential 
Design Codes 

Maximum Site Cover 92% 

Minimum Boundary Setbacks Western boundary: Nil 
North boundary: 3m 

Maximum Height 2 storey and 9.0 metres 

Required Car Parking Retail: 1 bay per 30m² gross leasable area 
Multiple Dwellings: As per Residential 
Design Codes 

 2. Including specific concessions/exemptions relating to future subdivision and development of 
the site into Schedule 5 of the Scheme as follows— 

  COLUMN 1 
PARTICULARS OF 
LAND 

COLUMN 2 
EXEMPTIONS/CONCESSIONS THAT MAY 
BE GRANTED BY THE COUNCIL 

SP5 5 No. 36 (Lot 50) Eric 
Street, Cottesloe 

Council, when considering an application for 
development that is in accordance with the 
standards set out in clause 3.4.3 of the 
Scheme, will be guided by any Indicative 
Development Plan for the site that it has 
supported ‘in-principle’. 

K. J. MORGAN, Mayor. 
S. TINDALE, Chief Executive Officer. 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PC401* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment— 

Hon J. R. Ford MLC, to act temporarily in the office of Minister for Agriculture and Food; 
Forestry; the Mid West and Wheatbelt; Great Southern in the absence of the Hon K. M. Chance 
MLC for the period 9 to 22 July 2007 inclusive. 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 



3224 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

PC402* 

INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment— 

Hon E. S. Ripper MLA, to act temporarily in the office of Minister for Police and Emergency 
Services; Community Safety; Water Resources; Sport and Recreation in the absence of the Hon  
J. C. Kobelke MLA for the period 25 June to 1 July 2007 inclusive. 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PC403* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment— 

Hon S. M. Ellery MLC to act temporarily in the office of Minister for Corrective Services; Small 
Business; Minister Assisting the Minister for Federal-State Relations in the absence of the Hon 
M. M. Quirk MLA for the period 25 to 28 June 2007 (both dates inclusive). 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

 
 

——————————— 
 

PC404* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984, has approved the following temporary appointments— 

Hon J. C. Kobelke MLA to act temporarily in the office of Treasurer; Minister for State 
Development in the absence of the Hon E. S. Ripper MLA for the periods 22 to 23 July 2007 and 
28 July to 5 August 2007 (both dates inclusive). 

Hon M. M. Quirk MLA to act temporarily in the office of Treasurer; Minister for State 
Development in the absence of the Hon E. S. Ripper MLA for the period 24 to 27 July 2007 (both 
dates inclusive). 

These arrangements supersede those published in Government Gazette Number 109 on 22 May 2007. 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PC405* 

INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment— 

Hon E. S. Ripper MLA to act temporarily in the office of Premier; Minister for Federal-State 
Relations; Trade; Innovation; Science; Public Sector Management in the absence of the Hon  
A. J. Carpenter MLA for the period 7 to 15 July 2007 (both dates inclusive). 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3225 

 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG401* 
LIQUOR CONTROL ACT 1988 

LIQUOR APPLICATIONS 
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Control Act 1988 (the Act) and 
required to be advertised.   

Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection process, 
should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming & Liquor, 1st Floor, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, 
Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation. 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE 
11974 Vu Van Do Application for the grant of a Restaurant 

licence in respect of premises situated in 
South Perth and known as Vu's Vietnamese 
Cafe Restaurant 

24/07/2007 

 
 

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—LIQUOR WITHOUT A MEAL 
30690 Borossco Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an extended 

trading permit – liquor without a meal, in 
respect of premises situated in Perth and 
known as Fuche 

16/07/07 

    
30365 West Coast Pals Pty 

Ltd 
Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit – liquor without a meal, in 
respect of premises situated in East Perth 
and known as Café Bellavista 

08/07/07 

 

 
APPLICATIONS TO ADD, VARY OR CANCEL A CONDITION OF LICENCE 

271533 Westwood Asset Pty 
Ltd 

Application to add, vary or cancel a condition 
of the Hotel licence in respect of premises 
situated in Fremantle and known as the 
Newport Hotel 

16/07/07 

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Act. 

Dated: 27 June 2007. 
B. A. SARGEANT, Director of Liquor Licensing. 

WATER/SEWERAGE 

WA401 
COUNTRY TOWNS SEWERAGE ACT 1948 

WILUNA SEWERAGE 
Acquisition 

The Water Corporation under the provisions of Section 11(3) of the Country Towns Sewerage 
Act 1948, at the request of the Shire of Wiluna, Department of Housing and Works, Department of 
Education, Wiluna Aboriginal Medical Service, Wiluna Club Hotel and Telstra, has with the approval 
of His Excellency the Governor, by and with consent of the Executive Council, acquired selected 
conveyance assets in the Wiluna sewerage scheme. 

J. I. GILL, Chief Executive Officer, 
Water Corporation. 



3226 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

WORKSAFE 

WC401 
WORKERS’ COMPENSATION AND INJURY MANAGEMENT ACT 1981 

PRESCRIBED AMOUNT 
In accordance with section 315 of the Workers’ Compensation and Injury Management Act 1981, 
I hereby publish for public information the following amounts for the financial year beginning 1 July 
2007— 
 (a) prescribed amount is $159,091; 
 (b) Amount A for the purposes of section 93F and 93K is $334,093; and 
 (c) Amount C for the purposes of Schedule 1 Clause 11 is $1 ,722.60. 
The full schedule of payments titled “Variations in Prescribed Amount and Other Workers’ 
Compensation Payments” is available from the WorkCover WA website at www.workcover.wa.gov.au 
or by contacting the WorkCover WA Infoline on 1300 794 744. 

Hon MICHELLE ROBERTS MLA, Minister for Employment Protection. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 and 
amendments thereto relate) in respect of the estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are 
required by the personal representatives care of Messrs Jackson McDonald, 25th floor, 
140 St Georges Terrace, Perth, Western Australia 6000 (GPO Box M971 Perth Western Australia 
6843) to send particulars of their claims to them within one month from the date of publication of this 
notice at the expiration of which time the personal representatives may convey or distribute the 
assets having regard only to the claims of which they have then had notice— 

Elizabeth Rhoda Saunders, deceased late of Tuohy Nursing Home, Morrison Road, Midland, 
Western Australia, who died on 31 May 2007. 

Jessie Ruth Ransom, deceased late of Regents Garden Nursing Home, Leach Highway, Bateman, 
Western Australia, who died on 18 November 2006. 

Wayne Walter Glenister, deceased late of 10 Bradwell Court, Carine, Western Australia, who died 
on 23 October 2006. 

Janis Bukovskis, deceased late of 16A Stanley Street, Belmont, Western Australia, who died 
between 6 March 2002 and 11 March 2002. 

Pamela Anne Quartermaine, deceased late of 158 Kitchener Road, Alfred Cove, Western 
Australia, who died on 29 March 2007. 

Mary Cargill, deceased late of Unit 59, Parkland Villas, 2 Hungerford Avenue, Mandurah, 
Western Australia, who died on 11 November 2004. 

Dated this 22nd day of June 2007. 
JACKSON McDONALD. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX402* 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act, relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before the 29th July 2007 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, 
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 
Campion, Alan George, late of 10c Grant Place, Bentley, died 17.05.2007, (DE19902955EM16) 
Castelli, Agostino Giovanni, late of 3 Hutton Street, Collie, died 22.05.2007, (DE19921645EM26) 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3227 

 

Clarke, Nellie Campbell, late of Brightwater Care Group, 17B Manuel Crescent, Redcliffe, formerly of 
Unit 6/77 Epsom Avenue, Belmont, died 03.06.2007, (DE19992461EM17) 

Clifton, Robert Cecil, late of 21 Pegus Street, Thornlie, died 13.05.2007, (DE19690792EM17) 
Davis, Lionel Sydney, late of Freshwater Bay Nursing Home, 67 Palmerston Street, Mosman Park, 

formerly of Unit 77/8 Bradford Street, Mount Lawley, died 25.05.2007, (DE19981156EM17) 
Jean, Anna, late of Wearne House, 7 Leslie Street, Mandurah, formerly of 11 Kestal Place, Kewdale, 

died 25.05.2007, (DE19842671EM23) 
McIntosh, Minnia Anne, late of 79/24 Freedman Road, Menora, died 22.02.2007, (DE33016513EM26) 
Robinson, Ewan Stuart, late of 14 Quorn Street, Wembley Down, formerly of 12 May Street, Subiaco, 

died 10.05.2007, (DE33049331EM213) 
Rogerson, William, late of Greenfields Aged Care, 95 Lakes Road, Mandurah, died 03.05.2007, 

(DE19913982EM16) 
Thomas, Martha Rebeca, late of 222 Cammillo Road, Kelmscott, died 23.02.2007, (DE32003134EM13) 
Upenieks, Harijs, late of 23 Thompson Road, North Fremantle, died 14.06.2007, (DE19980409EM313) 
Williams, Ailsa Agnes, late of Howard Solomon Aged Care Facility, 91 Hybanthus Road, Ferndale, 

died 28.05.2007, (DE32002124EM12) 
Wright, Edward Stephen, late of Carrington Aged Care, Ivermey Road, Hamilton Hill, died 

21.05.2007, (DE19840692EM16) 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
Public Trust Office, 

565 Hay Street, 
Perth WA 6000. 

Telephone: 9222 6777 

PUBLIC NOTICES 

ZZ401 
PARTNERSHIP ACT 1895 

DISSOLUTION OF PARTNERSHIP 
Take notice of the dissolution of partnership between Dr. Douglas James Smith and Dr. Laurence 
Edwin Fisher trading as D. J. Smith and L. E. Fisher at North Innaloo Medical Centre, 13 Morris Rd, 
Innaloo WA 6018 effective from 30th June 2007. 

D. J. SMITH. 

L. E. FISHER. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 
 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

FAIR TRADING (RETIREMENT VILLAGES 
CODE) REGULATIONS 2006 

*Price: $9.05 counter sales 
Plus postage on 120 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



3228 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

 
 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2008 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2008. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically on any day. 
All Gazettes $
  Within WA ..................................... 918.50
  Interstate  ..................................... 935.00

 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,138.50
 
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $
  Within WA  .................................... 441.00
  Interstate ...................................... 525.00
 
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $
  Within WA  .................................... 871.20
  Interstate ................................... 1,064.80
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 859.10
  Interstate ...................................... 872.30
 

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 310.20 
  Interstate ....................................... 345.40 
  Overseas ........................................ 402.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 856.90 

 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 334.40 
  Interstate ........................................ 345.40 

 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA ...................................... 459.80 
  Interstate ....................................... 481.80 

 

 

 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS 
 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at 
State Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of 
publication of the missing item. 
Claims lodged after this period will not be recognised and will attract 
payment in full. 
 



29 June 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3229 

 

Order your Bound Volumes of 
Government Gazette 2006 

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette 

 

For Government Departments and 
private firms who presently arrange 
binding for their copies of Government 
Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is 
now offering a subscription covering 4 
Quarterly Volumes at a cost of 
$1,098.90. 

The Gazettes will be bound in black 
cloth with gold foil lettering on the 
spine and personalised by  the addition 
of the client's name in gold lettering on 
the front cover. 

 

PLEASE NOTE 
On the rare occasion where extra 
gazettes are published in one quarter, a 
fifth volume may be required. In this 
instance the extra cost involved will be 
borne by the State Law Publisher and 
not passed on to clients. 

 
 

For further information please contact: 

State Law Publisher 

Telephone: 9321 7688 



3230 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2007 

 

 

W A N T E D ! ! ! 

Old copies of the Government Gazette 

State Law Publisher is in the process of scanning all Government 
Gazettes (back to the first one ever published in the 1840’s) with 
the intention of adding the archived copies to our existing on-line 
service. 

We are looking for donations of any copies (pre 1994) that are 
no longer required by clients and would be appreciative of any 
assistance you can offer in this undertaking. 

The scanning process requires single pages, therefore we need to 
trim the spine off each gazette, which unfortunately ruins the 
gazettes for future use. 

Our preference is for unwanted copies, however, if a client requires 
their gazettes returned, State Law Publisher will reprint and replace 
individual editions. If a bound copy is supplied and is to be returned 
we will reprint all gazettes and arrange to have them rebound for 
the client. 

The benefits of having all the gazettes and indices on-line and 
searchable will be enormous. This service should remove the need 
for clients to retain hard copies and will free up valuable storage 
space. 

Barring any unforeseen delays, it should take around a month to 
scan each year and then release on our website. 

 

——————————— 

 

Please contact John Thompson on 9426 0010 if you can assist by 
supplying editions of the Government Gazette. For large quantities 
we will arrange for them to be collected. 
 


