
!200700209GG! 
 

  5345 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 9 OCTOBER 2007 No. 209 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Betting Control Act 1954—Betting Control Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2007...............  5348 
Casino Control Act 1984— 

Casino Control Amendment Regulations 2007..................................................................  5350 
Casino Control (Burswood Island) (Licensing of Employees) Amendment 

Regulations 2007 .............................................................................................................  5351 
Gaming and Wagering Commission Act 1987—Gaming and Wagering Commission 

Amendment Regulations 2007 ...............................................................................................  5354 
Gas Standards Act 1972—Gas Standards (Infringement Notices) Amendment 

Regulations 2007 ....................................................................................................................  5347 
Liquor Control Act 1988—Liquor Control Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2007 .................  5352 
Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003—Racing and Wagering Western 

Australia Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2007 ..................................................................  5357 
Racing Penalties (Appeals) Act 1990—Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment 

Regulations 2007 ....................................................................................................................  5358 
 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Consumer and Employment Protection ....................................................................................  5360 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  5370 
Electoral Commission ................................................................................................................  5360 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  5361 
Environment ..............................................................................................................................  5361 
Health.........................................................................................................................................  5362 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................  5362 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  5364 
Parliament..................................................................................................................................  5367 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  5367 
Police ..........................................................................................................................................  5370 
 
 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2007 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$24.75 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$57.75 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$57.75 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.55 

  Bulk Notices—$211.00 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5347 

 

— PART 1 — 

ENERGY 

EN301* 

Gas Standards Act 1972 

Gas Standards (Infringement Notices) 
Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Gas Standards (Infringement Notices) 
Amendment Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette (“Gazettal 
day”); 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after Gazettal 
day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Gas Standards 
(Infringement Notices) Regulations 2007. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended under the heading “Offences under Gas 
Standards (Gasfitting and Consumer Gas Installations) 
Regulations 1999” by inserting the following items in the 
appropriate numerical positions —  

“     
r. 18(2)(a) Failing to ensure gas installation complied with 

prescribed requirements and is safe to use ................. 
 
$400 

r. 28(2) Failing to attach approved badge or label on 
completion of work ..................................................... 

 
$400 

    ”. 
By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



5348 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG301* 

Betting Control Act 1954 

Betting Control Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Betting Control Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Betting Control 
Regulations 1978. 

4. Regulation 17 amended 

 (1) Regulation 17(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (aa) by deleting “$35;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $40;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (ab) by deleting “$55;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $60;    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (ac) by deleting “$275;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $285;    ”; 

 (d) in paragraph (ad) by deleting “$55;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $60;    ”; 

 (e) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$550;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $575;    ”; 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5349 

 

 (f) in paragraph (ba) by deleting “$130;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $140;    ”; 

 (g) in paragraph (bb) by deleting “$70;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $75;    ”; 

 (h) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$125;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $135;    ”; 

 (i) in paragraph (d) by deleting “$3.50;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $4;    ”; 

 (j) in paragraph (f) by deleting “$510.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $535.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 17(2) is amended by deleting “$80.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $85.    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 17(3) is amended by deleting “$80.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $85.    ”. 

5. Regulation 17A amended 

  Regulation 17A(1)(a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in subparagraph (i) by deleting “$300;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $310;    ”; 

 (b) in subparagraph (ii) by deleting “$605;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $630;    ”; 

 (c) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting “$910,” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $950,    ”. 

6. Regulation 17B amended 

  Regulation 17B(1)(a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in subparagraph (ii) —  

 (i)  by deleting “$120 000” and inserting instead —  

  “    $135 000    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “$35;” and inserting instead —  

  “    $40;    ”; 



5350 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

 (b) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting “$120 000” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $135 000    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

RG302* 

Casino Control Act 1984 

Casino Control Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Casino Control Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Casino Control 
Regulations 1999. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  Regulation 4 is amended by deleting “$115.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $125.    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5351 

 

RG303* 

Casino Control Act 1984 

Casino Control (Burswood Island) (Licensing of 
Employees) Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Casino Control (Burswood Island) 
(Licensing of Employees) Amendment Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette (“Gazettal 
day”); 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Casino Control 
(Burswood Island) (Licensing of Employees) Regulations 1985. 

4. Regulation 6 amended 

 (1) Regulation 6(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$350;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $365;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$220.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $230.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 6(1a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$95;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $100;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$95.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $100.    ”. 



5352 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

 (3) Regulation 6(2)(a) is amended by deleting “$255;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $265;    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
RG304* 

Liquor Control Act 1988 

Liquor Control Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Liquor Control Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Liquor Control 
Regulations 1989. 

4. Regulation 26 amended 

 (1) Regulation 26(1aa) is amended by deleting “3a or 3b” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    4 or 5    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 26(1a) is amended by deleting “3a and 3b” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    4 and 5    ”. 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5353 

 

5. Schedule 3 replaced 

  Schedule 3 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 3 — Fees 

[r. 26(1)] 

 $ 
1. Application for the grant or removal of a hotel licence, 

nightclub licence, casino liquor licence, special facility 
licence or liquor store licence .................................................. 

 
 
 2 125.00 

2. Application for the grant or removal of a club licence, 
restaurant licence, producer’s licence or wholesaler’s licence  

 
 485.00 

3. Application for the transfer of a licence ..................................  485.00 
4. Licence fee for all licences other than a wholesaler’s licence   150.00 
5. Licence fee for a wholesaler’s licence .....................................  320.00 
6. Application for an occasional licence where the anticipated 

number of persons attending* is —  
 (a) up to 250 ....................................................................... 
 (b) between 251 and 500 .................................................... 
 (c) between 501 and 1 000 ................................................. 
 (d) between 1 001 and 5 000 .............................................. 
 (e) between 5 001 and 10 000 ............................................ 
 (f) over 10 000 ................................................................... 

 [*See regulation 26(4) as to the anticipated number of 
persons attending] 

 
 
 35.00 
 80.00 
 140.00 
 600.00 
 1 210.00 
  2 420.00 

7. Application for extended trading permit for a period of over 
21 days — 

 (a) issued for a purpose referred to in section 60(4)(ca) .... 
 (b) issued for a purpose referred to in section 60(4)(h) ...... 
 (c) issued for any other purpose ......................................... 

 
 
 360.00 
 240.00 
 655.00 

8. Application for extended trading permit for a period of 
21 days or less (for each day, up to a maximum of $500) ....... 

 
 65.00 

9. Application for approval of manager (other than under club 
restricted licence), after licence is granted ............................... 

 
 75.00 

10. Application for approval of manager under club restricted 
licence, after licence is granted ................................................ 

 
 25.00 

11. Application for approval of person in position of authority, 
after licence is granted ............................................................. 

 
 85.00 

12. Application for approval for alteration or redefinition of 
licensed premises ..................................................................... 

 
 300.00 

13. Application for a protection order under section 87(1) ...........  75.00 
14. Application for duplicate licence .............................................  30.00 
15. Application for approval of change of name of licensed 

premises ................................................................................... 
 
 65.00 

16. Application to add, vary or cancel condition of licence or 
permit (other than club restricted licence) ............................... 

 
 75.00 

17. Application to add, vary or cancel condition of club restricted 
licence ...................................................................................... 

 
 30.00 

18. On the issue of a list of licensed premises or a list of owners 
of licensed premises ................................................................. 

 
 75.00 

19. On the issue of a list of licensed premises on computer disk ...  95.00 
20. Address labels for licensed premises .......................................  115.00 
21. Application for Proof of Age Card (r. 18B) .............................  20.00 
22. Supply of approved heading for advertising an 

application..………………………………………………….. 
 
 25.00 

23. Copy of plan — per sheet ........................................................  20.00 
24. Certified copy of plan defining licensed premises ...................  30.00 
25. Issue of a summons to a witness ..............................................  15.00 



5354 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

 $ 
26. Copy of a licence or a permit, or a decision of the 

Commission (or the former Liquor Licensing Court) or the 
Director ....................................................................................

 
 
 25.00 

27. For the certification of a copy of a licence or permit or a 
decision of the Commission (or the former Liquor Licensing 
Court) or the Director — an additional fee of .……………… 

 
 
 20.00 

28. For a search of records of licences — per licence ...................  30.00 
29. For a notice of application for approval of arrangement or 

agreement (s. 68(1)(b)(i)) .........................................................
 
 65.00 

30. For a copy of documentation, other than that already 
prescribed, per page .................................................................

 
 4.50 

31. For a search of postcodes —   
 (a) 1 to 10 postcodes ...........................................................  30.00 
 (b) more than 10 postcodes .................................................  70.00 
32. For a full search of the licence record ......................................  45.00 
33. Application under section 62(6) to vary any plans or 

specifications the subject of a condition ..................................
 
 230.00 

34. Application under section 126A for approval of 
entertainment for juveniles on licensed premises .................... 

 
 55.00 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

RG305* 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Act 1987 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Gaming and Wagering Commission 
Amendment Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2008. 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5355 

 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Gaming and 
Wagering Commission Regulations 1988. 

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 1 — Prescribed fees 

[r. 4] 

Column 1 
Provision 

Column 2 
Description 

Column 3 
Amount 

$ 

50(3) Fee for —   

  (a) search of the register for an 
identified entry ……………………. 

 
7 

  (b) copy of extract from register ……… 13 

47 Fee on application for a function permit for —  

  (a) an item of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(a)) ……………………… 

 
30 

  (b) a class of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(b)) ……………………… 

 
50 

47 Fee on application for a permit of a continuing 
nature for —  

 

  (a) a video lottery terminal (r. 18AA(7))  30 

  (b) an item of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(a)) ……………………… 

 
50 

  (c) a class of gaming equipment  
(r. 18B(2)(b)) ……………………… 

 
95 

47, 53 Fee on application for a function permit for —  

95  (a) bingo ………………………………. 15 

96  (b) multiple bingo, for each premises … 15 

97  (c) simultaneous bingo, for each 
premises …………………………… 

 
15 

104  (d) a standard lottery —   

   (i) where the total retail value of 
prizes or prize money does not 
exceed $5 000 ………………... 

 
 

25 

   (ii) otherwise …………………….. 60 

104  (da) a standard lottery of a kind generally 
known or described as a Calcutta … 

 
60 

104  (e) a continuing lottery ………………… 10 

  (f) gaming (per day authorised) —   

   (i) 1-5 tables …………………….. 180 

   (ii) 6-10 tables …………………… 295 

   (iii) over 10 tables ………………… 360 



5356 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

Column 1 
Provision 

Column 2 
Description 

Column 3 
Amount 

$ 

  (g) two-up —   

80   (i) by a country race club ……….. 120 

81   (ii) otherwise .………………….… 180 

47, 53 Fee on application for a permit of a continuing 
nature for —  

 

95  (a) bingo ......................……………….. 30 

96  (b) multiple bingo, for each premises … 30 

97  (c) simultaneous bingo, for each 
premises ....………………………… 

 
30 

104  (d) a standard lottery, where the total 
retail value of prizes or prize money 
is —  

 

   (i) not more than $5 000 ....……… 40 

   (ii) more than $5 000 but not more 
than $50 000 .....……………… 

 
95 

   (iii) more than $50 000 but not more 
than $100 000 ……….……….. 

 
175 

   (iv) more than $100 000 but not 
more than $200 000 ……….… 

 
360 

   (v) more than $200 000 ……….… 600 

104  (da) a standard lottery of a kind generally 
known or described as a calcutta …. 

 
125 

104  (e) a continuing lottery ……………….. 25 

  (f) gaming (per day authorised) —   

   (i) 1-5 tables ……….………….… 145 

   (ii) 6-10 tables …………………… 265 

   (iii) over 10 tables ………………… 330 

  (g) two-up —   

80   (i) by a country race club, per day 
authorised ……………………. 

 
100 

81   (ii) otherwise, per day authorised .. 145 

53, 55 Fee on application for approval of 
premises —  

 

  (a) for a specific function …………….. 15 

  (b) for functions from time to time …… 65 

  (c) for permit of a continuing nature .… 65 

92 Fee for the issue of a certificate relating to —   

96(2)(c)  (a) multiple bingo …………………….. 125 

97(2)(c)  (b) simultaneous bingo ……………….. 125 

98(c)  (c) assisting in the conduct of bingo, for 
hire or reward .........……….……… 

 
125 

92 Fee for the issue of an approved operator’s 
certificate …………………………………… 

 
200 

88(5) Fee for the issue of a certificate …………….. 260 

104B Fee on application to be a licensed supplier … 240 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5357 

 

Column 1 
Provision 

Column 2 
Description 

Column 3 
Amount 

$ 

88(2)(b), 
(d) 

Fee for approval of a person to operate, or 
remove money from, gaming equipment ……. 

 
20 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

RG306* 

Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003 

Racing and Wagering Western Australia 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Racing and Wagering Western 
Australia Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Racing and 
Wagering Western Australia Regulations 2003. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 by deleting “350” and inserting instead —  

  “    365    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “95” and inserting instead —  

  “    100    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



5358 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

RG307* 

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Act 1990 

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Racing Penalties (Appeals) 
Amendment Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Racing Penalties 
(Appeals) Regulations 1991. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

 (1) Regulation 4(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$115;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $125;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$285.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $305.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 4(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a)(i) by deleting “$115;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $125;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (a)(ii) by deleting “$285;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $305;    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$55.” and inserting instead —  

  “    $60.    ”. 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5359 

 

5. Regulation 7 amended 

  Regulation 7 is amended by deleting “$3.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $4    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 
 
 



5360 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

— PART 2 — 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401 
COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943 

REGISTRATION OF A CO-OPERATIVE COMPANY 
Notice is hereby given that, pursuant to Section 26(1) of the Companies Co-operative Act 1943, a 
Certificate of Incorporation as a Limited Company, has this day been issued to Organic and 
Biodynamic Meats Western Australia Co-operative Limited. 
Dated this 27th day of September 2007. 

WILL MORGAN, for Registrar for Consumer Protection. 

 

——————————— 

 

CE402 
COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943 

Section 296(3) 
COMPANY TO BE STRUCK OFF REGISTER 

Notice is hereby given that at the expiration of three months from the date hereof, the name of the 
undermentioned Co-operative Company will, unless cause is shown to the contrary, be struck off the 
register and the company will be dissolved. 

MUSBA Co-operative Society Limited 
Dated this 27th day of September 2007. 

WILL MORGAN, for Registrar for Consumer Protection. 

ELECTORAL COMMISSION 

EC401 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN COLLEGE OF TEACHING ACT 2004 

NOTICE OF ELECTION 
Election of Board Members (10) pursuant to Part 2 Division 2 section 9 of the Western Australian 
College of Teaching Act 2004 and regulation 10 of the Western Australian College of Teaching 
(Elections) Regulations 2007. 
Nominations are called from registered teachers, who teach in a school, for the election of— 

Board Member (7)—Government School Representatives (term to expire 24 September 2010) 
Board Member (2)—Catholic School Representatives (term to expire 24 September 2010) 
Board Member (1)—Independent School Representative (term to expire 24 September 2010) 

Nominations open on Friday 12 October 2007. 
Nomination forms are to be completed in accordance with the Western Australian College of Teaching 
(Elections) Regulations 2007 and must reach the Electoral Commissioner no later than 4.00 pm on 
Friday 26 October 2007. Should an election be necessary, voting will close at 10.00 am on Monday 
10 December 2007. 
Candidate statement: Candidates may include with their nomination form a statement not exceeding 
150 words in length. The statement must be confined to biographical information about the candidate 
and the candidate’s policies or beliefs and is not to contain information that the Electoral 
Commissioner considers to be false, misleading or defamatory. Candidates may also include contact 
details and a recent passport size photograph of the candidate’s head or head and shoulders. 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5361 

 

How to Lodge Nominations with the Electoral Commissioner— 
 • By Hand: Western Australian Electoral Commission 

Level 2, 111 St Georges Terrace 
Perth WA 6000 

 • By Post: GPO Box F316 
Perth WA 6841 

 • By Fax: 9226 0577 
Originals of faxed nominations must be mailed or hand-delivered to the Electoral Commissioner. 

WARWICK GATELY AM, Electoral Commissioner. 

ENERGY 
EN401* 

ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 
NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23 (1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS. 

Amendment of Licence 
Notice is given that the following Integrated Regional licence has been amended— 

Licensee: Regional Power Corporation (Horizon Power) 
Issue Date: 28 September 2007 
Address of Licensee: 510 Abernethy Road 
 Kewdale WA 6105 
Classification: Integrated Regional Licence (EIRL 2) 
Term of Licence: Up to and including 29 March 2036 
Amendment: Amendment to licence area— 
 Extention of the Coral Bay Electricity Licence Area to include the power 

station, wind farm and boating facility as per Plan No. ERA-EL-039(A). 
Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
 6th Floor 
 197 St Georges Terrace 
 Perth WA 6000 
 http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

ENVIRONMENT 
EV401 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION ACT 1986 
DELEGATION NO. 77 

I, Keiran McNamara, acting in my capacity as the Chief Executive of the Department of Environment 
and Conservation responsible for the administration of the Environmental Protection Act 1986 (“the 
Act”), and pursuant to section 20 of the Act, hereby delegate to the holders for the time being of the 
offices of the Deputy Director General, Resources Group and the Director, Environment Division, of 
the Department of Industry and Resources, all my powers and duties under Part V, Division 2 of the 
Act (other than sections 51E(1)(a), 51M(1)(a) and 51S) and sections 107 and 110 of the Act, other than 
this power of delegation. 
In respect of clearing that is the result of carrying out— 
 (a) an activity under an authority granted, or a requirement imposed, under the Mining Act 

1978, the Petroleum Act 1967, the Petroleum Pipelines Act 1969 or the Petroleum (Submerged 
Lands) Act 1982; or 

 (b) an activity under a government agreement administered by the Department of Industry and 
Resources 

this delegation is subject to the condition that a decision about a clearing matter in respect of 
clearing that is the result of carrying out an activity referred to in (a) above must not be made 
unless— 

 (a) the authority or requirement under which the activity is to take place has been granted or 
imposed; or 

 (b) an application for the authority has been refused. 



5362 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

In this delegation— 
“clearing matter” means— 

 (a) an application for a clearing permit; or 
 (b) an amendment of a clearing permit; 

“government agreement” has the meaning given to that term in section 2 of the Government 
Agreements Act 1979. 

Under section 59(1)(e) of the Interpretation Act 1984, the Environmental Protection (Delegation) 
Notice (No. 2) 2005 gazetted 1 July 2005 is hereby revoked. 

———— 
Dated the 17th day of September 2007. 

KEIRAN McNAMARA, Chief Executive Officer. 
Approved by— 

DAVID TEMPLEMAN MLA, Minister for the Environment; 
Climate Change; Peel. 

HEALTH 

HE401 
HEALTH SERVICES (QUALITY IMPROVEMENT) ACT 1994 

HEALTH SERVICES (QUALITY IMPROVEMENT) (APPROVED COMMITTEE) 
ORDER (NO. 8) 2007 

Made by the Principal Medical Officer (as delegate of the Minister for Health) pursuant to section 7(1) 
of the Health Services (Quality Improvement) Act 1994. 

Citation 
1. This order may be cited as the Health Services (Quality Improvement) (Approved Committee) Order 
(No. 8) 2007. 

Commencement 
2. This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government Gazette. 

Committee 
3. The WA Country Health Service Area Clinical Risk Review Committee established by the Director 
General of Health in his capacity as the Board of the WA Country Health Service is an approved 
quality improvement committee for the purposes of the Act. 

Expiry of order 
4. This order expires three years after its commencement. 

Dated this 27th day of September 2007. 
Dr DOROTHY JONES,Director and  

Principal Medical Officer, 
Office of Safety and Quality in Healthcare. 

JUSTICE 

JU401* 
CHARITABLE TRUSTS ACT 1962 

APPROVAL OF SCHEME UNDER PART III OF THE ACT 
Notice is hereby given under section 10A(6)(b) of the Act that the scheme hereinafter set forth for the 
variation of the charitable trust established by the will of Mary Ruru Radcliffe-Taylor dated 21 May 
1951 was approved by the Attorney General on 14 September 2007. 

Scheme 
1. The terms of the charitable trust established by the Will of Mary Ruru Radcliffe-Taylor dated 21st 
May 1951 be varied as follows— 
 (a) by deleting “the Girl Guide Association of Kalgoorlie W. Australia” and substituting “Guides 

Western Australia (Inc)”; 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5363 

 

 (b) by inserting “who live in Western Australia” after “Guide movement”; 
 (c) by deleting “university” and substituting “tertiary”; and 

 (d) by deleting “the Guide Association” and substituting “Guides Western Australia (Inc)”; 
so that the terms of the trust shall be as set out in Annexure A from the date of approval of the 
scheme by the Attorney General. 

2. The trustee’s and the Attorney General’s reasonable costs and expenses of and incidental to— 
 (a) preparing and advertising the scheme; and 

 (b) obtaining approval for the scheme; 
shall be paid out of, and be a charge on, the trust property. 

Annexure A 
The residue of my estate I leave to Guides Western Australia (Inc) for Guides or members of the 
Guide movement who live in Western Australia for tertiary education. 
I wish preference in the granting of assistance to students be given to those taking a course which 
necessitates them going to another State. 

But all students receiving assistance must be an active member of Guides Western Australia (Inc) at 
the time. 

 

 

——————————— 
 
 

JU402* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 

Cooper Ron Brian AP 0511 28/09/2007 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

Dated: 3 October, 2007. 
BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager Acacia Prison Contract. 

 

 

——————————— 
 
 

JU403* 
COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 51 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Director General of the Department of the Attorney General has issued the following persons with 
Permits to do High-Level Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Issued 

Permit 
Commence 

Date 

Permit 
Expiry Date

Blackie Evelyn Lynette CS8-010 28/09/2007 28/09/2007 30/07/2008 

Burt Simon David CS8-011 28/09/2007 28/09/2007 30/07/2008 

Duncan Donald Richard Norman CS8-012 28/09/2007 28/09/2007 30/07/2008 

Harmer David  CS8-014 28/09/2007 28/09/2007 30/07/2008 

Innes Frances Bernyse CS8-015 3/10/2007 28/09/2007 30/07/2008 

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999. 

SPIRO GOUGOULIS, A/Manager CSCS Contract. 



5364 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

JU404* 
COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 56 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Director General of the Department of the Attorney General has revoked the following Permits to do 
High-Level Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number Date Permit Revoked 

Barr Kenneth John CS6-169 2/10/2007 

Bellotti Joel Bruce CS6-220 2/10/2007 

Yotopoulos Tracey Lee CS6-429 2/10/2007 

Harris Ryan  John CS6-379 2/10/2007 

Boase Timothy  CS6-178 2/10/2007 

These notices are published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999. 

SPIRO GOUGOULIS, CSCS Contract Manager. 

 

——————————— 
 

JU405* 
JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

APPOINTMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has 
approved of the following to the Office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia— 

James Anselm Egan of 4 Stillwater Way, Edgewater 
Jacqueline Angela Joseph-Bowen of 12 Manito Court, Joondalup 
Andrew Reinhard Anthony Stanbury of 72 Emerald Drive, Carabooda 
Stephen John Thrussell of 35 Durban Crescent, Kingsley 

RAY WARNES, Executive Director, 
Court and Tribunal Services. 

 

——————————— 
 

JU406* 
JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

RESIGNATIONS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Minister has accepted the resignations of— 

Mrs Barbara May Baughan of Unit 1, 50 Eric Street, Como 
Mr Alan Pitman Hillier of 35 Wahroonga Way, Greenwood 

from the Office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia. 

RAY WARNES, Executive Director, 
Court and Tribunal Services. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Northam 
APPOINTMENT 

It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Ian Alan Knapp has been appointed a Fire Control 
Officer for the Shire of Northam. 

B. W. MEAD, Chief Executive Officer. 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5365 

 

LG402* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Plantagenet  
FIRE CONTROL OFFICERS—2007 / 2008 

The following persons have been appointed to the designated positions for the Shire of Plantagenet in 
accordance with the Bush Fires Act 1954. All other appointments are hereby cancelled. 

Chief Bush Fire Control Officer David Burcham 
Deputy Chief Bush Fire Control Officer Len Handasyde 
Bush Fire Control Officers 
Simon Grylls Gavin Smith Norm Handasyde 
Michael Jenkins Geoff Mather Mike Lanigan 
Matt Candy Murray McLean Len Handasyde 
Geoff DePledge Rob Lally Steve Jones 
David Burcham Brian Harwood Ray Drage 
Wayne Davis Stan Hall Stephen Beech 
Ken Frost Phillip Webb Peter Stevens 
Bill Sounness Ian Mackie Brett Bell 
Peter Slade Owen Sounness Norm Hill 
Mark Wallace Warren Forbes Tom Rouse 
Bill Hollingworth Bill Bentley Graeme Frusher 
Phillip Trent Robin Ditchburn Ray Parry 
John Russell Ray Williams Ron Thomas 
Brad Cluett Phillip Rule Kelvin Ridgway 
Richard Stan-Bishop Ian Higgins Lachlan Cameron 
Grant Cooper Trevor Pieper Kevin Forbes 
Barry Pearce 
Chief Fire Weather Officer Len Handasyde 
Deputy Fire Weather Officer Rod Stan-Bishop 

The following have been appointed as a Dual Bush Fire Control Officers for the Shire of Plantagenet 
and the City of Albany— 

Tony Slattery Terry Bradshaw Graeme Pyle 
Steve Fullarton 

ROB STEWART, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 
LG403* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
City of Rockingham 

(Basis of Rates) 

Department of Local Government 
and Regional Development. 

DLGRD: RK5-4#04 
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the 
Local Government Act 1995, the Director General of the Department of Local Government and 
Regional Development under delegation from the Hon Ljiljanna Ravlich MLC, Minister for Local 
Government being charged for the time being, with the administration of the Local Government Act 
1995, has determined that the method of valuing the land described in the Schedule hereunder shall 
be gross rental value for the purposes of rating with effect from 1 July 2007. 

QUENTIN HARRINGTON, A/Director General. 

———— 
Schedule 

ADDITIONS TO GROSS RENTAL VALUE AREA 
City of Rockingham 

All those portions of land comprised in the schedules below— 

SCHEDULE “A” 
All those portions of land being Lot 6, Lot 7 and Lot 16 as shown on Plan 7531; Lot Lot 4, Lot 5, Lot 7, 
Lot 10 and Lot 14 as shown on Plan 8420; Lot 12 as shown on Plan 10309 and Lot 9 as shown on Plan 
10537. 

SCHEDULE “B” 
All those portions of land being Lot 4 as shown on Diagram 20993; Lot 1 as shown on Diagram 26388; 
Lot 1 and Lot 2 as shown on Diagram 28436; Lot 5 as shown on Diagram 28581; Lot 1 as shown on 
Diagram 29359; Lot 1 as shown on Diagram 29480; Lot 4 as shown on Diagram 29589; Lot 4 as shown 
on Diagram 30934; Lot 1 as shown on Diagram 31062; Lot 9 as shown on Diagram 31197; Lots 2 to 4 
inclusive as shown on Diagram 31201; Lot 14 as shown on Diagram 31972; Lots 2, Lot 6 and Lot 13 as 



5366 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

shown on Diagram 31973; Lot 22 as shown on Diagram 36709; Lot 100 and Lot 101 as shown on 
Diagram 44198; Lot 55 as shown on Diagram 44870; Lot 2 and Lot 3 as shown on Diagram 44974; Lot 
2 as shown on Diagram 47669; Lot 7 and Lot 8 as shown on Diagram 47817; Lot 101 and Lot 102 as 
shown on Diagram 49092; Lot 103 and Lot 104 as shown on Diagram 50627; Lot 101 as shown on 
Diagram 52269; Lots 1 to 3 inclusive as shown on Diagram 52809; Lot 34 as shown on Diagram 
54373; Lot 5 and Lot 6 as shown on Diagram 55050; Lot 17 as shown on Diagram 55816; Lot 31 as 
shown on Diagram 61135; Lot 1 as shown on Diagram 62063; Lot 27 as shown on Diagram 65383; Lot 
153 as shown on Diagram 66458; Lot 101 as shown on Diagram 76665; Lot 500 as shown on Diagram 
86939; Lot 3 as shown on Diagram 87411; Lot 700 as shown on Diagram 87766; Lot 101 as shown on 
Diagram 89029; Lot 100 as shown on Diagram 91349; Lot 100 as shown on Diagram 91537; Lot 23 
and Lot 24 as shown on Diagram 93665; Lot 105 as shown on Diagram 94207; Lot 201 as shown on 
Diagram 94653 and Lot 52 as shown on Diagram 96998. 

SCHEDULE “C” 
All those portions of land being Lot 103 as shown on Deposited Plan 25761; Lot 901 as shown on 
Deposited Plan 29398; Lot 59 as shown on Deposited Plan 31289; Lot 501 as shown on Deposited Plan 
36918; Lot 431 as shown on Deposited Plan 43592; Lot 807 as shown on Deposited Plan 48808; Lots 
101 to 111 inclusive and Lots 113 to 167 inclusive as shown on Deposited Plan 52599; Lots 1072 to 
1111 inclusive, Lots 1118 to 1127 inclusive and Lots 1500 to 1504 inclusive as shown on Deposited 
Plan 53873; Lot 368, Lot 369 and Lots 390 to 403 inclusive as shown on Deposited Plan 55241; Lot 
1125 as shown on Deposited Plan 149678; Lot 1208 as shown on Deposited Plan 149812; Lot 1212 as 
shown on Deposited Plan 149839; Lot 1213 to 1215 inclusive as shown on Deposited Plan 149840; 
Lots 1233 to 1236 inclusive as shown on Deposited Plan 149966; Lot 483, Lot 1262, Lot 1266 and Lot 
1267 as shown on Deposited Plan 152854; Lot 1270 as shown on Deposited Plan 152857; Lot 1272 as 
shown on Deposited Plan 152973; Lot 1284 as shown on Deposited Plan 163094; Lot 305, Lot 323 and 
Lot 772 as shown on Deposited Plan 202704; Lot 510 as shown on Deposited Plan 202741; Lot 101, 
Lot 487, Lot 530, Lot 545, Lot 552, Lot 555, Lot 557, Lot 561 and Lot 564 as shown on Deposited Plan 
202744; Lot 998, Lot 999, Lot 1002, Lot 1003, Lot 1012 and Lot 1013 as shown on Deposited Plan 
202754; Lot 934, Lot 938, Lot 958, Lot 960, Lot 961, Lot 968, Lot 976, Lot 983 and Lot 995 as shown 
on Deposited Plan 202758 and Lot 900 as shown on Deposited Plan 202761. 
 

——————————— 
 
LG404* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
City of Gosnells 
(Basis of Rates) 

Department of Local Government 
and Regional Development. 

DLGRD: GS5-4#03 
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the 
Local Government Act 1995, the Director General of the Department of Local Government and 
Regional Development under delegation from the Hon Ljiljanna Ravlich MLC, Minister for Local 
Government being charged for the time being, with the administration of the Local Government Act 
1995, has determined that the method of valuing the land described in the Schedule hereunder shall 
be gross rental value for the purposes of rating with effect from 16 August 2007. 

QUENTIN HARRINGTON, A/Director General. 

———— 
Schedule 

ADDITIONS TO GROSS RENTAL VALUE AREA 
City of Gosnells 

All those portions of land comprised in the schedules below— 

SCHEDULE “A” 
All that portion of land being Lots 114 to 120 inclusive, Lots 124 to 132 inclusive, Lots 143 to 145 
inclusive, Lots 165 to 167 inclusive, Lots 176 to 222 inclusive, Lots 247 to 255 inclusive, Lots 269 to 
272 inclusive, Lots 280 to 282 inclusive, Lot 5001, Lot 5002 and Lot 9004 as shown on Deposited Plan 
52111; Lot 8008 and Lot 9009 as shown on Deposited Plan 52114; Lots 283 to 310 inclusive, Lots 313 
to 319 inclusive and Lot 9018 as shown on Deposited Plan 52115; Lots 101 to 113 inclusive, Lots 133 
to 142 inclusive, Lots 146 to 157 inclusive, Lots 158 to 164 inclusive and Lots 168 to 175 inclusive as 
shown on Deposited Plan 52656; Lot 5004 as shown on Deposited Plan 52657; Lot 5003 as shown on 
Deposited Plan 52658; Lots 399 to 410 inclusive as shown on Deposited Plan 53316; Lot 9014 as 
shown on Deposited Plan 54252; Lots 223 to 230 inclusive; Lots 256 to 268 inclusive and Lots 273 to 
279 inclusive as shown on Deposited Plan 54279. 

SCHEDULE “B” 
All that portion of land being Lots 1732 to 1739 inclusive as shown on Plan 3315; Lot 1629, Lot 1637, 
Lot 1640, Lot 1641 and Lot 1643 as shown on Plan 3316 and Lot 434 as shown on Plan 3327. 

SCHEDULE “C” 
All that portion of land being Lot 100 as shown on Diagram 71379. 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5367 

 

LG405* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

City of Albany 
(Basis of Rates) 

Department of Local Government 
and Regional Development. 

DLGRD: AL5-4#02 
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the 
Local Government Act 1995, the Director General of the Department of Local Government and 
Regional Development under delegation from the Hon Ljiljanna Ravlich MLC, Minister for Local 
Government being charged for the time being, with the administration of the Local Government Act 
1995, has determined that the method of valuing the land described in the Schedule hereunder shall 
be gross rental value for the purposes of rating with effect from 9 October 2007. 

QUENTIN HARRINGTON, A/Director General. 

———— 

Schedule 
ADDITIONS TO GROSS RENTAL VALUE AREA 

City of Albany 
All those portions of land being Lot 47 as shown on Diagram 37863; Lot 10 as shown on Diagram 
99325; Lot 66 as shown on Plan 3570; Lot 87, Lot 88 and Lot 89 as shown on Deposited Plan 51544 
and Lot 80 as shown on Deposited Plan 54173. 

PARLIAMENT 

PA401* 
PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

Royal Assent to Bill 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor has Assented in the name and on behalf 
of Her Majesty the Queen, on the date shown, to the undermentioned Bill passed by the Legislative 
Council and the Legislative Assembly during the First Session of the Thirty-Seventh Parliament. 

Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No. 

Fiona Stanley Hospital Construction Account Act 2007 3 October 2007 22 of 2007 

Dated: 4 October 2007. 
MALCOLM PEACOCK, Clerk of the Parliaments. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT 1139/57 
Eastern Districts Omnibus 7 
Call for Public Submissions 

The Western Australian Planning Commission (WAPC) intends to amend the Metropolitan Region 
Scheme (MRS) for land in the local governments of Belmont, Bayswater, Swan, Bassendean, 
Mundaring and Kalamunda and is seeking public comment. 
The amendment contains 30 proposals, incorporating minor changes to zones and reservations in the 
eastern districts of the Perth metropolitan area, to ensure the Metropolitan Region Scheme is kept 
up-to-date as the statutory regional plan for Perth. 



5368 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

The Western Australian Planning Commission certifies that, in its opinion, the proposed amendment 
does not constitute a substantial alteration to the Metropolitan Region Scheme. 

The plans showing the proposed changes and the WAPC amendment report which explains the 
proposals, will be available for public inspection from Tuesday 9 October 2007 to Friday 7 December 
2007 at each of the following places— 
 • Western Australian Planning Commission, 469 Wellington Street, Perth 

 • J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 
 • Municipal offices of the cities of Belmont, Bayswater, Canning and Swan, and the shires of 

Mundaring and Kalamunda 
Documents are also available from the WAPC website www.wapc.wa.gov.au. 

Any person who desires to make a submission to support, object or provide comment on any part of 
the proposed amendment should do so on a form 57. This submission form is available from the 
amendment report, the display locations and the internet. 
Submissions must be lodged with the: Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission, 

469 Wellington Street, Perth WA 6000; on or before 5.00pm Friday, 7 December 2007. 
Late submissions will not be considered. 

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

 

 

——————————— 
 
 

PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Armadale 

Town Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 2 
Ref: 853/2/22/7 Pt 2 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of 
Armadale local planning scheme amendment on 27 August 2007 for the purpose of— 

 (a) Rezoning Lot 681 Canns Road, Bedfordale from “Rural Living 4”  to “Special Residential”; 
 (b) Amending the Scheme maps accordingly; 

 (c) Amending the Scheme text by inserting in appropriate numerical order a new entry into 
Schedule 3—Restricted Use table as follows— 

No. Description of 
land Restricted Uses Conditions 

5 
Lot 681 
Canns Road, 
Bedfordale 

The following uses listed in the “Special 
Residential” zone shall be uses that are not 
permitted (X) in the restricted use area: 

Nil.  
(Refer to Schedule 
12) 

   • Child Care Premises  

   • Civic Use  

   • Club Premises  

   • Community Purpose  

   • Consulting Rooms  

   • Convenience Store  

   • Educational Establishment  

   • Exhibition Centre  

   • Occasional Use  

   • Place of Worship  

   • Recreation—Private  

   • Recreation—Public   

   • Residential Building  

   • Industry—Cottage  

   • Holiday Accommodation  



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5369 

 

 (d) Amending the Scheme text by inserting in appropriate numerical order a new entry into 
Schedule 12—Development (Structure Planning) Area table as follows— 

No. Description of 
Land Additional Provision Applicable to Subdivision and Development 

32 Lot 681 
Canns Road, 
Bedfordale 

32.1 Comprehensive Planning for the area shall be undertaken 
by preparation of a Structure Plan under Part 6A. 

32.2 Overall maximum number of lots shall be 43 lots and shall 
be in accordance with the adopted Structure Plan. 

32.3 Minimum lot sizes shall be 3,000m², except for the proposed 
Lot 43 on the Structure Plan, which shall have a minimum 
lot size of 2.5 ha. 

32.4 Prior to subdivision, all existing inert landfill shall be 
consolidated with the area depicted on the approved 
Structure Plan and the base of the existing quarry area 
shall be tested and rehabilitated to the satisfaction of the 
City and the Department of Environment. 

32.5 Submission of a Dieback Management Plan that 
 includes controlled access to Settlers Common, 
fencing, dieback treatment spraying and appropriate 
signage.  

32.6 A memorial being placed on the lot identified as Lot 43 on 
the Structure Plan to advise the prospective property 
owner/s that the subject lot contains landfill material. 

32.7 All lots shall be provided with reticulated water supply. 
32.8 All lots shall be provided with an underground power 

supply. 
32.9 In lieu of provision of a Public Open Space contribution, the 

subdivider shall contribute 5% cash-in-lieu to the City for 
open space and recreation facilities in the locality. The POS 
cash-in-lieu contribution is to be valued in-accordance with 
Section 155 of the Panning & Development Act. 

32.10 Effluent drains for septic systems (leach drains) shall be 
located such that any consolidated laterite duricrust is 
totally removed to the depth of the underlying soil horizon 
and extending to one (1) metre around the perimeter of 
each drain and the excavated area backfilled with friable 
soils under and around the drains to allow effluents to 
drain into the underlying soil horizon. 

32.11 Effluent disposal systems using alternative disposal 
technologies should not be located over the duricrust. 

32.12 Stormwater and drainage management techniques shall 
meet the requirements of the City’s Water Sensitive Design 
Policy to the satisfaction of the City. 

32.13 All fencing shall be limited to open rural type fencing in 
accordance with the post and wire or post and rail, rural 
fencing model/guidelines depicted on the Structure Plan.  

32.14 Fencing along the common property boundary with the 
MRS Reserve (Settlers Common) to be in accordance with 
the specifications and to the satisfaction of the City. 

32.15 Revegetation is to be established in accordance with the 
proposals identified on the Structure Plan which shall 
include— 

 • A 40 metre buffer strip parallel and adjacent to Canns 
Road; 

 • Landscaped drainage detention swales; and 
 • Vegetation strips around the perimeters of each lot. 
32.16 Strategic Fire Breaks as nominated on the Structure Plan 

shall be provided/constructed and maintained by the 
owners of the lots to the satisfaction of the City. 

32.17 On approval of any subdivision application for the site, the 
current planning approval for landfill operations shall 
cease and be void.  

 (e) Amending Special Control Area Map 3 to include the land in “Development Area (Structure 
Plan)” and Special Control Area Map 1 to include the land in “Development Envelope Areas” 
and “Bushfire Protection Areas”. 

L. REYNOLDS, Mayor. 
R. S. TAME, Chief Executive Officer. 



5370 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

PI403 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Rockingham 

Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 37 
Ref: 853/2/28/4 Pt 37 

Notice is hereby given that the City of Rockingham has prepared the abovementioned Scheme 
Amendment for the purpose of amending the Scheme Text as follows— 

 1. The Building Envelope Provisions within Schedule No. 4, Planning Units 2, 3, 4, 5, 6 and 7, 
and Schedule No. 5, Planning Units 3, 4 be deleted and replaced with the following— 

Where building envelopes are designated, no clearing or development, other than for fire 
management purposes or to construct a vehicle accessway, which has received the prior 
written approval of the Council, shall be approved outside the designated building 
envelopes. 

 2. Provision 6 of Scheme No. 5—Warnbro Dunes be deleted and replaced with the following— 
 6. All development and effluent disposal system shall only be constructed within 

designated building envelopes identified at the time of subdivision. The building 
envelope shall be to the satisfaction of the Council and may be varied at the discretion 
of the Council, if— 

 (a) Council receives advice from a qualified environmental consultant that the 
variation will result in an environmental benefit; and 

 (b) only after consultation with the owners of affected or adjoining properties. 

B. SAMMELS, Mayor. 
GARY G. HOLLAND, Chief Executive Officer. 

POLICE 

PO501 

POLICE ACT 1892 

POLICE AUCTION 
Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892, unclaimed and stolen property will be sold by public 
auction at Lot 1513 Lambert Road, Karratha, at 10.00am on Wednesday 31st October 2007. 
Auction to be conducted by Ross’s Auctions, Licensed Auctioneer. 

K. O’CALLAGHAN, Commissioner of Police. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 
Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Michael Troy Gattorna, late of 45 Newry Street, Floreat, Western Australia. 

Creditors and other persons having claim (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the deceased who died on 18 July 2007 are required to send particulars of their claims to 
the Administrator, care of Butlers, Barristers & Solicitors, 83-85 Stirling Highway, Nedlands, 
Western Australia by Tuesday 6 November 2007 after which date the Trustees may convey or 
distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which notice has been given. 



9 October 2007 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5371 

 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Janet Valerie Madge Hall of 19Z Dean Street, Claremont, Western Australia. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 18 May 2007, are required by the personal 
representatives, James Mackenzie Hall and Georgia Mathieson Cowling care of Fairweather & 
Lemonis, Level 9, 172 St Georges Terrace, Perth WA 6000 to send particulars of their claims to them 
by the 9th day of November 2007, after which date the personal representatives may convey or 
distribute the assets, having regard only to the claims of which they then have notice. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

ZX403 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Robert Beau Abel, late of 146 Moolanda Boulevard, Kingsley, Western Australia. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 9 December 2006 at Kingsley aforesaid are required 
by the Executor and Trustee of care of Messrs Dwyer Durack Lawyers of 6th floor, St Martins Tower, 
44 St George’s Terrace, Perth to send particulars of their claims to him by the 12th day of November 
2007, after which date the Trustee may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the 
claims of which he then has notice. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Consolidated Loose Leaf Version 
(Including Index) 

 
$52.00 (incl. GST) Plus Postage 

Green Binder is an additional $17.20 if required 

Available from: 
State Law Publisher 

10 William Street, Perth 
Telephone: 9321 7688 

Fax: 9321 7536 
sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 



5372 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9 October 2007 

 

 

Order your Bound Volumes of 
Government Gazette 2008 

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes 
of Government Gazette 

 

For Government Departments and 
private firms who require bound copies 
of Government Gazettes, the State Law 
Publisher offers a subscription covering 
4 Quarterly Volumes at a cost of 
$1,138.50. 

The Gazettes will be bound in black 
cloth with gold foil lettering on the 
spine and personalised by  the addition 
of the client's name in gold lettering on 
the front cover. 

 

PLEASE NOTE 
On the rare occasion where extra 
gazettes are published in one quarter, a 
fifth volume may be required. In this 
instance the extra cost involved will be 
borne by the State Law Publisher and 
not passed on to clients. 

 
 

For further information please contact: 

State Law Publisher 

Telephone: 9321 7688 


