
!200800080GG! 
 

  2035 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 27 MAY 2008 No. 80 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Agriculture Protection Board Act 1950—Agriculture Protection Board Amendment 
Regulations 2008 ....................................................................................................................  2037 

Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation Fund Act 1980—Employers’ Indemnity 
Supplementation Fund Amendment and Repeal Regulations 2008 ....................................  2046 

Finance Brokers Control Act 1975—Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2008 ....................................................................................................................  2038 

Fish Resources Management Act 1994—Fish Resources Management Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2008 ........................................................................................................  2040 

Local Government Act 1995—Broomehill-Tambellup District Order 2008 ............................  2043 
Proclamations—Criminal Law Amendment (Criminal Property) Act 2004—No. 26 of 2004  2037 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Consumer and Employment Protection ....................................................................................  2047 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  2050 
Health.........................................................................................................................................  2047 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  2048 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  2050 
 
 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2007 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$24.75 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$57.75 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$57.75 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.55 

  Bulk Notices—$211.00 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



27 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2037 

 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 

AA101* 
CRIMINAL LAW AMENDMENT (CRIMINAL PROPERTY) ACT 2004 

No. 26 of 2004 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 

By His Excellency 
Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Governor, acting under the Criminal Law Amendment (Criminal Property) 
Act 2004 section 2(2) and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix 
the day after the day on which this proclamation is published in the Government 
Gazette as the day on which Part 3 of that Act comes into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 20 May 2008. 
By Command of the Governor, 

J. McGINTY, Attorney General. 

Note: Under section 2(3) of the Parole and Sentencing Legislation Amendment Act 2006, section 
71 of that Act will also commence on the day on which the Criminal Law Amendment 
(Criminal Property) Act 2004 Part 3 commences in accordance with this proclamation. 

AGRICULTURE 

AG301* 

Agriculture Protection Board Act 1950 

Agriculture Protection Board Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Agriculture Protection Board 
Amendment Regulations 2008. 



2038 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2008 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Agriculture 
Protection Board Regulations 2001. 

4. Regulation 2 amended 

 (1) Regulation 2(1) is amended by deleting “$31 000” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $13 400    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 2(2) is amended by deleting “$12 400” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $6 700    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE301* 

Finance Brokers Control Act 1975 

Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Finance Brokers Control (General) 
Amendment Regulations 2008. 



27 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2039 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Finance Brokers 
Control (General) Regulations 2005. 

4. Regulation 6 amended 

  Regulation 6(3) is amended by deleting paragraph (g) and 
inserting the following paragraph instead —  

“     
 (g) a summary of the current policy of professional 

indemnity insurance that covers the applicant, 
in the form approved by the Commissioner. 

    ”. 

5. Regulation 7 amended 

  Regulation 7(3)(h) is amended by deleting subparagraph (iv) 
and inserting the following subparagraph instead —  

“     
 (iv) for each partner of the firm — a 

summary of the current policy of 
professional indemnity insurance that 
covers the partner, in the form approved 
by the Commissioner. 

    ”. 

6. Regulation 8 amended 

  Regulation 8(3)(f) is amended by deleting subparagraph (iv) and 
inserting the following subparagraph instead —  

“     
 (iv) a summary of the current policy of 

professional indemnity insurance that 
covers the body corporate, in the form 
approved by the Commissioner. 

    ”. 

7. Regulation 17 amended 

  Regulation 17(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “Subject to subregulation (3), the” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    The    ”; 



2040 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2008 

 

 (b) in the Table to the subregulation, item 2, by deleting “or 
a Diploma of Lending” and inserting instead —  

“     
  , a Diploma of Lending or a Diploma of Financial 

Services (Lending), 
    ”. 

8. Regulation 18 amended 

  Regulation 18(2) is amended by deleting “Subject to 
subregulation (3), the” and inserting instead — 

  “    The    ”. 

9. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 Form 1 is amended by deleting “complaint” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    prosecution notice    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

FISHERIES 

FI301* 

Fish Resources Management Act 1994 

Fish Resources Management Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Fish Resources Management 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2008. 



27 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2041 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Fish Resources 
Management Regulations 1995. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 Part 3 item 3 is deleted and the following item is 
inserted instead —  

“     
3. Managed fishery licence fees  

 (1) Abalone Managed Fishery, the sum obtained by 
multiplying the total kg of entitlement conferred 
by the licence (but excluding any entitlement 
transferred to or from the licence under 
section 141 of the Act) by the fee for each kg, as 
follows — 

 

 (a) for greenlip abalone, per kg .......................... 10.62 

 (b) for brownlip abalone, per kg ......................... 10.62 

 (c) for Roe’s abalone, per kg .............................. 3.30 

 (2) Abrolhos Islands and Mid West Trawl Managed 
Fishery, per gear unit .............................................. 

 
5 971.00 

 (3) Broome Prawn Managed Fishery ............................ 8 504.00 

 (4) Cockburn Sound (Crab) Managed Fishery, per pot  27.29 

 (5) Cockburn Sound (Fish Net) Managed Fishery ....... 815.00 

 (6) Cockburn Sound (Line and Pot) Managed Fishery  119.00 

 (7) Cockburn Sound (Mussel) Managed Fishery .......... 122.00 

 (8) Esperance Rock Lobster Managed Fishery, per pot  61.93 

 (9) Exmouth Gulf Prawn Managed Fishery .................... 22 562.00 

 (10) Kimberley Gillnet and Barramundi Managed 
Fishery, per boat ...................................................... 

 
2 466.00 

 (11) Kimberley Prawn Managed Fishery —   

 (a) for a Class 1 licence ..................................... 945.00 

 (b) for a Class 2 licence ..................................... 945.00 

 (c) for a Class 3 licence ..................................... 5 000.00 

 (12) Marine Aquarium Fish Managed Fishery —   

 (a) for an individual ........................................... 955.00 

 (b) for a body corporate ..................................... 955.00 

 (13) Nickol Bay Prawn Managed Fishery ...................... 3 592.00 

 (14) Northern Demersal Scalefish Fishery —   

 (a) for an “A” class licence ............................... 17.00 

 (b) for a “B” class licence, per unit of 
entitlement ................................................... 

 
62.45 

 (15) Onslow Prawn Managed Fishery —   

 (a) for an “A” class licence ............................... 10 404.00 

 (b) for a “B” class licence .................................. 3 663.00 



2042 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2008 

 

 (c) for a “C” class licence .................................. 122.00 

 (d) for a “D” class licence ................................. 122.00 

 (16) Pilbara Fish Trawl Interim Managed Fishery, per fish 
trawl unit .................................................................. 

 
8.25 

 (17) Pilbara Trap Managed Fishery, per trap unit .......... 6.95 

 (18) Shark Bay Beach Seine and Mesh Net Managed 
Fishery, per fishing unit .......................................... 

 
2 748.00 

 (19) Shark Bay Prawn Managed Fishery ........................ 34 978.00 

 (20) Shark Bay Scallop Managed Fishery —  

 (a) for a class A boat, per boat .......................... 19 816.00 

 (b) for a class B boat, per boat ........................... 2 569.00 

 (21) Shark Bay Snapper Managed Fishery, per unit ....... 15.47 

 (22) South Coast Estuarine Managed Fishery ................ 1 163.00 

 (23) South Coast Purse Seine Managed Fishery, the 
sum obtained by multiplying the number of units 
of entitlement determined in accordance with that 
management plan, conferred by the licence by the 
fee for each unit as follows — 

 

 (a) for zone 1 ..................................................... 18.32 

 (b) for zone 2 ..................................................... 25.56 

 (c) for zone 3 ..................................................... 54.87 

 (d) for zone 4 ..................................................... 105.16 

 (24) South Coast Salmon Managed Fishery, per team.... 1 268.00 

 (25) South West Coast Salmon Managed Fishery, per 
team ......................................................................... 

 
624.00 

 (26) South West Trawl Managed Fishery —   

 (a) for zone A .................................................... 955.00 

 (b) for zone B .................................................... 955.00 

 (c) for zone A and B .......................................... 955.00 

 (d) for zone B and C .......................................... 955.00 

 (e) for zone B and D .......................................... 955.00 

 (27) Specimen Shell Managed Fishery ........................... 1 030.00 

 (28) Warnbro Sound (Crab) Managed Fishery ............... 1 083.00 

 (29) West Coast (Beach Bait Fish Net) Managed 
Fishery ..................................................................... 

 
277.00 

 (30) West Coast Demersal Gillnet and Demersal 
Longline Interim Managed Fishery, per unit .......... 

 
63.01 

 (31) West Coast Purse Seine Managed Fishery............... 2 164.00 

 (32) West Coast Rock Lobster Managed Fishery, per 
unit .......................................................................... 

 
147.00 

 (33) Windy Harbour-Augusta Rock Lobster Managed 
Fishery, per pot ....................................................... 

 
46.67 

    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

 



27 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2043 

 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 

Local Government Act 1995 

Broomehill-Tambellup District Order 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council on the recommendation of 
the Minister for Local Government. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Broomehill-Tambellup District Order 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  This order comes into operation as follows: 

 (a) clauses 1 and 2 — on the day on which this order is 
published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the order — on the day after that day. 

3. Terms used in this Order 

  In this order — 

 “Act” means the Local Government Act 1995; 

 “new district” means the district declared, named and 
designated under clause 5; 

 “new shire” means the local government of the new district; 

 “poll day 2008” means — 

 (a) 18 October 2008; or 

 (b) if another day for the holding of polls is fixed under 
section 4.7(2) of the Act — 

 (i) for all local governments; or 

 (ii) for the new shire, or for local governments, or 
a class of local governments including the 
new shire, 

  that other day. 

4. Districts abolished 

  The districts named Broomehill and Tambellup are abolished on 
1 July 2008. 



2044 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2008 

 

5. District declared 

 (1) As from and including 1 July 2008 the area of the State 
described in Schedule 1 is declared to be a district. 

 (2) The district is named Broomehill-Tambellup. 

 (3) The district is designated a shire. 

6. District divided into wards 

 (1) The new district is divided into 2 wards. 

 (2) The 2 wards are named as follows —  

 (a) North Ward; 

 (b) South Ward. 

 (3) The boundaries of the 2 wards are set out in Schedule 2. 

7. Councillors for the new shire 

 (1) The number of offices of councillor on the council of the new 
shire is 9. 

 (2) The number of offices of councillor for each ward is as 
follows —  

 (a) for the North Ward — 4; 

 (b) for the South Ward — 5. 

8. How first president is to be elected 

  The first president of the new shire is to be elected by the 
council of the new shire from among the councillors under 
Schedule 2.3 Division 1 of the Act. 

9. Polling day for inaugural election 

  Any poll needed for the elections to be held under section 4.2 of 
the Act to elect the councillors of the first council of the new 
shire is to be held on poll day 2008. 

10. Terms of office of new councillors 

  The terms of the councillors elected to the first council of the 
new shire must be determined in accordance with section 4.78 
of the Act and be such that the shire’s first election year is 2009. 

11. Commissioner for the new shire appointed 

 (1) Janet Grimoldby of 10 Beagle Street, Mosman Park, is 
appointed to be commissioner of the new shire. 

 (2) The appointment made by this clause takes effect on 1 July 
2008 and ends when the offices of members of the council of 
the new shire are filled for the first time and the council holds 
its first meeting. 



27 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2045 

 

12. Statutory appointments continued 

  If immediately before 1 July 2008 a person holds an 
appointment made under a written law by the Shire of 
Broomehill or the Shire of Tambellup for the purpose of 
enforcing or administering that written law, then on 1 July 2008 
the person is to be taken to have been appointed by the new 
shire under that law for those purposes. 

13. Plan for the future, Act s. 5.56 modified 

  The new shire is not required to prepare a plan under 
section 5.56 of the Act in the financial year ending on 30 June 
2009. 

 
Schedule 1 — Broomehill-Tambellup district boundaries 

[cl. 5] 

  The Broomehill-Tambellup district is the area of the State that, 
immediately before 1 July 2008, comprised the districts named 
Broomehill and Tambellup. 

 

Schedule 2 — Ward boundaries 
[cl. 6] 

1. North Ward 

  The North Ward is the area of the State that, immediately before 
1 July 2008, was in the district named Broomehill. 

2. South Ward 

  The South Ward is the area of the State that, immediately before 
1 July 2008, was in the district named Tambellup. 

As recommended by the Local Government Advisory Board, 
I recommend that the orders in clauses 4 to 7 be made. 

 

 

LJILJANNA RAVLICH, Minister for Local Government. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 



2046 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2008 

 

WORKCOVER 

WC301* 

Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation Fund Act 1980 

Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation Fund 
Amendment and Repeal Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Employers’ Indemnity 
Supplementation Fund Amendment and Repeal 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) regulation 3 — on the day after that day; 

 (c) regulation 4 — on 26 June 2008. 

3. Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation Fund 
Regulations 2001 amended 

 (1) The amendments in this regulation are to the Employers’ 
Indemnity Supplementation Fund Regulations 2001. 

 (2) Regulation 2 is amended by deleting “25 June 2009” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    25 June 2008    ”. 

4. Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation Fund 
Regulations 2001 repealed 

  The Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation Fund 
Regulations 2001 are repealed. 

 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 



27 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2047 

 

— PART 2 — 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401 

CHARITABLE COLLECTIONS ACT 1946 

REVOCATION OF LICENCES 
I, Anne Driscoll, being the officer delegated by the Minister administering the Charitable Collections 
Act 1946, and acting in the exercise of the powers conferred by subsection (3) of section 12 of that Act, 
hereby give notice that I have revoked the licence of the organisations listed below— 

 • Alister McLean Foundation Inc 

 • Bone Marrow Donor Institute Limited 

Dated this 15th day of May 2007. 

ANNE DRISCOLL, Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 

HEALTH 

HE401* 

MEDICAL ACT 1894 

MEDICAL (UNMET AREA OF NEED) DETERMINATION (NO. 8) 2008 

Made by the Minister for Health pursuant to section 11AF of the Medical Act 1894. 

Citation 

1. This determination may be cited as the Medical (Unmet Area of Need) Determination (No. 8) 2008.  

Commencement 

2. This determination comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government 
Gazette.  

Unmet area of need 

3. The area of need specified in the Schedule is determined to be an unmet area of need for the 
purposes of section 11AF(1)D of the Act.  

Expiry of determination  

4. This determination expires two years after its commencement.  

Schedule 

General Medical Services in the suburb of Joondalup in the City of Joondalup. 

Dated this 21st day of May 2008. 

JIM McGINTY MLA, Minister for Health. 



2048 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2008 

 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
SHIRE OF EXMOUTH 

APPOINTMENT 
It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed, under the 
provisions of the following for the municipality of the Shire of Exmouth. 

Local Government Act 1995 
Helga Jane Mowat 

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960—Authorised Officer & Pound Keeper 
Helga Jane Mowat 

Dog Act 1976—Authorised Officer & Registration Officer 
Helga Jane Mowat 

Litter Act 1979 
Helga Jane Mowat 

Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978 
Helga Jane Mowat 

Bush Fires Act 1954 
Helga Jane Mowat 

Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995 
Helga Jane Mowat 

Shire of Exmouth Local Laws  
 — Activities on Thoroughfares and Trading in Thoroughfares and Public Places Local Law 
 — Local Government Property Local Law 
 — Dogs Local Law 
 — Local Law Cat Control 
 — Local Laws Relating to Parking 
 — Local Laws Relating to the Exmouth Public Cemetery 
Helga Jane Mowat 
The appointment of Felix McQuistan is hereby revoked. 

P. J. ANASTASAKIS, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LG402* 
HEALTH ACT 1911 

City of Bunbury 
FEES AND CHARGES 

Notice is hereby given that pursuant to its powers under Section 344C of the Health Act 1911 (as 
amended), the Council of the City of Bunbury resolved at its meeting of 13 May 2008 to fix the 
following fees effective from 1 July 2008— 
 1. City of Bunbury (Eating-houses) Local Laws 2000— 
  Registration of an Eating-house ............................................................................................ $290 
  Renewal of an Eating-house Registration .......................................................... $290 per annum 
  Eating-house Proprietor’s License ........................................................................................... $54 
  Renewal of an Eating-house Proprietor’s License ................................................ $54 per annum 
 2. City of Bunbury Health Local Laws Part 8—Lodging-houses— 
  Registration of a Lodging-house for less than 100 lodgers ...................................................... $91 
  Renewal of Lodging-house Registration for less than 100 lodgers....................... $91 per annum 
  Registration of a Lodging-house for 100 or more lodgers ...................................................... $242 
  Renewal of Lodging-house Registration for 100 or more lodgers ....................... $242 per annum 

DAVID SMITH, Mayor. 
GREG TREVASKIS, Chief Executive Officer. 



27 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2049 

 

LG403* 

SHIRE OF LAKE GRACE 

AUTHORISED OFFICERS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed as 
Authorised Officers in accordance with the relevant acts hereunder and are effective immediately— 

(1) Local Government Act 1995, Part 3, Division 3, Subdivision 2, certain provisions about land—
s3.24— 

Jim Fraser 

Mark Burbridge 

(2) Local Government Act 1995, Part 3, Division 3, power of entry—s3.28 & 3.29— 

Phil Gough 

(3) Local Government Act 1995, Part 3, Division 3, Subdivision 4 Impounding goods involved in 
certain contraventions—s3.39— 

Jim Fraser 

Phil Gough 

(4) Local Government Act 1995, Part 9, Division 2, Subdivision 1, Miscellaneous provisions about 
enforcement—s9.10, s9.11 and s9.15; and Control of Vehicles (Off-Road Areas) Act 1978—s37— 

Jim Fraser 
Mark Burbridge 

Phil Gough 

(5) Local Government Act 1995, Part 9, Division 2, Subdivisions 1 & 2, Miscellaneous provisions 
about enforcement and infringement notices—s9.13, s9.16 and s9.17— 

Jim Fraser 
Mark Burbridge 

Phil Gough 

(6) Local Government Act 1995, Part 9, Division 2, Subdivision 2, Miscellaneous provisions about 
enforcement—s9.19 and s9.20— 

Jim Fraser 

(7) Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960—s449 establishment of pounds and 
appointment of pound keepers and rangers— 

Wayne Trawinski (Pound Keeper) 

Gary Seward (Pound Keeper) 
Phil Gough (Great Southern Ranger Services) 

(8) Dog Act 1976—Registration Officers 
Jim Fraser 
Mark Burbridge 

Danielle Robertson 
Rysha Bird 

Jessica De Burgh 
Phil Gough 

(9) Health Act 1911—s27 Appointment of Environmental Health Officer 
Maurice Walsh 

(10) Bush Fires Act 1954—s59 (2)(a) and (3)—Issue of infringement notices, Council Delegation—
Other 03 

Mark Burbridge 
Phil Gough 

(11) Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995—s17 Authorised Persons 
Maurice Walsh 

Phil Gough 

All previous authorisations relating to the above are cancelled. 

JIM FRASER, Chief Executive Officer. 



2050 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2008 

 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT 1140/57 
Lake Road, Champion Lakes 

Approved Amendment 
File: 833-2-22-65 
The Minister for Planning and Infrastructure has approved, as advertised, the abovementioned 
amendment to the Metropolitan Region Scheme. The amendment is shown on Western Australian 
Planning Commission plan 3.2088 and is effective from the date of publication of this notice in the 
Government Gazette. 
Copies of the amendment and the accompanying report on submissions are available for public 
inspection from Tuesday, 27 May 2008 to Friday, 27 June 2008 at the following locations— 

 • Western Australian Planning Commission, Wellington Street, Perth 
 • J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 
 • Municipal office of the City of Armadale 
Documents are also available from the WAPC’s website www.wapc.wa.gov.au. 

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

 

 

——————————— 
 
 

PI402* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Gingin 

Town Planning Scheme No. 8—Scheme Amendment No. 91 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Gingin’s Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 6 May 2008, for the purpose of— 

 1.  Adding a new definition to Appendix 1—Interpretation for ‘Landfill Site’; and 
 2. Amending Table 1—Zoning Table to include the Land Use Class ‘Landfill Site’ and cross 

referenced in the Zoning Table to each zone with in the Scheme as a “Use Not Permitted”. 

 S. D. FRASER, Chief Executive Officer. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 
Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Gaetano Mandosio, late of 37 George Road, Geraldton, Western Australia, Investor (“the deceased”). 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect to the estate of the deceased who died on the 18th October 2007 are required by the Executors 
John Mandosio and Gay O’Neill of care of Clifton Tham Commercial Law & Litigation of PO Box 
1587, Osborne Park WA 6916 to send particulars of their claims to them by no later than Monday 
30 June 2008 after which date the Executors may distribute the assets having regard only to the 
claims on hand. 



27 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2051 

 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 
Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Estate of the late June Leslie Parkin of Unit 1, 10 Widdicombe Street, Myaree, Western Australia. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the Estate of the above-named deceased who died on 9 April 2008 are required to send 
particulars of their claim to the Executor, care of Taylor Linfoot & Holmes (see address below) within 
1 month of the date of publication of this notice after which date the Executor may convey or 
distribute the assets having regard only to claims of which notice has been given. 
C/- Taylor Linfoot & Holmes, 
GPO Box 2586, 
Perth WA 6001. 
Telephone: (08) 9486 9197 
Ref: AJL:KT:SAXG0801 
 
 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

FAIR TRADING (RETIREMENT VILLAGES 
CODE) REGULATIONS 2006 

*Price: $9.45 counter sales 
Plus postage on 120 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

 
WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Loose Leaf Version 
(Including Index) 

 
$64.70 (incl. Amendments Nos. 1 & 2) 

Green Binder is an additional $17.20 if required 
(Prices include GST) 

Available from: 

State Law Publisher 

10 William Street, Perth 

Telephone: 9321 7688 

Fax: 9321 7536 
sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 

Web: www.slp.wa.gov.au 



2052 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2008 

 

 

PERTH OBSERVATORY 

 

THE W.A. SPECIALISTS IN 
ASTRONOMICAL 

RESEARCH & EDUCATIONAL 
ASTRONOMY 

Public Tours (day and night) 
Field Nights, Lectures 

Astronomical Information 

Astronomical Handbook 
Sun rise & set; Moon rise & set 

Legal advice 
Chronometer calibration 
Astronomical souvenirs 

SERVING WESTERN AUSTRALIA SINCE 1896 

WALNUT ROAD, BICKLEY 6076 
TELEPHONE 9293 8255  FAX 9293 8138 

ASTRONOMY IS L KING UP 



27 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2053 

 

 

Order your Bound Volumes of 
Government Gazette 2008 

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette 

 

For Government Departments and 
private firms who require bound copies 
of Government Gazettes, the State Law 
Publisher offers a subscription covering 
4 Quarterly Volumes at a cost of 
$1,138.50. 

The Gazettes will be bound in black 
cloth with gold foil lettering on the 
spine and personalised by  the addition 
of the client's name in gold lettering on 
the front cover. 

 

PLEASE NOTE 
On the rare occasion where extra 
gazettes are published in one quarter, a 
fifth volume may be required. In this 
instance the extra cost involved will be 
borne by the State Law Publisher and 
not passed on to clients. 

 
 

For further information please contact: 

State Law Publisher 

Telephone: 9321 7688 



2054 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2008 

 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2008 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2008. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically on any day. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 918.50
  Interstate  ..................................... 935.00

 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,138.50
 
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 441.00
  Interstate ...................................... 525.00
 
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 871.20
  Interstate ................................... 1,064.80
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 859.10
  Interstate ...................................... 872.30
 

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 310.20 
  Interstate ....................................... 345.40 
  Overseas ........................................ 402.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 856.90 

 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 334.40 
  Interstate ........................................ 345.40 

 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA ...................................... 459.80 
  Interstate ....................................... 481.80 

 

 

 

 
 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS 
 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at 
State Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of 
publication of the missing item. 
Claims lodged after this period will not be recognised and will attract 
payment in full. 
 
 


