2 008 00069 4 6 6

= WESTERN
s AUSTRALIAN
g GOVERNMENT t t

ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

PERTH, TUESDAY, 17 JUNE 2008 No. 94

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM
© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

CONTENTS
PART 1

Page

Armadale Redevelopment Act 2001—Armadale Redevelopment (Addition of Land to
Redevelopment Area) Regulations 2008.............ccooiiiiiiiiiiiieeiiiiiieieee e 2568
Bills of Sale Act 1899—Bills of Sale (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2008..............ccuuveeee... 2543
Builders’ Registration Act 1939—Builders’ Registration Amendment Regulations 2008...... 2545

Builders’ Registration Act 1939—Builders’ Registration Amendment Regulations (No. 2)
D201 1 USSP 2547

Credit (Administration) Act 1984—Credit (Administration) Amendment Regulations 2008 2548
Debt Collectors Licensing Act 1964—Debt Collectors Licensing Amendment Regulations

b0 L 1 USSP 2549
Electricity Act 1945—Electricity (Licensing) Amendment Regulations 2008......................... 2564
Employment Agents Act 1976—Employment Agents Amendment Regulations 2008........... 2550
Finance Brokers Control Act 1975—Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment

Regulations (INO. 2) 2008 .......cccoeiiiiuiiieieeeeeiiiiieee e e e eeeerreee e e e e e esiaraeeeeeeeessatraseeeesessesnnraaeaaeeas 2551
Gas Standards Act 1972—Gas Standards (Gasfitting and Consumer Gas Installations)

Amendment Regulations 2008............cceiviiieeiiiiieiiiieeeiiieeeerreeeestteeeeibeeeessaeeesesaeeesssaeeennns 2565

Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978—Land Valuers Licensing Amendment Regulations 2008 2566
Mines Safety and Inspection Act 1994—Mines Safety and Inspection Amendment

Regulations (INO. 2) 2008 ......cceeeeiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeiiietee e e ee ettt eeeeeesesnbareeeeeeessntbsaeeeeeessnnnnnraaeeaeeas 2567
Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973—Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment
Regulations 2008 ..........uuuuuuiuuiiiiiiiiiiiiie i aaaeaaaaaeaeaeaesaaeaeaearanes 2552
Motor Vehicle Repairers Act 2003—Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment Regulations
(IND. 2) 2008..... ettt ettt ettt et e e ettt e e et e e sttt e e e e ba e e e e abeeeeaabbee e ettt e e eaabaeeeebaeeeetbeeeeans 2554
Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984—Occupational Safety and Health Amendment
Regulations (INO. 7) 2008 .......ccceiiiiiiiiieieeeeeiciiteee e e e e e eetreee e e e e e esabaeeeeeeeessatsaseeeeeessesnnsaaeaaeeas 2573
Painters’ Registration Act 1961—Painters’ Registration Board Amendment Rules 2008..... 2556
Planning and Development Act 2005—Planning Fees Notice 2008...........cccccvvreevvieeeniiveeennnns 2570
Proclamations—Railway and Port (The Pilbara Infrastructure Pty Ltd) Agreement Act
2004—N0. TT OF 2004 ......eeiieeiiiee ettt et e ettt e e ettt e ssabt e e e sttt e e eaabaeeeeataeeeenbeeens 2543
Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003—RWWA Rules of Thoroughbred
RACING 2004 . ettt e e e ettt e e e e et e e e e e e a bt it e e e e e e eatabaaaeaeeeenanteaaeaann 2573
Real Estate and Business Agents Act 1978—Real Estate and Business Agents (General)
Amendment Regulations (IN0. 2) 2008.........cccouiiiiiiieiiiiiiiieeee et e e erirare e e e e e e svarreeee s 2557
Settlement Agents Act 1981—Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations 2008................. 2559
Trade Measurement Act 2006—Trade Measurement Amendment Regulations 2008........... 2560
Travel Agents Act 1985—Travel Agents Amendment Regulations 2008...............ccceeeeeennnnns 2562
PART 2
AGLICUITULTE 1..vviieeiiiee ettt ettt e ettt e e et e e st e e ettt e e esataeaesstbeeeassaeeeesssaeesssseeeansseeeasseesassseeans 2576
(0S40 1S 7Y o 1= TP SRR PPPRP 2577
Consumer and Employment Protection ...........cccceecviriiriiiieieiiieeesiieeeeiieeeeieeeesveeeesaveeeeseneas 2578
Deceased ESLALES .uviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee e e e e e e ettt e e e e e e e e nbnbeaeeennnnnes 2582
L0CAl GOVETIIIMENT .......iiiiiiiie ettt et e ettt e e ettt e et e e e e bbeeeesabaeeesnnbeeeesabeeenaes 2579
Planning and INfraStruCture .........ccviiieiiieiiiie ettt e s e e e b e e estaee e sebaeeeseraeeens 2579
POJICE .ot e e e ettt e e e e et bt e e e e e e e e tatraaeeeeeantaaeaeeeeannntes 2581

PUDLIC INOTICES ..ttt e e e e e e e e e e e e eeeeeeeeeeseseaeeeaeeeseseeeseeesesesersssssrnsees 2582




IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE

© State of Western Australia

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer,
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS

The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or
unforeseen circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published
periodically.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.
* Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.
* Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).

Delivery address:
State Law Publisher
Ground Floor,
10 William St. Perth, 6000
Telephone: 9321 7688 Fax: 9321 7536

* Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010.

* Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

WARNING — PRICE INCREASE

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS

EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2008 (Prices include GST).

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$25.60
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$59.70

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$59.70 minimum charge (except items of an

exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
Per Column Centimetre—$11.95
Bulk Notices—$218.20 per page
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.




17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2543

— PART 1 —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA301*
RAILWAY AND PORT (THE PILBARA INFRASTRUCTURE PTY LTD)
AGREEMENT ACT 2004
No. 77 of 2004
PROCLAMATION

Western Australia

By the Honourable
David Kingsley Malcolm,
Companion of the Order of Australia,
Queen’s Counsel, Lieutenant-Governor and [L.S]

deputy of the Governor of the State of

Western Australia
DAVID KINGSLEY MALCOLM
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor

I, the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, acting under the Railway
and Port (The Pilbara Infrastructure Pty Ltd) Agreement Act 2004 section 2 and with

the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix 1 July 2008 as the day on which
Part 3 of that Act comes into operation.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 4 June 2008.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

A. MacTIERNAN, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure.

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION

CE301*

Bills of Sale Act 1899

Bills of Sale (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Bills of Sale (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2008.



2544

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Bills of Sale
(Fees) Regulations 1983.

Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3 is amended as follows:

(a) inparagraph (a) by deleting “28.00” and inserting
instead —
“ 2900

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “12.00” and inserting
instead —
“ 1240 7

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “15.00” and inserting
instead —
“ 1550 7

(d) in paragraph (d) by deleting “27.00” and inserting
instead —
“ 28.00 7

(e) in paragraph (e) by deleting “24.00” and inserting
instead —
“ 2480 7

(f) in paragraph (e) by deleting “4.00” and inserting
instead —
“ 415 7.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2545

CE302*

Builders’ Registration Act 1939

Builders’ Registration Amendment
Regulations 2008

Made by the Builders’ Registration Board of Western Australia and
approved by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations are the Builders’ Registration Amendment
Regulations 2008.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations —
(1) on 1 July2008; or

(i) if these regulations are published in the Gazette
on a later day, on that day.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Builders’
Registration Regulations.

4. Second Appendix replaced

The Second Appendix is repealed and the following Appendix
is inserted instead —

13

Second Appendix — Fees

Item no. Description of circumstance Fee
section/ $
regulation
1. s.4(la) On an application, by an unregistered person,
r. 8A for an authorisation to construct a specified
building 264
2. s.9(6)(a) To obtain from the registrar a list of the

names and addresses of all persons registered
in the register 33



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

17 June 2008

Item no. Description of circumstance Fee
section/ $
regulation
3. 5.9(6)(b) To obtain from the registrar a certificate as to
the registration or non-registration of a named
person on a specific date or during a specific
period 20
4. s.9A(1)(e)  For an individual who is an architect,
engineer etc. with 5 years experience to be
registered under the Act 254
5. s. 10(1)(a) For an individual to be registered under
the Act 254
6. s.10(2)(a) For a partnership to be registered under
r. 8B(2) the Act 191
7. s.10(2)(a) For a company or other body corporate to be
r. 8C(2) registered under the Act 254
8. s.22(1) For the issue of a certificate of registration
r. 8(6) (Form No. 3) 27
9. s.24(1)() On an application for a temporary licence —
r. 15(2) (a) for an individual 238
(b) for a partnership 326
(c) for a company or other body
corporate 740

The Common Seal of the )
Builders’ Registration Board )

of Western Australia was )
affixed in the presence of )
MARK CUOMO

KIM FARE

Approved by the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




17 June 2008

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2547

CE303*

Builders’ Registration Amendment Regulations

Builders’ Registration Act 1939

(No. 2) 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1.

13

Citation

These regulations are the Builders’ Registration Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2008.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations —

(1) immediately after the Builders’ Registration
Amendment Regulations 2008 regulation 4
comes into operation; or

(i) if these regulations are published in the Gazette
on a day that is later than the day on which the
Builders’ Registration Amendment
Regulations 2008 regulation 4 comes into
operation — that later day.

The regulations amended

The amendment in these regulations is to the Builders’
Registration Regulations.

Second Appendix amended

The Second Appendix is amended by inserting after item 9 the
following item —

10. s.34A On a complaint or application to the Disputes
r. 19 Tribunal —

(a) by a financially disadvantage person 19
(b) by any other person 31

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



2548

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

CE304*

Credit (Administration) Act 1984

Credit (Administration) Amendment
Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations are the Credit (Administration) Amendment
Regulations 2008.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Credit
(Administration) Regulations 19835.

Regulation 4 amended

Regulation 4(1)(b) is amended by deleting “$600 and shall not
exceed $20 000.” and inserting instead —

“ $620 and shall not exceed $23 000. .

Regulation 7 amended

Regulation 7(1) is amended by deleting “$425 and shall not
exceed $20 000.” and inserting instead —

“ $440 and shall not exceed $23 000. .

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2549

CE305*

Debt Collectors Licensing Act 1964

Debt Collectors Licensing Amendment
Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations are the Debt Collectors Licensing Amendment
Regulations 2008.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Debt Collectors
Licensing Regulations 1964.

4. Regulation 4 amended

Regulation 4 is amended by deleting “450” and inserting
instead —

“ 470 7.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




2550

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

CE306*

Employment Agents Act 1976

Employment Agents Amendment
Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1.

13

Citation

These regulations are the Employment Agents Amendment
Regulations 2008.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Employment
Agents Regulations 1976.

Regulation 10 amended

Regulation 10(1) is amended by deleting the Table and inserting
instead —

Table
$

Grant of a general licence for a period not exceeding
the prescribed period .........cccccvevverciieceiieeeere e 1323.00
Renewal of a general licence for a period not exceeding
the prescribed period .........ccocvvevverciieceiieeeee e 987.00
Grant of a restricted licence for a period not exceeding
the prescribed period .........ccoccvevierciieceiieeeee e 1323.00
Renewal of a restricted licence for a period not
exceeding the prescribed period .........ccoeevvevvveriecivenennne, 987.00
Renewal of a general or a restricted licence for a period
OF 3 YOATS ..vievieeieceieeieee ettt 987.00
Application for an interim licence .........c..ccccevcereerrnnnee. 32.50

Duplicate liCENCe ........ccvevveeciieriieiienieseeree e 55.00



17 June 2008

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2551

Application for transfer of licence under section 19(6)
Of the ACt ..o 62.00

The penalty prescribed under section 13(2) of the Act
for any late application for the renewal of a licence is
25% of the fee due for the granting of that renewal.

Inspection of record under section 51 of the Act ........... 12.50
Inspection of the Register .........cccovcvvecivrienieerieeieeienne, 24.60

Copy (certified or uncertified) of an individual
registration in the Register —

FITSE PAZE vvevveeeveeeee et 24.60
each subsequent page .........cccocveveervencieniencieeieeen, 5.00

Copy (certified or uncertified) of all registrations in the
T 4 ] < TR 317.20

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

CE307*

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Finance Brokers Control Act 1975

Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment

Regulations (No. 2) 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations are the Finance Brokers Control (General)
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.



2552 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008
3. The regulations amended
The amendments in these regulations are to the Finance Brokers
Control (General) Regulations 2005.
4. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended in items 1, 2, 3 and 4 by deleting “750”
in each place where it occurs and inserting instead —

“ 1000 .

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

CE308*

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment

Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations are the Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing)
Amendment Regulations 2008.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Motor Vehicle
Dealers (Licensing) Regulations 1974.



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2553

4. Third Schedule replaced

The Third Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

13

Third Schedule — Fees
[r. 7]

1. Application for a dealer’s licence or renewal of a
dealer’s licence for the period prescribed by
regulation 6A —

(a) ifthe dealer only specifies single premises to be
authorised under section 20E(5) in relation to the
JICENICE .t 1 380.00

(b) if the dealer specifies 2 or more premises to be
authorised under section 20E(5) ......ccovevvivrvennnnnn. 690.00

plus

in respect of each further premises to be
authorised under section 20E(5) in relation to
the licence, a further .........coocvvvivviieiiiieeiiiee s 690.00

2. Application under section 20F in respect of alteration
OF PIEIMISES ..veeeevieeeiiieiieeiieeieeeeereeetee e eaeeeae e e reeeeaeas 116.00

3. Application under section 20F in respect of each added
PIEIMISES ..vveeevreeiieeeieeereeeeeesreesereeesereeseeessseesseeesssesssnes 690.00

Application for a temporary permit under section 20H 46.00

5. Application for yard manager’s licence or renewal of
yard manager’s licence for the period prescribed by
1eUIAtION OA ....cveeiieiieiieie e e e 353.00

6. Application for salesperson’s licence or renewal of
salesperson’s licence for the period prescribed by
regUIAtion BA .......ccoiiiiiieieete e 239.00

7. Application for car market operator’s registration or
renewal of car market operator’s registration —

(a) if the operator only specifies single premises to be
authorised under section 21A(5) in relation to the
TEEISIIALION ...vveeeevieeeiieeiieeiee e e eree e eereeeveeeeree s 1 380.00

(b) if the operator specifies 2 or more premises to be
authorised under section 21A(5) in relation to the
TEGISIIALION ..veevvieereieereieeeeie e e seeeeeeseeesene e e 690.00
plus

in respect of each further premises to be
authorised under section 21A(5) in relation to the

registration, a further .............ccoevvevieiienieiiecnens 690.00
8. Application under section 21B in respect of alteration
OF PIEIMISES ..evviierieeiiiecieecie et ere e ereeesreeeevee e 116.00

9. Application under section 21B in respect of each added
PIEIMISES ..vveeerreeeieerieeereeeeeeetreesereeessreeseeensseesseeenssessnses 690.00

10.  Application for certificate of exemption from the Act
under section 31(1) ..eevvvereiieiiieeieeeeeee e 116.00

11.  Application for temporary authorisation under
section 16(2) O 17(2) cocveeveeeiieeie e 46.00



2554 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

$
12.  Individual dealer — change to firm ..........c.ccceevevvennnnne. 116.00
13. Individual dealer — change to body corporate .............. 116.00
14.  Firm — change to sole proprietor ...........cccceeeevveeeveeennnn. 116.00
15. Firm — change to body corporate ............ccceevervveruvennnene 116.00
16. Body corporate change to individual or firm ................ 116.00
17.  Duplicate liCence ........ccevverieerierieeieeieeie e sve e 37.00
18.  Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of an
individual registration in the register kept under
section 24 of the Act —
FITSE PAZE vveveveereeeeeere e 16.80
each subsequent page .........cccocceevvveveereeneenne 3.35
19. Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of all
registrations in the register kept under section 24 of
ThE ACE i 214.00
20. Inspection of register kept under section 24 of the Act 16.80

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

CE309*

Motor Vehicle Repairers Act 2003

Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2008.



17 June 2008

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2555

2.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Motor Vehicle
Repairers Regulations 2007.

Regulation 7 amended

Regulation 7 is amended by deleting “$65.” and inserting
instead —

“ $67.50. 7.

Regulation 10 amended

Regulation 10 is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$15;” and inserting
instead —

“ $16.80; 7
(b) in paragraph (b)(i) —
(1) by deleting “$15” and inserting instead —

“ $16.80 7
(i) by deleting “$3” and inserting instead —
“ $335 7
(c) in paragraph (b)(ii) by deleting “$190.” and inserting
instead —
“ 8214, .

Regulation 11 amended

Regulation 11 is amended by deleting “$33.” and inserting
instead —

173 $37 n.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




2556

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

CE310*

Painters’ Registration Act 1961

Painters’ Registration Board Amendment
Rules 2008

Made by Painters’ Registration Board and approved by the Lieutenant-
Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These rules are the Painters’ Registration Board Amendment
Rules 2008.

2. Commencement

These rules come into operation as follows:

(a) rules 1 and 2 — on the day on which these rules are
published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the rules —
(1) on 1 July 2008; or

(i1) if these rules are published in the Gazette on a
later day, on that day.

3. The rules amended

The amendments in these rules are to the Painters’ Registration
Board Rules 1962.

4. Third Appendix replaced

The Third Appendix is repealed and the following Appendix is
inserted instead —

Third Appendix

Fees

The following fees are prescribed for the purpose of these rules —

$
For eXxamination ........ccccceeeerieiieniieieeie e 6.30
For application for registration —
COMPANIES ...veevvrereeieeriiesrireeereesieesseesseesseessnesseesseesssessenssessses 114.00
INdividuals .....ccoooiieieiee e 114.00

Partnerships ......oceevveeeieieiieieecee et 88.00



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2557

$
For annual registration fee —
COMPANIES ....vvieereeerieeiieeieesreesreeetreesteeesreesraeessseeesseessseessses 326.00
INdividuals .....ccoooiieieee e 217.00
Partnerships .......ccocveveerieerieeiecieee e 135.00
For any CertifiCate .........cccvuveverrieerieniesieree e 10.50

Passed by a resolution of the Painters’ Registration Board at a meeting
held on 13th May 2008.

The Common Seal of )
the Painters’ Registration )
Board was affixed at the )
time of the resolution in )
the presence of )

MARK CUOMO, Chairman.

KIM FARE, Secretary.

Approved by the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

CE311%

Real Estate and Business Agents Act 1978

Real Estate and Business Agents (General)
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Real Estate and Business Agents
(General) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008.



2558

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

17 June 2008

2. Commencement
These regulations come into operation as follows:
(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;
(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
3. The regulations amended
The amendments in these regulations are to the Real Estate and
Business Agents (General) Regulations 1979.
4. Regulation 4A amended
Regulation 4A(1) is amended by deleting “13” and inserting
instead —
(13 1 1 ’9'
5. Schedule 1 replaced
Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —
Schedule 1 — Fees
[r. 4 and 4A]
$
1. Application for liCeNnce .........cccveevverrineerreeiieie e 60
2. Grant of licence to natural person ............ceceeeeververenenne. 628
3. Grant of licence to firm ..........ccceeveveeeiienciie e, 822
4. Grant of licence to body corporate ...........ccceeevveeveennennne. 822
5. Renewal of triennial certificate ...........cccccveevvvevvienieennnnn. 404
6. Grant of certificate of registration ............ccecveveervenennne. 162
7. Renewal of certificate of registration ..............cceeven.ne. 132
8. Inspection of @ regiSter .......ceeevvievciieerieeieeece e, 10
9. Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of an
individual registration —
FIFSE PAGE .vveeevieeie ettt e 20
cach subsequent page .........cccoeveevveevieveecreecieseennenn 2
10.  Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of all
registrations in @ reZISTET ......ccveeeeveeerereerreeereeeeeeeen v e 278
11.  For the purposes of section 30(2a) (the holding fee) ..... 190

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2559

CE312*

Settlement Agents Act 1981

Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations are the Settlement Agents Amendment
Regulations 2008.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Settlement
Agents Regulations 1982.

4. Regulation 6 amended

Regulation 6(1) is amended by inserting after
“clause 1(1)(a)” —

“ of the Act ”.
5. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended as follows:

(a) initem 1 by deleting “580” and inserting instead —

(13 628 9’;

(b) initem 2 by deleting “760 and inserting instead —
(13 822 9,;

(c) initem 3 by deleting “760” and inserting instead —
(13 822 9,;

(d) initem 4 by deleting “375” and inserting instead —
(13 404 9’;



2560

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

(e) initem 7 by deleting “122” and inserting instead —
“ 134 7.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

CE313*

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Trade Measurement Act 2006

Trade Measurement Amendment
Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1.

(1)

Citation

These regulations are the Trade Measurement Amendment
Regulations 2008.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Trade
Measurement Regulations 2007.

Regulation 111 amended

Regulation 111(2)(a) is amended by deleting “$9.50” and
inserting instead —

“ $9.80 ™.



17 June 2008

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2561

13

(2)

10.

Regulation 111(3) is amended by deleting “$9.50” and inserting
instead —

“ $9.80 ™.

Regulation 112 amended

Regulation 112(2)(a) is amended by deleting “$21.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $21.70 .

Regulation 113 amended

Regulation 113(3)(a) is amended by deleting “$21.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $21.70 .

Schedule 5 replaced

Schedule 5 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —

Schedule 5 — Application and licence fees

[r. 108]
$
Application under regulation 103 ............. ... 43.50
Application under the principal Act section 55 .......... 87.00
Periodic licence for servicing licences under the
principal Act section 64(1) ...cccoeeverenieneniieeenee, 206.00
plus an additional amount of ..........ccccceevienininienenne. 54.50
for each person who, whether as the holder of the
licence or an employee of the holder of the licence,
will under the authority conferred by the licence —
(a) test a batch of measuring instruments for the
purposes of certification or re-certification; or
(b) certify or re-certify measuring instruments.
Periodic licence for public weighbridge licences
under the principal Act section 64(1) ......ccccceveereernennee. 109.00
Public weighbridge suitability statement Combined
with fee
payable
under
item 4
Application under the principal Act section 71(1) to
amend a condition of a kind mentioned in the
principal Act section 60(2) ......cceeeveevcieerieeerieeireenne 43.50
Application under the principal Act section 73(2) ...... 43.50
Application under the principal Act section 74(2) ...... 43.50
Amended liCenCe ..........cevuevenieiiinieieneeeee e 87.00

Duplicate liCenCe .......ccveevivveiiieiieiiece e 43.50



2562 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

$

11. Inspection of register kept under the principal Act

SECHION 25 OF 59 ..ot 16.00
12. Extract of an individual registration in a register kept

under the principal Act section 25 or 59 —

(a)  for the first PAge .....ccevvvevverieeireeeeie e 16.00
(b)  for each subsequent page .........c.ccccvevverveererennen. 3.30
13. Copy of the register kept under the principal Act
SECHION 25 01 59 ..o 206.00
8. Schedule 7 amended

Schedule 7 is amended as follows:

(a) initem 1(3)(a) Column 3 by deleting “0.035” and
inserting instead —

(13 2

0.0355 7

(b) initem 2(a) Column 3 by deleting “1.5” and inserting
instead —

(13 2

1492 7

(¢) initem 2(b) Column 3 by deleting “1.5” and inserting
instead —

13 2

1.492

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

CE314*
Travel Agents Act 1985

Travel Agents Amendment Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Travel Agents Amendment
Regulations 2008.



17 June 2008

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2563

2.

(1)

(2)

€)

(1)

2)

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Travel Agents
Regulations 1986.

Regulation 6 amended

Regulation 6(1)(a) and (b) are amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “$996” and inserting instead —
“ $1030 7
(b) by deleting “$209” and inserting instead —
“ %216

Regulation 6(1)(c) is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “$1 467” and inserting instead —
“ $1517 7
(b) by deleting “$209” and inserting instead —
“ 8216

Regulation 6(2) is amended by deleting “$2 090 and inserting
instead —

“ $2160 .

Regulation 11A amended

Regulation 11A(1)(a)(i) and (ii) are amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “$666” and inserting instead —
“ $1030 7
(b) by deleting “$144” and inserting instead —
“ %216 .

Regulation 11A(2)(a) is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “$1 000” and inserting instead —
“ 81517 7
(b) by deleting “$144” and inserting instead —
“ 8216



2564 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

(3) Regulation 11A(3)(a) is amended by deleting “$1 440 and
inserting instead —

“ %2160 .

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

ENERGY

EN301*

Electricity Act 1945

Electricity (Licensing) Amendment
Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations are the Electricity (Licensing) Amendment
Regulations 2008.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Electricity
(Licensing) Regulations 1991.

4. Schedule 1 amended
Schedule 1 is amended as follows:
(a) initem 1(a) by deleting “36” and inserting instead —
13 37 9’;



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2565

(b) initem 1(b) by deleting “63” and inserting instead —

“65 7

(c) initem 1(c) by deleting “10” and inserting instead —
“15

(d) initem 1(d) by deleting “36” and inserting instead —
“ o370

(e) initem 2(a) by deleting “70” and inserting instead —
“oT2

(f) initem 2(b) by deleting “370” and inserting instead —
“ 382 7

(g) initem 2(c) by deleting “185” and inserting instead —
“ o191

(h) initem 2(g) by deleting “36” and inserting instead —
“ 37 7

(1) initem 3 by deleting “100” and inserting instead —
“ 120 .

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

EN302*

Gas Standards Act 1972

Gas Standards (Gasfitting and Consumer Gas
Installations) Amendment Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Gas Standards (Gasfitting and
Consumer Gas Installations) Amendment Regulations 2008.



2566 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Gas Standards
(Gasfitting and Consumer Gas Installations) Regulations 1999.

4. Schedule 4 amended

Schedule 4 is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “$63” and inserting instead —
Y
(b) by deleting “$350” and inserting instead —
“ 8365 .

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

LAND

LA301*

Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978

Land Valuers Licensing Amendment
Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Land Valuers Licensing Amendment
Regulations 2008.



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2567

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Land Valuers
Licensing Regulations 1979.

4. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended in items 1 and 2 by deleting “600.00” in
each place where it occurs and inserting instead —

“ 660.00 .

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM

MP301*

Mines Safety and Inspection Act 1994

Mines Safety and Inspection Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Mines Safety and Inspection
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008.



2568 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.
3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Mines Safety
and Inspection Regulations 1995.

4. Schedule 2 replaced
Schedule 2 is repealed and following Schedule is inserted
instead —
Schedule 2 — Fees
[r. 2.31 and 2.33]
Item  Description Fee ($)
1. Application for a certificate referred to in
regulation 2.31 135.00

2. Issue of a replacement certificate 135.00

2

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE

P1301*

Armadale Redevelopment Act 2001

Armadale Redevelopment (Addition of Land to
Redevelopment Area) Regulations 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council under sections 4 and 68 of the Act, following
consultation between the Minister and the council of the City of
Armadale.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Armadale Redevelopment (Addition of
Land to Redevelopment Area) Regulations 2008.



17 June 2008

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2569

2.

13

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day.
The Act amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Armadale
Redevelopment Act 2001.

Schedule 1 amended (land added)

Schedule 1 is amended, and the land known as the Forrestdale
Business Park is added to the redevelopment area, by deleting
Plan No. 2 and inserting the following plan instead —

N TN AT GNPV AN W S e =
~ SCHEDULE 1 - Redevelopment Area




2570

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

P1302*
Planning and Development Act 2005

Planning Fees Notice 2008

Made by the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure under section 20 of
the Act.

1. Citation
This notice is the Planning Fees Notice 2008.

2. Commencement

The fees set out in Schedule 1 are the fees to be charged on and
from 1 July 2008 in respect of things referred to in that Schedule.

Note: The fees set out in this notice supersede those set out in the Planning
Fees Notice 2007.

3. Forms

(1) A reference to a form in this notice refers to the WAPC form for
the particular type of application.

(2) A form referred to in this notice can be found at the web address
www.wapc.wa.gov.au under the subcategory “Applications”.

4. Payments

(1) Each relevant application fee is payable at the time the
application is lodged, and applications cannot be accepted if not
accompanied by the correct fee at the time of the application.

(2) Fees are not subject to GST and cheques should be made
payable to the Western Australian Planning Commission.

Schedule 1 — Fees
[cl. 2 and 3]

1. Calculation of fee to accompany Form 1A

Application for approval of freehold or survey-strata subdivision.




17 June 2008

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2571

Amalgamation — $966

For example: an application proposing that multiple lots be
amalgamated into a single lot attracts an application fee of 3966.

2 or more lots (up to and including 100 lots) — $1 339 and $31
per lot.

For example: where 5 lots are proposed, the application fee is $1 339
plus $155 (5 lots multiplied by $31), which totals $1 494.

101 or more lots — $4 440 and $10.30 per lot in excess of 100 lots.

For example: where 105 lots are proposed, the application fee is
84 440 plus 351.50 (5 lots multiplied by $10.30), which totals
$4 491.50.

Note: Each common property lot is counted as one lot. Areas reserved
for the purpose of a pedestrian access way, right of way, truncation,
road widening, drainage reserve or recreation reserve are not
counted as lots.

Calculation of fee to accompany Form 2A

Amended plan/s for application for approval of freehold or
survey-strata subdivision.

Amalgamation — $641

For example: amended plans for an application proposing that
multiple lots be amalgamated into a single lot attracts an application

fee of $641.

2 or more lots (up to and including 100 lots) — $951 and $20.70
per lot.

For example: amended plans where 5 lots are proposed, the
application fee is 3951 plus 8103.50 (5 lots multiplied by 320.70),
which totals $1 054.50.

101 or more lots — $3 019 and $3.10 per lot in excess of 100 lots.

For example: amended plans where 105 lots are proposed, the
application fee is 33 019 plus $15.50 (5 lots multiplied by $3.10),
which totals $3 034.50.

Note: As for the original application (Form 1A), each common property lot
is counted as one lot. Areas reserved for the purpose of a
pedestrian access way, right of way, truncation, road widening,
drainage reserve or recreation reserve are not counted as lots.

Note: Where a minor variation is made at the request of the WAPC, the
WAPC may waive some or all of the applicable fee.

Calculation of fee to accompany Form 3A

An application to the WAPC under the Planning and Development
Act 2005 section 144(1) to reconsider a refusal or under the Planning

and Development Act 2005 section 151(1) to reconsider a condition(s).

Amalgamation — $563.50

For example: reconsideration of an application proposing that
multiple lots be amalgamated into a single lot attracts an application
fee of $563.50.



2572 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

2 or more lots (up to and including 100 lots) — $692 and $15.50
per lot.

For example: for reconsideration of an application where 5 lots are
proposed, the application fee is $692 plus $§77.50 (5 lots multiplied
by $15.50), which totals $769.50.

101 or more lots — $2 243 and $3.10 per lot in excess of 100 lots.

For example: for reconsideration of an application where 105 lots are
proposed, the application fee is 82 243 plus $15.50 (5 lots multiplied
by 83.10), which totals $2 258.50.

Note: As for the original application (Form 1A), each common property lot
is counted as one lot. Areas reserved for the purpose of a
pedestrian access way, right of way, truncation, road widening,
drainage reserve or recreation reserve are not counted as lots.

4. Calculation of fee to accompany Form 1C

An application for endorsement of a deposited plan or survey-strata
plan.

Amalgamation — $362

For example: application for endorsement of a deposited plan or
survey-strata proposing that multiple lots be amalgamated into a
single lot attracts an application fee of $362.

2 or more lots (up to and including 100 lots) — $403 and $5.15
per lot.

For example: endorsements where 5 lots are proposed, the
application fee is 3403 plus $25.75 (5 lots multiplied by $5.15), which
totals $428.75.

101 or more lots — $920 and $3.10 per lot in excess of 100 lots.

For example: endorsements where 105 lots are proposed, the
application fee is $920 plus $15.50 (5 lots multiplied by $3.10), which
totals $935.50.

Note: As for the original application (Form 1A), each common property lot
is counted as one lot. Areas reserved for the purpose of a
pedestrian access way, right of way, truncation, road widening,
drainage reserve or recreation reserve are not counted as lots.

5. Calculation of fee to accompany Form 1B

For an application for approval by the WAPC for a proposed class of
lease/licence under the Planning and Development Act 2005
section 139 — $215.

For an application for endorsement of approval by the WAPC on an
executed class of lease/licence under the Planning and
Development Act 2005 section 139 — $26.

6. Calculation of fee to accompany Form 1D

For an application for endorsement of approval by the WAPC on an
executed lease/licence under the Planning and Development Act 2005
section 136 — $215.

A. MacTIERNAN, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure.



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2573

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RG301*
RACING AND WAGERING WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 2003
RWWA RULES OF THOROUGHBRED RACING 2004
In accordance with Section 45 (1) (a) of the Racing and Wagering Western Australia
Act 2003, notice is hereby given that the Board of Racing and Wagering WA on
16 June 2008 resolved that, the RWWA Rules of Thoroughbred Racing 2004 be
amended as follows—
Amendment to Australian Racing (National) Rules

Effective 1 August 2008
Add AR104A
Amend AR103(1), AR104

Effective 1 June 2008
Add AR22, ARS1AA, AR118AA, AR141A(2)(a)
Delete AR149

Amendment to Local Rules
Amend LR93G

A copy of the above rules may be obtained during office hours from the offices of the
Western Australian Turf Club, 70 Grandstand Road, Ascot WA or the Racing and
Wagering Western Australia website, www.rwwa.com.au.

Sgd. for R. BURT, Chief Executive Officer.

WORKSAFE

WS301*

Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984

Occupational Safety and Health Amendment
Regulations (No. 7) 2008

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Occupational Safety and Health
Amendment Regulations (No. 7) 2008.

N

Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows:

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008.



2574

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Occupational
Safety and Health Regulations 1996.

Schedule 6.1 amended

Schedule 6.1 is amended by deleting “$27.50” and inserting
instead —

“ $28.25 7.
Schedule 6.1A amended

Schedule 6.1A is amended as follows:
(a) initem 1 by deleting “$3 630 and inserting instead —

“ $3753

(b) initem 2 by deleting “$2 410” and inserting instead —
“ 82492 7

(c) initem 3 by deleting “$1 205 and inserting instead —
“ 81246 .

Schedule 6.2 amended

Schedule 6.2 is amended as follows:
(a) initem 1 by deleting “$78.00” and inserting instead —

“ $81.00
(b) initem 2 by deleting “$71.00” and inserting instead —
“ $73.00 .
Schedule 6.2A amended

Schedule 6.2A is amended by deleting “$3 723” and inserting
instead —

“ $3850 .

Schedule 6.4 amended

Schedule 6.4 is amended as follows:
(a) initems 1 and 2 by deleting “$71.00” and inserting

instead —
“ $73.00 7

(b) initem 3 by deleting “$60.00” and inserting instead —
“ $62.00 7

(¢c) initem 4 by deleting “$45.00” and inserting instead —
“ $46.50 7

(d) initem 5 by deleting “$857.00” and inserting instead —
“ $886.00



17 June 2008

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2575

(e)

(®

(2

in item 6 by deleting “$142.00” and inserting instead —
“ $147.00
in item 7 by deleting “$428.00” and inserting instead —
“$442.50 7

in items 8 and 9 by deleting “$45.00” and inserting
instead —

“ 84650 .

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




2576 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

— PART 2 —

AGRICULTURE

AG401*

PLANT DISEASES ACT 1914
APPOINTMENTS
Department of Agriculture and Food,
South Perth WA 6151.

I, the undersigned Minister for Agriculture and Food, being the Minister responsible for the
administration of the Plant Diseases Act 1914 hereby appoint the following persons as authorised
inspectors under section 7A of the Plant Diseases Act 1914 to carry out all the functions that may be
performed by an inspector under that Act—

Michael Richard Allingame David George Dodge
Philip Alfred Ballantyne Larissa Gray

Fiona Phillipa Cowie James Andrew Miller
Kerryn Stacey Davey Sandra Pearce

KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture and Food.

AG402*
AGRICULTURAL PRODUCE COMMISSION ACT 1988
CHANGES TO VEGETABLE FEE FOR SERVICE

I, the undersigned Minister for Agriculture and Food being the Minister charged with the
administration of the Agricultural Produce Commission Act 1988 grant, pursuant to Section 14 of the
said Act, implementation of changes to the fee for service for the APC Vegetable Producers’
Committee for vegetables sold by producers as follows—

e Per individual package of vegetable product weighing 100 kilograms or less—$0.04 cents.

e Per individual package of vegetable product weighing 101 kilograms to 500 kilograms—$0.15
cents.

e Above 500 kg, multiples of 500kg be incremented by $0.15 cents per 500kg eg: per individual
package of vegetable product weighing 501 kilograms to 1000 kilograms—$0.30 cents, per
individual package of vegetable product weighing 1001 to 1500kg—$0.45 cents etc.

The above fee for service to apply to vegetables sold by producers except herb, potato, mushroom,
tomato and Kununurra vegetables.

The above charges to operate from 1 July 2008.
KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture and Food.

AG403*
AGRICULTURAL PRODUCE COMMISSION ACT 1988
CHANGES TO POTATO FEE FOR SERVICE

I, the undersigned Minister for Agriculture and Food being the Minister charged with the
administration of the Agricultural Produce Commission Act 1988 grant, pursuant to Section 14 of the
said Act, implementation of changes to the fee for service for the APC Potato Producers’ Committee
for potatoes sold by producers as follows—

e Processing potatoes (export and local) and seed potatoes (export and local) $5.00 per tonne
o Ware (fresh) export potatoes $6.00 per tonne.
e Ware (fresh) local potatoes $25.75 per tonne.

The above charges to operate from 1 July 2008.

KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture and Food.



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2577

AG404*
AGRICULTURAL PRODUCE COMMISSION ACT 1988
CHANGES TO POME FRUIT FEE FOR SERVICE

I, the undersigned Minister for Agriculture and Food being the Minister charged with the
administration of the Agricultural Produce Commission Act 1988 grant, pursuant to Section 14 of the
said Act, implementation of changes to the fee for service for the APC Pome, Citrus and Stone Fruit
Producers’ Committee for processing pome fruit sold by producers as follows—

e Processing pome fruit (i.e. pome fruit processed into something, juice, puree etc) $0.0050 per
kilo
The above charges to operate from 1 July 2008.
KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture and Food.

CEMETERIES

CC401*

CEMETERIES ACT 1986
Shire of Busselton
SCHEDULE OF FEES AND CHARGES 2008-2009

In pursuance of the powers conferred by Section 53 of the Cemeteries Act 1986, the Council of the
Shire of Busselton hereby records having resolved on the 11 June 2008 to set the following fees and
charges—

Land Grant for Right of Burial $
Grant of Right of Burial: Ordinary land for grave 2m x 1.2m where

directed (25 years) 875.00
Renewal of Grant of Right of Burial : Ordinary land for grave (additional

25 years) 550.00
Grant of Right of Burial: Placement of Ashes (25 years) 125.00
Renewal of Right of Burial: Placement of Ashes (additional 25 years) 100.00
Right of Burial per unreserved crypt in mausoleum 274.00
Pre-purchased Grant of Right of Burial: Ordinary land for grave 2m x

1.2m where directed (25 years 910.00
Pre-purchased Grant of Right of Burial: Placement of Ashes where

directed (25 years) 350.00
Reservation of specific site: ordinary land or placement of ashes (excludes

lawn cemetery) 290.00
Right of Burial per pre-reserved crypt in mausoleum 299.00

Burial Charge

Internment in grave to any depth to 2.1m (includes registration and
number plate) 750.00*

Burial in non-standard (oversize) denominational or non-denominational
grave (including registration and number plate)—Additional cost per
30cm deeper or wider 75.00*

Re-open and second burial in standard (2m x 1.2m) denominational or
non-denominational grave, excluding lawn cemetery (includes

registration) 750.00*
Construction of Vault (Does not include building application fees) At Cost + GST
First Internment in vault (Includes grant of right of burial and burial

fees) 1750.00*
Second Internment in vault 750.00*
Vault maintenance fee (annual) 100.00*
Burial per crypt in mausoleum 698.00*
Internment of a stillborn child (not to be re-opened for joint burial) 220.00*

Internment of a child up to 12 years old (not to be reopened for joint
burial) 396.00*




2578

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

17 June 2008

Grave Re-opening 3
Internment & re-opening grave for joint burial (including registration and

number plate) 750.00*
Removal of headstone 198.00*
Exhumation

Re-opening grave for exhumation 989.00%
Re-internment in new grave after exhumation (including registration and

number plate) 750.00*
Internment of Ashes

Internment of ashes in Memorial wall/garden (including registration) 270.00*
Internment of ashes in special location within cemetery (includes

registration) in addition to standard Internment of ashes fees (i.e. other

than established areas for ashes) 155.00*
Positioning of plinth and plaque (no internment/ashes) 66.00*

Plaques, plinths, vases and other monumental works.

At Cost + GST

Administration fee for purchase of plaques, plinths, vases and other

10% of Cost +

monumental works GST
Removal of Ashes from Memorial wall/ garden 120.00*
Storage of cremated remains per month for remains held longer than 6

months 11.00*
Positioning & affixing brass vase 25.00*
Miscellaneous Charges

Internment in open ground without due notice, not within usual hours

and prescribed or on a Saturday, Sunday or Public Holiday (in addition to

Internment costs) 275.00*
Funeral Directors licence fee per annum 250.00
Single funeral permit (funeral directors only) (GST free) 120.00
Single funeral permit (other than funeral directors) (GST free) 290.00
Monumental Masons licence fee per annum 215.00
Single permit to erect a headstone or kerbing 85.00
Single permit to erect a monument 105.00
Inspection of plans and registers 30.00
Copy of grant of burial 47.00

* denotes a charge with GST applied

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION

CE401*

ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987
CANCELLED ASSOCIATION

Bojanning Aboriginal Progress Association Incorporated—A0760149J

Notice is hereby given that pursuant to section 35 of the Associations Incorporation Act (1987) the
incorporation of the above-named association has been cancelled as from the date of this notice.

Dated: 10th June 2008.

ANNE DRISCOLL, Commissioner for Consumer Protection.



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2579

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG401

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954
Shire of Northampton
APPOINTMENTS

Notice is hereby given that the following persons have been appointed as Authorised Officers to
exercise powers pursuant to the Bush Fires Act 1954—

Chief Fire Control Officer
Sam Smith
Deputy Chief Fire Control Officers
Dennis Box (South)
Murray Carson (North)
Bushfire Control Officers

Garry Keeffe Anthony Gollan Lesley (Owen) Simkin
David Waite Hayden Teakle Ken Harris

Stan Sutherland Nigel Simkin Anton Atkinson
Richard Allen Chris Hasleby Marshall Clifton
Lindsay Roe Mick Morris

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.
GARRY L. KEEFE, Chief Executive Officer.

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE

PI1401*

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
City of Albany
Town Planning Scheme No. 1A—Amendement No. 140
Ref: 853/5/2/15Pt 140

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of Albany
local planning scheme amendment on 18 May 2008 for the purpose of—

(1) Incorporation of the following provision in Part IV—General Provisions of the Scheme Text.

4.22 Within the Area zoned ‘Special Site No. 38 with a Residential R30 density code,
development to the R60 standard may be permitted subject to the preparation of
detailed design guidelines to Council’s satisfaction and compliance with the
conditions outlined in Appendix II—Schedule of Special Sites.

(i1)) Renumbering subsequent clauses within Section 4 of Town Planning Scheme No. 1A
accordingly.

(ii1l) Rezoning Albany Town Lots 76, 77, 78, 79 and Portion of Albany Town Lot 75 Festing Street,
207 & 208 Mill Street, 220 & 221 Melville Street, Albany from the Industry zone to the
Residential (R30) zone and incorporating Albany Town Lots 77, 78, 79 and Portion of Albany
Town Lots 75 & 76 Festing Street, Portion of Albany Town Lots 207 & 208 Mill Street,
Albany Town Lot 221 and Portion of Albany Town Lot 220 Melville Street within Appendix II;
Schedule of Special Sites as Special Site Code No. 38 as follows—

Code Particulars Base Zone Additional Use

No. of Land

38 Albany Town Lots 77, | Residential | Aged  Persons Dwelling, Holiday
78, 79, 221 and | R30 Accommodation, Day Care Centre,
Portion of Albany Restaurant, R60 in accordance with
Town Lot 75, 76, 207, clause 4.22 or Other Incidental uses of a
208 and 220. minor nature as considered appropriate

by Council.

List of Conditions—

Despite anything else in the Scheme, all subdivision and development will be subject to
the following conditions—

(1) Original facade and support walls (circa 1924) to be retained together with
representative elements of the industrial building located immediately behind the
facade to the satisfaction of Council and in accordance with the guidance of the
Municipal Heritage Inventory.



2580 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

(i) Aged Persons Dwelling or Holiday Accommodation may be permitted after notice
has been given in accordance with Clause 7.5.

(i11) Day Care Centre or Restaurant may be permitted within the original structure as
described in condition 1) after notice has been given in accordance with Clause 7.5.

(iv) Access to the site from Mill Street to be centred on the original historic facade.

(v) External vehicular access to the site is to be provided from both Mill Street and
Melville Street to provide a through function.

(vi) Building development and design must address the street to the satisfaction of
Council.

(vii) Development fronting Festing Street and Melville Street shall be provided with
access from the internal road.

(viii) Complementary fencing shall be provided along Festing Street and Melville street
and be in accordance with the City of Albany Local Laws relating to Fencing 2001
and the Residential Design Codes.

(ix) Building development shall be restricted to 2 storeys plus a loft and is not to
exceed the maximum height for Category B as specified in the Residential Design
Codes unless otherwise approved by Council. Any variation will be determined in
accordance with the Residential Design Codes and any detailed design guidelines
adopted by Council.

(x) Prior to the development or subdivision of the site, a remediation and validation
assessment for soil, groundwater and vapour is to be prepared and all necessary
remediation works completed to the satisfaction of the Department of
Environment and Conservation and the City of Albany.

(iv) Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

PI1402*
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
City of Bayswater
Town Planning Scheme No. 24—Amendment No. 25
Ref: 853/2/14/29 Pt 25
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of
Bayswater local planning scheme amendment on 9 March 2008 for the purpose of rezoning Lot 1 No
326 Walter Road, Morley from “Residential R20/25” to “Medium Density Residential R40” and
reclassifying Lot 30 No 328 Walter Road, Morley from “Public Purpose—Religious Institution” to
“Medium Density Residential R40”.

T. G. KENYON, Mayor.
M. J. CAROSELLA, Chief Executive Officer.

PI403*
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005
METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT 1144/57

Great Eastern Highway, Rivervale between Graham Farmer Freeway
and Kooyong Road
Approved Amendment
File: 833-2-15-13
The Minister for Planning and Infrastructure has approved, with modification, the abovementioned
amendment to the Metropolitan Region Scheme. The amendment is shown on Western Australian

Planning Commission plan number 3.2097/1 and is effective from the date of publication of this notice
in the Government Gazette.

Copies of the amendment and the accompanying report on submissions are available for public
inspection from Tuesday, 17 June 2008 to Friday, 19 July 2008 at the following locations—

Western Australian Planning Commission, Wellington Street, Perth
e J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre
e Municipal office of the City of Belmont
e Main Roads WA, Waterloo Crescent, Perth

Documents are also available from the WAPC’s website www.wapc.wa.gov.au.

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary,
Western Australian Planning Commission.



17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2581

PI404%*
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005
METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT 1150/57

Former Craigie High School Site
Location 9801 Arawa Place, Craigie

Approved Amendment
File: 833-2-34-2

The Minister for Planning and Infrastructure has approved, as advertised, the abovementioned
amendment to the Metropolitan Region Scheme. The amendment is shown on Western Australian
Planning Commission plan number 3.2082 and is effective from the date of publication of this notice
in the Government Gazette.

Copies of the amendment and the accompanying report on submissions are available for public
inspection from Tuesday, 17 June 2008 to Friday, 19 July 2008 at the following locations—

o Western Australian Planning Commission, Wellington Street, Perth
e J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre
e Municipal office of the City of Joondalup

Documents are also available from the WAPC’s website www.wapc.wa.gov.au.

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary,
Western Australian Planning Commission.

PoOLICE

PO401

CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION (IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) ACT 2002
CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION (IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) REGULATIONS 2002
(Notice under Regulation 4)
APPROVED FORENSIC SCIENTISTS
I, Karl Joseph O’Callaghan, Commissioner of Police in the State of Western Australia, under the
regulation 4(3)(a) of the Criminal Investigation (Identifying People) Regulations 2002 approve the
following persons, employed as Forensic Scientists by the Western Australian Centre for Pathology

and Medical Research (PathWest), as forensic scientists for the purposes of regulation 4(1)(a) of those
regulations.

TITLE GIVEN NAMES FAMILY NAME DOB QUALIFICATIONS

Dr Fiona Orr BAXTER 20/01/1976 B.Sc. (Hons), PhD

Ms. Anna Linnea BOROWITZKA 22/08/1980 B.Sc., MBA

Ms Penny Lorraine COOPER 08/08/1980 B.Sc.

Dr Caroline Ellen GRAHAM 05/11/1974 B.Sc. (Hons), PhD

Mr Ross HEDLEY 17/12/1970 B.Sc. (Biomedical Sciences),

B.Sc. (Hons) (Anatomy and
Human Biology)

Mr Phu Han HUYNH 30/10/1980 B.Sc. (Hons) (Molecular Genetics)

Mr Yoon Chee (Louis) LIEW 04/12/1974 B.Sc. (Medical Science),
Postgraduate Diploma
(Biomedical Science)

Ms Anna-Marie ASHLEY 28/11/1966 B.Sc. Post Graduate Diploma
(Biomedical Science)

Dated: 30 May 2008.
KARL J. OCALLAGHAN, APM, Commissioner of Police.



2582 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

PO402
CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION (IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) ACT 2002
CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION (IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) REGULATIONS 2002
(Revocation Notice)
FORENSIC SCIENTISTS

I, Karl Joseph O’Callaghan, Commissioner of Police in the State of Western Australia, hereby revoke
the following persons as forensic scientists for the purposes of regulation 4(1)(a) of those regulations.

TITLE GIVEN NAMES FAMILY NAME DOB DATE OF GOVERNMENT
APPOINTMENT GAZETTE

Mrs Denise Susan GROVER 21/06/1968 16/08/2004 No. 151 of 2004

Ms Anna-Marie FURMEDGE 28/11/1966 21/06/2002 No. 116 of 2002

Dated: 30 May 2008.
KARL J. O'CALLAGHAN, APM, Commissioner of Police.

DECEASED ESTATES

7ZX401

TRUSTEES ACT 1962
DECEASED ESTATES
Notice to Creditors and Claimants

Albert Arthur Pinker, late of 32 First Avenue, Nungarin in the state of Western Australia, Kangaroo
Shooter, deceased.

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in
respect of the estate of Albert Arthur Pinker deceased who died on the 31st day of December 2007 at
Kununoppin, in the said State are required by the personal representative Yvonne Dawn Stallebrass
of 140 Ulster Road, Albany, Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to David Moss & Co
of PO Box 5744, Albany W.A. 6332 by the date one month following the publication of this notice after
which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the
claim for which he has then had notice.

7X402
TRUSTEES ACT 1962
DECEASED ESTATES
Notice to Creditors and Claimants
Joachim Alfred Chall, late of 20 Nicholl Street, Glen Forrest in Western Australia, Wrestler and Self-
Employed Importer, deceased.

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in
respect of the Estate of the deceased, who died on 17 October 2007 at 20 (Lot 59) Nicholl Street, Glen
Forrest in the State of Western Australia, are required by the Executrix, being Heidrun Erika Chall,
to send particulars of their claims to Earnshaw & Associates, PO Box 2235, Midland WA 6936, within
one (1) month of publication of this notice after which date the Executor may convey or distribute the
assets, having regard only to the claims of which she then has notice.

EARNSHAW & ASSOCIATES.

PuBLIC NOTICES

77401

PARTNERSHIP ACT 1895
DISSOLUTION OF PARTNERSHIP

Take notice that the partnership between JGQ INVESTMENTS PTY LTD (A.C.N. 114 129 038) and
JETSTONE HOLDINGS PTY LTD (A.C.N. 118 152 104) as Trustee for the MT & KD SMITH
FAMILY TRUST trading as DAYBREAK FARMS was dissolved effective from 31 March2007.

MICHAEL, WHYTE & CO.




17 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

(over

Order your Bound Volumes of

ment (razette 2008

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes

of Government Gazette

For Government Departments and
private firms who require bound copies
of Government Gazettes, the State Law
Publisher offers a subscription covering
4 Quarterly Volumes at a cost of
$1,138.50.

The Gazettes will be bound in black
cloth with gold foil lettering on the
spine and personalised by the addition
of the client's name in gold lettering on
the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE

On the rare occasion where extra
gazettes are published in one quarter, a
fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost involved will be
borne by the State Law Publisher and
not passed on to clients.

For further information please contact:

State Law Publisher
Telephone: 9321 7688




2584 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17 June 2008

PERTH OBSERVATORY

THE W.A. SPECIALISTS IN
ASTRONOMICAL

RESEARCH & EDUCATIONAL
ASTRONOMY

Public Tours (day and night)
Field Nights, Lectures

Astronomical Information

Astronomical Handbook
Sun rise & set; Moon rise & set
Legal advice
Chronometer calibration
Astronomical souvenirs

SERVING WESTERN AUSTRALIA SINCE 1896

WALNUT ROAD, BICKLEY 6076
TELEPHONE 9293 8255 FAX 9293 8138

ASTRONOMY IS LOOKING UP




