
!200800103GG! 
 

  2883 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 24 JUNE 2008 No. 103 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Firearms Act 1973—Firearms Amendment Regulations 2008..................................................................  2909 
Government Financial Responsibility Act 2000—Government Financial Responsibility Amendment 

Regulations 2008 ....................................................................................................................................  2914 
Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994—Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers 

Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008....................................................................................................  2907 
Police Act 1892—Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2008..................................................................  2905 
Proclamations— 
  Motor Vehicle Repairers Act 2003—No. 68 of 2003............................................................................  2885 
  Public Trustee and Trustee Companies Legislation Amendment Act 2008—No. 9 of 

  2008..................................................................................................................................................  2885 
Public Trustee Act 1941—Public Trustee Amendment Regulations 2008 ................................................  2888 
Marine Navigational Aids Act 1973—Marine Navigational Aids Amendment Regulations 2008 ...........  2890 
Real Estate and Business Agents Act 1978—Real Estate and Business Agents (General) Amendment 

Regulations 2008 ....................................................................................................................................  2886 
Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987—Rottnest Island Amendment Regulations 2008 ............................  2911 
Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996—Security and Related Activities (Control) 

Amendment Regulations 2008................................................................................................................  2903 
Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967—Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008...................  2891 
Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967—Mooring Amendment Regulations 2008 ..............................................  2893 
Transport Co-ordination Act 1966—Transport (Country Taxi-car) Amendment (Road Traffic) 

Regulations 2008 ....................................................................................................................................  2913 
Western Australian Marine Act 1982— 

Mooring Amendment Regulations 2008 .............................................................................................  2893 
Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2008..................................................................  2894 
W.A. Marine (Certificates of Competency and Safety Manning) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 

2008 .................................................................................................................................................  2895 
W.A. Marine (Hire and Drive Vessels) Amendment Regulations 2008 .............................................  2896 
W.A. Marine (Radiotelephony) Amendment Regulations 2008 .........................................................  2897 
W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates of Survey) Amendment Regulations 2008...........................  2898 

 
——— 

 
PART 2 

 
Consumer and Employment Protection .....................................................................................................  2916 
Deceased Estates ........................................................................................................................................  2927 
Health .........................................................................................................................................................  2917 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................................  2920 
Local Government ......................................................................................................................................  2925 
Minerals and Petroleum.............................................................................................................................  2926 
Planning and Infrastructure ......................................................................................................................  2926 
Premier and Cabinet ..................................................................................................................................  2927 
 
 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

WARNING — PRICE INCREASE 
ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 

EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2008 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$25.60 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$59.70 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$59.70 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.95 

  Bulk Notices—$218.20 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2885 

 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 

AA101* 
MOTOR VEHICLE REPAIRERS ACT 2003 

No. 68 of 2003 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 

By the Honourable 
David Kingsley Malcolm, 

Companion of the Order of Australia, 
Queen’s Counsel, Lieutenant-Governor and 

deputy of the Governor of the State of 
Western Australia 

DAVID KINGSLEY MALCOLM 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

I, the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, acting under the Motor 
Vehicle Repairers Act 2003 section 2 and with the advice and consent of the 
Executive Council, fix 1 July 2008 as the day on which section 4, Parts 2 and 5, 
Part 6 (other than sections 65 and 69), Part 8 (other than section 85(3)(b)), Part 9 
(other than sections 89 and 90), sections 108 and 109, Schedules 1 and 2 and 
Schedule 3 clause 1 of that Act come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 17 June 2008. 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

S. McHALE, Minister for Consumer Protection. 

Note: The Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment Regulations 2008, other than 
regulations 1 and 2, come into operation on the day on which the Motor 
Vehicle Repairers Act 2003 Part 2 comes into operation under this 
proclamation. 

 

——————————— 
 

AA102* 
PUBLIC TRUSTEE AND TRUSTEE COMPANIES LEGISLATION 

AMENDMENT ACT 2008 
No. 9 of 2008 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 

By His Excellency 
Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

I, the Governor, acting under the Public Trustee and Trustee Companies Legislation 
Amendment Act 2008 section 2(2) and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, fix 1 July 2008 as the day on which Parts 2 to 4 of that Act, come into 
operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 20 May 2008. 
By Command of the Governor, 

JIM McGINTY, Attorney General. 

Note: Under the Interpretation Act 1984 section 25(3), the Public Trustee 
Amendment Regulations 2008 take effect on the day on which the Public 
Trustee and Trustee Companies Legislation Amendment Act 2008 Parts 2 to 4 
commence in accordance with this proclamation. 



2886 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE301* 

 
Real Estate and Business Agents Act 1978 

Real Estate and Business Agents (General) 
Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Real Estate and Business Agents 
(General) Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Real Estate and 
Business Agents (General) Regulations 1979. 

4. Regulation 6A amended 

 (1) Regulation 6A is amended as follows: 

 (a) by inserting before “The” the subregulation designation 
“(1)”; 

 (b) by deleting the full stop and inserting instead —  

“     
  ; or 

 (d) each of the following modules from the CPP07 
Property Services Training Package —  

 (i) CPPDSM4003A — Appraise property; 

 (ii) CPPDSM4007A — Identify legal and 
ethical requirements of property 
management to complete agency work; 

 (iii) CPPDSM4008A — Identify legal and 
ethical requirements of property sales to 
complete agency work;  

 (iv) CPPDSM4012A — List property for 
sale; 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2887 

 

 (v) CPPDSM4014A — Market property for 
sale; 

 (vi) CPPDSM4022A — Sell and finalise the 
sale of property by private treaty; 

 (vii) CPPDSM4080A — Work in the real 
estate industry, 

provided by a registered training provider; or 

 (e) in the case of an application for registration as a 
sales representative with a condition restricting 
the registrant to property management 
transactions only — each of the following 
modules from the CPP07 Property Services 
Training Package —  

 (i) CPPDSM4007A — Identify legal and 
ethical requirements of property 
management to complete agency work; 

 (ii) CPPDSM4010A — Lease property; 

 (iii) CPPDSM4011A — List property for 
lease;  

 (iv) CPPDSM4013A — Market property for 
lease; 

 (v) CPPDSM4016A — Monitor and 
manage lease/tenancy agreements; 

 (vi) CPPDSM4080A — Work in the real 
estate industry, 

provided by a registered training provider. 
    ”; 

 (c) after paragraph (a) by inserting —  

  “    or    ”. 

 (2) At the end of regulation 6A the following subregulation is 
inserted —  

“     
 (2) In this regulation —  

 “CPP07 Property Services Training package” 
means the CPP07 Property Services Training 
Package published by the National Training 
Information Service. 

    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 



2888 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

JUSTICE 

JU301* 

Public Trustee Act 1941 

Public Trustee Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Public Trustee Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day on which Parts 2 
to 4 of the Public Trustee and Trustee Companies 
Legislation Amendment Act 2008 come into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Public Trustee 
Regulations 1942. 

4. Regulations 6, 6AA, 6A and 7 repealed 

  Regulations 6, 6AA, 6A and 7 are repealed. 

5. Regulation 6 inserted 

  After regulation 5 the following regulation is inserted — 

“     
6. Matters to be dealt with in written agreement 

  For the purposes of section 6B(1) of the Act, the 
following matters are prescribed —  

 (a) the determination of a scale of fees under 
section 38A(1) of the Act; 

 (b) the proportion of fees received by the Public 
Trustee to be credited to the Consolidated 
Account; 

 (c) the establishment of reserve funds; 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2889 

 

 (d) the moneys to be credited to reserve funds; 

 (e) the circumstances in which moneys may be 
transferred to or from a reserve fund; 

 (f) the uses to which moneys in a reserve fund may 
be put; 

 (g) the fixing of the rate or rates of Common 
Account interest; 

 (h) the establishment and operation of strategic 
common accounts. 

    ”. 

6. Regulation 10A amended 

  Regulation 10A is amended by deleting “$500.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $1 500.    ”. 

7. First Schedule amended 

 (1) The First Schedule Form 3 is amended by deleting “$10 000,” 
and inserting instead —  

“     
  the prescribed amount within the meaning given in 

section 14(6) of the Public Trustee Act 1941, 
    ”. 

 (2) The First Schedule Form 3A is amended by deleting “$10 000” 
and inserting instead —  

“     
  the prescribed amount within the meaning given in 

section 14(6) of the Public Trustee Act 1941 
    ”. 

 (3) The First Schedule Form 3B is amended by deleting “$10 000” 
and inserting instead —  

“     
  the prescribed amount within the meaning given in 

section 14(6) of the Public Trustee Act 1941 
    ”. 

 (4) The First Schedule Form 4 is amended by deleting “the sum of 
$10 000” and inserting instead —  

“     
  the prescribed amount within the meaning given in 

section 14(6) of the Public Trustee Act 1941 
    ”. 

 (5) The First Schedule Form 7 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in the heading by deleting “COMMON FUND” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    COMMON ACCOUNT    ”; 



2890 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

 (b) by deleting “Public Trustee Common Fund” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    Public Trustee Common Account    ”. 

8. Second Schedule repealed 

  The Second Schedule is repealed. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MX301* 

 
Marine Navigational Aids Act 1973 

Marine Navigational Aids Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Marine Navigational Aids Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Marine 
Navigational Aids Regulations 1985. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2891 

 

4. Schedule amended 

  The Schedule is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$108.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $111.80    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$141.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    $146.30    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$207.10” and inserting instead —  

  “    $214.10    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “$317.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $328.70    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “$485.10” and inserting instead —  

  “    $501.60    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “$758.10” and inserting instead —  

  “    $783.80    ”. 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

MX302* 

 
Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Navigable Waters Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 



2892 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 February 2009. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Navigable 
Waters Regulations 1958. 

4. Regulation 52BAB amended 

 (1) Regulation 52BAB(1) and (1a) are repealed and the following 
subregulations are inserted instead — 

“     
 (1A) In this regulation — 

 “AS/NZS”, followed by a designation means the 
Australian/New Zealand Standard having that 
designation that is jointly published by Standards 
Australia and the Standards Council of 
New Zealand; 

 “MS 241” means the Ministerial Standard for 
Emergency Position Indicating Radio Beacons, 
made by the Federal Minister under the 
Radiocommunications Act 1983 of the 
Commonwealth section 9; 

 “prescribed standard” means — 

 (a) AS/NZS 4280.1:2003; or 

 (b) until 1 February 2009 — MS 241 or 
AS/NZS 4330:1995. 

 (1) The owner of a vessel that proceeds more than 
2 nautical miles from the mainland, or more than 
400 m from an island situated more than 2 nautical 
miles from the mainland, must ensure that the vessel is 
equipped with an Emergency Position Indicating Radio 
Beacon that — 

 (a) complies with a prescribed standard; and 

 (b) is registered with the Australian Maritime 
Safety Authority established under the 
Australian Maritime Safety Authority Act 1990 
of the Commonwealth section 5. 

    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 52BAB(2) is amended by deleting “this regulation” 
and inserting instead — 

  “    subregulation (1)    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2893 

 

MX303* 

 
 
 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 
Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

Mooring Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Mooring Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Mooring 
Regulations 1998. 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in items 1, 3, 4, 5, 6 and 7 by deleting “$64.20” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $79.20    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “$364.30” and inserting instead —  

  “    $449.50    ”. 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



2894 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

MX304* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Navigable Waters Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Navigable 
Waters Regulations 1958. 

4. Regulation 45B amended 

 (1) Regulation 45B(3a)(b) is amended in the Table of fees as 
follows: 

 (a) in item (i) by deleting “$61.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    $63.40    ”; 

 (b) in item (ii) by deleting “$120.30” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $124.30    ”; 

 (c) in item (iii) by deleting “$223.70” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $231.30    ”; 

 (d) in item (iv) by deleting “$306.30” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $316.70    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 45B(4) is amended by deleting “$28.80.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $29.70.    ”. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2895 

 

5. Regulation 45BAA amended 

  Regulation 45BAA(4)(g) is amended by deleting “$28.80” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $29.70    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MX305* 

 
Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Certificates of Competency 
and Safety Manning) Amendment 

Regulations (No. 2) 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Certificates of 
Competency and Safety Manning) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Certificates of Competency and Safety Manning) 
Regulations 1983. 



2896 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

4. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$70.80” in the 3 places where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $87.30    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$57.30” in both places where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $70.70    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$43.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $54.10    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “$123.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    $151.70    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “$114.80/hour” and inserting instead —  

  “    $141.60/hour    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “$73.50/hour” and inserting instead —  

  “    $90.60/hour    ”; 

 (g) by deleting “$7.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $8.60    ”; 

 (h) by deleting “$10.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $12.90    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

MX306* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Hire and Drive Vessels) 
Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Hire and Drive Vessels) 
Amendment Regulations 2008. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2897 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Hire and Drive Vessels) Regulations 1983. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  Regulation 4(2)(e) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in substituted clause 3.1.2(1)(b) by deleting “$389.80” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    $481.00    ”; 

 (b) in substituted clause 3.1.2(3)(b) by deleting “$191.40” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    $236.10    ”; 

 (c) in substituted clause 3.1.3(m) by deleting “$73.50.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $90.60.    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

——————————— 
 

MX307* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Radiotelephony) Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Radiotelephony) 
Amendment Regulations 2008. 



2898 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Radiotelephony) Regulations 1981. 

4. Regulation 16 amended 

 (1) Regulation 16(2a) is amended by deleting “$372.10” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $459.10    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 16(2b) is amended by deleting “$183.50.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $226.40.    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

——————————— 
 

MX308* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates of 
Survey) Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates 
of Survey) Amendment Regulations 2008. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2899 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Surveys and Certificates of Survey) Regulations 1983. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 item 1(a) is amended by deleting the Table to the 
paragraph and inserting instead —  

“     
Table 

Length of vessel  
(metres) 

Examination 
of plans ($) 

Initial  
survey ($) 

Subsequent 
surveys ($) 

Not over 5 573 808 236 

Over 5 but not over 6 666 1 113 282 

Over 6 but not over 7 724 1 568 344 

Over 7 but not over 8 935 2 082 372 

Over 8 but not over 9 1 155 2 714 401 

Over 9 but not over 10 1 352 3 336 423 

Over 10 but not over 11 1 667 4 011 466 

Over 11 but not over 12 1 979 4 695 512 

Over 12 but not over 13 2 287 5 374 560 

Over 13 but not over 14 2 611 6 049 603 

Over 14 but not over 15 2 927 6 726 649 

Over 15 but not over 16 3 226 7 408 691 

Over 16 but not over 17 3 540 8 086 739 

Over 17 but not over 18 3 864 8 763 784 

Over 18 but not over 19 4 163 9 441 828 

Over 19 but not over 20 4 480 10 122 877 

Over 20 but not over 21 4 842 10 849 944 

Over 21 but not over 22 5 207 11 577 1 019 

Over 22 but not over 23 5 571 12 304 1 088 

Over 23 but not over 24 5 945 13 044 1 155 

Over 24 but not over 25 6 303 13 765 1 219 

Over 25 but not over 26 6 678 14 492 1 287 

Over 26 but not over 27 7 032 15 221 1 352 

Over 27 but not over 28 7 408 15 963 1 428 

Over 28 but not over 29 7 765 16 689 1 493 

Over 29 but not over 30 8 130 17 412 1 562 

Over 30 but not over 31 8 545 18 196 1 654 

Over 31 but not over 32 8 968 18 990 1 748 

Over 32 but not over 33 9 374 19 766 1 836 

Over 33 but not over 34 9 800 20 551 1 929 

Over 34 but not over 35 10 213 21 330 2 021 



2900 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

Length of vessel  
(metres) 

Examination 
of plans ($) 

Initial  
survey ($) 

Subsequent 
surveys ($) 

Over 35 but not over 36 10 638 22 109 2 112 

Over 36 but not over 37 11 062 22 890 2 207 

Over 37 but not over 38 11 466 23 685 2 289 

Over 38 but not over 39 11 888 24 459 2 381 

Over 39 but not over 40 12 304 25 241 2 474 

Over 40 but not over 41 12 780 26 070 2 596 

Over 41 but not over 42 13 243 26 909 2 709 

Over 42 but not over 43 13 712 27 753 2 819 

Over 43 but not over 44 14 184 28 572 2 938 

Over 44 but not over 45 14 651 29 423 3 050 

Over 45 but not over 46 15 121 30 244 3 159 

Over 46 but not over 47 15 590 31 077 3 275 

Over 47 but not over 48 16 056 31 919 3 388 

Over 48 but not over 49 16 536 32 747 3 500 

Over 49 but not over 50 16 998 33 579 3 620 

Over 50 17 463 34 416 3 730 

    ”. 

(2)  Schedule 1 item 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (b)(i)(A) by deleting “$144.80” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b)(i)(B) by deleting “$144.80” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (b)(ii)(A) by deleting “$144.80” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”; 

 (d) in paragraph (b)(ii)(C)(I) by deleting “$144.80” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”; 

 (e) in paragraph (b)(ii)(C)(II) by deleting “$144.80” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 1 item 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$105.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $130.50    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$105.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $130.50    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$105.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $130.50    ”; 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2901 

 

 (d) in paragraph (d)(i) by deleting “$144.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”; 

 (e) in paragraph (d)(ii) by deleting “$144.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”; 

 (f) in paragraph (e)(i) by deleting “$144.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”; 

 (g) in paragraph (e)(ii) by deleting “$144.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”; 

 (h) in paragraph (f)(ii) by deleting “$105.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $130.50    ”; 

 (i) in paragraph (g)(ii) by deleting “$105.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $130.50    ”; 

 (j) in paragraph (h)(ii) by deleting “$105.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $130.50    ”; 

 (k) in paragraph (i)(i)(I) by deleting “$723.20” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $892.40    ”; 

 (l) in paragraph (i)(i)(II) by deleting “$362.20” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $446.90    ”; 

 (m) in paragraph (i)(ii)(I) by deleting “$2 171.10” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $2 679.10    ”; 

 (n) in paragraph (i)(ii)(II) by deleting “$723.20” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $892.40    ”; 

 (o) in paragraph (i)(ii)(III) by deleting “$362.20” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $446.90    ”; 

 (p) in paragraph (i)(iii) by deleting “$723.20” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $892.40    ”; 

 (q) in paragraph (j) by deleting “$723.20” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $892.40    ”; 



2902 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

 (r) in paragraph (k) by deleting “$72.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $89.40    ”; 

 (s) in paragraph (l) by deleting “$144.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”; 

 (t) in paragraph (m) by deleting “$172.70” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $213.10    ”; 

 (u) in paragraph (n)(i) by deleting “$144.10” in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    $161.64    ”; 

 (v) in paragraph (n)(ii) by deleting “$159.20” in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    $178.55    ”; 

 (w) in paragraph (p) by deleting “$1.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $1.20    ”. 

 (4) The notes at the end of Schedule 1 item 1 are amended by 
deleting “$144.80” and inserting instead —  

  “    $178.60    ”. 

 (5) Schedule 1 item 3 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$94.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.60    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$94.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.60    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$58.40” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $72.00    ”. 

 (6) Schedule 1 item 4(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$78.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $96.30    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$156.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $192.60    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$288.40” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $355.80    ”; 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2903 

 

 (d) in paragraph (d) by deleting “$392.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $484.80    ”. 

 (7) Schedule 1 item 4(2) is amended by deleting “$38.90” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $48.00    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

POLICE 

PO301* 

 
Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996 

Security and Related Activities (Control) 
Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Security and Related Activities 
(Control) Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Security and 
Related Activities (Control) Regulations 1997. 



2904 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

4. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 is amended in column 3 as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “401” and inserting instead —  

  “    433    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “423” and inserting instead —  

  “    453    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “162” in the first place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    170    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “223” and inserting instead —  

  “    234    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “139” and inserting instead —  

  “    150    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “162” in the second place where it occurs 
and inserting instead —  

  “    171    ”; 

 (g) by deleting “102” and inserting instead —  

  “    110    ”; 

 (h) by deleting “128” in the first place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    134    ”; 

 (i) by deleting “32” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    34    ”; 

 (j) by deleting “128” in the second place where it occurs 
and inserting instead —  

  “    135    ”; 

 (k) by deleting “93” and inserting instead —  

  “    96    ”; 

 (l) by deleting “20” and inserting instead —  

  “    21    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2905 

 

PO302* 

 
Police Act 1892 

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Police (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Police (Fees) 
Regulations 1981. 

 

4. Schedule amended 

  The Schedule is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1(a) and (b) by deleting “$17.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $19.20    ”; 

 (b) in item 2(a)(i) by deleting “$80.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $86.35    ”; 

 (c) in item 2(a)(ii) by deleting “$94.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $100.00    ”; 

 (d) in item 2(a)(iii) by deleting “$72.05” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $77.85    ”; 

 (e) in item 2(c) by deleting “$125.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $137.50    ”; 



2906 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

 (f) in item 3(a) by deleting “$11.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $12.00    ”; 

 (g) in item 3(b) by deleting “$17.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $19.25    ”; 

 (h) in item 4(a) by deleting “$10.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $10.50    ”; 

 (i) in item 4(b) by deleting “$34.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $35.00    ”; 

 (j) in item 4(c) by deleting “$39.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $40.50    ”; 

 (k) in item 4a by deleting “$44.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $51.00    ”; 

 (l) in item 5 by deleting “$81.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $90.00    ”; 

 (m) in item 6 by deleting “$17.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    $19.25    ”; 

 (n) in item 7(a) and (b) by deleting “$32.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $34.55    ”; 

 (o) in item 8 by deleting “$32.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $34.55    ”; 

 (p) in item 9(a) and (b) by deleting “$81.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $90.00    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2907 

 

PO303* 

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994 

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Pawnbrokers and Second-hand 
Dealers Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Pawnbrokers 
and Second-hand Dealers Regulations 1996. 

4. Regulation 28 amended 

  The Table to regulation 28 is amended as follows:  

 (a) in item 1 —  

 (i) by deleting “438” and inserting instead —  

  “    453    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “736” and inserting instead —  

  “    761    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “1 034” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 069    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 —  

 (i) by deleting “395” and inserting instead —  

  “    408    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “663” and inserting instead —  

  “    686    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “931” and inserting instead —  

  “    963    ”; 



2908 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

 (c) in item 3 —  

 (i) by deleting “508” and inserting instead —  

  “    525    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “940” and inserting instead —  

  “    972    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “1 367” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 413    ”; 

 (d) in item 4 —  

 (i) by deleting “496” and inserting instead —  

  “    513    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “796” and inserting instead —  

  “    823    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “1 095” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 132    ”. 

5. Regulation 29 amended 

  The Table to regulation 29 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 —  

 (i) by deleting “322” and inserting instead —  

  “    333    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “625” and inserting instead —  

  “    646    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “929” and inserting instead —  

  “    961    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 —  

 (i) by deleting “292” and inserting instead —  

  “    302    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “565” and inserting instead —  

  “    584    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “837” and inserting instead —  

  “    865    ”; 

 (c) in item 3 —  

 (i) by deleting “468” and inserting instead —  

  “    484    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “897” and inserting instead —  

  “    927    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “1 325” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 370    ”; 

 (d) in item 4 —  

 (i) by deleting “344” and inserting instead —  

  “    356    ”; 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2909 

 

 (ii) by deleting “671” and inserting instead —  

  “    694    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “975” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 008    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

PO304* 

 
Firearms Act 1973 

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Firearms Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Firearms 
Regulations 1974. 

4. Regulation 27 amended 

  Regulation 27(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$390” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $421    ”. 



2910 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

5. Schedule 1A replaced 

  Schedule 1A is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 1A — Fees 

[r. 2] 

Item Fee for Fee ($) 
1. Application for firearm licence (r. 3A, 3B) —   
 (a) by person without such a licence 175 
 (b) by person renewing such a licence 38 
 (c) by person with such a licence wanting licence for one 

or more additional firearms 
 

28 
2. Application for firearm collector’s licence (r. 3A, 3B) —  
 (a) by person without such a licence 206 
 (b) by person renewing such a licence 38 
 (c) by person with such a licence wanting licence for one 

or more additional firearms 
 

28 
3. Application for corporate licence (r. 3A, 3B) —   
 (a) by person without such a licence 364 
 (b) by person renewing such a licence 96 
 (c) by person with such a licence wanting licence for one 

or more additional firearms 
 

28 
4. Application for dealer’s licence (r. 3A, 3B) —   
 (a) by person without such a licence 364 
 (b) by person renewing such a licence 89 
5. Application for repairer’s licence (r. 3A, 3B) —   
 (a) by person without such a licence 364 
 (b) by person renewing such a licence 68 
6. Application for manufacturer’s licence (r. 3A, 3B) —   
 (a) by person without such a licence 364 
 (b) by person renewing such a licence 68 
7. Application for shooting gallery licence (r. 3A, 3B) —   
 (a) by person without such a licence 232 
 (b) by person renewing such a licence 71 
8. Application for ammunition collector’s licence (r. 3A, 3B) —  
 (a) by person without such a licence 218 
 (b) by person renewing such a licence 64 
9. Application for permit under the Act s. 17, per month or part 

of a month for which permit issued 
 

51 
10. Extract of Licence (r. 7A) 18 
11. Duplicate of licence (r. 8) 29 
12. Replacement for an Extract of Licence (r. 8) 18 
13. Police custody of firearm, per year or part of year (r. 11) 129 

    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2911 

 

ROTTNEST ISLAND AUTHORITY 

RX301* 

Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987 

Rottnest Island Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Rottnest Island Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Rottnest Island 
Regulations 1988. 

4. Schedule 5 amended 

  Schedule 5 is amended by deleting each fee or payment listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this regulation and inserting instead the 
corresponding fee or payment listed in column 2. 

Table 

Column 1 
fee or payment deleted 

Column 2 
fee or payment inserted 

$24.90 $25.60 

$50.00 $51.50 

$74.90 $77.10 

$99.90 $102.90 

5. Schedule 6 amended 

 (1) Schedule 6 Part 1 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of 
the Table to this subregulation by deleting the fee listed in 
column 2 and inserting instead the corresponding fee listed in 
column 3. 



2912 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

Table 

Column 1 
item 

Column 2 
fee deleted 

Column 3 
fee inserted 

1 $24.90 $25.60 

2 $38.00 $39.10 

3 $38.00 $39.10 

 (2) Schedule 6 Part 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of 
the Table to this subregulation by deleting the fee listed in 
column 2 and inserting instead the corresponding fee listed in 
column 3. 

Table 

Column 1 
item 

Column 2 
fee deleted 

Column 3 
fee inserted 

1 $21.70 $22.40 

2 $32.60 $33.60 

3 $32.60 $33.60 

6. Schedule 7 amended 

 (1) Schedule 7 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this subregulation by deleting the fee or payment listed 
in column 2 and inserting instead the corresponding fee or 
payment listed in column 3. 

Table 

Column 1 
item 

Column 2 
fee or payment 

deleted 

Column 3 
fee or payment 

inserted 

1 $12.50 $12.90 

2 $131.00 $134.90 

2 $149.30 $153.80 

2 $179.20 $184.60 

2 $298.70 $307.70 

2a $131.40 $135.30 

3 $37.70 $38.80 

5 $35.60 $36.70 

 (2) Schedule 7 item 4 is amended by deleting “$715, or $71.30” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $736.50, or $73.40    ”. 

7. Schedule 8 amended 

  Schedule 8 is amended by deleting each fee listed in column 1 
of the Table to this regulation and inserting instead the 
corresponding fee listed in column 2. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2913 

 

Table 

Column 1 
fee deleted 

Column 2 
fee inserted 

$43.40 $44.70 

$309.50/m $318.80/m 

$494.00/m $508.80/m 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

TRANSPORT 

TR301* 

 
 

Transport Co-ordination Act 1966 

Transport (Country Taxi-car) Amendment 
(Road Traffic) Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Transport (Country Taxi-car) 
Amendment (Road Traffic) Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day on which the 
Road Traffic Amendment Act 2006 section 6 comes into 
operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Transport 
(Country Taxi-car) Regulations 1982. 



2914 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

4. Regulation 25 amended 

  Regulation 25(d) is amended by deleting “his A Class and 
T Class driver’s licence issued” and inserting instead —  

“     
  the driver’s licence document for a licence 

endorsed with extension T or equivalent 
evidence of authorisation to drive 

    ”. 

5. Regulation 40 amended 

  Regulation 40(d) is amended by deleting “, his A Class and 
T Class driver’s licence and passenger vehicle licence issued” 
and inserting instead —  

“     
  and a driver’s licence document for a licence 

endorsed with extension T or equivalent 
evidence of authorisation to drive 

    ”. 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

TREASURY AND FINANCE 

TF301* 

Government Financial Responsibility Act 2000 

Government Financial Responsibility 
Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Government Financial Responsibility 
Amendment Regulations 2008. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2915 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Government 
Financial Responsibility Regulations 2006. 

4. Regulation 2 amended 

  Regulation 2(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting paragraph (a)(i), (ii) and (iii) and inserting 
instead —  

“     
 (i) the Consolidated Account; and 

 (ii) the Treasurer’s Advance Account 
referred to in the Financial Management 
Act 2006 section 7(b); and 

 (iii) the Treasurer’s special purpose accounts 
referred to in the Financial Management 
Act 2006 section 7(c); 

    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “Fund” in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    Account    ”; 

 (c) by deleting paragraph (c) and inserting instead —  

“     
 (c) a statement of —  

 (i) the payments in respect of extraordinary 
or unforeseen matters made under the 
authority of the Financial Management 
Act 2006 section 27 in the budget year 
or any Treasurer’s Advance 
Authorisation Act for the budget year; 
and 

 (ii) the net unrecovered balances as at the 
end of the budget year in respect of the 
advances made under the authority of 
the Financial Management Act 2006 
section 28 in the budget year or any 
Treasurer’s Advance Authorisation Act 
for the budget year. 

    ”. 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



2916 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

— PART 2 — 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401* 
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 

REINSTATEMENT OF ASSOCIATION 
BRITISH MOTORCYCLE ENTHUSIASTS CLUB OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA INCORPORATED 

Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named association has been re-instated 
pursuant to Section 35(4) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987. 
Dated 13 June 2008. 

ROBERT ALLEN, A/Director, 
Business Services for Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 

 

——————————— 
 

CE402 
CHARITABLE COLLECTIONS ACT 1946 

REVOCATION OF LICENCES 
I, Anne Driscoll, being the officer delegated by the Minister administering the Charitable Collections 
Act 1946, and acting in the exercise of the powers conferred by subsection (3) of section 12 of that Act, 
hereby give notice that I have revoked the licence of the organisations listed below— 
  Chaianne Ramage Foundation Inc 
  Computer Angels (Inc) 
Dated this 17th day of June 2008. 

ANNE DRISCOLL, Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 

 

——————————— 
 

CE403* 
CONSUMER AFFAIRS ACT 1971 

ORDER PROHIBITING SUPPLY OF GOODS 
I, Anne Marie Driscoll Commissioner for Consumer Protection in the State of Western Australia— 
 • being satisfied that a Consumer Affairs Authority, namely Chris Bowen, Minister for 

Competition Policy and Consumer Affairs in the Commonwealth Government of Australia, 
has, by notice dated 16 June 2008 and published in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette 
on 16 June 2008, made an Order or similar instrument (“the Corresponding Order”) 
prohibiting the supply of goods described in the Schedule hereto; and 

 • considering it necessary in the interests of the safety of the public; 
 • Order pursuant to section 23R(2) of the Consumer Affairs Act 1971 that the supply to 

consumers of goods described in the Schedule below is prohibited in this State for a period of 
18 months; and 

 • Further order that this Order shall take effect upon the date of gazettal. 

SCHEDULE 
Particulars of Goods 
Balls manufactured from fire resistant material, designed to be doused in flammable liquid and 
ignited, and intended to be used for the purpose of amusement by kicking or throwing, including but 
not limited to goods supplied as “Fire Footbag”, except where such goods are supplied for use by 
professional entertainers or for theatrical use and where the purchaser is able to demonstrate such 
qualifications or intended use. 
Dated this 20th day of June 2008. 

ANNE MARIE DRISCOLL, Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2917 

 

HEALTH 

HE401* 
POISONS ACT 1964 

POISONS (AUTHORISED POSSESSION OF SUBSTANCES) AMENDMENT ORDER 2008 
Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council under section 41 
of the Act. 

1. Citation 
This order may be cited as the Poisons (Authorised Possession of Substances) Amendment Order 2008. 

2. Commencement 
This order comes into operation as follows— 
 (a) clauses 1 and 2—on the day on which this order is published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the clauses—on the day after that day. 

3. Principal order 
In this order the Poisons (Authorised Possession of Substances) Order (No. 11) 2005* is referred to as 
the principal order. 
[ *Published in Gazette 4 November 2005, p. 5333-34 ] 

4.Schedule 1 amended 
Schedule 1 of the principal order is amended by deleting items 1 to 7 and inserting instead— 
 “  1. Western Australian Police Academy, 81 Lakeside Drive, Joondalup. 
 2. Western Australian Police Air Wing, Jandakot Airport, Jandakot. 
 3. Western Australian Police Drug Receival Unit, 2 Adelaide Terrace, East Perth. 
 4. Western Australian Police Traffic Branch, Wellington Street, East Perth. 
 5. Western Australian Police Headquarters, 2 Adelaide Terrace, East Perth. 
 6. Perth Police Station, Curtin House, 60 Beaufort Street, Perth. 
 7. Water Police Fremantle, Harvest Road, North Fremantle. ”. 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

——————————— 
 

HE402* 
POISONS ACT 1964 

POISONS (AUTHORISED POSSESSION OF SUBSTANCES) AMENDMENT ORDER (NO. 2) 2008 
Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council under section 41 
of the Act. 

1. Citation 
This order may be cited as the Poisons (Authorised Possession of Substances) Amendment Order 
(No. 2) 2008. 

2. Commencement 
This order comes into operation as follows— 
 (a) clauses 1 and 2—on the day on which this order is published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the clauses—on the day after that day. 

3. Principal order 
In this order the Poisons (Authorised Possession of Substances) Order (No. 7) 2005* is referred to as 
the principal order. 
[ *Published in Gazette 4 November 2005, p. 5329-30 and amended in Gazette 24 July 2007, p. 3674 ] 

4. Clause 4 amended 
Clause 4 of the principal order is amended by deleting the table to that clause and inserting instead— 
 “ 

Table 
Daniel Armstrong, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
James Fisher, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
Robert Hands, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 



2918 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

Chris Harper, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
Colin Harrison, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
Janice Keelan, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
Dawn Kennedy, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
Phillip Leonard, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
Glen Marriott, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
Glen Minnorgan, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
David Pickett, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
Gail Raven, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit. 
Mark Sheehan, prison officer, Department of Corrective Services Drug Detection Unit.  ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

HE403* 
POISONS ACT 1964 

POISONS (AUTHORISED POSSESSION OF SUBSTANCES) AMENDMENT ORDER (NO. 3) 2008 
Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council under section 41 
of the Act. 

1. Citation 
This order may be cited as the Poisons (Authorised Possession of Substances) Amendment Order 
(No. 3) 2008. 

2. Commencement 
This order comes into operation as follows— 
 (a) clauses 1 and 2—on the day on which this order is published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the clauses—on the day after that day. 

3. Principal order 
In this order the Poisons (Authorised Possession of Substances) Order (No. 9) 2005* is referred to as 
the principal order. 
[ *Published in Gazette 4 November 2005, p. 5331-32 and amended in Gazette 24 July 2007, p. 3672 ] 

4. Clause 4 amended 
Clause 4 of the principal order is amended by deleting the table to that clause and substituting the 
following— 
 “ 

Table 
Warren Ayeliffe, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Hannah Crisp, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Neil Thomas Campbell, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Peter Andrew Collins, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Lecinda Anne Collins-Brown, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Melissa Suzanne Davies, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
David De Tata, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Helen Dierson, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Robert Charles Hansson, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Antoinette Harvey, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Alison Rosemary Hewitt, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Murray Hoare, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Phuong Le, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Jennifer Liepold, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Peter Norman Miles, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Sam Ngo, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Francois Jacobus Oosthuizen, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Lindsay Pescud, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Charles Alexander Pierce, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Colin Roderick Priddis, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2919 

 

Meena Kersa Raghvani, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Dominic Reynolds, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Charles Ivan Russo, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Kari Margaret Smith, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Bianca Jane Stevens, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Nathan Ashley Sumner, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Sarah Louise Thomas, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Edward Toh, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
Hayley Patricia Vickers, officer, Chemistry Centre (WA). 
James Andrew White, officer Chemistry Centre (WA). ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

HE404* 
POISONS ACT 1964 

POISONS (AUTHORISED POSSESSION OF SUBSTANCES) AMENDMENT ORDER (NO. 4) 2008 
Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council under section 41 
of the Act. 

1. Citation 
This order may be cited as the Poisons (Authorised Possession of Substances) Amendment Order 
(No. 4) 2008. 

2. Commencement 
This order comes into operation as follows— 
 (a) clauses 1 and 2—on the day on which this order is published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the clauses—on the day after that day. 

3. Principal order 
In this order the Poisons (Authorised Possession of Substances) Order 2005* is referred to as the 
principal order. 
[ *Published in Gazette 15 April 2005, p. 1208 and amended in Gazette 24 July 2007 p. 3675 ] 

4. Clause 4 amended 
Clause 4 of the principal order is amended by inserting the following after “4—Hydroxybutanoic 
acid”— 

“ and its salt derivatives ”. 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

HE405* 
POISONS ACT 1964 

POISONS (AUTHORISED POSSESSION OF SUBSTANCES) ORDER 2008 
Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council under section 41 
of the Act. 

1. Citation 
This order may be cited as the Poisons (Authorised Possession of Substances) Order 2008. 

2. Commencement 
This order comes into operation as follows— 
 (a) clauses 1 and 2—on the day on which this order is published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the clauses—on the day after that day. 

3. Interpretation 
In this order— 

“specified place” means the premises occupied by Clinipath Pathology at 647 Murray Street, 
West Perth; 



2920 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

“specified substances” means the amount of the substances included in Schedule 9 to the Act, 
possession and use of which is authorised under clause 4. 

4. Possession and use of certain substances authorised 
Subject to clause 5, the people listed in the table to this clause are authorised to together possess and 
use at the specified place, for analytical chemical analysis purposes, not more than 1 gram each of— 
 (a) N,a-dimethyl-3,4-(methylenedioxy)phenethylamine (MDMA) isomers and their salts, esters 

and derivatives; 
 (b) 3,4-methylenedioxyamphetamine (MDA) isomers and their salts, esters and derivatives, and 
 (c) Ecgonine and its salts, esters and derivatives. 

Table 
Matthew Lee Callisto, of Clinipath Pathology. 
Julian Chin, of Clinipath Pathology. 
Justine Chi Yum Chow, of Clinipath Pathology. 
Mai Thi Phuong Huynh, of Clinipath Pathology. 
William James Quentin McConnell, of Clinipath Pathology. 
Sally Anne McMahon, of Clinipath Pathology. 
Sydney Soloman Sacks, of Clinipath Pathology. 
Claire Jane Sutcliffe, of Clinipath Pathology. 

5. Conditions of authorised preparation, possession and use  
The possession and use authorised under clause 4 is subject to the conditions that— 
 (a) the specified substances, when not required for the purposes referred to in clause 4, are 

stored at the specified place in a secure manner, as directed by the CEO; 
 (b) written records relating to the specified substances are maintained by the people listed in the 

table to clause 4 at the specified place, as directed by the CEO; and 
 (c) that, if requested by the CEO, any oral information or written report relating to the specified 

substances is given by the people listed in the table to clause 4 to the Chief Executive Officer. 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

JUSTICE 

JU401* 
PUBLIC TRUSTEE ACT 1941 

PUBLIC TRUSTEE’S SCALE OF FEES 
Pursuant to Section 38a(1) 

1. Deceased estates 
(1) (a) Subject to this item and to items 3B, 7, 8, 8A and 10, the following fees shall be charged in 

respect of the services of the Public Trustee, acting alone or jointly, with respect to the estate 
of a deceased person— 

 (i) where the gross capital value of an estate does not exceed $300, $33; 
 (ii) where the gross capital value of an estate exceeds $300 but does not exceed $2,000, 11% 

of that value; 
 (iii) where the gross capital value of an estate exceeds $2,000, according to the scale—4.4% 

on the first $200,000 of that value, subject to a minimum of $200; 
  3.3% on the next $200,000 of that value; 
  2.2% on the next $200,000 of that value; and 
  1.1% on the amount in excess of $600,000 of that value; 
 (b) Subject to this item, in addition, there shall be the following fees for the Public Trustee, 

acting alone or jointly, collecting the income of any estate (except income from a Fund) during 
the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009— 

 (i) in relation to income derived from rent— 
 (I) where the rent is collected by the Public Trustee without an agent, such amount 

as expressed as a percentage or otherwise under the scale adopted by the body 
known as the Real Estate Institute of Western Australia; 

 (II) where the rent is collected through an agent who is employed and paid a 
commission by the Public Trustee, such amount as equals 2.75% of that income; 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2921 

 

 (ii) in relation to income derived from sources other than rent— 
 (I) where the income is collected by the Public Trustee without an agent, 6.6% of 

that income; 
 (II) where the income is collected through an agent who is employed and paid a 

commission by the Public Trustee, such amount as equals 2.75% of that income. 
(1a) The fees to be charged under sub-item (1)(a) shall be reduced in accordance with the following 
provisions— 
 (a) where the estate includes— 
 (i) a residential property that was the principal place of residence of the deceased person; 

or 
 (ii) an interest as a tenant in common in a residential property of the kind described in 

subparagraph (i), 
and that asset is transferred to the spouse, de facto partner or a child (within the meaning of 
the Inheritance (Family and Dependants Provision) Act 1972 or any Act in substitution for 
that Act) of the deceased person, the fee payable on that part of the estate is 1.1% of the gross 
capital value of that asset; 

 (b) where any property in an estate is an asset in another estate administered by the Public 
Trustee and in respect of which the appropriate fee in this Schedule has already been paid 
the fee payable shall be 1.65% of the gross capital value of the asset; 

 (c) where the property in an estate consists of the proceeds of an asset which the Public Trustee 
receives as principal administrator from outside the State of Western Australia the fee 
payable shall be 1.65% of those proceeds; and 

 (d) where the estate includes a lump sum payment, which is paid directly to the Public Trustee 
by the trustees of a superannuation fund, the fee payable on the part of the estate consisting 
of the lump sum payment shall be 1.65%. 

(1b) In sub-item (1a)(a) the reference to the spouse or de facto partner of the deceased person means a 
person who was the spouse or de facto partner of the person immediately before the person’s death. 

(2) In time of war no fees shall be charged under this item on the estate of any deceased seaman or 
any member of the Defence Forces as constituted under the Defence Act 1903 of the Parliament of the 
Commonwealth and any Act in substitution for that Act where the gross value of the assets of the 
estate does not exceed $5,000, but where the gross value of the estate exceeds $5,000— 
 (a) there shall be charged on so much of the gross value of the estate as exceeds $5,000 but does 

not exceed $10,000, one-half of the fee chargeable under sub-item (1); and 
 (b) there shall be charged on so much of the gross value of the estate as exceeds $10,000, the fees 

chargeable under sub-item (1). 

2. Fee payable on assets realised or moneys collected 
 (1) Subject to this item, the fee payable for the Public Trustee realising an asset or collecting 

money during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009 in relation to the estate of a 
represented person is 4.4% of its gross capital value. 

 (1a)  Where the assets realised by the Public Trustee during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 
2009 include the principal place of residence of the represented person, the fee payable in 
respect of that asset is 2.2% of its gross capital value. 

 (1b)  The fee prescribed under sub-item (1) does not apply to moneys withdrawn by the Public 
Trustee from a Fund or a cheque account or savings account held with a bank or other 
financial institution. 

 (2)  Where the estate is that of an incapacitated member of the Defence Forces, as constituted 
under the Defence Act 1903 of the Parliament of the Commonwealth and any Act in 
substitution for that Act, as the result of war service, the fees payable under this item shall 
be reduced by half. 

3. Court trusts 
Subject to items 3A, 6, 8, 8A and 10, the fee for managing a court trust during the period 1 July 2008 
to 30 June 2009 is 1.25% of the moneys received for investment during that period. 

3A. Fee payable in respect of investment outside a Fund 
 (1) Subject to sub-item (2), with respect to a court trust, the fee payable for managing an 

investment outside a Fund during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009 is 6.6% of the 
income earned or amount distributed from that investment, as the case may be.  

 (2) The fee prescribed under sub-item (1) does not apply to any capital gain resulting from the 
realisation of an investment referred to in that sub-item. 

3B. Fee payable for administration of certain trusts 
 (1) Subject to sub-item (2) and to items 4, 6, 8, 8A and 10, where the Public Trustee has 

completed duties as the executor or administrator of an estate but continues to hold assets of 
the estate as trustee (including as trustee of a perpetual charitable trust), the fee payable for 
work performed in connection with the administration of the trust during the period 1 July 
2008 to 30 June 2009 is $165 per hour or a total of $165, whichever is higher. 



2922 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

 (2) The fees payable for legal services (other than services covered by item 10) performed during 
the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009 in connection with the administration of the trust in 
sub-item (1) are— 

 (a) legal services performed by a senior practitioner (admitted for more than 5 years)—
$275 per hour; 

 (b) legal services performed by a junior practitioner (admitted for less than 5 years)—$198 
per hour; and 

 (c) legal services performed by a clerk/paralegal—$165 per hour. 

4. Fees payable on income received 
 (1) Subject to sub-item (2), the fees payable for collecting income during the period 1 July 2008 to 

30 June 2009 in respect of any property held by the Public Trustee (except in a Fund), alone 
or jointly, are the same as the fees referred to in item 1(1)(b). 

 (2) The fee payable for collecting income during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009 
consisting of receipts of pensions or benefits in respect of unemployment, age, sickness, 
invalidity or war service received by the Public Trustee, alone or jointly, is 3.3% of the 
amount received, where the person on whose behalf the income is received has other moneys 
or investments with a total value of $2,000 or more. 

5. Fee payable for acting as agent or attorney 
 (1) Where the Public Trustee acts as agent or attorney, alone or jointly, its fees shall be as is 

agreed on, and in the absence of agreements, shall be, subject to items 6, 8, 8A and 10— 
 (a) for realising an asset (except from a Fund) during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 

2009—3.85% on the gross proceeds of the assets realised; 
 (b) for collecting the income of any estate (except from a Fund) during the period 1 July 

2008 to 30 June 2009—6.6% on the income received except that in respect of rental 
received by the Public Trustee the fee shall be as fixed from time to time by the body 
known as the Real Estate Institute of Western Australia; and 

 (c) for legal services (other than services covered by item 10) performed during the period 1 
July 2008 to 30 June 2009, other than work connected with realising an asset or 
collecting the income of any estate— 

 (i) legal services performed by a senior practitioner (admitted for more than 5 
years)—$275 per hour; 

 (ii) legal services performed by a junior practitioner (admitted for less than 5 
years)—$198 per hour; and 

 (iii) legal services performed by a clerk/paralegal—$165 per hour. 
 (2)  Sub-item (1) does not cover the services referred to in item 11. 

6. Fee payable for purchase or construction of dwelling house 
In any estate or trust where it is considered desirable to— 
 (a) purchase a dwelling house; or 
 (b) purchase vacant land and construct a dwelling house on that land, 
for the use of any beneficiary or client under the estate or trust, the Public Trustee in arranging the 
purchase or the purchase and construction, as the case may be, is entitled to a fee of 1.1% of the sum 
of the values of— 
 (c) the dwelling house purchased or constructed; and 
 (d) the land on which that dwelling house is situated. 

7. Fee for postage and stationery 
When the Public Trustee administers the estate of a deceased person, acting alone or jointly, the fee 
to cover postages and stationery is in accordance with the following scale— 

On estates not exceeding $10,000 in gross value .............  $27.50 
On estates exceeding $10,000 in gross value ................... $55 

8. Common Account 
The Public Trustee shall deduct, by way of fees in respect of the management of the Common Account 
during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009, 6% of the total interest or income earned by 
investment of moneys forming part of the Common Account during that period. 

8A. Strategic common accounts 
The Public Trustee shall receive, with respect to the supervision of the management of a strategic 
common account during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009, a fee not exceeding— 
 (a) 2% per annum, calculated daily, of the value of the assets under management in that 

strategic common account; minus 
 (b) external management fees and charges (net of any tax credits applicable to those external 

management fees and charges). 

9. Other fees 
For any matter or service not in this Schedule provided for, the fees of the Public Trustee shall be 
such as are agreed or in the absence of agreement such as are fixed by the Public Trustee. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2923 

 

9A. Fees payable in respect of frozen or confiscated property under the Criminal Property 
Confiscation Act 2000 
Subject to items 4, 8, 8A and 10, the fees payable to the Public Trustee for performing functions under 
the Criminal Property Confiscation Act 2000 or any Act in substitution for that Act in relation to 
frozen or confiscated property are as follows— 
 (a) an amount calculated at the rate of $165 per hour or a total of $165, whichever is higher, for 

work performed during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009 in relation to the property, 
other than legal services, services covered by item 10 and work connected with the disposal of 
the property; 

 (b) where the Public Trustee disposes of the property, an amount equal to 2.75% of the gross 
amount realised on the disposal of the property; 

 (c) for legal services performed during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009, other than 
services covered by item 10 and work connected with the disposal of the property— 

 (i) legal services performed by a senior practitioner (admitted for more than 5 years)—
$275 per hour; 

 (ii) legal services performed by a junior practitioner (admitted for less than 5 years)—$198 
per hour; and 

 (iii) legal services performed by a clerk/paralegal—$165 per hour. 

9B. Fees payable to the Public Trustee for examination of accounts 
 (1) In this item— 
  “value” means the gross capital value of the estate at the date of the examination. 
 (2) The fees specified in the Table to this subitem are payable to the Public Trustee for 

examining the accounts of the estate of a represented person during the period 1 July 2008 to 
30 June 2009. 

Table 
Value of estate Fee 

$ $ 
0—999 0 
1 000—20 000 55 
20 001 upwards 165 per hour or a total of 

165, whichever is higher 
 (3) There shall be no fees payable to the Public Trustee for the examination of accounts pursuant 

to section 80 of the Guardianship and Administration Act 1990 during the period 1 July 2008 
to 30 June 2009. 

9C. Fees payable for management of represented person’s estate 
 (1) In this item, unless the contrary intention appears— 

 “value” means gross capital value on 30 June 2009. 
 (2) Subject to sub-items (3), (4) and (5) and to items 2, 4, 6, 8, 8A, 9B and 10, the fee payable to 

the Public Trustee for management of the estate of a represented person during the period 1 
July 2008 to 30 June 2009 is the amount specified in the Table to this sub-item corresponding 
to the value of those assets of the estate that are under the day to day care of the Public 
Trustee. 

Table 
Value of estate 

$ 
Fee 

$ 
Not more than 5,000 55 

5,001 to 15,000 110 
15,001 to 25,000 165 

25,001 to 50,000 220 
50,001 to 100,000 330 

100,001 to 500,000 550 
500,001 to 1,000,000 1,100 

More than 1,000,000 2,750 
 
 (3) If the administration of the estate commences after 1 July 2008, the annual fee referred to in 

sub-item (2) is to be calculated on a pro rata basis. 
 (4) If the Public Trustee ceases to administer the estate of a represented person before 30 June 

2009— 
 (a) the annual fee referred to in sub-item (2) is to be calculated on a pro rata basis for that 

year; and 
 (b) for that purpose the value of the assets referred to in sub-item (2) is their gross capital 

value on the day on which administration of the estate ceases. 



2924 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

 (5) The fees payable for legal services (other than services covered by item 10) performed in 
connection with the management of the estate of a represented person during the period 1 
July 2008 to 30 June 2009 are— 

 (a) legal services performed by a senior practitioner (admitted for more than 5 years)—
$275 per hour; 

 (b) legal services performed by a junior practitioner (admitted for less than 5 years)—$198 
per hour; and 

 (c) legal services performed by a clerk/paralegal—$165 per hour. 
 (6) No fees are payable for a legal service in sub-item (5) during such periods in which the Public 

Trustee engages an external firm of solicitors to provide that service. 

9D. Fees payable for work done in relation to orders made under the Guardianship and 
Administration Act 1990 
 (1) Subject to sub-item (2) and to item 10, the fee payable to the Public Trustee for work done 

during the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009 in order to comply with an order made under 
the Guardianship and Administration Act 1990 in respect of an estate, where the Public 
Trustee is not an executor, trustee or administrator of the estate, is $165 per hour or a total 
of $165, whichever is higher. 

 (2) The fees payable for legal services (other than services covered by item 10) performed during 
the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009 in order to comply with an order made under the 
Guardianship and Administration Act 1990 in respect of an estate, where the Public Trustee 
is not an executor, trustee or administrator of the estate are— 

 (a) legal services performed by a senior practitioner (admitted for more than 5 years)—
$275 per hour; 

 (b) legal services performed by a junior practitioner (admitted for less than 5 years)—$198 
per hour; and 

 (c) legal services performed by a clerk/paralegal—$165 per hour. 

6. Conveyancing services 
 (1) The following fees are payable to the Public Trustee for preparing and lodging the following 

documents— 
 (a) caveat—$110; 
 (b) withdrawal of caveat—$100; 
 (c) deeds—$330; 
 (d) mortgage or charge—$220; 
 (e) extension of mortgage—$350; 
 (f) reseal of an interstate or overseas grant of probate or letters of administration—$500 
 (2)  A fee of $220 is payable to the Public Trustee for preparing a discharge of a mortgage or 

charge and registering it or attending at settlement, as the case may be. 
 (3)  A fee of $93 is payable to the Public Trustee for production of a certificate of title or Crown 

lease, plus $5.50 for each subsequent title in the same security and lodged at the same time. 
 (4)  The following fees are payable to the Public Trustee for searching for the following documents 

at the Western Australian Land Information Authority (also known as Landgate)— 
 (a) search of Certificate of Title where number known—$7; 
 (b) search of name and order subsequent Certificate of Title address search—$10; 
 (c) if more than one search after the initial fee, all subsequent searches—$7; 
 (d) search of document—$7; 
 (e) search of name, location, lot index—$9; 
 (f) check search—$6.50; 
 (g) search of plan, diagram—$7; and 
 (h) memorial—$7. 

11. Executor Support Service 
The fee payable to the Public Trustee for making an application for a grant of probate or letters of 
administration when acting as an agent pursuant to section 12A of the Public Trustee Act 1941 is 
$165 per hour or a total of $165, whichever is higher. 

12. Definitions 
In this scale of fees, unless the contrary intention appears— 
 (a) “court trust” means a trust established pursuant to the order of a court, board, tribunal, 

assessor or other judicial or quasi-judicial body, but does not include moneys paid into court; 
 (b) “de facto partner” has the same meaning as in the Interpretation Act 1984;  
 (c) “junior practitioner” and “senior practitioner” have the same meanings as in the Legal 

Practitioners (Supreme Court) (Contentious Business) Determination 2006; and 
 (d) “represented person” means a person in respect of whom there is in force under the 

Guardianship and Administration Act 1990 an administration order whereby the Public 
Trustee is the administrator or a joint administrator of the estate of that person, or a person 
for whom the Public Trustee is manager pursuant to section 124 and Schedule 5 of the 
Guardianship and Administration Act 1990. 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2925 

 

13. Time and manner 
The Public Trustee’s fees will be paid or deducted as soon as practicable, and need not be paid or 
deducted in the financial year in which they were incurred. They will be paid or deducted in the 
manner that the Public Trustee, his staff or agents consider suitable at the time. 

NOTES 
Sections 6B, 38A and 38B of the Public Trustee Act 1941 are to come into operation on 1 July 2008. 

This Scale of Fees is a Schedule to the agreement between the Public Trustee and the Attorney 
General, for the period 1 July 2008 to 30 June 2009, made pursuant to section 6B of the Public 
Trustee Act 1941 (“the Agreement”). 

The following clauses are included in the main body to the Agreement— 

4. DEFINITIONS AND INTERPRETATION 

Unless otherwise indicated, words and phrases defined in the Public Trustee Act 1941 (“the Act”) or 
Public Trustee Regulations 1942 shall have the same meaning in this Agreement. 

6. DETERMINATION OF SCALE OF FEES 

 6.1 The Public Trustee’s scale of fees pursuant to section 38A(1) of the Act shall be as set out in 
the Schedule to this Agreement. 

 6.2 This scale of fees shall be in addition to the expenses and disbursements for which the Public 
Trustee is legally entitled to charge. These include, but are not limited to— 

 6.2.1 external management fees and charges with respect to a strategic common account; 

 6.2.2 costs of engaging external lawyers; 

 6.2.3 expenses incurred in connection with the purchase of a dwelling house; 

 6.2.4 expenses incurred in purchasing vacant land and constructing a dwelling house on that 
land; and 

 6.2.5 charges by the Western Australian Land Information Authority (also known as 
Landgate). 

 6.3 The Public Trustee may, in addition to fees chargeable under section 38B of the Act, charge a 
fee for work involved in the preparation and lodging of returns for the purpose of or in 
connection with assessments of any duties or taxes (other than probate, death, succession or 
estate duties). This is allowed for in sections 38B(6) and (7) of the Act. 

 6.4 Pursuant to section 38B(9) of the Act, where in a particular case the Public Trustee is 
satisfied that there is proper cause, the Public Trustee may waive, either wholly or in part, 
any fees determined under the Act. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Gingin 
APPOINTMENT OF REGISTRATION OFFICER AND AUTHORISED OFFICER 

It is hereby notified for public information that Danny Benoiton has been appointed as a Ranger and 
Authorised Officer pursuant to the following Acts and has been authorised to enforce the following 
Acts, Regulations and Local Laws— 

Local Government Act 1995 (as amended) 

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 

Control of Vehicles (Off-Road Areas) Act 1978 and Regulations 

Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995 and Regulations 1997 

Dog Act 1976 and Regulations 

Bush Fires Act 1954 and Regulations 

Justices of the Peace Act 2004 

Litter Act 1979 

All Shire of Gingin Local Laws 

The appointments of Giuseppe Silvestro and Rennie Wiremu Tai are hereby cancelled. 

S. D. FRASER, Chief Executive Officer. 



2926 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

LG402* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT 1960 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT (BUILDING SURVEYORS) 2008 
Shire of Cuballing 
Shire of Wickepin 

Appointment of Authorised Officers 
It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons are appointed as Building 
Surveyors for the Shire of Cuballing and Shire of Wickepin. 

Mr Neil Flood 
Mr Allan Ramsay 

Mr Rodney Woods 
Mr Linton Thomas 

Mr Frank Buise 

Mr PETER NAYLOR, Chief Executive Officer, 
Shire of Cuballing. 

Mr ALAN LEESON, Chief Executive Officer, 
Shire of Wickepin. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
RENEWAL OF EXPLORATION PERMIT WA-313-P (R1) 

Renewal of Exploration Permit WA-313-P (R1) has been granted to ENI Australia B.V. to have effect 
from and including 16th June 2008 for a period of five years. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
SUBIACO REDEVELOPMENT ACT 1994 

SUBIACO REDEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY 
Subiaco Redevelopment Scheme 

Amendment No. 5 
Available for Public Inspection 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure has 
approved for advertising Amendment No. 5 to the Subiaco Redevelopment Scheme. The function of 
Amendment No. 5 is to facilitate the redevelopment of the former TAFE site at the corner of Station 
Street and Salvado Road, Subiaco.  
Comments are now invited on the proposed amendment. A Scheme Report (including Scheme Map 
and Precinct Planning Policy) detailing the amendment is available for inspection at the office of the 
Subiaco Redevelopment Authority located at 12 Lindsay Street, Northbridge, between the hours of 
8:30am and 5:00pm, Monday to Friday and may also be viewed on the Authority’s website 
www.sra.wa.gov.au. 
Written submissions should be addressed to— 

The Chief Executive Officer 
Subiaco Redevelopment Authority 
Locked Bag 8 
Perth Business Centre 
WA 6849 

Attention: Planning Manager 
The closing date for submissions is Tuesday 5 August 2008.  



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2927 

 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PC401* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor 
in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of the Interpretation Act 1984, has approved the following 
temporary appointment— 

Hon J R Ford MLC to act temporarily in the office of Minister for the Environment; Climate 
Change; Peel in the absence of the Hon D A Templeman MLA for the period 28 June to 
11 July 2008 (both dates inclusive).  

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

PC402* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the temporary appointment by the Governor in 
accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of the Interpretation Act 1984 of the Hon D A Templeman MLA as 
Minister for Energy; Resources; Industry and Enterprise in the absence of the Hon F M Logan MLA 
for the period 4 to 14 July 2008 (both dates inclusive) has been cancelled. 
These arrangements supersede those published in Government Gazette Number 59 on 15 April 2008. 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Hazel Bagnall late of 58 Barnesby Drive, Albany, Western Australia. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 14 March 2008, are required by the trustee of the 
late Hazel Bagnall of c/- Haynes Robinson Solicitors of PO Box 485, Albany, Western Australia to 
send particulars of their claims to them within one (1) month from the date of publication of this 
notice, after which date the trustee may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the 
claims of which it then has notice. 
Dated this 19th day of June 2008. 

HAYNES ROBINSON. 

 
 

 

 

——————————— 
 



2928 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

PERTH OBSERVATORY 

 

THE W.A. SPECIALISTS IN 
ASTRONOMICAL 

RESEARCH & EDUCATIONAL 
ASTRONOMY 

Public Tours (day and night) 
Field Nights, Lectures 

Astronomical Information 

Astronomical Handbook 
Sun rise & set; Moon rise & set 

Legal advice 
Chronometer calibration 
Astronomical souvenirs 

SERVING WESTERN AUSTRALIA SINCE 1896 

WALNUT ROAD, BICKLEY 6076 
TELEPHONE 9293 8255  FAX 9293 8138 

ASTRONOMY IS L KING UP 



24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2929 

 

Order your Bound Volumes of 
Government Gazette 2008 

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette 

 

For Government Departments and 
private firms who require bound copies 
of Government Gazettes, the State Law 
Publisher offers a subscription covering 
4 Quarterly Volumes at a cost of 
$1,138.50. 

The Gazettes will be bound in black 
cloth with gold foil lettering on the 
spine and personalised by  the addition 
of the client's name in gold lettering on 
the front cover. 

 

PLEASE NOTE 
On the rare occasion where extra 
gazettes are published in one quarter, a 
fifth volume may be required. In this 
instance the extra cost involved will be 
borne by the State Law Publisher and 
not passed on to clients. 

 
 

For further information please contact: 

State Law Publisher 

Telephone: 9321 7688 



2930 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2009 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2009. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically on any day. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 949.75
  Interstate  ..................................... 966.80

 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,177.20
 
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 456.10
  Interstate ...................................... 543.50
 
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 900.80
  Interstate ................................... 1,101.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 888.25
  Interstate ...................................... 902.00
 

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 320.75 
  Interstate ....................................... 357.15 
  Overseas ........................................ 415.65 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 886.05 

 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 345.75 
  Interstate ........................................ 357.15 

 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA ...................................... 475.45 
  Interstate ....................................... 498.20 

 

 

 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS 
 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at 
State Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of 
publication of the missing item. 
Claims lodged after this period will not be recognised and will attract 
payment in full. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 


