
!200800116GG! 
 

  3137 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 1 JULY 2008 No. 116 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Jetties Act 1926—Jetties Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008 ............................................  3140 
Local Government Act 1995—Town of Cambridge—Standing Orders Amendment Local 

Law 2008.................................................................................................................................  3139 
Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967— 

Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2008.................................................  3154 
Ports and Harbours Amendment Regulations 2008..........................................................  3155 
Ports and Harbours Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2008..............................................  3156 

Transport Co-ordination Act 1966— 
Transport Co-ordination Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008 ......................................  3159 
Transport (Country Taxi-car) Amendment Regulations 2008 ..........................................  3160 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Cemeteries..................................................................................................................................  3162 
Consumer and Employment Protection ....................................................................................  3165 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  3168 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  3165 
Land............................................................................................................................................  3165 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  3166 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  3167 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  3168 
 
 



 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

WARNING — PRICE INCREASE 
ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 

EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2008 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$25.60 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$59.70 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$59.70 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.95 

  Bulk Notices—$218.20 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3139 

— PART 1 — 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Town of Cambridge 

STANDING ORDERS AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2008 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and all other powers 
enabling it, the Council of the Town of Cambridge resolved on 27 May 2008 to make 
the Town of Cambridge Standing Orders Amendment Local Law 2008. 
 

PART 1—PRELIMINARY 

1.1 Citation 
This local law may be cited as the Town of Cambridge Standing Orders Amendment 
Local Law 2008. 

1.2 Objective 
The objective of this local law is to make minor amendments to the existing Standing 
Orders Local Law to allow Elected Members the opportunity to ask supplementary 
questions of an application proponent during the course of Committee discussion 
about the issue at hand. 

1.3 Commencement 
This local law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the 
Government Gazette. 

1.4 Application 
This local law applies throughout the district. 
 

PART 2—AMENDMENT 

2.1 Principal Local Law 
In this amendment local law, the Town of Cambridge Standing Orders Local Law 
published in the Government Gazette on 2 May 2007 is referred to as the principal 
local law. 
The principal local law is hereby amended as follows— 

2.2 Amendment 
2.2.1 Insert the following subclause after subclause 16.6— 

“16.7 Questions by Members at Committee Meetings 
(1) During discussion on any item of business, Committee Members may, 
through the Presiding Member, ask any member of the public who has made a 
representation on that item one question relating to that item. 
(2) Further questions may be asked by the Presiding Member or by a Member 
with the consent of the Presiding Member. 
(3) Each question and response— 

 (a) must be brief, concise and to the point; 
 (b) is not to be accompanied by argument or debate.” 

———— 

Dated this 9th day of June 2008 

The Common Seal of the Town of Cambridge was affixed by authority of a resolution 
of the Council in the presence of— 

SIMON WITHERS, Mayor. 
JASON R. BUCKLEY, Chief Executive Officer. 



3140 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MX301* 

Jetties Act 1926 

Jetties Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Jetties Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Jetties 
Regulations 1940. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 clause 1 Table 1.1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 236.02 244.04 

1 23.60 24.40 

1 47.20 48.82 

2 198.91 205.68 

2 19.89 20.56 

2 39.78 41.14 

3 180.33 186.47 

3 18.03 18.64 

3 36.07 37.30 

4 33.14 34.27 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3141 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

5 6.63 6.86 

6 121.99 126.14 

6 3.98 4.12 

7 30.50 31.54 

 (2) Schedule 1 clause 2 Table 2.1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 153.80 159.03 

1 247.96 256.39 

1 308.95 319.45 

1 464.10 479.88 

2 1 506.31 1 557.52 

3 2 980.82 3 082.17 

4 373.92 386.64 

5 $7.63 $7.89 

5 7.63 7.89 

5 30.50 31.54 

6 $4.41 $4.56 

6 4.41 4.56 

 (3) Schedule 1 clause 3 Table 3.1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 621.31 642.44 

1 3.72 3.84 

 (4) Schedule 1 clause 4 Table 4.1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 25.74 26.62 

1 12.88 13.32 

1 19.31 19.96 

1 25.74 26.62 

2 25.74 26.62 



3142 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

 (5) Schedule 1 clause 4 Table 4.1 item 2 is amended by inserting 
after “fishing bait” — 

  “     , per t or m3    ”. 

 (6) Schedule 1 clause 4 Table 4.2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 6.44 6.65 

2 77.24 79.87 

2 3.22 3.33 

3 6.44 6.65 

3 25.74 26.62 

4 $6.44 $6.65 

4 6.44 6.65 

 (7) Schedule 1 clause 5 Table 5.1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 262.47 271.40 

1 26.24 27.13 

1 52.49 54.28 

1 19.71 20.38 

1 3.94 4.07 

3 35.11 36.30 

 (8) Schedule 1 clause 5 Table 5.2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 55.12 57.00 

1 110.24 113.99 

2 187.48 193.86 

2 218.72 226.16 

3 7.88 8.14 

3 32.81 33.93 

4 7.88 8.14 

4 32.81 33.93 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3143 

 (9) Schedule 1 clause 8 Table 8.1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 233.38 241.31 
1 23.34 24.12 
1 46.68 48.26 
1 33.14 34.27 
1 6.63 6.86 
2 186.97 193.32 
2 18.70 19.34 
2 37.40 38.67 
2 33.14 34.27 
2 6.63 6.86 
3 163.10 168.64 
3 16.30 16.86 
3 32.62 33.74 
3 19.89 20.56 
3 3.98 4.12 
4 35.11 36.30 
5 3.32 3.43 
6 662.99 685.53 
6 132.61 137.11 
7 198.91 205.68 
8 26.52 27.42 

 (10) Schedule 1 clause 9 Table 9.1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 5.30 5.48 
1 11.95 12.35 
2 3.98 4.12 

 (11) Schedule 1 clause 9 Table 9.2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 389.94 403.09 

1 38.98 40.31 



3144 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 77.97 80.62 

1 38.62 39.93 

1 3.86 3.99 

1 7.72 7.98 

3 338.12 349.61 

3 33.81 34.96 

3 67.62 69.92 

3 19.31 19.96 

3 3.86 3.99 

3 338.12 349.61 

4 271.82 281.06 

4 27.18 28.11 

4 54.36 56.21 

4 32.16 33.26 

4 6.44 6.65 

4 271.82 281.06 

5 35.11 36.30 

6 13.26 13.71 

7 5.15 5.32 

7 7.72 7.98 

8 7.72 7.98 

8 3.30 3.41 

9 193.11 199.67 

9 3.86 3.99 

9 386.21 399.34 

9 7.72 7.98 

10 1.33 1.38 

10 24.42 25.25 

11 33.15 34.28 

12 662.99 685.53 

12 132.60 137.11 

13 6.63 6.86 

13 25.74 26.62 

14 4.13 4.27 

15 66.29 68.54 

15 6.63 6.86 

 (12) Schedule 1 clause 9 Table 9.2 item 8 is amended by inserting 
after “cruise liner” — 

  “    transfer vessel    ”. 

 (13) Schedule 1 clause 10 Table 10.1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3145 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 219.70 227.17 
1 21.97 22.71 
1 28.56 29.53 
2 299.04 309.20 
2 29.91 30.93 
2 38.87 40.20 
3 299.04 309.20 
3 29.91 30.93 
3 59.81 61.84 
4 30.49 31.53 
4 6.10 6.30 

 (14) Schedule 1 clause 11 Table 11.1 is deleted and the following 
Table is inserted instead —  

“     
Table 11.1 (Berthing and pen rental) 

Item Service $ 

1. For pen for commercial or pleasure vessel, per m of 
the longer of the vessel’s length and the chargeable 
length for the pen —  

 

 • for 12 months paid in advance 332.75 

 • for 3 months or more, per month paid in advance 33.28 

 • for one month or more, per month paid in advance 66.55 

2. For pen for commercial vessel, per m of the longer of 
the vessel’s length and the chargeable length for the 
pen — 

 

 • for one week or more, per week paid in advance 31.70 

 • for 3 days paid in advance 12.68 

 • otherwise, per day 6.34 

3. For pen for pleasure vessel, per m of the longer of the 
vessel’s length and the chargeable length for the 
pen —  

 

 • for one week or more, per week paid in advance 22.19 

 • for 3 days paid in advance 8.88 

 • otherwise, per day 4.44 

4. For living on board a vessel, per vessel per month 103.02 

5. For use of service jetty for short time just to load or 
unload vessel, unless the item 1, 2 or 3 fee has been 
paid for the vessel — 

 

 • for 12 months, per vessel paid in advance 951.06 

 • per m of the vessel’s length per day 3.17 

6. For use of pen or service wharf by cruise liner transfer 
vessel to load or unload passengers — 

 

 • per m of the vessel’s length per day 7.98 

 • plus, per passenger 3.41 
    ”. 



3146 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

 (15) Schedule 1 clause 13 Table 13.1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 77.24 79.87 

2 3.86 3.99 

 (16) Schedule 1 clause 14 Table 14.1 is deleted and the following 
Table is inserted instead — 

“     
Table 14.1 (Berthing, jetty use and pen rental) 

Item Service $ 

1. For pen for commercial or pleasure vessel, per m of 
the longer of the vessel’s length and the chargeable 
length for the pen —  

 

 • for 12 months paid in advance 335.50 

 • for 3 months or more, per month paid in advance 33.56 

 • for one month or more, per month paid in advance 67.10 

2. For pen for commercial vessel, per m of the longer of 
the vessel’s length and the chargeable length for the 
pen — 

 

 • for one week or more, per week paid in advance 32.30 

 • otherwise, per day 6.46 

3. For pen for pleasure vessel, per m of the longer of the 
vessel’s length and the chargeable length for the 
pen —  

 

 • for one week or more, per week paid in advance 22.75 

 • for 3 days paid in advance 9.10 

 • otherwise, per day 4.55 

4. For vehicular use of service jetty and land adjacent to 
it by a business (company or registered business 
name), other than lessee of land at Jurien Boat 
Harbour controlled or managed by Department, to load 
or unload vessels, for 12 months paid in advance, 
per business 

 
 
 
 
 

3 980.90 

5. For use of service jetty by vessel for which the item 1 
or 2 fee has not been paid, per m of vessel’s length 
per day 

 
 

3.23 

    ”. 

 (17) Schedule 1 clause 18 Table 18.1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3147 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 257.47 266.22 

1 25.74 26.62 

1 51.49 53.24 

1 32.20 33.26 

1 6.44 6.65 

2 128.73 133.11 

3 6.44 6.65 

4 6.44 6.65 

4 25.74 26.62 

6 6.44 6.65 

 (18) Schedule 1 clause 19 Table 19.1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 386.21 399.34 

1 (both places) 38.62 39.93 

1 77.24 79.87 

1 7.72 7.98 

2 308.96 319.46 

2 30.90 31.95 

2 61.79 63.89 

2 32.16 33.26 

2 6.44 6.65 

3 12.88 13.32 

3 25.74 26.62 

 (19) Schedule 1 clause 19 Table 19.2 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 3.48 3.59 

2 5.98 6.19 

3 128.73 133.11 

3 182.20 189.01 

4 154.48 159.74 

4 225.29 232.95 



3148 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

 (20) Schedule 1 clause 20 Table 20.1 is deleted and the following 
Tables are inserted instead — 

“     
Table 20.1 (Berthing and pen rental) 

Item Service $ 

1. For pen for commercial or pleasure vessel —   

 • for 12 months, if paid in advance 951.50 

 • plus per vessel, per m of the longer of the vessel’s 
length and the chargeable length (if any) for the 
pen 

 
 

77.00 

2. For use of service jetty other than for short time to 
load or unload by vessel for which item 1 fee has been 
paid, per vessel per day 

 
 

44.00 

3. For use of service jetty for short time just to load or 
unload vessel for which item 1 fee has not been paid, 
per vessel for 12 months paid in advance 

 
 

275.00 

4. For other use of service jetty by vessel, per m of the 
vessel’s length per day 

 
5.50 

Table 20.2 (Wharfage) 

Item Service $ 

1. Wharfage for general cargo 

If loaded from or into a vessel, per vessel, for 
12 months (excludes fishing product, fishing 
equipment and bait) 

 
 
 

550.00 

    ”. 

 (21) Schedule 1 clause 22 Table 22.1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 $0.91 $0.94 

1 138.42 143.13 

2 $5.01 $5.18 

2 92.25 95.38 

3 $5.01 $5.18 

3 92.25 95.38 

4 $7.18 $7.43 

5 $23.12 $23.91 

 (22) Schedule 1 clause 22 Table 22.2 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3149 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 80.23 82.96 

1 99.28 102.65 

1 50.36 52.07 

1 159.12 164.52 

2 46.23 47.80 

3 (both places) 1.98 2.05 

3 0.42 0.43 

3 8.43 8.71 

3 8.77 9.07 

3 3.41 3.53 

3 2.77 2.87 

3 3.27 3.38 

3 2.71 2.80 

3 1.85 1.91 

3 3.26 3.37 

3 3.12 3.23 

3 12.31 12.73 

3 5.37 5.55 

 (23) Schedule 1 clause 22 Table 22.4 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 0.54 0.56 

2 (both places) 0.54 0.56 

3 29.48 30.48 

 (24) Schedule 1 clause 22 Table 22.5 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 113.49 117.35 

1 165.31 170.93 

2 138.68 143.39 

 (25) Schedule 1 clause 22 Table 22.6 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 



3150 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 10.55 10.91 

1 12.02 12.43 

1 15.01 15.53 

 (26) Schedule 1 clause 22 Table 22.7 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 2.76 2.85 

2 25.49 26.35 

2 8.17 8.45 

2 2.71 2.80 

 (27) Schedule 1 clause 23 Table 23.1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 5.15 5.32 

1 11.58 11.98 

 (28) Schedule 1 clause 24 Table 24.1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 64.37 66.56 

 (29) Schedule 1 clause 25 Table 25.1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 128.73 133.11 

1 25.74 26.62 

1 2.58 2.67 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3151 

 (30) Schedule 1 clause 26 Table 26.1 is deleted and the following 
Table is inserted instead —  

“     
Table 26.1 (Berthing or mooring) 

Item Service $ 

1. Berthing or mooring —   

 • for 12 months paid in advance 201.31 

 • per day, per m of vessel’s length 3.99 

2. Electricity supply, 3-phase per 12 hour period 26.62 

    ”. 

 (31) Schedule 1 clause 27 Table 27.1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 3.86 3.99 

2 6.44 6.65 

5. Schedule 1A amended 

 (1) The Table to Schedule 1A clause 1 is amended in each item 
listed in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting 
the figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure 
set out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

4 0.036 0.0375 

18 0.00843 0.00871 

 (2) The Table to Schedule 1A clause 1 is amended by deleting 
item 11. 

6. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) The Table to Schedule 2 clause 1 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 $3 218.41 $3 327.83 

1 $45.06 $46.59 

1 $5 793.12 $5 990.08 

1 $321.84 $332.78 



3152 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 $514.95 $532.45 

1 $4 505.77 $4 658.97 

2 $64.37 $66.56 

 (2) The Table to Schedule 2 clause 2 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 61.03 63.10 

1 12.21 12.63 

 (3) The Table to Schedule 2 clause 3 is amended in each item listed 
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 549.26 567.82 

1 54.93 56.80 

1 109.85 113.58 

2 378.38 391.24 

2 37.84 39.13 

2 75.68 78.24 

3 341.76 353.38 

3 34.18 35.34 

3 68.35 70.68 

4 152.57 157.76 

5 30.51 31.55 

6 93.65 96.84 

 (4) The Table to Schedule 2 clause 4 is deleted and the following 
Table is inserted instead —  

“     
Table 

Item Description $ 

1. For fixed pen for commercial vessel, if paid in 
advance —  

 

 • for 12 months, per m of the longer of the vessel’s 
length and the chargeable length for the pen 

 
387.02 

 • for 3 months or more, per m of vessel’s length per 
month 

 
38.71 

 • for one month or more, per m of vessel’s length 
per month  

 
77.40 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3153 

Item Description $ 

2. For floating pen for commercial vessel, if paid in 
advance —  

 

 • for 12 months, per m of the longer of the vessel’s 
length and the chargeable length for the pen  

 
412.46 

 • for 3 months or more, per m of vessel’s length per 
month  

 
41.24 

 • for one month or more, per m of vessel’s 
length per month  

 
82.50 

3. For fixed pen for pleasure vessel, if paid in advance —   

 • for 12 months, per m of the longer of the vessel’s 
length and the chargeable length for the pen 

 
356.14 

 • for 3 months or more, per m of vessel’s length per 
month 

 
35.61 

 • for one month or more, per m of vessel’s length 
per month  

 
71.24 

4. For floating pen for pleasure vessel, if paid in 
advance —  

 

 • for 12 months, per m of the longer of the vessel’s 
length and the chargeable length for the pen  

 
381.59 

 • for 3 months or more, per m of vessel’s length per 
month  

 
38.16 

 • for one month or more, per m of vessel’s 
length per month  

 
76.31 

5. For pen for one week or more, per week —  

 • for commercial vessel, higher of $167.97 and 
$20.62 per m of vessel’s length 

 

 • for pleasure vessel, higher of $167.97 and $19.07 
per m of vessel’s length 

 

6. For pen per day —  

 • for commercial vessel —   

  • per m of vessel’s length 4.13 

  • minimum fee for overnight use 33.59 

 • for pleasure vessel —   

  • per m of vessel’s length 3.81 

  • minimum fee for overnight use 33.59 

7. For use of service jetty, per m of vessel’s length 
per day —  

 

 • for commercial vessel 4.13 

 • for pleasure vessel 3.81 

8. For use of service jetty for up to 3 hours by pleasure 
vessel, per vessel 

 
24.69 

9. For living on board a vessel, per vessel per month 96.84 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



3154 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

MX302* 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Navigable Waters Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Navigable 
Waters Regulations 1958. 

4. Regulation 45BA amended 

 (1) Regulation 45BA(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$253.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $261.70    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$68.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $71.20    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 45BA(3) is amended by deleting “$190.50” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $196.90    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 45BA(6a)(b) is amended by deleting “$68.90.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $71.20.    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3155 

MX303* 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Ports and Harbours Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Ports and Harbours Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Ports and 
Harbours Regulations 1966. 

4. Regulation 16A amended 

 (1) Regulation 16A(1) is repealed and the following subregulation 
is inserted instead —  

“     
 (1) A person is not eligible to be examined under 

regulation 16B unless in the 2 years immediately 
before the examination he or she has made —  

 (a) 3 trips into and 3 trips out of the subject port in 
command of a vessel; or 

 (b) 2 trips into and 2 trips out of the subject port in 
command of a vessel and 2 trips into and 2 trips 
out of the subject port as first mate on duty on 
the bridge throughout the period of pilotage or, 
if the vessel was under the command of an 
exempt master, throughout what would 
otherwise have been the period of compulsory 
pilotage. 

    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 16A(2) is amended by deleting “(b)”. 

 (3) Regulation 16A(3) is amended by deleting “(ii)”. 



3156 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

5. Regulation 16E amended 

  Regulation 16E(1) is amended by deleting “(b)”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

MX304* 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Ports and Harbours Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Ports and Harbours Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Ports and 
Harbours Regulations 1966. 

4. Regulation 14 amended 

  Regulation 14(3) is amended by deleting “$4 402.60” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $4 552.28    ”. 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3157 

5. Regulation 15 amended 

  Regulation 15(3) is amended by deleting “$724.53” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $749.16    ”. 

6. Regulation 15A amended 

 (1) Regulation 15A(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$721.82” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $746.36    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 15A(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$721.82” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $746.36    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$857.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $886.14    ”. 

7. Regulation 15B amended 

  Regulation 15B is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$343.34” and inserting instead —  

  “    $355.02    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$492.04” and inserting instead —  

  “    $508.77    ”. 

8. Regulation 15C amended 

  Regulation 15C(a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$108.14” and inserting instead —  

  “    $111.82    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$724.53” and inserting instead —  

  “    $749.16    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$1 881.62” and inserting instead —  

  “    $1 945.59    ”. 

9. Regulation 16 amended 

  Regulation 16(d)(i) is amended by deleting “$796.17” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $823.24    ”. 

10. Regulation 18 amended 

 (1) Regulation 18(1)(f) is amended by deleting “issued under the 
Fisheries Act 1905” and inserting instead —  

“     
  granted under the Fish Resources Management 

Regulations 1995 
    ”. 



3158 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

 (2) Regulation 18(2)(e) and (f) are deleted and the following 
paragraph is inserted instead —  

“     
 (e) in the case of conservancy dues referred to in 

item 3, on 1 July. 
    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 18(2a) is amended by deleting “and the Third 
Schedule Division 2”. 

11. Third Schedule amended 

 (1) The Third Schedule Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
amount set out in column 2, and inserting instead the amount set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 $4 838.44 $5 002.94 

1 $4 951.42 $5 119.77 

1 $5 496.15 $5 683.02 

1 $6 077.39 $6 284.02 

1 $7 292.59 $7 540.54 

1 $8 153.66 $8 430.89 

1 $8 926.85 $9 230.36 

2(a) $601.52 $621.98 

2(c)(i) $343.34 $355.02 

2(c)(ii) $492.04 $508.77 

 (2) The Third Schedule Division 2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
amount set out in column 2, and inserting instead the amount set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1(a)(i) $108.20 $111.80 

1(a)(ii) $141.50 $146.30 

1(a)(iii) $207.10 $214.10 

1(a)(iv) $317.90 $328.70 

1(a)(v) $485.20 $501.60 

1(a)(vi) $758.10 $783.80 

1(b) $96.50 $99.70 

3(a) $108.20 $111.80 

3(b) $141.50 $146.30 

3(c) $207.10 $214.10 

3(d) $317.90 $328.70 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3159 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

3(e) $485.20 $501.60 

3(f) $758.10 $783.80 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

TRANSPORT 

TR301* 

Transport Co-ordination Act 1966 

Transport Co-ordination Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Transport Co-ordination Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day or 
on 1 July 2008, whichever is the later. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Transport 
Co-ordination Regulations 1985. 



3160 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

4. Regulation 8A amended 

  Regulation 8A is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a)(ii) by deleting “$21.70;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $22.40;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (d) by deleting “$1.35.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $1.40.    ”. 

5. Regulation 8B amended 

  Regulation 8B is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$16.20;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $16.80;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$21.70.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $22.40.    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

TR302* 

Transport Co-ordination Act 1966 

Transport (Country Taxi-car) Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Transport (Country Taxi-car) 
Amendment Regulations 2008. 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3161 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day or 
on 1 July 2008, whichever is the later. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Transport 
(Country Taxi-car) Regulations 1982. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 by deleting “162.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    167.90    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “92.20” and inserting instead —  

  “    95.30    ”; 

 (c) in item 3 by deleting “162.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    167.90    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 

 



3162 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

— PART 2 — 

CEMETERIES 

CC401* 
CEMETERIES ACT 1986 

Shire of Exmouth 
FEES AND CHARGES 

In pursuance of the powers conferred by Section 53 of the Cemeteries Act 1986 the Council of the Shire 
of Exmouth hereby records having resolved on the 19th June 2008 to set the following fees and 
charges effective from 15th July 2008. The fees shall be payable upon application for services detailed 
hereunder at Exmouth Public Cemetery. 

EXMOUTH PUBLIC CEMETERY 

Cemetery Charges (in accordance with Cemeteries Act 1986 Section 53) 
 GST 

Exclusive GST Total inc 
GST Det 

GRANT OF RIGHT OF BURIAL  
(applies to Gravesite and Niche Wall Memorials) 

    

Grant of Right of Burial: $113.64 $11.36 $125.00  
Renewal of Right of Burial: $113.64 $11.36 $125.00  

GRAVESITE BURIAL CHARGES    
Interment of Adult: $590.91 $59.09 $650.00  
Interment of Child (under 18): $363.64 $36.36 $400.00  
Interment of Ashes in Family Grave: $190.91 $19.09 $210.00  

MEMORIAL CHARGES    
Spread of Ashes in Cemetery: $68.18 $6.82 $75.00  
Purchase / Pre-Purchase of Niche Memorial: $272.73 $27.27 $300.00  
Niche Pre-Purchase Refund Fee: $27.27 $2.73 $30.00  
Installation of Plaque: $63.64 $6.36 $70.00  

FAMILY GRAVES  
(under existing Grant of Right of Burial)    
Reopening of Family Grave for Interment of Adult: $590.91 $59.09 $650.00  
Reopening of Family Grave for Interment of Child: $363.64 $36.36 $400.00  
Reopening of Family Grave for Interment of Ashes: $190.91 $19.09 $210.00  
Monument Removal by the Shire (prior to Reopening): $118.18 $11.82 $130.00  

EXHUMATIONS    
Fee for Exhumation: $181.82 $18.18 $200.00  
Reinterment after Exhumation—Adult: $590.91 $59.09 $650.00  
Reinterment after Exhumation—Child: $363.64 $36.36 $400.00  
Re-opening of grave for exhumation (performed by 

Shire): $590.91 $59.09 $650.00  

LICENCES / LATE FEES AND ADDITIONAL FEES    
Funeral Directors Licence—Annual: $300.00 – $300.00 s. 34.4 
Permit to Conduct Funeral: $50.00 – $50.00 s. 34.4 
Weekend / Public Holiday Memorials / Burials—

Additional Charge: $136.36 $13.64 $150.00  
Register Inspection Fee: $27.27 $2.73 $30.00  

Note: GST Exempt Items as specified at Section 34.4 of Rulings for GST Free Items Made From a New 
Tax System (Goods and Services Tax) (Exempt Taxes, Fees and Charges) Determination 2006 (No. 2). 

VERONICA FLEAY , Shire President. 
PHILLIP ANASTASAKIS, Chief Executive Officer. 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3163 

CC402* 
CEMETERIES ACT 1986 

Shire of Harvey 

SCALE OF FEES AND CHARGES 

In pursuance of powers conferred upon it by Section 53 of the Cemeteries Act, the Shire of Harvey 
hereby records having resolved on the 27th May, 2008, that the following fees and charges shall apply 
to all cemeteries within the Shire of Harvey from the date of this Gazettal. 
All fees and charges are inclusive of GST. 

1. General Charges 
 1.1 Reservation of specific site (non-refundable) ...........................................................  $194.00 
 1.2 Ordinary land for grave 2.4m x 1.2, .........................................................................  $655.00 
 1.3 Internment of an adult in a grave any depth to 2.1m, including registration fee  

and use of number plate............................................................................................  $495.00 
 1.4 For internment of a child, under the age of seven (7) in grave any depth to 2.1m  

including registration fee and use of number plate.................................................  $225.00 
 1.5 Internment of a stillborn child..................................................................................  $165.00 
 1.6 For internment of cremated ashes............................................................................  $210.00 
 1.7 Each internment of an adult.....................................................................................  $495.00 
 1.8 Internment of a child under seven (7) ......................................................................  $225.00 
 1.9 Internment of a stillborn child..................................................................................  $165.00 

2. Extra Fees 
 2.1 Internment without due notice.................................................................................  $235.00 
 2.2 Internment not in usual hours .................................................................................  $235.00 
 2.3 Internment on a Saturday, Sunday or Public Holiday ............................................  $264.00 
 2.4 Fee of exhumation .....................................................................................................  $605.00 

3. Miscellaneous Charges 
 3.1 Funeral Director’s Annual Licence Fee....................................................................  $96.00 
 3.2 Single Funeral Permit (Funeral Director’s Only) ....................................................  $60.00 
 3.3 Single Funeral Permit (other than Funeral Director’s)...........................................  $275.00 
 3.4 Monumental Mason’s Annual Fee ............................................................................  $120.00 
 3.5 Single Monument Permit (Monumental Masons only)............................................  $60.00 
 3.6 Permit to erect a headstone/kerbing ........................................................................  $73.00 
 3.7 Copy of Local Laws....................................................................................................  $24.00 
 3.8 Copy of Grant of Right of Burial...............................................................................  $24.00 
 3.9 Renewal of Grant of Right of Burial.........................................................................  $96.00 
 3.10 Refund of unexpired Grant of Right of Burial not to exceed the amount  

originally paid, less and administration fee of.........................................................  $85.00 

4. Disposal of Ashes 
 4.1 Reservation for placement ........................................................................................  $73.00 
 4.2 Placement in single niche including bronze plaque and standard inscription.......  $252.00 
 4.3 Placement in double niche including bronze plaque and standard Inscription .....  $312.00 
 4.4 Second inscription .....................................................................................................  $188.00 
 4.5 Plaque for reserved position: Single Niche ..............................................................  $136.00 
 4.6 Plaque for reserved position: Double Niche .............................................................  $242.00 
 4.7 Standard niche wall vase ..........................................................................................  $62.00 
 4.8 Tranquil vase (pyramid shape).................................................................................  $62.00 
 4.9 Conical vase...............................................................................................................  $62.00 
 4.10 Additional text line....................................................................................................  $20.00 

5. Memorial Garden of Remembrance 
 5.1 Reservation for internment.......................................................................................  $73.00 
 5.2 Internment including bronze plaque 143mm x 117mm ..........................................  $252.00 
 5.3 Internment including bronze plaque 143mm x 117mm and reservation for a  

second internment.....................................................................................................  $285.00 
 5.4 Second internment and plaque.................................................................................  $252.00 
 5.5 Internment including bronze plaque 143mm x 117mm and reservation for  

three additional internments....................................................................................  $346.00 
 5.6 Second, third and fourth internments and plaque (each)........................................  $252.00 
 5.7 Plaque for reserved position: Single .........................................................................  $188.00 



3164 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

CC403* 
CEMETERIES ACT 1986 

Morawa Public Cemetery 

SCALE OF FEES AND CHARGES (GST INCLUSIVE) 
Pursuant to s53 of the Cemeteries Act 1986, at its meeting held on 19 June 2008, Council resolved to 
adopt the following scale of fees and charges applicable to the Morowa Public Cemetery— 

On application for “Form of Grant of Right of Burial” for— 

 A Land 2.4m x 1.2m where directed by Board ......................................................  $70 

  Land 2.4m x 2.4m where directed by Board ......................................................  $110 
  Land 2.4m x 3.6m where directed by Board ......................................................  $140 

  Land 2.4m x 1.2 selected by Applicant ..............................................................  $140 
  Land 2.4m x 2.4m selected by Applicant ...........................................................  $170 

  Land 2.4m x 3.6m selected by Applicant ...........................................................  $200 
 B Sinking Fee—On application for a “Form of Order for Burial” for— 

  Ordinary Grave for an adult ..............................................................................  $440 
  Grave for any child under seven years of age....................................................  $270 
  Grave for any still born child .............................................................................  $180 

If graves are required to be sunk deeper than 1.8m the following charges shall be  
payable— 

  First additional 0.3 metres.................................................................................  $50 
  Second additional 0.3 metres .............................................................................  $70 

  Third additional 0.3 metres................................................................................  $90 
  And so on in proportion for each additional 0.3 metres 

Re-opening fees: Re-opening an ordinary grave for each interment or exhumation— 

 A Ordinary grave for an adult ...............................................................................  $360 
  Of a child under seven years of age ...................................................................  $220 

  Of a still born child .............................................................................................  $160 
  Where removal of kerbing, tiles, grass etc is necessary 

  According to time required—per man hour at...................................................  $70 
  Any brick grave...................................................................................................  $140 
  Any vault, according to work required from......................................................  $140 

Extra Charges for— 

 A Interment without 24 hours due notice .............................................................  $110 
 B Interment not in usual hours 8.30am-5.00pm 

  Monday to Friday................................................................................................  $110 
  Saturday, Sunday and Public Holidays .............................................................  $220 
 C Exhumations .......................................................................................................  $220 

Miscellaneous Charges— 

  Permission to erect a headstone and for kerbing ..............................................  $60 
  Permission to erect a monument........................................................................  $90 
  Permission to erect a name plate .......................................................................  $40 
  Registration of Transfer of Form of Grant of Right of Burial...........................  $40 
  Copy of Grant of Burial ......................................................................................  $30 
  Grave Number Plate...........................................................................................  $60 
  Undertakers Annual Licence .............................................................................  $70 
  Making a search of the Register.........................................................................  $20 
  Copy of Local Laws .............................................................................................  $20 

Niche Wall Interment Fees— 

  Single Compartment...........................................................................................  $110 
  Double Compartment .........................................................................................  $170 

Standard Niche Wall Plaque Fees— 

  Single Plaque ......................................................................................................  $220 
  Double Plaque .....................................................................................................  $440 
  Second Inscription on Plaque ............................................................................  $140 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3165 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 
CE401 

ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 
Order Pursuant to Section 34(2) 

TRANSFER OF ACTIVITIES 
Ngala Incorporated 

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 34(2) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987, I hereby order 
that the undertaking of Ngala Incorporated be transferred to Ngala Family Services. 
In accordance with section 34(3) of the Act, Ngala Incorporated will be dissolved on the publication of 
this Order, and the property, rights and liabilities of the association officially become those of Ngala 
Family Services. 
Dated: 24th June 2008. 

ANNE DRISCOLL, Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 

ENERGY 
EN401 

ELECTRICITY ACT 1945 
ELECTRICITY (LICENSING) ORDER 2008 

Made by the Director of Energy Safety under regulation 19(2)(k) of the Electricity (Licensing) 
Regulations 1991. 

1. Citation 
This Order may be cited as the Electricity (Licensing) Order 2008. 

2. Commencement 
This Order is to have effect from the day after the publication of this Order. 

3. Declaration of electrical work not requiring a licence or permit 
(1) It is declared that electrical work comprising the servicing and repair of electrical appliances 
connected to or to be connected to a low voltage electricity supply by means of a plug and cord (or 
flexible cable) may be carried out by persons who are not the holders of a licence or permit issued 
under the provisions of the Electricity (Licensing) Regulations 1991. 
(2) In this clause— 

“low voltage electricity supply” means electricity supplied at a pressure not exceeding 1,000 
volts 50 hertz alternating current or 1,500 volts direct current. 

“servicing and repair” means identifying faulty components within electrical appliances and 
replacing them on a like-for-like basis, and attaching plugs or cords (or flexible cables) and 
cords (or flexible cables) to electrical appliances. 

“electrical appliance” means a device in which electrical energy is consumed or substantially 
changed in character by conversion into heat, sound, light or otherwise. 

ALBERT KOENIG, Director of Energy Safety, 
Department of Consumer and Employment Protection. 

LAND 
LA401 

TRANSFER OF LAND ACT 1893 
DESIGNATION 

Western Australian Land Information 
Authority (Landgate), Midland. 

File: 1236 2004 
His Excellency the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council is pleased 
to designate under section 6 of the Transfer of Land Act 1893 Shane Paul Nelson as a Deputy 
Commissioner of Titles. 

GRAHAME SEARLE, Chief Executive. 



3166 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995  

Shire of Upper Gascoyne 
CENTENARY MEDAL 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and all other powers enabling it, the 
Council of the Shire of Upper Gascoyne on 26 March 2004 resolved that the Centenary Medal be 
awarded to the persons so named in the Table enabling the wearing of the Upper Gascoyne Centenary 
Medal as follows — 
 (a) Evening Functions 
  Holders of medals would wear miniature medals on the left breast of their uniforms,  evening 

dress or lounge suits on such occasions as official receptions and dinners; or an evening event 
arranged for the investiture of others with their insignia of a medal. 

  Ribbon bars are not worn. 
 (b) Day Functions 
  When attending day functions such as Anzac Day or Remembrance Day ceremonies the full-

size insignia is worn on the left breast.  
 (c) Everyday use 
  The ribbon bar may be worn with all forms of dress at the discretion of the holder , however, 

it should not be worn at the same time as the full-size or miniature  medals.  

Table 
Abrahall S Caunt J Gere F 
Archer S Charlton E Gere L 
Atkinson R Clarke J Gilbert P 
Bain AE Collins R Gilpin D 
Bain AG Councillor P Gilmore M 
Baker R Country Housing Authority Great Northern Pumps 
Balcombe J Cragan M Gregorini C 
Balcombe K Crawford J Gregory S 
Ballantyne J Crowe R Gronow A 
Balmer P Davies M Haase B 
Banks A Dawson C Hahn T 
Barber R Deturt C Hammarquist DR 
Baron P Devine O Hammarquist DM 
Baston K Dixon C Hammarquist DL 
Baston M Doherty R Hammarquist M 
Baston N Drage R Harrington F 
Baston V Draper K Harrison J 
Beazley K Eftos J Hatch M 
Beck C Elder A Henderson R 
Beck P  Farrar H Henry M 
Biggar J Featonby T Hillary L 
Birch H Feeney G  Hodder J 
Birney M Fidock R Holberton L 
Bond D Field B Holland C 
Bond J Field L Howard J 
Bond R Field P Houston A 
Bowler J Fisher A Hudson A 
Brand K Fitzhardinge R Jack M 
Brennan J Fletcher E James H 
Brennan R Fletcher T Jefferies B 
Bridge B Foster P Jeffery M 
Bridge R Fox A Jeffery P 
Brown S Fox C Job B 
Burnett D Fox S Jones D 
Burnett K Fraser J Jones W 
Burnett P Fraser J Jorgensen C 
Burns G Fullarton A Kealley L  
Cangemi C Fullarton AR Kelly D 
Carpenter A Fullarton J Kelly M 
Catania V Fullarton S Kempton A 
Caunt J Gallop G Kempton D 



1 July 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3167 

Kempton DM Morrison S Simpson D 
Kempton E Newton B Skinner B 
Kempton J Newton D Smith D 
Kempton K Newton JF Smith B 
Kendall B Newton JL Smith E 
King B Newton JO Smith P 
Kirby R Newton T Solomon A 
Kirk D Nicholson K Somerville R 
Kirk J O’Callaghan K Sommerville B 
Ladhams M Omodei P Sommerville W 
Lampard M Oxenham D Steadman D 
Leahy P Painter D Steadman DP 
Liau P Palmer C Steadman J 
Lienert G Panaia L Steadman P 
Lienert R Pendlebury B Steadman R 
Lienert S Percy J Steadman T 
Lienert V Peters D Steele B 
Liversidge M Petersen T Steele R 
Loftus J Polinelli J Stocks I 
Loftus K Polinelli T Stocks W 
Lumley D Price C Tanner A 
MacKenzie A  Priestley D Taylor C 
MacKenzie R Quigley O Te R 
MacTiernan A Ravlich L Tennant J 
McBurney P Reynolds E Thompson I 
McDonald A Richardson J Tisdell B 
McDonald D Ridley T Trainor M 
McTaggart D Rigoni D Trigg K 
McTaggart J Roberts G Viveash S 
McTaggart L Robertson C Walker B 
McTaggart LM Robinson D Ward C 
Maslen R Robinson G Ward J 
Maslen R Rogers R  Water Corporation 
Mathews G Rogers M Watters G 
Mathews K Rowley T Watters J 
Maver G Russell Gene Weeks W 
Meecham G Russell Guy Wellings B 
Meecham M  Sanderson J Williams G 
Melville D Sanderson L Wilson G 
Michael J Shalders R Wood P 
Michael K Shannon R Woodhead J 
Milne B Sharp C Woods J 
Mitchell Smith T Shepherd G  
Morgan L Siddans D  

ROSS M. COLLINS OAM JP, President. 
JOHN L. NEWTON OAM JP, Chief ExecutiveOfficer. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
GRANT OF PIPELINE LICENCE 

Pipeline Licence No. WA-15-PL was granted on 23 June 2008 to ENI Australia B.V.  

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 



3168 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2008 

MP402* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
RENEWAL OF EXPLORATION PERMIT WA-214-P (R3) 

Renewal of Exploration Permit WA-214-P (R3) has been granted to Apache Northwest Pty Ltd and 
Santos (BOL) Pty Ltd to have effect from and including 25th June 2008 for a period of five years. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 
PI401* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT 1153/41 

Caversham Urban Cell 
Call for Public Submissions 

The Western Australian Planning Commission (WAPC) intends to amend the Metropolitan Region 
Scheme (MRS) for land in the local government of Swan and is seeking public comment. 
The amendment seeks to transfer approximately 131 ha of land generally bounded by Reid Highway, 
Patricia Street, the proposed Lord Street extension and lots fronting Benara Road and West Swan 
Road, from the rural zone to the urban zone. 

Display locations 
The plans showing the proposed change and the WAPC’s amendment report, which explains the 
proposal, will be available for public inspection from Tuesday 3 June 2008 to Friday 5 September 
2008 at each of the following places— 

 • Western Australian Planning Commission 
Wellington Street, Perth 

 • J S Battye Library 
Level 3, Alexander Library Building 
Perth Cultural Centre 

 • City of Perth 
 • City of Fremantle 
 • City of Swan 
 • City of Bassendean 

Documents are also available from the WAPC’s website www.wapc.wa.gov.au. 

Submissions 
Any person who desires to make a submission to support, object or provide comment on any part of 
the proposed amendment should do so on a form 41. This submission form is available from the 
display locations, the amendment report and the internet. 
Submissions must be lodged with the: Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission, 
469 Wellington Street, Perth WA 6000; on or before 5.00pm Friday, 5 September 2008. 
Late submissions will not be considered. 

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

DECEASED ESTATES 
ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Estelle Margaret Frances Wainscoat, late of 27 All Saints Way, Churchlands, Western Australia, 
Music Teacher, (“the deceased”). 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect to the estate of the deceased who died on the 15th April 2008 are required by the Executors 
Geoffrey Stephen Wainscoat and Karen Lesley Woods of care of Clifton Tham Commercial Law & 
Litigation of PO Box 1587, Osborne Park WA 6916 to send particulars of their claims to them by no 
later than 4th August 2008 after which date the Executors may distribute the assets having regard 
only to the claims on hand. 

——————————— 


