
 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Betting Control Act 1954—Betting Control Amendment Regulations 2008...........................  4732 
Casino Control Act 1984—Casino Control (Burswood Island) (Licensing of Employees) 

Amendment Regulations 2008 ...............................................................................................  4739 
Gaming and Wagering Commission Act 1987—Gaming and Wagering Commission 

Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2008...................................................................................  4735 
Liquor Control Act 1988—Liquor Control Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2008 .................  4729 
Public Sector Management Act 1994—Public Sector Management (Breaches of Public 

Sector Standards) Amendment Regulations 2008 ................................................................  4727 
Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003—Racing and Wagering Western 

Australia Amendment Regulations 2008 ..............................................................................  4738 
Racing Penalties (Appeals) Act 1990—Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment 

Regulations 2008 ....................................................................................................................  4734 
 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Corrective Services ....................................................................................................................  4741 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  4748 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  4741 
Marine/Maritime........................................................................................................................  4746 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  4747 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  4747 
 
 

!200800183GG! 
 

  4725 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 28 OCTOBER 2008 No. 183 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 



 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2008 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$25.60 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$59.70 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$59.70 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.95 

  Bulk Notices—$218.20 per page 

Clients who have an account will only be invoiced for charges over $50. 

For charges under $50, clients will need to supply credit card details at time of lodging
notice (i.e. notice under 5cm would not be invoiced). 

Clients without an account will need to supply credit card details or pay at time of
lodging the notice. 

 

 



— PART 1 — 

PUBLIC SERVICE 

PS301* 

 

Public Sector Management Act 1994 

Public Sector Management (Breaches of Public 
Sector Standards) Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Public Sector Management (Breaches 
of Public Sector Standards) Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows —  

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 November 2008. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Public Sector Management 
(Breaches of Public Sector Standards) Regulations 2005. 

4. Regulation 7 amended 

  In regulation 7(5) in the definition of prescribed lodgement 
period delete paragraph (a) and “or” after it and insert: 

 
 (a) for a public sector standard established in 

respect of the recruitment, selection and 
appointment of employees — the period of —  

 (i) 10 days after the claimant was given 
notice under regulation 5(1); or 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4727 

 



 (ii) if the relevant public sector body is 
authorised by the Commissioner under 
regulation 8A, 4 days after the claimant 
was given that notice; 

  or 

 (ba) for a public sector standard established in 
respect of the resolution of employees’ 
grievances — 10 days after the claimant was 
given notice under regulation 5(1); or 

 

5. Regulation 8A inserted 

  After regulation 7 insert: 
 

8A. Commissioner may authorise reduced prescribed 
lodgement period for lodging certain claims 

 (1) The Commissioner may give a written authorisation to 
a public sector body for the purposes of 
paragraph (a)(ii) of the definition of prescribed 
lodgement period in regulation 7(5) if the 
Commissioner —  

 (a) has reached agreement with the public sector 
body as to the conditions of the authorisation; 
and 

 (b) is satisfied the public sector body will comply 
with those conditions. 

 (2) The Commissioner may at any time, in writing, revoke 
an authorisation given under subregulation (1). 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

 
——————————— 

 

4728 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG301* 

 
 

Liquor Control Act 1988 

Liquor Control Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Liquor Control Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2009. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Liquor Control 
Regulations 1989. 

4. Regulation 26 amended 

  Regulation 26(1aa) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$100.00;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $105.00;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$200.00.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $205.00.    ”. 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4729 

 



5. Schedule 3 replaced 

  Schedule 3 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 3 — Fees 

[r. 26(1) and (2A)] 

Item Description Fee 
$ 

Electronic 
lodgment 

fee 
$ 

1. Application for the grant or removal of a hotel 
licence, nightclub licence, casino liquor licence, 
special facility licence or liquor store licence .......... 

 
 
 2 200.00 

 
 

2 000.00 

2. Application for the grant or removal of a club 
licence, restaurant licence, producer’s licence or 
wholesaler’s licence ................................................. 

 
 
 500.00 

 
 

460.00 

3. Application for the transfer of a licence ...................  500.00  

4. Licence fee for all licences other than a 
wholesaler’s licence ................................................. 

 
 155.00 

 

5. Licence fee for a wholesaler’s licence .....................  330.00  

6. Application for an occasional licence where the 
anticipated number of persons attending* is —  

 (a) up to 250 ........................................…............ 

 (b) between 251 and 500 ..................……........... 

 (c) between 501 and 1 000 ....................….......... 

 (d) between 1 001 and 5 000 .............….…......... 

 (e) between 5 001 and 10 000 .............…............ 

 (f) over 10 000 ...................................…............. 

 [*See regulation 26(4) as to the anticipated number 
of persons attending] 

 
 

 35.00 

 80.00 

 145.00 

 610.00 

 1 250.00 

 2 500.00 

 

7. Application for extended trading permit for a period 
of over 21 days — 

 (a) issued for a purpose referred to in 
 section 60(4)(ca) ...........................…............. 

 (b) issued for a purpose referred to in 
 section 60(4)(h) ...................................…...... 

 (c) issued for any other purpose ...............…....... 

 
 

 
 370.00 

 
 245.00 

 670.00 

 
 

 
340.00 

 
230.00 

620.00 

8. Application for extended trading permit for a period 
of 21 days or less (for each day, up to a maximum 
of $500) .................................................................... 

 
 
 65.00 

 

9. Application for approval of manager (other than 
under club restricted licence), after licence is 
granted ......................................................................

 
 
 80.00 

 

10. Application for approval of manager under club 
restricted licence, after licence is granted ................ 

 
 25.00 

 

11. Application for approval of person in position of 
authority, after licence is granted ............................. 

 
 90.00 

 

12. Application for approval for alteration or 
redefinition of licensed premises ............................. 

 
 310.00 

 
285.00 

13. Application for a protection order under 
section 87(1) ............................................................ 

 
 80.00 

 

14. Application for duplicate licence .............................  30.00  

4730 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



Item Description Fee 
$ 

Electronic 
lodgment 

fee 
$ 

15. Application for approval of change of name 
of licensed premises ................................................. 

 
 65.00 

 

16. Application to add, vary or cancel condition 
of licence or permit (other than club 
restricted licence) ..................................................... 

 
 
 80.00 

 
 

70.00 

17. Application to add, vary or cancel condition of club 
restricted licence ....................................……….......

 
 30.00 

 

18. On the issue of a list of licensed premises or a list 
of owners of licensed premises ................................ 

 
 80.00 

 

19. On the issue of a list of licensed premises on 
computer disk ........................................................... 

 
 50.00 

 

20. Address labels for licensed premises .......................  115.00  

21. Application for Proof of Age Card (r. 18B) .............  25.00  

22. Supply of approved heading for advertising an 
application ................................................................ 

 
 25.00 

 

23. Copy of plan — per sheet .........................................  25.00  

24. Certified copy of plan defining licensed premises ...  35.00  

25. Issue of a summons to a witness ..............................  20.00  

26. Copy of a licence or a permit, or a decision of the 
Commission (or the former Liquor Licensing 
Court) or the Director ...............................................

 
 
 25.00 

 

27. For the certification of a copy of a licence or 
permit or a decision of the Commission (or the 
former Liquor Licensing Court) or the Director —
 an additional fee of ..................................................

 
 
 
 25.00 

 

28. For a search of records of licences — per licence ...  35.00  

29. For a notice of application for approval of 
arrangement or agreement (s. 68(1)(b)(i)) ............... 

 
 70.00 

 

30. For a copy of documentation, other than that 
already prescribed, per page .................................... 

 
 4.50 

 

31. For a search of postcodes —    

 (a) 1 to 10 postcodes .........................…..............  35.00  

 (b) more than 10 postcodes ...............…..............  70.00  

32. For a full search of the licence record ......................  45.00  

33. Application under section 62(6) to vary any plans 
or specifications the subject of a condition .............. 

 
 230.00 

 
220.00 

34. Application under section 126A for approval of 
entertainment for juveniles on licensed premises .... 

 
 55.00 

 

    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4731 

 



RG302* 

 

Betting Control Act 1954 

Betting Control Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Betting Control Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2009. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Betting Control 
Regulations 1978. 

4. Regulation 17 amended 

 (1) Regulation 17(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (ac) by deleting “$285;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $300;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (ad) by deleting “$60;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $65;    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$575;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $595;    ”; 

 (d) in paragraph (ba) by deleting “$140;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $145;    ”; 

 (e) in paragraph (bb) by deleting “$75;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $80;    ”; 

4732 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



 (f) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$135;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $140;    ”; 

 (g) in paragraph (f) by deleting “$535.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $550.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 17(2) is amended by deleting “$85.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $90.    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 17(3) is amended by deleting “$85.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $90.    ”. 

5. Regulation 17A amended 

  Regulation 17A(1)(a) and “and” after it are deleted and the 
following is inserted instead —  

“     
 (a) paid, in respect of each assessment year 

commencing on 1 August and ending on 
31 July, at the following rates for that year —  

 (i) on total turnover not exceeding 
$250 000 ....................................... $315; 

 (ii) on total turnover greater than  
$250 000 but not exceeding 
$1 000 000 .................................... $635; 

 (iii) on total turnover greater than 
$1 000 000 .................................... $955; 

  and 
    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4733 

 



RG303* 

 

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Act 1990 

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Racing Penalties (Appeals) 
Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2009. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Racing Penalties 
(Appeals) Regulations 1991. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

 (1) Regulation 4(1)(b) is amended by deleting “$305.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $310.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 4(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a)(ii) by deleting “$305;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $310;    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$60.” and inserting instead —  

  “    $65.    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

4734 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



RG304* 

 
Gaming and Wagering Commission Act 1987 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Gaming and Wagering Commission 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2009. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Gaming and 
Wagering Commission Regulations 1988. 

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 1 — Prescribed fees 

[r. 4] 

Column 1 
Provision 

Column 2 
Description 

Column 3 
Amount 

$ 

50(3) Fee for —   

  (a) search of the register for an identified 
entry .................................................... 

 
7 

  (b) copy of extract from register .............. 13 

47 Fee on application for a function permit for —  

  (a) an item of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(a)) ...................................... 

 
30 

  (b) a class of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(b)) ...................................... 

 
55 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4735 

 



Column 1 
Provision 

Column 2 
Description 

Column 3 
Amount 

$ 

47 Fee on application for a permit of a continuing 
nature for —  

 

  (a) a video lottery terminal (r. 18AA(7))  30 

  (b) an item of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(a)) ...................................... 

 
55 

  (c) a class of gaming equipment  
(r. 18B(2)(b)) ...................................... 

 
100 

47, 53 Fee on application for a function permit for —  

95  (a) bingo ................................................... 20 

96  (b) multiple bingo, for each premises ...... 20 

97  (c) simultaneous bingo, for each 
premises .............................................. 

 
20 

104  (d) a standard lottery —   

  (i) where the total retail value of 
prizes or prize money does not 
exceed $5 000 .......................... 

 
 

30 

  (ii) otherwise .................................. 65 

104  (da) a standard lottery of a kind generally 
known or described as a Calcutta ....... 

 
65 

104  (e) a continuing lottery ............................. 15 

  (f) gaming (per day authorised) —   

  (i) 1-5 tables .................................. 180 

  (ii) 6-10 tables ................................ 305 

  (iii) over 10 tables ........................... 375 

  (g) two-up —   

80  (i) by a country race club .............. 125 

81  (ii) otherwise .................................. 185 

47, 53 Fee on application for a permit of a continuing 
nature for —  

 

95  (a) bingo ................................................... 30 

96  (b) multiple bingo, for each premises ...... 30 

97  (c) simultaneous bingo, for each 
premises ............................................. 

 
30 

104  (d) a standard lottery, where the total 
retail value of prizes or prize money 
is —  

 

  (i) not more than $5 000 ............... 40 

  (ii) more than $5 000 but not more 
than $50 000 ............................ 

 
95 

  (iii) more than $50 000 but not 
more than $100 000 ................. 

 
185 

  (iv) more than $100 000 but not 
more than $200 000 ................. 

 
370 

  (v) more than $200 000 ................. 620 

104  (da) a standard lottery of a kind generally 
known or described as a Calcutta ....... 

 
130 

4736 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



Column 1 
Provision 

Column 2 
Description 

Column 3 
Amount 

$ 

104  (e) a continuing lottery ............................. 25 

  (f) gaming (per day authorised) —   

  (i) 1-5 tables .................................. 150 

  (ii) 6-10 tables ................................ 275 

  (iii) over 10 tables ........................... 340 

  (g) two-up —   

80  (i) by a country race club, per day 
authorised ................................. 

 
100 

81  (ii) otherwise, per day authorised .. 150 

53, 55 Fee on application for approval of premises —  

  (a) for a specific function ......................... 20 

  (b) for functions from time to time .......... 65 

  (c) for permit of a continuing nature ........ 65 

92 Fee for the issue of a certificate relating to —   

96(2)(c)  (a) multiple bingo ..................................... 130 

97(2)(c)  (b) simultaneous bingo ............................. 130 

98(c)  (c) assisting in the conduct of bingo, for 
hire or reward ...................................... 

 
130 

92 Fee for the issue of an approved operator’s 
certificate ......................................................... 

 
205 

88(5) Fee for the issue of a certificate ....................... 270 

104B Fee on application to be a licensed supplier .... 250 

88(2)(b), 
(d) 

Fee for approval of a person to operate, or 
remove money from, gaming equipment ......... 

 
20 

    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4737 

 



RG305* 

 
 

Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003 

Racing and Wagering Western Australia 
Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Racing and Wagering Western 
Australia Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2009. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Racing and 
Wagering Western Australia Regulations 2003. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 by deleting “365” and inserting instead —  

  “    380    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “100” and inserting instead —  

  “    105    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

4738 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



RG306* 

 
 

Casino Control Act 1984 

Casino Control (Burswood Island) (Licensing of 
Employees) Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Casino Control (Burswood Island) 
(Licensing of Employees) Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2009. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Casino Control 
(Burswood Island) (Licensing of Employees) Regulations 1985. 

4. Regulation 6 amended 

 (1) Regulation 6(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$365;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $380;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$230.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $240.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 6(1a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$100;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $105;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$100.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $105.    ”. 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4739 

 



 (3) Regulation 6(2)(a) is amended by deleting “$265;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $275;    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

4740 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



— PART 2 — 

CORRECTIVE SERVICES 

CS401* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 

Finnegan William David AP 0465 03/10/2008 

Ennor Ivan Mark AP0370 15/10/2008 

Barry Paul AP 0331 17/10/2008 

Brown Madaline Bridget AP 0253 17/10/2008 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager Acacia Prison Contract. 
23 October, 2008. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT 1960 

City of Canning 
APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED OFFICERS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following person has been appointed as Security 
Officer pursuant to Part XX, Section 449 of the Local Government (Miscellaneous Provision) Act 1960. 
The appointment is effective as of 21 October 2008— 

Patric Mikell Sean Kristopher Spahn 

A. SHARPE, Acting Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

LG402* 
SHIRE OF TAMMIN 

APPOINTMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that Angela Plichota has been appointed Authorised 
Officer under the Local Government Act 1995 (Section 3.28, 3.29, 3.39, 9.10, 9.11, 9.13, 9.15, 9.16 & 
9.17), Section 449 of the Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960, Dog Act 1976 & 
Regulations, Control of Off-Road Vehicles Act 1978 & Regulations, Litter Act 1979 & Regulations, 
Section 59 (2) (a) of the Bush Fires Act 1954, Section 64 (1) of the Cemeteries Act 1986 and Shire of 
Tammin Local Laws. 
The appointments of Geoff Copley and Paul Reece are cancelled. 
Dated this 16 October 2008. 

M. G. OLIVER, Chief Executive Officer. 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4741 

 



LG403* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Serpentine-Jarrahdale 
APPOINTMENTS 

In accordance with the Bush Fires Act 1954 as amended, the following persons are hereby appointed 
as authorised fire control officers as described below for the Serpentine Jarrahdale Shire, from 1 July 
2008 to 30 June in the year of termination. 

Chief Fire Control Officer— 
Chief Fire Control Officer—David George Gossage, continuous appointment until terminated by 
Council 

Deputy Chief Fire Control Officer— 
Deputy Chief Fire Control Officer—Kenneth George Elliott year 2009 
Deputy Chief Fire Control Officer—Paul Walter Maddern year 2010 

Operational Fire Control Officers— 
Donald Fredrick Montague Wright year 2010 

Alex Jermolajew 2009 
Frank James Rankin year 2010 

Terrence John Mallon year 2010 
Leslie Hugo Harris year 2010 

Alan van der Wal year 2010 
Kenneth Charles Bunney year 2009 

Mike Muller year 2010 
Geoffrey Graham Fawcett year 2010 

Alan Scott Hambley year 2009 
Kim Michelle Maddern—continuous appointment until terminated by Council 

James Johnson—continuous appointment until terminated by Council  
Lorraine Edna Mallon—continuous appointment until terminated by Council 

Brian Douglas Owston—continuous appointment until terminated by Council 
Sarah Kirsty Hutchins—continuous appointment until terminated by Council 

Permit Issuing Fire Control Officers— 
Paul Bernard Brodie year 2010 
Paul Chapman year 2009 
Ray Stanley Elliott year 2009 
Len Hofert-smith year 2009 

JOANNE ABBISS, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

LG404* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Corrigin  
APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED PERSONS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons— 
Julian Murphy Taryn Dayman 
Greg Tomlinson Graeme Bissett 
Robert Criddle Nick Darke 
Frank Dickinson Craig Fulwood 
Alan Johns Peter Kirkwood 
Darren Teasdale Ben Hewett 
Tyrell Astbury Susan Bailey 
Terry Barron Robert Ellis 
John McKenzie David Pratt 
John Reynolds Stanley White 
George Ward 

4742 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



Have been appointed as authorised persons in accordance with the following acts— 
Local Government Act (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1960, Part XX (Ranger/Pound Keeper) 

Local Government Act 1995, Part 3—Executive Functions of Local Government and Part 9—
Miscellaneous Provisions 

Caravan and Camping Grounds Act 1995 
Dog Act 1976 and Regulations 

Bush Fires Act 1954 and Regulations 
Litter Act 1979 and Regulations 

Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978 and Regulations 
Shire of Corrigin Local Laws 

The following persons have been authorised as Registration Officers in accordance with the Dog Act 
1976 and Regulations— 

Julian Murphy 

Taryn Dayman 
Heather Talbot 

Sarah Whitehouse 
Shannon Aldworth 

Karen Dickinson 
Trudi Szczecinski 

Karen Rushton 
All previous appointments are hereby cancelled. 

JULIAN MURPHY, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LG501* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

City of Melville 
FIREBREAK NOTICE 

Notice to all owner and / or occupiers of land situated in the City of Melville 
Pursuant to the powers contained in Section 33 of the above Act, you are hereby required on or before 
the 15th day of November 2008 or within 14 days of the date of you becoming the owner or occupier, 
should this be after the 15th day of November 2008 and thereafter up to and including the 30th day of 
April 2009 to clear flammable matter from that land in accordance with the following requirements— 
 A As to land which is 1,500 square metres or less in area, or which is zoned “residential” to 

clear all flammable matter from the whole of the land except living trees, shrubs and plants 
under cultivation and lawns. 

 B As to all other land within the district the owner or occupier shall— 
 (i) Clear firebreaks of a minimum width of three (3) metres inside all  

 external boundaries of the land; and 

 (ii) Clear firebreaks of a minimum width of five (5) metres around all buildings situated on 
the land; and 

 (iii) Where that area of land exceeds ten (10) hectares, clear firebreaks of a minimum width 
of five (5) metres so as to ensure that no area of land within the firebreaks exceeds ten 
hectares in land; and 

 (iv) In any event, clear the firebreaks to the satisfaction of Council’s duly authorised officer. 

If for any reason an owner or occupier considers it to be impracticable to clear firebreaks or comply 
with other fire protection measures in accordance with this requirement, the owner or occupier may 
apply in writing to the Council’s duly authorised officer no later than 31 October 2008 for an 
exemption or partial exemption from compliance with the requirement of this notice. 

The penalty for failing to comply with this notice is a fine of not more than $5,000 and a person in 
default is also liable, whether prosecuted or not, to pay the cost of performing the work directed in 
this notice if it is not carried out by the owner or occupier by the date required by this notice. 

SHAYNE SILCOX, Chief Executive Officer. 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4743 

 



LG502* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Serpentine-Jarrahdale 
FIREBREAK NOTICE 2008-2009 

Action is required by all property owners/occupiers to comply with this notice by 30 November each 
year and to maintain compliance until 31 May following for each and every year. 
Pursuant to the powers contained in Section 33 of the Bush Fires Act, 1954 (as amended) you are 
hereby required on or before the 30th day of November to remove from land owned or occupied by you 
all flammable material to clear bare mineral earth, unobstructed trafficable firebreaks in accordance 
with the following, and thereafter to maintain the land and/or clear bare mineral earth trafficable 
firebreaks clear of flammable material up to and including the 31st day of May, in such 
positions/dimensions and specifications as required by this Notice or approved in writing by Council 
or its authorised officer. 

DEFINITIONS 
“FIREBREAK” means a strip of land that has been cleared of all trees, bushes, grasses and any 

other object or thing or flammable material leaving clear bare mineral earth. This includes 
the trimming back of all overhanging trees, bushes, shrubs and any other object or thing over 
the fire break area. 

“FLAMMABLE” means any bush, plant, tree, grass, vegetable, substance, object, thing or 
material that may or is likely to catch fire and burn. 

“TRAFFICABLE” means to be able travel from one point to another in a 4x4 fire vehicle on a 
firm and stable surface, unhindered without any obstruction that may endanger resources, no 
firebreak is to terminate without provision for egress to a safe place or a cleared turn around 
area of not less than a 19 meter radius. 

 “VERTICAL AXIS” means a continuous vertical uninterrupted line at a right angle to the 
horizontal line of the firebreak. 

Land Category Firebreak Fuel Hazard 
Reduction 

Dwellings Out 
Buildings 

1. All areas of 
land within the 
Shire less than 
4047m2 (one 
acre) 

(a)  
Have the entire land clear of all 
flammable material by mowing, 
slashing or other means. All 
grasses are to be maintained 
below 25mm in height and all 
trees, bushes, shrubs are to be 
trimmed back over driveways 
and access ways to all buildings 
to four (4) metres wide with a 
clear vertical axis over it to 
afford access for emergency 
services to all structures and 
points of the property or provide 
firebreaks as per item 2. 

(b) 
•Remove fuels as 
per 1(a). 
•Maintain grasses 
below 25mm 
throughout the 
period 30 
November to 31 
May each and 
every year. 

(c) 
• Maintain low 
fuel zones adjacent 
to all buildings and 
outbuildings. 
• Trim back all 
overhanging trees 
from buildings. 

2. All areas of 
land within the 
Shire greater 
than 4047m2 (one 
acre) 

(a)  
Install bare mineral earth 
trafficable firebreaks clear of all 
flammable material to a 
minimum of three (3) metres 
wide immediately inside all 
external boundaries of the land 
with all overhanging branches, 
trees, limbs, etc to be trimmed 
back four (4) metres wide with a 
clear vertical axis over the 
firebreak area. Install bare 
mineral earth trafficable 
firebreaks to a minimum of 
three (3) metres wide 
immediately surrounding all 
buildings, sheds and haystacks 
or groups of buildings situated 
on the land, with all 
overhanging branches, trees, 
limbs etc. to be trimmed back 
four (4) metres wide with a clear 
vertical axis over the firebreak 
area. This includes driveways 
and access to all buildings on 
the land. 

(b) 
• Manage fuel 
levels. 
• Keep grasses 
short. 

(c) 
• Maintain low 
fuel zones adjacent 
to all buildings and 
outbuildings. 
• Provide 
firebreaks around 
all buildings as per 
2(a). 

4744 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



Land Category Firebreak Fuel Hazard 
Reduction 

Dwellings Out 
Buildings 

3. Hazard 
reduction 
requirements 

(a) 
 In addition to the above 
firebreak requirements where 
Council or the Authorised 
Officer requires that additional 
fire prevention works be 
undertaken within the property 
to reduce the hazard, Council or 
the Authorised Officer, may 
instruct in writing the owner 
and/or occupier is to comply 
with the required works 
specified within the notice. 

(b) 
• Additional 
hazard reduction as 
required by 
Council/ authorised 
officer. 

(c) 
• Additional 
hazard reduction 
as required by 
Council/ 
authorised officer. 

4. Plantations (a) 
 All plantations shall comply 
with Councils conditions of 
approval and/or the approved 
Fire Management Plan. 

(b) 
• Manage fuel 
levels. 

(c) 
• Construct 
firebreaks in 
accordance with 
Conditions of 
Approval and/or 
Fire Management 
Plan. 

5. Application 
to vary 
firebreak 

(a)  
If you consider you can not clear 
firebreaks as required by this 
Notice, you may apply in writing 
to Council on or before 31st day 
of October in any year, 
requesting permission to 
provide firebreaks in an 
alternative position or take 
alternative action to comply 
with this Firebreak Order. If the 
Council or its authorised officer 
does not grant permission for 
your variation, you shall comply 
with the requirements of this 
Notice in its entirety. Variations 
to the Firebreak Order once 
approved will henceforth be 
granted for an indefinite period 
and therefore will not be 
required to be applied for each 
subsequent year after granting. 
To apply for a Variation please 
call 9526 1111 and request a 
Variation Kit. 

(b) 
• In accordance 
with your approved 
Variation to 
Firebreak Order. 

(c) 
• In accordance 
with your approved 
Variation to 
Firebreak Order. 

6. Does your 
property have a 
Fire 
Management 
Plan? 

(a)  
All properties with a fire 
management plan approved as 
part of a subdivision consent or 
for an individual or group of 
properties shall comply with the 
plan in its entirety. 
PENALTY: $5000. 

(b) 
• In accordance 
with your 
Firebreak 
Management Plan 
and this Firebreak 
Notice. 

(c) 
• In accordance 
with your 
Firebreak 
Management Plan 
and this Firebreak 
Notice 

7. Fuel 
storage/hay 
stacks 

(a)  
On all land where fuel 
storage/hay stacks are located 
and where fuel dumps, whether 
containing fuel or not, are 
stored, clear maintained 
firebreaks 4 metres wide with a 
clear vertical axis over it around 
any drum, ramp or stack of 
drums. 

(b) 
• Manage fuel 
levels. 
• Keep grasses 
short. 

(c) 
• Maintain low 
fuel zones around 
fuel storage/hay 
stacks. 

8. Exemptions Council does not issue 
exemptions. 

Council does not 
issue exemptions. 

Council does not 
issue exemptions. 

This Order/Notice has effect from 1st October 2008. All previous Firebreak Notices are hereby 
cancelled. 
By order of Council, 

J. ABBISS, Chief Executive Officer. 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4745 

 



MARINE/MARITIME 

MX401* 
PORT AUTHORITIES ACT 1999 

PORT AUTHORITIES REGULATIONS 2001 
REMOVAL OF ABANDONED BOATS AND EQUIPMENT 

FROM THE SLIPWAY AT THE PORT OF BROOME 
A number of boats and other equipment located at the slipway area at the Port of Broome appear to 
be abandoned. 
The Broome Port Authority (“Authority”) gives notice that— 
 • Things obstructing or interfering with operations of the Port may be removed from the Port 

by order of the Authority in accordance with Schedule 1, Division 2, Subdivision 5 of the 
Western Australian Port Authorities Regulations 2001; and 

 • If the owner of the obstructing items does not comply with an order from the Port then the 
owner of the obstructing item is liable to a penalty, storage and related costs incurred by the 
Authority. 

To avoid a penalty and additional costs, owners of boats and other equipment located on the slipway 
at the Port of Broome should contact the Services Superintendant on (08) 9194 3100 by 14 November 
2008 to seek the Authority’s approval to their boat or equipment remaining on the slipway. 
Conditions will apply to the storage of boats and equipment after 14 November 2008. 
By Order of the Harbour Master Broome Port Authority. 
 

——————————— 
 

MX402* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

RESTRICTED SPEED AREAS—ALL VESSELS 
Perth Waters 

2008 Red Bull Air Race 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 28 October 2008. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 67 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, 
the department by this notice revokes notice TR403 as published in the Government Gazette on 8 May 
1998, relating to the 8 knot speed restrictions on that part of the Swan River known as Perth Waters; 
during the following times— 

Thursday  30 October 2008  9am to 5pm 
Friday  31 October 2008  9am to 5pm 
Saturday 1 November 2008 9am to 5pm 
Sunday 2 November 2008 9am to 5pm 

Providing however, that such revocations shall only apply to official bona fide vessels associated with 
the 2008 Red Bull Air Race, that have been approved by Marine Safety Control,  

BARBARA O’DOWD, Acting General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 
MX403* 

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 
NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 1958 

PROHIBITED SWIMMING AREA 
Perth Waters 

2008 Red Bull Air Race 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 28 October 2008. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 10A(b) of the Navigable Waters Regulations 
1958, I hereby close all of Perth Waters between the Narrows Bridge and the Causeway, to swimming 
during the following times— 

Thursday  30 October 2008  9am to 5pm 
Friday  31 October 2008  9am to 5pm 
Saturday  1 November 2008 9am to 5pm 
Sunday 2 November 2008 9am to 5pm 

BARBARA O’DOWD, Acting General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

4746 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

OFFSHORE PETROLEUM ACT 1967 
GRANT OF PRODUCTION LICENCE WA-35-L 

Production Licence WA-35-L has been granted to Apache North West Pty Ltd, BHP Billiton 
(Australia) Pty Ltd and Inpex Alpha Ltd to have effect from and including 17 October 2008. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum Division. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MP402* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

OFFSHORE PETROLEUM ACT 2006 
DELEGATION UNDER SECTION 48 

The Joint Authority in respect of the offshore area in respect of the State of Western Australia hereby 
revokes all existing delegations made pursuant to section 48 of the Act and delegates all its functions 
and powers under the Act (other than the power to delegate), or under an Act that incorporates the 
Act, to the following two persons together— 
 • the person from time to time performing the duties of General Manger, Offshore Resources 

Branch, Resources Division, Commonwealth Department of Resources, Energy and Tourism, 
as the person representing the Commonwealth Minister; and 

 • the person from time to time holding, occupying, or performing the duties of the office of 
Director of Petroleum and Royalties Division, Department of Industry and Resources of the 
State of Western Australia, as the person representing the State Minister. 

Dated this 7th day of October 2008. 

MARTIN JOHN FERGUSON, Minister for Resources and Energy. 
Dated this 13th day of October 2008. 

NORMAN FREDERICK MOORE, Minister for Mines and Petroleum. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT 1163/57 
Fremantle Artillery Barracks 
Call for Public Submissions 

The Western Australian Planning Commission (WAPC) intends to amend the Metropolitan Region 
Scheme (MRS) for land in the local government of Fremantle and is seeking public comment. 
The planning objective of the amendment is to rezone approximately 1.47 ha of land bounded by 
Queen Victoria Street to the west, Burt Street to the south, Tuckfield Street to the east and Canning 
Highway to the north, abutting the Cantonment Hill Reserve, from a public purposes (Commonwealth 
Government) reserve and central city zone to the urban zone. There is a remnant portion of 
approximately 15 m2 of central city zoned land that is proposed to be reserved as public purpose. 
The Western Australian Planning Commission certifies that, in its opinion, the proposed amendment 
does not constitute a substantial alteration to the Metropolitan Region Scheme. 
The plans showing the proposed change and the WAPC amendment report which explains the 
proposal, will be available for public inspection from Tuesday 28 October 2008 to Friday 23 January 
2008 at each of the following places— 
 • Western Australian Planning Commission, 469 Wellington Street, Perth 
 • J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 
 • Municipal office of the City of Fremantle 
Documents are also available from the WAPC website www.wapc.wa.gov.au. 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4747 

 



Any person who desires to make a submission to support, object or provide comment on any part of 
the proposed amendment should do so on a form 57. This submission form is available from the 
display locations, the amendment report and the internet. 
Submissions must be lodged with the: Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission, 
469 Wellington Street, Perth WA 6000; on or before 5.00pm Friday, 23 January 2009. 
Late submissions will not be considered. 

WAYNE WINCHESTER, Acting Secretary. 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION 
Shire of Manjimup 

Local Planning Scheme No. 4 
Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Shire of Manjimup has prepared the 
abovementioned local planning scheme for the purpose of— 
 1. setting out the local government’s planning aims and intentions for the scheme area;  
 2. setting aside land reserved for public purposes;  
 3. zoning land within the scheme area for the purposes defined in the scheme; 
 4. showing land which may be suitable for development through expansion of various 

settlements within the scheme area, where special scrutiny of proposed land uses and 
development must occur having regard to the scheme objectives; 

 5. controlling and guiding land use and development; 
 6. setting out procedures for the assessment and determination of planning applications; 
 7. making provision for the administration and enforcement of the scheme; and 
 8. addressing other matters set out in the First Schedule to the Planning and Development Act 

2005. 
Plans and documents setting out and explaining the local planning scheme have been deposited at— 
 (i) The Administration Centre of the Shire of Manjimup at the corner of Rose and Brockman 

Streets, Manjimup. 
 (ii) Public library facilities in Brockman Street, Pemberton, Northcliffe Visitor Centre, Muirillup 

Road, Northcliffe, Pier Street, Walpole and Community Centre, Quinninup. 
 (iii) The offices of the Western Australian Planning Commission, C/- Department for Planning 

and Infrastructure at— 
 (a) Level 6 Bunbury Tower, 61 Victoria Street, Bunbury. 
 (b) Albert Facey House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth. 
and will be available for inspection during office hours up to and including 30 January 2009. 

The scheme documents have also been posted on Council’s web-site at www.manjimup.wa.gov.au . 
Submissions on the local planning scheme may be made in writing on Form No 4 and lodged with the 
undersigned on or before 30 January 2009. 

J. HUBBLE, Chief Executive Officer. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Keith Bernard Moore, late of 32 Eugene Place, Karragullen, Western Australia. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 21 July 2003 are required by Birman & Ride, of 
Level 3, 16 Irwin Street, Perth, WA 6000 to send particulars of their claim to them by the date being 
30 days from the publication of this notice, after which date the assets may conveyed or distributed 
having regard only to the claims of which they then have notice. 

4748 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



ZX402 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Estate of the late Elena Ann Mazza-Hewlett of 18 Gladstone Avenue, South Perth in the State of 
Western Australia, Retired, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims in respect of the estate mentioned below to which Section 
63 of the Trustees Act 1962 as amended relates in respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 
the 28th day of April 2008 are required by the personal representative Robert Anthony Mazza to send 
particulars of claims to the personal representative c/- McCallum Donovan Sweeney, Solicitors of 
2nd Floor, 16 Irwin Street, Perth within one (1) month of the date of publication of this notice, after 
which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the 
claims of which he has notice and the personal representative shall not be liable to any person of 
whose claim he has had no notice at the time of distribution. 

Dated this 21st day of October 2008. 

Signed— 

McCALLUM DONOVAN SWEENEY for the Personal Representative. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

ZX403 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act applies in respect 
of the Estate of Frank Mondello late of Kimberley Nursing Home, Kimberley Street, Leederville in 
the State of Western Australia, who died on 11 February 2008 are required by the trustees, Maria 
Mondello of 16 Springvale Drive Warwick in the State of Western Australia, and Robert Mondello of 
24 Felgate Place, Warwick in the State of Western Australia to send particulars of their claim to their 
solicitor, Paynes of 11 Ventnor Avenue, West Perth in the State of Western Australia by 28 November 
2008 after which date the trustees may convey and distribute the assets, having regard only to the 
claims of which they then have notice. 

Dated the 22nd day of October 2008. 

PAYNES. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

ZX404 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Williams, Mark Haydn late of 45 Avocet Boulevard, Geographe, died on 8 June 2008. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased person are required by the deceased’s personal representative, 
Michelle Leanne Williams, to send particulars of their claims to her c/o Robertson Hayles Lawyers 
Pty Ltd of Level 3, 33 Barrack Street, Perth, WA 6000 within one month of the date of publication 
hereof after which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets, having 
regard only to the claims of which she then has notice. 

Dated the 21st day of October 2008. 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4749 

 



ZX405 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
In the estate of Andrew Dean Dunlop, late of 5 Eaglemont Drive, Swan View, Western Australia 
deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the abovenamed deceased who died on the 8th day of April 2008 are required 
by the personal representative, Chau Kim Savas, care of Corser & Corser, Lawyers Level 4, Irwin 
Chambers, 16 Irwin Street, Perth to send particulars of their claims to her by the 28th day of 
November 2008 after which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets 
having regard only to the claims of which she then has notice. 
Dated the 28th day of October 2008. 

CORSER & CORSER Lawyers. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 

 
 

 
WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Loose Leaf Version 
(Including Index) 

 
$64.70 (incl. Amendments Nos. 1 & 2) 

Green Binder is an additional $17.20 if required 
(Prices include GST) 

Available from: 

State Law Publisher 

10 William Street, Perth 

Telephone: 9321 7688 

Fax: 9321 7536 
sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 

Web: www.slp.wa.gov.au 

4750 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



Order your Bound Volumes of 
Government Gazette 2009 

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette 

 

For Government Departments and 
private firms who require bound copies 
of Government Gazettes, the State Law 
Publisher offers a subscription covering 
4 Quarterly Volumes at a cost of 
$1,177.20. 

The Gazettes will be bound in black 
cloth with gold foil lettering on the 
spine and can be personalised by the 
addition of the client's name in gold 
lettering on the front cover if required. 

 

PLEASE NOTE 
On the rare occasion where extra 
gazettes are published in one quarter, a 
fifth volume may be required. In this 
instance the extra cost involved will be 
borne by the State Law Publisher and 
not passed on to clients. 

 
 

For further information please contact: 

State Law Publisher 

Telephone: 9321 7688 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4751 

 



 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2009 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2009. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically on any day. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 949.75
  Interstate  ..................................... 966.80

 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,177.20
 
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 456.10
  Interstate ...................................... 543.50
 
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 900.80
  Interstate ................................... 1,101.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 888.25
  Interstate ...................................... 902.00
 

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 320.75 
  Interstate ....................................... 357.15 
  Overseas ........................................ 415.65 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 886.05 

 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 345.75 
  Interstate ........................................ 357.15 

 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA ...................................... 475.45 
  Interstate ....................................... 498.20 

 

 

 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS 
 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at 
State Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of 
publication of the missing item. 
Claims lodged after this period will not be recognised and will attract 
payment in full. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

4752 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 


