
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Associations Incorporation Act 1987—Associations Incorporation Amendment Regulations 
2009.........................................................................................................................................  2430 

Builders’ Registration Act 1939— 
Builders’ Registration Amendment Regulations 2009 ......................................................  2431 
Builders’ Registration Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2009 ..........................................  2433 

Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943—Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) Regulations 2009 ...  2434 
Correction to Reprint—Petroleum and Geothermal Energy Resources Act 1967 ..................  2470 
Criminal Procedure Act 2004—Criminal Procedure Amendment Regulations (No. 5) 2009 .  2467 
Debt Collectors Licensing Act 1964—Debt Collectors Licensing Amendment Regulations 

2009.........................................................................................................................................  2437 
Electricity Act 1945—Electricity (Licensing) Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2009.............  2438 
Employment Agents Act 1976—Employment Agents Amendment Regulations 2009...........  2439 
Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994—Fines, Penalties and 

Infringement Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations 2009.....................................  2466 
Gas Standards Act 1972—Gas Standards (Gasfitting and Consumer Gas Installations) 

Amendment Regulations 2009...............................................................................................  2441 
Health Act 1911— 

City of Melville—Local Laws Relating to Eating Houses—Health (Eating Houses) 
Local Laws 2001...............................................................................................................  2467 

Town of Claremont—Health Amendment Local Laws 2009.............................................  2468 
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927— 

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2009 ...............................  2463 
Hospitals (Services Charges for Compensable Patients) Amendment Determination 

(No. 2) 2009 ......................................................................................................................  2464 
Jetties Act 1926—Jetties Amendment Regulations 2009 ........................................................  2490 
Land Administration Act 1997—Land Administration Amendment Regulations 2009 ........  2482 
Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978—Land Valuers Licensing Amendment Regulations 2009  2442 
Limited Partnerships Act 1909—Limited Partnerships Amendment Rules 2009 .................  2443 
Local Government Act 1995—Town of Claremont—Health Amendment Local Laws 2009 ..  2468 
Misuse of Drugs Act 1981—Misuse of Drugs Amendment Regulations 2009.........................  2492 
Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973—Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment 

Regulations 2009 ....................................................................................................................  2444 
Motor Vehicle Repairers Act 2003—Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2009.............................................................................................................................  2447 
Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984—Occupational Safety and Health Amendment 

Regulations (No. 6) 2009 ........................................................................................................  2449 
Occupational Therapists Act 2005—Occupational Therapists Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2009.............................................................................................................................  2460 
Osteopaths Act 2005—Osteopaths Amendment Regulations 2009 .........................................  2462 
Painters’ Registration Act 1961—Painters’ Registration Board Amendment Rules 2009 .....  2451 
Perth Parking Management Act 1999—Perth Parking Management Amendment 

Regulations 2009 ....................................................................................................................  2489 
Petroleum and Geothermal Energy Resources Act 1967— 

Correction to Reprint ..........................................................................................................  2470 
Petroleum Amendment Regulations 2009 .........................................................................  2471 

Petroleum and Geothermal Energy Resources (Registration Fees) Act 1967—Petroleum 
(Registration Fees) Amendment Regulations 2009 ..............................................................  2480 

 
Contents continued overleaf 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

!200900115GG! 
 

  2421 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 23 JUNE 2009 No. 115 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 



CONTENTS—continued 
 

PART 1—continued 
Page 

Petroleum Pipelines Act 1969—Petroleum Pipelines Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2009  2478 
Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1982— 

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Amendment Regulations 2009 ........................................  2474 
Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Registration Fees Amendment Regulations 2009 ..........  2477 

Police Act 1892—Firearms Amendment Regulations 2009 .....................................................  2493 
Port Authorities Act 1999— 

Port Authorities Amendment Regulations 2009................................................................  2485 
Port Authorities (Geraldton Port Description) Order 2009...............................................  2491 

Proclamations— 
Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Amendment (Compensation) 

Act 2009—No. 4 of 2009...................................................................................................  2423 
Police (Medical and Other Expenses for Former Officers) Act 2008—No. 46 of 2008......  2424 
Road Traffic Amendment Act 2008—No. 24 of 2008 .........................................................  2423 

Real Estate and Business Agents Act 1978—Real Estate and Business Agents (General) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2009 ...................................................................................  2453 

Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914— 
Rights in Water and Irrigation Amendment Regulations 2009 ........................................  2495 
Rights in Water and Irrigation Exemption (Section 26C) Amendment Order 2009 ........  2501 

Settlement Agents Act 1981—Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations 2009 .................  2455 
Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967—Ports and Harbours Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2009 .............................................................................................................................  2483 
Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968—Enzootic Diseases Amendment Regulations 2009 .  2424 
Trade Measurement Act 2006—Trade Measurement Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2009 2456 
Trade Measurement Administration Act 2006—Trade Measurement Amendment 

Regulations (No. 3) 2009 ........................................................................................................  2456 
Travel Agents Act 1985—Travel Agents Amendment Regulations 2009 ................................  2458 

 
 
 

——— 
 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Agriculture and Food .................................................................................................................  2504 
Deceased Estates........................................................................................................................  2509 
Lands ..........................................................................................................................................  2504 
Local Government ......................................................................................................................  2504 
Minerals and Petroleum ............................................................................................................  2506 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  2508 

 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 



— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 
AA101* 

FINES, PENALTIES AND INFRINGEMENT NOTICES  
ENFORCEMENT AMENDMENT (COMPENSATION) ACT 2009 

No. 4 of 2009 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 
By His Excellency 

Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 

I, the Governor, acting under the Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices 
Enforcement Amendment (Compensation) Act 2009 section 2(b) and with the advice 
and consent of the Executive Council, fix the day on which this proclamation is 
published in the Government Gazette as the day on which the provisions of that Act, 
other than sections 1 and 2, come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 16 June 2009. 
By Command of the Governor, 

C. PORTER, Attorney General. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

AA102* 
ROAD TRAFFIC AMENDMENT ACT 2008 

No. 24 of 2008 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 
By His Excellency 

Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 

I, the Governor, acting under the Road Traffic Amendment Act 2008 section 2 and 
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix 1 July 2009 as the day on 
which sections 5(a) and 8 of that Act come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 16 June 2009. 
By Command of the Governor, 

S. O’BRIEN, Minister for Transport. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2423 



AA103* 
POLICE (MEDICAL AND OTHER EXPENSES FOR  

FORMER OFFICERS) ACT 2008 
No. 46 of 2008 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 
By His Excellency 

Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

I, the Governor, acting under the Police (Medical and Other Expenses for Former 
Officers) Act 2008 section 2(b) and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, fix 1 July 2009 as the day on which the provisions of that Act, other than 
sections 1 and 2, come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 16 June 2009. 
By Command of the Governor, 

R. JOHNSON, Minister for Police. 
 
Note: Under regulation 2 of the Police (Medical and Other Expenses for Former 

Officers) Regulations 2009, those regulations come into operation on the day 
on which the Police (Medical and Other Expenses for Former Officers) Act 
2008 section 15 comes into operation under this proclamation. 

AGRICULTURE 
AG301* 

Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968 

Enzootic Diseases Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Enzootic Diseases Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

2424 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Enzootic Diseases 
Regulations 1970. 

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Enzootic diseases 
[r. 4, 5, 6, 11 and 20] 

Division 1 — Diseases foreign to Australia that, if identified, 
are subject to control measures 

Subdivision 1 — Animal diseases 

African horse sickness 

Aujeszky’s disease 

Borna disease 

Bovine brucellosis (Brucella abortus) 

Caprine brucellosis (Brucella melitensis) 

Camelpox 

Chagas’ disease (Trypanosoma cruzi) 

Chronic wasting disease of deer 

Contagious agalactia in sheep 

Contagious bovine pleuropneumonia 

Contagious caprine pleuropneumonia 

Contagious equine metritis 

Crimean Congo haemhorragic fever 

Dourine (Trypanosoma equiperdum) 

Duck virus enteritis (Duck plague) 

Duck virus hepatitis 

East Coast fever (Theileriosis) 

Encephalitides (tick borne) 

Epizootic lymphangitis 

Equine encephalomyelitis (Eastern, Western and Venezuelan) 

Equine encephalosis 

Equine influenza 

Equine piroplasmosis (Babesia equi, Babesia caballi) 

Equine viral arteritis 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2425 



Getah virus infection 

Glanders 

Goat pox 

Haemorrhagic septicaemia 

Heartwater 

Infectious bursal disease (hypervirulent form) 

Japanese encephalitis 

Jembrana disease 

Louping Ill 

Lumpy skin disease 

Maedi-Visna 

Malignant catarrhal fever (wildebeest associated) 

Nairobi sheep disease 

Nipah virus infection 

Peste des petits ruminants 

Porcine cysticercosis (Cysticercus cellulosae) 

Porcine enterovirus encephalomyelitis (Teschen disease) 

Porcine reproductive and respiratory syndrome 

Post weaning multisystemic wasting syndrome 

Potomac fever 

Pulmonary adenomatosis (Jaagsiekte) 

Rift Valley fever 

Scrapie 

Sheep pox 

Sheep scab 

Surra (Trypanosoma evansi) 

Swine influenza 

Transmissible gastroenteritis 

Transmissible spongiform encephalopathy 

Trichinellosis 

Trypanosomiasis 

Tularaemia 

Warble fly infestation 

Wesselsbron disease 

West Nile fever 

2426 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



Subdivision 2 — Crustacean diseases 

Crayfish plague 

Infectious myonecrosis 

Necrotising hepatopancreatitis 

Taura syndrome 

Tetrahedral baculovirus (Baculovirus penaei) 

White spot disease 

White tail disease 

Yellowhead disease 

Subdivision 3 — Fish diseases 

Aeromonas salmonicida infection (Furunculosis) 

Bacterial kidney disease (Renibacterium salmoninarium) 

Channel catfish virus disease  

Enteric septicaemia of catfish (Edwardsiella ictaluri) 

Grouper iridoviral disease 

Gyrodactylosis (Gyrodactylus salaris) 

Herpesvirus infection of Koi carp 

Infectious haematopoietic necrosis 

Infectious pancreatic necrosis 

Infectious salmon anaemia 

Piscirickettsiosis 

Red sea bream iridoviral disease 

Spring viraemia of carp 

Viral haemorrhagic septicaemia 

Whirling disease of salmonids 

Subdivision 4 — Mollusc diseases 

Abalone viral mortality 

Akoya oyster disease 

Iridovirus 

Withering syndrome of abalone 

Division 2 — Diseases not foreign to Australia that, if 
identified, are subject to control measures 

Subdivision 1 — Animal diseases 

Anthrax 

Bovine Johne’s disease 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2427 



Bovine tuberculosis (Mycobacterium bovis) 

Equine infectious anaemia 

Liver fluke 

Menangle virus infection 

Porcine brucellosis (Brucella suis) 

Virulent footrot (infection with protease thermostable strains of 
Dichelobacter nodosus) in sheep and goats 

Subdivision 2 — Crustacean diseases 

GAV/LOV virus of prawns 

Infectious hypodermal and haemopoietic necrosis virus 

Subdivision 3 — Fish diseases 

Enteric redmouth disease (Yersinia ruckeri) 

Epizootic haemopoietic necrosis (Redfin virus) 

Subdivision 4 — Mollusc diseases 

Abalone viral ganglioneuritis 

Division 3 — Diseases that, if identified outside a cattle tick 
infected area, are subject to control measures 

Anaplasmosis 

Babesiosis 

Cattle tick infestation 

Division 4 — Diseases not foreign to Australia that, if 
identified, might be subject to control measures 

Subdivision 1 — Animal diseases 

Australian bat lyssavirus infection 

Enzootic bovine leucosis 

Equine herpes virus 1 infection (abortogenic and neurological strains) 

Footrot in sheep and goats (U5 protease thermo-unstable strain of 
Dichelobacter nodosus) 

Hendra virus infection 

Non virulent Newcastle disease 

Ovine Johne’s disease 

Porcine myocarditis (Bungowannah virus infection) 

Salmonella abortus equi infection in horses 

Salmonella abortus ovis infection in sheep 

Salmonella enteritidis infection in poultry 

2428 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



Virulent footrot (infection with protease thermostable strains of 
Dichelobacter nodosus) in ruminants other than sheep and goats 

Subdivision 2 — Crustacean diseases 

Microsporidiosis 

Spherical baculovirus (Penaeus monodon type baculovirus) 

Subdivision 3 — Fish diseases 

Aeromonas salmonicida infection (Goldfish ulcer disease) 

Epizootic ulcerative syndrome 

Viral encephalopathy and retinopathy 

Subdivision 4 — Mollusc diseases 

Bonamiosis 

Haplosporidiosis 

Marteiliosis 

Mikrocytosis (Mykrycytois mackini) 

Oyster oedema disease 

Perkinsosis 

Division 5 — Diseases that are subject to control measures in 
extreme cases 

Ked infestation of sheep 

Lice infestation of sheep 
 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

  At the end of Schedule 2 insert: 
 

Division 9 — Abalone 

38. Abalone 

  Live abalone (Haliotis spp.) must not be moved into the 
State. 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2429 



CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 
CE301* 

Associations Incorporation Act 1987 

Associations Incorporation Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Associations Incorporation 
Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Associations Incorporation 
Regulations 1988. 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  Amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 2 it. 1  $35.00 $37.75 

Sch. 2 it. 2 $117.00 $126.00 

Sch. 2 it. 4(a) $19.50 $21.00 

Sch. 2 it. 4(b) $19.50 $21.00 

Sch. 2 it. 4(c) $19.50 $21.00 

Sch. 2 it. 5 $35.00 $37.75 

Sch. 2 it. 6 $32.50 $35.00 

2430 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 2 it. 7 $35.00 $37.75 

Sch. 2 it. 8 $6.75 $7.25 

Sch. 2 it. 9(a) $1.40 $1.50 

Sch. 2 it. 9(b)(i) $7.35 $7.90 

Sch. 2 it. 9(b)(ii) $1.50 $1.60 

Sch. 2 it. 10 $27.50 $29.50 

Sch. 2 it. 11(a) $10.80 $11.60 

Sch. 2 it. 11(b) $1.40 $1.50 

Sch. 2 it. 12 $10.80 $11.60 

 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
CE302* 

Builders’ Registration Act 1939 

Builders’ Registration Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by Board with the approval of the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Builders’ Registration Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2431 



2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations —  
 (i) on 1 July 2009; or 
 (ii) if these regulations are published in the Gazette 

on a later day — on that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Builders’ Registration Regulations. 

4. Second Appendix amended 

 (1) This regulation amends the Second Appendix. 

 (2) Amend the items listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

item 1 264 275 

item 4 254 264 

item 5 254 264 

item 6 191 199 

item 7 254 264 

item 8 27 28 

item 9 238 248 

item 9 326 339 

item 9 740 771 

 
The common seal of the ) 
Builders’ Registration Board ) 
of Western Australia was ) 
affixed in the presence of —  ) 
 
MARK CUOMO 
KIM FARE 

Approved by the Governor, 
 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

2432 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



CE303* 
Builders’ Registration Act 1939 

Builders’ Registration Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Builders’ Registration Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations —  
 (i) immediately after the Builders’ Registration 

Amendment Regulations 2009 regulation 4 
comes into operation; or 

 (ii) if these regulations are published in the Gazette 
on a day that is later than the day on which the 
Builders’ Registration Amendment 
Regulations 2009 regulation 4 comes into 
operation — on that later day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Builders’ Registration Regulations. 

4. Second Appendix amended 

  In the Second Appendix delete item 10 and insert: 
 

10. s. 34A 
 r. 19 

On a complaint or application to the Disputes 
Tribunal —  

 (a) by a financially disadvantaged person 

 (b) by any other person 

 
 

20 

32 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2433 



CE304* 
Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943 

Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 409(3) of 
the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Act amended 

  These regulations amend the Companies (Co-operative) 
Act 1943. 

4. Tenth Schedule replaced 

  Delete the Tenth Schedule and insert: 
 

Tenth Schedule — Fees to be paid to the Registrar 
[s. 409(3)] 

Item Matter Fee ($) 

1. On submission of the memorandum of a company ............. 274.00 

2. For the registration of a company .................................... 274.00 

3. For every authorisation by the Governor under the 
provisos to section 28(7) ......................................................

 
73.00 

4. For every approval of the Registrar to the change of name 
of a company ........................................................................

 
73.00 

2434 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



Item Matter Fee ($) 

5. On lodgment of request to the Registrar to exercise the 
powers conferred by section 297, 299 or 300 (Application 
fee) ........................................................................................

 
 

38.25 

6. For every act done by the Registrar as representing a 
defunct company under section 297, 299 or 300 
(Application fee) ...................................................................

 
 

73.00 

7. On late lodgment, registration or filing of any 
document under this Act, in addition to any other 
fee — 

(a) if lodged, registered or filed within one month 
after the period prescribed by law ..........................

(b) if lodged, registered or filed more than one month 
after the period prescribed by law, in addition to 
the fee payable in paragraph (a) .............................

The Registrar, if satisfied that just cause existed for the 
late lodgment, may waive in whole or in part the 
additional fee under paragraph (b). 

 
 
 

 
14.00 

 
 

42.00 

8. For every application for the reservation of a name ............ 24.70 

9. For every application for extending the time of such 
reservation .............................................................................

 
24.70 

10. On filing any statement in lieu of prospectus ...................... 35.50 

11. On filing any prospectus ................................................. 608.00 

12. On filing an annual return of a company ........................ 79.00 

13. For every application for the consent of the Minister 
under section 46(3a)(a) ...................................................

 
73.00 

14. For every application for the consent of the Minister 
under section 173(2) .......................................................

 
73.00 

15. For every application for exemption from the 
provisions of section 369(1) ............................................

 
73.00 

16. On lodging any other application .................................... 24.70 

17. For every certificate issued by the Registrar ................... 9.30 

18. For every inquiry as to the availability of any name 
sought to be adopted by a company — for every name 
the subject of the inquiry .................................................

 
 

8.60 

19. For production at the Office of State Revenue of 
documents lodged by or in relation to a company ..........

 
13.50 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2435 



Item Matter Fee ($) 

20. (a) For every inspection of a document or documents 
filed or lodged with the Registrar by or in relation 
to a company or of any transparency or 
reproduction of such document or documents ........

 
 
 

7.60 

 (b) For the supply of an uncertified copy or print of 
any document where the fee prescribed by 
paragraph (a) has been paid — for each page of 
the copy or print ......................................................

(c) For the supply on an uncertified copy or print of a 
document without inspection having been 
made — 

 For the first 2 pages of the copy or print .................

 For each additional page .........................................

(d) For every inspection of any document filed or 
lodged with the Registrar not being an inspection 
in respect of which paragraph (a) applies ...............

(e) For every written inquiry involving a search for 
any document filed or lodged by or in relation to 
a company ...............................................................

 
 
 

1.30 

 
 
 

5.25 

1.30 

 
 

2.35 

 
 

9.70 

 (f) For the supply of an uncertified copy or print of a 
document where the fee prescribed by 
paragraph (e) has been paid — for each page of 
the copy or print ......................................................

 
 
 

1.20 

21. (a) For certifying a copy of or extract from any 
document filed or lodged with the Registrar of 
which a typewritten or printed copy is supplied by 
an applicant —  

 For one page ............................................................

 For each additional page .........................................

(b) For the supply of a certified copy or print of any 
document filed or lodged with the Registrar —  

 For one page ............................................................

 For each additional page .........................................

 
 
 
 

6.00 

2.40 

 
 

8.60 

4.85 

22. For the deposit of any book or document under 
section 288 (provided that the total fees to be paid by a 
liquidator under section 288 in respect of any one 
company shall not exceed $10.00) ..................................

 
 
 

3.75 

 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

2436 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



CE305* 
Debt Collectors Licensing Act 1964 

Debt Collectors Licensing Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Debt Collectors Licensing Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Debt Collectors Licensing 
Regulations 1964. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  In regulation 4 delete “470” and insert: 
 

  490 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2437 



CE306* 
Electricity Act 1945 

Electricity (Licensing) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Electricity (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Electricity (Licensing) 
Regulations 1991. 

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Fees 
[r. 64] 

 $ 

1. Licences and permits under Part 3 —   

 (a) Application for licence or permit 38 

 (b) Registration of licence or permit or 
renewal of registration (for each year) 

 
67 

 (c) Replacement for licence or permit or 
copy of certificate of registration 

 
20 

 (d) Application for restoration of name to 
register (failure to renew) 

 
38 

2438 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



 $ 

2. Licences under Part 4 —   

 (a) Application for licence 75 

 (b) Registration or renewal of registration of 
electrical contractor’s licence 

 
398 

 (c) Registration or renewal of registration of 
in-house electrical installing work licence 

 
199 

 (d) Replacing or adding nominee: electrical 
contractor’s licence 

 
354 

 (e) Replacing or adding nominee: in-house 
electrical installing work licence 

 
177 

 (f) Replacement for licence or copy of 
certificate of registration 

 
31 

 (g) Extract of register 31 

 (h) Copy of register (if available) 64 

 (i) Application for restoration of name to 
register (failure to renew) 

 
38 

3. Further inspection 150 

 
 
By Command of the Governor, 

 
R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 
CE307* 

Employment Agents Act 1976 

Employment Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Employment Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2439 



2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Employment Agents 
Regulations 1976. 

4. Regulation 10 amended 

 (1) In regulation 10(1) delete the Table and insert: 
 

Table 

 $ 

Grant of a general licence for a period not 
exceeding the prescribed period .......................

 
1 379.00 

Renewal of a general licence for a period not 
exceeding the prescribed period .......................

 
1 028.00 

Grant of a restricted licence for a period not 
exceeding the prescribed period .......................

 
1 379.00 

Renewal of a restricted licence for a period 
not exceeding the prescribed period .................

 
1 028.00 

Renewal of a general or a restricted licence 
for a period of 3 years .......................................

 
1 028.00 

Application for an interim licence .................... 32.50 

Duplicate licence ............................................... 55.00 

Application for transfer of licence under 
section 19(6) of the Act ....................................

 
64.50 

Inspection of record under section 51 of the 
Act .....................................................................

 
12.50 

Inspection of the Register ................................. 24.60 

2440 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



 $ 

Copy (certified or uncertified) of an 
individual registration in the Register —  

 

 first page .................................................... 24.60 

 each subsequent page ................................. 5.00 

Copy (certified or uncertified) of all 
registrations in the Register ...............................

 
317.20 

 

 (2) After regulation 10(1a) insert: 
 

 (1B) The penalty prescribed under section 13(2) of the Act 
for any late application for the renewal of a licence is 
25% of the fee due for the granting of that renewal. 

 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 
R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 
CE308* 

Gas Standards Act 1972 

Gas Standards (Gasfitting and Consumer Gas 
Installations) Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Gas Standards (Gasfitting and 
Consumer Gas Installations) Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2441 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Gas Standards (Gasfitting and 
Consumer Gas Installations) Regulations 1999. 

4. Schedule 4 amended 

  In Schedule 4: 
 (a) delete “$65” and insert: 

 
  $67 

 
 (b) delete “$365” and insert: 

 
  $385 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 
CE309* 

Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978 

Land Valuers Licensing Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Land Valuers Licensing Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

2442 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Land Valuers Licensing 
Regulations 1979. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  In Schedule 1 items 1 and 2 delete “660.00” and insert: 
 

  688.00 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
CE310* 

Limited Partnerships Act 1909 

Limited Partnerships Amendment Rules 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Limited Partnerships Amendment 
Rules 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These rules come into operation as follows — 
 (a) rules 1 and 2 — on the day on which these rules are 

published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the rules — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Rules amended 

  These rules amend the Limited Partnerships Rules 1909. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2443 



4. Rule 3 replaced 

  Delete rule 3 and insert: 
 

3. Fees 

  The fees set out in the Table are payable in respect of 
the matters listed in the Table. 

Table 

1. Registration of limited partnership .......... $166.00 

2. Inspection of statements filed by 
Registrar ...................................................

 
$4.30 

3. Certificate of registration ......................... $11.30 

4. Certified copy of, or extract from, a 
registered statement .................................

 

$4.30 per 
folio of 

72 words 

 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
CE311* 

Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973 

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) 
Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2444 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) 
Regulations 1974. 

4. Third Schedule replaced 

  Delete the Third Schedule and insert: 
 

Third Schedule — Fees 
[r. 7] 

Table 

Item Description $ 

1. Application for a dealer’s licence or renewal of a 
dealer’s licence for the period prescribed by 
regulation 6A — 

 

 (a) if the dealer only specifies single premises 
to be authorised under section 20E(5) in 
relation to the licence ................................... 

 
 

1 438.00 

 (b) if the dealer specifies 2 or more premises to 
be authorised under section 20E(5) ............. 

 
719.00 

 plus, in respect of each further premises to 
be authorised under section 20E(5) in 
relation to the licence, a further ................... 

 
 

719.00 

2. Application under section 20F in respect of 
alteration of premises .......................................... 

 
120.00 

3. Application under section 20F in respect of each 
added premises .................................................... 

 
719.00 

4. Application for a temporary permit under 
section 20H .......................................................... 

 
47.75 

5. Application for yard manager’s licence or 
renewal of yard manager’s licence for the period 
prescribed by regulation 6A ................................ 

 
 

367.00 

6. Application for salesperson’s licence or renewal 
of salesperson’s licence for the period prescribed 
by regulation 6A .................................................. 

 
 

249.00 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2445 



Item Description $ 

7. Application for car market operator’s 
registration or renewal of car market operator’s 
registration — 

 

 (a) if the operator only specifies single 
premises to be authorised under 
section 21A(5) in relation to the 
registration .................................................. 

 
 
 

1 438.00 

 (b) if the operator specifies 2 or more premises 
to be authorised under section 21A(5) in 
relation to the registration ........................... 

 
 

719.00 

 plus, in respect of each further premises to 
be authorised under section 21A(5) in 
relation to the registration, a further ............

 
 

719.00 

8. Application under section 21B in respect of 
alteration of premises .......................................... 

 
120.00 

9. Application under section 21B in respect of each 
added premises .................................................... 

 
719.00 

10. Application for certificate of exemption from the 
Act under section 31(1) ....................................... 

 
120.00 

11. Application for temporary authorisation under 
section 16(2) or 17(2) .......................................... 

 
47.75 

12. Individual dealer — change to firm ..................... 120.00 

13. Individual dealer — change to body corporate  120.00 

14. Firm — change to sole proprietor ....................... 120.00 

15. Firm — change to body corporate ....................... 120.00 

16. Body corporate change to individual or firm ...... 120.00 

17. Duplicate licence ................................................. 38.50 

18. Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of an 
individual registration in the register kept under 
section 24 — 

 

  first page ...................................................... 17.50 

  each subsequent page .................................. 3.45 

19. Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of 
all registrations in the register kept under 
section 24 ............................................ 

 
 

222.00 

20. Inspection of register kept under section 24 ........ 17.50 

 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

2446 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



CE312* 
Motor Vehicle Repairers Act 2003 

Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Motor Vehicle Repairers 
Regulations 2007. 

4. Regulation 7A amended 

  In regulation 7A(6) delete the Table and insert: 
 

Table 

Item Number of repairers $ 

1. 1 to 2 631 

2. 3 881 

3. 4 1 100 

4. 5 to 7 1 600 

5. 8 to 10 2 038 

6. 11 or more 2 569 

 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2447 



5. Regulation 7C amended 

  In regulation 7C delete “$35.75.” and insert: 
 

  $37.25. 
 

6. Regulation 7F amended 

  In regulation 7F(2) delete the Table and insert: 
 

Table 

Item Number of repairers $ 

1. 1 to 2 631 

2. 3 881 

3. 4 1 100 

4. 5 to 7 1 600 

5. 8 to 10 2 038 

6. 11 or more 2 569 

 

7. Regulation 7 amended 

  In regulation 7 delete “$67.50.” and insert: 
 

  $70.00. 
 

8. Regulation 10 amended 

  In regulation 10: 
 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$16.80;” and insert: 

 
  $17.50; 

 
 (b) in paragraph (b)(i) delete “$16.80” and insert: 

 
  $17.50 

 
 (c) in paragraph (b)(i) delete “$3.35” and insert: 

 
  $3.50 

 

2448 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



 (d) in paragraph (b)(ii) delete “$214.” and insert: 
 

  $222. 
 

9. Regulation 11 amended 

  In regulation 11 delete “$37.” and insert: 
 

  $38.50. 
 

10. Regulation 12 amended 

  In regulation 12(2): 
 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$56” and insert: 

 
  $58 

 
 (b) in paragraph (b) delete “$112” and insert: 

 
  $116 

 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
CE313* 

Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984 

Occupational Safety and Health Amendment 
Regulations (No. 6) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Occupational Safety and Health 
Amendment Regulations (No. 6) 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2449 



2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Occupational Safety and Health 
Regulations 1996. 

4. Schedule 6.1 amended 

  In Schedule 6.1 delete “$28.25” and insert: 
 

  $29.40 
 

5. Schedule 6.1A amended 

 (1) This regulation amends Schedule 6.1A. 

 (2) Amend the items listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

item 1  $3 753 $3 905 

item 2  $2 492 $2 590 

item 3  $1 246 $1 295 

6. Schedule 6.2 amended 

  In Schedule 6.2: 
 (a) in item 1 delete “$81.00” and insert: 

 
  $84.00 

 
 (b) in item 2 delete “$73.00” and insert: 

 
  $76.00 

 

7. Schedule 6.2A amended 

  In Schedule 6.2A item 1 delete “$3 850” and insert: 
 

  $3 990 
 

2450 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



8. Schedule 6.4 amended 

 (1) This regulation amends Schedule 6.4. 

 (2) Amend the items listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

item 1  $73.00 $76.00 

item 2  $73.00 $76.00 

item 3  $62.00 $64.50 

item 5 $886.00 $920.00 

item 6 $147.00 $153.00 

item 7 $442.50 $460.00 

item 9 $46.50 $48.00 

 
 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
CE314* 

Painters’ Registration Act 1961 

Painters’ Registration Board Amendment 
Rules 2009 

Made by the Painters’ Registration Board and approved by the Governor 
in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Painters’ Registration Board Amendment 
Rules 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2451 



2. Commencement 

  These rules come into operation as follows — 
 (a) rules 1 and 2 — on the day on which these rules are 

published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the rules —  
 (i) on 1 July 2009; or 
 (ii) if these rules are published in the Gazette on a 

later day, on that day. 

3. Rules amended 

  These rules amend the Painters’ Registration Board Rules 1962. 

4. Third Appendix replaced 

  Delete the Third Appendix and insert: 
 

Third Appendix — Fees 
The following fees are prescribed for the purposes of these rules —  

 $ 

For examination 6.30 

For application for registration —   

 Companies 118.00 

 Individuals 118.00 

 Partnerships 91.00 

For annual registration fee —   

 Companies 339.00 

 Individuals 226.00 

 Partnerships 140.00 

For any certificate 11.00 

 

Passed by a resolution of the Painters’ Registration Board at a meeting 
held on 3 June 2009. 

 

2452 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



The Common Seal of the 
Painters’ Registration Board 
was affixed at the time of the 
resolution in the presence of 

) 
) 
) 
) 
 

 
MARK CUOMO, 

 

Chairman. 
 

 
KIM FARE, 

 

Secretary. 
 

 

Approved by the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
CE315* 

Real Estate and Business Agents Act 1978 

Real Estate and Business Agents (General) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Real Estate and Business Agents 
(General) Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2453 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Real Estate and Business Agents 
(General) Regulations 1979. 

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Fees 
[r. 4 and 4A] 

Item Type of fee Fee 

1. Application for licence ............ $62.50 

2. Grant of licence ....................... $654.00 

3. Grant of licence to firm ........... $856.00 

4. Grant of licence to body 
corporate .................................

 
$856.00 

5. Renewal of triennial 
certificate ................................

 
$421.00 

6. Grant of certificate of 
registration ..............................

 
$168.80 

7. Renewal of certificate of 
registration ..............................

 
$138.00 

8. Inspection of a register ............ $10.00 

9. Copy (certified or 
uncertified) or an extract of 
an individual registration —  

first page .................................

each subsequence page ...........

 
 
 

$20.00 

$2.00 

10. Copy (certified or 
uncertified) or an extract of 
all registrations in a register ....

 
 

$290.00 

11. For the purposes of 
section 30(2a) (the holding 
fee) ..........................................

 
 

$198.00 

 
 

By Command of the Governor, 
 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

2454 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



CE316* 
Settlement Agents Act 1981 

Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Settlement Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Settlement Agents 
Regulations 1982. 

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Fees 
[r. 4 and 4A] 

Item Type of fee Fee 

1. Grant of licence (including a triennial certificate) to a 
natural person .......................................................................

 
$654.00 

2. Grant of licence (including a triennial certificate) to 
a firm ....................................................................................

 
$856.00 

3. Grant of licence (including a triennial certificate) to a 
body corporate ......................................................................

 
$856.00 

4. Renewal of triennial certificate ............................................ $421.00 

5. Inspection of register ............................................................ $10.00 

6. Certificate as to an individual registration —  

 first page .......................................................................

 each subsequence page .................................................

 

$20.00 

$2.00 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2455 



Item Type of fee Fee 

7. Certificate as to all registrations in register ......................... $140.00 

8. For the purposes of section 30(3a) (the holding fee) ........... $198.00 

 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 
CE317* 

Trade Measurement Act 2006 
Trade Measurement Administration Act 2006 

Trade Measurement Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Trade Measurement Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Trade Measurement 
Regulations 2007. 

4. Regulation 111 amended 

  In regulation 111(2)(a) and (3) delete “$9.80” and insert: 
 

  $10.20 

2456 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



5. Regulation 112 amended 

  In regulation 112(2)(a) delete “$21.70” and insert: 
 

  $22.60 
 

6. Regulation 113 amended 

  In regulation 113(3)(a) delete “$21.70” and insert: 
 

  $22.60 
 

7. Schedule 5 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 5 and insert: 
 

Schedule 5 — Application and licence fees 
[r. 108] 

Item Description Fee ($) 

1. Application under regulation 103 45.25 

2. Application under the principal Act section 55 91.00 

3. Periodic licence for servicing licences under the 
principal Act section 64(1) ..............................................

plus an additional amount of ...... ....................................
for each person who, whether as the holder of the 
licence or an employee of the holder of the licence, 
will under the authority conferred by the 
licence —  
(a) test a batch of measuring instruments for the 

purposes of certification or re-certification; 
or 

(b) certify or re-certify measuring instruments. 

 
215.00 

57.00 

4. Periodic licence for public weighbridge licences 
under the principal Act section 64(1) 

 
114.00 

5. Public weighbridge suitability statement Combined 
with fee 
payable 
under 
item 4 

6. Application under the principal Act section 71(1) 
to amend a condition of a kind mentioned in the 
principal Act section 60(2) 

 
 

45.25 

7. Application under the principal Act section 73(2) 45.25 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2457 



Item Description Fee ($) 

8. Application under the principal Act section 74(2) 45.25 

9. Amended licence 91.00 

10. Duplicate licence 45.25 

11. Inspection of register kept under the principal Act 
section 25 or 59 

 
16.70 

12. Extract of an individual registration in a register 
kept under the principal Act section 25 or 59 — 
(a) for the first page ....................................................
(b) for each subsequent page .......................................

 
 

16.70 
3.45 

13. Copy of the register kept under the principal Act 
section 25 or 59 

 
215.00 

 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 
CE318* 

Travel Agents Act 1985 

Travel Agents Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Travel Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

2458 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Travel Agents Regulations 1986. 

4. Regulation 6 amended 

 (1) In regulation 6(1)(a) and (b): 
 (a) delete “$1 030” and insert: 

 
  $1 073 

 
 (b) delete “$216” and insert: 

 
  $225 

 

 (2) In regulation 6(1)(c):  
 (a) delete “$1 517” and insert: 

 
  $1 581 

 
 (b) delete “$216” and insert: 

 
  $225 

 

 (3) In regulation 6(2) delete “$2 160” and insert: 
 

  $2 250 
 

5. Regulation 11A amended 

 (1) In regulation 11A(1)(a)(i) and (ii): 
 (a) delete “$1 030” and insert: 

 
  $1 073 

 
 (b) delete “$216” and insert: 

 
  $225 

 

 (2) In regulation 11A(2)(a):  
 (a) delete “$1 517” and insert: 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2459 



 
  $1 581 

 
 (b) delete “$216” and insert: 

 
  $225 

 

 (3) In regulation 11A(3)(a) delete “$2 160” and insert: 
 

  $2 250 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

HEALTH 
HE301* 

Occupational Therapists Act 2005 

Occupational Therapists Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Occupational Therapists Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

2460 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Occupational Therapists 
Regulations 2007. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  In the Table to regulation 4(1): 
 (a) after the item for the qualification of Bachelor of Health 

Science Occupational Therapy awarded by the 
University of Newcastle insert: 

 
Bachelor of Occupational 
Therapy (2005 -) 

University of Newcastle 

 
 (b) in the item for the qualification of Bachelor of Applied 

Science Occupational Therapy awarded by the South 
Australian Institute of Technology delete “(1979-1997)” 
and insert: 

 
  (1979-1990) 

 
 (c) in the item for the qualification of Bachelor of Applied 

Science Occupational Therapy awarded by the 
University of South Australia delete “(1998 -)” and 
insert: 

 
  (1991 -) 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2461 



HE302* 
Osteopaths Act 2005 

Osteopaths Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Osteopaths Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Osteopaths Regulations 2006. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  In the Table to regulation 4(2) after the item for the qualification 
of Bachelor of Applied Science (Osteopathy) awarded by the 
Phillip Institute of Technology insert: 

 
Bachelor of Applied Science 
(Osteopathic Studies) 

University of Western Sydney 

Master of Osteopathy University of Western Sydney 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

2462 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



HE303* 
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Hospitals (Services Charges) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Hospitals (Services Charges) 
Regulations 1984. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 1 item 1(b)(i) $496 $511 

Sch. 1 item 1(b)(ii) $287 $294 

Sch. 1 item 1(d) $140.65 $143 

Sch. 1 item 1(e) $1 288 $1 374 

Sch. 1 item 4(b) $146 $156 

Sch. 1 item 6(b) $223 $230 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2463 



Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 1 item 6(d) $1 258 $1 312 

Sch. 1 item 7 $26.75 $28.50 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
HE304* 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 
Hospitals (Services Charges) Regulations 1984 

Hospitals (Services Charges for 
Compensable Patients) Amendment 

Determination (No. 2) 2009 

Made by the Minister for Health under section 37(3)(af) of the Act and 
regulation 5(2) of the regulations. 

1. Citation 

  This determination is the Hospitals (Services Charges 
for Compensable Patients) Amendment 
Determination (No. 2) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  This determination comes into operation as follows — 
 (a) clauses 1 and 2 — on the day on which this 

determination is published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the determination — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Determination amended 

  This determination amends the Hospitals (Services Charges for 
Compensable Patients) Determination 2005. 

2464 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 1 item 1 $1 545 $1 648 

Sch. 1 item 2 $1 347 $1 437 

Sch. 1 item 2A $1 656 $1 766 

Sch. 1 item 3 $223 $230 

Sch. 1 item 4 $3 528 $3 692 

Sch. 1 item 5 $146 $156 

Sch.1 item 6 $146 $156 

Sch. 1 item 9(a) $1 357 $1 447 

Sch. 1 item 9(aa) $1 669 $1 778 

Sch. 1 item 9(b) $1 557 $1 659 

 (2) In Schedule 1 item 8: 
 (a) delete “service” and insert: 

 
  service) 

 
 (b) delete “$146” and insert: 

 
  $156 

 

 

K. HAMES, Minister for Health. 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2465 



JUSTICE 
JU301* 

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement  
Act 1994 

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices 
Enforcement Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Fines, Penalties and Infringement 
Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Fines, Penalties and Infringement 
Notices Enforcement Regulations 1994. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  In Schedule 1 insert in alphabetical order: 
 

Electricity Act 1945  

Energy Coordination Act 1994  

Energy Safety Act 2006  

Gas Standards Act 1972  
 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

2466 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



JU302* 
Criminal Procedure Act 2004 

Criminal Procedure Amendment Regulations 
(No. 5) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Criminal Procedure Amendment 
Regulations (No. 5) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Criminal Procedure 
Regulations 2005. 

4. Schedule 1A amended 

  In Schedule 1A insert in alphabetical order: 
 

  Energy Safety Act 2006  
 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 
R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG301* 

HEALTH ACT 1911 
City of Melville 

LOCAL LAWS RELATING TO EATING HOUSES—HEALTH (EATING HOUSES) 
LOCAL LAWS 2001 

In pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the Health Act 1911 and all other 
powers enabling it, the City of Melville hereby records having resolved on Tuesday, 
19 May 2009 to make the following amendments to the Schedule of Fees— 
 • Scale of Fees 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2467 



Eating House Licence and Registration Fees— 
 • Eating House Registration—$310 
 • Eating House Registration—Non Food Preparation—$185 

———— 
The Common Seal of the City of Melville was hereunto affixed in the presence of— 

 RUSSELL AUBREY, Mayor. 
Dr SHAYNE SILCOX, Chief Executive Officer. 

For more information contact Dennis Gillam on phone 9364 0278 or email 
Dennis.Gillam@melville.wa.gov.au. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
LG302* 

HEALTH ACT 1911 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Town of Claremont 
HEALTH AMENDMENT LOCAL LAWS 2009 

Made by the Council of the Town of Claremont at its Ordinary Meeting under 
Section 342 of the Health Act 1911 and in accordance with Subdivision 2, Division 2, 
Part 3 of the Local Government Act 1995.  
1. Citation 
This local law may be referred to as the Town of Claremont Health Amendment 
Local Laws 2009. 
2. Operation 
This local law will come into operation on the day on which it is published in the 
Government Gazette.  
3. Principal Local Laws  
In this local law, the Town of Claremont Health Local Laws 1997 as published in the 
Government Gazette on 17 April 2000 is referred to as the principal local law.  
4. Purpose 
The purpose of this Local Law is to amend clauses in the Health Local Law to 
provide for the regulation, control and management of public health within the local 
government. 
5. Principal local laws amended  
The Principal local laws are amended as follows—  
5.1 Section 1.3 (1) Interpretation amended  
In the definition of “Act”, delete the words “and includes subsidiary legislation made 
under the Health Act 1911”. 

The definition of “approved” is deleted and substituted with the words 
““approved” means approved by the local government”“. 

In the appropriate alphabetical order the following definition is inserted, ““AS 
1668.2—2002” means the standard published by the Standards Association 
of Australia as AS 1668.2—2002 and called “The use of ventilation and air-
conditioning in buildings—Ventilation design for indoor air contaminant 
control.”“ 

In the appropriate alphabetical order the following definition is inserted 
““AS/NZS 3666.2: 2002” means the standard published by the Standards 
Association of Australia as AS/NZS 3666.2: 2002 and called “Air-handling 
and water systems of buildings—Microbial Control—Operation and 
maintenance.”“  

The definition of “Building Code” is deleted and substituted for the definition 
““Building Code” means the latest edition of the Building Code of Australia 
published from time to time by, or on behalf of, the Australian Building 
Codes Board, as amended from time to time, but not including explanatory 
information published with that Code”“. 

The definition of “Council” is deleted and then, except in the definition of 
“water” the word “Council” is deleted wherever it appears in the Local Laws 
and the words “local government” or “the local government” as appropriate is 
substituted. 

2468 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



Insert, in the appropriate alphabetical order, the definition ““Food Standards 
Code” means the Australian New Zealand Food Standards Code as defined 
in the Commonwealth Food Standards Australia New Zealand Act 1991.”“ 

In the appropriate alphabetical order, the definition ““local government” 
means the Town of Claremont”“ is inserted; and 

Delete the definition of “water” and substitute the definition “ “water” means 
drinking water within the meaning of the Australian Drinking Water 
Guidelines as published by the National Health and Medical Research 
Council in 2004 and as amended from time to time”.” 

6. PART 2 Division 1 amended 
In subsection 6(2)(c)(ii) delete the words “hand basin” and substitute the words 
“hand wash basin”. 

Section “7. Outdoor Festivals” is repealed and the following inserted; 
 “7. Outdoor Festivals 
 (1) The organiser of an outdoor festival shall provide sanitary conveniences 

in accordance with the recommendations contained within the 
Department of Health document Guidelines for Concerts, Events and 
Organised Gatherings.  

 (2) Where, under sub-section (1), the number of a particular sanitary 
convenience to be provided is not a whole number, that number shall be 
rounded up to the next higher whole number. 

 (3) The Principal Environmental Health Officer may vary the requirements 
of sub-section (1) upon the written request of the organiser.” 

7. PART 2 Division 2 amended 
In subsection 15(3) delete the words “hand basin” and substitute the words “hand 
wash basin”. 
In subsection 18(4)(a) delete the words “the Office of Energy” and substitute the 
words “Energy Safety”.  
In subsection 18(5)(a) the numbers “1991” are deleted and substituted are the 
numbers “2002”. 
8. PART 3 Division 1 amended 
In subsection 19 (m) delete the term “the Office of Energy” and substitute in its place 
the words “Energy Safety”. 
In subsection 25 (3) (a) delete the number 3666-1989 and insert “/NZS 3666.2: 2002”. 
In section 36 the words “Environmental Protection” are deleted and substituted in 
their place are the words “Environment and Conservation”. 
In section 35 (2) (b) the word “and” after “Health” is deleted and substitute it its 
place is the word “or”. 
9. PART 4 Divisions 2 and 3 Deleted 
In Part 4 delete all of Divisions 2 and 3 
10. PART 5 amended 
Delete the existing section 54 and insert “54. An owner or occupier of premises shall 
maintain any footpath, pavement, area or right of way immediately adjacent to the 
premises clear of rubbish, matter or other things coming from or belonging to the 
premises.” 
In subsection 58 (2) delete the last word “therefrom” and substitute the words “there 
from”. 
In subsections 72 (1) (a) and (d) delete the word “is” and insert in its place the word 
“are” 
In subsection 72 (5), delete the words “flies, or vectors of disease” and substitute the 
words “flies or other vectors of disease”. 
Delete section 78 (a) and substitute the following— 
 “(a) all exhaust air that is discharged from a car park shall be discharged at 

points— 
 (i) which are constructed in accordance with AS1668.2-2002;  
 (ii) located so that the hourly average exhaust flow rate is not reduced 

below the minimum requirement of AS1668.2-2002; and 
 (ii) at a velocity and in a direction so as not to be a danger to health or a 

nuisance;” 
PART 7 amended 
In PART 7, delete Division 3—Skin Penetration. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2469 



PART 8 Section 122 amended 
In subsection 122 (c) (i) delete the words “prescribed in Schedule 10” and substitute 
“as fixed by the local government in accordance with Section 6.16 of the Local 
Government Act 1995”. 
In section 130 (c), delete the words “the requirements of the Health (Food Hygiene) 
Regulation 1993” and substitute the words “any of the requirements of Standard 
3.2.3 of the Food Standards Code”. 
In subsection 134(e), delete the words “advised by the Western Australian Fire 
Brigades Board and approved by the Council” and substitute the words “required by 
the Building Code”. 
PART 9 amended 
Subsection 155 (b) is amended by deleting the words “Offensive Trades (Fees) 
Regulations 1976” and substituting the words “Health (Offensive Trades Fees) 
Regulations 1976”.  
In subsection 176 (a) delete the words “as set out in the Health (Food Hygiene) 
Regulations 1993,”and  
In subsection 176 (b) (iii) delete the number “1991” and insert the number “2002” 
In section 185, delete the words “or the Western Australian Fire Brigades Board “. 
Schedule 1 amended  
In Schedule 1 delete the words “wash hand basins” and substitute the words “hand 
wash basins” in both places where they appear.  
Passed at an ordinary meeting of the Council of the Town of Claremont held on the 
15 May 2009.  

———— 
The Common Seal of the Town of Claremont was affixed by authority of a resolution 
of the Council in the presence of—  

PETER OLSON, Mayor. 
ATHANASIOS KYRON, Chief Executive Officer. 

———— 
Consented to— 

J. DODDS, Executive Director, Public Health. 
Dated this 16th day of June 2009. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 
MP101 

CORRECTION TO REPRINT 
PETROLEUM AND GEOTHERMAL ENERGY RESOURCES ACT 1967 

Reprint 5 as at 2 May 2008. 
At page 58, after section 46(2) insert— 
 (2a) If 2 or more geothermal resources areas are identified in a geothermal 

permit area or geothermal drilling reservation, the permittee or holder of the 
drilling reservation, as the case requires, may, instead of making a 
nomination under subsection (1a) in relation to each geothermal resources 
area, nominate all of the blocks to which the geothermal resources areas 
extend, or to which any 2 or more of the geothermal resources areas extend, 
for declaration as a single location. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

2470 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



MP301* 
Petroleum and Geothermal Energy Resources Act 1967 

Petroleum Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Petroleum Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Petroleum Regulations 1987. 

4. Regulation 1 amended 

  In regulation 1 after “Petroleum” insert: 
 

  and Geothermal Energy Resources 
 

5. Regulation 2 amended 

  In regulation 2: 
 (a) in paragraph (a) after “permittee,” (each occurrence) 

insert: 
 

  holder of the drilling reservation, 
 

 (b) in paragraph (b) after “permit,” insert: 
 

  drilling reservation, 
 

 (c) in paragraph (b) after “permittee,” insert: 
 

  holder of the drilling reservation, 
 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2471 



 (d) in paragraph (c) after “permittee,” insert: 
 

  holder of the drilling reservation, 
 

 (e) after paragraph (a) insert: 
 

  and 
 

6. Regulation 3 amended 

 (1) In regulation 3(4)(a) and (b) delete “$33” and insert: 
 

  $34.00 
 

 (2) In regulation 3(5)(a) and (b) delete “$33” and insert: 
 

  $34.00 
 

 (3) In regulation 3(6) delete “$72.00.” and insert: 
 

  $75.00. 
 

 (4) In regulation 3(7) delete “$8 600.00.” and insert: 
 

  $8 961.00. 
 

 (5) In regulation 3(8) delete “$25 800.00.” and insert: 
 

  $26 884.00. 
 

7. Regulation 3A deleted 

  Delete regulation 3A. 

8. Regulation 5 amended 

  In regulation 5(1)(f), (g) and (h) after “Petroleum” insert: 
 

  and Geothermal Energy Resources 
 

9. Regulations 6 and 7 deleted 

  Delete regulations 6 and 7. 

2472 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



10. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Prescribed fees 
[r. 3(1)] 

Column 1 

Item 

Column 2 

Provision of Act 

Column 3 

Amount of prescribed fee 

($) 

1. s. 31(1)(f) 4 064.00 

2. s. 34(1)(a) 4 064.00 

3. s. 37A(2)(e) 813.00 

4. s. 40(2)(c) 1 626.00 

5. s. 43B(1)(f) 4 064.00 

6. s. 43F(3)(d) 1 626.00 

7. s. 48A(2)(e) 1 626.00 

8. s. 48F(2)(d) 1 626.00 

9. s. 51(1)(e) 1 626.00 

10. s. 58(1)(a) 4 064.00 

11. s. 61(2)(e) 813.00 

12. s. 64(2)(d) 1 626.00 

13. s. 73(2) 81.00 

14. s. 73(3)(b) 81.00 

15. s. 80(1) 17.00 

16. s. 81(3) 41.00 

17. s. 105(2)(d) 813.00 

18. s. 137(a) 1 563.00 

 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2473 



11. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 2 delete: 
 

Petroleum Act 1967 

Petroleum Regulations 1987 
 

  and insert: 
 

Petroleum and Geothermal Energy Resources Act 1967 

Petroleum and Geothermal Energy Resources Regulations 1987 
 

 (2) In Schedule 2 in the form note 3 delete “within the meaning of 
section 72” and insert: 

 

  as defined in section 69J 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

 
——————————— 

 
 
MP302* 

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1982 

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) 
Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2474 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) 
Regulations 1990. 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

 (1) In regulation 3(4)(a) and (b) delete “$33.00” and insert: 
 

  $34.00 
 

 (2) In regulation 3(5)(a) and (b) delete “$33.00” and insert: 
 

  $34.00 
 

 (3) In regulation 3(6) delete “$1 500.00.” and insert: 
 

  $1 563.00. 
 

 (4) In regulation 3(7) delete “$72.00.” and insert: 
 

  $75.00. 
 

 (5) In regulation 3(8) delete “$8 600.00.” and insert: 
 

  $8 961.00. 
 

 (6) In regulation 3(9) delete “$25 800.00.” and insert: 
 

  $26 884.00. 
 

5. Regulation 3A deleted 

  Delete regulation 3A. 

6. Regulations 6 and 7 deleted 

  Delete regulations 6 and 7. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2475 



7. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Prescribed fees 
[r. 3(1)] 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Provision of Act 

Column 3 
Amount of prescribed fee 

($) 

1. s. 21(1)(f) 4 064.00 

2. s. 24(1)(a) 4 064.00 

3. s. 30(2)(c) 1 626.00 

4. s. 38A(2)(e) 1 626.00 

5. s. 38F(2)(d) 1 626.00 

6. s. 41(1)(e) 1 626.00 

7. s. 48(1)(a) 4 064.00 

8. s. 51(2)(e) 813.00 

9. s. 54(2)(d) 1 626.00 

10 s. 64(1)(f) 4 064.00 

11. s. 68(2)(c) 1 626.00 

12. s. 71(2)(e) 813.00 

13. s. 79(2) 81.00 

14. s. 79(3)(b) 81.00 

15. s. 86(1) 17.00 

16. s. 87(3) 41.00 

17. s. 111(2)(d) 813.00 

18. s. 141 120.00 

 

2476 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



8. Schedule 2 amended 

  In Schedule 2 in the form note 3 delete “within the meaning of 
section 72” and insert: 

 

  as defined in section 74J 
 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 
MP303* 

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1982 

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Registration Fees 
Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) 
Registration Fees Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) 
Registration Fees Regulations 1990. 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

 (1) In regulation 3(1) delete “$780.00.” and insert: 
 

  $813.00. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2477 



 (2) In regulation 3(2) delete “$780.00.” and insert: 
 

  $813.00. 
 

 (3) In regulation 3(3) delete “$3 900.00.” and insert: 
 

  $4 064.00. 
 

 (4) In regulation 3(4) delete “$780.00.” and insert: 
 

  $813.00. 
 

 (5) In regulation 3(5) delete “$3 900.00.” and insert: 
 

  $4 064.00. 
 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
MP304* 

Petroleum Pipelines Act 1969 

Petroleum Pipelines Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Petroleum Pipelines Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2009. 

2478 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Petroleum Pipelines 
Regulations 1970. 

4. Regulation 4B amended 

  In regulation 4B delete “$115.00.” and insert: 
 

  $120.00. 
 

5. Third Schedule replaced 

  Delete the Third Schedule and insert: 
 

Third Schedule — Fees 
[r. 4] 

Item 
no. 

Purpose Provision of 
Act 

Fee 
($) 

1. Application for licence s. 8(l)(j) 4 054.00 

2. Application for renewal of 
licence 

 
s. 11(2)(d) 

 
1 626.00 

3. Application for variation of 
licence 

 
s. 15(2)(d) 

 
813.00 

4. Registration of memorandum 
of transfer and name of 
transferee 

 
 
s. 44(9) 

 
 

81.00 

5. Registration as licensee on 
devolution by operation of law 

 
s. 45(2) 

 
81.00 

6. Application by company 
licensee for registration of 
change of name 

 
 
s. 45(3) 

 
 

81.00 

7. Entry on memorial of 
registration of approval of 
dealing 

 
 
s. 47(12) 

 
 

81.00 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2479 



Item 
no. 

Purpose Provision of 
Act 

Fee 
($) 

8. Inspection of register s. 52(1) 17.00 

9. Copies of or extracts from the 
register or of or from an 
instrument certified by 
Minister 

 
 
 
s. 53(2) 

 
 
 

3.00 

10. Certificate by Minister as to 
entry, matter or things under 
the Act 

 
 
s. 53(3) 

 
 

41.00 

 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 
R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

——————————— 
 
 
MP305* 

Petroleum and Geothermal Energy Resources (Registration Fees) 
Act 1967 

Petroleum (Registration Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Petroleum (Registration Fees) 
Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

2480 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Petroleum (Registration Fees) 
Regulations 1990. 

4. Regulation 1 amended 

  In regulation 1 after “Petroleum” insert: 
 

  and Geothermal Energy Resources 
 

5. Regulation 3 amended 

 (1) In regulation 3(1) delete “$780.00.” and insert: 
 

  $813.00. 
 

 (2) In regulation 3(2) delete “$780.00.” and insert: 
 

  $813.00. 
 

 (3) In regulation 3(3) delete “$3 900.00.” and insert: 
 

  $4 064.00. 
 

 (4) In regulation 3(4) delete “$780.00.” and insert: 
 

  $813.00. 
 

 (5) In regulation 3(5) delete “$3 900.00.” and insert: 
 

  $4 064.00. 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2481 



PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 
PI301* 

Land Administration Act 1997 

Land Administration Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Land Administration Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Land Administration 
Regulations 1998. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  In Schedule 1: 
 (a) in item 1 delete “100.00” and insert: 

 
  104.00 

 
 (b) in item 1A delete “123.00” and insert: 

 
  128.00 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

2482 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



PI302* 
Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Ports and Harbours Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Ports and Harbours Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Ports and Harbours 
Regulations 1966. 

4. Regulation 14 amended 

  In regulation 14(3) delete “$4 552.28” and insert: 
 

  $4 743.48 
 

5. Regulation 15 amended 

  In regulation 15(3) delete “$749.16,” and insert: 
 

  $780.62, 
 

6. Regulation 15A amended 

 (1) In regulation 15A(1)(a) delete “$746.36” and insert: 
 

  $777.71 
 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2483 



 (2) In regulation 15A(2): 
 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$746.36” and insert: 

 
  $777.71 

 
 (b) in paragraph (c) delete “$886.14” and insert: 

 
  $923.35 

 

7. Regulation 15B amended 

  In regulation 15B: 
 (a) delete “$355.02” and insert: 

 
  $369.93 

 
 (b) delete “$508.77” and insert: 

 
  $530.15 

 

8. Regulation 15C amended 

  In regulation 15C delete paragraph (a) and “and” after it and 
insert: 

 
 (a) $116.51 per hour with a minimum charge of 

$780.62 and a maximum charge in any 24 hour 
period of $2 027.31 at the port of Wyndham; 
and 

 

9. Regulation 16 amended 

  In regulation 16(d)(i) delete “$823.24” and insert: 
 

  $857.81 
 

10. Third Schedule amended 

  Amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 1 $5 002.94 $5 213.07 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 1 $5 119.77 $5 334.79 

2484 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 1 $5 683.02 $5 921.71 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 1 $6 284.02 $6 547.96 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 1 $7 540.54 $7 857.25 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 1 $8 430.89 $8 784.99 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 1 $9 230.36 $9 618.04 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 2(a) $621.98 $648.10 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 2(c)(i) $355.02 $369.93 

Sch. 3 Div. 1 it. 2(c)(ii) $508.77 $530.15 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 
R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 
PI303* 

Port Authorities Act 1999 

Port Authorities Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Port Authorities Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2485 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Port Authorities Regulations 2001. 

4. Regulation 22 amended 

  In regulation 22 insert in alphabetical order: 
 

 cargo vessel means a vessel which is not a passenger 
vessel or an exempt vessel; 

 exempt vessel means —  
 (a) a vessel belonging to the naval, military or air 

forces of the Commonwealth or of any other 
country, including a foreign country; or 

 (b) a vessel which the harbour master considers to 
be a non-commercial vessel; 

 normal working hours means the hours between 
7:30 a.m. and 3:30 p.m. each day, other than a 
Saturday, a Sunday or a public holiday; 

 passenger vessel has the meaning given in the Marine 
Act section 3(1); 

 

5. Regulation 48A inserted 

  After regulation 47 insert: 
 

48A. Charges for pilotage services — Port of Albany 

 (1) The charges for pilotage services provided in the Port 
of Albany and payable in respect of a vessel are set out 
in Schedule 2 Division 7. 

 (2) The payment of a charge set out in any of items 1, 2 
and 3 of Schedule 2 Division 7 provides for the 
movement of a vessel of the appropriate class and gross 
registered tonnage under the control of a pilot both into 
and out of the Port of Albany. 

 (3) The payment of a charge set out in Schedule 2 
Division 7 item 4 provides for the movement of a 
vessel of the appropriate gross registered tonnage under 
the control of a pilot both from a berth within the Port 
of Albany to an anchorage and from an anchorage to a 
berth within the Port of Albany. 

 (4) The charge set out in Schedule 2 Division 7 item 6 is 
payable if —  

 (a) the services of a pilot are arranged for a vessel; 
and 

 (b) the arrangement is cancelled with less than 
2 hours notice being given to the pilot. 

 

2486 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



6. Regulation 48 amended 

  In regulation 48(1): 
 (a) in paragraph (d) delete “item 3,” and insert: 

 
  item 3; or 

 
 (b) after paragraph (d) insert: 

 
 (e) Division 7 item 7, 

 

7. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Delete Schedule 2 Division 2 and insert: 
 

Division 2 — Port of Bunbury 

1. Pilotage of a vessel into and out of the port ................ $4 298.18 

2. Pilotage of a vessel from a place in the port to 
another place in the port ...............................................

 
$2 149.09 

3. Detention of pilot, for each hour or part of an hour ..... $1 074.55 

4. Cancellation of pilot ..................................................... $1 074.55 

5. Cancellation of pilot boat crew only ............................ $1 074.55 
 

 (2) Delete Schedule 2 Division 6 and insert: 
 

Division 6 — Port of Port Hedland 

  To or from 
Nelson 
Point or 
PHPA 
Berth 
Nos. 1, 2 
or 3 

To or from 
Finucane 
Island or 
Anderson 
Point 

1. Pilotage of a vessel of not more than 
20 000 gross registered tonnes into or 
out of the port —  

(a) for each gross registered tonne of 
vessel .............................................

(b) minimum charge ............................

 
 
 

 
$0.383 

$4 140.40 

 
 
 

 
$0.440 

$4 764.10 

2. Pilotage of a vessel of more than 20 000 
but not more than 40 000 gross 
registered tonnes into or out of the port ....

 
 
$7 661.50 

 
 
$8 285.20 

3. Pilotage of a vessel of more than 40 000 
but not more than 60 000 gross 
registered tonnes into or out of the port ....

 
 
$9 113.50 

 
 
$9 737.20 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2487 



  To or from 
Nelson 
Point or 
PHPA 
Berth 
Nos. 1, 2 
or 3 

To or from 
Finucane 
Island or 
Anderson 
Point 

4. Pilotage of a vessel of more than 60 000 
but not more than 80 000 gross 
registered tonnes into or out of the port ...

 
 
$10 147.50 

 
 
$10 771.20 

5. Pilotage of a vessel of more than 80 000 
gross registered tonnes into or out of the 
port ...........................................................

 
 
$10 766.80 

 
 
$11 390.50 

6. Additional charge for pilotage of a 
vessel into the port from the designated 
pilotage area or out of the port to the 
designated pilotage area ...........................

 
 
 

$2 246.20 

7. Pilotage of a vessel from a place in the 
port to another place in the port —  

(a) for a vessel of not more than 
1 000 gross registered tonnes ........

(b) for a vessel of more than 
1 000 gross registered tonnes ........

 
 
 

$1 035.10 

 
$1 448.70 

8. Cancellation of pilot ................................. $389.40 
 

 (3) After Schedule 2 Division 6 insert: 
 

Division 7 — Port of Albany 

1. Pilotage of a vessel of more than 500 
gross registered tonnes but not more 
than 1 000 gross registered tonnes into 
and out of the port —  

(a) standard charge ...............................

(b) supplementary charge for each 
movement of the vessel outside normal 
working hours ...........................................

 
 
 
 

$4 240.00 

 
 
$925.00 

2. Pilotage of a cargo vessel of more than 
1 000 gross registered tonnes into and 
out of the port —  

(a) for each deadweight tonne of 
vessel ............................................

(b) minimum charge ............................

 
 
 

 
$0.12 

$4 840.00 

3. Pilotage of a passenger vessel of more 
than 1 000 gross registered tonnes into 
and out of the port —  

(a) for each gross registered tonne of 
vessel ............................................

(b) minimum charge ............................

 
 
 

 
$0.12 

$4 840.00 

2488 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



4. Pilotage of a vessel of more than 500 
gross registered tonnes from berth to 
anchorage and from anchorage to 
berth —  

(a) for each deadweight tonne of 
vessel .............................................

(b) minimum charge ............................

 
 
 
 

 
$0.06 

$2 120.00 

5. Pilotage of a vessel of more than 500 
gross registered tonnes from one berth to 
another berth .............................................

 
 
$1 060.00 

6. Cancellation of pilot ................................. $1 060.00 

7. Detention of pilot, per hour or part of an 
hour ..........................................................

 
$250.00 

 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
PI304* 

Perth Parking Management Act 1999 

Perth Parking Management Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Perth Parking Management 
Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2489 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Perth Parking Management 
Regulations 1999. 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  In Schedule 2 item 11(v) delete “concerning which the owner has 
agreed with a tenant of the owner that it will be set aside for the 
exclusive use of the tenant.” and insert: 

 
  that is not available to the public but is 

available for use by a person who is not the 
owner of the building.  

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
PI305* 

Jetties Act 1926 

Jetties Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Jetties Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Jetties Regulations 1940. 

2490 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Delete Schedule 1 Division 1 clause 22(8) and Table 22.7 and 
insert: 

 

 (8) The charge to be paid for each kilolitre of water supply 
supplied to a vessel is the relevant amount prescribed in the 
Water Agencies (Charges) By-laws 1987 Schedule 1 
item 31(b). 

 (9) The charge for lighting, per hour or part of an hour is set out 
in Table 22.7. 

Table 22.7 (Lighting) 

Item Service $ 

1. For jetty, shed and yard 26.35 

2. For jetty only 8.45 

3. For reduced lighting 2.80 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
PI306* 

Port Authorities Act 1999 

Port Authorities (Geraldton Port Description) 
Order 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 24(1) of 
the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Port Authorities (Geraldton Port Description) 
Order 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2491 



2. Port of Geraldton described 

 (1) The Port of Geraldton consists of the areas of land, water and 
seabed in —  

 (a) Lot 502 and Lot 503 on Deposited Plan 57801 
Version 1; and 

 (b) Lot 12186 on Deposited Plan 193685 as approved on 
27 November 1998. 

 (2) The Deposited Plans referred to in subclause (1) are held by the 
Western Australian Land Information Authority established by 
the Land Information Authority Act 2006. 

3. Previous instruments cancelled 

  All proclamations made under the Geraldton Port Authority 
Act 1968 in relation to the area of the port of Geraldton are 
cancelled. 

 
 
By Command of the Governor, 

 
R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

POLICE 
PO301* 

Misuse of Drugs Act 1981 

Misuse of Drugs Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Misuse of Drugs Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

2492 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Misuse of Drugs Regulations 1982. 

4. Schedule 3 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 3 Division 1 after “Acetic anhydride” insert: 
 

Acetyl Chloride  50ml 

 

 (2) Delete Schedule 3 Division 2 and insert: 
 

Division 2 — Things 

Item Description 

1 Any storage device containing ammonia gas where the 
mass of the storage device is less than one tonne. 

 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 
PO302* 

Police Act 1892 

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Firearms Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2493 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Firearms Regulations 1974. 

4. Schedule 1A amended 

  Amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 1A it. 1(b) 38 41.50 

Sch. 1A it. 2(b) 38 41.50 

Sch. 1A it. 3(b) 96 104 

Sch. 1A it. 4(b)  89 96 

Sch. 1A it. 5(b) 68 73 

Sch. 1A it. 6(b) 68 73 

Sch. 1A it. 7(b) 71 77 

Sch. 1A it. 9 51 53 

Sch. 1A it. 10 18 19 

Sch. 1A it. 11 29 30 

Sch. 1A it. 12 18 19 

Sch. 1A it. 13 129 134 

 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 

 

 

2494 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



WATER/SEWERAGE 
WA301* 

Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914 

Rights in Water and Irrigation Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council under the Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 section 
37 and the Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914 section 27. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Rights in Water and Irrigation 
Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Rights in Water and Irrigation 
Regulations 2000. 

4. References to “Commission” replaced 

 (1) In the provisions listed in the Table delete “Commission” (each 
occurrence) and insert: 

 

  Minister 
 

Table 

r. 3 def. of approved r. 4(1)(a) 

r. 4(2) r. 5(1) 

r. 5(2) r. 5(3)(e) 

r. 6(1) r. 6(2) 

r. 7(1) r. 7(2) but not r. 7(2)(g)(iv) 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2495 



r. 7(3) r. 7(4) 

r. 7(5) r. 7(6) 

r. 8(1) r. 8(2) 

r. 9(1) r. 9(2) 

r. 11(1) r. 12(1) 

r. 12(2) r. 12(3) 

r. 13(1) r. 13(2) 

r. 13(4) r. 14(1) 

r. 14(2) r. 14(4) 

r. 14(6) r. 15 

r. 16(1) r. 16(2) 

r. 17(1)(b) r. 17(2) 

r. 18(1) r. 18(3) 

r. 20(7) r. 21(2) 

r. 22(2) r. 23(2) 

r. 23(3)(a)(ii) r. 23(3)(b)(ii) 

r. 23(4)(d) r. 23(5) 

r. 24(1) r. 24(2) 

r. 25(1) r. 25(2) 

r. 25(3) r. 26(1) 

r. 26(2) r. 26(3) 

r. 26(4) r. 27(1) 

r. 27(2) r. 29 

r. 30(3) r. 34(1) 

r. 34(2) r. 35(1) 

r. 35(2) but not r. 35(2)(f)(iv) r. 35(3) 

r. 35(4) r. 35(5) 

2496 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



r. 35(6) r. 36(1) 

r. 36(2) r. 37(1) 

r. 37(2) r. 38 

r. 41 r. 44(1) 

r. 44(2) r. 44(3)(a) 

r. 45(1) r. 45(2) 

r. 46(b) r. 48 

r. 57  

 (2) Amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

r. 6(1)(b) it the Minister 

r. 6(2)(a) its the 

r. 7(2) it the Minister 

r. 7(2)(g)(iv)  of the Commission; in relation to such 
applications; 

r. 7(4) it makes its making the 

r. 7(6) it is  

r. 8(1) it the Minister 

r. 14(4)(a) its the 

r. 14(6) it makes its making the 

r. 17(2) its his or her 

r. 23(5) it makes its making the 

r. 24(2) it makes its making the 

r. 26(1) obligation it obligation, the 
Minister 

r. 26(4) it makes its making the 

r. 34(1)(b) it the Minister 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2497 



Provision Delete Insert 

r. 34(2)(a) its the 

r. 35(2) it the Minister 

r. 35(2)(f)(iv)  of the Commission; in relation to such 
applications; 

r. 35(4) it makes its making the 

r. 35(6) it is  

r. 36(1) it the Minister 

5. Regulation 18 amended 

  Delete regulation 18(3)(b)(ii) and insert: 
 

 (ii) recover the costs and expenses incurred 
in doing so as a debt due to the State by 
the person. 

 

6. Regulation 20 amended 

  In regulation 20(7) delete “If ” and insert: 
 

  If a 
 

7. Regulation 42 replaced 

  Delete regulation 42 and insert: 
 

42. Damage to meters 

 (1) Any repairs required to a meter provided by the State 
are to be carried out, or to be caused to be carried out, 
by the Minister and the cost of those repairs is to be 
paid by the licence holder. 

 (2) The State may recover the costs due under 
subregulation (1) as a debt due to the State from the 
licence holder in a court of competent jurisdiction. 

 

8. Regulations 52, 52A and 52B replaced 

  Delete regulations 52, 52A and 52B and insert: 
 

52A. Persons authorised to give infringement notices 

  For the purposes of the Water Agencies (Powers) 
Act 1984 section 103, each of the following persons is 

2498 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



authorised to give an infringement notice in respect of 
an offence prescribed by regulation 50 — 

 (a) any person employed in the Department who is 
authorised in writing by the chief executive 
officer of the Department to give such notices; 

 (b) any person who is authorised under the Water 
Agencies (Infringements) Regulations 1994 
regulation 5(2) to give an infringement notice 
in respect of an offence under the Water 
Agencies (Water Use) By-laws 2007 by-law 4. 

52B. Prescribed persons for infringement notices 

  For the purposes of the Water Agencies (Powers) 
Act 1984 section 103, a person holding or acting in any 
of the following offices in the Department is a 
prescribed person in relation to an infringement notice 
given in respect of an offence prescribed by 
regulation 50 — 

 (a) the chief executive officer; 
 (b) the Director, Regional Management and Water 

Information; 
 (c) the Manager, Regional Integration Branch; 
 (d) the Coordinator, Compliance and Enforcement 

Unit. 

52. Designated person for infringement notices 

  For the purposes of the Water Agencies (Powers) 
Act 1984 section 103, a person holding or acting in the 
office of chief finance officer (within the meaning of 
that term in the Financial Management Act 2006 
section 57) for the Department is the designated person 
to whom payment may be made of a modified penalty 
for an offence prescribed by regulation 50. 

 

9. Regulation 55A inserted 

  After regulation 54 insert: 
 

55A. Form of certificate for authorised person 

  A certificate issued under the Water Agencies (Powers) 
Act 1984 section 103(11) to an authorised person must 
be in the form of Form 5. 

 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2499 



10. Schedule 3 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 3 in Form 1 delete the passage that begins with 
“Water and Rivers” and ends with “Act 1984” and insert: 

 

Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914 
Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 

Application for a licence under the 
Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914 s. 26D 

 

 (2) In Schedule 3 in Form 2 delete the passage that begins with 
“Water and Rivers” and ends with “Act 1984” and insert: 

 

Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914 
Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 

Information to be provided under the 
Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914 s. 26E 

after constructing or deepening a non-artesian well 
 

 (3) In Schedule 3 in Form 3: 
 (a) delete the passage that begins with “Water and Rivers” 

and ends with “section 103(2)” and insert: 
 

Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 s. 103(2) 

Infringement notice 
 

 (b) delete “Water and Rivers Commission” (second 
occurrence) and insert: 

 
  Department of Water 

 
 (c) Delete “Water and Rivers Commission” (third occurrence) 

and insert: 
 

  Department of Water 
 

 (4) In Schedule 3 in Form 4: 
 (a) delete the passage that begins with “Water and Rivers” 

and ends with “section 103(6)” and insert: 
 

Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 s. 103(6) 

Notice of withdrawal of infringement notice 
 

 (b) delete “in the Water and Rivers Commission”. 

2500 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



 (5) In Schedule 3 in Form 5: 
 (a) delete the passage that begins with “Water and Rivers” 

and ends with “section 103(11)” and insert: 
 

Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914 
Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 s. 103(11) 

Certificate that person is an authorised person 
 

 (b) delete “Water and Rivers Commission” (second 
occurrence); 

 (c) delete “in the Water and Rivers Commission”; 
 (d) delete “CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORISED PERSON”; 
 (e) delete “these regulations.” and insert: 

 
  the Rights in Water and Irrigation Regulations 2000. 

 
 (f) at the end of the form insert: 

 

  Signed: ....................................................................... 

  Chief executive officer of the Department of Water or 
Chief executive officer of the Water Corporation on behalf 
of the Water Corporation.* 

  * Delete the inapplicable. 
 

 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

 
R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 
WA302* 

Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914 

Rights in Water and Irrigation Exemption 
(Section 26C) Amendment Order 2009 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Rights in Water and Irrigation Exemption 
(Section 26C) Amendment Order 2009. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2501 



2. Commencement 

  This order comes into operation as follows — 
 (a) clauses 1 and 2 — on the day on which this order is 

published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the order — on the day after that day. 

3. Order amended 

  This order amends the Rights in Water and Irrigation 
Exemption (Section 26C) Order 2007. 

4. Clause 4 amended 

  In clause 4(1) after “Schedule 1” insert: 
 

  Division 1 and shown for information purposes in 
Schedule 1 Division 2, 

 

5. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Proclaimed areas — clause 4 
[cl. 4(1)] 

Division 1 — Proclaimed areas or parts of areas 

 (1) All of the following —  
 (a) the Wanneroo Groundwater Area; 
 (b) the Swan Groundwater Area; 
 (c) the Perth Groundwater Area; 
 (d) the Mirrabooka Groundwater Area; 
 (e) the Gwelup Groundwater Area; 
 (f) the Cockburn Groundwater Area; 
 (g) the Jandakot Groundwater Area; 
 (h) the Serpentine Groundwater Area; 
 (i) the Rockingham Groundwater Area; 
 (j) the Stakehill Groundwater Area. 

 (2) The parts of the Yanchep Groundwater Area and Gnangara 
Groundwater Area that are within the Metropolitan Region 
as defined in the Planning and Development Act 2005 
section 4(1). 

 (3) The part of the South Western Coastal Groundwater Area 
that is within the City of Mandurah. 

 (4) The part of the Murray Groundwater Area that is within the 
Shire of Murray. 

2502 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



Division 2 — Plan of proclaimed areas or parts of areas 

 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2503 



— PART 2 — 

AGRICULTURE AND FOOD 
AG401* 

STOCK DISEASES (REGULATIONS) ACT 1968 
STOCK (IDENTIFICATION AND MOVEMENT) ACT 1970 

APPOINTMENTS 
Department of Agriculture and Food, 

South Perth WA 6151. 
The Governor is pleased to appoint the following as Inspectors pursuant to Section 8(1) of the Stock 
Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968 and Section 37 of the Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970— 

Jessica Claire Paterson 
James Joseph Sheehan 

TERRY REDMAN MLA, Minister for Agriculture and Food. 

LANDS 
LA401* 

DAMPIER TO BUNBURY PIPELINE ACT 1997 
DESIGNATED LAND 

I, Brendon John Grylls, MLA, DBNGP Land Access Minister, give notice in accordance with section 
33(1) of the Dampier to Bunbury Pipeline Act 1997 that the land the subject of the Land Description 
described below is designated, at the beginning of the day this notice is published in the Government 
Gazette, as additional land in the DBNGP corridor. 
LAND DESCRIPTION 
1. Portion of Lot 156 on Deposited Plan 202726 shown as DBNGP corridor marked Y on Deposited 
Plan 39030 being part of the land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 1199 Folio 651. 
The Plans may be inspected at Landgate, Midland Square, Midland. 

BRENDON GRYLLS MLA, DBNGP Land Access Minister. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG401* 

SHIRE OF AUGUSTA-MARGARET RIVER 
APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED PERSON AND REGISTRATION OFFICER 

It is hereby notified for public information that— 
Gavin Wayne Jennion has been appointed as an Authorised Person of the Shire of Augusta-
Margaret River pursuant to the following— 

To exercise powers under Part XX of the Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 
1960; Section 449 of the Local Government Act (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 as Pound 
Keeper and Ranger. 

2504 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



Part 9, Division 2 of the Local Government Act 1995; 
Section 3.39 of the Local Government Act 1995 as an Authorised Person; 
Section 9.13, 9.15 and 9.16 of the Local Government Act 1995 as an Authorised Person, 

and as an Authorised Person pursuant to the following— 
Dog Act 1976 (as amended) and Regulations; 
Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978-1985 (as amended) and Regulations; 
Litter Act 1979-1981 (as amended) and Regulations; 
Bush Fires Act 1954 (as amended) and Regulations; 
Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995 (as amended) and Regulations 1997; 
All Shire of Augusta-Margaret River Local Laws. 

and that the following person is appointed as a Registration Officer pursuant to the Dog Act 1976 
Suzanne Marie Davies 

All previous appointments gazetted 21 April 2009, No. 69, P1372 are still in effect. 

GARY EVERSHED, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
LG402* 

CITY OF KALGOORLIE-BOULDER 
APPOINTMENTS 

The City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder wishes to advise for public information the appointment of Bianca 
Teresa Broom as an authorised officer to operate within the City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder to enforce the 
following Acts, Regulations and Local Laws effective immediately— 
 • Local Government Act 1995 
 • Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 
 • Dog Act 1976—For the purpose of Dog Registration Officer, Issuing of Dog Infringement 

Notices, Dog Warning Notices and Notices to Register Dog (Admin) 
 • Litter Act 1979—For the Purpose of issuing Litter Infringements (Admin) 
 • City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder Parking and Parking Facilities Local Law (Admin) 
 • Bush Fires Act 1954 (Admin) 
 • Control of Vehicles (Off-road Areas) Act 1978 (Admin) 
 • Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act and Regulations 1995 (Admin) 

D. S. BURNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
LG403* 

CITY OF KALGOORLIE-BOULDER 
CANCELLATION OF APPOINTMENTS 

The City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder wishes to advise for public information the cancellation of the 
appointments of Rebecca Pope and Deonne Lewis as an authorised officer to operate within the City 
of Kalgoorlie-Boulder to enforce the following Acts, Regulations and Local Laws— 
 • Local Government Act 1995 
 • Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 
 • Dog Act 1976—For the purpose of Dog Registration Officer, Issuing of Dog Infringement 

Notices, Dog Warning Notices and Notices to Register Dog (Admin) 
 • Litter Act 1979—For the Purpose of issuing Litter Infringements (Admin) 
 • City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder Parking and Parking Facilities Local Law (Admin) 
 • Bush Fires Act 1954 (Admin) 
 • Control of Vehicles (Off-road Areas) Act 1978 (Admin) 
 • Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act and Regulations 1995 (Admin) 

D. S. BURNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2505 



LG404* 
CITY OF KALGOORLIE-BOULDER 

CANCELLATION 
The City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder wishes to advise for public information the cancellation of the 
appointment of Richard John Rose, as authorised officer to enforce the following Acts and Regulations 
and Local Laws— 
 • Local Government Act 1995  
 • Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960  
 • Dog Act 1976  
 • Litter Act 1979  
 • Bush Fires Act 1954 and Regulations—(Bush Fire Control Officer)  
 • Bush Fires (Infringements) Regulations 1978  
 • Control of Off-Road Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978 and Regulations  
 • Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act and Regulations 1995  
 • City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder Local Laws 

D. S. BURNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 
MP402* 

PETROLEUM AND GEOTHERMAL ENERGY RESOURCES ACT 1967 
Section 30(1) 

DISCRETE AREA RELEASE 
Invitation for Applications for The Grant of Petroleum Exploration Permits 

Release Date: Tuesday, 2 June 2009 
Closing Date: Thursday, 26 November 2009  

AREAS AVAILABLE 
Applications are invited for the grant of exploration permits over the following discrete areas within 
Western Australia’s Canning Basin. 
Applications will be received up until 4.00 pm on Thursday, 26 November 2009. Applicants need to 
observe the closing time and date. Any applications received after the closing time and date will not 
be considered. 

Onshore Areas 
AREA L09- 1 Canning Basin Contains 25 blocks 
1 000 000 Broome Map Sheet (SE51) 

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. 
7631 7632 7633 7634 
7703 7704 7705 7706 
7775 7776 7777 7778 
7779 7780 7781 7782 
7847 7848 7849 7850 
7851 7852 7853 7854 
7924    

AREA L09- 2 Canning Basin Contains 12 blocks 
1 000 000 Broome Map Sheet (SE51) 

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. 
7932 7933 7934 8004 
8005 8006 8007 8076 
8077 8078 8079 8151 

2506 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



APPLICATION DETAILS 
Central to any application made is the program of work proposed for each year of the six year term. 
Applications are to be made in accordance with Section 31 of the Petroleum and Geothermal Energy 
Resources Act 1967. Consideration of an application for the grant of a Permit shall take into account 
work programs relative to the whole of the area applied for, the adequacy of the work program, and 
the applicant’s technical and financial ability to undertake the work. Permits are awarded on the 
understanding that the first two years work commitment will be fulfilled without variation. 
Where there is more than one applicant to the application, the percentage participating interest of 
each party to the application is to be supplied This is to include evidence that a satisfactory 
settlement has been, or can be; reached on a Joint Operating Agreement (copy of Heads of Agreement 
dealing will generally suffice). 
Applicants should also make themselves aware of the existence of any areas which have the potential 
to restrict exploration activities, e.g., National Parks, Nature Reserves, Marine Parks, World 
Heritage Areas, Conservation Reserves, Defence Areas and Mining Titles. 
Insofar as Reserved Land is concerned, entry for exploration purposes is subject to approval by the 
Minister. In this regard, it should be noted that Government policy, at least, is such that petroleum 
extraction from within National Parks, Nature Reserves and access to Conservation Estates should 
not be presumed. 
Any applications over the above onshore areas may be subject to the provisions of the Commonwealth 
Native Title Act 1993 and applicants should be prepared to negotiate with Native Title parties 
pursuant to the right to negotiate provisions of the NTA. 
Applicants should also be aware that onshore areas available for petroleum application are subject (at 
least in part) to Native Title claims. Plans showing these claim boundaries are available as part of the 
release package. 
An information package on the release areas detailing the criteria for assessment of applications and 
the conditions to apply following the award of a permit, and including a plan of the release areas and 
an application proforma, is available on CD-ROM. Copies of the CD-ROM can be obtained from the 
Petroleum and Environment Division, Department of Mines and Petroleum by contacting the 
Petroleum Applications Receiving Officer on (08) 9222 3106. 

LODGEMENT OF APPLICATIONS 
Applications, together with supporting data, should be submitted in the following manner and 
accompanied by fee of $3,900.00 (non-refundable) payable to the Department of Industry and 
Resources through an Australian Bank or by Australian bank cheque. 
The following special instructions should be observed— 
 • The application should be sealed and clearly marked “Application for Petroleum 

Exploration Permit—Commercial-in-Confidence”. 
 • Unless delivered by hand to the Petroleum Applications Receiving Officer, the sealed 

application (as described above) should be enclosed in a plain covering envelope or package 
and forwarded to the following address— 

Executive Director, Petroleum and Environment Division 
Department of Mines and Petroleum 
Mineral House 
100 Plain Street 
East Perth WA 6004 
Attention: Petroleum Applications Receiving Officer 

Confirmation of receipt of applications (delivered and received by hand) will be issued by the 
Petroleum Applications Receiving Officer. 
This application needs to observe the closing time and date as published in the release 
package. Applications received after the closing time and date will not be considered. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
MP401* 

Commonwealth of Australia 
OFFSHORE PETROLEUM AND GREENHOUSE GAS STORAGE ACT 2006 

Section 275 
NOTICE OF CANCELLATION OF EXPLORATION PERMIT WA-306-P R1 

The cancellation of Petroleum Exploration Permit WA-306-P R1, held by Antrim Energy Australia 
Pty Ltd, will take effect on the date this notice appears in the Government Gazette. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Executive Director Petroleum and  
Environment Division. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2507 



PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 
PI101* 

CORRECTION 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Mandurah 

Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 92 
Ref: 853/6/13/12 Pt 92  
It is hereby notified for public information that the notice under the above Amendment No. 92 
published at page 1935 of the Government Gazette No. 98 dated 9 June 2009, contained an error 
which is now corrected as follows— 

For the words: Waterson Place 
Read: Waterston Place 

P. CREEVEY, Mayor. 
M. R. NEWMAN, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
——————————— 

 
PI401* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

City of Rockingham 
Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 44 

Ref: 853/2/28/4 Pt 44 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the City of Rockingham local planning 
Scheme Amendment on the 26th May 2009 for the purpose of— 
 1. Modifying the Scheme Text, Schedule 4 Special Rural Zone provisions as follows— 
 (a) Include ‘Portion of Lot 578 Mandurah Road, Baldivis’ within Plan Reference 4(ii) of the 

location table of Schedule No.4 of the Scheme Text pertaining to ‘Special Rural’ zones 
‘Portions of Planning Unit 4 of the Rural Land Strategy’. 

 (b) Plan No.4—Special Rural zones of the Scheme being amended to show portion of Lot 
578 Mandurah Road, Baldivis outlined in black and annotated as 4(ii). 

 2. Modifying the Scheme Maps as follows:— 
 (a) Rezoning portion of Lot 578 Mandurah Road, Baldivis from ‘Rural’ to ‘Special Rural’. 

B. SAMMELS, Mayor. 
ANDREW HAMMOND, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
——————————— 

 
PI402* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

Town of Kwinana 
Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 93 

Ref: 853/2/26/3 Pt 93 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the Town of Kwinana local planning 
scheme development on 20 April 2009 for the purpose of— 
 1. Modifying the Scheme Map to remove the ‘R20’ base coding from Lots 1201 and 1202 

Bertram, Lot 1216 Thomas Road, Bertram, Lots 9004 and Pt Lot 9215 Durrant Avenue, 
Parmelia and the ‘R12.5/20’ base coding from Lot 6 Durrant Avenue, Parmelia. 

 2. Extending the Development Area No.1, to cover Lot 9004 and Pt Lot 9215 Durrant Avenue, 
Parmelia and Lot 6 Durrant Avenue, Parmelia. 

 3. Modifying the Scheme Map to zone the currently unzoned portion of Lot 1201, Bertram 
‘Residential.’ 

 4. Adding the following special provisions to Development Area No.1 under the fourth schedule 
of the Scheme Text.  

2508 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



 3. The density coding shall be in accordance with the approved Structure Plan. 
 4. Uses and development within the neighbourhood centre shall be in accordance with the 

Commercial Zone and the Residential Density Code shown on the approved Structure 
Plan.  

C. E. ADAMS, Mayor. 
N. P. HARTLEY, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
——————————— 

 
PI403* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

Town of Kwinana 
Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 99 

Ref: 853/2/26/3 Pt 99 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the Town of Kwinana local planning 
scheme development on 20 April 2009 for the purpose of— 
 1. Amending the Scheme Map to rezone various lots created from closed portions of Johnson 

Road reserve to allow for residential development, as depicted on the Scheme Amendment 
Map.  

 2. Amending the Scheme Map to include the various lot within ‘Development Area No.1’ and 
‘Development Contribution Area No. 1’, as depicted on the Scheme Amendment Map.  

C. E. ADAMS, Mayor. 
N. P. HARTLEY, Chief Executive Officer. 

DECEASED ESTATES 
ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Anthony John McAleer, late of 11/21 Ponte Vecchio Boulevard, Ellenbrook, Western Australia, 
Retired Farmer, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 16 January 2009, are required by the Executor, 
Nancy May McAleer of care of Michael, Whyte & Co, Solicitors, Level 1, 41-43 Ord Street, West Perth, 
Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to her within ONE (1) month from the date of 
publication of this notice, after which date the Executor may convey or distribute the assets, having 
regard only to the claims of which she then has notice. 

MICHAEL, WHYTE & CO. 
 

——————————— 
 
ZX402 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Peter Eaton, late of 3 Adam Road, Ravenswood in the State of Western Australia, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 18 November 2008 are required by the personal 
representative Christine Louise Eaton to send particulars of their claims to her care of Clement & Co, 
Lawyers, Unit 2, 12 Sutton Street, Mandurah by the 31 July 2009 after which date the personal 
representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which she then has 
notice. 

CLEMENT & CO as solicitors for the personal representative. 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2509 



ZX403 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Valerie Wilson, late of Unit 4/141 Claremont Crescent, Swanbourne in the State of Western 
Australia, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 13 January 2009 are required by the personal 
representative to send particulars of their claims to him/her care of Clement & Co, Lawyers, Unit 2, 
12 Sutton Street, Mandurah by the 22 July 2009 after which date the personal representative may 
convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which he/she then has notice. 

CLEMENT & CO as solicitors for the personal representative. 
 

——————————— 
 
ZX404 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Keith Livingstone Elder, late of Unit 10, 2 James Street, Shenton Park, Western Australia, Retired 
Technician, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 11 October 2008, are required by the Executor, 
Lance Keith Elder of care of Michael, Whyte & Co, Solicitors, Level 1, 41-43 Ord Street, West Perth, 
Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to him within ONE (1) month from the date of 
publication of this notice, after which date the Executor may convey or distribute the assets, having 
regard only to the claims of which he then has notice. 

MICHAEL, WHYTE & CO. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

 
WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
Loose Leaf Version 
(Including Index) 

 
$64.70 (incl. Amendments Nos. 1 & 2) 

Green Binder is an additional $17.20 if required 
(Plus Postage) 

Available from: 

State Law Publisher 
10 William Street, Perth 

Telephone: 9321 7688 
Fax: 9321 7536 

sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 
Web: www.slp.wa.gov.au 

2510 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 



 

Order your Bound Volumes of 
Government Gazette 2009 

 
An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes

of Government Gazette 
 

For Government Departments and 
private firms who require bound copies 
of Government Gazettes, the State Law 
Publisher offers a subscription covering 
4 Quarterly Volumes at a cost of 
$1,177.20. 

The Gazettes will be bound in black 
cloth with gold foil lettering on the 
spine and can be personalised by the 
addition of the client's name in gold 
lettering on the front cover if required. 
 
PLEASE NOTE 
On the rare occasion where extra 
gazettes are published in one quarter, a 
fifth volume may be required. In this 
instance the extra cost involved will be 
borne by the State Law Publisher and 
not passed on to clients. 

 
 

For further information please contact: 

State Law Publisher 
Telephone: 9321 7688 

23 June 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2511 



 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2009 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2009. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically on any day. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 949.75
  Interstate  ..................................... 966.80

 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,177.20
 
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 456.10
  Interstate ...................................... 543.50
 
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 900.80
  Interstate ................................... 1,101.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 888.25
  Interstate ...................................... 902.00
 

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 320.75 
  Interstate ....................................... 357.15 
  Overseas ........................................ 415.65 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 886.05 
 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA....................................... 345.75 
  Interstate ........................................ 357.15 

 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA ...................................... 475.45 
  Interstate ....................................... 498.20 

 

 

 

 
 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS 
 
For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at 
State Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of 
publication of the missing item. 
 
Claims lodged after this period will not be recognised and will attract 
payment in full. 
 

2512 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2009 


