
 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Betting Control Act 1954—Betting Control Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2009...............  4312 
Casino Control Act 1984— 

Casino Control Amendment Regulations 2009..................................................................  4314 
Casino Control (Burswood Island) (Licensing of Employees) Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2009 ......................................................................................................................  4315 
Gaming and Wagering Commission Act 1987—Gaming and Wagering Commission 

Amendment Regulations 2009...............................................................................................  4316 
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927— 

Hospitals (Licensing and Conduct of Private Hospitals) Amendment Regulations 2009  4306 
Hospitals (Licensing and Conduct of Private Psychiatric Hostels) Amendment 

Regulations 2009 .............................................................................................................  4308 
Local Government Act 1995—Local Government (Cockburn-Ward Boundaries) Order 2009 4310 
Pig, Potato and Poultry Industries (Compensation Legislation) Repeal Act 2004— 

Pig, Potato and Poultry Industries (Compensation Legislation) Repeal Order 2009..........  4321 
Proclamations— 
  Metropolitan Water Supply, Sewerage, and Drainage Act 1909......................................  4305 
  Petroleum Amendment Act 2007—No. 35 of 2007 ............................................................  4305 
Racing Penalties (Appeals) Act 1990—Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment 

Regulations 2009 ....................................................................................................................  4319 
Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003—Racing and Wagering Western 

Australia Amendment Regulations 2009 ..............................................................................  4320 
 

——— 
 

PART 2 
 

Consumer Protection .................................................................................................................  4323 
Corrective Services ....................................................................................................................  4323 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  4339 
Electoral .....................................................................................................................................  4324 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  4326 
Minerals and Petroleum ............................................................................................................  4327 
Planning .....................................................................................................................................  4333 
Public Service.............................................................................................................................  4338 
Racing, Gaming and Liquor ......................................................................................................  4338 
Water/Sewerage .........................................................................................................................  4339 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

!200900195GG! 
 

  4303 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 30 OCTOBER 2009 No. 195 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 



 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9426 0000  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 
 
 
 
 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2009 (Prices include GST). 
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$26.60 

Articles in Public Notices Section—$62.20 minimum charge (except items of an 
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing 
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$12.45 

  Bulk Notices—$227.00 per page 

Clients who have an account will only be invoiced for charges over $50. 

For charges under $50, clients will need to supply credit card details at time of lodging 
notice (i.e. notice under 5cm would not be invoiced). 

Clients without an account will need to supply credit card details or pay at time of 
lodging the notice. 

 

 



— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 
AA101* 

PETROLEUM AMENDMENT ACT 2007 
No. 35 of 2007 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 
By His Excellency 

Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

I, the Governor, acting under the Petroleum Amendment Act 2007 section 2(b) and 
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix the day after the day on 
which this proclamation is published in the Government Gazette as the day on 
which section 99 of that Act comes into operation. 

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 20 October 2009. 
By Command of the Governor, 

N. MOORE, Minister for Mines and Petroleum. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

AA102* 
METROPOLITAN WATER SUPPLY, SEWERAGE, 

AND DRAINAGE ACT 1909 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 
By His Excellency 

Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

I, the Governor, acting under the Metropolitan Water Supply, Sewerage, and 
Drainage Act 1909 section 13 and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, alter the boundaries of the Victoria Reservoir Catchment Area from those 
defined in the proclamation published in the Gazette of 17 August 1923 p. 1524 to 
those— 
 (a) outlined in bold on Plan 3316 held by the Department of Water at its office 

at 168 St Georges Terrace, Perth; and 
 (b) described by Australian Map Grid coordinates annexed to that plan, 
which area is represented for information purposes in the plan in Schedule 1. 

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 20 October 2009. 
By Command of the Governor, 

Dr GRAHAM JOCOBS, Minister for Water. 
 
 

——————————— 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4305 

 



HEALTH 
HE301* 

 
 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Licensing and Conduct of Private 
Hospitals) Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Hospitals (Licensing and Conduct of 
Private Hospitals) Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Hospitals (Licensing and Conduct 
of Private Hospitals) Regulations 1987. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

 (1) In regulation 4(1) delete “of $1 100” and insert: 
 

  calculated in accordance with Schedule 1 item 1 
 

 (2) In regulation 4(3) delete “of $100” and insert: 
 

  calculated in accordance with Schedule 1 item 2 
 

 (3) After regulation 4(5) insert: 
 

 (6) The CEO must issue an applicant for a replacement 
licence with a replacement on payment of the fee set 
out in Schedule 1 item 3, if satisfied that the licence 
has been lost, damaged or destroyed. 

 

4306 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



5. Regulation 5 amended 

  In regulation 5 delete “of $60” and insert: 
 

  calculated in accordance with Schedule 1 item 4 
 

6. Schedule 1 inserted 

  After regulation 10 insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Fees 

Item Description Fee ($) 

1. Grant of licence 
(r. 4(1)) 

Number of persons 
licensed to be 
accommodated —  

Fewer than 25 ...............

25-100 ...........................

101-200 .........................

more than 201 ...............

 
 
 

1 500 

2 000 

3 000 

5 000 

2. Renewal of licence 
(r. 4(3)) 

Number of persons 
licensed to be 
accommodated —  

Fewer than 25 ...............

25-100 ...........................

101-200 .........................

more than 201 ...............

 
 
 

200 

500 

1 000 

1 500 

3. Replacement licence 
(r. 4(6)) 

 300 

4. Approval of premises 
as a private hospital 
(r. 5) 

Number of persons 
licensed to be 
accommodated —  

Fewer than 25 ...............

25-100 ...........................

101-200 .........................

more than 201 ...............

 
 
 

1 500 

2 000 

3 000 

5 000 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4307 

 



HE302* 
 
 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Licensing and Conduct of Private 
Psychiatric Hostels) Amendment 

Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Hospitals (Licensing and Conduct of 
Private Psychiatric Hostels) Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Hospitals (Licensing and Conduct 
of Private Psychiatric Hostels) Regulations 1997. 

4. Regulation 5 amended 

 (1) In regulation 5(1) delete “of $1 100” and insert: 
 

  calculated in accordance with Schedule 1 item 1 
 

 (2) In regulation 5(3) delete “of $100” and insert: 
 

  calculated in accordance with Schedule 1 item 2 
 

 (3) After regulation 5(5) insert: 
 

 (6) The CEO must issue an applicant for a replacement 
licence with a replacement on payment of the fee set 
out in Schedule 1 item 3, if satisfied that the licence 
has been lost, damaged or destroyed. 

4308 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



5. Regulation 6 amended 

  In regulation 6 delete “of $60” and insert: 
 

  calculated in accordance with Schedule 1 item 4 
 

6. Schedule 1 inserted 

  After regulation 18 insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Fees 

Item Description Fee ($) 

1. Grant of licence 
(r. 5(1)) 

Number of persons 
licensed to be 
accommodated —  

Fewer than 25 ...............

25-100 ...........................

101-200 .........................

more than 201 ...............

 
 
 

1 500 

2 000 

3 000 

5 000 

2. Renewal of licence 
(r. 5(3)) 

Number of persons 
licensed to be 
accommodated —  

Fewer than 25 ...............

25-100 ...........................

101-200 .........................

more than 201 ...............

 
 
 

200 

500 

1 000 

1 500 

3. Replacement licence 
(r. 5(6)) 

 300 

4. Approval of premises 
as a private psychiatric 
hostel 
(r. 6) 

Number of persons 
licensed to be 
accommodated —  

Fewer than 25 ...............

25-100 ...........................

101-200 .........................

more than 201 ...............

 
 
 

1 500 

2 000 

3 000 

5 000 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4309 

 



LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG301* 

 
 

Local Government Act 1995 

Local Government (Cockburn - Ward 
Boundaries) Order 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council on the recommendation of 
the Minister for Local Government. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Local Government (Cockburn - Ward 
Boundaries) Order 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  This order comes into operation as follows — 
 (a) clauses 1 and 2 — on the day on which this order is 

published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the order — on the day after that day. 

3. Change of ward boundaries (s. 2.2(1)(c) of the Act) 

 (1) The boundaries of the Central Ward of the district of Cockburn 
are changed by excluding from the area of the ward the 
2 portions of land described in Schedule 1. 

 (2) The boundaries of the East Ward of the district of Cockburn are 
changed by including in the area of the ward the 2 portions of 
land described in Schedule 1. 

 
Schedule 1 — Land to be excluded from the Central Ward 

and included in the East Ward 
[cl. 3] 

Portion 1 

All that portion of land bounded by lines starting from the intersection of the 
centreline of North Lake Road with the prolongation northeasterly of the 
northernmost northwestern side of Tamara Drive, a point on a present 
northeastern boundary of the Central Ward of the City of Cockburn and 
extending southwesterly to and along that side to the northernmost northeastern 
corner of Lot 8001 (Reserve 49078) as shown on Deposited Plan 52692; thence 

4310 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



southwesterly, generally southeasterly, generally southwesterly and southerly 
along boundaries of that lot to its southern corner; thence southerly along the 
western side of Tamara Drive and onwards to the centreline of Yangebup Road; 
thence easterly along that centreline to the prolongation northerly of the western 
boundary of Lot 803 as shown on Deposited Plan 44876; thence southerly to 
and along that boundary and southerly along the western boundary of the 
northwestern severance of Lot 55 as shown on Plan 21688 and onwards to the 
centreline of Beeliar Drive; thence southeasterly along that centreline to the 
prolongation northerly of the eastern boundary of Lot 801 as shown on 
Deposited Plan 44876; thence southerly to and southerly and generally 
southeasterly along boundaries of that lot to the westernmost northwestern 
corner of Lot 502 as shown on Diagram 97689; thence southerly and easterly 
along the western and southern boundaries of that lot and easterly along the 
northern boundary of the northern severance of Lot 2256 (Reserve 15556) as 
shown on Deposited Plan 202611 and onwards to the prolongation northerly of 
the centreline of Wonnil Close, a point on a present southern boundary of the 
Central Ward of the City of Cockburn and thence easterly, generally northerly, 
northwesterly, northerly, northeasterly and generally northwesterly along 
boundaries of that ward to the starting point. 

Area: approx. 57 hectares 

Portion 2 

All that portion of land bounded by lines starting from the southwestern corner 
of Lot 80 as shown on Plan 8190 (sheet 2), a point on a present southern 
boundary of the City of Cockburn and extending northerly along the western 
boundary of that lot and onwards to a northern side of Wattleup Road; thence 
westerly along that side and northerly along the western boundary of Lot 71 to a 
southern boundary of Lot 300 (Class ‘A’ Reserve 29241) as shown on 
Deposited Plan 52083; thence generally easterly along the southern boundaries 
of that lot to a western side of Frankland Avenue, a point on a present northern 
boundary of the Central Ward of the City of Cockburn; thence easterly, 
southeasterly and southerly along boundaries of that ward to the southeastern 
corner of Lot 2022 (Reserve 27057) as shown on Diagram 27846, a point on a 
present southern boundary of the City of Cockburn and thence generally 
westerly along boundaries of that city to the starting point. 

Area: approx. 135 hectares 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

 
——————————— 

 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4311 

 



RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 
RG301* 

Betting Control Act 1954 

Betting Control Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Betting Control Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2010. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Betting Control Regulations 1978. 

4. Regulation 17 amended 

 (1) In regulation 17(1): 
 (a) in paragraph (ab) delete “$60;” and insert: 

 
  $65; 

 
 (b) in paragraph (ac) delete “$300;” and insert: 

 
  $310; 

 
 (c) in paragraph (a) delete “$595;” and insert: 

 
  $620; 

 
 (d) in paragraph (b) delete “$25;” and insert: 

 
  $30; 

4312 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



 (e) in paragraph (ba) delete “$145;” and insert: 
 

  $150; 
 

 (f) in paragraph (c) delete “$140;” and insert: 
 

  $145; 
 

 (g) in paragraph (e) delete “$25;” and insert: 
 

  $30; 
 

 (h) in paragraph (f) delete “$550.” and insert: 
 

  $575. 
 

 (2) In regulation 17(2) delete “$90.” and insert: 
 

  $95. 
 

 (3) In regulation 17(3) delete “$90.” and insert: 
 

  $95. 
 

5. Regulation 17A amended 

  In regulation 17A(1): 
 (a) in paragraph (a)(i) delete “$315;” and insert: 

 
  $340; 

 
 (b) in paragraph (a)(ii) delete “$635;” and insert: 

 
  $685; 

 
 (c) in paragraph (a)(iii) delete “$955;” and insert: 

 
  $1 030; 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4313 

 



RG302* 
 
 

Casino Control Act 1984 

Casino Control Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Casino Control Amendment 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2010. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Casino Control Regulations 1999. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  In regulation 4 delete “$125.” and insert: 
 

  $135. 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

4314 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



RG303* 
 
 

Casino Control Act 1984 

Casino Control (Burswood Island) (Licensing of 
Employees) Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Casino Control (Burswood Island) 
(Licensing of Employees) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2010. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Casino Control (Burswood Island) 
(Licensing of Employees) Regulations 1985. 

4. Regulation 6 amended 

 (1) In regulation 6(1): 
 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$380; and” and insert: 

 
  $400; and 

 
 (b) in paragraph (b) delete “$240.” and insert: 

 
  $250. 

 

 (2) In regulation 6(1a): 
 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$105; and” and insert: 

 
  $110; and 

 
 (b) in paragraph (b) delete “$105.” and insert: 

 
  $110. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4315 

 



 (3) In regulation 6(2)(a) delete “$275;” and insert: 
 

  $290; 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 
RG304* 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Act 1987 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Gaming and Wagering Commission 
Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2010. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Gaming and Wagering 
Commission Regulations 1988. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  Delete regulation 4(1) and insert: 
 

 (1) The fees specified in Schedule 1 are payable for the 
matters listed in that Schedule. 

4316 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



5. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Prescribed fees 
[r. 4] 

Item Description Fee 
$ 

1. Search of the register for an identified entry ...... 7.50 

2. Copy of extract from register ............................. 14 

3. Application for a function permit for —  

 (a) an item of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(a)) ..............................................

 
30 

 (b) a class of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(b)) ..............................................

 
55 

4. Application for a permit of a continuing 
nature for —  

 

 (a) a video lottery terminal (r. 18AA(7)) ......... 30 

 (b) an item of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(a)) ..............................................

 
55 

 (c) a class of gaming equipment 
(r. 18B(2)(b)) ..............................................

 
105 

5. Application for a function permit for —  

 (a) bingo ........................................................... 20 

 (b) multiple bingo, for each premises .............. 20 

 (c) simultaneous bingo, for each premises ....... 20 

 (d) a standard lottery —   

  (i) where the total retail value of 
prizes or prize money does not 
exceed $5 000 .....................................

 
 

30 

  (ii) otherwise ............................................. 70 

 (da) a standard lottery of a kind generally 
known or described as a Calcutta ...............

 
70 

 (e) a continuing lottery ................................... 15 

 (f) gaming (per day authorised) —   

  (i) 1-5 tables ............................................ 195 

  (ii) 6-10 tables .......................................... 320 

  (iii) over 10 tables ...................................... 390 

 (g) two-up —   

  (i) by a country race club ......................... 135 

  (ii) otherwise ............................................. 195 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4317 

 



Item Description Fee 
$ 

6. Application for a permit of a continuing 
nature for —  

 

 (a) bingo ........................................................... 30 

 (b) multiple bingo, for each premises ............... 30 

 (c) simultaneous bingo, for each premises ....... 30 

 (d) a standard lottery, where the total retail 
value of prizes or prize money is —  

 

  (i) not more than $5 000 .......................... 45 

  (ii) more than $5 000 but not more 
than $50 000 ........................................

 
100 

  (iii) more than $50 000 but not more 
than $100 000 ......................................

 
190 

  (iv) more than $100 000 but not more 
than $200 000 ......................................

 
390 

  (v) more than $200 000 ............................ 650 

 (da) a standard lottery of a kind generally 
known or described as a Calcutta ...............

 
135 

 (e) a continuing lottery ..................................... 25 

 (f) gaming (per day authorised) —   

  (i) 1-5 tables ............................................. 160 

  (ii) 6-10 tables ........................................ 290 

  (iii) over 10 tables ...................................... 355 

 (g) two-up —   

  (i) by a country race club, per day 
authorised ............................................

 
105 

  (ii) otherwise, per day authorised ............. 160 

7. Application for approval of premises for —  

 (a) a specific function ....................................... 20 

 (b) functions from time to time ........................ 70 

 (c) permit of a continuing nature ...................... 70 

8. Issue of a certificate under section 92 relating 
to —  

 

 (a) multiple bingo ............................................. 135 

 (b) simultaneous bingo ..................................... 135 

 (c) assisting in the conduct of bingo, for hire 
or reward .....................................................

 
135 

9. Issue of an approved operator’s certificate ......... 215 

10. Issue of a certificate under section 88(5) ............ 280 

11. Application to be a licensed supplier ................. 260 

4318 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



Item Description Fee 
$ 

12. Approval to operate, or remove money from, 
gaming equipment ..............................................

 
25 

 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
RG305* 

 
Racing Penalties (Appeals) Act 1990 

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Racing Penalties (Appeals) 
Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2010. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Racing Penalties (Appeals) 
Regulations 1991. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

 (1) In regulation 4(1): 
 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$125; and” and insert: 

 
  $135; and 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4319 

 



 (b) in paragraph (b) delete “$310.” and insert: 
 

  $320. 
 

 (2) In regulation 4(2): 
 (a) in paragraph (a)(i) delete “$125; and” and insert: 

 
  $135; and 

 
 (b) in paragraph (a)(ii) delete “$310;” and insert: 

 
  $320; 

 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
RG306* 

 
Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003 

Racing and Wagering Western Australia 
Amendment Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Racing and Wagering Western 
Australia Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2010. 

4320 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Racing and Wagering Western 
Australia Regulations 2003. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 1 item 1 delete “380” and insert: 
 

  400 
 

 (2) In Schedule 1 item 2 delete “105” and insert: 
 

  110 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

TREASURY AND FINANCE 
TF301* 

 
 

Pig, Potato and Poultry Industries (Compensation Legislation) Repeal 
Act 2004 

Pig, Potato and Poultry Industries 
(Compensation Legislation) Repeal Order 2009 

Made by the Treasurer under section 19 of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This is the Pig, Potato and Poultry Industries (Compensation 
Legislation) Repeal Order 2009. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4321 

 



2. State of accounts 

  The Treasurer is satisfied that there is —  
 (a) no money in any former account under the Act; and 
 (b) no money to be paid into the Agricultural Produce 

Commission Account under the Act. 
 
 Treasurer 
 Note: Under the Pig, Potato and Poultry Industries (Compensation 

Legislation) Act 2004 section 19, that Act is repealed on publication of 
this Order in the Gazette. 

 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

4322 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



— PART 2 — 

CONSUMER PROTECTION 
CE401* 

ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 
REINSTATED ASSOCIATION 

Wanneroo Flag Marshal Association Incorporated 
Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named association has been re-instated 
pursuant to Section 35(4) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987. 
Dated: 23 October 2009. 

SUSAN NULSEN, Director, Business Services 
for Commissioner of Consumer Protection. 

 
——————————— 

 
CE402* 

ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 
REINSTATED ASSOCIATION 

Stock Feed Manufacturers’ Association of Western Australia Incorporated—A1006135T 
Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named association has been re-instated 
pursuant to Section 35(4) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987. 
Dated: 23 October 2009. 

SUSAN NULSEN, Director, Business Services 
for Commissioner of Consumer Protection. 

 
——————————— 

 
CE403* 

ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 
REINSTATED ASSOCIATION 

Ellenbrook Toy Library Centre Inc—A1010137N 
Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named association has been re-instated 
pursuant to Section 35(4) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987. 
Dated: 23 October 2009. 

SUSAN NULSEN, Director, Business Services 
for Commissioner of Consumer Protection. 

CORRECTIVE SERVICES 
CS401* 

COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999 
PERMIT DETAILS 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 51 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Commissioner of the Department of Corrective Services has issued the following persons with Permits 
to do High-Level Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit
Issued 

Permit 
Commence Date 

Permit 
Expiry Date

Kazancik Hatice CS10-496 22/10/2009 22/10/2009 30/07/2011 
This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, CSCS Contract Manager. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4323 

 



Pursuant to the provisions of section 56 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Commissioner of the Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permits to do High-
Level Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Revoked 

Cakir Hatice CS9-188 22/10/2009 

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999. 
BRIAN LAWRENCE, CSCS Contract Manager. 

ELECTORAL 
EC401* 

ELECTORAL ACT 1907 
DISTRICT OF WILLAGEE BY-ELECTION 

Appointment of Returning Officer 
In accordance with sections 6 and 9 of the Electoral Act 1907, I have appointed the following person as 
Returning Officer for the by-election for the district of Willagee. 

WARWICK GATELY AM, Electoral Commissioner. 
Shaun Major 
Tel: 9421 5443 or mobile 0434 308 367 

Appointment of Place of Declaration of Nominations 
In accordance with section 85 (1) of the Electoral Act 1907, I hereby appoint the following premises as 
the Place of Declaration of Nominations for the by-election for the district of Willagee. 

WARWICK GATELY AM, Electoral Commissioner. 
Willagee Community Centre 
Corner of Archibald & Winnacott Streets, 
WILLAGEE WA  6156  

Appointment of Polling Places 
In accordance with section 100 (1) of the Electoral Act 1907, I hereby appoint the polling places listed 
below for the by-election for the district of Willagee.  
Any previous appointment in respect to polling places for the districts and regions in the schedule is 
hereby cancelled and the corresponding polling places abolished. 

DISTRICT OF WILLAGEE 
COOLBELLUP 

Coolbellup Community School 
15 Waverley Road 

HAMILTON HILL 
East Hamilton Hill Primary School 

27 Bradbury Road 
Phoenix Primary School 

28 Phoenix Road 
Southwell Primary School 

26 Grandpre Crescent 
HILTON 

Hilton Primary School 
21 Rennie Crescent North 

KARDINYA 
North Lake Senior Campus 

188 Winterfold Road 
MELVILLE 

Anglican Church of The Holy Cross Hall 
56 McLean Street 

Melville Senior High School 
18 Potts Street 

4324 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



PALMYRA 
Palmyra Primary School 

60 McKimmie Road 
SAMSON 

Samson Primary School 
22 Lawrence Way 

WILLAGEE 
Caralee Community School 

24 Winnacott Street 
Southern Districts Senior Citizens Centre 

Corner North Lake Road and Archibald street 
Southern Districts Senior Citizens Centre (Drive-in) 

Corner North Lake Road and Archibald Street 
WARWICK GATELY AM, Electoral Commissioner. 

Declaration of Special Institutions and Hospitals 
Pursuant to section 100 (1) of the Electoral Act 1907, I hereby declare each of the institutions and 
hospitals set out below in the electoral district of Willagee to be a special institution or hospital or 
both for the purpose of the Electoral Act 1907. 
DISTRICT OF WILLAGEE 
COOLBELLUP  

Hale Hostel—Amana Living 
37 Waverley Road 

HAMILTON HILL  
Bethanie Illawong Village Hostel 

1 Rodd Place 
Carrington Aged Care 

27 Ivermey Street 
HILTON  

John Mercer Lodge 
19 Laidlaw Street 

Foley Village 
84 Collick Street 

MELVILLE  
St Ives Eldercare Village 

15 Cotrill Street 
MYAREE  

Myaree Gardens 
444 Marmion Street 

WARWICK GATELY AM, Electoral Commissioner. 

Declaration of Boundaries of a Polling Area 
For the purpose of section 193 (1) of the Electoral Act 1907, I hereby declare and fix the boundaries of 
the polling area for each and every polling place appointed by the notice published in this Government 
Gazette to be the area outside the polling place within a 100 metre radius from every entrance to the 
polling place. 
In accordance with section 193 (1), on polling day or on a day to which polling is adjourned, a person 
shall not in a polling place or such a polling area, collect, canvass for, solicit or invite signatures or 
comments for the purpose of any petition, opinion poll or survey, or display or distribute any 
information for such a purpose. 

WARWICK GATELY AM, Electoral Commissioner. 
Registered Political Parties 
I hereby give notice in accordance with section 62M (2) of the Electoral Act 1907, that the political 
parties and secretaries of the political parties listed below are included in the register. 

WARWICK GATELY AM, Electoral Commissioner. 
Party Name Secretary 
Australian Labor Party (Western Australian Branch) Mr Simon Mead  
Christian Democratic Party WA  Ms Madeleine Goiran  
Citizens Electoral Council of Australia  Ms Jean Robinson  
WAFAMILYFIRST.COM INCORPORATED  Mrs Beverley Custers  
National Party of Australia (WA) Incorporated  Mr Colin Holt  
The Greens (WA) Inc  Ms Tea Breannan 
The Liberal Party of Australia (Western Australian Division) Incorporated Mr Ben Morton 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4325 

 



LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG401* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
Shire of Collie 

BASIS OF RATES 
Department of Local Government. 

DLGRD: CO5-4#02 
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the 
Local Government Act 1995, the Director General of the Department of Local Government, under 
delegation from the Hon John Castrilli MLA, Minister for Local Government, being charged for the 
time being with the administration of the Local Government Act 1995, has determined that the 
method of valuing the land described in the Schedule hereunder shall be gross rental value for the 
purposes of rating with effect from 1 July 2009. 

JENNIFER MATHEWS  Director General. 
———— 

 
Schedule 

ADDITIONS TO GROSS RENTAL VALUE AREA 
SHIRE OF COLLIE 

All that portion of land being Lot 3001 as shown on Deposited Plan 51101; Lot 101 as shown on 
Deposited Plan 61201; Lot 1293 as shown on Deposited Plan 106783; Lot 5341 as shown on Deposited 
Plan 184335 and Lot 5192 as shown on Deposited Plan 213624; 
 

——————————— 
 
LG402* 

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 
Shire of Cunderdin 

FIRE CONTROL OFFICERS 
Appointment of Authorised Persons 

In accordance with the Bush Fires Act 1976 as amended, the following persons are hereby appointed 
as authorised Fire Control Officers and Fire Weather Officers as described for the Shire of 
Cunderdin— 

Chief Bush Fire Officer Todd Harris 
Deputy Chief Fire Officer Doug Kelly 
Chief Weather Officer Gary Tuffin 
Deputy Weather Officer Loren Hempel 
Liaison Officer Dennis Whisson 
Cunderdin Bush Fire Brigade— 
  Captain A. Whisson 
  Deputy Captain D. Fulwood 
  Secretary/Treasurer R. Rogers 
  1st Lieutenant S. Mussared 
  2nd Lieutenant A. Teakle 
Area Control Officers (South West) R. Carter & R. Woodley 
Area Control Officers (South East) M. Jasper & T. Jasper 
Area Control Officers (North West) R. Fulwood, B. Williams & D. Beard  
Area Control Officers (North East) T. Harris & N. Jenzen 
Area Control Officers (Central West) D. Jasper & M. Fulwood 
Area Control Officers (Central East) J/P. Jasper & S. Mussared 
Meckering Bush Fires Brigade— 
  Captain Ashley Burges 
  Secretary David Fisher 
  1st Lieutenant Neville Burges 
  2nd Lieutenant Neil Foot 
Area Control Officers (South) C. Pearse, D. Kelly, V. Elliot & D. Reynolds 
Area Control Officers (North) N. Burges, T. Elliot & P. Hitchcock 
Area Control Officers (Central) N. Foot & W. Reynolds 

4326 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



Ygnattering Bush Fires Brigade— 
  Captain Digby Willmott 
  Sec/Treasurer Glen Beard 
Dual FCO—Shire of Tammin 
Hayden Dixon 
Shane Mackin 
Tim York 
Ray Reid  

All previous appointments are hereby revoked. 
GARY TUFFIN, Chief Executive Officer. 

Dated: 15 October 2009. 
 

——————————— 
 
LG403* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
Shire of Carnamah 

APPOINTMENT 
It is hereby notified for public information that Mr William Thomas Atkinson has been appointed 
Chief Executive Officer of the Shire of Carnamah from Monday the 12th October 2009. 

M. ISBISTER, President. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 
MP101* 

CORRECTION 
Commonwealth of Australia 

OFFSHORE PETROLEUM AND GREENHOUSE GAS STORAGE ACT 2006 
GRANT OF PRODUCTION LICENCE WA-36-L 

Production Licence WA-36-L has been granted to Chevron (TAPL) Pty Ltd, Chevron Australia Pty 
Ltd, Mobil Australia Resources Company Pty Limited and Shell Development (Australia) Proprietary 
Limited to have effect from and including 14 September 2009. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Executive Director, 
Petroleum and Environment Division. 

 
——————————— 

 
MP401* 

Commonwealth of Australia 
OFFSHORE PETROLEUM AND GREENHOUSE GAS STORAGE ACT 2006 

GRANT OF PRODUCTION LICENCE WA-37-L 
Production Licence WA-37-L has been granted to Chevron (TAPL) Pty Ltd, Chevron Australia Pty 
Ltd, Mobil Australia Resources Company Pty Limited and Shell Development (Australia) Proprietary 
Limited to have effect from and including 14 September 2009. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Executive Director, 
Petroleum and Environment Division. 

 
——————————— 

 
MP402* 

Commonwealth of Australia 
OFFSHORE PETROLEUM AND GREENHOUSE GAS STORAGE ACT 2006 

GRANT OF PRODUCTION LICENCE WA-38-L 
Production Licence WA-38-L has been granted to Chevron (TAPL) Pty Ltd, Chevron Australia Pty 
Ltd, Mobil Australia Resources Company Pty Limited and Shell Development (Australia) Proprietary 
Limited to have effect from and including 14 September 2009. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Executive Director, 
Petroleum and Environment Division. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4327 

 



MP403* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

OFFSHORE PETROLEUM AND GREENHOUSE GAS STORAGE ACT 2006 
GRANT OF PRODUCTION LICENCE WA-39-L 

Production Licence WA-39-L has been granted to BP Exploration (Alpha) Ltd, Chevron (TAPL) Pty 
Ltd, Chevron Australia Pty Ltd, Mobil Australia Resources Company Pty Limited and Shell 
Development (Australia) Proprietary Limited to have effect from and including 14 September 2009. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Executive Director, 
Petroleum and Environment Division. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 
MP404* 

Commonwealth of Australia 
OFFSHORE PETROLEUM AND GREENHOUSE GAS STORAGE ACT 2006 

GRANT OF PRODUCTION LICENCE WA-40-L 
Production Licence WA-40-L has been granted to BP Exploration (Alpha) Ltd, Chevron (TAPL) Pty 
Ltd, Chevron Australia Pty Ltd, Mobil Australia Resources Company Pty Limited and Shell 
Development (Australia) Proprietary Limited to have effect from and including 14 September 2009. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Executive Director, 
Petroleum and Environment Division. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 
MP405* 

PETROLEUM AND GEOTHERMAL ENERGY RESOURCES ACT 1967 
RENEWAL OF EXPLORATION PERMIT EP368 (R3) 

Renewal of Exploration Permit EP 368 (R3) has been granted to Westranch Holdings Pty Ltd to have 
effect from and including 10 September 2009 for a period of five years. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Executive Director, 
Petroleum and Royalties Division. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 
MP406* 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines and Petroleum, 
Leonora. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act, 
1978 for failure to lodge a report within the prescribed period. 

T. WATT, Warden. 
———— 

To be heard by the Warden at Leonora on 25 November 2009. 
MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 

Mount Malcolm District 
Prospecting Licence 

P37/6571 Hunter, Brian James 
 Johnston, Lionel Gordon 
 Johannessen, Evie 
P37/6572 Hunter, Brian James 
 Johnston, Lionel Gordon 
 Johannessen, Evie 

4328 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Morgans District 

Prospecting Licences 
P39/4869 Crew, Christopher 
 Crew, Ross Frederick 
 McKnight, Russell Geoffrey 
P39/4870 Crew, Christopher 
 Crew, Ross Frederick 
 McKnight, Russell Geoffrey 
P39/4919 Crew, Christopher 
 Crew, Ross Frederick 
 McKnight, Russell Geoffrey 
 
 

——————————— 
 
MP407* 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines and Petroleum, 
Leonora. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act, 
1978 for non-payment of rent. 

T. WATT, Warden. 
———— 

 
To be heard by the Warden in Leonora on 25 November 2009. 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Morgans District 

Prospecting Licences 
P39/4313 Harrison, Robert Adam 
P39/4314 Harrison, Robert Adam 
P39/4315 Harrison, Robert Adam 
P39/4491 Eliyahu, Amit 
 Harlap, Nahum 
 
 

——————————— 
 

MP408* 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Mines and Petroleum, 

Leonora. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act, 
1978 for failure to comply with the prescribed expenditure conditions. 

T. WATT, Warden. 
———— 

 
To be heard by the Warden at Leonora on 25 November 2009. 

EAST MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD 
Lawlers District 

Prospecting Licence 
P36/1546 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1547 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1548 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1549 Traynor Pty Ltd 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4329 

 



P36/1550 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1551 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1552 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1553 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1554 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1555 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1556 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1557 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1560 Traynor Pty Ltd 
P36/1561 Traynor Pty Ltd 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Malcolm District 

Prospecting Licence 
P37/6999 Dixon, Trevor John 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
MP409* 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines and Petroleum, 
Meekatharra WA 6642. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act, 
1978 for non payment of rent. 

S. RICHARDSON, Warden. 
———— 

 
To be heard by the Warden at Meekatharra on 25 November 2009. 

MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD 
Prospecting Licences 

51/2390 Bond, Stuart Robert Leonard 
Bond, Ward Douglas Michael 

 
EAST MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD 

Prospecting Licences 
53/1143 Goldstar Resources (WA) Pty Ltd 

Murchison Resources Pty Ltd 
53/1144 Goldstar Resources (WA) Pty Ltd 

Murchison Resources Pty Ltd 
53/1367 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1368 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1404 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1470 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1471 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1472 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1473 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1474 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1475 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1476 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1477 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1478 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1479 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1480 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1481 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1482 Brewer, Gerard Victor 

4330 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



MP410* 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Mines and Petroleum, 

Meekatharra WA 6642 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act, 
1978 for non-lodgement of the Operations Report Form 5 within the prescribed period. 

S. RICHARDSON, Warden. 

———— 
 
To be heard by the Warden at Meekatharra on 25 November 2009. 

MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD 
Prospecting Licences 

51/2531 Oriental Minerals Inc 
51/2532 Oriental Minerals Inc 
51/2545 Bapaume Pty Ltd 
51/2550 Yellow River Gold Pty Ltd 

PEAK HILL MINERAL FIELD 
Prospecting Licences 

52/1120 Aurox Resources Ltd 
52/1248 Legendre, Bruce Robert 

Woods, Stephen James 
EAST MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD 

Prospecting Licences 
53/1367 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1368 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1404 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1470 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1471 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1472 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1473 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1474 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1475 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1476 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1477 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1478 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1479 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1480 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1481 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
53/1482 Brewer, Gerard Victor 
 
 

——————————— 
 
MP411* 

MINING ACT 1978 
FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines and Petroleum, 
East Perth WA 6004. 

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of section 96A(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned mining tenement is forfeited for the non-lodgement of the annual Operations Report 
(Form 5). 

NORMAN MOORE MLC, Minister for Mines and Petroleum. 

———— 
Number Holder Mineral Field 

Exploration Licence 
52/2033 Bonaparte Diamond Mines NL Peak Hill 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4331 

 



MP412* 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Mines and Petroleum, 

Kalgoorlie WA 6430. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Act 1978 notice is hereby given that the 
Prospecting Licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) for breach of 
covenant, viz. non payment of rent. 

G. BENN, Warden. 
———— 

To be heard in the Warden’s Court, Kalgoorlie on the 27th November, 2009. 
NORTH COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 

28/1145 Dalla-Costa, Melville Raymond 
 

——————————— 
 
MP413* 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines and Petroleum, 
Kalgoorlie WA 6430. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following Prospecting Licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the 
Mining Act 1978 for breach of covenant, viz non-compliance with the expenditure condition &/or non-
compliance with the reporting requirement. 

G. BENN, Warden. 
———— 

To be heard by the Warden at Kalgoorlie on the 27th November, 2009. 
BROAD ARROW MINERAL FIELD 

24/3706 Biddle, Kim David 
24/4227 O’Loughlin, Basil Robert 
24/4239 Great Southern Mines NL 
24/4240 Great Southern Mines NL 
24/4241 Great Southern Mines NL 
24/4242 Great Southern Mines NL 

NORTH EAST COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 
26/3580 Black Mountain Gold Ltd 
26/3582 Black Mountain Gold Ltd 
26/3583 Black Mountain Gold Ltd 
26/3584 Black Mountain Gold Ltd 
26/3585 Black Mountain Gold Ltd 
26/3586 Black Mountain Gold Ltd 
26/3588 Black Mountain Gold Ltd 
27/1274 Kelsi Chemicals Pty Ltd 
27/1275 Kelsi Chemicals Pty Ltd 
27/1277 Kelsi Chemicals Pty Ltd 
27/1278 Kelsi Chemicals Pty Ltd 
27/1279 Kelsi Chemicals Pty Ltd 
27/1280 Kelsi Chemicals Pty Ltd 
27/1285 Kelsi Chemicals Pty Ltd 
27/1288 Kelsi Chemicals Pty Ltd 
27/1294 Kelsi Chemicals Pty Ltd 
27/1615 Carrick Gold Ltd 
27/1616 Carrick Gold Ltd 
27/1617 Carrick Gold Ltd 
27/1618 Carrick Gold Ltd 
27/1681 Carrick Gold Ltd 

NORTH COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 
28/1145 Dalla-Costa, Melville Raymond 
29/2035 Duffy, Michael 
31/1760 Avoca Resources Ltd 

4332 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



MP414* 
MINING ACT 1978 

INTENTION TO FORFEIT 
Department Mines and Petroleum, 

Perth WA 6000. 
In accordance with Regulation 50(b) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that 
unless the rent due on the under mentioned licences and leases is paid on or before 20 November 2009 
it is the intention of the Minister for Mines and Petroleum under the provisions of sections 96A(1) and 
97(1) of the Mining Act, 1978 to forfeit such for breach covenant, being non-payment of rent. 

Director General. 
———— 

Number Holder Minerald Field 
Exploration Licence 

04/1590 Starwolf Resources Pty Ltd West Kimberley 
08/1736 Glass Mountain Pty Ltd Ashburton 
29/636 Dalla-Costa, Melville Raymond North Coolgardie 
74/308 Adelaide Prospecting Pty Ltd Phillips River 
80/3862 Elliss, Michael Jeremy Kimberley 

Mining Lease 
04/83 Sim, Colin West Kimberley 
04/84 Sim, Colin West Kimberley 
04/85 Sim, Colin West Kimberley 
04/86 Sim, Colin West Kimberley 
04/87 Sim, Colin West Kimberley 
04/88 Sim, Colin West Kimberley 
04/89 Sim, Colin West Kimberley 
04/90 Sim, Colin West Kimberley 
39/613 McWilliam, Gordon John 

McWilliam, Gary Alexander 
Mt Margaret 

40/274 Anvil Mining NL North Coolgardie 
40/275 Anvil Mining NL North Coolgardie 
 

PLANNING 
PI401* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME MINOR AMENDMENT 1168/57 

Matilda Bay Brewery Precinct 
Approved Amendment 

File: 833-2-5-37 
The Minister for Planning has approved, as advertised, the abovementioned amendment to the 
Metropolitan Region Scheme. The amendment is shown on Western Australian Planning Commission 
plan number 3.2301 and is effective from the date of publication of this notice in the Government 
Gazette. 
Copies of the amendment and the accompanying report on submissions are available for public 
inspection from Friday, 30 October 2009 to Friday, 27 November 2009 at the following locations— 
 • Western Australian Planning Commission, Wellington Street, Perth 
 • J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 
 • Municipal offices of the City of Fremantle 
 • Municipal offices of the Town of Mosman Park 
Documents are also available from the Planning WA website www.planning.wa.gov.au. 

TONY EVANS, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4333 

 



PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Bunbury 

Town Planning Scheme No. 7—Amendment No. 34 
Ref: 853/6/2/11 Pt34 & TPS/0022/1 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the City of Bunbury local planning 
scheme amendment on 14 October 2009 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning portion of Lot 100 Wimbridge Road, Picton from “Primary Distributor Road” to 

“Industry” and “Development Zone—Industrial”. 
 2. Rezoning portion of Lot 7 & Lot 8 Wimbridge, Picton from “Primary Distributor Road” and 

“Rural” to “Development Zone—Industry”.  
 3. Rezoning portion of Lot 9 Wimbridge Road, Picton from “Primary Distributor Road” to 

“Development Zone—Industrial”.  
 4. Rezoning portion of Lot 102 Wimbridge Road, Picton from “Primary Distributor Road” to 

“Rural”.  
 5. Rezoning portion of Lot 103 Wimbridge Road, Picton from “Primary Distributor Road” to 

“Rural”. 
 6. Rezoning portion of Lot 151 Wimbridge Road, Picton from “Primary Distributor Road” to 

“Industry”. 
 7. Rezoning portion of Wimbridge Road reserve from “Primary Distributor Road” to “Access 

Road Reserve”. 
D. L. SMITH, Mayor. 

G. TREVASKIS, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
PI403* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

Shire of Denmark 
Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 89 

Ref: 853/5/7/3 Pt 89 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Denmark local planning 
scheme amendment on 14 October 2009 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lots 999 and 106 McLean Road/Kearsley Road, Denmark from ‘Rural Zone’ to 

‘Special Residential Zone’. 
 2. Introducing Special Residential Zone No. 12—McLean Road Special Residential in Appendix 

XIV to provide planning controls to guide land use and developments for Lots 999 and 106 
McLean Road.  

Provisions relating to specified area— 
Particulars 
of the Land Proposed Uses Special Provisions 

Lot 999 
Kearsley 
Road, 
Denmark and 
lot 106 
McLean Road, 
Denmark 

Residential  
Permitted Use (P)—
Single House. 
Permitted at Council’s 
Discretion (AA)— 
Home Occupation 

(i) Lot Sizes 
 (a) For lot 371 Horsley Road, lot 999 

Kearsley Road and lot 106 McLean 
Road the minimum lot size shall be 
no less than 2000m2. 

 (b) Subdivision shall generally be in 
accordance with the Subdivision 
Guide Plans endorsed by the WAPC 
and signed by the CEO, for lot 369 
Kearsley Road, lot 371 Horsley 
Road, lot 999 Kearsley Road and lot 
106 McLean Road. The WAPC may 
consider minor variations to the 
Subdivision Guide Plan, however 
the further breakdown of lots shall 
be contrary to the Scheme. 

4334 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



Particulars 
of the Land Proposed Uses Special Provisions 

  (ii) Boundary Setback Distances 
   (a) All buildings shall be set back a 

minimum of— 
   — 10m from the front boundary 
   — 8m from the rear boundary 
   — 6m from all other boundaries 

   (b) Notwithstanding (a) above, Council 
may approve a reduction to the 
nominated ‘rear boundary’ and ‘all 
other boundaries’ setback, to a 
minimum of 5m each, where it is of 
the opinion that the topography or 
shape of the lot, or remnant 
vegetation on it, makes it desirable 
to alter the setback and that the 
location of the building will not 
detract from the amenity of the area 
of existing or future dwellings on 
surrounding lots. 

On the lots allocated ‘Development 
Envelopes’ (1000m2) on the Subdivision 
Guide Plan, dwellings shall be confined 
to the Development Envelopes unless 
otherwise approved by Council.  

  (iii) Bush Fire Management 
  (a) Council may request the Commission to 

impose a condition at the time of 
subdivision requiring the preparation 
and implementation of a Bushfire 
Management Plan in accordance with 
Planning For Bushfire Protection 
Guidelines for lot 999 Kearsley Road and 
lot 106 McLean Road. 

(b) Council may request the Commission to 
impose a condition at the time of 
subdivision for the provision of Strategic 
Fire Breaks and other fire safety 
facilities. Such facilities shall be 
provided to the satisfaction of Council 
and the Fire & Emergency Services 
Authority and in accordance with the 
Fire Management Plan. 

(c) Council shall require that individual 
landowners are responsible for the 
maintenance of any strategic firebreaks 
crossing individual lots. 

(d) The clearing of firebreaks other than for 
strategic firebreak purposes will not be 
permitted unless for safety reasons to 
comply with Council and Fire & 
Emergency Services Authority 
requirements. 

(e) Low Fuel Areas a minimum of 20m wide 
shall be provided and maintained around 
all buildings. 

(f) Council may request the Commission to 
impose a condition at the time of 
subdivision for the provision of fire 
hydrants at intervals of 200 metres 
along subdivisional water mains. 

  (iv) Vegetation Protection and Control 
  (a) No clearing of remnant vegetation shall 

occur except for— 
— clearing to comply with the 

requirements of the Bush Fires Act 
(as amended) 

— clearing may reasonably be 
required to construct an approved 
building and curtilage 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4335 

 



Particulars 
of the Land Proposed Uses Special Provisions 

  — clearing trees that present an 
imminent danger to human health 

— clearing to establish a low fuel 
buffer 

— clearing to gain vehicular access to 
an approved dwelling or any other 
clearing which may be approved by 
the Council 

— that which is prescribed in the 
Environmental Protection 
Regulations 2004 

— strategic fire breaks or hazard 
separation zones 

(b) Council may request the Commission to 
impose a condition at the time of the 
subdivision for the preparation and 
implementation of a public open space 
and tree planting strategy. Such strategy 
shall use local native tree and shrub 
species. Trees only should be used in 
road reserves. 

  (v) Building Materials, Colours and Heights 
 (a) All buildings constructed within the 

zone shall be sympathetic to existing 
landscape elements (landform and 
vegetation) in terms of their 
location, scale, height, materials and 
colour. 

  (vi) Fencing 
 (a)  No boundary fencing shall be 

constructed of fibre cement or metal 
sheeting. If boundary fencing is 
utilized, it shall be of rural 
construction such as pine posts/steel 
posts and 7 strand ringlock to the 
satisfaction of Council. 

  (vii) On-site Effluent Disposal 
 (a)  On-site effluent disposal shall be the 

responsibility of the individual 
landowner and shall involve the use 
of on-site disposal systems approved 
by Council in accordance with 
Health Department of WA and 
Department of Environment and 
Conservation guidelines. 

  (viii) Urban Water Management Plan 
 (a)  Council may request the 

Commission to impose a condition at 
the time of subdivision for the 
preparation and implementation of a 
detailed Urban Water Management 
Plan (UWMP) in accordance with 
Water Sensitive Urban Design 
Principles, as detailed in the 
Stormwater Management Manual 
for Western Australia. This plan is 
to be developed in consultation with 
the Shire of Denmark, to the 
satisfaction of the Department of 
Water. 

  (ix) Prospective Purchasers 
Provision shall be made to Council’s 
satisfaction to ensure prospective purchasers 
of land within Special Residential Zone Area 
No. 12 acknowledge and accept these Special 
Provisions prior to entering into an 
agreement to acquire any property. 

4336 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



Particulars 
of the Land Proposed Uses Special Provisions 

For lot 999 Kearsley Road and lot 106 
McLean Road, that— 

— Land managed by the Department of 
Environment and Conservation is in 
close proximity and that some or all 
of the following activities may occur 
from time to time 

— prescribed burning for conservation 
and/or fire hazard reduction purposes 

— baiting with approved poisons to 
control introduced predators of native 
fauna 

— application of herbicides and other 
chemicals for weed and plant disease 
control. 

 3. Amend the scheme maps accordingly. 

R. THORNTON, Shire President. 
D. STEWART, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PI404* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Busselton 

Town Planning Scheme No. 20—Amendment No. 96 
Ref: 853/6/6/21 Pt 96  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Busselton local planning 
scheme amendment on 7 September 2009 for the purpose of— 
 1. Removing the “Development Investigation” classification from Lot 500 Ford Road.  
 2. Deleting the Conservation Zone from a portion Lot 500 Ford Road and reserving that land  for 

Recreation as depicted on the Scheme Amendment Map.  
 3. Amending the Scheme Map accordingly.  

W. H. HARTLEY Shire President. 
A. MacNISH, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PI405* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Busselton 

Town Planning Scheme No. 20—Amendment No. 124 
Ref: 853/6/6/21 Pt 124 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Busselton local planning 
scheme amendment on 14 October 2009 for the purpose of rezoning a portion of Lot 31 Walburra 
Siding Road, Metricup from ‘Agriculture’ to ‘Bushland Protection’.  

W. H. HARTLEY, Shire President. 
A. MacNISH, Chief Executive Officer. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4337 

 



PUBLIC SERVICE 
PS401 

PUBLIC SECTOR MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 
ESTABLISHMENT AND DESIGNATION OF DEPARTMENT 

Pursuant to section 35(2) of the Public Sector Management Act 1994, notice is hereby given that the 
Governor has— 

under the Public Sector Management Act 1994 section 35(1)(a), established a department and 
designated it as the Department of Training and Workforce Development with effect on and from 
30 October 2009; and 
under the Public Sector Management Act 1994 section 35(1)(d), altered the designation of the 
Department of Education and Training and designated it as the Department of Education with 
effect on and from 30 October 2009. 

(Sgd.) for M. C. WAUCHOPE, Public Sector Commissioner. 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 
RG401* 

LIQUOR CONTROL ACT 1988 
LIQUOR APPLICATIONS 

The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Control Act 1988 (the Act) and 
required to be advertised.  
Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection process, 
should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming and Liquor, 1st Floor, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, 
Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation. 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE 
13099 Skygrade Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Tavern licence 

in respect of premises situated in 
Northbridge and known as Outback Jacks 
Bar & Grill 

29/11/2009 

13109 Cabernet Wines Pty 
Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Liquor Store 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Doubleview and known as WA Cleanskin 
Cellars @ Doubleview 

29/11/2009 

13115 Cunderdin Farmers 
Co-Operative 
Company Limited 

Application for the grant of a Liquor Store 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Cunderdin and known as Cunderdin IGA 

29/11/2009 

13125 Tong 86 Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Restaurant 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Perth and known as Tong 86 

29/11/2009 

13120 Mash Brewing 
Rockingham Pty 
Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Tavern licence 
in respect of premises situated in 
Rockingham and known as Mash Brewing 
Rockingham 

29/11/2009 

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS 
34921 RAWA Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an Extended 

Trading Permit in respect of premises 
situated in Cervantes and known as Lynne’s 
Licka 

22/11/2009 

34960 Soho House Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an Extended 
Trading Permit in respect of premises 
situated in Perth  and known as Wolfe Lane 

9/11/2009 

4338 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATION FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—LIQUOR WITHOUT A MEAL 
35060 Edward Canute 

Roberts 
Application for the grant of an Extended 
Trading Permit in respect of premises 
situated in Borden and known as Bluff Knoll 
Café 

22/11/2009 

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Act. 
Dated: 28 October 2009. 

B. A. SARGEANT, Director of Liquor Licensing. 

WATER/SEWERAGE 
WA401 

WATER BOARDS ACT 1904 
AQWEST–BUNBURY WATER BOARD 

The Governor in Executive Council has approved the appointment of the following persons as a 
member of the Aqwest–Bunbury Water Board— 

Thomas Hall for a period expiring on 31 May 2012 
Merrilynn Walker for a period expiring on 31 May 2012 
Robert Edgeloe for a period expiring on 31 May 2011 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

DECEASED ESTATES 
ZX401* 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Roy Allan Dixon, late of 190 Empire Avenue, Wembley Downs in Western Australia, Retired 
Businessman, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 3 June 2009, are required by the executors Gregory 
Allan Dixon of 9 The Spit, Kallaroo, Western Australia and Anthony Clement Maclean of 
28 Karoonda Road, Booragoon, Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to the executors 
c/- Mack & Co Chartered Accountants, PO Box 609, West Perth WA 6872 within one (1) month from 
the date of publication of this notice after which date the executors may convey or distribute the 
assets, having regard only to the claims of which they then have notice. 
Dated this 23rd day of October 2009. 
 

——————————— 
 
ZX402 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Margit Molnar, late of 11 Dalwood Road, Swan View, Western Australia, home duties, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 30 September 2009 are required by the Birman & 
Ride of Level 3, Irwin Chambers, 16 Irwin Street, Perth, WA 6000 to send particulars of their claim to 
them by 27 November 2009 after which date the Trustee may convey or distribute the assets, having 
regard only to the claims of which he then has notice. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4339 

 



ZX403 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Milan Simon Bracic, late of Glenn Craig Nursing Home, Beaufort Road, Albany, Western Australia, 
deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 8 July 2009, are required by the trustee of the late 
Milan Simon Bracic of c/- Haynes Robinson Solicitors of PO Box 485, Albany, Western Australia 6331 
to send particulars of their claims to them within one (1) month from the date of publication of this 
notice after which date the trustee may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the 
claims of which it then has notice. 
Dated this 27th day of October 2009. 

HAYNES ROBINSON. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
ZX404 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Hazel Lavinia Rodgers, late of 1/105 Pola Street, Dianella in the State of Western Australia, Retired 
Salesperson, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 29 April 2008 at Sir Charles Gairdner Hospital, 
Nedlands in the State of Western Australia, are required by the executor Andrew Ernest Lynn of 
Lynn & Brown Lawyers, 5 Collier Road, Morley WA 6062 to send particulars of their claims to him by 
1 December 2009 after which date the executor may convey or distribute the assets of the estate, 
having regard only to the claims of which he then has notice. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
ZX405* 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act, relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before 30 November 2009 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, 
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 
Bailey, Maree Elizabeth, late of 37 Davis Street, Boulder, died 26.12.2007 (DE33066035EM24) 
Burmann, Daniel Gilbert, late of 50 Horseshoe Circuit, Henley Brook, died 26.09.2009 

(DE30335584EM313) 
Hall, Irene Emily, late of Tanby Hall Aged Care, Tanby Place, Cooloongup, died 13.09.2009 

(DE19830385EM17) 
Harris, Norman Stewart, late of 5/21 West Street, Busselton, died 3.10.2008 (DE19993282EM110) 
Harvey, Mervyn Leslie, late of 340 Anchorage Drive, Mindarie, died 26.08.2009 (DE33071357EM35) 
Jakubowicz, Jan, late of Windsor Park Aged Care, 110 Star Street, Carlisle, died 13.12.2008 

(DE33039360EM110) 
Marlborough, Maria Cecilia, late of 44/277 South Terrace, South Fremantle, died 28.09.2009 

(DE33075352EM17) 
Nielsen, Gordon Bergmann, late of 68 Gardiner Street, Belmont, died 21.09.2009 

(DE19670548EM110) 
Rogers, Dora, late of Room 23/ 5 Brittania Road, Leederville, died 27.09.2009 (DE19954443EM16) 
Shadforth, Clark Anthony, also known as Cas, late of 4a McGovern Way, Derby, died 2.08.2008 

(DE33074989EM36) 

4340 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



Silver, Noelle Anne, late of c/-Embleton Care Facility, 46 Broun Avenue, Embleton, died 18.09.2009 
(DE19901277EM23) 

Tyler, Robert Charles, late of Craigmont Nursing Home, Third Avenue, Maylands, formerly of 
5/5 Dennison Street, Inglewood, died 7.09.2009 (DE19561349EM27) 

Washer, Norma Lilian, late of Valleyview Residence, 5 Vernon Street, Collie, formerly of Unit 8 
Riverview, 3 Pendleton Street, Collie, died 2.09.2009 (DE19972849EM26) 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
Public Trust Office, 

565 Hay Street, 
Perth WA 6000. 

Telephone: 9222 6777 
 

——————————— 
 
ZX406* 

PUBLIC TRUSTEE ACT 1941 
ADMINISTERING OF ESTATES 

Notice is hereby given that pursuant to Section 14 of the Public Trustee Act 1941 and amendments 
the Public Trustee has elected to administer the estates of the undermentioned deceased persons. 
Dated at Perth the 30th day of October 2009. 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
565 Hay Street, PERTH WA 6000. 

———— 
Name of Deceased Address Date of Death Date Election Filed 
Essie Blincow 
DE20010735EM16 

20 Boulder Avenue, 
Ascot 

26 July 2009 15 October 2009 

Myrtle Jane Jackson 
DE20012319EM37 

18 Martell Street, 
Warnbro 

19 July 2009 15 October 2009 

Ronald Sowry 
DE33013488EM16 

33 Drovers Place, 
Wanneroo 

27 March 2009 22 October 2009 

 
 

——————————— 
 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
Loose Leaf Version 
(Including Index) 

 
$64.70 (incl. Amendments Nos. 1 & 2) 

Green Binder is an additional $17.20 if required 
(Prices include GST) 

Available from: 

State Law Publisher 
10 William Street, Perth 

Telephone: 9426 0000 
Fax: 9321 7536 

sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 
Web: www.slp.wa.gov.au 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4341 

 



 

 
NEW EDITION AVAILABLE ! ! ! 

 

 
 

The Western Australian 
PARLIAMENTARY HANDBOOK 

 
 

TWENTY-SECOND EDITION 
(2009) 

 
 

DAVID BLACK (Editor) 
 

Detailed with comprehensive biographical information  
and photographs, this publication is highly recommended  
for those with an interest in the individuals and history 

 that form the Western Australian Parliament. 
 

Cost: $25.00 
 

For further information please contact— 
STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
Telephone: (08) 9426 0000 
Facsimile: (08) 9321 7536 

Email: sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 
 

 

4342 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 


