
 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Fisheries Adjustment Schemes Act 1987—Fisheries Adjustment Schemes Regulations 
2009.........................................................................................................................................  4992 

Fish Resources Management Act 1994—Fish Resources Management Amendment 
Regulations (No. 18) 2009 ......................................................................................................  4993 

Health Act 1911—Health (Aquatic Facilities) Amendment Regulations 2009.......................  4998 
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment 

Regulations (No. 5) 2009 ........................................................................................................  5001 
Local Government Act 1995—Building Amendment Regulations (No. 5) 2009......................  4991 
Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960—Building Amendment 

Regulations (No. 5) 2009 ........................................................................................................  4991 
Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987—Rottnest Island Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 

2009.........................................................................................................................................  5002 
 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Agriculture and Food .................................................................................................................  5010 
Corrective Services ....................................................................................................................  5013 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  5019 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  5013 
Environment and Conservation ................................................................................................  5013 
Fisheries .....................................................................................................................................  5014 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  5015 
Marine/Maritime........................................................................................................................  5016 
Minerals and Petroleum ............................................................................................................  5017 
Planning .....................................................................................................................................  5017 
Public Service.............................................................................................................................  5018 
Water/Sewerage .........................................................................................................................  5019 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

!200900228GG! 
 

  4989 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 8 DECEMBER 2009 No. 228 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 



 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9426 0000  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 
 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

PUBLISHING DETAILS FOR CHRISTMAS 2009 
AND NEW YEAR HOLIDAY PERIOD 2010 

————— 

 Publishing Dates Closing Dates and Times 
 and times for copy 

Thursday, 24 December 2009 at 3.30 pm Tuesday, 22 December 2009 at 12 noon 

Thursday, 31 December 2009 at 3.30 pm Thursday, 24 December 2009 at 12 noon 

Friday, 8 January 2010 at 3.30 pm Wednesday, 6 January 2010 at 12 noon 

 

——————————— 
 

 

 



— PART 1 — 

COMMERCE 
CO301* 

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 
Local Government Act 1995 

Building Amendment Regulations (No. 5) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under the Local Government 
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 section 433A and the Local 
Government Act 1995 section 9.60. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Building Amendment Regulations 
(No. 5) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Building Regulations 1989. 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  In Schedule 2 after the item relating to Derby-West Kimberley 
insert: 

 
Donnybrook- 
Balingup 

Whole district Whole district Whole district 

 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 
PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4991 

 



FISHERIES 
FI301* 

Fisheries Adjustment Schemes Act 1987 

Fisheries Adjustment Schemes Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Fisheries Adjustment Schemes 
Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Terms used 
 Abrolhos Islands Fishery means the Fishery as defined in the 

Abrolhos Islands Notice clause 2; 
 Abrolhos Islands Notice means the Abrolhos Islands and Mid 

West Trawl Managed Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment 
Scheme Notice 2009; 

 Abrolhos Islands Voluntary Scheme means the voluntary 
fisheries adjustment scheme established by the Abrolhos Islands 
Notice clause 3; 

 authorisation means an authorisation that authorises fishing in 
the Abrolhos Islands Fishery; 

 gear unit has the meaning given in the Abrolhos Islands and 
Mid West Trawl Limited Entry Fishery Notice 1993 clause 2. 

4. Fee under section 8 of Act imposed 

 (1) For the purposes of the Abrolhos Islands Voluntary Scheme, the 
fee calculated in accordance with regulation 5 is imposed. 

 (2) The fee is payable by the holder of an authorisation. 

4992 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



5. Amount of fee fixed 

 (1) If the number of gear units that apply to an authorisation is a 
whole number, the fee referred to in regulation 4 is the amount 
equal to $5 011.34 multiplied by the number of gear units. 

 (2) If the number of gear units that apply to an authorisation is not a 
whole number, the fee referred to in regulation 4 is the amount 
equal to the sum of —  

 (a) $5 011.34 multiplied by the number of gear units, 
disregarding any part of that number that is less than a 
whole number; and 

 (b) $2 505.67. 

6. Payments to be made on 1 March for 10 years 

 (1) The fee referred to in regulation 4 is payable annually on 
1 March. 

 (2) The first payment is due on 1 March 2010, and the final 
payment is due on 1 March 2019. 

 (3) The fee is payable to the CEO at the head office of the 
Department. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 
PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 
FI302* 

Fish Resources Management Act 1994 

Fish Resources Management Amendment 
Regulations (No. 18) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Fish Resources Management 
Amendment Regulations (No. 18) 2009. 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4993 

 



2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 16 December 2009. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Fish Resources Management 
Regulations 1995. 

4. Regulation 16E amended 

 (1) In regulation 16E(1) delete the definition of West Coast Region 
Division 1 fish. 

 (2) In regulation 16E(1) insert in alphabetical order: 
 

 charter boat means a boat that is used to conduct a 
fishing tour for a commercial purpose in accordance 
with a fishing tour operator’s licence or a restricted 
fishing tour operator’s licence; 

 

 (3) In regulation 16E(1) in the definition of single-sided fillet delete 
“fish;” and insert: 

 

  fish. 
 

 (4) Delete regulation 16E(3E) and (3F) and insert: 
 

 (3E) The master of a boat, other than a fishing boat, being 
used for taking fish in the West Coast Region must 
ensure that the number of West Australian dhufish on, 
or attached to, the boat, and any tender or other vessel 
operating with or attached to the boat, at any one 
time —  

 (a) if the boat is a charter boat — is not more 
than 6; or 

 (b) if the boat is other than a charter boat — is not 
more than 2. 

 Penalty: a fine of $10 000 and the penalty provided in 
section 222 of the Act. 

 

4994 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



5. Regulation 64N amended 

  In regulation 64N delete “This” and insert: 
 

  Except as stated in regulation 64OAA, this 

6. Regulation 64OAA inserted 

  At the end of Part 4A Division 3 insert: 
 

64OAA. Release weight to be on boat used for fishing for 
demersal scalefish in West Coast Region 

 (1) In this regulation —  
 demersal scalefish has the meaning given in 

regulation 45(1); 
 release weight means a weight that —  

 (a) for the purpose of returning to the seabed a live 
fish that has been taken, is able to be attached 
to the fish; and 

 (b) is able to be detached from the fish when it 
reaches the seabed; 

 West Coast Demersal Scalefish (Interim) Managed 
Fishery means the fishery declared under the West 
Coast Demersal Scalefish (Interim) Management 
Plan 2007. 

 (2) If a person is fishing from a fishing boat under the 
authority conferred by a managed fishery licence that 
applies to the West Coast Demersal Scalefish (Interim) 
Managed Fishery, the master of the boat must ensure 
that there is a release weight on the boat. 

 Penalty: $2 000. 

 (3) If a person is fishing for demersal scalefish from a 
boat, other than a fishing boat, in the West Coast 
Region by means of a line, the master of the boat must 
ensure that there is a release weight on the boat. 

 Penalty: $2 000. 
 

7. Regulation 64ZA amended 

  In regulation 64ZA(3) after “Division 1,” insert: 
 

  2A, 
 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4995 

 



8. Schedule 2 amended 

  In Schedule 2 Part 2 Division 3 Subdivision 2 in the item 
relating to Snapper, Pink delete paragraph (a) and insert: 

 
 (a) when taken or brought onto land from the 

waters of the West Coast Region that are 
south of 31° 00′ south latitude...............................

 
 
500 

 

9. Schedule 3 amended 

 (1) Delete Schedule 3 Part 3 Division 1 and insert: 
 

Division 1 — Grouped bag limit of 2 fish (demersal scalefish) 

Fish 

Species, or 
group of 

species, bag 
limit for 
one day 

Grouped bag 
limit of all 

species in this 
Division for 

one day 

Cod (cobined, except Coral Trout and 
Coronation Trout) ..................................................

 
2 

Cod classified as Epinephelus spp., in excess 
of 30 kg in weight or 1000 mm in length................

 
0 

Coral Trout and Coronation Trout (combined) ...... 1 

Dhufish, West Australian ....................................... 1 

Emperor and Seabream (combined) ....................... 2 

Foxfish, Western and Pigfish (combined) ............. 2 

Groper, Blue .......................................................... 1 

Hapuku, Trevalla, Bass Groper and Grey 
Banded Rock Cod (combined) ...............................

 
2 

Parrot Fish (combined) .......................................... 2 

Sea Perch, Tropical (combined) ............................. 2 

Snapper, Pink ......................................................... 2 

Snapper, Queen ...................................................... 2 

Snapper, Red (Redfish) and Swallowtail 
(combined) .............................................................

 
2 

Tuskfish and Baldchin Groper (combined) ............ 2 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

2 

4996 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



Division 2A — Grouped bag limit of 2 fish (pelagic species) 

Fish 

Species, or 
group of 
species, bag 
limit for 
one day 

Grouped bag 
limit of all 
species in the 
Division for 
one day 

Barracuda .............................................................. 2 

Billfish, Sailfish, Spearfish and Marlins and 
Swordfish (combined) ..........................................

 
1 

Cobia ..................................................................... 2 

Dolphinfish (Mahi Mahi) ...................................... 2 

Mackerel, Broad-barred Spanish and 
Narrow-barred Spanish (combined) .....................

 
2 

Mackerel, Shark .................................................... 2 

Mackerel, Wahoo ................................................. 2 

Samson Fish, Amberjack and Yellowtail 
Kingfish (combined) .............................................

 
2 

Trevally, Giant and Golden (combined) ............... 2 

Tuna, Southern Bluefin, Yellowfin and Bigeye 
(combined) ............................................................

 
2 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
2 

 

 (2) In Schedule 3 Part 3 Division 2 insert in alphabetical order: 
 

Cobbler ................................................................. 4 

Mulloway .............................................................. 2 

Salmon, Australian ............................................... 4 

Sharks and Rays (combined) ................................ 2 

Trout, Brown and Rainbow (combined) ............... 4 
 

10. Schedule 7 amended 

  In Schedule 7 Division 1 in the item relating to Cod, Grey 
Banded Rock delete “Epinephelus octofasciatus” and insert: 

 

  Hyporthodus octofasciatus 
 

11. Schedule 12 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 12 Part 2 item 4: 
 (a) delete “16E(3E), 16E(3F),”; 
 (b) after “64O,” insert: 

 
  64OAA(2), 64OAA(3), 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4997 

 



 (2) In Schedule 12 Part 2 item 5 after “Regulations” insert: 
 

  16E(3E), 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 
PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

HEALTH 
HE301* 

Health Act 1911 

Health (Aquatic Facilities) Amendment 
Regulations 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Health (Aquatic Facilities) 
Amendment Regulations 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Health (Aquatic Facilities) 
Regulations 2007. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  In regulation 4 insert in alphabetical order: 
 

 dwelling unit means a room or suite of rooms, and any 
associated parts of a building, constituting a single 
dwelling for the exclusive occupation of the occupant; 

4998 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



 residential lot means a lot used, or intended to be used, 
as a place of residence, but does not include a lot used, 
or intended to be used, in the course of carrying on a 
business of providing holiday or temporary 
accommodation for persons away from their normal 
place of residence; 

 

5. Regulation 5 amended 

 (1) In regulation 5(2): 
 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “lots;” and insert: 

 
  lots, each of which is a residential lot; 

 
 (b) after paragraph (a) insert: 

 
 (ba) an aquatic facility, that is part of a complex that 

consists of or includes dwelling units, if —  
 (i) there are less than 30 dwelling units in 

the complex; and 
 (ii) only long-term residents of the complex 

and their guests are permitted to have 
access to the aquatic facility; 

 
 (c) in paragraph (c) delete “body.” and insert: 

 
  body; 

 
 (d) after paragraph (c) insert: 

 
 (d) an aquatic facility that is exempt under 

subregulation (3). 
 

 (2) After regulation 5(2) insert: 
 

 (3) The EDPH may exempt an aquatic facility for the 
purposes of subregulation (2)(d) if satisfied that —  

 (a) only persons who have a long-term connection 
with the facility and their guests are permitted 
to have access to it; and 

 (b) the health and safety of persons using the 
facility will not be compromised; and 

 (c) it is in the public interest to exempt the facility. 
 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4999 

 



6. Regulation 15 amended 

  After regulation 15(3) insert: 
 

 (4) Subregulation (5) applies to and in relation to an 
aquatic facility if —  

 (a) the facility was in use, to some extent, during 
the 12 months immediately prior to 
1 October 2007; and 

 (b) there is no certificate of compliance in force in 
respect of the facility. 

 (5) If this subregulation applies, the EDPH may issue a 
certificate of compliance for the facility even though 
not satisfied as required by subregulation (3) if 
satisfied that the health and safety of persons using the 
facility will not be compromised and that there is a 
public interest in issuing the certificate of compliance. 

 

7. Regulation 21 amended 

 (1) In regulation 21(1)(a) delete “officer” and insert: 
 

  officer, or a person under the direction of an 
environmental health officer, 

 

 (2) After regulation 21(1) insert: 
 

 (2A) For the purposes of subregulation (1)(a), a person is 
under the direction of an environmental health officer if 
the person is under the regular and frequent, but not 
necessarily continuous and personal, supervision of the 
officer. 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

5000 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



HE302* 
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 5) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Hospitals (Services Charges) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 5) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Hospitals (Services Charges) 
Regulations 1984. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 1 item 1(c) delete “$41.35” and insert: 
 

  $45.50 
 

 (2) In Schedule 1 item 1(d) delete “$143” and insert: 
 

  $147.15 
 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5001 

 



ROTTNEST ISLAND AUTHORITY 
RX301* 

Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987 

Rottnest Island Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Rottnest Island Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Rottnest Island Regulations 1988. 

4. Regulation 5 amended 

  In regulation 5(4) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

5. Regulation 11 amended 

 (1) In regulation 11(2) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (2) In regulation 11(3) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

6. Regulation 12 amended 

  In regulation 12(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 

5002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



7. Regulation 28 amended 

 (1) In regulation 28(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (2) In regulation 28(3) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (3) In regulation 28(5) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

8. Regulation 29 amended 

  In regulation 29(3) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

9. Regulation 30 amended 

 (1) In regulation 30(4) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (2)  In regulation 30(8) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

10. Regulation 36 amended 

  In regulation 36(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

11. Regulation 36A amended 

  In regulation 36A delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5003 

 



12. Regulation 37 amended 

 (1) In regulation 37(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (2)  In regulation 37(4) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

13. Regulation 41A amended 

  In regulation 41A(2) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

14. Regulation 42 amended 

  In regulation 42(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

15. Regulation 44 amended 

  In regulation 44(3) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

16. Regulation 52 amended 

  In regulation 52(2) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

17. Regulation 54 amended 

  In regulation 54 delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

18. Regulation 55 amended 

  In regulation 55(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

5004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



19. Regulation 56 amended 

  In regulation 56(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

20. Regulation 57 amended 

  In regulation 57 delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

21. Regulation 60A amended 

  In regulation 60A(2) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

22. Regulation 72A amended 

  In regulation 72A(5) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

23. Regulation 74A amended 

  In regulation 74A delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

24. Schedule 1 Form 2 amended 

  In Schedule 1 Form 2: 
 (a) in the item relating to regulation 5(4) delete “$50” and 

insert: 
 

  $150 
 

 (b) in the item relating to regulation 9(1) delete “$100” and 
insert: 

 
  $200 

 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5005 

 



 (c) delete the item relating to regulation 11(2)(a) and insert: 
 

 Regulation 11(2) — securing vessel to 
mooring without authority or without 
exhibiting sticker or licence 

 
 

$150 
 

 (d) delete the item relating to regulation 40 and insert: 
 

 Regulation 40(1) — interfering etc. with 
fauna or habitat etc. of fauna 

 
$200 

 
 (e) in the item relating to regulation 41(1) delete “$100” and 

insert: 
 

  $200 
 

 (f) in the item relating to regulation 41A(2) delete “$50” 
and insert: 

 
  $150 

 
 (g) in the item relating to regulation 59(1)(a) delete “$100” 

and insert: 
 

  $200 
 

 (h) in the item relating to regulation 60(1) delete “$100” and 
insert: 

 
  $200 

 
 (i) in the item relating to regulation 60B(1) delete “$100” 

and insert: 
 

  $200 
 

 (j) in the item relating to regulation 70(1)(c) delete “$80” 
and insert: 

 
  $200 

 
 (k) in the item relating to regulation 72(1) delete “$80” and 

insert: 
 

  $200 
 

5006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



25. Schedule 4 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 4 and insert: 
 

Schedule 4 — Offences to which modified penalties 
apply 

[r. 73] 

Item Regulation Matter to which regulation 
relates 

Modified 
penalty 

$ 

1. 5(4) Failing or refusing to pay 
admission, not being a passenger on 
commercial transport 

 
 

150 

2. 9(1) Taking up unauthorised casual 
residence 

 
200 

3. 11(1)(a) Installing mooring without 
permission 

 
200 

4. 11(1)(b) Securing vessel to mooring installed 
without permission 

 
200 

5. 11(2) Securing vessel to mooring without 
authority or without exhibiting 
sticker or licence 

 
 

150 

6. 11(3)(a) Securing vessel to mooring where 
vessel already secured 

 
150 

7. 11(3)(b) Securing vessel to vessel secured to 
mooring 

 
150 

8. 12(1) Anchoring vessel closer than 
50 metres to mooring or so that it 
obstructs mooring 

 
 

150 

9. 28(3) Licensee failing to have mooring 
inspection report 

 
150 

10. 28(5) Licensee using mooring in respect 
of which Authority does not have 
mooring inspection report 

 
 

150 

11. 29(3) Failing to comply with notice to 
move unattended vessel 

 
150 

12. 30(8) Removing mooring that is subject 
to notice prohibiting removal 

 
150 

13. 36(1)(a) Being in a restricted area without 
permission 

 
150 

14. 36(1)(b) Being in a protected area without 
permission 

 
150 

15. 36(1)(c) Using a closed track or path without 
permission 

 
150 

16. 36A(a) Securing vessel to structure not 
designed for that use 

 
150 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5007 

 



Item Regulation Matter to which regulation 
relates 

Modified 
penalty 

$ 

17. 36A(b) Using apparatus other than beach 
anchor as a beach anchor 

 
150 

18. 37(1)(a) Beaching vessel in Thomson, 
Longreach or Geordie Bay without 
permission and not in permitted 
area 

 
 
 

150 

19. 37(1)(b) Beach-anchoring a vessel in 
Thomson, Longreach or Geordie 
Bay without permission and not in 
permitted area 

 
 
 

150 

20. 38A(3) Exceeding speed limit set for vessel 
in defined area 

 
100 

21. 38B(3) Using vessel contrary to notice 
setting aside area and imposing 
conditions for use of that vessel 

 
 

200 

22. 38C(2) Discharging or depositing sullage 
from vessel other than by approved 
system 

 
 

200 

23. 39(1) Injuring etc. flora or removing stake 
or label relating to flora 

 
200 

24. 40(1) Interfering etc. with fauna or habitat 
etc. of fauna 

 
200 

25. 41(1) Without permission causing or 
allowing animal or bird to enter 
Island 

 
 

200 

26. 41A(2) Feeding fauna contrary to sign or 
notice 

 
150 

27. 42(1) Causing damage to any rock or soil 
without permission 

 
150 

28. 44(3) Failing to comply with traffic sign 
or with ranger’s signal or direction 
relating to vehicle 

 
 

150 

29. 47(1) Exceeding speed limit 100 

30. 53 Without permission organising, 
advertising or participating in any 
event or meeting 

 
 

200 

31. 55(1) Without permission affixing notice 
etc., defacing rock, tree, pavement, 
structure etc. or causing any such 
act to be done 

 
 
 

150 

32. 56(1) Without permission selling, 
distributing etc. printed or written 
matter 

 
 

150 

33. 59(1)(a) Without permission carrying or 
discharging firearm, speargun, 
gidgie etc. 

 
 

200 

5008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



Item Regulation Matter to which regulation 
relates 

Modified 
penalty 

$ 

34. 59(2) Without permission having, or 
discharging, explosive device 
within limits of Island 

 
 

200 

35. 60(1) Without permission lighting, 
making or using fire other than in 
gas stove or indoor fireplace 

 
 

200 

36. 60A(1) Sandboarding 200 

37. 60A(2) Possessing sandboard 150 

38. 60B(1) Littering 200 

39. 65(1) Being within aerodrome limits 
without permission or authority 

 
200 

40. 69 Without authority destroying or 
damaging building or structure 

 
200 

41. 70(1)(a) Unlawfully assaulting a person 200 

42. 70(1)(b) Using indecent, obscene, 
threatening, abusive or insulting 
language 

 
 

200 

43. 70(1)(c) Doing or engaging in any offensive, 
indecent or improper act, conduct or 
behaviour 

 
 

200 

44. 70(1)(d) Acting in such a way as to cause a 
nuisance or annoyance to persons 

 
200 

45. 70(3) Writing etc. or distributing or 
otherwise disseminating indecent or 
obscene matter 

 
 

200 

46. 71 Causing or producing noise that 
unreasonably interferes with 
convenience, comfort or amenity of 
any person 

 
 
 

200 

47. 72(1) Consuming alcoholic liquor in 
unauthorised place 

 
200 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
 

——————————— 
 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5009 

 



— PART 2 — 

AGRICULTURE AND FOOD 
AG401* 

PLANT PESTS AND DISEASES (ERADICATION FUNDS) ACT 1974 
APPOINTMENT OF RECEIVERS AS AGENTS FOR COLLECTION OF CONTRIBUTIONS 

Pursuant to section 11 of the Plant Pests and Diseases (Eradication Funds) Act 1974 I appoint the 
following receivers of grain and seed as agents for the collection of contributions in respect of growers 
the delivery of whose grain or seed is made to them. 
Receiver Address  City/Town 
ABB Grain Ltd GPO Box 1169 ADELAIDE SA 
Aero Flour Company 6 Noble street KEWDALE WA 
AC Toepfer International (Aust) Pty 

Ltd 
Level 2, ANL House PORT ADELAIDE SA 

Agri-Best Australia Pty Ltd PO Box 1043 WEST PERTH WA 
Allied Mills Australia Pty Ltd Locked Bag 2222 NORTH RYDE NSW 
Arrow Commodities P/L PO Box 1669 STRAWBERRY HILLS NSW 
Ausfeeds Exports WA 5 Rochdale Road MT CLAREMONT WA 
Australasian Feed Pty Ltd Post Office WONGAN HILLS WA 
Australian Foods Company Pty Ltd 251-257 Hay Street EAST PERTH WA 
Australian Rolled Oats Pty Ltd 31 Camm Avenue BULL GREEK WA 
AWB Limited  380 La Trobe Street MELBOURNE VIC 
Banjawarn Pty Ltd PO Box 1366 ESPERANCE WA 
Barragup Stock Feeds Lot 5 Pinjarra Road BARRAGUP WA 
Brian Sargeant & Son RMB 725 NARROGIN WA 
Brigadoon Produce 1125 Great Northern Hwy BASKERVILLE WA 
Bunge Global Markets Australia Pty 

Ltd 
99 Coventry Street SOUTH MELBOURNE VIC 

Busselton Stockfeeds & Saddlery Lot 48 Strelley Street BUSSELTON WA 
Byford Flour Mill Pty Ltd PO Box 69 ARMADALE WA 
Cargill Australia Limited GPO Box 58 MELBOURNE VIC 
Chapman Valley Feed Lot C/- Post Office MOONYOONOOKA WA 
Concordia Agritrading (Australia) 

Pty Ltd 
7 Merriwa street GORDON ACT 

Coorow Seed Cleaners South Street COOROW WA 
Craig Mostyn & Co Pty Ltd 6 Short Street FREMANTLE WA 
Demeter Cormack PO Box 1043 WEST PERTH WA 
Eastern Districts Seed Cleaning Co Mather Road KELLERBERRIN WA 
Elders Australia 27 Currie Street ADELAIDE SA 
Elders Toepfer Grain Pty. Ltd 27 Currie Street—3rd floor ADELAIDE SA 
Elite Grains Pty Ltd PO Box 10 WILLIAMS WA 
Emerald Group Australia Pty Ltd 2 Birksgate Road NORTH FREMANTLE WA 
Esperance Quality Grains PO Box 1758 ESPERANCE 
Fares Rural Pty Ltd PO Box 185 KOJONUP WA 
Fyfe Transport 8 Elliott Street LAKE GRACE WA 
Geraldton Golden Eggs Pty Ltd Lot 3 Abattoir Road MOONYOONOOKA WA 
Geraldton Seed Services Lot 135 Goulds Road NARNGULU WA 
GF Food Services 2 Coulson Way CANNINGVALE WA 
Gilmac (WA) Pty Ltd 3 Ord Street WEST PERTH WA 
Glen Forrest Stock Feeders 3150 Great Eastern Hwy GLEN FORREST WA 

5010 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



Receiver Address  City/Town 
Glencore Grain PTY LTD Level 6, 437 St Kilda Road MELBOURNE VIC 
Golden Plains Fodder PO Box 201 NORTH FREMANTLE 
Goodman Fielder Foods Pty Ltd Level 23, 56 Pitt Street SYDNEY NSW 
Gosnells Stock Feeds 1990 Albany Hwy MADDINGTON WA 
GrainCorp Operations Ltd Level 27, 175 Liverpool 

Street 
SYDNEY SOUTH NSW 

Grain Exporters (Aust) Pty Ltd PO Box 5030 ROCKINGHAM BEACH WA 
Grain Link WA Pty Ltd PO Box 1910 MIDLAND DC WA 
Grainfeeds Pty Ltd (Wagin) Railway Reserve WAGIN WA 
Grain Pool Pty Ltd Gayfer House, 30 Dehli 

Street 
WEST PERTH WA 

Great Southern Oat Company Pty 
Ltd 

1 Reid Place BOYUP BROOK 

Green’s General Foods Pty Ltd 1 - 7 Ilda Road CANNINGVALE 
Hack & Rack Stockfeeds 209 Chester Pass Road  ALBANY WA 
Hay Australia Pty Ltd PO Box 260 MUCHEA WA 
HD, AL & NJ Linberg RMB 535 DENBARKER WA 
Inghams Enterprises Pty Ltd PO Box 287 CAMPBELLTOWN NSW 
Irwin Valley  PO Box 225 PALMYRA WA 
Jarra Luka Feedlot 673 Mt Pleasant Road MANYPEAKS WA 
 JK International Pty Ltd GPO Box 1981 BRISBANE QLD 
JJ & MK Hetherington PO Box 209 MT BARKER WA 
Joe White Maltings Ltd PO Box 1072 CLOVERDALE WA 
Ketteridge Stockfeeds Post Office PICTON WA 
Kirin Australia Pty Ltd 47 MacDowell Street WELSHPOOL WA 
KM & LD Johnston RMB 700 WILLIAMS WA 
Kojonup Oils PO Box 82 KOJONUP WA 
Kojonup Seed Enterprises RMB 419 KOJONUP WA 
Landmark Locked Bag 1 BASSENDEAN WA 
Lempriere Grain Pty Ltd   BIBRA LAKE WA  
Louis Dreyfus Australia Pty Ltd PO Box 445 SOUTH YARRA VIC 
Macco Feeds Australia Po Box 53 WILLIAMS WA 
Mandurah Stockfeeds 114 Park Road MANDURAH WA 
Martin’s Mill C/- Post Office WALKAWAY WA 
Melchiorre Seeds 170 Clayton Road NARROGIN WA 
Midlands Stock Feeds 41 Cathedral Ave MILLENDON WA 
Milnefeeds Agrigroup Pty Ltd Locked Bag 19 WELSHPOOLWA 
Milross Grains C/-PO Box 448 BRIDGETOWN WA 
MJ,M & M Seebers Grain Supplies PO Box 599 BRIDGETOWN WA 
Moora Seed Works Berkshire Valley Road MOORA WA 
Morton Seed and Grain Merchants 42 Howson Way BIBRA LAKE WA 
Mount Barker Co-op Ltd Lowood Road MOUNT BARKER WA 
Newman’s Seed Works C/- Post Office NEWDEGATE WA 
Neil Thompson Trading Company PO Box 1910 MIDLAND DC WA 
Ninan Farm Pty Ltd PO Box 167 YERECOIN WA 
Noble Grain Australia PTY LTD 6 Sara Road SCORESBY VIC 
Norring Grain and Produce 167 Bushmede Road HAZELMERE WA 
Northam Chaff and Fodder Co 24 Church Road MADDINGTON WA 
O’Driscoll Produce PO Box 13 GRASS VALLEY WA 
Parkfeeds Lot 11 Dalwallinu-Kalannie 

Road 
DALWALLINU WA 

Pentarch Farms Pty Ltd PO Box 201 NORTH FREMANTLE WA 
Pindellup Genetices PO Box 39 TAMBELLUP WA 
Planfarm Agronomy Pty Ltd PO Box 2437 GERALDTON WA 
Poultry Farmers of WA 26 Railway Parade BENTLEY WA 
Premium Grain Handlers Roushead Industrial Park NORTH FREMANTLE WA 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5011 

 



Receiver Address  City/Town 
Proudi Trading 131A Walpole Street BENTLEY WA 
Pulse Association of the South East 

Inc 
PO Box 2187 ESPERANCE WA 

Quaker Oats Australia Pty Ltd 1 - 3 Carolyn Place FORRESTFIELD WA 
RF Pugh & Co Carmendale NARRIKUP WA 
Ridley Agri Products PO Box 18 PAKENHAM VIC 
Riverina (Australia) Pty Ltd PO Box 2008 SUBIACO WA 
Riverland Oilseed Processors Greenlands Rd, Plnjarra NUMERKAH VIC 
Rural Logic Aust. P/L Suite 210, 620 St Kilda 

Road 
MELBOURNE VIC 

Semini Enterprises Pty Ltd PO Box 133 COWARAMUP WA 
Shark Lake Piggery  Norseman Road ESPERANCE WA  
 Sumitomo Australia Pty Ltd Level 6 44 Martin Place SYDNEY NSW 
SP Hay Pty Ltd Suite1, Level 2, Havelock 

Street 
WEST PERTH WA 

Swan Brewery Pty Ltd 25 Baile Road CANNINGVALE WA 
Syd Matthew & Co PO Box 38 KOJONUP WA 
Symonds Seeds 5 Hutton Street OSBORNE PARK WA 
Tamma Grains Milton Road PINGELLY WA 
Thompson & Redwood Pty Ltd 220 Almeria Pde UPPER SWAN WA 
Tullibardine Feedlot Tullibardine Pastrol Co NARRIKUP WA 
TW Pearson & Co 43 Dichingham Place AUSTRALIND WA 
VR & DJ Mouritz PO Box 98 HYDEN WA 
WA Consolidated Grain Products 87 Main Street CUNDERDIN WA 
WA Malt Technology 3 Sheppard Way MARMION WA 
Wellard Feeds Pty Ltd PO Box 796 FREMANTLE WA 
Welldon Beef PO Box 152 WILLIAMS WA 
Wesfeeds Pty Ltd PO Box 109 BENTLEY WA 
West Beef Feedlot PO Box 21 KALANNIE WA 
West Coast Milling PO Box 1111 CANNINGVALE WA 
Westbeef Watson Road BURAKIN WA 
Westcoast Milling 27 Catalano Road CANNINGVALE WA 
Weston Milling (WA) PO Box 169 CLOVERDALE WA 
Westpork Pty Ltd 67 Central Avenue REDCLIFFE WA 
Whitby Falls Stock Feeds 101 Kiernan Road MUNDIJONG WA 
White Wings foods 148 Carrington Street O’CONNOR WA 
WR Carpenter Agriculture Level 15 28 Esplanade PERTH WA 
Woorree Stockfeeds 20 Piping Lane WOORREE WA 

TERRY REDMAN MLA, Minister for Agriculture and Food. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
AG402 

MARKETING OF POTATOES ACT 1946 
POTATO MARKETING POOLS 

Potato Marketing Corporation of Western Australia. 
Public notice in accordance with Section 26(2) of the Marketing of Potatoes Act 1946. 
Pool 1, Season 2010/2011 
Pool period: The pool commences on 1 July 2010 and ends on 4 September 2010. 
The quantity of ware potatoes required to be accepted: 10,130 tonnes. 
Additional specifications: Nil. 

5012 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



CORRECTIVE SERVICES 
CS401* 

PRISONS ACT 1981 
PERMIT DETAILS 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 
Flowers Dean Wade AP0480 04/12/09 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 
Dated: 4 December, 2009. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager Acacia Prison Contract. 

ENERGY 
EN401* 

ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 
NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23 (1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS 

Notice is given that the following Distribution and Transmission licences have been amended— 
Licensee: Electricity Networks Corporation 
Issue Date: 30 March 2006 
Address of Licensee: 363 Wellington Street 

PERTH  WA  6000 
 1. Classification: Distribution Licence (EDL 1) 
  Term of Licence: Up to and including 29 March 2036 
  Amendment: Amendment to Clause 25—Trouble Call Fault Management Plan 
  Area Covered: Area within the boundaries set out in the South West 

Interconnected System, Electricity Licence Area Plan No.  
ERA-EL-072. 

 2. Classification: Transmission Licence (ETL 2) 
  Term of Licence: Up to and including 29 March 2036 
  Amendment: Amendment to Clause 22—Trouble Call Fault Management Plan 
  Area Covered: Area within the boundaries set out in the South West 

Interconnected System, Electricity Licence Area Plan No.  
ERA-EL-077. 

  Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
6th Floor 
197 St Georges Terrace 
Perth WA 6000 
http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

ENVIRONMENT AND CONSERVATION 
EV401* 

CONSERVATION AND LAND MANAGEMENT ACT 1984 
PROPOSED COMMERCIAL TOURISM OPERATIONS, CAPE LE GRAND NATIONAL PARK 

Compatible Operations Notice 
The Department of Environment and Conservation (DEC) invites public submissions on the proposal 
to conduct commercial tourism operations in Cape Le Grand National Park (reserve no. 22795). 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5013 

 



Commercial tourism operations include activities such as bushwalking, 4 wheel drive safari tours, 
camping and accommodation facilities.  
As a management plan does not exist for Cape Le Grand National Park, the Conservation and Land 
Management Act 1984 [Section 33A(3)] requires the Department to notify the public of intentions to 
conduct ‘compatible operations’ (meaning operations compatible with the purpose of a national park) 
and seek public comment on the proposed operations. 
All commercial activities and facilities on DEC-managed lands are licensed or operated under a lease 
issued by the Department following consultation with the vesting body, being the Conservation 
Commission of Western Australia, and approval by the Minister for Environment. 
Pending approval of the proposed compatible operations by the Minister, the Department may call for 
‘Expressions of Interest’ from commercial operators interested in providing low impact eco-tourism 
and eco-accommodation developments, which will increase tourism within the park whilst protecting 
the park’s visual beauty and conservation value. 
For further information and details on how to make a submission, please contact Rod Quartermain of 
DEC on (08) 9334 0562. 
The closing date for submissions is 3pm (WST) on Thursday 11 February 2010. 

KEIRAN McNAMARA, Director General, 
Department of Environment and Conservation. 

FISHERIES 
FI401* 

FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 
WEST COAST DEMERSAL SCALEFISH FISHERY (INTERIM) MANAGEMENT PLAN 

AMENDMENT (NO. 2) 2009 
FD 297/07 [940] 
Made by the Minister under section 54. 

1. Citation 
This instrument is the West Coast Demersal Scalefish Fishery (Interim) Management Plan 
Amendment (No. 2) 2009. 

2. Plan amended 
The amendments in this instrument are to the West Coast Demersal Scalefish (Interim) Management 
Plan 2007 * . 

3. Clause 15 amended 
In clause 15 delete “ 2008 ” and insert instead— 

“ 2009 ”. 

4. Schedule 5 amended 
In the second Table in Schedule 5— 
 (a) in column 2 (Mid-West Area) delete “ 24272 ” and insert instead— 

“ 24398 ” ; and 
 (b) in column 3 (South-West Area) delete “ 5069 ” and insert instead— 

“ 6622 ”. 

5. Schedule 8 amended 
In column 2 of the Table in Schedule 8 delete “ 2009 ” and insert instead— 

“ 2010 ”. 
[*Published in the Gazette of 9 November 2007.] 

Dated this 3rd day of December 2009. 

NORMAN MOORE, Minister for Fisheries. 

5014 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG401* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
Shire of Jerramungup 

APPOINTMENT 
It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Dean Jolly has been appointed Ranger for the 
Shire of Jerramungup effective from the 30th November 2009 for the following purposes— 
 (i)  Dog Act 1976 
 (ii)  Litter Act 1979 
 (iii)  Local Government Act 1995 
 (iv)  Bush Fires Act 1954 
 (v)  Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 
 (vi)  Council Local Laws 
 (vii)  Control of Vehicles (Off Road Vehicle) Act 
 (viii)  Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995 

BILL PARKER, Chief Executive Officer. 
Dated: 1st December 2009. 
 

——————————— 
 
LG402* 

CITY OF KALGOORLIE-BOULDER 
APPOINTMENTS 

The City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder wishes to advise for public information the appointment of Gert 
Bothma as an authorised officer to operate within the City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder to enforce the 
following Acts, Regulations and Local Laws effective immediately— 
  Local Government Act 1995 
  Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 
  Dog Act 1976—For the purpose of Dog Registration Officer, Issuing of Dog Infringement 

Notices, Dog Warning Notices and Notices to Register Dog 
  Litter Act 1979—For the Purpose of issuing Litter Infringements 
  City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder Parking and Parking Facilities Local Law 
  Bush Fires Act 1954 
  Control of Vehicles (Off-road Areas) Act 1978 
  Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act and Regulations 1995 

D. S. BURNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 
LG403* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
Shire of Narrogin 
(BASIS OF RATES) 

Department of Local Government. 
DLG: NO5-4#02 
 It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of 
the Local Government Act 1995, the Director General of the Department of Local Government, under 
delegation from the Hon John Castrilli MLA, Minister for Local Government, being charged for the 
time being with the administration of the Local Government Act 1995, has determined that the 
method of valuing the land described in the Schedule hereunder shall be gross rental value for the 
purposes of rating with effect from 27 November 2009. 

JENNIFER MATHEWS, Director General. 

———— 
Schedule 

ADDITIONS TO GROSS RENTAL VALUE AREA 
SHIRE OF NARROGIN 

All those portions of land being Lots 19 to 23 inclusive as shown on Deposited Plan 33638. 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5015 

 



LG404* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Denmark 
(BASIS OF RATES) 

Department of Local Government. 
DLG: DE5-4#04 
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the 
Local Government Act 1995, the Executive Director Governance and Legislation of the Department of 
Local Government under delegation from the Hon John Castrilli MLA, Minister for Local 
Government, being charged for the time being with the administration of the Local Government 
Act 1995, has determined that the method of valuing the land described in the schedule hereunder 
shall be changed back to gross rental value for the purposes of rating with effect from 3 December 
2009. 

BRAD JOLLY, Executive Director Governance and Legislation. 

———— 
Schedule 

ADDITION TO GROSS RENTAL VALUE AREA 
SHIRE OF DENMARK 

All that portion of land being Lot 9000 as shown on Deposited Plan 61016. 

MARINE/MARITIME 
MX401* 

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 
CLOSED WATERS TO PERSONAL WATER CRAFT 

Moore River 
Shire of Gingin 

Department of Transport, 
Fremantle WA, 08 December 2009. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, the 
Department of Transport hereby closes the following waters to navigation by all Personal Water 
Craft.  

MOORE RIVER: All waters of the Moore River. 
DAVID HARROD FNI, General Manager, Marine Safety, 

Department of Transport. 

 
——————————— 

 
MX402* 

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 
CLOSURE OF NAVIGABLE WATERS 

Motorised Vessels 
Moore River 

Shire of Gingin 
Department of Transport, 

Fremantle WA, 08 December 2009. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, 
the Department of Transport hereby closes the following waters to navigation by all Motorised 
Vessels. 

MOORE RIVER: All waters of the Moore River within the following areas— 
 (i)  The mouth of the river, west of a line between 31°21.136’S, 115°30.038’E (on the 

southern bank) and 31°21.046’S, 115°30.038’E (on the northern bank adjacent the 
Guilderton Caravan Park); 

 (ii)  Silver Creek, north of a line between 31°21.020’S, 115°30.508’E (on the western side of 
the entrance to the creek) and 31°21.039’S, 115°30.715’E (on the eastern side of the 
entrance to the creek);  

5016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



 (iii)  The western side of Diamond Island south-west of a line between 31°20.914’S, 
115°31.765’E (on the southern bank of the river) and 31°20.948’S, 115°31.816’E (on the 
northern tip of the island) and west of a line between 31°21.077’S, 115°31.870’E (on the 
southern tip of the island) and 31°21.126’S, 115°31.852’E (on the southern bank OF 
THE RIVER). ALL COORDINATES BASED ON GDA94. 

DAVID HARROD FNI, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department of Transport. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 
MP401* 

PETROLEUM AND GEOTHERMAL ENERGY RESOURCES ACT 1967 
GRANT OF EXPLORATION PERMIT 

Exploration Permit No. EP 467 has been granted to ERM Gas Pty Ltd to have effect for a period of six 
(6) years from and including 1 December 2009. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Executive Director, 
Petroleum and Environment Division. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MP402* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

OFFSHORE PETROLEUM AND GREENHOUSE GAS STORAGE ACT 2006 
RENEWAL OF RETENTION LEASE WA-33-R (R1) 

Renewal of Retention Lease WA-33-R (R1) has been granted to Apache Oil Australia Pty Ltd, Tap 
(Shelfal) Pty Ltd, Santos (BOL) Pty Ltd, WM Petroleum Limited and Pan Pacific Petroleum (South 
Aust) Pty Ltd to have effect from and including 30 November 2009 for a period of five years. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Executive Director, 
Petroleum and Environment Division. 

PLANNING 
PI402* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

City of Albany 
Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 286 

Ref: 853/5/4/5 Pt 286 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the City of Albany local planning 
scheme amendment on 11 November 2009 for the purpose of— 
 1. Removing Lots 101 & 102 Kitson Street, Gledhow, Albany from the ‘Public Purposes’ reserve, 

rezoning the land to the ‘Light Industrial’ zone; and 
 2. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly. 

M. J. EVANS, Mayor. 
P. R. RICHARDS, Chief Executive Officer. 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5017 

 



PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Wanneroo 

District Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 97 
Ref: 853/2/30/19 Pt 97 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the City of Wanneroo local planning 
scheme amendment on 26 November 2009 for the purpose of recoding Lot 26 Brunswick Circuit, 
Banksia Grove from Residential R20 to Residential R40. 

J. KELLY, Mayor. 
D. SIMMS, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
——————————— 

 
PI403* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

City of Mandurah 
Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 91 

Ref: 853/6/13/12 Pt 91 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the City of Mandurah local planning 
scheme amendment on 26 November 2009 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lot 12, No 2580 Old Coast Road, Herron from the ‘Rural’ zone to the ‘Rural-

Residential’ zone. 
 2. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly. 

P. CREEVEY, Mayor. 
M. R. NEWMAN, Chief Executive Officer. 

PUBLIC SERVICE 
PS401* 

PUBLIC SECTOR MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 
EXEMPTION 

In accordance with s.25(1)(a) of the Public Sector Management Act 1994, I partially exempt the 
Department for Child Protection from the Recruitment, Selection and Appointment Standard, for the 
following occupational groups; 
 • Field Workers (SC1); 
 • Senior Field Workers (SC2); 
 • Senior Community Child Protection Workers (SC2); 
 • Clinical and Counselling Psychologists (SC2 and SC3); 
 • Residential Care Officers (Level 2);  and 
 • Senior Residential Care Officer (Metro)/Coordinator Residential Placement (Country) 

(Level 3) 
This exemption applies to the “open and competitive” component of the Recruitment, Selection and 
Appointment Standard until 30 June 2010, unless repealed or amended under s.25(1)(b) of the Public 
Sector Management Act 1994.  
During the period of the partial exemption, all other components of the Recruitment, Selection and 
Appointment Standard and associated procedures pursuant to the Public Sector Management 
(Breaches of Public Sector Standards) Regulations 2005 remain applicable. 
This exemption aims to provide for the Department for Child Protection to continue to consolidate its 
staffing and to source candidates on an ongoing basis in order to attempt to meet staffing needs 
arising from an increase in funding.  
The exemption is applicable to the abovementioned occupational groups only and cannot be used for 
any other groups or positions in the department. 

Dr RUTH SHEAN, Commissioner, 
Public Sector Standards. 

Dated: 1 December 2009. 

5018 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



WATER/SEWERAGE 
WA401* 

ECONOMIC REGULATION AUTHORITY ACT 2003 
ECONOMIC REGULATION AUTHORITY (WATER RESOURCE MANAGEMENT AND PLANNING 

CHARGES REFERENCE) NOTICE (NO. 2) 2009 
Given by the Economic Regulation Authority under the Economic Regulation Authority Act 2003 
section 34(1). 

1. Citation  
This notice is the Economic Regulation Authority (Water Resource Management and Planning 
Charges Reference) Notice (No. 2) 2009. 

2. Reference amended 
(1) Under the Economic Regulation Authority Act 2003 section 33 the Treasurer has amended the 
reference for the Inquiry into Water Resource Management and Planning Charges. 
(2) The particulars of the amendment are set out in Schedule 1. 

Schedule 1—Particulars of amendment 
NOTICE FOR THE AMENDMENT TO THE TERMS OF REFERENCE FOR AN INQUIRY 

INTO WATER RESOURCE MANAGEMENT AND PLANNING CHARGES 
I, Troy Buswell, Treasurer, in accordance with section 33 of the Economic Regulation Authority Act 
2003, amend the terms of reference for an Inquiry into Water Resource Management and Planning 
Charges, as set out in the Economic Regulation Authority (Water Resource Management and Planning 
Charges) Notice 2009. 
The amended terms of reference will extend the due date for the final report from 2 January 2010 
(nine months after receiving the Terms of Reference) to 29 October 2010. 

TROY BUSWELL, MLA, Treasurer; Minister for Commerce; 
Science and Innovation; Housing and Works. 

LYNDON ROWE, Chairman, Economic Regulation Authority. 

DECEASED ESTATES 
ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Richard Garfield Moyes, late of 194/490 Pinjarra Road, Furnissdale in the State of Western Australia, 
deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 19 September 2009, are required by the personal 
representative to send particulars of their claims to him/her care of Clement & Co, Lawyers, Unit 2, 
12 Sutton Street, Mandurah by 15 January 2010 after which date the personal representative may 
convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which he/she then has notice. 

CLEMENT & CO, as solicitors for the personal representative. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5019 

 



 

 
NEW EDITION AVAILABLE ! ! ! 

 

 
 

The Western Australian 
PARLIAMENTARY HANDBOOK 

 
 

TWENTY-SECOND EDITION 
(2009) 

 
 

DAVID BLACK (Editor) 
 

Detailed with comprehensive biographical information  
and photographs, this publication is highly recommended  
for those with an interest in the individuals and history 

 that form the Western Australian Parliament. 
 

Cost: $25.00 
 

For further information please contact— 
STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
Telephone: (08) 9426 0000 
Facsimile: (08) 9321 7536 

Email: sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 
 

 

5020 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 


