
!201100103GG! 

 

  2333 
  
 
 
 
 
 

 

 PERTH, WEDNESDAY, 22 JUNE 2011 No. 103 SPECIAL 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.45 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

Associations Incorporation Act 1987 

Associations Incorporation 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2011 

——————————— 

Chattel Securities Act 1987 

Chattel Securities Amendment 
Regulations 2011 

——————————— 

Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943 

Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) 
Regulations 2011 

——————————— 

Debt Collectors Licensing Act 1964 

Debt Collectors Licensing 
Amendment Regulations 2011 

——————————— 

Employment Agents Act 1976 

Employment Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2011 

——————————— 

Co-operatives Act 2009 

Co-operatives Amendment 
Regulations 2011 

 

Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973 

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) 
Amendment Regulations 2011 

——————————— 

Limited Partnerships Act 1909 

Limited Partnerships Amendment 
Rules 2011 

——————————— 

Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978 

Land Valuers Licensing Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2011 

——————————— 

Settlement Agents Act 1981 

Settlement Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2011 

——————————— 

Real Estate and Business Agents 
Act 1978 

Real Estate and Business Agents 
(General) Amendment 

Regulations 2011 

——————————— 

Motor Vehicle Repairers Act 2003 

Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2011 

 





22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2335 

 
   
 

 
Associations Incorporation Act 1987 

Associations Incorporation Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Associations Incorporation 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Associations Incorporation 
Regulations 1988. 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  In Schedule 2 amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out 
in the Table. 



2336 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Associations Incorporation Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 2 it. 1 $37.75 $39.75 

Sch. 2 it. 2 $126.00 $132.00 

Sch. 2 it. 4 $21.00 
(each occurrence) 

$22.10 

Sch. 2 it. 5 $37.75 $39.75 

Sch. 2 it. 6 $35.00 $36.75 

Sch. 2 it. 7 $37.75 $39.75 

Sch. 2 it. 8 $7.25 $7.60 

Sch. 2 it. 9(a) $1.50 $1.60 

Sch. 2 it. 9(b)(i) $7.90 $8.30 

Sch. 2 it. 9(b)(ii) $1.60 $1.70 

Sch. 2 it. 10 $29.50 $31.00 

Sch. 2 it. 11(a) $11.60 $12.20 

Sch. 2 it. 11(b) $1.50 $1.60 

Sch. 2 it. 12 $11.60 $12.20 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2337 

 
   
 

 
Chattel Securities Act 1987 

Chattel Securities Amendment Regulations 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Chattel Securities Amendment 
Regulations 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Chattel Securities 
Regulations 1988. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 1 it. 1(a)  $7.00 $5.50 

Sch. 1 it. 1(b) $8.00 $6.20 



2338 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Chattel Securities Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 1 it. 2 $2.00 $1.50 

Sch. 1 it. 3 $5.00 $3.85 

Sch. 1 it. 4 $3.50 $2.80 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2339 

 
   
 

 
 

Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943 

Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) 
Regulations 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council under section 409(3) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) 
Regulations 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Act amended 

  These regulations amend the Companies (Co-operative) 
Act 1943. 



2340 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

4. Tenth Schedule replaced 

  Delete the Tenth Schedule and insert: 
 

Tenth Schedule — Fees to be paid to the Registrar 

[s. 409(3)] 

Item Matter Fee ($) 

1. On submission of the memorandum of a company ........... 288.00 

2. For the registration of a company .................................. 288.00 

3. For every authorisation by the Governor under the 
provisos to section 28(7) ......................................................

 
77.00 

4. For every approval of the Registrar to the change of name 
of a company ........................................................................ 

 
77.00 

5. On lodgment of request to the Registrar to exercise the 
powers conferred by section 297, 299 or 300 (Application 
fee) ........................................................................................ 

 
 

40.20 

6. For every act done by the Registrar as representing a 
defunct company under section 297, 299 or 300 
(Application fee) .................................................................. 

 
 

77.00 

7. On late lodgment, registration or filing of any 
document under this Act, in addition to any other 
fee — 

(a) if lodged, registered or filed within one month 
after the period prescribed by law ........................... 

(b) if lodged, registered or filed more than one month 
after the period prescribed by law, in addition to 
the fee payable in paragraph (a) ............................... 

The Registrar, if satisfied that just cause existed for the 
late lodgment, may waive in whole or in part the 
additional fee under paragraph (b). 

 
 
 

 
14.70 

 
 

44.00 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2341 

Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) Regulations 2011 
 
 

r. 4 

 

 
   
 

Item Matter Fee ($) 

8. For every application for the reservation of a name ........... 26.00 

9. For every application for extending the time of such 
reservation ............................................................................ 

 
26.00 

10. On filing any statement in lieu of prospectus ..................... 37.25 

11. On filing any prospectus .................................................... 639.00 

12. On filing an annual return of a company ......................... 83.00 

13. For every application for the consent of the Minister 
under section 46(3a)(a) ...................................................... 

 
77.00 

14. For every application for the consent of the Minister 
under section 173(2) ...........................................................

 
77.00 

15. For every application for exemption from the 
provisions of section 369(1) .............................................. 

 
77.00 

16. On lodging any other application ..................................... 26.00 

17. For every certificate issued by the Registrar ................. 9.75 

18. For every inquiry as to the availability of any name 
sought to be adopted by a company — for every name 
the subject of the inquiry ................................................... 

 
 

9.05 

19. For production at the Office of State Revenue of 
documents lodged by or in relation to a company ......... 

 
14.20 

20. (a) For every inspection of a document or documents 
filed or lodged with the Registrar by or in relation 
to a company or of any transparency or 
reproduction of such document or documents ...... 

 
 
 

8.00 



2342 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

Item Matter Fee ($) 

 (b) For the supply of an uncertified copy or print of 
any document where the fee prescribed by 
paragraph (a) has been paid — for each page of 
the copy or print ......................................................... 

(c) For the supply of an uncertified copy or print of a 
document without inspection having been 
made — 

 For the first 2 pages of the copy or print ............. 

 For each additional page ......................................... 

(d) For every inspection of any document filed or 
lodged with the Registrar not being an inspection 
in respect of which paragraph (a) applies .............. 

(e) For every written inquiry involving a search for 
any document filed or lodged by or in relation to 
a company .............................................................. 

(f) For the supply of an uncertified copy or print of a 
document where the fee prescribed by 
paragraph (e) has been paid — for each page of 
the copy or print .................................................... 

 
 
 

1.40 

 
 
 

5.50 

1.40 

 
 

2.45 

 
 

10.20 

 
 
 

1.25 

21. (a) For certifying a copy of or extract from any 
document filed or lodged with the Registrar of 
which a typewritten or printed copy is supplied by 
an applicant —  

 For one page ........................................................ 

 For each additional page ...................................... 

(b) For the supply of a certified copy or print of any 
document filed or lodged with the Registrar —  

 For one page ........................................................ 

 For each additional page ...................................... 

 
 
 
 

6.30 

2.55 

 
 

9.05 

5.10 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2343 

Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) Regulations 2011 
 
 

r. 4 

 

 
   
 

Item Matter Fee ($) 

22. For the deposit of any book or document under 
section 288 (provided that the total fees to be paid by a 
liquidator under section 288 in respect of any one 
company shall not exceed $10.00) .................................

 
 
 

3.95 

 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

 

 
——————————— 

 





22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2345 

 
   
 

 
 

Debt Collectors Licensing Act 1964 

Debt Collectors Licensing Amendment 
Regulations 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Debt Collectors Licensing Amendment 
Regulations 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Debt Collectors Licensing 
Regulations 1964. 



2346 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Debt Collectors Licensing Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

4. Regulation 4 replaced 

  Delete regulation 4 and insert: 
 

4. Fees 

  The following fees are payable for the matters 
specified —  

 $ 

For the issue or renewal of a licence .............. 515.00 

For the transfer of a licence ............................ 290.00 

For a duplicate licence .................................... 31.75 

For an inspection of the register kept under 
section 12 of the Act .......................................

 
10.50 

 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

 
——————————— 

 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2347 

 
   
 

 
 

Employment Agents Act 1976 

Employment Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Employment Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Employment Agents 
Regulations 1976. 



2348 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Employment Agents Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

4. Regulation 10 amended 

  In regulation 10(1) delete the Table and insert: 
 

Table 

 $ 

Grant of general licence for period not exceeding 
prescribed period 

 
1 450.00 

Renewal of general licence for period not 
exceeding prescribed period 

 
1 080.00 

Grant of restricted licence for period not 
exceeding prescribed period 

 
1 450.00 

Renewal of restricted licence for period not 
exceeding prescribed period 

 
1 080.00 

Renewal of general or restricted licence for period 
of 3 years 

 
1 080.00 

Application for interim licence 33.50 

Duplicate licence 57.00 

Application for transfer of licence under 
section 19(6) of the Act  

 
66.50 

Inspection of record under section 51 of the Act 13.00 

Inspection of Register  25.50 

Copy (certified or uncertified) of individual 
registration in Register —  

 first page 

 each subsequent page 

 
 

25.50 

5.00 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2349 

Employment Agents Amendment Regulations 2011 
 
 

r. 4 

 

 
   
 

 $ 

Copy (certified or uncertified) of all registrations 
in Register  

 
335.00 

 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

 

 

 
——————————— 

 





22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2351 

 
   
 

 
Co-operatives Act 2009 

Co-operatives Amendment Regulations 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Co-operatives Amendment 
Regulations 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Co-operatives Regulations 2010. 

4. Schedule 10 clause 1 amended 

  In Schedule 10 clause 1 delete the Table and insert: 
 

Table of Fees 

No. Item giving rise to a fee Fee 

$ 

1 Submission of proposed disclosure statement for 
approval under sections 16, 146, 186, 251, 252, 
255, 300 or 392 of the Act ....................................... 

 
 

283.00 



2352 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Co-operatives Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

No. Item giving rise to a fee Fee 

$ 

2 Application for exemption under sections 139 or 
296 of the Act .......................................................... 

 
283.00 

3 Submission of proposed rules for approval under 
section 17 of the Act ................................................ 

 
139.00 

4 Decision on registration applications under 
sections 18, 23, 182 or 448 of the Act ..................... 

 
139.00 

5 Duplicate certificate issued under section 34 of the 
Act ........................................................................... 

 
35.00 

6 Uncertified copy of rules under section 99(2) or an 
uncertified extract or copy of a document under 
section 457 of the Act —  

(a) for the first page ............................................ 

(b) for each additional page ................................ 

up to a maximum of $86.60. 

 
 
 

11.90 

1.55 

 

7 Submission of proposed alteration of rules for 
approval under section 103 of the Act— 

(a) for each rule to be altered .............................. 

(b) maximum fee ................................................. 

 
 

13.90 
139.00 

8 Application for registration of alteration of rules 
under section 106 of the Act .................................... 

 
35.00 

9 Review of right of member to vote under 
section 171 ............................................................... 

 
139.00 

10 Filing fee for lodgment of special resolution under 
section 181 ............................................................... 

 
35.00 

11 Application under section 231(1)(d) of the Act to 
keep register at an office approved by  
the Registrar ............................................................. 

 
 

35.00 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2353 

Co-operatives Amendment Regulations 2011 
 
 

r. 4 

 

 
   
 

No. Item giving rise to a fee Fee 

$ 

12 Giving notice of appointment or cessation of 
appointment of a person as director, chief 
executive officer or secretary under section 234 of 
the Act ......................................................................

 
 
 

Nil* 

13 Filing annual report under section 235 of the Act ... 35.00* 

14 Approval of the registration of a name as 
mentioned in section 238(4) of the Act ................... 

 
72.00 

15 Providing written notice of a new address under 
section 243(3) .......................................................... 

 
Nil* 

16 Registrar’s statement of maximum permissible 
level of share interest as mentioned in 
section 278(2) of the Act ......................................... 

 
 

283.00 

17 Approval of resolution by the Registrar as 
mentioned in section 278(5) of the Act ................... 

 
139.00 

18 Application for extension of time as mentioned in 
section 292(5) of the Act ......................................... 

 
70.00 

19 Application for Registrar’s consent as mentioned in 
sections 299(2) or 391(3) of the Act or Schedule 7 
clause 3(5) to these regulations ............................... 

 
 

72.00 

20 Application for approval of a merger or transfer of 
engagement under section 302, 303, 394 or 395 of 
the Act ......................................................................

 
 

283.00 

21 Approval of an explanatory statement under 
section 350(1) of the Act ......................................... 

 
695.00 

22 Filing office copy of order under section 352(5) of 
the Act ......................................................................

 
Nil* 

23 Foreign co-operative lodging notification of 
intention to carry on business as mentioned in 
section 372 of the Act .............................................. 

 
 

Nil* 



2354 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Co-operatives Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

No. Item giving rise to a fee Fee 

$ 

24 Filing particulars of change concerning foreign 
co-operative under section 382 of the Act ............... 

 
Nil* 

25 Giving notice of cessation under section 383 of the 
Act ........................................................................... 

 
Nil* 

26 Application to have the Registrar call a special 
meeting or hold, or appoint an inspector to hold, an 
inquiry under section 444 of the Act ....................... 

 
 

283.00 

27 Application for the Registrar to grant an extension 
of, or to abridge time under section 449 of the Act . 

 
70.00 

28 Inspection of register or prescribed documents 
under section 457(1)(a) or (1)(b) of the Act ............ 

 
13.90 

29 Certified copy of a document under 
section 457(1)(d) of the Act —  

(a) for the first page ............................................ 

(b) for each additional page ................................ 

 
 

26.25 

2.70 

30 Application for permission to give notice by 
newspaper under section 484(2)(f) .......................... 

 
70.00 

31 Filing a notice under Schedule 3 clause 13(1), 
17(1), 36(1) or 36(2) to the Act ............................... 

 
35.00 

32 Application for the Registrar to allow a further 
period under Schedule 3 clause 20(3)(c) to the Act  

 
70.00 

33 Lodging a memorandum of discharge under 
Schedule 3 clause 37(2) to the Act .......................... 

 
35.00 

34 Lodging a managing controller’s report under 
Schedule 4 clause 12(2) to the Act .......................... 

 
Nil* 

35 Inspection of managing controller’s report under 
Schedule 4 clause 12(3)(b) to the Act ..................... 

 
13.90 

36 Lodging receiver’s report under Schedule 4 
clause 13(1)(c) to the Act ........................................ 

 
Nil* 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2355 

Co-operatives Amendment Regulations 2011 
 
 

r. 4 

 

 
   
 

No. Item giving rise to a fee Fee 

$ 

37 Lodging notice of obtaining an order for the 
appointment of a receiver under Schedule 4 
clause 18(1)(a) to the Act ........................................ 

 
 

Nil* 

38 Lodging notice of the appointment of a controller 
under Schedule 4 clause 18(2)(a) to the Act ............

 
Nil* 

39 Lodging notice that a person has entered into 
possession or taken control of property of a 
co-operative under Schedule 4 clause 18(3) to the 
Act ........................................................................... 

 
 
 

Nil* 

40 Lodging a notice of change in the situation of the 
controller’s office under Schedule 4 clause 18(5) to 
the Act ......................................................................

 
 

Nil* 

41 Lodging notice of cessation as controller under 
Schedule 4 clause 18(6) to the Act .......................... 

 
Nil* 

42 Lodging copy of report of the reporting officers’ 
under Schedule 4 clause 20(2)(c) of to the Act ....... 

 
Nil* 

43 Lodging copy of extension notice given by 
controller under Schedule 4 clause 20(4) to the Act 

 
Nil* 

44 Lodging copy of court order granting extension 
under Schedule 4 clause 20(5) to the Act ................ 

 
Nil* 

45 Lodging copy of controller’s account under 
Schedule 4 clause 23(1) to the Act .......................... 

 
Nil* 

46 Lodging of half year reports under section 320 of 
the Corporations Act as applied by section 225 of 
the Act ......................................................................

 
 

Nil* 

47 Lodging a disclosure document under section 718 
of the Corporations Act as applied by section 250 
of the Act ................................................................. 

 
 

2085.00 



2356 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Co-operatives Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

No. Item giving rise to a fee Fee 

$ 

48 Lodging a supplementary or replacement 
disclosure document under section 719 of the 
Corporations Act as applied by section 250 of the 
Act ........................................................................... 

 
 
 

Nil* 

49 Application for the Registrar to exercise the 
powers conferred by sections 601AE(2) or 601AF 
of the Corporations Act as applied by section 316 
of the Act ................................................................. 

 
 
 

283.00 

50 Lodging any other document under the 
Corporations Act as applied by the Act ................... 

 
Nil* 

51 Applications for exemption under section 111AS, 
111AT, 283GA, 741, 742 or 1045A of the 
Corporations Act as applied by section 250 of the 
Act ........................................................................... 

 
 
 

283.00 

52 Lodging documents or making applications for the 
registrar to exercise a power or do something under 
the Act for which no other fee is prescribed ............ 

 
 

35.00 
 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2357 

 
   
 

 
 

Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973 

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) 
Amendment Regulations 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) 
Regulations 1974. 



2358 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

4. Third Schedule amended 

  In the Third Schedule delete the Table and insert: 
 

Table 

Item Description $ 

1. Application for a dealer’s licence or renewal 
of a dealer’s licence for the period prescribed 
by regulation 6A — 

 

 (a) if the dealer only specifies single 
premises to be authorised under 
section 20E(5) in relation to the licence ...

 
 

1 512.00 

 (b) if the dealer specifies 2 or more 
premises to be authorised under 
section 20E(5) ..........................................

 
 

756.00 

 plus, in respect of each further premises to be 
authorised under section 20E(5) in relation to 
the licence, a further .........................................

 
 

756.00 

2. Application under section 20F in respect of 
alteration of premises ........................................

 
125.00 

3. Application under section 20F in respect of 
each added premises .........................................

 
756.00 

4. Application for a temporary permit under 
section 20H .......................................................

 
50.20 

5. Application for yard manager’s licence or 
renewal of yard manager’s licence for the 
period prescribed by regulation 6A ..................

 
 

385.00 

6. Application for salesperson’s licence or 
renewal of salesperson’s licence for the 
period prescribed by regulation 6A ..................

 
 

261.00 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2359 

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment Regulations 2011 
 
 

r. 4 

 

 
   
 

Item Description $ 

7. Application for car market operator’s 
registration or renewal of car market 
operator’s registration — 

 

 (a) if the operator only specifies single 
premises to be authorised under 
section 21A(5) in relation to the 
registration ................................................

 
 
 

1 512.00 

 (b) if the operator specifies 2 or more 
premises to be authorised under 
section 21A(5) in relation to the 
registration ................................................

 
 
 

756.00 

 plus, in respect of each further premises to be 
authorised under section 21A(5) in relation to 
the registration, a further ..................................

 
 

756.00 

8. Application under section 21B in respect of 
alteration of premises ........................................

 
125.00 

9. Application under section 21B in respect of 
each added premises .........................................

 
756.00 

10. Application for certificate of exemption from 
the Act under section 31(1) ..............................

 
125.00 

11. Application for temporary authorisation 
under section 16(2) or 17(2) .............................

 
50.20 

12. Individual dealer — change to firm .................. 125.00 

13. Individual dealer — change to body 
corporate ...........................................................

 
125.00 

14. Firm — change to sole proprietor ..................... 125.00 



2360 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

Item Description $ 

15. Firm — change to body corporate .................... 125.00 

16. Body corporate change to individual or firm .... 125.00 

17. Duplicate licence .............................................. 40.40 

18. Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract 
of an individual registration in the register 
kept under section 24 — 

 

 first page ........................................................... 18.30 

 each subsequent page ........................................ 3.60 

19. Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract 
of all registrations in the register kept under 
section 24 ..........................................................

 
 

232.00 

20. Inspection of register kept under section 24 ..... 18.30 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2361 

 
   
 

 
 

Limited Partnerships Act 1909 

Limited Partnerships Amendment Rules 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Limited Partnerships Amendment 
Rules 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These rules come into operation as follows — 

 (a) rules 1 and 2 — on the day on which these rules are 
published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the rules — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Rules amended 

  These rules amend the Limited Partnerships Rules 1909. 



2362 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Limited Partnerships Amendment Rules 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

4. Rule 3 amended 

  In rule 3 delete the Table and insert: 
 

Table 

1. Registration of limited partnership $174.00 

2. Inspection of statements filed by 
Registrar 

$4.50 

3. Certificate of registration $11.90 

4. Certified copy of, or extract from, a 
registered statement 

$4.50 per 
folio of  

72 words 

 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

 
——————————— 

 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2363 

 
   
 

 
 

Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978 

Land Valuers Licensing Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Land Valuers Licensing Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Land Valuers Licensing 
Regulations 1979. 



2364 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Land Valuers Licensing Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Fees 
[r. 4 and 5A] 

Table 

Item Description of fee  $ 

1. Grant of licence (for 3 years) 723.00 

2. Renewal of licence (for 3 years) 723.00 

3. Issue of duplicate licence 31.75 

4. Inspection of register 10.50 

5. Certificate as to an individual registration in 
register —  

first page 

each subsequent page 

 
 

10.50 

2.00 

6. Certificate as to all registrations in register 129.00 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2365 

 
   
 

 
 

Settlement Agents Act 1981 

Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Settlement Agents Amendment 
Regulations 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Settlement Agents 
Regulations 1982. 



2366 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 
 

Schedule 1 — Fees 
[r. 4 and 4A] 

Item Type of fee Fee 

1. Grant of licence (including a triennial certificate) to a 
natural person .......................................................................

 
$688.00 

2. Grant of licence (including a triennial certificate) to 
a firm ....................................................................................

 
$900.00 

3. Grant of licence (including a triennial certificate) to a 
body corporate ......................................................................

 
$900.00 

4. Renewal of triennial certificate ............................................. $442.00 

5. Inspection of register ............................................................ $10.30 

6. Certificate as to an individual registration —  

 first page ..........................................................................

 each subsequent page ......................................................

 

$20.60 

$2.05 

7. Certificate as to all registrations in register .......................... $147.00 

8. For the purposes of section 30(3a) (the holding fee) ............ $208.00 

 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2367 

 
   
 

 
 

Real Estate and Business Agents Act 1978 

Real Estate and Business Agents (General) 
Amendment Regulations 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Real Estate and Business Agents 
(General) Amendment Regulations 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Real Estate and Business Agents 
(General) Regulations 1979. 



2368 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Real Estate and Business Agents (General) Amendment Regulations 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 1 it. 1 $64.00 $65.50 

Sch. 1 it. 2 $668.00 $688.00 

Sch. 1 it. 3 $874.00 $900.00 

Sch. 1 it. 4 $874.00 $900.00 

Sch. 1 it. 5 $430.00 $442.00 

Sch. 1 it. 6 $172.00 $177.00 

Sch. 1 it. 7 $141.00 $145.00 

Sch. 1 it. 8 $10.00 $10.30 

Sch. 1 it. 9 $20.00 

$2.00 

$20.60 

$2.05 

Sch. 1 it. 10 $296.00 $304.00 

Sch. 1 it. 11 $202.00 $208.00 

 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2369 

 
   
 

 
 

Motor Vehicle Repairers Act 2003 

Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2011 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows —  

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2011. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Motor Vehicle Repairers 
Regulations 2007. 



2370 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2011 
  
  
r. 4 

 

 
   
  

4. Regulation 7A amended 

 (1) In regulation 7A(1): 

 (a) in paragraph (a)(i) delete “$150; and” and insert: 
 

  $155; and 
 

 (b) in paragraph (c)(i) delete “$150; and” and insert: 
 

  $155; and 
 

 (2) In regulation 7A(6) delete the Table and insert: 
 

Table 

Item Number of repairers $ 

1. 1 to 2 649 

2. 3 906 

3. 4 1 132 

4. 5 to 7 1 647 

5. 8 to 10 2 098 

6. 11 or more 2 645 

 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2371 

Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2011 
 
 

r. 5 

 

 
   
 

5. Regulation 7C amended 

  In regulation 7C delete “$37.25.” and insert: 
 

  $38.25. 
 

6. Regulation 7F amended 

 (1) In regulation 7F(1)(a) delete “$150; and” and insert: 
 

  $155; and 
 

 (2) In regulation 7F(2) delete the Table and insert: 
 

Table 

Item Number of repairers $ 

1. 1 to 2 649 

2. 3 906 

3. 4 1 132 

4. 5 to 7 1 647 

5. 8 to 10 2 098 

6. 11 or more 2 645 

 



2372 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2011 

Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2011 
  
  
r. 7 

 

 
   
  

7. Regulation 7 amended 

  In regulation 7 delete “$70.00.” and insert: 
 

  $72. 
 

8. Regulation 10 amended 

  In regulation 10: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$17.50;” and insert: 
 

  $18; 
 

 (b) in paragraph (b)(i) delete “$17.50” and insert: 
 

  $18 
 

 (c) in paragraph (b)(i) delete “$3.50” and insert: 
 

  $3.60 
 

 (d) in paragraph (b)(ii) delete “$222.” and insert: 
 

  $228. 
 

9. Regulation 11 amended 

  In regulation 11 delete “$38.50.” and insert: 
 

  $39.50. 
 



22 June 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2373 

Motor Vehicle Repairers Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2011 
 
 

r. 10 

 

 
   
 

10. Regulation 12 amended 

  In regulation 12(2): 

 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$58” and insert: 
 

  $59.50 
 

 (b) in paragraph (b) delete “$116” and insert: 
 

  $119 
 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

G. MOORE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

 
——————————— 

 

 


