20131816 6

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN

azette

ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

PERTH, TUESDAY, 8 OCTOBER 2013 No. 181

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 12.00 NOON
© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

CONTENTS

PART 1

Page
Education Service Providers (Full Fee Overseas Students) Registration Amendment

Regulations 2018 . ...ttt e e e e e ettt e e e e e ettt e e e e e e e aaraaeeaeeee s nnrbaraaeeeeannnnes 4591

PART 2
| D0 01y PP PUPPR 4593
L =T 1 o DU SUR P 4593
L0CAl GOVEITIMIENE ...eiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiee ettt e e e ettt e e e e e e eettta e e e e e e eeetatbaeeaeeeeeennsssaseeasesannnnes 4594
g P20 0B a1 oV USRI 4596
Premier and Cabinet..........civieiiiiiiii et e et ee e e e e et e e e e e e eaaaraaaeaeeeennarraaeas 4597
Racing, Gaming and LIQUOT..........cccuviiiiiiiiiiiiieiiee ettt e e e et e e e e e eeenaaaeeeaeeeeennnes 4597
Salaries and Allowances Tribunal .........cccccoooviiiiiiiieiiieee e e ee e e eas 4598

WALET/SEWETAZE ....vvveieeiieiiiiieiee e eerciite e e e e e sttt e e e e e e ssatareeeeeeesestasaeeeaeesassssssaaeaeesassssssaseaessasssnses 4599



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE

© State of Western Australia

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer,
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS

The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or
unforeseen circumstances.

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published
periodically.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).

Delivery address:

State Law Publisher

Ground Floor,

10 William St. Perth, 6000

Telephone: 6552 6000 Fax: 9321 7536
Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 6552 6010.
Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2013 (Prices include GST).

Deceased Estate notices (per estate)—$29.30

Articles in Public Notices Section—$68.00 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices—
Per Column Centimetre—$13.60
Bulk Notices—$249.00 per page

Electronic copies of gazette notices sent to clients for lodgement with the Delegated
Legislation Committee—$44.70

Clients who have an account will only be invoiced for charges over $50.

For charges under $50, clients will need to supply credit card details at time of lodging
notice (i.e. a notice under 4cm would not be invoiced).

Clients without an account will need to supply credit card details or pay at time of
lodging the notice.




8 October 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

4591

— PART 1 —

EDUCATION

ED301*

Education Service Providers (Full Fee Overseas Students) Registration
Act 1991

Education Service Providers (Full Fee Overseas
Students) Registration Amendment
Regulations 2013

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Education Service Providers (Full Fee
Overseas Students) Registration Amendment Regulations 2013.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows —

(@) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day.

3. Regulations amended

These regulations amend the Education Service Providers (Full
Fee Overseas Students) Registration Regulations 1992.

4. Schedule 1 amended

(1) In Schedule 1 item 1(c):
(@) delete “$285” and insert:

$300
(b) delete “$710” and insert:

$745



4592 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

8 October 2013

(2) In Schedule 1 item 3:
(@) delete “$285” and insert:

$300
(b) delete “$710” and insert:

$745

By Command of the Governor,

N. HAGLEY, Clerk of the Executive Council.




8 October 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4593

— PART 2 —

ENERGY
EN401*
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004
GRANT OF LICENCE
Notice is given that the following Electricity Integrated Regional Licence has been granted—
Licensee: Alinta Energy Transmission (Roy Hill) Pty Ltd
ACN 159 279 857
Issue Date: 1 October 2013
Address of Licensee: Level 11, 20 Bridge Street
Sydney NSW 2000
Classification: Electricity Integrated Regional Licence (EIRL6)
Term of Licence: Up to and including 1 October 2043
Area Covered: The licence area is the area as set out in plan
ERA-EL- 132(A) in the State of Western Australia.
Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority
4th Floor, Albert Facey House
469 Wellington Street
Perth WA 6000
http://www.erawa.com.au
LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman,
Economic Regulation Authority.
HEALTH
HE401*

HEALTH ACT 1911

PERINATAL AND INFANT MORTALITY COMMITTEE (APPOINTMENT OF PERMANENT MEMBERS)
INSTRUMENT 2013

Made by the Minister under section 340AB(3) of the Act.

1. Citation

This instrument may be cited as the Perinatal and Infant Mortality Committee (Appointment of
Permanent Members) Instrument 2013.

2. Appointment of Member/s

The appointment of Professor John Phillipps Newnham, Dr Andrew Michael Warwyk,
Dr Noel Peter French and Professor Karen Margaret Edmond, as permanent Member/s to the
Perinatal and Infant Mortality Committee, pursuant to section 340AB(3)(a) (b), (¢) and (f)
(respectively) of the Health Act 1911 is approved for a term of three years commencing on the date of
appointment.

Date: 15/9/2013.

Dr KIM HAMES MLA, Deputy Premier,
Minister for Health.



4594 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 October 2013

HE402*
HEALTH ACT 1911
PERINATAL AND INFANT MORTALITY COMMITTEE (APPOINTMENT OF PROVISIONAL MEMBERS)
INSTRUMENT 2013

Made by the Minister under section 340AB(4) of the Act.

1. Citation

This instrument may be cited as the Perinatal and Infant Mortality Committee (Appointment of
Provisional Members) Instrument 2013.

2. Appointment of Member/s

The appointment of Dr Michael Bryant Gannon, Dr Keith Meadows and Louise Lynley Keyes, as
provisional Member/s to the Perinatal and Infant Mortality Committee, pursuant to section
340AB(4)(a) (c) and (d) of the Health Act 1911 respectively is approved for a term of three years
commencing on the date of appointment.

Date: 15/9/2013.

Dr KIM HAMES MLA, Deputy Premier,
Minister for Health.

HE403*
HEALTH ACT 1911

PERINATAL AND INFANT MORTALITY COMMITTEE (APPOINTMENT OF INVESTIGATORS)
INSTRUMENT 2013

Made by the Minister under section 340AB(3) of the Act.

1. Citation

This instrument may be cited as the Perinatal and Infant Mortality Committee (Appointment of
Investigators) Instrument 2013.

2. Appointment of Member/s

The appointment of Dr Patrick John Pemberton and Dr Christine Rosemary Marsack, as
Investigators to the Perinatal and Infant Mortality Committee, pursuant to section 340AJ(1) of the
Health Act 1911 is approved for a term of three years commencing on the date of appointment.

Date: 15/9/2013.

Dr KIM HAMES MLA, Deputy Premier,
Minister for Health.

LocAL GOVERNMENT

LG401*

DOG ACT 1976

Shire of Trayning

APPOINTMENTS
That the following persons be appointed under the provisions of the Dog Act 1976.
Registration Officers—

Tanika McLennan
Belinda Taylor
Denise Kamerling
Evelin Ojaper
Michelle McHugh

Authorised Officers—

George Ward—Shire Ranger
Tanika McLennan

Belinda Taylor

Bill McKenna

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.
TANIKA McLENNAN, Chief Executive Officer.



8 October 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4595

LG402*
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954
Shire of Trayning
APPOINTMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that as of 22nd March 2013 the following persons are
authorised to impose a ban on harvesting and movement of machinery in paddocks—

Chief Fire Control Officer Phillp Sachse
Deputy Chief Fire Control Officer Geoff Waters
Fire Weather Officers—

Tanika McLennan

Belinda Taylor

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.
TANIKA McLENNAN, Chief Executive Officer.

LG403*
CAT ACT 2011
Shire of Trayning
APPOINTMENT
That the following persons be appointed under the provisions of the Cat Act 2011.
Registration Officers—
Tanika McLennan
Belinda Taylor
Denise Kamerling
Evelin Ojaper
Michelle McHugh
Authorised Officers—

George Ward—Shire Ranger
Tanika McLennan

Belinda Taylor

Bill McKenna

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.
TANIKA McLENNAN, Chief Executive Officer.

LG501%*
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954
City of Melville
FIRE BREAK NOTICE
Notice to all owner and / or occupiers of land situated in the City of Melville.

Pursuant to the powers contained in Section 33 of the above Act, you are hereby required on or before
the 15th day of November 2013 or within 14 days of the date of you becoming the owner or occupier,
should this be after the 15th day of November 2013 and thereafter up to and including the 30th day of
April 2014 to clear flammable matter from that land in accordance with the following requirements—

A As to land which is 1,500 square metres or less in area, or which is zoned “residential” to
clear all flammable matter from the whole of the land except living trees, shrubs and plants
under cultivation and lawns.

B As to all other land within the district the owner or occupier shall—

(1) Clear firebreaks of a minimum width of three (3) metres inside all external boundaries
of the land; and

(i1) Clear firebreaks of a minimum width of five (5) metres around all buildings situated on
the land; and

(iii)) Where that area of land exceeds ten (10) hectares, clear firebreaks of a minimum width
of five (5) metres so as to ensure that no area of land within the firebreaks exceeds ten
hectares in land; and

@iv) In any event, clear the firebreaks to the satisfaction of Council’s duly authorised officer.

If for any reason an owner or occupier considers it to be impracticable to clear firebreaks or comply
with other fire protection measures in accordance with this requirement, the owner or occupier may



4596 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 October 2013

apply in writing to the Council’s duly authorised officer no later than 31 October 2013 for an
exemption or partial exemption from compliance with the requirement of this notice.

The penalty for failing to comply with this notice is a fine of not more than $5,000 and a person in
default is also liable, whether prosecuted or not, to pay the cost of performing the work directed in
this notice if it is not carried out by the owner or occupier by the date required by this notice.

SHAYNE SILCOX, Chief Executive Officer.

PLANNING

PL401*
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
Shire of Harvey

Town Planning Scheme No. 1—Amendment No. 102
Ref: TPS/0850
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Harvey local planning
scheme amendment on 16 September 2013 for the purpose of—

1. Inserting the following into Schedule 7 of District Planning Scheme No. 1—

Particulars of

Street Locality Land Only Use Permitted
Old Coast Road, | Lot 4857 The following uses are to be carried out within the ‘Red
Myalup barn’ or in locations as to otherwise preserve the rural

character of the land and its potential to sustain
agricultural production—

e Arts and photography studio for the purpose of
making and selling products;

e Tourist Retail (maximum floorspace of 250m?2
net leasable area);

e Tourist information office;

e Licensed Restaurant;

e Eating House, including the sale of takeaway
food;

Special events, functions and concerts;

Public rest area facilities;

Brewery;

Animal petting enclosures; and

e Tourist Accommodation (subject to preparation

of a Detailed Area Plan in accordance with
Clause 9.14.8).

2. Amending the Scheme Map accordingly to note the Additional Use number.
3. Inserting the following definition into Schedule 13—Interpretations of the Scheme—

Brewery: means breweries, cideries and distilleries licensed as a producer under the
Liquor Control Act 1988 and may be used to sell liquor produced on-site for
consumption on the premises.

T. JACKSON, Shire President.
M. A. PARKER, Chief Executive Officer.

PL402*
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
City of Swan

Local Planning Scheme No. 17—Amendment No. 74
Ref: TPS/0783

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the City of Swan local planning
scheme amendment on 20 August 2013 for the purpose of—

1. Removing the ‘Local Scheme Reserve—Local Road’ designation from part of Lot 800 (No. 224)
Swan Street West, Guildford and zoning this portion ‘Private Clubs and Institutions’.



8 October 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4597

2.

3.

Removing the ‘Local Scheme Reserve—Recreation’ designation from part of Lot 900 (No. 128)
Great Eastern Highway, South Guildford and zoning this portion ‘General Industrial’.

Removing the ‘Local Scheme Reserve—Local Road’ designation from part of Lots 200 (No. 3),
201 (No. 5), and 202 (No. 7) Salvator Street and part of Lots 203 (No. 28) and 204 (No. 30)

Minerva Street, Noranda and zoning these portions ‘Residential’ with a density coding of
‘R 20.

. Rezoning Lots 11 (No. 3), 8 (No. 4), 9 (No 6) and 10 (No. 8) Fin Place, Lots 5 (No. 16), 6 (No.

18), 7 (No. 20) and 12 (No. 22) Freshwater Promenade and Lots 1 (No. 9), 2 (No. 7), 3 (No. 5)
and 4 (No. 3) Tattler Way, Bennett Springs from ‘General Commercial’ to ‘Residential’ with a
density code of ‘R 20’, in addition to designating Fin Place as a ‘Local Scheme Reserve—Local
Road’.

Removing the ‘Local Scheme Reserve—Local Road’ designation from part of Lots 10 and 11
(No. 311) Stirling Crescent, Hazelmere and zoning this portion ‘Industrial Development’.

Removing the ‘Local Scheme Reserve—Local Road’ designation from part of Lot 9009
Marshall Road, Malaga and zoning this portion ‘General Industrial’ and ‘Industrial
Development’ and ‘Additional Use site (AU30).

Amending Clause 11.4.4 by deleting the reference ‘an Outline Development Plan’ and
substitute therein the term ‘a Structure Plan’.

. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

C. ZANNINO, Mayor.
M. J. FOLEY, Chief Executive Officer.

PREMIER AND CABINET

PR401*

INTERPRETATION ACT 1984
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor, in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment—

Hon D. T. Redman MLA to act temporarily in the office of Minister for Regional Development;

Lands; Minister Assisting the Minister for State Development in the absence of the Hon B. J.
Grylls MLA for the period 5 to 13 October 2013 (both dates inclusive).

P. CONRAN, Director General, Department of the Premier and Cabinet.

RACI

NG, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA401*

LIQUOR CONTROL ACT 1988
LIQUOR APPLICATIONS

The following applications received under the Liquor Control Act 1988 (the Act) are required to be
advertised.

Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection process,

should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming and Liquor, 1st Floor, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth,
Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation.
Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for
Objections
APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE
14832 Peter Francis Application for the grant of a Producers 4/11/2013
Scharf and Claire licence in respect of premises situated in
Winifred Scharf Jurien Bay and known as Hill River Mead
14843 C.Y. Tan Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Restaurant 27/10/2013
licence in respect of premises situated in
Morley and known as Eden Cafe
14726 Compass Group Application for the grant of a Tavern 4/11/2013

(Australia) Pty Ltd Restricted licence in respect of premises
situated in South Hedland and known as
Gateway Village




4598 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 October 2013

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for
Objections
APPLICATIONS FOR THE REMOVAL OF A LICENCE
382066 Borden Bowling Application for the removal of a club 20/10/2013

Club Inc restricted licence in respect of premises
situated in Borden to premises also in Borden
and known as Borden Bowling Club

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Act.
Dated 4 October 2013.

B. A. SARGEANT, Director of Liquor Licensing.

SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES TRIBUNAL

SA401*
SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT 1975
DETERMINATION VARIATION
Parliament of Western Australia
Preamble

Section 4(2) of the Salaries and Allowances Act 1975 provides for remuneration to be paid to various
officers of the Parliament including “the person who is the Whip in the Legislative Council or the
Legislative Assembly of a party of at least 7 members other than a party whose leader is the Premier
or the Leader of the Opposition and the first mentioned party in the case of the Whip in the
Legislative Council has 7 members or more in that House or in the case of the Whip in the Legislative
Assembly has 7 or more members in that House”.

This determination provides for the remuneration of the recently appointed National Party Whip in
the Legislative Assembly.

The determination also adds the holder of this new office to the list of office holders who continue to
receive the salary of the office during the care taker period prior to an election—that is, where the
Legislative Assembly is dissolved or expires by the effluxion of time until such time as the office
holder ceases to be a Member by reason of an event other than the dissolution or expiry by the
effluxion of time of the Legislative Assembly or another person is elected or appointed to the office
held by that person.

Determination

The determination of the Salaries and Allowances Tribunal made on the 9th day of August 2013
under sections 6(1)(a), (ab), (b) and 6AA of the Salaries and Allowances Act 1975, as amended from
time to time, is hereby varied by a further determination set out below.

The variation is effective from 13 August 2013.
Remove Part 1 Section 1.3.
Include in Part 1, Section 1.3 the following—

1.3 Where the Legislative Assembly is dissolved or expires by the effluxion of time, a person who
is the Parliamentary Secretary of the Cabinet or immediately before the dissolution or expiry
by the effluxion of time was the Chairman of Committees in the House (Deputy Speaker) or is
the holder of the office of—

1.3.1 Leader of the Opposition in that House;

1.3.2 Leader of a recognised non-Government party (as defined in Section 2 of Part 2 of
this determination);

1.3.3 Deputy Leader of the Opposition in that House;
1.3.4 Government Whip in that House;
1.3.5 Opposition Whip in that House; or

1.3.6 Recognised minor party Whip (as defined in Section 2 of Part 2 of this determination)
in that House;

is entitled to receive the remuneration payable to that office holder by virtue of Section 2 of
Part 2 of this determination until—

1.3.7 that person ceases to be a Member by reason of an event other than the dissolution or
expiry by the effluxion of time of the Legislative Assembly; or

1.3.8 another person is elected or appointed to the office held by that person;
whichever event shall first occur.



8 October 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4599

Include in Part 2, Section 2 the following line to the table—

Additional Total
Remuneration Remuneration

Per cent of Base

Office Held Remuneration

The person who is the Whip in the
Legislative Council or the Legislative
Assembly of a party of at least 7
members other than a party whose
leader is the Premier or the Leader of
the Opposition and the first
mentioned party in the case of the 9%
Whip in the Legislative Council has 7
members or more in that House or in
the case of the Whip in the
Legislative Assembly has 7 or more
members in that House. (referred to
as a “recognised minor party Whip”)

Dated at Perth this 24th day of September 2013.

$13,377 $162,015

W. S. COLEMAN AM, Chairman.
B. J. MOORE, Member.
Salaries and Allowances Tribunal.

WATER/SEWERAGE

WA401*

WATER SERVICES LICENSING ACT 1995
AMENDMENT OF LICENCE
Notice is given that the following water services operating licences have been amended—

Licensee:

Issue Date:
Address of Licensee:

Classification:
Term of Licence:
Area Covered:
Amendment:

Licensee:

Issue Date:
Address of Licensee:

Classification:
Term of Licence:
Area Covered:

Amendment:

Inspection of Licence:

Water Corporation
ABN 28 003 434 917

28 June 1996

PO Box 100
LEEDERVILLE WA 6902

Potable and Non-Potable Water Supply, Sewerage, Irrigation and
Drainage Services (0OL32)

Up to and including 28 June 2021

Licence Area is the area as set out in plans OWR-0A-301, OWR-OA-
302, OWR-0A-181(B), OWR-0A-180(B), OWR-0A-179(B), OWR-
0A-175(C) and OWR-0A-175-1 in the State of Western Australia
Amendment to pressure and flow standards for farmlands

Aquasol Pty Ltd
ABN 75 157 831 411

5 February 2013

82-86 Beringarra Avenue

Malaga WA 6090

Potable and Non-Potable Water Supply and Sewerage Services (0L42)
Up to and including 4 February 2038

Licence Area is the area as set out in plan OWR-0A-304(B) in the
State of Western Australia

Remove the provision of irrigation services and include the provision
of non-potable water supply services

Economic Regulation Authority

4th Floor

Albert Facey House

469 Wellington Street

Perth WA 6000

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, Economic Regulation Authority.




4600 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 October 2013

STATE LAW PUBLISHER
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2014

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2014. Subject to
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year.
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated
otherwise.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE STATUTES

General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, Bound Statutes
unless disrupted by public holidays or Bound volumes are posted during March of
unforseen circumstances. the following year.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically on any day. Within WA
All Gazettes $ Interstate

Within WA Overseas

Interstate 1,109.00 Half Calf Bound Statutes

Bound Volumes of full year 1,351.00
Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE available.
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. Within WA

Within WA ) Interstate
Interstate

Sessional Bills

Bills are posted weekly as they become
HANSARD available.

Hansard is printed and distributed weekly

during parliamentary sessions. Within WA
$ Interstate

Within WA
Interstate 1,264.00

Bound Volumes of Hansard
Within WA
Interstate

CLAIMS FOR MISSING SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State Law
Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the missing
item.

Claims lodged after this period will not be recognised and will attract payment in full.

Please debit my: D Visa Card D Mastercard

Card Number: DDDD DDDD DDDD DDDD

Expiry date of card:.................. Joiiiiiiiiiiiinis



