
!2013200GG! 
 

  4967 

  

 

 

 

 

 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 8 NOVEMBER 2013 No. 200 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 12.00 NOON 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 

ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

 

 

CONTENTS 

 

PART 1 

Page 

Betting Control Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2013............................................................  4972 
Casino Control Amendment Regulations 2013 .........................................................................  4973 
Casino Control (Burswood Island) (Licensing of Employees) Amendment Regulations 2013  4974 
Gaming and Wagering Commission Amendment Regulations 2013 .......................................  4975 
Liquor Control Amendment Regulations (No. 7) 2013 .............................................................  4977 
Port Authorities (Vesting of Property and Description of Port of Bunbury) Order 2013 .......  4970 
Proclamations— 

Community Protection (Offender Reporting) Amendment Act (No. 2) 2012—No. 54 of 
2012 ..................................................................................................................................  4969 

Marine and Harbours Act 1981 ..........................................................................................  4969 
Racing and Wagering Western Australia Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2013 ..................  4980 
Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment Regulations 2013 .....................................................  4981 

 

 

——— 

 

 

PART 2 

 
Consumer Protection .................................................................................................................  4983 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  4992 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  4983 
Local Government ......................................................................................................................  4984 
Minerals and Petroleum ............................................................................................................  4987 
Parliament ..................................................................................................................................  4988 
Planning .....................................................................................................................................  4988 
Salaries and Allowances Tribunal ............................................................................................  4989 
Training ......................................................................................................................................  4989 
Treasury and Finance ................................................................................................................  4991 
Water/Sewerage .........................................................................................................................  4991 
 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 

may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 

Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 

State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 

Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 

unforeseen circumstances. 

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 

periodically. 

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 

 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 

 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 

Delivery address: 

  State Law Publisher 

  Ground Floor, 

  10 William St. Perth, 6000 

  Telephone: 6552 6000  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 6552 6010. 

 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 

original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 

 

 
 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2013 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices (per estate)—$29.30 

Articles in Public Notices Section—$68.00 minimum charge (except items of an 

exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing 

the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices— 

  Per Column Centimetre—$13.60 

  Bulk Notices—$249.00 per page 

Electronic copies of gazette notices sent to clients for lodgement with the Delegated 

Legislation Committee—$44.70 

Clients who have an account will only be invoiced for charges over $50. 

For charges under $50, clients will need to supply credit card details at time of lodging 

notice (i.e. a notice under 4cm would not be invoiced). 

Clients without an account will need to supply credit card details or pay at time of 

lodging the notice. 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4969 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 

AA102* 

COMMUNITY PROTECTION (OFFENDER REPORTING)  
AMENDMENT ACT (No. 2) 2012 

No. 54 of 2012 

PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 

By His Excellency 
Malcolm James McCusker, 

Companion of the Order of Australia, 
Commander of the Royal Victorian Order, 

Queen’s Counsel, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 

M. J. McCUSKER 
Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Governor, acting under the Community Protection (Offender Reporting) 
Amendment Act (No. 2) 2012 section 2(b) and with the advice and consent of the 
Executive Council, fix the day after the day on which this proclamation is published 
in the Government Gazette as the day on which sections 23 to 26, 28 to 33, 34(3) and 
39 to 42 of that Act come into operation. 

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 20 August  2013. 

By Command of the Governor, 

L. HARVEY, Minister for Police. 

 

Note: Under the Community Protection (Offender Reporting) Amendment Regulations 2013 
regulation 2(b), the provisions of those regulations, other than regulations 1 and 2, 
come into operation on the day on which the Community Protection (Offender 
Reporting) Amendment Act (No. 2) 2012 section 33 comes into operation. 

 

——————————— 
 

AA101* 

MARINE AND HARBOURS ACT 1981 

PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 

By His Excellency 
Malcolm James McCusker, 

Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Commander of the Royal Victorian Order, 
Queen’s Counsel, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 

M. J. McCUSKER 
Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Governor, acting under the Marine and Harbours Act 1981 section 9 and with 
the advice and consent of the Executive Council— 

 (a) cancel the proclamation made under the Marine and Harbours Act 1981 
section 9, dated 9 July 2002 and published in the Gazette on 12 July 2002 at 
page 3374; and 

 (b) revest in the Crown the portion of land and harbour bed described in the 
Schedule to that proclamation other than the land and seabed set out in 
Schedule 1 to this proclamation; and 

 (c) vest in The Minister for Transport, constituted under the Marine and 
Harbours Act 1981 section 8(1), the land and seabed set out in Schedule 1 to 
this proclamation, 

with effect on and from the day after the day on which this proclamation is published 
in the Gazette. 



4970 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

Schedule 1—Casuarina Boat Harbour 

The land and seabed comprised in the following— 

 (a) Lot 1035 on Deposited Plan 30623; 

 (b) Lot 1036 on Deposited Plan 30623; 

 (c) Lot 6192 on Deposited Plan 30623; 

 (d) Lots 501 and 503 on the plan (to be Deposited Plan 73513) shown for 
information purposes in Schedule 2, 

being documents held by the Western Australian Land Information Authority 
established by the Land Information Authority Act 2006. 

Schedule 2—Proposed Deposited Plan 73513 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 29 October 2013. 

By Command of the Governor, 

T. BUSWELL, Minister for Transport. 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MA301* 

Port Authorities Act 1999 

Port Authorities (Vesting of Property and 

Description of Port of Bunbury) Order 2013 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under sections 24(1) 

and 26(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Port Authorities (Vesting of Property and 

Description of Port of Bunbury) Order 2013. 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4971 

2. Commencement 

  This order comes into operation as follows — 

 (a) clauses 1 and 2 — on the day on which this order is 

published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the order — on the day after that day. 

3. Term used: Lot 973 

  In this order —  

 Lot 973 means the portion of land that is defined by Lot 973 on 

Deposited Plan 194696 held by the Western Australian Land 

Information Authority established by the Land Information 

Authority Act 2006. 

4. Lot 973 revested in the Crown 

  Lot 973 is withdrawn from the Bunbury Port Authority and is 

revested in the Crown. 

5. Port of Bunbury described 

 (1) The Port of Bunbury consists of all those portions of land and 

seabed shown coloured pink on Statutory Services Plan 20494, 

other than Lot 973. 

 (2) The Statutory Services Plan referred to in subclause (1) is held 

by the Western Australian Land Information Authority 

established by the Land Information Authority Act 2006. 

6. Order revoked 

  The Port Authorities (Description of Port of Bunbury) 

Order 2000 is revoked. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

 

 

 

 

——————————— 
 

 

 

 



4972 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RA301* 

Betting Control Act 1954 

Betting Control Amendment Regulations 

(No. 3) 2013 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Betting Control Amendment 

Regulations (No. 3) 2013. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2014. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Betting Control Regulations 1978. 

4. Various fees amended 

  Amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

r. 17(1)(ab) $66 $67 

r. 17(1)(ac) $334 $337 

r. 17(1)(ad) $71 $72 

r. 17(1)(a) $673 $675 

r. 17(1)(ba) $159 $162 

r. 17(1)(c) $154 $157 

r. 17(1)(f) $621 $633 

r. 17(2) $102 $104 

r. 17(3) $102 $104 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4973 

Provision Delete Insert 

r. 17A(1)(a)(i) $364 $371 

r. 17A(1)(a)(ii) $740 $755 

r. 17A(1)(a)(iii) $1 110 $1 132 

5. Regulation 17B amended 

  In regulation 17B(1): 

 (a) in paragraph (a)(ii) delete “$150 000 —” and insert: 

 

  $155 000 —  

 

 (b) in paragraph (a)(iii) delete “$150 000 —” and insert: 

 

  $155 000 —  

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

——————————— 

 

 
RA302* 

Casino Control Act 1984 

Casino Control Amendment Regulations 2013 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Casino Control Amendment 

Regulations 2013. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2014. 



4974 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Casino Control Regulations 1999. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  In regulation 4 delete “$143.” and insert: 

 

  $145. 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

——————————— 

 

 

RA303* 

Casino Control Act 1984 

Casino Control (Burswood Island) (Licensing of 

Employees) Amendment Regulations 2013 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Casino Control (Burswood Island) 

(Licensing of Employees) Amendment Regulations 2013. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2014. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Casino Control (Burswood Island) 

(Licensing of Employees) Regulations 1985. 

4. Regulation 6 amended 

  In regulation 6 amend the provisions listed in the Table as set 

out in the Table. 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4975 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

r. 6(1)(a) $426 $434 

r. 6(1)(b) $267 $272 

r. 6(1a)(a) $118 $120 

r. 6(1a)(b) $118 $120 

r. 6(2)(a) $308 $314 

r. 6(2)(c) $50 $51 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

——————————— 

 

RA304* 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Act 1987 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Amendment 

Regulations 2013 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Gaming and Wagering Commission 

Amendment Regulations 2013. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2014. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Gaming and Wagering 

Commission Regulations 1988. 



4976 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  In Schedule 1 amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out 

in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 1 it. 3(b) 56 57 

Sch. 1 it. 4(b) 61 62 

Sch. 1 it. 4(c) 107 109 

Sch. 1 it. 5(d)(ii) 71 72 

Sch. 1 it. 5(da) 71 72 

Sch. 1 it. 5(f)(i) 210 214 

Sch. 1 it. 5(f)(ii) 349 356 

Sch. 1 it. 5(f)(iii) 405 406 

Sch. 1 it. 5(g)(i) 143 145 

Sch. 1 it. 5(g)(ii) 210 214 

Sch. 1 it. 6(d)(ii) 107 109 

Sch. 1 it. 6(d)(iii) 205 209 

Sch. 1 it. 6(d)(iv) 421 429 

Sch. 1 it. 6(da) 143 145 

Sch. 1 it. 6(f)(i) 169 172 

Sch. 1 it. 6(f)(ii) 308 314 

Sch. 1 it. 6(f)(iii) 385 392 

Sch. 1 it. 6(g)(i) 113 115 

Sch. 1 it. 6(g)(ii) 169 172 

Sch. 1 it. 7(b) 71 72 

Sch. 1 it. 7(c) 71 72 

Sch. 1 it. 8(a) 143 145 

Sch. 1 it. 8(b) 143 145 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4977 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 1 it. 8(c) 143 145 

Sch. 1 it. 9 231 235 

Sch. 1 it. 10 303 309 

Sch. 1 it. 11 282 287 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

——————————— 

 

RA305* 

Liquor Control Act 1988 

Liquor Control Amendment Regulations 

(No. 7) 2013 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Liquor Control Amendment 

Regulations (No. 7) 2013. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2014. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Liquor Control Regulations 1989. 

4. Regulation 26 amended 

  In regulation 26(1aa): 

 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$257; or” and insert: 

 

  $262; or  



4978 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

 (b) in paragraph (b) delete “$514.” and insert: 

 

  $524. 

 

5. Schedule 3 amended 

  In Schedule 3 amend the provisions listed in the Table as set out 

in the Table. 

Table 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 3 it. 1 3 186 3 250 

Sch. 3 it. 2 822 835 

Sch. 3 it. 3 785 800 

Sch. 3 it. 4 539 550 

Sch. 3 it. 5 267 272 

Sch. 3 it. 6(a) 50 51 

Sch. 3 it. 6(b) 103 105 

Sch. 3 it. 6(c) 210 214 

Sch. 3 it. 6(d) 1 050 1 055 

Sch. 3 it. 6(e) 2 100 2 142 

Sch. 3 it. 6(f) 4 205 4 290 

Sch. 3 it. 7(a)(i) 50 51 

Sch. 3 it. 7(a)(ii) 431 439 

Sch. 3 it. 7(b) 323 329 

Sch. 3 it. 7(c) 1 079 1 100 

Sch. 3 it. 8(a) 103 105 

Sch. 3 it. 8(b) 210 214 

Sch. 3 it. 8(c) 1 050 1 071 

Sch. 3 it. 8(d) 2 100 2 142 

Sch. 3 it. 8(e) 4 205 4 290 

Sch. 3 it. 9A 40 41 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4979 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 3 it. 9(a) 165 168 

Sch. 3 it. 9(b) 55 56 

Sch. 3 it. 10A(a) 160 163 

Sch. 3 it. 10A(b) 120 122 

Sch. 3 it. 10B(a)(i) 70 71 

Sch. 3 it. 10B(b)(i) 115 117 

Sch. 3 it. 10B(b)(ii) 75 76 

Sch. 3 it. 10B(c)(i) 160 163 

Sch. 3 it. 10B(c)(ii) 120 122 

Sch. 3 it. 10C(a) 50 51 

Sch. 3 it. 10(a) 149 152 

Sch. 3 it. 10(b) 102 104 

Sch. 3 it. 11 370 377 

Sch. 3 it. 12 215 219 

Sch. 3 it. 14 70 71 

Sch. 3 it. 15(a) 221 225 

Sch. 3 it. 15(b)(i) 103 105 

Sch. 3 it. 15(b)(ii) 210 214 

Sch. 3 it. 15(b)(iii) 1 050 1 071 

Sch. 3 it. 15(b)(iv) 2 100 2 142 

Sch. 3 it. 15(b)(v) 4 205 4 290 

Sch. 3 it. 17 257 262 

Sch. 3 it. 18 215 219 

Sch. 3 it. 18 140 142 

Sch. 3 it. 19A 228 230 

Sch. 3 it. 19B 205 209 



4980 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

Provision Delete Insert 

Sch. 3 it. 19 61 62 

Sch. 3 it. 22 55 56 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

——————————— 

 

 

RA306* 

Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003 

Racing and Wagering Western Australia 

Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2013 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Racing and Wagering Western 

Australia Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2013. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2014. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Racing and Wagering Western 

Australia Regulations 2003. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 1 item 1 delete “426” and insert: 

 

  434 

 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4981 

 (2) In Schedule 1 item 2 delete “118” and insert: 

 

  120 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

——————————— 

 

RA307* 

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Act 1990 

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment 

Regulations 2013 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Racing Penalties (Appeals) 

Amendment Regulations 2013. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2014. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Racing Penalties (Appeals) 

Regulations 1991. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

 (1) In regulation 4(1): 

 (a) in paragraph (a) delete “$143; and” and insert: 

 

  $145; and 

 

 (b) in paragraph (b) delete “$349.” and insert: 

 

  $355. 



4982 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

 (2) In regulation 4(2): 

 (a) in paragraph (a)(i) delete “$143; and” and insert: 

 

  $145; and 

 

 (b) in paragraph (a)(ii) delete “$349;” and insert: 

 

  $355; 

 

 (c) delete “$71.” and insert: 

 

  $72. 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

——————————— 

 

 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4983 

— PART 2 — 

CONSUMER PROTECTION 

CP401* 

RETAIL TRADING HOURS ACT 1987 

RETAIL TRADING HOURS (SHIRE OF LAKE GRACE) VARIATION ORDER 2013 

Made by the Minister for Commerce under section 12E of the Act. 

1. Citation 

This order is the Retail Trading Hours (Shire of Lake Grace) Variation Order 2013. 

2. Commencement 

This order comes into operation as follows— 

 (a) clauses 1 and 2—on the day on which this order is published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the order—on the day after that day. 

3. Variation of retail trading hours 

General retail shops in the Lake Grace local government district are authorised to be open at times 
when the shops would otherwise be required to be closed— 

 (a) on the day specified in the Table; and 

 (b) during the hours specified for that day in the Table. 

Table 

Day Hours 

Friday 13 December 2013 From 6.00pm until 9.00pm 

M. MISCHIN, Minister for Commerce. 

ENERGY 

EN401* 

ENERGY COORDINATION ACT 1994 

APPROVAL OF AMENDMENTS TO THE REMCO RETAIL MARKET SCHEME 

The Economic Regulation Authority, pursuant to Section 11ZOM of the Energy Coordination 
Act 1994, hereby gives notice that the following amendments to the REMCo Retail Market Scheme 
have been approved—Rule Changes C01/13S, C02/13R, C03/13C and C04/13S— 

  Rule Change C01/13S proposes amending the Connectivity Testing and Technical 
Certification document (part of the Specification Pack) to require REMCo to notify gas retail 
market participants at least ten business days prior to the effective date of any new gas 
business operator identifiers for REMCo’s Gas Retail Market Systems and any new FRC Hub 
identifiers for the FRC Hub operated by the Australian Energy Market Operator. 

  Rule Change C02/13R proposes to amend Rules 67 and 83 to enable the Gas Retail Market 
Systems to validate that the Incoming User specified in a new connection confirmation notice 
or a transfer request has valid Shipper arrangements for the delivery of gas to that sub-
network; and modify the Gas Retail Market Systems by adding a validation check to the 
Change of User and Commissioning of Delivery Point transactions. 

  Rule Change C03/13C proposes to: replace all references to “FRC Hub Conditions” with “FRC 
Hub Operational Terms and Conditions”; amend Rule 14(2) to remove the Hub T&Cs from 
the Rule Change process under Chapter 9 of the Rules; insert a new Rule 14(4) that requires 
REMCo to publish new versions of the Specification Pack, as amended from time to time; and 
implement a new version 6 of the Hub T&Cs that applies consistently across Western 
Australia, South Australia, Victoria and Queensland. 



4984 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

  Rule Change C04/13S proposes to include an additional clause 7A.2(e) into the REMCo 
Constitution to clarify an issue relating to the approval of Self Contracting Users as Associate 
Members of REMCo.  

Rule Changes C01/13S, C02/13R, C03/13C and C04/13S are to take effect on 1 November 2013. 
Details regarding these amendments and the Economic Regulation Authority’s decision are available 
on the Economic Regulation Authority website. 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Lake Grace 

APPOINTMENTS 

The following have been appointed as Bush Fire Control Officers for the Shire of Lake Grace in 
accordance with the Bush Fires Act 1954. All previous appointments are hereby cancelled. 

B. (W.) Lloyd (Chief Bush Fire Control Officer) 

D. Dunham (Deputy Chief Bush Fire Control Officer) 

R. Metcalf (Deputy Chief Bush Fire Control Officer) 

W. Hall (Deputy Chief Bush Fire Control Officer) 

Fire Control Officers— 

D. Dunham E. Wyatt B. Watson 

G. Willcocks L. Morgan G. Carruthers 

K. Naisbitt C. Slarke S. Strevett 

B. Lloyd T. Lloyd I. Lloyd 

B. Ness J. Dunkeld G. Dunkeld 

R. Shalders C. Shalders G. Richardson 

P. Walker M. Cugley G. Cugley 

S. Cugley S. Walker W. Hall 

P. Kennedy S. Davies J. Brinkmann 

Ben Hyde C. Newman J. Sugg 

A. Sugg R. Metcalf H. Roberts 

P. Newman L. Brownley B. Giles 

D. Tonkin R. Chappell Brent Hyde 

R. Dunkeld M. Owen 

The following have been appointed as a Dual Fire Control Officer for the Shires of Lake Grace and 
Ravensthorpe and Jerramungup— 

Mr B. Giles 

The following have been appointed as a Dual Fire Control Officer for the Shires of Lake Grace and 
Kulin— 

Mr D. Dunham  

Mr S. Davies 

Mr E. Wyatt 

The following have been appointed as a Dual Fire Control Officer for the Shires of Lake Grace and 
Dumbleyung— 

Mr K. Naisbitt  

Mr L. Morgan 

The following have been appointed as a Dual Fire Control Officer for the Shires of Lake Grace and 
Kent— 

Mr L. Morgan 

The following have been appointed as a Dual Fire Control Officer for the Shires of Lake Grace and 
Esperance— 

Mr R. Metcalf 

The following have been appointed as a Dual Fire Control Officer for the Shires of Lake Grace and 
Kondinin— 

Mr H. Roberts 

The following have been appointed as Fire Weather Officers— 

D. Dunham S. Davies 

W. Hall L. Brownley 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4985 

The following have been appointed as Deputy Fire Weather Officers— 

B. Watson C. Newman 

B. Giles I. Lloyd 

H. Roberts 

The following have been appointed as Harvest Ban—CBH Advisory Officers— 

L. Brownley J. Sugg 

S. Davies B. Lloyd 

T. Lloyd S. Strevett 

T. Smith B. Giles 

 

——————————— 
 

LG402* 

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Lake Grace 

FIRES FOR THE PURPOSE OF CAMPING/COOKING ARE PROHIBITED 

The Shire of Lake Grace wishes to advise, under the Bush Fires Act 1954 S25 (1a), the lighting of fires 
for the purpose of camping or cooking is prohibited during the Prohibited Burning Time, 1 November 
to 31 January, dates inclusive. 

The exemptions stated in S25 (1c) apply. 

NEVILLE HALE, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

LG403* 

CAT ACT 2011 

Shire of Plantagenet 

APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Steven Player, Mr Mark Vitler and Mr Ray Parry 
have been appointed as Authorised Officers under the Cat Act 2011, for the enforcement of both the 
Cat Act 2011 and the Cat Regulations 2012 for the Shire of Plantagenet. 

Dated: 28 October 2013 

R. STEWART, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

LG404* 

DOG ACT 1976 

Shire of Cunderdin 

APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that pursuant to the provisions of the Dog Act 1976, the 
following persons have been appointed— 

Authorised Persons 

Peter Naylor 

Paul Godfrey 

Ian Bartlett 

Kelly Whisson 

Hayley Byrnes 

Alicia Clarke 

Matthew Sharpe 

Daniel Birleson 

Dog Registration Officers 

Peter Naylor 

Paul Godfrey 

Kelly Whisson 

Hayley Byrnes 

Alicia Clarke 

Michelle Samson 



4986 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

Pound Keepers 

Matthew Sharpe 

Daniel Birleson 

Peter Naylor 

Ian Bartlett 

Paul Godfrey 

All previous authorisations are hereby revoked. 
PETER NAYLOR, Chief Executive Officer. 

6 November 2013. 

 

——————————— 
 
LG405* 

CAT ACT 2011 

City of Belmont 

APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed under the 
provisions of the Cat Act 2011 for the City of Belmont, effective 1 November 2013— 

City of Belmont Registration Officers 

Stuart Monks 
Iain Hamilton 

Nicole McKennay 
Jacqueline Skegg 

Zelma Neasham 
Carol Berry 

Rebecca Dreher 
Kevin Davidson 

Jozef Zygadlo 
Matthew Robinson 

Geoffrey Copley 
Bruce Gilbert 

Craig Bell 

Julie’s Kennels Registration Officers 

Julie Kimberley 

Alexis Kimberley 
Nicholas Kimberley 

Karen Ramsey 
Annie Bulmer 

Teaghan Mitchell 
Aimee Long 
Alison Wyer 

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled. 

STUART COLE, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 
LG501* 

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Lake Grace 

FIREBREAK NOTICE 2013/14 

Notice to all Owners and Occupiers of Land in the Shire of Lake Grace. 

Pursuant to the powers contained in section 33 of the above Act, you are hereby required on or before 
the 1st day of November up to and including the 15th day of March the following year, to have a 
firebreak clear of all inflammable material in accordance with the following— 

 (i) RURAL LAND 

     1. (a) Immediately inside all external boundaries of the property or as is practicable, 
firebreaks of not less than 3 metres wide and 

 (b) Where buildings, haystacks, fuel ramps, fuel tanks and stored fuel drums are 
situated on land, firebreaks of not less than 2.5 metres wide within 33.5 metres of the 
perimeter of such buildings, haystacks, fuel ramps, fuel tanks and stored fuel drums 
in such manner as to completely encircle the buildings, haystacks, fuel ramps, fuel 
tanks and stored fuel drums and; 

 2. Where land is in crop and adjoins the railway line reserve a firebreak of not less than 3 
metres wide encircling the crop and; 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4987 

     3. (a) Immediately surrounding an aerial landing ground situated on the land a firebreak of 
not less than 6 metres wide and; 

 (b) Any aerial landing ground used as the motor start up, refuelling and maintenance 
area to be completely cleared of all inflammable materials for a radius of 18 metres 
and; 

 4. Maintain clear of all flammable materials all townsite blocks and; 

 5. Where bush or land has been bulldozed, chained or prepared in any similar manner for 
clearing by burning (whether intended to burn the bush or not), provide a firebreak of not 
less than 13 metres wide inside the external boundaries of the land so prepared. If you 
become owner or occupier of land after the first day of November, 2013, the requirements 
of this notice are varied so as to require you to comply with the terms of this notice within 
fourteen days of the date of your becoming owner or occupier of such land, instead of on or 
before the first day of November, 2013. The firebreaks required by this notice are to be 
maintained clear of inflammable materials up to and including the 15th day of March, 
2014. 

 6. A readily mobile operational fire fighting unit containing a minimum of 400 litres of 
water on standby and available for inspection is required during the period 1 November 
2013 to 15 March 2014. 

 (ii) TOWN LAND 

 1. Where the area of the land is 0.202 hectares (half an acre) or less all inflammable 
material on the land shall be removed from the whole of the land; and 

 2. Where the land exceeds 0.202 hectares (half an acre) in area, firebreaks at least 2 metres 
wide shall be cleared of all inflammable material immediately inside all external 
boundaries of the land and also immediately surrounding all buildings situated on the 
land. 

GENERAL 

If it is considered to be impracticable for any reason to clear firebreaks or to remove inflammable 
material from land or any other provisions required by this notice you may apply to the Council or its’ 
duly authorised officer not later than 31 October, for permission to provide firebreaks in alternative 
positions or to take alternative action to abate fire hazards on the land. If permission is granted by 
Council or its’ duly authorised officer, you shall comply with the requirements of this notice. 

“Inflammable Material” is defined for the purpose of this Order to include bush (as defined in the 
Bush Fires Act), timber, boxes, cartons, paper and like inflammable materials, rubbish and also any 
combustible matter, but does not include green standing trees or growing bushes and plants in 
gardens, or lawns. 

The penalty for failing to comply with this notice is a fine of not more than $5,000 or a penalty of $250 
may be incurred by issue of an infringement notice, and a person in default is also liable, whether 
prosecuted or not, to pay the cost of performing the work directed in this notice if it is not carried out 
by the owner or occupier before the date required by this notice. 

If the requirements of this notice are carried out by burning, such burning must be in accordance with 
the relevant provision of the Bush Fires Act 1954. A permit to burn is required during the restricted 
burning period from an authorised officer. Permits are not valid on Public Holidays. Burning on 
Sundays is permitted, with a valid permit, during the Restricted Burning Time. Bush Fires 
Regulations 1954 15C (1). 

By Order of the Council, 

NEVILLE HALE, Chief Executive Officer. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 

MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines and Petroleum, 
EAST PERTH WA 6004. 

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of Section 96A of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned mining tenement is forfeited for the breach covenant, being non-payment of rent. 

Hon BILL MARMION MLA, Minister for Mines and Petroleum. 

———— 

Number Holder Mineral Field 

EXPLORATION LICENCE 

E15/1299 TJ and IM Leahy Pty Ltd Coolgardie 



4988 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

PARLIAMENT 

PA401* 

PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

ROYAL ASSENT TO BILLS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor has Assented in the name and on behalf 
of Her Majesty the Queen, on the dates shown, to the undermentioned Acts passed by the Legislative 
Council and the Legislative Assembly during the First Session of the Thirty-Ninth Parliament. 

Title of Act Date of Assent Act No. 

Coal Industry Superannuation Amendment Act 2013 4 November 2013 19 of 2013 

Courts and Tribunals (Electronic Processes Facilitation) 
 Act 2013 

4 November 2013 20 of 2013 

PETER McHUGH, Acting Clerk of the Parliaments. 

5 November 2013. 

PLANNING 

PL401* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

Shire of East Pilbara 

Town Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 18 

Ref: TPS/1210 

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the Shire of East Pilbara local 
planning scheme amendment on 21 October 2013 for the purpose of— 

 1. Reclassifying Reserve 38561 being Lot 1642 Trotman Avenue and Lot 10 Newman Drive, 
Newman from ‘Local Scheme Reserve—Recreation’ to ‘Town Centre’ zone. 

 2. Reclassifying Lot 581 Newman Drive, Newman from ‘Mixed Business’ zone to ‘Town Centre’ 
zone. 

 3. Amending the Scheme Map in accordance with the Scheme Amendment Map. 

L. CRAIGIE, Shire President. 
A. COOPER, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

 

——————————— 
 

 

PL402* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

RESOLUTION DECIDING TO PREPARE A TOWN PLANNING SCHEME 

Shire of Morawa 

Local Planning Scheme No. 3 

Notice is hereby given that the Council of the local government of the Shire of Morawa on 23 July 
2013 passed the following Resolution— 

Resolved that the local government, in pursuance of Part 5 of the Planning and Development 
Act 2005, prepare the above Local Planning Scheme with reference to an area situate wholly 
within the Shire of Morawa and enclosed within the inner edge of black border on a plan 
produced to the Council of the local government. 

Dated this 5th day of November 2013. 

SEAN FLETCHER, A/Chief Executive Officer. 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4989 

SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES TRIBUNAL 

SA401* 

SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT 1975 

DETERMINATION VARIATION 

PREAMBLE 

This determination provides for the remuneration of a new appointee to the office of Executive 
Director, Western Australian Police Service. 

DETERMINATION 

The determination of the Salaries and Allowances Tribunal made on 18 December 2012 under 
sections 6(1)(c), (d) and (e) of the Salaries and Allowances Act 1975, as amended from time to time, is 
hereby varied by a further determination set out below.  

The variation is effective from the 17th day of October 2013. 

Remove from Part 3 of the First Schedule the following— 

Special Division Non CEOs 

Office Department or Agency Band Office Holder Salary 

Executive Director, 
Infrastructure and 
Finance  

Treasury  4 A. Kannis  $218,978 

Executive Director  Western Australian Police 
Service  

3 Vacant  $– 

Include in Part 3 of the First Schedule the following— 

Special Division Non CEOs 

Office Department or Agency Band Office Holder Salary 

Executive Director  Western Australian Police 
Service  

3 A. Kannis  $271,510 

Executive Director, 
Infrastructure and 
Finance  

Treasury  4 Vacant  $– 

Dated at Perth this 22nd day of October 2013. 

W. S. COLEMAN AM, C. A. BROADBENT,  B. J. MOORE, 
Chairman. Member. Member. 

Salaries and Allowances Tribunal 

TRAINING 

TA401* 

VOCATIONAL EDUCATION AND TRAINING ACT 1996  

CLASSIFICATION OF PRESCRIBED VOCATIONAL EDUCATION AND  
TRAINING QUALIFICATIONS 

Amendment to Western Australian Government Gazette 2009/225. 

Under the Vocational Education and Training Act 1996 section 60C, I, the Minister for Training and 
Workforce Development classify the following— 

Class B qualification 

No. Qualification Conditions 

Training contract requirements 

Title of 
apprentice 

under 
training 
contract 

Nominal 
period 

(months) 
full time 

Part 
time 

School 
based 

Other 
require-
ments 

109.4 CPC30111 
Certificate III in 
Bricklaying/ 
Blocklaying 

This qualification can only be 
obtained by fulfilling the 
obligations of an apprentice 
under a training contract 
except: (a) a person who is 
temporarily living in 
Australia on a student visa 
issued by the Department of 

Apprentice 36-48 Y Y  



4990 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

No. Qualification Conditions 

Training contract requirements 

Title of 
apprentice 

under 
training 
contract 

Nominal 
period 

(months) 
full time 

Part 
time 

School 
based 

Other 
require-
ments 

Immigration and Citizenship 
may obtain the qualification 
through a registered training 
provider approved to deliver 
a course for the qualification; 
or (b) a person seeking 
recognition of prior learning 
under s60I of the VET Act. 

8.2 52209 Certificate 
III in Bricklaying 
(Housing) 

 Apprentice 24 Y Y  

569.3 CPC30211 
Certificate III in 
Carpentry 

This qualification can only be 
obtained by fulfilling the 
obligations of an apprentice 
under a training contract 
except: (a) a person who is 
temporarily living in 
Australia on a student visa 
issued by the Department of 
Immigration and Citizenship 
may obtain the qualification 
through a registered training 
provider approved to deliver 
a course for the qualification; 
or (b) a person seeking 
recognition of prior learning 
under s60I of the VET Act. 

Apprentice 36-38 Y Y  

9.2 52207 Certificate 
III in Carpentry 
(Housing) 

 Apprentice 24 Y Y  

13.3 CPC32011 
Certificate III in 
Carpentry and 
Joinery 

 Apprentice 36 Y Y  

570.3 CPC31912 
Certificate III in 
Joinery 

 Apprentice 36-48 Y Y  

44.3 CPC30611 
Certificate III in 
Painting and 
Decorating 

 Apprentice 36 Y Y  

43.2 52210 Certificate 
III in Painting 
(Housing) 

 Apprentice 24 Y Y  

468.3 CPC301011 
Certificate III in 
Solid Plastering 

This qualification can only be 
obtained by fulfilling the 
obligations of an apprentice 
under a training contract 
except: (a) a person who is 
temporarily living in 
Australia on a student visa 
issued by the Department of 
Immigration and Citizenship 
may obtain the qualification 
through a registered training 
provider approved to deliver 
a course for the qualification; 
or (b) a person seeking 
recognition of prior learning 
under s60I of the VET Act. 

Apprentice 36 Y Y  

45.2 52211 Certificate 
III in Plastering 
(Housing) 

 Apprentice 24 Y Y  

50.3 CPC30811 
Certificate in Roof 
Tiling 

 Apprentice 36 Y Y  

40.4 CPC32111 
Certificate III in 
Signing 

 Apprentice 36-48 Y Y  

52.2 52212 Certificate 
III in Steel 
Framing (Housing) 

 Apprentice 24 Y Y  

53.2 CPC32311 
Certificate III in 
Stonemasonry 
(Monumental/ 
Installation) 

 Apprentice 42 Y Y  



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4991 

No. Qualification Conditions 

Training contract requirements 

Title of 
apprentice 

under 
training 
contract 

Nominal 
period 

(months) 
full time 

Part 
time 

School 
based 

Other 
require-
ments 

540.3 CPC31311 
Certificate III in 
Wall and Floor 
Tiling 

This qualification can only be 
obtained by fulfilling the 
obligations of an apprentice 
under a training contract 
except: (a) a person who is 
temporarily living in 
Australia on a student visa 
issued by the Department of 
Immigration and Citizenship 
may obtain the qualification 
through a registered training 
provider approved to deliver 
a course for the qualification; 
or (b) a person seeking 
recognition of prior learning 
under s60I of the VET Act. 

Apprentice 36 Y Y  

57.3 CPC31211 
Certificate III in 
Wall and Ceiling 
Lining 

 Apprentice 36 Y Y  

56.2 52208 Certificate 
III in Wall and 
Ceiling Fixing 
(Housing) 

 Apprentice 24 Y Y  

Hon TERRY REDMAN MLA, Minister for Training and  
Workforce Development. 

Dated: 22 October 2013. 

TREASURY AND FINANCE 

TR401* 

TAXATION ADMINISTRATION ACT 2003 

COMMISSIONER’S PRACTICE 

Under the provisions of section 127 of the Taxation Administration Act 2003, the following 
Commissioner’s practice is hereby published for public information— 

 DA 11.1 DUTIES—DUTIABLE TRANSACTIONS INVOLVING A UNIT ENTITLEMENT 
UNDER THE FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994—CLAIM OF NO 
PASSING OF A BENEFICIAL INTEREST 

Full details of the Commissioner’s practice can be obtained from the Office of State Revenue website 
at www.finance.wa.gov.au. 

B. SULLIVAN, Commissioner of State Revenue, 
Department of Finance. 

WATER/SEWERAGE 

WA401* 

WATER BOARDS ACT 1904 

APPOINTMENTS 

Aqwest—Bunbury Water Board 

The Governor in Executive Council has approved the appointment of the following persons as 
members of the Aqwest—Bunbury Water Board— 

Mrs Judy Jones for a period expiring on 31 May 2016 

Mr Hans Dopheide for a period expiring on 31 May 2016 

By Command of the Governor, 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



4992 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Any creditors having claims on the estate of the late Feliciano Luigi Jannis of 1 Blythe Avenue, 
Yokine, deceased 26 August 2013, are required to send particulars of their claims to William 
Alexander Parker, Administrator, C/- Lynn & Brown Lawyers, PO Box 1114, Morley WA 6942 by 
9 December 2013, after which date the administrator may distribute the assets having regard only to 
the claims of which they then have notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX402* 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of 
their claims to me, on or before 8 December 2013 , after which date I may convey or distribute the 
assets, having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 

Berkery, Natalie Lucy, late of 95 Rawlinson Drive, Marangaroo, died 3.10.2013 (DE19832351 EM13). 

Hanley, James Edward, late of 85 Rosedale Street, Floreat, died 6.10.2013 (DE33026459 EM110). 

Jones, Audrey Jeanette, late of Sandstrom Nursing Home, 44-46 Whatley Crescent, Mount Lawley, 
formerly of 32 Micketon Terrance, Bassendean died 14.06.2013 (DE19782635 EM35). 

Jowett, Keith Lawrence, late of U5, 55 Second Avenue, Shoalwater, died 25.09.2013 
(DE19610714 EM23). 

Porter, Margaret Joan, late of 10a Dandaloo Crescent, Wanneroo, died 27.08.2013 
(DE19913026 EM17). 

Storrie, Gregory Wayne, late of 36 Sandpiper Cove, Broadwater, died 16.08.2013 
(DE19764386 EM113). 

Watterston, Sylvia Valentina Violet, late of 15 Narrung Way, Nollamara, died 9.10.2013 
(DE33086734 EM15). 

Western, Patricia, late of Avon Valley Residency, 47-57 Burgoyne Street, Northam, died 24.06.2013 
(DE33033266 EM110). 

Wooltorton, Douglas Ernest, late of U7 65 Gibson Avenue, Padbury, died 18.10.2013 
(DE19862875 EM13). 

BRIAN ROCHE, Public Trustee, 
553 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000. 

Telephone: 1300 746 212 

 

 

——————————— 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

FAIR TRADING (RETIREMENT VILLAGES 

INTERIM CODE) REGULATIONS 2013 

*Price: $11.20 plus postage 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



8 November 2013 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4993 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

BUILDING ACT 2011 

 

Price: $23.60 plus postage 

 

 

BUILDING REGULATIONS 2012 

 

Price: $18.20 plus postage 

 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

BUILDING SERVICES (COMPLAINT 

RESOLUTION AND ADMINISTRATION) 

ACT 2011 

 

Price: $29.70 plus postage 

 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

CAT ACT 2011 
 

Price: $11.20 plus postage 

 

CAT REGULATIONS 2012 

 

Price: $8.90 plus postage 

 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

CRIMINAL PROPERTY CONFISCATION 

ACT 2000 

 

Price: $35.80 plus postage 

 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



4994 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 November 2013 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2014 
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2014. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically on any day. 

All Gazettes $   
  Within WA  ..................................  1,090.00 
  Interstate   ..................................  1,109.00 

 
Bound Volumes of full year  ........  1,351.00 
 

 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $   
  Within WA   ....................................  523.00 
  Interstate  ......................................  623.00 
 
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $   
  Within WA   .................................  1,033.00 
  Interstate  ...................................  1,264.00 
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA   .................................. 1,018.00 
  Interstate  ...................................  1,033.00 

 

STATUTES 

 
Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $   
  Within WA .......................................  368.00 
  Interstate  .......................................  410.00 
  Overseas  ........................................  476.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes  .............  1,016.00 

 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $   
  Within WA .......................................  395.00 
  Interstate ........................................  410.00 

 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $   
  Within WA  ......................................  544.00 
  Interstate  .......................................  572.00 

 

 

 

 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS 

 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State Law 

Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the missing 

item. 

 

Claims lodged after this period will not be recognised and will attract payment in full. 

 

Please debit my: Visa Card MasterCard 

 

Card Number:  
 

Expiry date of card:………………/………………. 

 

Name of card holder:…………………………………………………………………....... 


