
!2015122GG! 
 

  3197 
  
 
 
 

 
ISSN 1448-949X (print) ISSN 2204-4264 (online) 
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 7 AUGUST 2015 No. 122 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 12.00 NOON 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

City of Gosnells—Cat Amendment Local Law 2015 ................................................................  3205 
Fish Resources Management Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2015 ......................................  3200 
Liquor Control Amendment Regulations 2015 .........................................................................  3206 
Litter Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2015 ............................................................................  3199 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  3213 
Education ...................................................................................................................................  3208 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  3208 
Local Government ......................................................................................................................  3208 
Minerals and Petroleum ............................................................................................................  3211 
Planning .....................................................................................................................................  3211 
Transport ....................................................................................................................................  3212 
 
 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Lower Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 6552 6000  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Publications Officer  on 
(08) 6552 6012. 

 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 
observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2015 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices (per estate)—$30.75 

Articles in Public Notices Section—$71.50 minimum charge (except items of an 
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing 
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices— 

  Per Column Centimetre—$14.25 

  Bulk Notices—$261.00 per page 

Electronic copies of gazette notices sent to clients for lodgement with the Delegated 
Legislation Committee—$47.00 

Clients who have an account will only be invoiced for charges over $50. 

For charges under $50, clients will need to supply credit card details at time of lodging 
notice (i.e. a notice under 4cm would not be invoiced). 

Clients without an account will need to supply credit card details or pay at time of 
lodging the notice. 



7 August 2015 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3199 

— PART 1 — 

ENVIRONMENT 

EV301* 

Litter Act 1979 

Litter Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2015 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Litter Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2015. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Litter Regulations 1981. 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  In Schedule 2 delete Form 3 and insert: 
 

Form 3 
Western Australia 

CERTIFICATE OF APPOINTMENT OF 
AUTHORISED OFFICER 

LITTER ACT 1979 

This is to certify that ............................................................................... 
whose signature appears below is an authorised officer under the 
Litter Act 1979 and is entrusted under that Act with the following area 
of jurisdiction ......................................................................................... 
 
..................................................................... ............................. 
Signature of CEO as defined in the 
Environmental Protection Act 1986 
section 3(1) 

Date 

...................................................................... ............................. 
Signature of authorised officer Date 



3200 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 August 2015 

The authorised officer has the duties and powers conferred by the 
Litter Act 1979. 

The penalty for failing to comply with a lawful requisition by an 
authorised officer or giving false or misleading information in 
response to a lawful requisition by an authorised officer is a maximum 
fine of $1 000. 

 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

FISHERIES 

FI301* 

Fish Resources Management Act 1994 

Fish Resources Management Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2015 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Fish Resources Management 
Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2015. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Fish Resources Management 
Regulations 1995. 

4. Regulation 12 amended 

 (1) At the end of regulation 12(1) insert: 
 

 Penalty: In the case of an individual, $3 000 or, in the 
case of a body corporate, $6 000. 

 



7 August 2015 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3201 

 (2) At the end of regulation 12(2) insert: 
 

 Penalty: In the case of an individual, $3 000 or, in the 
case of a body corporate, $6 000. 

 

 (3) Delete regulation 12(3) and insert: 
 

 (3) A person, other than the holder of a commercial fishing 
licence, who takes any totally protected fish that is a 
crab must not, by any means, take any further crab 
until the crab is released into the water from which it 
was taken. 

 Penalty: In the case of an individual, $3 000 or, in the 
case of a body corporate, $6 000. 

 

 (4) At the end of regulation 12 delete the Penalty. 

5. Regulation 16E amended 

  After regulation 16E(3C) insert: 
 

 (3D) The master of a charter boat does not commit an 
offence under subregulation (3C)(c)(ii) if —  

 (a) there are 10 or more persons on the charter 
boat; and 

 (b) there are no more than 20 mud crabs (brown 
and green combined) on or attached to the boat 
and any tender or other vessel operating with or 
attached to the boat. 

 

6. Part 4 Division 5A heading amended 

  In the heading to Part 4 Division 5A delete “deep sea”. 

7. Regulation 38DA inserted 

  At the end of Part 4 Division 5A insert: 
 

38DA. Possession of parts of raw crab other than deep sea 
crab 

  A person must not possess a part only of a raw crab 
that is not a deep sea crab unless the part is prepared, or 
being prepared, for immediate consumption. 

 Penalty:  

 (a) in the case of an individual — a fine of 
$5 000 and the penalty provided in 
section 222 of the Act; or  



3202 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 August 2015 

 (b) in the case of a body corporate — a fine of 
$10 000 and the penalty provided in 
section 222 of the Act. 

 

8. Regulation 64 amended 

 (1) In regulation 64(1A) delete the definition of person engaged for 
a commercial purpose in an activity. 

 (2) In regulation 64(1A) insert in alphabetical order: 
 

 responsible person, in relation to an activity, means —  

 (a) if the activity is carried out under a commercial 
fishing licence —  

 (i) using a boat which has a master — the 
master of the boat; or 

 (ii) otherwise — the holder of the 
authorisation under which the activity is 
carried out; 

  or 

 (b) otherwise — the person who engages in the 
activity; 

 

 (3) In regulation 64(1) before “person” insert: 
 

  responsible 
 

9. Regulation 64L amended 

 (1) Before regulation 64L(1) insert: 
 

 (1A) In this regulation — 

 charter boat means a boat that is used to conduct a 
fishing tour for a commercial purpose in accordance 
with a fishing tour operator’s licence. 

 

 (2) In regulation 64L(2) after “fishing boat” insert: 
 

  or a charter boat 
 

 (3) After regulation 64L(2) insert: 
 

(3AA) The master of a charter boat with fewer than 10 people 
on board must not use, or cause or permit to be carried 
on the boat, more than 10 drop nets in any one day. 



7 August 2015 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3203 

(3AB) The master of a charter boat with 10 or more people on 
board may carry up to 20 drop nets at any one time, but 
must not use more than 10 drop nets in any one day. 

(3AC) If a charter boat has smaller tender boats that use the 
charter boat as a primary boat —  

 (a) the charter boat is to be used to calculate the 
total number of drop nets that may be used or 
carried as a part of that charter boat’s fishing 
tour for the purposes of subregulations (3AA) 
and (3AB); and 

 (b) the master of the charter boat must not use, or 
cause or permit to be carried on any single 
tender boat, more than 10 drop nets in any one 
day. 

 

10. Regulation 64OB amended 

  In regulation 64OB(2)(c) delete “mullet.” and insert: 
 

  mullet or garfish. 
 

11. Regulation 64QA inserted 

  After regulation 64P insert: 
 

64QA. Use of fishing nets in Gascoyne Region 

 (1) In this regulation —  

 attend, in relation to a net, means to be within 100 m of 
the net. 

 (2) A person who fishes using a set fishing net in the 
Gascoyne Region must —  

 (a) attend the net; and 

 (b) remove the net from the water and clear it of 
fish at intervals of not more than one hour. 

 Penalty: a fine of $2 000. 
 

12. Regulation 128MA amended 

 (1) Before regulation 128MA(1) insert: 
 

 (1A) In this regulation —  

 current identification sticker, in relation to a boat, 
means the identification sticker for the boat issued to 
the holder of a fishing tour operator’s licence or a 



3204 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 August 2015 

restricted fishing tour operator’s licence at the later of 
the following times —  

 (a) the time the licence was granted; 

 (b) the time the licence was last renewed. 
 

 (2) In regulation 128MA(2) delete “in such manner as the CEO 
specifies in a written notice given to the holder of the licence.” 
and insert: 

 

  by affixing the current identification sticker for the boat to the 
wheel house or another prominent position on the boat. 

 

13. Schedule 3 amended 

  In Schedule 3 Part 5 delete “Prawns, Western School and Western 
King” and insert: 

 

  Prawns 
 

14. Schedule 7 amended 

  In Schedule 7 Division 3 in the item relating to Crab, Blue 
Manna (Blue Swimmer) delete “pelagicus” and insert: 

 

  armatus 
 

15. Schedule 12 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 12 Part 1 item 2 after paragraph (b) insert: 
 

 (ca) category 1 fish for which there is no bag limit   400.00 
 

 (2) In Schedule 12 Part 2 item 3 delete “14(1), 14(3),”. 

 (3) In Schedule 12 Part 2 item 4: 

 (a) after “12(1) and (2),” insert: 
 

  14(1), 14(3), 
 

 (b) after “38C,” insert: 
 

  38DA, 
 

 (c) delete “38D(2),”; 



7 August 2015 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3205 

 (d) after “64P,” insert: 
 

  64QA, 
 

 (4) In Schedule 12 Part 2 item 5 after “16E(3E),” insert: 
 

  38D(2), 
 

K. H. ANDREWS, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 
CAT ACT 2012 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
City of Gosnells 

CAT AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2015 
Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995, the Cat Act 2012, 
and under all other powers enabling it, the Council of the City of Gosnells resolved 
on 28 July 2015 to make the following local law. 

PART 1—PRELIMINARY 

1.1 Title 
This local law may be cited as the City of Gosnells Cat Amendment Local Law 2015. 

1.2 Commencement 
This local law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the 
Government Gazette. 

1.3 Purpose and effect 
(1) The purpose of this local law is to amend the City of Gosnells Cat Local 
Law 2014. 
(2) The effect of this local law is to correct two minor errors in the City of Gosnells 
Cat Local Law 2014. 

1.4 Principal local law amended 
This local law amends the City of Gosnells Cat Local Law 2014 as published in the 
Government Gazette on 13 January 2015.  

1.5 City of Gosnells Cat Local Law 2014 amended 
(1) In clause 2.2 after the word “Penalty” delete “$1,000” and insert “$2,000” 
(2) In clause 2.7 after the word “Penalty” delete “$1,000” and insert “$2,000” 
(3) In the column headed “CLAUSE” of the table of modified penalties in Schedule 3, 
delete the text “2.6” and insert “2.7” 

———— 

Dated: 31 July 2015. 

The Common Seal of the City of Gosnells was affixed by authority of a resolution of 
the Council in the presence of— 

DAVID GRIFFITHS, Mayor. 
IAN COWIE, Chief Executive Officer. 



3206 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 August 2015 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RA301* 

Liquor Control Act 1988 

Liquor Control Amendment Regulations 2015 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Liquor Control Amendment 
Regulations 2015. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Liquor Control Regulations 1989. 

4. Regulation 3AD inserted 

  After regulation 3AC insert: 
 

3AD. Kind of liquor prescribed (powdered alcohol) 
(Act s. 3(1) kind) 

  For the purposes of paragraph (e) of the definition of a 
kind in section 3(1), powdered alcohol that 
regulation 4AD(2) prescribes as being liquor is 
prescribed as being a kind of liquor. 

 

5. Regulation 4AD inserted 

  After regulation 4AC insert: 
 

4AD. Substance prescribed (powdered alcohol) 
(Act s. 3(1) liquor) 

 (1) In this regulation —  

 powdered alcohol means a substance that —  

 (a) appears to be of a powdered or crystalline 
nature; and 



7 August 2015 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3207 

 (b) contains ethanol; and 

 (c) is intended for human consumption. 

 (2) For the purposes of paragraph (b) of the definition of 
liquor in section 3(1), powdered alcohol is prescribed 
as being liquor. 

 

K. H. ANDREWS, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 



3208 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 August 2015 

— PART 2 — 

EDUCATION 

ED401 
SCHOOL EDUCATION ACT 1999 

DECLARATION OF SCHOOL AMALGAMATION 
(Pursuant to section 56(1)(a)) 

Notice is hereby given that the Minister for Education has declared that Hamilton Senior High School 
and South Fremantle Senior High School will amalgamate on the current South Fremantle Senior 
High School site. The new school will open on 1 January 2018. 

ENERGY 

EN401* 
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 

AMENDED LICENCE 
Notice is given that the following Electricity Integrated Regional Licence has been amended— 

Licensee: Regional Power Corporation (t/a Horizon Power) 
ABN 57 955 011 697 

Classification: Electricity Integrated Regional Licence (EIRL2, Version 21) 
Date of Amendment: 27 July 2015 
Term of Licence: Up to and including 29 March 2036 
Licence Area: The licence area is the area as set out in plan ERA-EL-143 in the State of 

Western Australia. 
Amendment: − Replace all licence operating area plans with one consolidated licence 

operating area plan ERA- EL- 143 
 – Remove generation from the list of activities authorised by this licence 

in Schedule 1 
Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
 4th Floor, Albert Facey House 
 469 Wellington Street 
 PERTH WA 6000 
 http://www.erawa.com.au 

Dr. STEPHEN KING, Chairman, Economic Regulation Authority. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
SHIRE OF MERREDIN 

APPOINTMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that Matthew Sharpe, Jodie Taylor and Bradley Miller 
have been appointed by the Council of the Shire of Merredin, as Authorised Officer(s) to enforce the 
provisions of the following— 

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 
Local Government Act 1995 



7 August 2015 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3209 

Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995 
Dog Act 1976 and Regulations 
Bush Fires Act 1954 and Regulations 
The Litter Act 1979 
Control of Vehicles (Off-road Areas) Act 1978 and Regulations (as amended) 
And applicable Shire Council Local Laws 

GREG POWELL, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LG402* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

City of Rockingham 

(BASIS OF RATES) 
This notice, which is for public information only, is to confirm that— 

I, Brad Jolly, being delegated by the Minister of the Crown to whom the administration of the 
Local Government Act 1995 is committed by the Governor, and acting pursuant to section 6.28 (1) 
of that Act, hereby, and with effect from 27 July 2015, determined that the method of valuation to 
be used by the City of Rockingham as the basis for a rate in respect of the land referred to in the 
Schedule is to be the gross rental value of the land; 

Schedule 

 Designated Land 

UV to GRV All those portions of land being Lots 145 to 177 inclusive, Lots 180 to 
192 inclusive and Lots 202 to 209 inclusive as shown on Deposited 
Plan 404908. 

BRAD JOLLY, Executive Director, Sector Regulation and Support, 
Department of Local Government and Communities. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LG403* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Menzies 

(BASIS OF RATES) 
I, Tony Simpson MLA, being the Minister of the Crown to whom the administration of the Local 
Government Act 1995 is committed by the Governor, and acting pursuant to section 6.28 (1), and 
section 6.29 (3), of that Act, hereby, and with effect from 13 July 2015— 

 1. determine that the method of valuation to be used by the Shire of Menzies, as the basis for a 
rate on the mining tenement referred to in Column 1 of the Schedule (mining tenement), in 
respect of the portion of land referred to in Column 2 of the Schedule (portion of land), is to be 
the gross rental value of the land; 

 2. expressly exclude the application of section 6.29 (2) of the Act to the mining tenement, in 
respect of the portion of land. 

Schedule 

1. Mining Tenement 2. Portion of Land 

Part Mining Lease 
M39/1096 

All that portion of land being part of former Mineral Lease 
M39/1019 (now part M39/1096), starting from a point at 
coordinate 647423.079 metres East, 6767055.841 metres 
North (MGA94 Zone 51) and extending westerly 270 degrees, 
500.0 metres; thence northerly 0 degrees, 500.0 metres; 
thence easterly 90 degrees, 500.0 metres; thence southerly 
180 degrees, 500.0 metres to the starting point. 

Hon TONY SIMPSON MLA, Minister for Local Government. 



3210 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 August 2015 

LG404* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Serpentine Jarrahdale 
(BASIS OF RATES) 

This notice, which is for public information only, is to confirm that— 
I, Brad Jolly, being delegated by the Minister of the Crown to whom the administration of the 
Local Government Act 1995 is committed by the Governor, and acting pursuant to section 6.28 (1) 
of that Act, hereby, and with effect from this date determined that the method of valuation to be 
used by the Shire of Serpentine Jarrahdale as the basis for a rate in respect of the land referred 
to in the Schedule is to be the gross rental value of the land. 

Schedule 

 Designated Land 

UV to GRV All that portion of land being Lot 100 as shown on Deposited 
Plan 402581. 

MARY ADAM, A/Executive Director. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LG405* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Serpentine Jarrahdale 
(BASIS OF RATES) 

This notice, which is for public information only, is to confirm that— 
I, Brad Jolly, being delegated by the Minister of the Crown to whom the administration of the 
Local Government Act 1995 is committed by the Governor, and acting pursuant to section 6.28 (1) 
of that Act, hereby, and with effect from the date of gazettal, determined that the method of 
valuation to be used by the Shire of Serpentine Jarrahdale as the basis for a rate in respect of the 
land referred to in the Schedule is to be the gross rental value of the land; 

Schedule 

 Designated Land 

UV to GRV All those portions of land being Lots 51 to 59 inclusive, Lots 62 
to 71 inclusive, Lots 74 to 79 inclusive, Lots 107 to 110 
inclusive, Lots 119 to 125 inclusive and Lots 130 to 136 
inclusive as shown on Deposited Plan 404912.  

BRAD JOLLY, Executive Director. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LG406* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Augusta Margaret River 
(BASIS OF RATES) 

This notice, which is for public information only, is to confirm that— 
I, Mary Adam, being delegated by the Minister of the Crown to whom the administration of the 
Local Government Act 1995 is committed by the Governor, and acting pursuant to section 6.28 (1) 
of that Act, hereby, and with effect from 9 July 2015, determine that the method of valuation to 
be used by the Shire of Augusta Margaret River, as the basis for a rate in respect of the land 
referred to in the Schedule is to be the unimproved value of the land; 

Schedule 

 Designated land 

GRV to UV  All that portion of land being Lot 105 as shown on Deposited 
Plan 39531. 

MARY ADAM, A/Executive Director. 



7 August 2015 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3211 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
PETROLEUM PIPELINES ACT 1969 

APPLICATION FOR A PIPELINE LICENCE 
I, Ronald Mark Gabrieslon, Acting Executive Director, Petroleum Division of the Department of 
Mines and Petroleum, under delegation from the Minister for Mines and Petroleum, give notice 
pursuant to section 8 of the Petroleum Pipelines Act 1969, that application STP-PLA-0028 has been 
received from— 

AWE PERTH PTY LTD 

and 
ORIGIN ENERGY DEVELOPMENTS PTY LIMITED 

for a licence to construct the Waitsia Pipeline. 
A map showing the proposed route of the pipeline may be examined up to 31 August 2015 at the 
Department of Mines and Petroleum, 1st floor Mineral House, 100 Plain Street, East Perth, WA and 
the Department of Mines and Petroleum website: www.dmp.wa.gov.au. 

Dated at Perth this 31st day of July 2015. 

Made under the Petroleum Pipelines Act 1969 of the Sate of Western Australia. 

R. M. GABRIELSON, Acting Executive Director, 
Petroleum Division. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MP402* 

PETROLEUM AND GEOTHERMAL ENERGY RESOURCES ACT 1967 

EXPIRY OF PETROLEUM RETENTION LEASE R 5 
Petroleum Retention Lease R 5 held by Apache Oil Australia Pty Ltd and OMV Australia Pty Ltd 
expired on 27 April 2015. 

R. M. GABRIELSON, Acting Executive Director, 
Petroleum Division, Department of Mines and Petroleum. 

PLANNING 

PL401* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

City of Greater Geraldton 
Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 70 

Ref: TPS/1616 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the City of Greater Geraldton local 
planning scheme amendment on 20 July 2015 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lot 9000 Ord Street, Beresford from “Residential R12.5/30/40” and “No Zone” to 

“Residential” with a “R30” density coding; and 

 2. Amending the Scheme Map accordingly. 

I. W. CARPENTER, Mayor. 
K. DIEHM, Chief Executive Officer. 



3212 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 August 2015 

PL402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME MINOR AMENDMENT 1276/57 
Caporn Street, Wanneroo 

Approved Amendment 
File: 833-2-30-120 
The Minister for Planning has approved, as advertised, the abovementioned amendment to the 
Metropolitan Region Scheme. The amendment is shown on Western Australian Planning Commission 
(WAPC) plan number 3.2518 and is effective from the date of publication of this notice in the 
Government Gazette. 
Copies of the amendment and the accompanying Report on Submissions are available for public 
inspection from Friday, 7 August 2015 to Friday, 4 September 2015 at— 
  Western Australian Planning Commission, William Street, Perth 
  J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 
  City of Wanneroo 
  City of Joondalup 
Documents are also available from the PlanningWA website www.planning.wa.gov.au. 

TIM HILLYARD, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

TRANSPORT 

TN401* 
ROAD TRAFFIC (VEHICLES) ACT 2012 

ROAD TRAFFIC (VEHICLES) REGULATIONS 2014 
EXEMPTION NOTICE 

Requirement for the Fitting and Use of Light Emitting Diode (LED) Light Bars on  
Motor Vehicles as Additional Driving Lamps 

(RTVR-2015-200767) 

1. Exemption 
I, Reece Waldock, Chief Executive Officer of the Department of Transport, acting pursuant to 
regulation 462 of the Road Traffic (Vehicles) Regulations 2014, (Regulations) hereby exempt motor 
vehicles when fitted with LED light bars, from compliance with regulations 286(5) and 289 of the 
Regulations. This exemption is subject to compliance with the conditions set out in clause 3 of this 
Notice. 
Regulations 286(5) and 289 relate to requirement that additional headlights be fitted in pairs. 

2. Definition 
LED light bars means a lamp which contains multiple LED light sources in one or more rows. 

LED light sources must only emit white light.  
Motor Vehicles for the purpose of this Notice means motor vehicles that have four or more 

wheels  

3. Conditions 
When operating under this Notice, compliance with the following conditions is required— 
 a. The LED light bar(s) must be installed at the front of the vehicle and not higher than the 

front edge of the bonnet. 
 b. The LED light bar(s) must be installed horizontally and located symmetrically about the 

longitudinal centre line of the vehicle. 
 c. The LED light bar(s) must be forward facing and positioned in a way that the light produced 

does not cause the driver of the vehicle discomfort, either directly or by reflection while in the 
normal driving position. 

 d. The LED light bar(s) must only operate when the high-beam headlights are in operation and 
must automatically turn off when the high-beam headlights are turned off. 

 e. A manual switch must be provided to allow the LED light bar to be deactivated, so that it is 
not on whether the high beam is on or off. This switch must be accessible to the driver of the 
vehicle from the normal driving position. 

 f. The LED light bar(s) must only emit white light. 



7 August 2015 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3213 

 g. The LED light bar(s) shall not obstruct the driver’s view of the roadway more than 11 metres 
ahead of the driver’s eye position when looking through the windscreen, with the driver’s seat 
in the rearmost position. 

 h. One or more (to a maximum of four) LED light bars may be fitted as additional driving lamps. 

4. Commencement 
This Notice has effect on the day after the day of publication of this Notice in the West Australian 
Government Gazette. 

5. Expiry 
This Notice expires after a period of 3 years after the date of publication in the Government Gazette. 
This instrument is to be known as RTVR-2015-200767 

Dated the 3rd day of August 2015. 
REECE WALDOCK, Chief Executive Officer. 

DECEASED ESTATES 
ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of Ethel Rose Paterson, late of 44 Caporn Street, Bullsbrook in the State of 
Western Australia, who died on the 22nd day of March 2015, are required by the personal 
representative, Gail Maree Paterson to send particulars of their claims addressed to the executor of 
the Estate of the late Ethel Rose Paterson care of Slater & Gordon, Lawyers, Level 7, 32 St Georges 
Terrace, Perth WA 6000 within one (1) month of the date of publication of this notice, after which date 
the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims  
of which the personal representative then has notice. 
 

——————————— 
 
ZX402* 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims in respect of the Estate of the late David Hee-Chua Khoo 
(also known as David Hee Chua Khoo and Hee Chua Khoo), late of Unit 18, 12-16 Milford Street,  
East Victoria Park in the State of Western Australia, who died on 4 August 2014, are required to  
send particulars of their claims to the Joint Administrator of the Estate, Ruiling Huang, care of  
Tang Legal, Suite 2/191 James Street, Northbridge in the State of Western Australia on or before 
7 September 2015, after which the Joint Administrators, Ruiling Huang and Elliot Yon-Yuan Khoo 
will proceed to distribute the assets of the Estate, having regard only to the claims of which they  
then have notice. 
 

——————————— 
 
ZX403 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
In the matter of the Estate of Joan Viola Slattery, late of Freshwater Bay Aged Care, 67 Palmerston 
Street, Mosman Park in the State of Western Australia, Retired School Teacher, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the Estate of the deceased, who died on the 13th day of April 2015, are required by the 
Executors, Sheron Elizabeth Watkins and Brian John Slattery to send the particulars of their claim 
to Messrs Taylor Smart of 1 Regal Place, East Perth in the State of Western Australia by the 7th day 
of September 2015, after which date the said Executors may convey or distribute the assets, having 
regard only to the claims of which they then have had notice. 

Dated the 31st day of July 2015. 
GARRY E. SAME, Taylor Smart. 



3214 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 August 2015 

ZX404* 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of 
their claims to me on or before 7 September 2015, after which date I may convey or distribute the 
assets, having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 
Anderson, John Hugh, late of c/- Sarah Hardy House, 222 Cammillo Road, Kelmscott, died 3.03.2015 

(DE33073495 EM13) 
Anthony, Ernest Maxwell, late of Melville Age Care, 1 French Road, Melville, formerly of 14a Gimber 

Street, Melville, died 17.06.2015 (DE19912200 EM36) 
Bartlett, Joan Antill, Also Known As Sue Bartlett, late of James Brown House, Unit 35, 171 Albert 

Street, Osborne Park, formerly of 15 Gransmoor Way, Willetton, died 21.05.2015 
(DE33080396 EM32) 

Beilby, John Andrew, late of 21 Karel Avenue, Rossmoyne, died 8.06.2015 (DE33126155 EM24) 
Buckley, Patrick Joseph, Also Known As Joe Buck, late of c/ Post Office Box 245, Port Hedland, died 

5.05.2015 (DE19991594 EM213) 
Clarke, Stephen, late of 13-27 McManus Street, Wilson, died 27.06.2015 (DE19900060 EM36) 
Davies, Mavis, late of 26 Connaught Street, Forrestfield, died 18.05.2015 (DE19721595 EM22) 
De Costa, Keith Alexander, late of Unit 5, 175 Adelaide Street, St Marys, New South Wales, formerly 

of 53 Limetree Circuit, Mindarie, Western Australia, died 26.10.2014 (DE19982013 EM26) 
James, William John, Also Known As John James, late of 60 Leake Street, Bayswater, died 5.05.2015 

(DE33106726 EM13) 
Merton, Herbert Colin, Also Known As Colin Merton, late of 15 View Road, Safety Bay, died 

22.05.2015 (DE20002525 EM22) 

BRIAN ROCHE, Public Trustee. 
553 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000. 

Telephone: 1300 746 212 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

 
 

 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

ENDURING POWER OF ATTORNEY KIT 

 

Price: $2.00 plus postage 

 

Information booklet about planning for your future financial affairs 

 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

ENDURING POWER OF GUARDIANSHIP GUIDE 

 

Price: $1.75 plus postage 

 

Information booklet about planning for your future lifestyle 

Includes 5-page tear out form at back of guide 

(extra forms can be obtained by purchasing the EPG kit for $1.00) 



7 August 2015 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3215 

 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
  

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

CRIMINAL PROPERTY CONFISCATION 

ACT 2000 

 

Price: $37.85 plus postage 

 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION ACT 2006 

 

Price: $44.35 plus postage 

 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

CRIMINAL ORGANISATIONS CONTROL 

ACT 2012 

 

Price: $34.60 plus postage 

 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

WORKING WITH CHILDREN (CRIMINAL 

RECORD CHECKING) ACT 2004 

 

Price: $19.15 plus postage 

 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



3216 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 August 2015 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2016 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2016. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically on any day. 
All Gazettes $
  Within WA  ..................................  1,202.00
  Interstate   ..................................  1,222.00

 
Bound Volumes of full year  ........  1,420.00
 
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $
  Within WA   ....................................  550.00
  Interstate  ......................................  654.00
 
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $
  Within WA   .................................  1,086.00
  Interstate  ...................................  1,328.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA   .................................. 1,070.00
  Interstate  ...................................  1,086.00
 

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $ 
  Within WA .......................................  386.00 
  Interstate  .......................................  431.00 
  Overseas  ........................................  500.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes  .............  1,067.00 

 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA .......................................  439.00 
  Interstate ........................................  455.00 

 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA  ......................................  571.00 
  Interstate  .......................................  601.00 

 

 

 

 

 
CLAIMS FOR MISSING SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State Law 
Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the missing 
item. 
 
Claims lodged after this period will not be recognised and will attract payment in full. 
 

Please debit my: �Visa Card �MasterCard 
 

Card Number: ����  ����  ����  ���� 
 

Expiry date of card:………………/………………. 
 
Name of card holder:…………………………………………………………………....... 




