
!2016063GG! 
 

  1203 

  

 

 

 

 
ISSN 1448-949X (print) ISSN 2204-4264 (online) 

PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 19 APRIL 2016 No. 63 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 12.00 NOON 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 

GOVERNMENT 

 

 

 

CONTENTS 

 

PART 1 

Page 

Local Government (Narembeen - Councillor Numbers) Order 2016 .......................................  1209 
Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup Activities on Thoroughfares and Trading in Thoroughfares 

and Public Places Amendment Local Law 2016....................................................................  1205 
Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup Extractive Industries Amendment Local Law 2016 .............  1206 
Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup Fencing Amendment Local Law 2016 ....................................  1206 

 

 

——— 

 

 

PART 2 

 
Agriculture and Food .................................................................................................................  1210 
Corrective Services ....................................................................................................................  1210 
Health .........................................................................................................................................  1211 
Marine/Maritime ........................................................................................................................  1212 
Planning .....................................................................................................................................  1212 
Premier and Cabinet ..................................................................................................................  1215 
Salaries and Allowances Tribunal ............................................................................................  1215 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 

may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 

Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 

State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 

Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 

unforeseen circumstances. 

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 

periodically. 

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 

 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 

 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 

Delivery address: 

  State Law Publisher 

  Lower Ground Floor, 

  10 William St. Perth, 6000 

  Telephone: 6552 6000  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Publications Officer  on 

(08) 6552 6012. 

 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to email or fax copy, confirmation is not required by 

post. If original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 

 

 
 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2015 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices (per estate)—$30.75 

Articles in Public Notices Section—$71.50 minimum charge (except items of an 

exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing 

the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices— 

  Per Column Centimetre—$14.25 

  Bulk Notices—$261.00 per page 

Electronic copies of gazette notices sent to clients for lodgement with the Delegated 

Legislation Committee—$47.00 

Clients who have an account will only be invoiced for charges over $50. 

For charges under $50, clients will need to supply credit card details at time of lodging 

notice (i.e. a notice under 4cm would not be invoiced). 

Clients without an account will need to supply credit card details or pay at time of 

lodging the notice. 

 



19 April 2016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1205 

— PART 1 — 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup 

ACTIVITIES ON THOROUGHFARES AND TRADING IN THOROUGHFARES AND 

PUBLIC PLACES AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2016 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and under all other 
powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup resolved on 
23 March 2016 to make the following local law.  

1. Citation 

This local law may be cited as the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup Activities on 
Thoroughfares and Trading in Thoroughfares and Public Places Amendment Local 
Law 2016. 

2. Commencement 

This local law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the 
Government Gazette. 

3. Principal Local Law 

This local law amends the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup Activities on Thoroughfares 
and Trading in Thoroughfares and Public Places Local Law as published in the 
Government Gazette on 17 October 2000 and as amended in the Government Gazette 
on 22 October 2008. 

4. Preliminary 

In construing the following modifications, where a modification requires the 
renumbering of a division, clause, subclause or paragraph, subsequent modifications 
have been drafted on the basis that the renumbering has been effected. 

5. Clause 1.2 amended 

 (a) In the definition for “thoroughfare” delete ‘Act;’ and substitute ‘Act, but 
does not include a private thoroughfare which is not under the management 
control of the local government’; and 

 (b) In the definition for “Planning Scheme” delete ‘Shire Planning and 
Development Act 1928’ and substitute ‘Planning and Development Act 2005’. 

6. Clause 6.8 amended 

In clause 6.8(1)(c), delete “Weights and Measures Act 1915” and substitute “National 
Measurement Act 1960 (Cth)”. 

7. Division 2 deleted 

 (a) Division 2 of Part 6 is deleted. 

8. Clause 6.16 amended 

In clause 6.16 insert the following definition in alphabetical order— 

“Permitted area” means the area or areas, specified in a permit, in which the 
permit holder may perform; and. 

9. Schedule 1 amended 

In Schedule 1— 

Delete modified penalties 6.10, 6.12, 6.14(1) and 6.14(2). 

———— 

Dated: 4 April 2016. 

The Common Seal of the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup was affixed by authority of a 
resolution of the Council in the presence of— 

Cr ANGELO LOGIUDICE, President. 
JOHN ATTWOOD, Chief Executive Officer. 



1206 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 19 April 2016 

LG302* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup 

EXTRACTIVE INDUSTRIES AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2016 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and under all other 
powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup resolved on 
23 March 2016 to make the following local law.  

1. Title 

This local law may be cited as the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup Extractive 
Industries Amendment Local Law 2016. 

2. Commencement 

This local law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the 
Government Gazette. 

3. Principal local law 

This local law amends the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup Extractive Industries Local 
Law as published in the Government Gazette on 9 June 1998 and as amended on 
31 October 2008. 

4. Clause 6.2 amended 

Clause 6.2 is amended as follows— 

 (a) delete paragraphs (b), (c), (d), (g), (h) and (i); 

 (b) renumber paragraph “(e)” as paragraph “(b)”; 

 (c) renumber paragraph “(f)” as paragraph “(c)”; 

 (d) in paragraph (b) replace “Minerals and Energy;” with “Mines and Petroleum; 
and” 

 (e) in paragraph (c) replace the semi-colon with a full stop. 

———— 
Dated: 4 April 2016. 

The Common Seal of the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup was affixed by authority of a 
resolution of the Council in the presence of— 

Cr ANGELO LOGIUDICE, President. 
JOHN ATTWOOD, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 

 

LG303* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup 

FENCING AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2016 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and under all other 
powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup resolved on 
23 March 2016 to make the following local law.  

PRELIMINARY 

1. Title 

This local law may be cited as the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup Fencing 
Amendment Local Law 2016. 

2. Commencement 

This local law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the 
Government Gazette. 

3. Principal Local Law 

This local law amends the Shire of Donnybrook/Balingup Local Laws Relating to 
Fencing as published in the Government Gazette on 3 September 1999 and as 
amended on 31 October 2008. 

4. Title amended 

The title of the local law is amended by removing “Dividing Fences Act 1961” from 
the top of the page. 



19 April 2016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1207 

5. Clause 3 amended 

In clause 3— 

  (a) Insert the following new definitions in alphabetical order— 

“licence” means a licence issued under clause 11 in relation to an electrified 
fence; 

“local government” means the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup; 

“Low Density Residential Lot” means a lot where a residential code of 
R2.5, R5 or split code R2.5/R5 (as amended from time to time) applies; 

“razor wire” means a coiled strong wire with pieces of sharp cutting edges 
set across it at close intervals; and 

“thoroughfare” has the meaning given to it by the Local Government 
Act 1995, but does not include a private thoroughfare which is not under 
the management or control of the local government. 

 (b) In the definition for “electrified fence”, after the word “charge”, add “but 
does not include an electronic dog containment system”. 

 (c) Delete the definition— 

 “ “Special Residential Lot” means a lot where a special residential use— 

  (a) is or may be permitted under the town planning scheme; and 

  (b) is or will be the predominant use of the land;” 

 (d) Delete all references to “town planning scheme” and replace with “local 
planning scheme”. 

SUFFICIENT FENCES 

6. Terms “Special Residential” amended 

Wherever the term “Special Residential” is mentioned in the local law, replace with 
“Low Density”. 

7. Clause 4.(2)(c) amended 

At the beginning of this clause 4.(2)(c), add the words “on a Commercial Lot and”. 

GENERAL 

8. Clause 5(1) amended 

Clause 5(1) is amended by deleting “750mm” and substituting “1200mm”. 

9. New clause 8A inserted 

Insert a new clause 8A as follows— 

“Fences across rights-of-way, public access ways or thoroughfares 

 8A A person must not, without the approval of the local government, erect or 
maintain a fence or obstruction of a temporary or permanent nature across 
any right-of-way, public access way or thoroughfare so as to impede or 
prevent use of those facilities in the manner for which they are intended or 
constructed.” 

10. Clause 8 is amended 

In clause 8— 

 (a) in subclause 8 (2)(a), delete “or”; 

 (b) at the end of subclause (2)(b) insert “or”; and 

 (c) following subclause (2)(b) insert— 

 “(c) the visual amenity of the locality.” 

FENCING MATERIALS 

11. Clause 10 heading amended 

In the heading of clause 10, delete the words “and Broken Glass” and add to the end 
of the heading “and spiked or jagged materials” 

OFFENCES 

12. Clause 16 amended 

Clause 16 is amended as follows— 

 (a) in subclause (1) delete “Act” and insert “Local Government Act 1995”; and 

 (b) in subclause (2) delete “$125” and insert “$250”. 

13. New clause 18 inserted 

Clause 18 is inserted as follows— 

“Objections and Review 

When the local government makes a decision under this local law, the provision 
of Part 9 Division 1 of the Local Government Act 1995, and regulation 33 of the 
Local Government (Functions and General) Regulations 1996, apply to that 
decision.” 



1208 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 19 April 2016 

FIRST SCHEDULE 

14. Item 2 of the First Schedule is amended 

In the First Schedule, add to item 2, Fence Materials— 

 (d)  Brick, stone or concrete 

 (e)  Composite Materials (brick piers combined with another material) 

15. Items 6 and 7 inserted 

In the First Schedule following item 5, insert— 

Brick, stone or concrete fence 

 6 A fence constructed of brick, stone or concrete, shall satisfy the following 
requirements and specifications— 

 (a) a site classification is to be provided by a professional engineer in 
accordance with Australian Standard 2870-2011 Residential slabs and 
footing, as amended from time to time; 

 (b) the footing is to be designed in accordance with AS 2870-2011 
Residential slabs and footings as amended from time to time; 

 (c) footings of minimum 225mm x 150mm concrete 15MPa or 300mm x 
175mm brick laid in cement mortar; 

 (d) fences to be offset a minimum of 200mm at maximum 3 000mm centres 
or 225mm x 100mm engaged piers to be provided at maximum 3 000mm 
centres; 

 (e) expansion joints in accordance with the manufacturer’s written 
instructions; and 

 (f) the height of the fence to be 1 800mm except with respect to the front set 
back area for which there is no minimum height but which is subject to 
clause 51. 

Composite fence 

 7 A composite fence shall satisfy the following specifications for the brick 
construction— 

 1. (a) brick piers of minimum 345mm x 345mm at 1 800mm centres bonded 
to a minimum height base wall of 514mm; 

 (b) each pier shall be reinforced with one R10 galvanised starting rod  
1 500mm high with a 250mm horizontal leg bedded into a 500mm x 
200mm concrete footing and set 65mm above the base of the footing. 
The top of the footing shall be 1 course (85mm) below ground level; 

 (c) the minimum ultimate strength of brickwork shall by 20MPa. Mortar 
shall be a mix of 1 part cement, 1 part lime and 6 parts sand; 

 (d) the ground under the footings is to be compacted to 6 blows per 
300mm and checked with a standard falling weight penetrometer; and 

 (e) control joints in brickwork shall be provided with double piers at a 
maximum of 6-metre centres; or 

 2. (a) brick piers of a minimum 345mm x 345mm x 2 700mm centres bonded 
to the base wall; and 

 (b) each pier shall be reinforced with two R10 galvanised starting rods as 
previously specified. 

THIRD SCHEDULE 

16. Third Schedule amended 

In the title of the Third Schedule insert the words “a commercial lot or” immediately 
following “Specifications for a Sufficient Fence in”. 

FOURTH SCHEDULE 

17. Item 1 amended 

In item 1 of the Fourth Schedule, insert “be less than 100mm nor” immediately after 
“A dividing fence shall not”. 

———— 
Dated: 4 April 2016. 

The Common Seal of the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup was affixed by authority of a 
resolution of the Council in the presence of— 

Cr ANGELO LOGIUDICE, President. 
JOHN ATTWOOD, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 



19 April 2016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1209 

LG304* 

Local Government Act 1995 

Local Government (Narembeen - Councillor 

Numbers) Order 2016 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council on the recommendation of 

the Minister for Local Government. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Local Government (Narembeen - Councillor 

Numbers) Order 2016. 

2. Commencement 

  This order comes into operation as follows — 

 (a) clauses 1 and 2 — on the day on which this order is 

published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the order — on the day after that day. 

3. Change in number of councillors 

  The number of offices of councillor on the council of the Shire 

of Narembeen is 8. 

R. KENNEDY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

 

 

 

——————————— 
 

 



1210 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 19 April 2016 

— PART 2 — 

AGRICULTURE AND FOOD 

AG401* 

SOIL AND LAND CONSERVATION ACT 1945 

KATANNING LAND CONSERVATION DISTRICT  
(APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS OF DISTRICT COMMITTEE) INSTRUMENT 2016 

Made by the Commissioner of Soil and Land Conservation. 

1. Citation 

This Instrument may be cited as the Katanning Land Conservation District (Appointment of 
Members) Instrument 2016. 

2. Appointment of members 

Under section 23(2b) of the Act and clause 5(1) of the Soil and Land Conservation (Katanning Land 
Conservation District Order 1990*, the following members are appointed to the land conservation 
district committee for the Katanning Land Conservation District— 

 (a) on the nomination of the Shire of Katanning: delete Cr Robert Godfrey and insert Cr Serena 
Sandwell of Katanning; 

  (b) as persons actively engaged in, or affected by or associated with, land use in the district— 

delete 

 (i) Ernest Maples of Ewlyamartup; and 

 (ii) Sue Rocchi of Katanning 

insert 

 (i) Michael Quartermaine of Katanning 

 (ii) Matt Collis of Katanning 

(*Published in the Gazette of 6 July 1990 at pp. 3268-3269 and Amendment Orders approved by 
Executive Council on 11 March 1997 and 16 November 1999 {refer to Department of Agriculture and 
Food reference: 153852V1}). 

3. Term of office 

Members appointed to the committee under this instrument will hold office for a term expiring on 
23 March 2019. 

ANDREW WATSON, Commissioner of Soil and Land Conservation. 

Dated this 23rd day of March 2016.  

CORRECTIVE SERVICES 

CS401* 

PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Department of Corrective 
Services has issued the following Permit to do High-Level Security Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Issue Date 

Lizee Michelle Dawn PA 0172 14 April 2016 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

GREG THATCHER, Assistant Director. 
14 April 2016. 



19 April 2016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1211 

HEALTH 

HE401* 

MENTAL HEALTH ACT 2014 

MENTAL HEALTH (AUTHORISED MENTAL HEALTH PRACTITIONERS)  
REVOCATION ORDER (NO. 2) 2016 

Made by the Chief Psychiatrist under section 539 of the Mental Health Act. 

1. Citation 

This Order may be cited as the Mental Health (Authorised Mental Health Practitioners) Revocation 
Order (No. 2) 2016. 

2. Commencement 

This Order comes into operation as follows— 

 (a) clauses 1 and 2—on the day on which this order is published in the Gazette; 

 (b) clause 3—on the day after that day. 

3. Revocation of designation 

The designation, as an authorised mental health practitioner of the mental health practitioners 
specified in Schedule 1 to this order is revoked. 

Schedule 1 

Brabzon, Vernon Registered Nurse (Division 1) 

Alexander, Adrian Registered Nurse (Division 1) 

Archer, Dee Registered Mental Health Nurse 

Axon, Graeme Mental Health Nurse 

Fidyka, Natalia  Psychologist 

Gibbons, Adie Registered Mental Health Nurse 

Hanslip, Stephen Mental Health Nurse 

Harris, Carey  Mental Health Nurse 

Irons,Eileen Registered Mental Health Nurse 

Keily, Mandy Social Worker 

Kennedy Aidian Mental Health Nurse 

Kleinman, Diane Mental Health Nurse 

McNamara, Liz Mental Health Nurse 

O’Dea, Sara Social Worker 

Plane, Darren Mental Health Nurse 

Read, Frances Registered Nurse (Division 1) 

Reed, Victoria Mental Health Nurse 

Rogowski, Andre Mental Health Nurse 

Rolfe, Geraldine Registered Nurse (Division 1) 

Russell, Adrienne  Mental Health Nurse 

Shaw, Heather Registered Nurse (Division 1) 

Sheehan, Paula Registered Nurse (Division 1) 

Soiza, Kenneth Mental Health Nurse 

Sommer, Mike Community Mental Health Nurse 

Stevens, Barry Mental Health Nurse  

Taylor, John Mental Health Nurse  

Tengende, John Masimba Mental Health Nurse 

Walling, Sam Registered Nurse (Division 1) 

Warnock, Michael Mental Health Nurse 

Watson, Karen  Registered Nurse (Division 1) 

Whitworth, Lisa Mental Health Nurse 

Dr NATHAN GIBSON, Chief Psychiatrist. 

12 April 2016. 



1212 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 19 April 2016 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MA401* 

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 1958 

SWIMMING PROHIBITED AREA  

Elizabeth Quay 

Swan River, Perth 

Department of Transport, 
Fremantle WA, 19 April 2016. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 10A of the Navigable Waters Regulations 1958, I 
hereby prohibit swimming within the following area— 

Swan River: All those waters within the Elizabeth Quay inlet bounded in the west, north and 
east by the shoreline and in the south by (i) the south western side of the pedestrian footbridge 
between position 31°57.539′S, 115°51.317′E and 31°57.554′S, 115°51.329′E (along the first  
35 metres of the bridge from its western end), and (ii) a line between 31°57.554′S, 115°51.329′E 
(on the footbridge) and 31°57.571′S, 115°51.366′E (on the artificial island), dissecting the port and 
starboard navigational markers at the entrance to the quay and (iii) back to the shoreline of the 
artificial island. All coordinates based on GDA 94. 

With the exception of all nominated waters during ‘specified times’ for official participants of aquatic 
events approved under Regulation 51C of the Navigable Waters Regulations 1958. 

CHRISTOPHER J. MATHER, Director Waterways Safety Management, 
Department of Transport. 

PLANNING 

PL401* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME MINOR AMENDMENT 1309/57 

INDUSTRIAL ZONING ANOMALIES 

Call for Public Submissions 

The Western Australian Planning Commission (WAPC) intends to amend the Metropolitan Region 
Scheme (MRS) for land in the local government of Cockburn, Kwinana, Rockingham and Swan and is 
seeking public comment. 

The proposed amendment comprises three proposals relating to Industrial and Special Industrial 
zoning anomalies in the Perth Metropolitan Region for the purpose of aligning MRS zones with the 
cadastral boundaries. The amendment proposes the following rezonings— 

Proposal 1—City of Swan 

To rezone approximately 0.65 ha from the Rural zone to the Industrial zone, being a portion of 
Lot 1 Clayton Street, Bellevue, to align the MRS zoning to the cadastral boundaries of the lot. 

Proposal 2—Cities of Rockingham and Kwinana 

To rezone approximately 0.33 ha from the Parks and Recreation reservation to the Special 
Industrial zone over the existing Kwinana Beach Road, and to transfer approximately 0.32 ha of 
Crown Reserve 48553 from the Special Industrial zone to the Parks and Recreation reservation to 
align with the cadastral boundaries of the Reserve. 

Proposal 3—City of Cockburn 

To rezone approximately 30.63 ha from the Industrial zone to the Waterways reservation in the 
Henderson area to reflect the existing cadastral boundaries of adjacent Lot 804 Quill Way, 
Henderson, which is reclaimed land. No further land reclamation is proposed. 

The Western Australian Planning Commission certifies that, in its opinion, the proposed amendment 
does not constitute a substantial alteration to the MRS. 

The plans showing the proposed change and the WAPC amendment report which explains the 
proposal, will be available for public inspection from Tuesday 19 April 2016 to Friday 24 June 2016 
at— 

  Western Australian Planning Commission, 140 William Street, Perth 

  J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 

  City of Cockburn,  

  City of Kwinana,  

  City of Rockingham 

  City of Swan. 



19 April 2016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1213 

Documents are also available from the PlanningWA website www.planning.wa.gov.au. 

Any person who desires to make a submission to support, object or provide comment on any part of 
the proposed amendment should do so on a form 57. This submission form is available from the 
display locations, the amendment report and the internet. 

Submissions must be lodged with the: Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission, 
140 William Street, Perth WA 6000; on or before 5 pm Friday 24 June 2016. 

Late submissions will not be considered. 

KERRINE BLENKINSOP, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

 

——————————— 
 

PL402* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

Shire of Toodyay 

Local Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 10 

Ref: TPS/1743 

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Toodyay Local Planning 
Scheme amendment on 23 February 2016 for the purpose of— 

 1. Deleting the following clauses from the Scheme Text, as they have been superseded by the 
deemed provisions set out in the Planning and Development (Local Planning Scheme) 
Regulations 2015 Schedule 2— 

 a. Clauses 2.1 to 2.5 (inclusive); 

 b. Clause 5.7 (inclusive); 

 c. Clause 5.11.5;  

 d. Clause 5.24 (inclusive); and  

 e. Clauses 7.1 to 11.7 (inclusive); 

 2. Deleting Schedules 6 to 9 (inclusive) from the Scheme, as they have been superseded by the 
deemed provisions set out in the Planning and Development (Local Planning Scheme) 
Regulations 2015 Schedule 2; 

 3. Removing the following clauses from the Scheme Text and inserting them into Schedule A—
Supplemental Provisions— 

 a. Clause 8.2(b), (v), (vii) and (ix); 

 b. Clause 8.2(c); 

 c. Clause 8.2(f) 

 d. Clause 8.2(g) 

 e. Clause 8.2(h); and 

 f. Clause 8.2(i); 

 4. Inserting the following provisions into Schedule A—Supplemental Provisions— 

 a. the erection or extension of a single house on a lot if a single house is a permitted (“P”) 
use in the zone (where the R Codes do not apply) in which that lot is located, where the 
development standards set out in the scheme for that particular zone (including 
boundary setbacks) are satisfied, unless the development is located in a place that is— 

 (i) entered in the Register of Heritage Places under the Heritage of Western 
Australia Act 1990; or 

 (ii) the subject of an order under Part 6 of the Heritage of Western Australia 
Act 1990; or 

 (iii) included on a heritage list prepared in accordance with this Scheme; or 

 (iv) within an area designated under the Scheme as a heritage area; or 

 (v) the subject of a heritage agreement entered into under the Heritage of Western 
Australia Act 1990 section 29; 

 b. the erection or extension of an outbuilding, external fixture, boundary wall or fence, 
patio, pergola, veranda, garage, carport or swimming pool on the same lot as a single 
house if a single house is a permitted (“P”) in the zone (where the R Codes do not apply) 
where the development standards set out in the scheme for that particular zone 
(including boundary setbacks) are satisfied, unless the development is located in a 
place that is— 

 (i) entered in the Register of Heritage Places under the Heritage of Western 
Australia Act 1990; or 

 (ii) the subject of an order under the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 Part 6; 
or 

 (iii) included on a heritage list prepared in accordance with this Scheme; or 



1214 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 19 April 2016 

 (iv) within an area designated under the Scheme as a heritage area; or 

 (v) the subject of a heritage agreement entered into under the Heritage of Western 
Australia Act 1990 section 29; or 

 5. Delete the following definitions from Schedule 1, as they have been superseded by the 
definitions in the deemed provisions set out in the Planning and Development (Local 
Planning Scheme) Regulations 2015 Schedule 2— 

 a. Advertisement; 

 b. Amenity; 

 c. Cultural heritage significance; 

 d. Local government; 

 e. Local Planning Strategy; 

 f. Owner; 

 g. Place; 

 h. Premises; 

 i. Residential Design Codes; 

 j. Substantially commenced; and 

 k. Zone; 

 6. Amend the following clauses by removing the cross reference to the clause deleted by the 
amendment and replace them with cross reference to deemed provisions set out in the 
Planning and Development (Local Planning Scheme) Regulations 2015 Schedule 2— 

 a. Clause 3.4.1 

 b. Clause 3.4.2(a) 

 c. Clause 4.3.2 

 d. Clause 4.3.3(note) 

 e. Clause 4.4.2(b) 

 f. Clause 4.8(c) 

 g. Clause 4.9.2 

 h. Clause 5.4.2 

 i. Clause 5.5.2(a) 

 j. Clause 5.5.3(a) 

 k. Clause 5.9.4 

 l. Clause 5.13.2 

 m. Schedule 2—Additional Uses, No. 6; 

 7. Delete reference to the following terms and replace them with the corresponding term 
throughout the Scheme— 

 a. ‘planning application’ / ‘consent’ to ‘development application’ / ‘approval’; 

 b. ‘Council’ to ‘local government’  

 c. ‘Town Planning Regulations 1967’ to ‘Planning and Development (Local Planning 
Scheme) Regulations 2015’; 

 d. ‘Scheme Text’ to ‘deemed provisions’ (where relevant); 

 e. ‘Minister for the Environment’ to ‘Environmental Protection Act 1986’; and  

 f. ‘Planning and Development Act’ to ‘Planning and Development Act 2005’; 

 8. Update the following clauses and definitions as detailed below— 

 a. Clause 1.4—adding new subclauses (b) and (c) to reference the new Regulations and 
supplemental provisions in new Schedule A; 

 b. Clause 5.11.1—para. 2 by deleting 2nd sentence; deleting para. 3 and renumber para. 4 
as (b); 

 9. Modify the zoning table to make ‘Ancillary Accommodation’ a ‘P’ use in the Residential zone; 

  (this is to bring the permissibility in line with the exemption under 61(1)(d) of the deemed 
provisions) 

 10. Modify the zoning table to make a ‘Transportable Structure’ a ‘D’ use in all zones; 

  (this is to ensure that a development application is still required for transportable structures 
and is not exempt development) 

 11. Update the Clause 5.11.7(a) reference to approval authority from local government to the 
Western Australian Planning Commission to reflect provisions of new Regulations; 

 12. Insert Clause 6.1.1(c) ‘Wetland/River Channel’ under Part 6—Special Control Areas— 

 13. Insert Clause 5.4 provisions relating to flood prone land now known as ‘Wetlands/River 
Channel Special Control Area’ as follows— 

 a. 5.4.1 Purpose 

  The purpose of the Wetlands/River Channel Special Control Area is to manage 
development within the flood fringe or floodway of the Avon River as identified on the 
Scheme Maps as wetlands/river channel; 



19 April 2016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1215 

 b. 5.4.2 Application requirements 

  Development approval is required for all development within this special control area; 

 c. 5.4.3 Relevant considerations 

  Any application for subdivision or development on land within a floodway or flood 
fringe as identified on the Scheme Maps as Wetland/River Channel is to be referred to 
the Department of Water and the local government shall pay due regard to any advice 
received on such applications; 

 14. Inserting reference to the deemed provisions in the preamble to the Scheme; 

 15. Renumber the remaining scheme provisions and schedules sequentially and update any cross 
referencing to the new clause numbers as required. 

D. DOW, President. 
S. SCOTT, Chief Executive Officer. 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PR401* 

INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor, in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment— 

Hon J. H. D. Day MLA to act temporarily in the office of Minister for Education; Aboriginal 
Affairs; Electoral Affairs in the absence of the Hon P. C. Collier MLC for the period 9 to 17 July 
2016 (both dates inclusive). 

PETER CONRAN, Director General, 
 Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

 

——————————— 
 

PR402* 

INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor, in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment— 

Hon A. J. Simpson MLA to act temporarily in the office of Minister for Environment; Heritage in 
the absence of the Hon A. P. Jacob MLA for the period 18 to 29 July 2016 (both dates inclusive). 

PETER CONRAN, Director General, 
 Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES TRIBUNAL 

SA401* 

SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT 1975 

DETERMINATION VARIATION 

PREAMBLE 

The Salaries and Allowances Tribunal has issued a determination with respect to the Managing 
Directors of the State Training Institutes within the Special Division of the Public Service. 

DETERMINATION 

The determination of the Salaries and Allowances Tribunal made on 23 June 2015 under sections 
6(1)(c), (d) and (e) of the Salaries and Allowances Act 1975, as amended from time to time, is hereby 
varied by a further determination set out below.  

This variation is effective on and from 11 April 2016. 



1216 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 19 April 2016 

Delete the following references to the offices below as they appear in ‘Table 1—Special Division CEOs’ 
within Part 1 of the First Schedule— 

Table: 1—Special Division CEOs 

Office Department or Agency Band Office Holder Annual 
Salary 

Managing 
Director 

Central Institute of Technology 4 N. Fernandes $216,804 

Managing 
Director 

Challenger Institute of Technology 4 T. Durant $199,636 

Managing 
Director 

CY O’Connor Institute  4 J. Scott $199,636 

Managing 
Director 

Durack Institute of Technology 4 W. (Bill) Swetman $199,636 

Managing 
Director 

Goldfields Institute of Technology 4 K. Doig $199,636 

Managing 
Director 

Great Southern Institute of 
Technology 

4 L. Rozlapa $199,636 

Managing 
Director 

Kimberley Training Institute  4 K. Dickinson $199,636 

Managing 
Director 

Pilbara Institute  4 M. Boundy $199,636 

Managing 
Director 

Polytechnic West  4 J. Jamieson $199,636 

Managing 
Director 

South West Institute of Technology  4 D. Anderson $199,636 

Managing 
Director 

West Coast Institute of Training 4 M. Hoad $199,636 

Insert the offices below into ‘Table 1—Special Division CEOs’ within Part 1 of the First Schedule— 

Table: 1—Special Division CEOs 

Office Department or Agency Band Office Holder Annual 
Salary 

Managing 
Director 

South Metropolitan TAFE Under Review Vacant $- 

Managing 
Director 

North Metropolitan TAFE Under Review Vacant $- 

Managing 
Director 

South Regional TAFE Under Review Vacant $- 

Managing 
Director 

Central Regional TAFE Under Review Vacant $- 

Managing 
Director 

North Regional TAFE Under Review Vacant $- 

Delete the following references to the offices below as they appear in ‘Table 9—District Allowances’ 
within Part 4 of the First Schedule— 

Table: 9—District Allowances 

Office Department or Agency Office Holder Annual District 
Allowance 

(Standard Rate) 

Managing 
Director 

Durack Institute of Technology W. (Bill) Swetman $1,239 

Managing 
Director 

Goldfields Institute of Technology K. Doig $2,354 

Managing 
Director 

Kimberley Training Institute  K. Dickinson $8,361 

Managing 
Director 

Pilbara Institute  M. Boundy $9,449 

Insert the offices below into ‘Table 9—District Allowances’ within Part 4 of the First Schedule— 

Table: 9—District Allowances 

Office Department or Agency Office Holder Annual District 
Allowance 

(Standard Rate) 

Managing 
Director 

Central Regional TAFE Vacant Under Review 

Managing 
Director 

North Regional TAFE Vacant Under Review 



19 April 2016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1217 

Delete the following references to the offices below as they appear in ‘Table 10—Travel Allowances—
Annual Leave Travel Concessions’ within Part 4 of the First Schedule— 

Table: 10—Travel Allowances—Annual Leave Travel Concessions 

Office Department or Agency Office Holder 

Managing Director Goldfields Institute of Technology K. Doig 

Managing Director Kimberley Training Institute K. Dickinson 

Managing Director Pilbara Institute  M. Boundy 

Insert the offices below into ‘Table 10—Travel Allowances—Annual Leave Travel Concessions’ within 
Part 4 of the First Schedule— 

Table: 10—Travel Allowances—Annual Leave Travel Concessions 

Office Department or Agency Office Holder 

Managing Director Central Regional TAFE Vacant 

Managing Director North Regional TAFE Vacant 

Delete the following references to the offices below as they appear in ‘Table 11—Rental Subsidies’ 
within Part 4 of the First Schedule— 

Table: 11—Rental Subsidies 

Office Department or Agency Office Holder Maximum Annual 
Rental Subsidy 

Managing 
Director 

Goldfields Institute of Technology K. Doig $13,300 

Managing 
Director 

Pilbara Institute  M. Boundy $13,700 

Insert the following references to the offices below into ‘Table 11—Rental Subsidies’ within Part 4 of 
the First Schedule— 

Table: 11—Rental Subsidies 

Office Department or Agency Office Holder Maximum Annual 
Rental Subsidy 

Managing 
Director 

Central Regional TAFE Vacant Under Review 

Managing 
Director 

North Regional TAFE Vacant Under Review 

Delete the following references to the offices below as they appear in ‘Table 13—Electricity Subsidies’ 
within Part 4 of the First Schedule— 

Table: 13—Electricity Subsidies 

Office Department or Agency Office Holder Maximum Annual 
Electricity Subsidy 

Managing 
Director 

Goldfields Institute of Technology K. Doig $1,665 

Managing 
Director 

Kimberley Training Institute K. Dickinson $1,554 

Managing 
Director 

Pilbara Institute  M. Boundy $2,999 

Insert the following references to the offices below into ‘Table 13—Electricity Subsidies’ within Part 4 
of the First Schedule— 

Table: 13—Electricity Subsidies 

Office Department or Agency Office Holder Maximum Annual 
Electricity Subsidy 

Managing 
Director 

Central Regional TAFE Vacant Under Review 

Managing 
Director 

North Regional TAFE Vacant Under Review 

Signed on 12 April 2016.  

 W. S. COLEMAN AM, C. A. BROADBENT, B. J. MOORE, 
 Chairman. Member. Member. 

Salaries and Allowances Tribunal. 

 

——————————— 
 




