
[3231]

orgrantent
OF

WESTE 9 AUSTRALIA
(Published by Authority at 3.30 p.m.)

No. 76]
	

PERTH: WEDNESDAY, 23rd AUGUST	 [ 1972

COMPANIES ACT, 1961-1971.

Crown Law Department,
Perth, 9th August, 1972.

HIS Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting under the pro-
visions of section 384 of the Companies Act, 1961-1971, has been pleased to
make the regulations set forth in the Schedule hereunder.

W. J. ROBINSON,
Under Secretary For Law.

Principal
regulations.

Reg. 12
amended.

Schedule.
Regulations.

1. In these regulations the Companies (Auditors Board) Regula-
tions, 1962, published in the Government Gazette on the 27th
September, 1962 and amended by a notice so published on the 12th
March, 1963, are referred to as the principal regulations.

2. Regulation 12 of the principal regulations is amended
(a) by substituting for the words "seven pounds seven shillings"

in line one of paragraph (a), the words "twenty-five dol-
lars"; and

(b) by substituting for the words "six pounds six shillings" in
line one of paragraph (b), the words "eighteen dollars".

FIRE BRIGADES ACT, 1942-1971.

Chief Secretary's Department,
Perth, 9th August, 1972.

HIS Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting pursuant to the
provisions of the Fire Brigades Act, 1942-1971, has been pleased to make the
regulations set forth in the Schedule hereunder.

C. W. CAMPBELL,
Secretary.

Principal
regulations.

Reg. 190
amended.

Schedule.
Regulations.

1. In these regulations the Fire Brigades Act Regulations re-
printed pursuant to the Reprinting of Regulations Act, 1954, and
published in the Government Gazette on the 28th April, 1965, as
amended from time to time thereafter by notices so published, are
referred to as the principal regulations.

2. Regulation 190 of the principal regulations is amended by
substituting for the words "ten pounds" in line twelve, the words
"one hundred dollars".




