
51i5( GOVERNMENT GAZETTE. WA 1( Nov r mbcar 2012

Item Description Fee
S

28. For the certification of a copy of ,a licence, a permit or a
decision of the Commission (or the former liquor
LicensingCourt) or the 1)i rector ........................................ 25
[In addition, to tlic [CC LIr,dcr- itcr„ 271

29. Supply of copy of documentation, other than that aIrcad\
prescribed. per page ........................................................... 4

0. Issue of a summons to a witness ........................................ 20

11. For a search of the database of records of I icences — per
licence................................................................................ 35

Fora hill ,carer cif' n l iccncc rcc.orcl ...................................

3. Fora search of postcodes

(a) 1 to 10 postcodes ..................................................... 35

(h) more than 10 postcodes ........................................... 75

By Command of the Governor..

R. KENNEDY. Clerk of the Executive Council.

RA306*

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Act 1990

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment
Regulations 2012

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Racing Penalties (Appeals)
1 rnrendinent Regulations 2012.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows

(a) regulations I and 2 on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations on I .lanuary 2013.

3. Regul.aturns amended

These regulations amend the Racing Penalties (Appeals)
Regulations 1991.



16 Nove mb c'r 2012 CTOVERNITENT CTAZETTE. W '1 5057

4. Regulation 4 amended

(1) In regulation 4(1):

(a) in paragraph (a) delete "$140; and" and insert:

$143; and

(b) in para^g r-aph (b) delete "$340." and insert:

$349.

(2) In regulation 4(2):

(a) in paraw-aph (a)(i) delete `'$140; and"" and insert:

$143: and

(b) in paragraph (a)(ii) delete "$340;" and insert:

$349;

(c) delete "$70." and insert:

$71.

By Command cif - the Governor,

R. KENNEDY. Clerk of the Executive Council.

RA308*

Liquor Control Act 1988

Liquor Control Amendment Regulations
(No. 6) 2012

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Liquor Control Amendment
Regulations (No. 6) 2012.


