
STATE DEVELOPMENT  

SX301* 

 
Evaporites (Lake MacLeod) Agreement Act 1967 

Evaporites (Lake MacLeod) (Cape Cuvier 
Berth) Amendment By-laws 2011 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council on the recommendation of 
Dampier Salt Limited ACN 008 706 590. 

1. Citation 

  These by-laws are the Evaporites (Lake MacLeod) (Cape Cuvier 
Berth) Amendment By-laws 2011. 

2. Commencement 

  These by-laws come into operation as follows — 

 (a) by-laws 1 and 2 — on the day on which these by-laws 
are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the by-laws — on the day after that day. 

3. By-laws amended 

  These by-laws amend the Evaporites (Lake MacLeod) (Cape 
Cuvier Berth) By-laws 1991. 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 2 Part 1 delete “$0.008” and insert: 
 

  $0.016 
 

 (2) In Schedule 2 Part 2: 

 (a) delete “$0.012” and insert: 
 

  $0.024 
 

 (b) delete “$600.” and insert: 
 

  $1 200. 
 

29 July 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3147 



5. Schedule 3 amended 

 (1) Amend Schedule 3 clause 1 as set out in the Table: 

Table 

Delete Insert 

3 950 7 900 

4 700 9 400 

5 400 10 800 

6 250 12 500 

7 000 14 000 

7 800 15 600 

8 600 17 200 

9 350 18 700 

10 150 20 300 

10 900 21 800 

11 700 23 400 

12 500 25 000 

13 250 26 500 

14 050 28 100 

15 600 31 200 

17 150 34 300 

 (2) In Schedule clause 2 delete “$600” and insert: 
 

  $1 300 
 

 (3) In Schedule 3 clause 3 delete “$600” and insert: 
 

  $1 300 
 

6. Schedule 6 amended 

 (1) In Schedule 6 clause 1: 

 (a) delete “$600” and insert: 
 

  $1 200 

3148 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 July 2011 



 (b) delete “$150” and insert: 
 

  $300 
 

 (2) In Schedule 6 clause 2(1): 

 (a) delete “$0.025” and insert: 
 

  $0.05 
 

 (b) delete “$240.00” and insert: 
 

  $480.00 
 

 (3) In Schedule 6 clause 3: 

 (a) delete “$0.005” and insert: 
 

  $0.01 
 

 (b) delete “$250.00,” and insert: 
 

  $500.00, 
 

 (4) After Schedule 6 clause 3 insert: 
 

Pilotage services 

 4A. The charge payable for pilotage services provided in respect 
of a vessel is —  

Gross registered tonnage 
of vessel 

Charges for inward or 
outward pilotage 

$ 

Up to 10 000 6 000 

More than 10 000 but not 
more than 20 000 

 
7 300 

More than 20 000 but not 
more than 30 000 

 
8 700 

More than 30 000 but not 
more than 40 000 

 
10 100 

More than 40 000 11 900 

 
 
 

29 July 2011 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3149 



Recommended by Dampier Salt Limited ACN 008 706 590 
 

DENISE GOLDSWORTHY, Director. 

JANETTE PHILLIPS, Secretary. 

Date: 8 June 2011. 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 

3150 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 July 2011 


