
ROTTNEST ISLAND AUTHORITY 
RX301* 

Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987 

Rottnest Island Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Rottnest Island Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Rottnest Island Regulations 1988. 

4. Regulation 5 amended 

  In regulation 5(4) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

5. Regulation 11 amended 

 (1) In regulation 11(2) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (2) In regulation 11(3) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

6. Regulation 12 amended 

  In regulation 12(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 

5002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



7. Regulation 28 amended 

 (1) In regulation 28(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (2) In regulation 28(3) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (3) In regulation 28(5) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

8. Regulation 29 amended 

  In regulation 29(3) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

9. Regulation 30 amended 

 (1) In regulation 30(4) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (2)  In regulation 30(8) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

10. Regulation 36 amended 

  In regulation 36(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

11. Regulation 36A amended 

  In regulation 36A delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5003 

 



12. Regulation 37 amended 

 (1) In regulation 37(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

 (2)  In regulation 37(4) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

13. Regulation 41A amended 

  In regulation 41A(2) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

14. Regulation 42 amended 

  In regulation 42(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

15. Regulation 44 amended 

  In regulation 44(3) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

16. Regulation 52 amended 

  In regulation 52(2) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

17. Regulation 54 amended 

  In regulation 54 delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

18. Regulation 55 amended 

  In regulation 55(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

5004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



19. Regulation 56 amended 

  In regulation 56(1) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

20. Regulation 57 amended 

  In regulation 57 delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

21. Regulation 60A amended 

  In regulation 60A(2) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

22. Regulation 72A amended 

  In regulation 72A(5) delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

23. Regulation 74A amended 

  In regulation 74A delete the Penalty and insert: 
 

 Penalty: a fine of $750. 
 

24. Schedule 1 Form 2 amended 

  In Schedule 1 Form 2: 
 (a) in the item relating to regulation 5(4) delete “$50” and 

insert: 
 

  $150 
 

 (b) in the item relating to regulation 9(1) delete “$100” and 
insert: 

 
  $200 

 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5005 

 



 (c) delete the item relating to regulation 11(2)(a) and insert: 
 

 Regulation 11(2) — securing vessel to 
mooring without authority or without 
exhibiting sticker or licence 

 
 

$150 
 

 (d) delete the item relating to regulation 40 and insert: 
 

 Regulation 40(1) — interfering etc. with 
fauna or habitat etc. of fauna 

 
$200 

 
 (e) in the item relating to regulation 41(1) delete “$100” and 

insert: 
 

  $200 
 

 (f) in the item relating to regulation 41A(2) delete “$50” 
and insert: 

 
  $150 

 
 (g) in the item relating to regulation 59(1)(a) delete “$100” 

and insert: 
 

  $200 
 

 (h) in the item relating to regulation 60(1) delete “$100” and 
insert: 

 
  $200 

 
 (i) in the item relating to regulation 60B(1) delete “$100” 

and insert: 
 

  $200 
 

 (j) in the item relating to regulation 70(1)(c) delete “$80” 
and insert: 

 
  $200 

 
 (k) in the item relating to regulation 72(1) delete “$80” and 

insert: 
 

  $200 
 

5006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



25. Schedule 4 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 4 and insert: 
 

Schedule 4 — Offences to which modified penalties 
apply 

[r. 73] 

Item Regulation Matter to which regulation 
relates 

Modified 
penalty 

$ 

1. 5(4) Failing or refusing to pay 
admission, not being a passenger on 
commercial transport 

 
 

150 

2. 9(1) Taking up unauthorised casual 
residence 

 
200 

3. 11(1)(a) Installing mooring without 
permission 

 
200 

4. 11(1)(b) Securing vessel to mooring installed 
without permission 

 
200 

5. 11(2) Securing vessel to mooring without 
authority or without exhibiting 
sticker or licence 

 
 

150 

6. 11(3)(a) Securing vessel to mooring where 
vessel already secured 

 
150 

7. 11(3)(b) Securing vessel to vessel secured to 
mooring 

 
150 

8. 12(1) Anchoring vessel closer than 
50 metres to mooring or so that it 
obstructs mooring 

 
 

150 

9. 28(3) Licensee failing to have mooring 
inspection report 

 
150 

10. 28(5) Licensee using mooring in respect 
of which Authority does not have 
mooring inspection report 

 
 

150 

11. 29(3) Failing to comply with notice to 
move unattended vessel 

 
150 

12. 30(8) Removing mooring that is subject 
to notice prohibiting removal 

 
150 

13. 36(1)(a) Being in a restricted area without 
permission 

 
150 

14. 36(1)(b) Being in a protected area without 
permission 

 
150 

15. 36(1)(c) Using a closed track or path without 
permission 

 
150 

16. 36A(a) Securing vessel to structure not 
designed for that use 

 
150 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5007 

 



Item Regulation Matter to which regulation 
relates 

Modified 
penalty 

$ 

17. 36A(b) Using apparatus other than beach 
anchor as a beach anchor 

 
150 

18. 37(1)(a) Beaching vessel in Thomson, 
Longreach or Geordie Bay without 
permission and not in permitted 
area 

 
 
 

150 

19. 37(1)(b) Beach-anchoring a vessel in 
Thomson, Longreach or Geordie 
Bay without permission and not in 
permitted area 

 
 
 

150 

20. 38A(3) Exceeding speed limit set for vessel 
in defined area 

 
100 

21. 38B(3) Using vessel contrary to notice 
setting aside area and imposing 
conditions for use of that vessel 

 
 

200 

22. 38C(2) Discharging or depositing sullage 
from vessel other than by approved 
system 

 
 

200 

23. 39(1) Injuring etc. flora or removing stake 
or label relating to flora 

 
200 

24. 40(1) Interfering etc. with fauna or habitat 
etc. of fauna 

 
200 

25. 41(1) Without permission causing or 
allowing animal or bird to enter 
Island 

 
 

200 

26. 41A(2) Feeding fauna contrary to sign or 
notice 

 
150 

27. 42(1) Causing damage to any rock or soil 
without permission 

 
150 

28. 44(3) Failing to comply with traffic sign 
or with ranger’s signal or direction 
relating to vehicle 

 
 

150 

29. 47(1) Exceeding speed limit 100 

30. 53 Without permission organising, 
advertising or participating in any 
event or meeting 

 
 

200 

31. 55(1) Without permission affixing notice 
etc., defacing rock, tree, pavement, 
structure etc. or causing any such 
act to be done 

 
 
 

150 

32. 56(1) Without permission selling, 
distributing etc. printed or written 
matter 

 
 

150 

33. 59(1)(a) Without permission carrying or 
discharging firearm, speargun, 
gidgie etc. 

 
 

200 

5008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 December 2009 

 



Item Regulation Matter to which regulation 
relates 

Modified 
penalty 

$ 

34. 59(2) Without permission having, or 
discharging, explosive device 
within limits of Island 

 
 

200 

35. 60(1) Without permission lighting, 
making or using fire other than in 
gas stove or indoor fireplace 

 
 

200 

36. 60A(1) Sandboarding 200 

37. 60A(2) Possessing sandboard 150 

38. 60B(1) Littering 200 

39. 65(1) Being within aerodrome limits 
without permission or authority 

 
200 

40. 69 Without authority destroying or 
damaging building or structure 

 
200 

41. 70(1)(a) Unlawfully assaulting a person 200 

42. 70(1)(b) Using indecent, obscene, 
threatening, abusive or insulting 
language 

 
 

200 

43. 70(1)(c) Doing or engaging in any offensive, 
indecent or improper act, conduct or 
behaviour 

 
 

200 

44. 70(1)(d) Acting in such a way as to cause a 
nuisance or annoyance to persons 

 
200 

45. 70(3) Writing etc. or distributing or 
otherwise disseminating indecent or 
obscene matter 

 
 

200 

46. 71 Causing or producing noise that 
unreasonably interferes with 
convenience, comfort or amenity of 
any person 

 
 
 

200 

47. 72(1) Consuming alcoholic liquor in 
unauthorised place 

 
200 

 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
 

——————————— 
 

8 December 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5009 

 


