
5:118 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 9 October 2007 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

IG3o1* 

Betting Control Act 1954 

Betting Control Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Betting Control Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4)2007. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2 - on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations - on 1 January 2008. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Betting Control 
Regulations 1978. 

	

4. 	Regulation 17 amended 

(1) 	Regulation 17(1) is amended as follows: 

(a)  in paragraph (aa) by deleting "$35;" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	e1in. 	". 

4TU 	, 
(b)  in paragraph (ab) by deleting 	$55:' and inserting 

instead - 
" 	CA. JJ, 	". .4P 	, 

(c)  in paragraph (ac) by deleting "$275;" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$285; 

(d)  in paragraph (ad) by deleting "$55;" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	CA. JU, 	". 4P 	, 

(e)  in paragraph (a) by deleting "$550;" and inserting 
instead - 
44 	$575; 	"; 



9 October 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 5349 

(f)  in paragraph (ba) by deleting "$130;" and inserting 
instead - 
44 	$140; 

(g)  in paragraph (bb) by deleting "$70;" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	cic. 	". 

4PI..', 	, 
(h)  in paragraph (c) by deleting "$125;" and inserting 

instead - 
44 	$135; 

(i)  in paragraph (d) by deleting "$3.50;" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	CA. 	'. 

4P1, 	, 
(j)  in paragraph (f) by deleting "$510." and inserting 

instead - 
" 	$535. 

(2) Regulation 17(2) is amended by deleting "$80." and inserting 
instead - 
44 $85. ". 

(3) Regulation 17(3) is amended by deleting "$80." and inserting 
instead - 

" $85. ". 

	

5. 	Regulation 17A amended 

Regulation 17A(1)(a) is amended as follows: 
(a) in subparagraph (i) by deleting "$300;" and inserting 

instead - 
" $310; 

(b) in subparagraph (ii) by deleting "$605;" and inserting 
instead - 
" $630; 

(c) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting "$910," and inserting 
instead - 

" $950, ". 

	

6. 	Regulation 17B amended 

Regulation 1713(1)(a) is amended as follows: 
(a) in subparagraph (ii) - 

(i) by deleting "$120 000" and inserting instead - 
" $135000 "; 

(ii) by deleting "$35;" and inserting instead - 
" 	. CAfl 	

-)1 ,. 
4PTU  



5350 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 9 October 2007 

(b) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting "$120 000" and 
inserting instead — 

" $135000 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


