
RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 
RG301* 

Betting Control Act 1954 

Betting Control Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2009 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Betting Control Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2009. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2010. 

3. Regulations amended 

  These regulations amend the Betting Control Regulations 1978. 

4. Regulation 17 amended 

 (1) In regulation 17(1): 
 (a) in paragraph (ab) delete “$60;” and insert: 

 
  $65; 

 
 (b) in paragraph (ac) delete “$300;” and insert: 

 
  $310; 

 
 (c) in paragraph (a) delete “$595;” and insert: 

 
  $620; 

 
 (d) in paragraph (b) delete “$25;” and insert: 

 
  $30; 

4312 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 October 2009 

 



 (e) in paragraph (ba) delete “$145;” and insert: 
 

  $150; 
 

 (f) in paragraph (c) delete “$140;” and insert: 
 

  $145; 
 

 (g) in paragraph (e) delete “$25;” and insert: 
 

  $30; 
 

 (h) in paragraph (f) delete “$550.” and insert: 
 

  $575. 
 

 (2) In regulation 17(2) delete “$90.” and insert: 
 

  $95. 
 

 (3) In regulation 17(3) delete “$90.” and insert: 
 

  $95. 
 

5. Regulation 17A amended 

  In regulation 17A(1): 
 (a) in paragraph (a)(i) delete “$315;” and insert: 

 
  $340; 

 
 (b) in paragraph (a)(ii) delete “$635;” and insert: 

 
  $685; 

 
 (c) in paragraph (a)(iii) delete “$955;” and insert: 

 
  $1 030; 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

PETER CONRAN, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

30 October 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4313 

 


