
10 July 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3417  

FI301* 

Pearling Act 1990 

Pearling (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Pearling (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Pearling 
(General) Regulations 1991* . 

r Reprint 2 as at 5 May 2006.1 

	

4. 	Regulation 6 amended 

Regulation 6(1) is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$2 000.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $2 170.00 "; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting -$345.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $375.00 "; 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$345.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $375.00 ". 



3418 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 10 July 2007  

5. Regulation 8 amended 

Regulation 8 is amended by deleting "$70.00" in each place 
where it occurs and inserting instead — 

" $76.00 

6. Regulation 9 amended 

Regulation 9(1) is amended in the Table as follows: 

(a) by deleting "628" and inserting instead — 

" 680 "; 

(b) by deleting "70" in both places where it occurs and 
inserting instead — 

" 76 "; 

(c) by deleting "390" and inserting instead — 

" 420 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


