
26 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3013  

EN301* 

Energy Operators (Powers) Act 1979 

Energy Operators (Electricity Retail 
Corporation) (Charges) Amendment 

By-laws 2007 

Made by the Electricity Retail Corporation with the approval of the 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. 	Citation 

These by-laws are the Energy Operators (Electricity Retail 
Corporation) (Charges) Amendment By-laws 2007. 



3014 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 26 June 2007 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These by-laws come into operation as follows: 

(a) by-laws 1 and 2 - on the day on which these by-laws 
are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the by-laws - on 1 July 2007. 

	

3. 	The by-laws amended 

The amendments in these by-laws are to the Energy Operators 
(Electricity Retail Corporation) (Charges) By-laws 2006*. 

[* Published in Gazette 31 March 2006, p. 1225-46 
For amendments to 7 June 2007 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.1 

	

4. 	Schedule 1 amended 

(1) Schedule 1 clause 3(1) is repealed. 

(2) After Schedule 1 clause 3(2) the following subclause is 
inserted - 

(3) Tariff R  is subject to the following conditions - 

(a) the consumer agrees to take the tariff for a 
minimum period of 12 months; 

(b) the consumer pays the fee set out in Schedule 4 
item 11; 

(c) the consumer satisfies the corporation that the 
amount of electricity supplied to the consumer's 
premises will be less than 50 megawatt hours per 
annum. 

(3) After Schedule 1 clause 3 the following clause is inserted - 

3A. 	Tariff R3 (time of use tariff) 

(1) Tariff R3 comprises for each supply period specified in the 
first column of the Table to this subclause - 

(a) a fixed charge at the rate per day set out opposite 
the supply period in the second column of that 
Table; and 

(b) an energy charge consisting of- 

(i) an on peak energy charge at the rate per unit 
set out opposite the supply period in the 
third column of that Table; and 

(ii) an off peak energy charge at the rate per 
unit set out opposite the supply period in the 
fourth column of that Table. 



26 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3015 

(4) 

Table 

Supply period Fixed Energy charge 
charge On peak Off peak 

1 July 2007 to $1.19 20.85 cents 6.43 cents 
30 June 2008 
1 July 2008 to $1.25 21.89 cents 6.75 cents 
30 June 2009 
1 July 2009 to $1.31 22.99 cents 7.09 cents 
30 June 2010 
1 July 2010 to $1.38 24.14 cents 7.44 cents 
30 June 20!! 
1 July 2011 to $1.44 25.35 cents 7.82 cents 
30 June 2012 

(2) Tariff R3 is subject to the following conditions - 
(a) the consumer agrees to take the tariff for a 

minimum period of 12 months; 
(b) the consumer pays the fee set out in Schedule 4 

item 11; 
(c) the consumer satisfies the corporation that the 

amount of electricity supplied to the consumer's 
premises will be 50 megawatt hours or more per 
annum. 

Schedule 1 clause 4(2) is repealed and the following subclause 
is inserted instead - 

(2) Tariff S! comprises for each supply period specified in the 
first column of the Table to this subclause - 

(a) a minimum charge at the rate per day set out 
opposite the supply period in the second column of 
that Table; and 

(b) a demand charge at the rate per day set out opposite 
the supply period in the third column of that Table 
multiplied by - 

(i) the on peak half-hourly maximum demand; 
or 

(ii) 30% of the off peak half-hourly maximum 
demand, 

whichever is the greater; and 
(c) an energy charge consisting of- 

(i) an on peak energy charge at the rate per unit 
set out opposite the supply period in the 
fourth column of that Table; and 

(ii) an off peak energy charge at the rate per 
unit set out opposite the supply period in the 
fifth column of that Table. 



3016 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 26 June 2007 

Table 

Supply period Minimum 
charge 

Demand 
charge 

Energy charge 
Off 

peak 	peak 

1 July 2007 to $263.96 67.06 9.61 6.08 
30 June 2008 cents cents cents 
1 July 2008 to $277.16 70.41 10.09 6.39 
30 June 2009 cents cents cents 
1 July 2009 to $291.02 73.93 10.60 6.71 
30 June 2010 cents cents cents 
l July 2OiOto $305.57 77.63 11.13 7.04 
30 June 2011 cents cents cents 
l July 2011to $320.84 81.51 11.69 7.39 
30 June 2012 cents cents cents 

(5) Schedule 1 clause 5(2) is repealed and the following subclause 
is inserted instead - 

(2) Tariff Ti comprises for each supply period specified in the 
first column of the Table to this subclause - 

(a) a minimum charge at the rate per day set out 
opposite the supply period in the second column of 
that Table; and 

(b) a demand charge at the rate per day set out opposite 
the supply period in the third column of that Table 
multiplied by - 

(i) the on peak half-hourly maximum demand; 
or 

(ii) 30% of the off peak half-hourly maximum 
demand, 

whichever is the greater; and 

(c) an energy charge consisting of- 

(i) an on peak energy charge at the rate per unit 
set out opposite the supply period in the 
fourth column of that Table; and 

(ii) an off peak energy charge at the rate per 
unit set out opposite the supply period in the 
fifth column of that Table. 

Table 

Supply period Minimum Demand Etiergy charge 
charge charge On Off 

peak peak 

1 July 2007 to $348.23 61.36 8.98 5.98 
30 June 2008 cents cents cents 
1 July 2008 to $365.64 64.43 9.43 6.28 
30 June 2009 cents cents cents 
1 July 2009 to $383.92 67.65 9.90 6.60 
30 June 2010 cents cents cents 



26 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3017  

Supply period Minimum 
charge 

Demand 
charge 

Energy charge 
On 	Off 

peak 	peak 
1 July 2010 to 
30 June 2011 
1 July 2011 to 
30 June 2012 

$403.12 

$423.28 

71.03 
cents 
74.58 
cents 

10.40 
cents 
10.92 
cents 

6.93 
cents 
7.27 
cents 

(6) Schedule 1 clause 6(1) is amended by inserting after "R1," — 
" R3, ". 

(7) Schedule 1 clause 6(2) is amended by deleting "or R1," and 
inserting instead — 

R1 or R3, ". 

5. 	Schedule 4 amended 

Schedule 4 is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 1 by deleting "$27.50" and inserting instead — 

" $29.80 "; 

(b) in item 10 by deleting "$3.80" and inserting instead — 

" $4.10 "; 

(c) in item 11 by inserting after "Rl" — 

" or R3 ". 

The Common Seal of the 
Electricity Retail Corporation was ) 	 [LS] 
affixed to these by-laws 
in the presence of— 

JAMES K. MITCHELL, Director. 

WILLIAM J. BARGMANN, Executive Officer. 

Approved by the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


