
3192 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 29 June 2007  

EN301* 

Energy Operators (Powers) Act 1979 

Energy Operators (Regional Power 
Corporation) (Charges) Amendment 

By-laws 2007 

Made by the Regional Power Corporation with the approval of the 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These by-laws are the Energy Operators (Regional Power 
Corporation) (Charges) Amendment By-laws 2007. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These by-laws come into operation as follows: 

(a) by-laws 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the by-laws — on 1 July 2007. 

	

3. 	The by-laws amended 

The amendments in these by-laws are to the Energy Operators 
(Regional Power Corporation) (Charges) By-laws 2006*. 

[* Published in Gazette 31 March 2006, p. 1279-97.] 



29 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3193  

4. 	Schedule 4 amended 

Schedule 4 is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 1 by deleting "$27.50" and inserting instead — 
" $29.80 ''; 

(b) in item 10 by deleting "$3.80" and inserting instead — 

" $4.10 "; 

(c) by inserting after item 10 the following item 
46 

1 1 . 	Rejected account payment 	 $20.00 

The Common Seal of the 
Regional Power Corporation was ) 	 [LS] 
affixed to these by-laws 
in the presence of— 

B. HAMMOND 
Director 

P. FELDHUSEN 
Executive officer 

Approved by the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


