
31 9( 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 29 June 2007 

POLICE 

P0301 * 

Firearms Act 1973 

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Firearms Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2— on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations - on 1 July 2007. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Firearms 
Regulations 1974* 

[* Reprint 5 as at 15 April 2005. 
For amendments to 23 May 2007 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 12 January 2007.] 

	

4. 	Regulation 4 amended 

(1) 	The Table to regulation 4(la) is amended as follows: 

(a)  by deleting "160" and inserting instead - 
46 	167 	"; 

(b)  by deleting "34" and inserting instead - 
" 	35 	"; 

(c)  by deleting "183" and inserting instead - 
" 	191 	"; 

(d)  by deleting "33" and inserting instead - 
" 	35 	"; 

(e)  by deleting "332" and inserting instead - 
46 	345 	"; 



29 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3197 

(f) by deleting "87" and inserting instead - 
46 90 

(2) Regulation 4(laa)(a) and (b) are amended by deleting $26" and 
inserting instead - 

" $27 ". 

(3) Regulation 4(lb)(a) is amended by deleting "$26" and inserting 
instead - 
44 	$27 ". 

(4) The Table to regulation 4(lc) is amended as follows: 
(a)  by deleting "332" in each place where it occurs and 

inserting instead - 
" 	345 	"; 

(b)  by deleting "80" and inserting instead - 
66 	83 	"; 

(c)  by deleting "61" in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead - 
" 	64 	"; 

(d)  by deleting "214" and inserting instead - 
46 	220 	"; 

(e)  by deleting "65" and inserting instead - 
46 	67 	"; 

(f)  by deleting "203" and inserting instead - 
46 	208 	"; 

(g)  by deleting "60" and inserting instead - 
66 	62 

5. Regulation 5 amended 

Regulation 5(1)(b) is amended by deleting "$45" and inserting 
instead - 

" $47 ,, 

6. Regulation 7 amended 

Regulation 7(5a) is amended by deleting "$16" and inserting 
instead - 

" $17 

7. Regulation 8 amended 

(I) Regulation 8(2) is amended by deleting "$26" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $27 ". 



3198 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 29 June 2007 

(2) Regulation 8(2a) is amended by deleting "$16" and inserting 
instead — 

" $17 ". 

8. Regulation 11 amended 

Regulation 11(1) is amended by deleting "$119" and inserting 
instead — 

" $122 ". 

9. Regulation 27 amended 

Regulation 27(1)(0 is amended by deleting "$376-  and 
inserting instead — 

" $390 5,. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


