
2792 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 15 June 2007  

NVS301* 

Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984 

Occupational Safety and Health Amendment 
Regulations (No. 5) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations are the Occupational Safety and Health 
Amendment Regulations (No. 5) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2— on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 



15 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2793 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Occupational 

Safety and Health Regulations 1996*. 

[* Reprint 5 as at 2 June 2006. 
For amendments to 17 May 2007 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 27 April 200.7.] 

	

4. 	Schedule 6.1 amended 

Schedule 6.1 is amended by deleting "$26.25" and inserting 
instead - 

" $27.50 ". 

	

5. 	Schedule 6.1A amended 

Schedule 6. 1A is amended as follows: 
(a) in item 1 by deleting "$3 465" and inserting instead - 

46 $3 630 "; 
(b) in item 2 by deleting "$2 300" and inserting instead - 

$2410 "; 
(c) in item 3 by deleting "$1 150-  and inserting instead - 

46 $1 205 ". 

	

6. 	Schedule 6.2 amended 

Schedule 6.2 is amended as follows: 
(a) in item 1 by deleting "$75.00" and inserting instead - 

" $78.00 "; 
(b) in item 2 by deleting "$68.00" and inserting instead - 

" $71.00 ". 

	

7. 	Schedule 6.2A amended 

Schedule 6.2A item 1 is amended by deleting "$3 553" and 
inserting instead - 

" $3 723 ". 

	

8. 	Schedule 6.3 amended 

Schedule 6.3 is amended as follows: 
(a) by deleting the heading and inserting instead - 

Schedule 6.3 - Fees under Part 6 
[r. 6.2, 6.6, 6.7 and 6.8] 

(b) in item I by deleting $68.00" and inserting instead - 
41 $71.00 



2794 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 15 June 2007  

(c) in item 2 by deleting "$36.25" and inserting instead — 

" $37.50 "; 

(d) in item 3 by deleting "$818.00" and inserting instead — 

" $857.00 "; 

(e) in item 4 by deleting -$136.00-  and inserting instead — 

" $142.00 "; 

(f) in item 5 by deleting "$409.00" and inserting instead — 

" $428.00 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


