
2756 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 15 June 2007  

AG306* 

Plant Diseases Act 1914 

Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations are the Plant Diseases Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2007. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2007. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Plant Diseases 
Regulations 1989*. 

[* Reprint 4 as at 3 March 2006. 
For amendments to 14 May 2007 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4, and 
Gazette 6 March 2007.] 

4. Regulation 19P amended 

( I ) Regulation 19P(1) is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$103" and inserting 
instead — 

" $200.00 "; 



15 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2757  

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$41.25." and inserting 
instead - 

" $200.00. ". 

(2) Regulation 19P(2) is amended by deleting "$41.25." and 
inserting instead - 

" $43.00. ". 

5. 	Schedule 2 amended 

Schedule 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2, and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 Column 2 	Column 3 
Item Delete 	Insert instead 
1(a)  32.75 	 34.25 

1(b)  33.75 	 35.25 

1(c)  41.25 	 43.25 

1(c) 42.25 	 44.25 

1(c) 32.75 	 34.25 

1(c) 101.00 	 106.00 

2(a)  43.25 	 45.25 

2(b)  57.50 	 60.00 

2(b) 43.25 	 45.25 

2(b) 128.00 	 134.00 

3(a) 320.00 	 335.00 

3(a)  49.50 	 52.00 

3(b)  430.00 	 451.00 

3(b) 64.00 	 67.00 

3 128.00 	 134.00 
4 19.00 	 20.00 

5 57.00 	 59.50 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


