
3198 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 29 June 2007  

P0302* 

Police Act 1892 

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations are the Police (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2007. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2007. 



29 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3199 

3. The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Police (Fees) 
Regulations 1981*. 

[* Reprint 2 as at 21 April 2006. 
For amendments to 23 May 2007 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.} 

4. Schedule amended 

The Schedule is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting item 1 and inserting instead - 
" 

1. 	Copy of a person's traffic records - 
(a) road traffic conviction record ..............................$17.60 
(b) traffic infringement notice record ..........................$17.60 

(b) by deleting item 1 a; 

(c) in item 2(a)(i) by deleting "$77.50" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $80.90 

(d) in item 2(a)(ii) by deleting $92.50 and inserting 
instead - 
46 $94.60 

(e) in item 2(a)(iii) by deleting "$70.00" and inserting 
instead - 

" $72.05 

(1) in item 2(c) by deleting "$119.25" and inserting 
instead - 

" $125.00 

(g) in item 3(a) by deleting "$10.00" and inserting 
instead - 

" $11.00 

(h) in item 3(b) by deleting "$16.75" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $17.60 

(i) by deleting item 4 and inserting instead - 

4. 	National criminal history record check - 
(a) issued to a volunteer organisation ........................$10.00 
(b) issued to a public sector body .......................$34.00 
(c) issued to a business ............................................$39.50 

4a. 	National police certificate ..............................................$44.50 

(j) in item 5 by deleting "$75.60" and inserting instead - 
44 $81.90 "; 



3200 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 29 June 2007  

(k) in item 6 by deleting "$16.75" and inserting instead — 

" $17.60 "; 

(1) in item 7(a) and (b) by deleting "$30.50" and inserting 
instead — 

" $32.00 "; 

(m) in item 8 by deleting "$30.75" and inserting instead — 

" $32.00 "; 

(n) in item 9(a) and (b) by deleting "$75.60" and inserting 
instead — 

" $81.90 ". 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor 
and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


