
12 Juiie 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2723 

Iv1X3O2 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Ports and Harbours Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations are the Ports and Harbours Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2)2007. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2007. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Ports and 
Harbours Regulations 1966*. 

[* Reprint 1 as at 1 August 2003. 
For amendments to 8 May 2007 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

4. Regulation 14 amended 

Regulation 14(3) is amended by deleting "$4 200.95" and 
inserting instead - 

" $4 402.60 ". 

5. Regulation 15 amended 

Regulation 15(3) is amended by deleting "$691.34" and 
inserting instead - 
46 $724.53 ". 

6. Regulation ISA amended 

(1) Regulation 15A(1)(a) is amended by deleting "$688.76" and 
inserting instead - 
44 $721.82 ". 

(2) Regulation 15A(2) is amended as follows: 
(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$688.76" and inserting 

instead - 
44 $721.82 "; 



2724 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 12 June 2007 

(b) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$817.75" and inserting 
instead - 

$857.00 ". 

7. 	Regulation ISB amended 

Regulation 15B is amended as follows: 
(a) by deleting "$327.61" and inserting instead - 

" $343.34 
(b) by deleting "$469.50" and inserting instead 

" $492.04 ". 

8. 	Regulation 15C amended 

Regulation 15C(a) is amended as follows: 
(a) by deleting "$103.19" and inserting instead - 

" $108.14 "; 
(b) by deleting "$691.34" and inserting instead - 

$724.53 
(c) by deleting "$1795.43" and inserting instead - 

" $1881.62 ". 

9. 	Regulation 16 amended 

Regulation 16(d)(i) is amended by deleting "$759.70" and 
inserting instead - 

" $796.17 ". 

10. 	Third Schedule amended 

(1) 	The Third Schedule Division 1 item 1 is amended as follows: 
(a)  by deleting "$4 616.83" and inserting instead - 

" 	$4 838.44 	"; 
(b)  by deleting "$4 724.63" and inserting instead - 

" 	$4 951.42 	"; 
(c)  by deleting "$5 244.42" and inserting instead - 

" 	$5496.15 	"; 
(d)  by deleting "$5 799.04" and inserting instead - 

" 	$6 077.39 	"; 
(e)  by deleting "$6 958.58" and inserting instead - 

" 	$7 292.59 	"; 
(1) by deleting "$7 780.21" and inserting instead - 

46 	$8 153.66 	"; 
(g) by deleting "$8 517.99" and inserting instead - 

46 	$8926.85 	". 



12 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2725 

(2) The Third Schedule Division 1 item 2 is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$573.97" and inserting 
instead — 

$601.52 ff. 

(b) in paragraph (c)(i) by deleting "$327.61/hour" and 
inserting instead — 

“ $343.34/hour "; 

(c) in paragraph (c)(ii) by deleting "$469.50/hour-  and 
inserting instead — 

" $492.04/hour ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


