
GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 22 June 2007 

TRANSPORT 

1,1130P 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2007 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3)2007. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 
(a) regulations 1 and 2— on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations - on 1 July 2007. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Charges and Fees) Regulations 2006*. 

[* Published in Gazette 24 November 2006, p.  4843-85. 
For amendments to 21 May 2007 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

	

4. 	Regulation 39 amended 

Regulation 39(1) is amended by deleting "$12.10" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $25.80 ". 

	

5. 	Regulation 40 amended 

Regulation 40 is amended by deleting "$12.10" and inserting 
instead - 

" $25.80 ". 

	

6. 	Regulation 42 amended 

(1) Regulation 42(1) is amended as follows: 
(a) by deleting "$80.30;" and inserting instead - 

46  $84.15; "; 



22 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2867 

(b) by deleting "$160.60." and inserting instead - 
44 $168.30. ". 

(2) Regulation 42(2) is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting "$17.30;" and inserting instead - 
46 $18.10; "; 

(b) by deleting "$35.00." and inserting instead - 
46 $36.60. ". 

7. Regulation 54 amended 

Regulation 54 is amended by deleting "$32." and inserting 
instead - 

" $14.30. ". 

8. Regulation 56 amended 

The Table to regulation 56(1) is deleted and the following Table 
is inserted instead - 

" 
Table 

$ 
Category 1 event 	143.50 

Category 2 event 	86.00 
Category 3 event 	58.00 
Category 4 event 	58.00 

9.  

" 

Schedule 1 amended 

Schedule 1 Division 2 is repealed and the following Division is 
inserted instead - 

Division 2 - Fees relating to vehicle licensing 
Item Regulation 	 Service Fee 

No. $ 
1.  22 	Upon establishment of premises as an 

authorised inspection station 162.20 
Each year for the renewal of 
authorisation 67.40 

2.  23(1) 	An initial examination of a mobile home 
or trailer without brakes, motor cycle, 
motor carrier, engine change 58.10 

3.  23(1) 	Subject to items 5, 7 and 8, an 
examination of a vehicle that is not set 
out in item  83.30 

4.  23(1) 	A second or subsequent examination of 
a vehicle referred to in item 2 45.50 

5.  23(1) 	A second or subsequent examination of 
a vehicle referred to in item 3 58.10 

6.  23(3) 	An examination of a licensed vehicle for 
the purpose of verifying the vehicle's 
identity and/or specifications 58.10 



2868 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 22 June 2007 

Item 	Regulation 
No. 

Service Fee 
$ 

7. 	23(4)(a) An initial examination by the Director 
General of a heavy vehicle (i.e. a vehicle 
with an MRC exceeding 4 500 kg) 134.50 

8. 	23(4)(b) A re-examination by the Director 
General of a heavy vehicle (i.e. a vehicle 
with an MRC exceeding 4 500 kg) 90.90 

8A. 	23A Fee payable by a motor vehicle dealer or 
vehicle manufacturer for each vehicle 
the dealer or manufacturer wishes to 
licence 7.30 

9. 	24 For— 
(a) searching records - 

(i) manually, per vehicle 13.45 
(ii) by computer where a list of 

vehicles to be searched is 
supplied to the Director General 
on magnetic tape, per vehicle 2.70 

(b) production of an extract describing 
the current status of ownership of a 
vehicle, according to the Director 
General's records 14.70 

(c) detailed searching of current and 
previous owner's records and 
production of supporting 
documentation 18.00 

10. 	25(1) Recording fee for grant or renewal of 
vehicle licence (not heavy vehicle) 10.65 

11. 	25(2) Recording fee for grant or renewal of 
heavy vehicle licence 17.55 

12. 	26 Fee for transfer of a vehicle licence 10.20 
13. 	27(a) Fee for grant of permit for unlicensed 

vehicle 6.50 
14. 	27(bXii) Minimum permit fee 22.30 
15. 	28 Fee for issue of duplicate or certified 

copy of a vehicle licence document 6.50 
16. 	29(1) Fee for authorisation under 

regulation 14(3) 10.80 
17. 	30(1) Fee— 

(a) for the issue of plates (other than 
personalised plates, plates bearing 
the same characters as previous 
plates, or dealers plates) except 
where paragraph (b) applies 11.30 

(b) for the re-issue of plates which have 
been returned under the Road Traffic 
(Licensing) Regulations 1975 
regulation 22(3), (3a) or (4) (other 
than personalised plates, plates to 
replace existing plates bearing the 
same characters, or dealers plates) 11.30 

(c) upon application for the issue of 
personalised plates 101.20 

(d) upon application for the issue of 
plates to replace ordinary plates 
bearing the same characters 13.00 



22 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2869 

Item Regulation 	 Service 	 Fee 
No. 	 $ 

(e) upon application for the issue of 
plates to replace personalised plates 
bearing the same characters without 
the letter "P" previously required by 
the Road Traffic (Licensing) 
Regulations 1975 77.90 

3 0(2) Fee upon application for issue of name 
plates 771.00 

30(3) Fee for transfer of right to display 
special plates - 
(a) single digit numeral special plates 7741.30 
(b) 2 digit numeral special plates 1 548.70 
(c) 3 digit numeral special plates 771.00 
(d) any other number of digit 

special plates 153.90 
(e) unique series special plates referred 

to in the Road Traffic (Licensing) 
Regulations 1975 
regulation 24(4a)(b) 1 548.70 

(f) unique series special plates referred 
to in the Road Traffic (Licensing) 
Regulations 1975 
regulation 24(4a)(c) 67.40 

3 0(4) Fee for transfer of right to display 
name plates 386.50 

30(5) Fee for transfer of right to display 
special plates or name plates - 
(a) pursuant to an agreement or order 

under the Family Law Act 1975 of 
the Commonwealth 16.00 

(b) to a beneficiary by a trustee or other 
person in a fiduciary capacity under 
a trust whether express or implied 16.00 

3 0(7) Fee upon application for the issue of 
special plates or name plates to replace 
special plates or name plates bearing the 
same characters - 
(a) for premium material plates 175.40 
(b) for standard metal plates 85.00 

30(8) Fee for transfer of— 
(a) special plates or name plates by a 

person to another vehicle owned by 
that person 16.00 

(b) personalised plates by a person to 
another vehicle owned by that 
person or by a member of his or her 
immediate family 16.00 

31 Fee for storage of special plate by 
Director General (per year or part of 
a year) 16.00 

32(1) Fee for assignment and issue of 
dealers plates - 
(a) where the plate is issued in 

substitution for a plate bearing the 
same characters, per plate 31.60 

Ird 

20. 

21 

22. 

23 

24.  

25.  



2870 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 22 June 2007 

Item Regulation 
No. 

Service Fee 
$ 

(b) in any other case, per set of plates 19.10 
26. 32(2) Deposit for each set of plates issued 20.00 
27. 33 Annual fee for the use and possession of 

dealers plates 91.70 
28. 34 Fee for duplicate of registration label 0.50 
29. 35 Fee for duplicate tax invoice 6.50 

,, 

10. 	Schedule 2 amended 

Schedule 2 items IA to 8 are deleted and the following items 
are inserted instead - 

" 
$ 

1A. Fee to take a theory test for the first time 19.60 
lB. Fee to resit a theory test 13.10 

Application for a driver's licence - 
(a) 	including one practical driving 

assessment - 
(i) where the motor vehicle is not of 

class HC or MC 68.30 
(ii) where the motor vehicle is of class 

HC or MC 154.30 
(b) 	where the motor vehicle is of class MC 

(in which case a practical driving 
assessment is conducted by someone 
other than the Director General) or where 
a practical driving assessment is not 
required 36.20 

2. Each additional practical driving assessment - 
(a) where the motor vehicle is not of class 

HCorMC 71.80 
(b) where the motor vehicle is of class 

HC or MC 160.60 
3. For each duplicate tax invoice provided in respect 

of fees paid for any additional driving tests referred 
toin item 2 6.50 

4. Grant or renewal of a driver's licence - 
(a) where the licence is granted or renewed 

for a period of one year 36.60 
(b) where the licence is granted or renewed 

for a period of 5 years 116.00 
(c) for a period determined under the Road 

Traffic (Drivers' Licences) 
Regulations 1975 regulation 5A(2), not 
being a period provided for by 
paragraph (a) or (b) for each year 

or part of a 
year to which 
the licence 
relates, '/5  of 
the fee under 
paragraph (b) 



22 June 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2871 

5. 	Application for the endorsement of a driver's 
licence as of class F under the Road Traffic 
(Drivers' Licences) Regulations 1975 
regulation 5 — 

(a) where the application is made within 
15 days of the expiry of an endorsement 
of that class on the licence 	 nil  

(b) 	in any other case 	 103.30 
5A. 	Application for the endorsement of a driver's 

licence as of class T under the Road Traffic 
(Drivers' Licences) Regulations 1975 
regulation 5 — 

(a) where the application is made within 
15 days of the expiry of an endorsement 
of that class on the licence 	 nil  

(b) in any other case 	 103.30 
6. 	First hazard perception test in respect of a driver's 

licence application 	 24.60 
7. 	Each additional hazard perception test in respect of 

a driver's licence application 	 17.80 
8. 	Fee for logbook under the Road Traffic (Drivers' 

Licences) Regulations 1975 regulation 4E(2) 	 21.00 
9. 	Copy of notice of disqualification previously given 

to a person under the Road Traffic Act 1974 
section 103 	 17.60 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


