
3156 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 1 July 2008  

MX304* 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Ports and Harbours Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Ports and Harbours Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2008. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Ports and 
Harbours Regulations 1966. 

	

4. 	Regulation 14 amended 

Regulation 14(3) is amended by deleting "$4 402.60" and 
inserting instead — 

" $4 552.28 ". 



1 July 2008 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3157 

5. 	Regulation 15 amended 

Regulation 15(3) is amended by deleting "$724.53" and 
inserting instead - 
44 $749.16 ". 

6. 	Regulation iSA amended 

(1) Regulation 1 5A( I )(a) is amended by deleting "$721.82" and 
inserting instead - 
44 $746.36 ". 

(2) Regulation 15A(2) is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$721.82" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $746.36 

(b) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$857.00" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $886.14 ". 

7. 	Regulation 15B amended 

Regulation 15B is amended as follows: 
(a) by deleting "$343.34" and inserting instead - 

" $355.02 "; 
(b) by deleting "$492.04" and inserting instead - 

44 $508.77 ". 

8. 	Regulation 15C amended 

Regulation 15C(a) is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting "$108.14" and inserting instead - 
46 $111.82 "; 

(b) by deleting "$724.53" and inserting instead - 
46 $749.16 "; 

(c) by deleting "$1881.62" and inserting instead - 
" $1945.59 ". 

9. 	Regulation 16 amended 

Regulation 16(d)(i) is amended by deleting "$796.17" and 
inserting instead - 
44 $823.24 ". 

10. 	Regulation 18 amended 

(1) Regulation 18(1)(f) is amended by deleting "issued under the 
Fisheries Act 1905" and inserting instead - 

46 

granted under the Fish Resources Management 
Regulations 1995 



3158 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 1 July 2008 

(2) Regulation 18(2)(e) and (0 are deleted and the following 
paragraph is inserted instead - 

" 
(e) in the case of conservancy dues referred to in 

item 3, on 1 July. 

(3) Regulation 18(2a) is amended by deleting "and the Third 
Schedule Division 2". 

11. 	Third Schedule amended 

(1) The Third Schedule Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
amount set Out in column 2, and inserting instead the amount set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 	Column 2 	Column 3 
Item 	 Delete 	Insert instead 

$4838.44 $5002.94 

I $4951.42 $5119.77 
I $5496.15 $5683.02 

I $6077.39 $6284.02 
I $7292.59 $7540.54 

$8 153.66 $8430.89 

1 $8926.85 $9230.36 

2(a) $601.52 $621.98 

2(c)(i) $343.34 $355.02 
2(c)(ii) $492.04 $508.77 

(2) The Third Schedule Division 2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
amount set out in column 2, and inserting instead the amount set 
out in column 3, opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 	Column 2 	Column 3 
Item 	 Delete 	Insert instead 

1(a)(i) $108.20 $111.80 

1(a)(ii) $141.50 $146.30 

l(a)(iii) $207.10 $214.10 

1(aXiv) $317.90 $328.70 

1(a)(v) $485.20 $501.60 
1(aXvi) $758.10 $783.80 

1(b) $96.50 $99.70 

3(a)  $108.20 $111.80 
3(b)  $141.50 $146.30 

3(c)  $207.10 $214.10 

3(d)  $317.90 $328.70 



1 July 2008 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3159 

	

Column 	1 	Column 2 	Column 3 

	

Item 	 Delete 	Insert instead 
3(e) $485.20 	 $501.60 
3(f) $758.10 	 $783.80 

By Command of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


