
2488 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 10 June 2008  

HE301* 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2008 

Made by the Lieutentant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Hospitals (Services Charges) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) regulation 4(1)(c) and (d) — on the day after that day; 

(c) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

	

3. 	I he regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the hospitals 
(Services Charges) Regulations 1984. 

	

4. 	Schedule 1 amended 

(1) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 1(b)(i) by deleting "$484 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $496 per day ''; 

(b) in item 1(b)(ii) by deleting "$275 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $287 per day ''; 

(c) in item 1(c) by deleting "$39.05 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $39.70 per day "; 

(d) in item 1(d) by deleting "$136.85 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $139 per day "; 



10 June 2008 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2489  

(e) in item 1(e) by deleting "$1 213 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $1 288 per day ". 

(2) Schedule 1 Division 3 item 4(b) is amended by deleting "$138" 
and inserting instead — 

" $146 ". 

(3) Schedule 1 Division 4 is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 6(b) by deleting "$218 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $223 per day "; 

(b) in item 6(d) by deleting "$1 146 per day" and inserting 
instead — 

" $1258 per day ". 

(4) Schedule 1 Division 5 item 7 is amended by deleting 
"$25.25 per day" and inserting instead — 

" $26.75 per day ''. 

By Command of the Lieutentant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


