
2894 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 24 June 2008 

MX304* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Navigable Waters Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2008. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 
(a) regulations 1 and 2— on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
(b) the rest of the regulations - on 1 July 2008. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Navigable 
Waters Regulations 1958. 

	

4. 	Regulation 45B amended 

(1) Regulation 45B(3a)(b) is amended in the Table of fees as 
follows: 

(a) in item (i) by deleting "$61.40 and inserting instead - 
46 $63.40 "; 

(b) in item (ii) by deleting "$120.-')0'* and inserting 
instead - 
" $124.30 

(c) in item (iii) by deleting "$223.70" and inserting 
instead - 

" $231.30 
(d) in item (iv) by deleting "$306.30" and inserting 

instead - 

" $316.70 ". 

(2) Regulation 4513(4) is amended by deleting $28.80." and 
inserting instead - 
46  $29.70. ". 



21 June 2008 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2895 

5. 	Regulation 45BAA amended 

Regulation 45BAA(4)(g) is amended by deleting "$28.80" and 
inserting instead — 

" $29.70 ". 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


