
24 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2905 

 

PO302* 

 
Police Act 1892 

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Police (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Police (Fees) 
Regulations 1981. 

 

4. Schedule amended 

  The Schedule is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1(a) and (b) by deleting “$17.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $19.20    ”; 

 (b) in item 2(a)(i) by deleting “$80.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $86.35    ”; 

 (c) in item 2(a)(ii) by deleting “$94.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $100.00    ”; 

 (d) in item 2(a)(iii) by deleting “$72.05” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $77.85    ”; 

 (e) in item 2(c) by deleting “$125.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $137.50    ”; 



2906 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 June 2008 

 

 (f) in item 3(a) by deleting “$11.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $12.00    ”; 

 (g) in item 3(b) by deleting “$17.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $19.25    ”; 

 (h) in item 4(a) by deleting “$10.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $10.50    ”; 

 (i) in item 4(b) by deleting “$34.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $35.00    ”; 

 (j) in item 4(c) by deleting “$39.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $40.50    ”; 

 (k) in item 4a by deleting “$44.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $51.00    ”; 

 (l) in item 5 by deleting “$81.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $90.00    ”; 

 (m) in item 6 by deleting “$17.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    $19.25    ”; 

 (n) in item 7(a) and (b) by deleting “$32.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $34.55    ”; 

 (o) in item 8 by deleting “$32.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $34.55    ”; 

 (p) in item 9(a) and (b) by deleting “$81.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $90.00    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 


