
2560 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 17 June 2008  

CE313* 

Trade Measurement Act 2006 

Trade Measurement Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Trade Measurement Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2— on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Trade 
Measurement Regulations 2007. 

	

4. 	Regulation 111 amended 

(1) Regulation 111(2)(a) is amended by deleting "$9.50" and 
inserting instead — 

" $9.80 ". 



17 June 2008 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2561 

(2) Regulation 111(3) is amended by deleting "$9.50" and inserting 
instead - 

" $9.80 " 

5. Regulation 112 amended 

Regulation 11 2(2)(a) is amended by deleting "$21.00" and 
inserting instead - 

44 $21.70 ". 

6. Regulation 113 amended 

Regulation 1 13(3)(a) is amended by deleting "$21 .00 and 
inserting instead - 

" $21.70 ". 

7. Schedule 5 replaced 

Schedule 5 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead - 

Schedule 5—Application and licence fees 

[r. 108] 

$ 
1. 	Application under regulation 103 .......................... 43.50 
2. 	Application under the principal Act section 55 87.00 
3. 	Periodic licence for servicing licences under the 

principal Act section 64(1) .......................................... 206.00 
plus an additional amount of....................................... 54.50 

for each person who, whether as the holder of the 
licence or an employee of the holder of the licence, 
will under the authority conferred by the licence - 
(a) test a batch of measuring instruments for the 

purposes of certification or re-certification; or 
(b) certify or re-certify measuring instruments. 

4. 	Periodic licence for public weighbridge licences 
under the principal Act section 64(1) .......................... 109.00 

5. 	Public weighbridge suitability statement Combined 
with fee 
payable 
under 
item 4 

6.  Application under the principal Act section 71(l) to 
amend a condition of a kind mentioned in the 
principal Act section 60(2) .......................................... 43.50 

7.  Application under the principal Act section 73(2) 43.50 
8.  Application under the principal Act section 74(2) 43.50 
9.  Amended licence ......................................................... 87.00 
10.  Duplicate licence ......................................................... 43.50 



2562 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 17 June 2008 

11. Inspection of register kept under the principal Act 
section 25 or 59  	16.00 

12. Extract of an individual registration in a register kept 
under the principal Act section 25 or 59 — 
(a) for the first page  	16.00 
(b) for each subsequent page 	3.30 

13. Copy of the register kept under the principal Act 
section 25 or 59 	206.00 

8. 	Schedule 7 amended 

Schedule 7 is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 1(3)(a) Column 3 by deleting "0.035" and 
inserting instead - 

44  0.0355 11; 

(b) in item 2(a) Column 3 by deleting "1.5" and inserting 
instead - 

44  1.492 "; 

(c) in item 2(b) Column 3 by deleting "1.5" and inserting 
instead 
44 	

1.492 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


