
20 May 2008 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 1939  

AG307* 

Plant Diseases Act 1914 

Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

I. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Plant Diseases Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2— on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Plant Diseases 
Regulations 1989. 



1940 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 20 May 2008  

	

4. 	Regulation 19P amended 

(1) Regulation 19P(1) is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$200.00;" and inserting 
instead - 

" $207.00; "; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$200.00." and inserting 
instead - 

" $207.00. ". 

(2) Regulation 19P(2) is amended by deleting "$43.00." and 
inserting instead - 

" $44.50. ". 

	

5. 	Schedule 2 amended 

Schedule 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2 and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 	 Column 2 	 Column 3 
Item 	 Delete 	 Insert instead 

1(a)  34.25 35.50 

1(b)  35.25 36.45 

1(c)  43.25 44.75 

1(c) 44.25 45.75 

1(c) 34.25 35.50 

1(c) 106.00 110.00 

2(a)  45.25 46.75 

2(b)  60.00 62.00 
2(b) 45.25 46.75 

2(b) 134.00 139.00 

3(a) 335.00 346.00 

3(a)  52.00 54.00 

3(b)  451.00 466.00 

3(b) 67.00 69.50 

3 134.00 139.00 

4 20.00 20.70 

5 59.50 61.50 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


