
29 May 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2499 

TRANSPORT 

'F 1130 1* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2007 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2)2007. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 
(a) regulations 1 and 2—on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
(b) the rest of the regulations - on 31 May 2007. 

	

3. 	Specified day: section 28A 

For the purposes of section 28A(3) of the Act, the specified day 
in relation to these regulations is 1 July 2007. 

	

4. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Charges and Fees) Regulations 2006*. 

[* Published in Gazette 24 November 2006p. 4843-85. 
For amendments to 14 May 2007 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2006, Table 4.] 

	

5. 	Regulation 20 amended 

Regulation 20(1) is amended by deleting "$55" in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead - 

" $58 ". 

	

6. 	Schedule 1 amended 

(1) Schedule 1 clause 3 is amended as follows: 
(a) by deleting "$14.75" and inserting instead - 

" $15.46 "; 
(b) by deleting "$343.00." and inserting instead - 

46  $355.00. ". 



2500 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 29 May 2007 

(2) Schedule 1 clause 4 is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting "$14.75" and inserting instead - 

" $15.46 "; 

(b) by deleting "$1485.00." and inserting instead 
46 $1537.00. ". 

(3) Schedule 1 clause 5 is amended by deleting "$7.37" and 
inserting instead - 

44 $7.72 ". 

(4) Schedule 1 clause 6(1) is amended by deleting "$29.51." and 
inserting instead - 

44 $30.93. ". 

(5) Schedule 1 clause 6(2) is amended by deleting "$44.29." and 
inserting instead - 

46 $46.42. ". 

(6) Schedule 1 clause 7 is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting "$3.69" and inserting instead - 
46 $3.87 "; 

(b) by deleting "$86.00." and inserting instead - 
46 $90.00. ". 

(7) Schedule 1 clause 8 is amended by deleting the Table to the 
clause and inserting instead - 

46 

Table 

Licence Class Charge 
$ 

1132 355 
2132 592 
2133 1 478 
AB3 592 

(8) 	Schedule 1 clause 9 is amended by deleting the 'Fable to the 
clause and inserting instead - 

44 

Table 

Licence Class Charge 
$ 

1R2 355 
2R2 592 
1R3 710 
2R3 946 
1R4 1 065 
2R4 2 365 
iRS 1 065 
2R5 2 365 
SR2 651 



29 May 2007 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2501 

Licence Class Charge 
$ 

SR3 2365 
SR4 2365 
SR5 2365 
MR2 4494 
MR3 4494 
MR4 4 848 
MR5 4 848 
LR2 6208 
LR3 6208 
LR4 6208 
LR5 6208 

(9) Schedule 1 clause 10 is amended by deleting the Table to the 
clause and inserting instead - 
" 

Table 
Licence Class Charge 

$ 
SP2 1 537 
SP3 4019 
SP4 5201 
SP5 5201 
MP2 4 729 
MP3 5911 
MP4 6 503 
MP5 6 503 
ILP2 5911 
1LP3 5911 
ILP4 6503 
ILP5 6503 
2LP2 5911 
2LP3 5911 
2LP4 6 503 
2LP5 6 503 

(10) Schedule 1 clause 11 is amended by deleting 	$343.00" and 
inserting instead - 
" 	$355.00 	". 

(11) Schedule 1 clause 12 is amended by deleting the Table to the 
clause and inserting instead - 

44 

Table 

Licence Class Charge 
S 

PSV 90 
ISV 90 

OSV2 296 
OSV3 592 
OSV4 888 
OSV5 1184 



2502 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 29 May 2007 

Licence Class Charge 

OSV6 1 480 
OSV7 1 776 
OSV8 2 072 
OSV9 2 368 

(12) Schedule 1 Division 2 is amended as follows: 

(a) in item 10 by deleting "10.15" and inserting instead — 
" 10.65 "; 

(b) in item 11 by deleting "16.75" and inserting instead — 

" 17.55 ". 

7. 	Schedule 2 amended 

Schedule 2 item 4 is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "35.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" 36.60 "; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "111.00-  and inserting 
instead — 

" 116.00. ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


