
14 October 2005 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4555  

HEALTH 

HE301* 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Hospitals (Services Charges) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2005. 

	

2. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the hospitals 
(Services Charges) Regulations 1984*. 

r Reprint 4 as at 3 December 2004. 
For amendments to 14 September 2005 see Western 
Australian Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, 
p. 189-92, and Gazette 11 March, 19 April and 1 July 20051 

	

3. 	Regulation 4 amended 

Regulation 4(1) is amended as follows: 

(a) in the definition of "in-patient" by deleting "as defined 
in section 3(1) of the Commonwealth Act"; 

(b) in the definition of "surgically implanted prostheses" by 
deleting "section 4(1)(dd)" and inserting instead — 

" Schedule 1 paragraph (bj) ". 

	

4. 	Schedule 1 amended 

Schedule 1 Division 1 item 1 is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$34.80 per day" and 
inserting instead — 

" $35.65 per day "; 



4556 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 14 October 2005 

(b) in paragraph (d) by deleting "$121 per day" and 
inserting instead — 

" $121.85 per day ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


