
9 September 2005 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4155 

JUSTICE 

JU301* 

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994 

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices 
Enforcement Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Fines, Penalties and Infringement 
Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2005. 



4156 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	9 September 2005 

	

2. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Fines, Penalties 
and Infringement Notices Enforcement Regulations 1994*. 

r Reprint 2 as at 9 July 2004. 
For amendments to 27 July 2004 see Gazette 13 May 20051 

	

3. 	Regulation 6A amended 

(1) Regulation 6A(1) is amended by deleting "$150-  in each place 
where it occurs and inserting instead — 

" $300 ". 

(2) Regulation 6A(1)(b) is amended by deleting "$300" and 
inserting instead — 

" $600 

	

4. 	Regulation 611 amended 

Regulation 6B(2) is amended by deleting "$150" in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead — 

" $300 ". 

	

5. 	Regulation 6C amended 

Regulation 6C(3) is amended by deleting "$150" and inserting 
instead — 

" $300 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


