
:3(i58 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 24 August 2004  

T R 30 1* 

Jetties Act 1926 

Jetties Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2004 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Jetties Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2004. 

2. The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations, other than regulation 6, 
are to the Jetties Act Regulations 1940*. 

[* Reprinted as at 10 December 1999. 
For amendments to 26 July 2004 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 197-8 
and Gazette 25 June 2004.] 



24 August 2004 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3659  

	

3. 	Regulation 1 amended 

Regulation 1 is amended by deleting "Act". 

	

4. 	Regulation 67B amended 

(1) Regulation 67B(7) is amended by deleting "50 feet" and 
inserting instead — 

" 15 metres ". 

(2) Regulation 67B(24) is amended by deleting "150° Fahrenheit" 
and inserting instead — 

" 65° Celsius ". 

	

5. 	Regulation 76 amended 

Regulation 76 is amended by deleting "8 feet" and inserting 
instead — 

" 2.4 metres ". 

	

6. 	Jetties Regulations repealed 

The Jetties Regulations are repealed. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


