
30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4057 

TR302* 

Port Authorities Act 1999 

Port Authorities Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Port Authorities Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Port Authorities 
Regulations 2001*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 20 May 2005.] 

3. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 Division 6 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 —  

 (i) by deleting “$0.2277” and inserting instead —  

  “    $0.25    ”; and 

 (ii) by deleting “$2 464.00” and inserting instead — 

  “    $2 710.40    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “$4 558.00” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    $5 103.80    ”; 

 (c) in item 3 by deleting “$5 421.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $5 963.10    ”; 

 (d) in item 4 by deleting “$6 037.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $6 640.70    ”; 

 (e) in item 5 by deleting “$6 406.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $7 046.60    ”; 

 (f) in item 6 by deleting “$1 497.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $1 470.70    ”; 



4058 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

 (g) in item 7 — 

 (i) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$616.00” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $677.60    ”; and 

 (ii) by deleting “$862.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $948.20    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 

 
 


