
1566 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 18 May 2004 

AG304* 

Seeds Act 1981 

Seeds Amendment Regulations 2004 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Seeds Amendment 
Regulations 2004. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Seeds 
Regulations 1982*. 

[* Reprinted as at 20 August 1999. 
For amendments to 24 March 2004 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p.  350.] 

	

4. 	Regulation 15 amended 

(1) Regulation 15(2) is amended by deleting "$375" and inserting 
instead - 

" $390 " 

(2) Regulation 15(6) is amended by deleting "$234" and inserting 
instead - 

" $255 " 

	

5. 	Seventh Schedule replaced 

The Seventh Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is 
inserted instead - 

" 
Seventh Schedule 

Seed analysis and report fees 

[r. 13] 

$ 
Fees for the analysis of a seed sample 
provided under section 25 of the Act and for 
a report of the result of the analysis are - 
Pure seed content analysis, group 1 48.00 
Pure seed content analysis, group 2 60.00 
Pure seed content analysis, group 3 74.00 
Pure seed content analysis, group 4 88.00 



18 May 2004 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 1567 

The pure seed content analysis group is displayed in column 6 
of the First Schedule. 

Germination analysis, group 1  	48.00 
Germination analysis, group 2  	53.00 
Germination analysis, group 3  	58.00 

The germination analysis group is displayed in column 7 
of the First Schedule. 

Pure seed content analysis of chaffy seed 	 88.00 
Cultivar determination by grow-on test 	 130.00 
Moisture content determination 	 50.00 
Pest or disease test 	  55.00 
Weed seed presence test 	  52.00 
Caryopsis presence test 	  50.00 
Pigmented seed content 	  35.00 
Number of seeds (per unit volume) 	 47.00 
Seed identification 	  23.00 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


