
2778 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 24 June 2005  

TR303* 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 
Jetties Act 1926 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

	

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the Navigable Waters Amendment 
Regulations 2005. 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2005. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Navigable 
Waters Regulations*. 

r Reprint 11 as at 21 March 2003. 
For amendments to 31 May 2005 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 3751 

	

4. 	Regulation 45B amended 

( I ) The Table to regulation 45B(3a)(b) is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting "$55.40" and inserting instead — 

$56.60 "; 

(b) by deleting "$108.60" and inserting instead — 

" $110.90 "; 

(c) by deleting "$201.70" and inserting instead — 

" $206.10 "; 

(d) by deleting "$276.20" and inserting instead — 

" $282.20 ". 

(2) Regulation 45B(4) is amended by deleting "$26.10.-  and 
inserting instead — 

" $26.60. ". 

	

5. 	Regulation 45BAA amended 

Regulation 45BAA(4)(g) is amended by deleting "$26.10" and 
inserting instead — 

" $26.60 ". 



21 .1 line 2005 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2779  

	

6. 	Regulation 45BA amended 

(1) Regulation 45BA(2) is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$228.30" and inserting 
instead — 

" $233.30 "; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$62.50" and inserting 
instead — 

" $63.80 ". 

(2) Regulation 45BA(3) is amended by deleting "$172.00" and 
inserting instead — 

" $175.50 ". 

(3) Regulation 45BA(6a)(b) is amended by deleting "$61.00." and 
inserting instead — 

" $63.80. ". 

	

7. 	Regulation 57 amended 

Regulation 57(1) is amended by deleting "Appendix IA of" and 
inserting instead — 

" Schedule 2 to ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


