
2912 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 28 June 2005 

CE311* 

Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984 

Occupational Safety and Health Amendment 
Regulations (No. 8) 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

These regulations are the Occupational Safety and Health 
Amendment Regulations (No. 8) 2005. 

Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2005. 

The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Occupational 
Safety and Health Regulations 1996*. 

r Reprint 3 as at 9 July 2004. 
For amendments to 7 June 2005 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 271, and 
Gazette 7 January, 4 March and 1 April 20051 

Schedule 6.1 amended 

Schedule 6.1 is amended by deleting "$25.00" and inserting 
instead — 

" $25.50 ". 

Schedule 6.1A amended 

Schedule 6.1A is amended by deleting each of the amounts 
shown in column 1 of the Table to this regulation, which 
amounts are shown in the order in which they occur in the 
Schedule, and inserting instead the amount shown opposite it in 
column 2. 

Table 

Column 1 	 Column 2 

Delete 	 Insert instead 

$3 274 $3 345 

$2171 $2220 

$1 085 $1 110 

1.  

2.  

3.  

4.  

5.  



28 June 2005 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2913  

6. Schedule 6.2 amended 

Schedule 6.2 is amended by deleting "$65.00" in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead — 

" $66.00 ". 

7. Schedule 6.2A amended 

Schedule 6.2A is amended by deleting "$3 355" and inserting 
instead — 

" $3 430 ". 

8. Schedule 6.3 amended 

Schedule 6.3 is amended by deleting each of the amounts shown 
in column 1 of the Table to this regulation, which amounts are 
shown in the order in which they occur in the Schedule, and 
inserting instead the amount shown opposite it in column 2. 

Table 

Column 1 	 Column 2 
Delete 	 Insert instead  

	

$65.00 	 $66.00 

	

$34.00 	 $35.00 

	

$774.00 	 $790.00 

	

$129.00 	 $132.00 

	

$387.00 	 $395.00 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


