
6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2023 

— PART 1 — 

JUSTICE 
JU301* 

Legal Practice Act 2003 

Legal Practice Board Amendment 
Rules (No. 3) 2005 

Made by the Legal Practice Board under section 252 of the Legal 
Practice Act 2003. 

1. Citation 
  These rules are the Legal Practice Board Amendment 

Rules (No. 3) 2005. 

2. The rules amended 
  The amendments in these rules are to the Legal Practice Board 

Rules 2004*. 
 [* Published in Gazette 14 May 2004, p. 1473-557. 
  For amendments to 18 April 2005 see Gazette 12 April 2005.] 

3. Rule 44 amended 
  Rule 44(3) is amended as follows: 
 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$300” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    $500    ”; 
 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$550” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    $950    ”; 
 (c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$600” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    $1 000    ”. 

Made by the Legal Practice Board under section 252 

Mr I. WELDON, Member. 

Mr R. O’CONNOR QC, Member. 

Mr G. TANNIN SC, Member. 

Ms S. SCHLINK, Member. 


