
2306 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2005 

TR304* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Fees for Vehicle Licences) 
Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Fees for Vehicle 
Licences) Regulations 2005. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 31 May 2005. 

3. Specified day: section 28A 
  For the purposes of section 28A(3) of the Act, the specified day 

in relation to these regulations is 1 July 2005. 

4. The Act amended 
  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 

Act 1974. 

 [* Reprint 8 as at 16 July 2004. 
  For subsequent amendments see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 1, p. 395-6.] 

5. Second Schedule amended 
 (1) Part III Division 2 of the Second Schedule is amended as 

follows: 
 (a) in item 2(1) —  
 (i) by deleting “$13.93” and inserting instead —  
  “    $14.24    ”; and 
 (ii) by deleting “$330.00” and inserting instead —  
  “    $334.00    ”; 
 (b) in item 3 —  
 (i) by deleting “$13.93” and inserting instead —  
  “    $14.24    ”; and 
 (ii) by deleting “$1 428.00” and inserting instead —  
  “    $1 446.00    ”; 
 (c) in item 4 by deleting “$6.96” and inserting instead —  
  “    $7.11    ”; 



27 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2307 

 (d) in item 5 —  
 (i) by deleting “$3.48” and inserting instead —  
  “    $3.56    ”; and 
 (ii) by deleting “$81.00” and inserting instead —  
  “    $83.00    ”; 
 (e) in item 6(1) by deleting “$27.87” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    $28.48    ”; 
 (f) in item 6(2) by deleting “$41.83” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    $42.75    ”. 

 (2) Part III Division 4 of the Second Schedule is amended as 
follows: 

 (a) by deleting the Table to clause 3 and inserting the 
following Table instead —  
“     

Table 
Licence Class Fee 

$ 
1B2 334 
2B2 557 
2B3 1 390 
AB3 557 

    ”; 
 (b) by deleting the Table to clause 4 and inserting the 

following Table instead —  
“     

Table 
Licence Class Fee 

$ 
1R2 334 
2R2 557 
1R3 668 
2R3 890 
1R4 1 002 
2R4 2 225 
1R5 1 002 
2R5 2 225 
SR2 612 
SR3 2 225 
SR4 2 225 
SR5 2 225 
MR2 4 228 
MR3 4 228 
MR4 4 561 
MR5 4 561 
LR2 5 840 
LR3 5 840 
LR4 5 840 
LR5 5 840 

    ”; 



2308 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 May 2005 

 (c) by deleting the Table to clause 5 and inserting the 
following Table instead —  

“     
Table 

Licence Class Fee 
$ 

SP2 1 446 
SP3 3 781 
SP4 4 893 
SP5 4 893 
MP2 4 449 
MP3 5 561 
MP4 6 118 
MP5 6 118 
1LP2 5 561 
1LP3 5 561 
1LP4 6 118 
1LP5 6 118 
2LP2 5 561 
2LP3 5 561 
2LP4 6 118 
2LP5 6 118 

    ”; 
 (d) in clause 6 by deleting “$331” and inserting instead — 
  “    $334.00    ”; 
 (e) by deleting the Table to clause 7 and inserting the 

following Table instead —  

“     
Table 

Licence Class Fee 
$ 

PSV 83 
TSV 83 

OSV2 278 
OSV3 556 
OSV4 834 
OSV5 1 112 
OSV6 1 390 
OSV7 1 668 
OSV8 1 946 
OSV9 2 224 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


