
27 June 2006 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2299  

P0302* 

Firearms Act 1973 

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations are the Firearms Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 



2300 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 27 June 2006 

3. The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Firearms 
Regulations 1974* 

[* Reprint 5 as at 15 April 2005. 
For amendments to 23 May 2006 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p.  137.] 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

(1) The Table to regulation 4(la) is deleted and the following Table 
is inserted instead - 

Table of application forms and fees 

Form Kind of Licence Fee 
No ($) 

1 Firearm Licence - original issue (1 year) .................. 160 
1 Firearm Licence - renewal (1 year) ........................... 34 
1 Firearm Collector's Licence - original issue (3 years) 183 
1 Firearm Collector's Licence - renewal (3 years) 33 
2 Corporate Licence - original issue (1 year) ............... 332 
2 Corporate Licence - renewal (1 year) ........................ 87 

(2) Regulation 4(laa) is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$24" and inserting 
instead - 

" $26 "; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$24" and inserting 
instead - 

" $26 ". 

(3) Regulation 4(lb)(a) is amended by deleting "$24" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $26 ". 

(4) The Table to regulation 4(lc) is deleted and the following Table 
is inserted instead - 

Table of application forms and fees 

Form 
No 

Kind of Licence Fee 
($) 

3 Dealer's Licence - original issue (1 year) .................... 332 
3 Dealer's Licence-  renewal (1 year) ............................. 80 
3 Repairer's Licence - original issue (1 year) ................. 332 
3 Repairer's Licence - renewal (1 year) .......................... 61 
3 Manufacturer's Licence - original issue (1 year) 332 
3 Manufacturer's Licence - renewal (1 year) ................... 61 
3 Shooting Gallery Licence - original issue (1 year) ............. 214 

33 

33 



27 June 2006 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2301  

Form 	 Kind of Licence 	 Fee 

	

No. 	 ($)  

	

3 	Shooting Gallery Licence — renewal (1 year) 	65 

	

4 	Ammunition Collector's Licence— original issue (5 years)  	203 

	

4 	Ammunition Collector's Licence —  renewal (5 years)  	60 

5. 	Regulation 5 amended 

Regulation 5(1)(b) is amended by deleting "$41" and inserting 
instead — 

" $45 ". 

6. Regulation 8 amended 

Regulation 8(2) is amended by deleting "$24." and inserting 
instead — 

" $26. " 

7. Regulation 11 amended 

Regulation 11(1) is amended by deleting "$107" and inserting 
instead — 

" $119 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


