
27 June 2006 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2297  

P0301* 

Police Act 1892 

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations are the Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Police (Fees) 
Regulations 1981*. 



2298 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 27 June 2006 

[* Reprinted as at 20 August 1999. 
For amendments to 23 May 2006 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p.  309, and 
Gazette 10 February 2006.] 

4. 	Schedule amended 

The Schedule is amended as follows: 
(a) in item 1(a) by deleting "$16.00" and inserting 

instead - 
44 $16.50 

(b) in item 1(b) by deleting "$16.00" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $16.50 

(c) in item 1 a by deleting "$16.00" and inserting instead - 

" $16.50 "; 
(d) in item 2(a)(i) by deleting "$74.30" and inserting 

instead - 

" $77.50 
(e) in item 2(a)(ii) by deleting "$89.30" and inserting 

instead - 

" $92.50 

(f) in item 2(a)(iii) by deleting "$67.50" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $70.00 

(g) in item 2(c) by deleting "$115.00" and inserting 
instead - 
" $119.25 

(h) in item 3(a) by deleting "$9.50" and inserting instead - 
44 $10.00 "; 

(i) in item 3(b) by deleting "$16.00" and inserting 
instead - 

" $16.75 
(j) in item 4(a) by deleting "$9.00" and inserting instead - 

" $9.50 "; 
(k) in item 4(b) by deleting "$31.00" and inserting 

instead - 
44 $33.00 

(1) after item 4(b) by inserting the following subitern - 
44 

(ba) 	for a business ..........................$38.00 

(m) in item 4(c) by deleting "$42.00" and inserting 
instead - 
46  $43.00 "; 



27 June 2006 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2299  

(n) in item 5 by deleting "$69.30" and inserting instead — 

" $75.60 "; 

(o) in item 6 by deleting "$16.00" and inserting instead — 

" $16.75 "; 

(p) in item 7(a) by deleting "$29.50-  and inserting 
instead — 

" $30.50 "; 

(q) in item 7(b) by deleting "$29.50" and inserting 
instead — 

" $30.50 "; 

(r) in item 8 by deleting "$29.50" and inserting instead — 

" $30.75 "; 

(s) in item 9(a) by deleting "$69.30" and inserting 
instead — 

" $75.60 "; 

(t) in item 9(b) by deleting -$69.30-  and inserting 
instead — 

" $75.60 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


